Hidalgo County

(Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories(
Bid No. 08-044-02-27-YSI
Tabulation Sheet
	Item
	Description
	MCM Sporting Goods
	Uniforms of Texas

	
	JUVENILE PROBATION
	
	

	01B.
	Swat Boots (Men) 9-10 ( W   

(Women) 7-9
	No Bid
	$48.50

	
	
	No Bid
	$48.50

	01C.
	Belts Small-X Large (Elastic)
	$4.95
	$2.50

	01F.
	Staff T-Shirts Small-XLarge

2XLarge
	$10.50
	$2.50

	
	
	$11.50
	$4.50

	01J.
	Regular Length Walking Shorts Small-XLarge

2XLarge-4XLarge
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	
	No Bid
	No Bid

	01K.
	Heavy Duty Canvas Step Ins Deck Style Shoes Sizes 5-13
	No Bid
	No Bid

	01L.
	Sport Bras Small-XLarge

2XLarge
	No Bid
	$15.90

	
	
	No Bid
	$17.90

	01P.
	Sweatshirts Medium-XLarge

2XL-3XL
	$8.50
	$7.85

	
	
	$9.50
	$9.85

	
	
	Average:  $9.00
	Average:  $8.85

	01Q.
	Sweatpants- XLarge
	$7.95
	$9.85

	
	2XL-3XL
	$8.95
	$11.85

	
	FIRE MARSHAL
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	02A.
	Long Sleeve Twill Medium- XLarge

2XLarge
	No Bid
	$21.90

	
	
	No Bid
	$23.90

	02B.
	Short Sleeve Twill Medium- XLarge

2XLarge
	No Bid
	$21.90

	
	
	No Bid
	$23.90

	02C.
	Sport Shirt Polo Medium-XLarge

2XLarge
	No Bid
	$15.90

	
	
	No Bid
	$17.90

	02E.
	T-Shirts Medium-XLarge

2 XLarge
	No Bid
	$3.14

	
	
	No Bid
	$5.14

	02F.
	Sweatshirts Medium- XLarge

2 XLarge
	$7.95
	$7.80

	
	
	$8.95
	$9.80

	
	
	Average $8.45
	Average $8.80

	02G.
	Class A Shirt Medium- XLarge

2 XLarge
	No Bid
	$34.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$36.00

	02H.
	Tactical Pant Men 30-44        

Women 8-16
	No Bid
	$31.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$31.00

	02I.
	Heavy Duty Work Pant Men 30-44

Women 8-16
	No Bid
	$16.95

	
	
	No Bid
	$16.95

	02J.
	Class A Trouser Men 30-44

Women 8-16
	No Bid
	$15.95

	
	
	No Bid
	$15.95

	02L.
	Windbreaker Medium-XLarge

2XLarge
	$15.00
	$13.95

	
	
	$16.95
	$15.95

	02M.
	Raincoat Medium-XLarge

2XLarge
	No Bid
	$59.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$61.00

	02N.
	Duty Jacket Medium-XLarge

2XLarge
	No Bid
	$112.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$114.00

	02P.
	Duty Boot Men 8-12

Women 6-9
	No Bid
	$87.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$87.00

	02Q.
	Structural Boot Men 8-12                         
Women 6-9
	No Bid
	$223.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$223.00

	
	SHERIFF’S OFFICE
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	03D.
	5.7 oz Polo Shirts XSmall-XLarge

2XLarge-6XLarge
	$17.95
	No Bid

	
	
	$18.95 $19.95 $20.95
	No Bid

	03E.
	5.5 Oz Poplin Shirts  X-Small - X-Large

2XLarge-6XLarge
	$22.95
	No Bid

	
	
	$23.95 $24.95 $25.95
	No Bid

	03F.
	Force 10 Jacket Small-XLarge

2XLarge-4-XLarge
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	PRECINCT #4
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	04A.
	Standard Industrial Shirts/Smocks Small-XLarge

2XLarge-5XLarge
	No Bid
	$12.05

	
	
	No Bid
	$14.05

	
	ELECTIONS DEPARTMENT
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	05A.
	Duty Polo Medium-XLarge 2XLarge-
3XLarge
	No Bid
	$26.00

	
	
	No Bid
	$28.00

	
	BOOT CAMP
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	06B.
	Boxer Briefs Small-2XLarge
	No Bid
	$12.00

	
	
	Average $8.60
	Average $7.84

	06J.
	T-Shirts Crew Neck Small-Large
	$4.95
	$3.43

	06L.
	Socks
	No Bid
	$3.50

	06M.
	Running Shoes 7 (- 11
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	IT DEPARTMENT
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	08B.
	Sport Shirt Polo- Small- XLarge
	$17.95
	$9.19

	
	2XLarge
	$18.95
	$11.19

	
	CONSTABLE PRECINCT # 3
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	11A.
	Raincoat Small-X-Large

2XLarge-6XLarge
	No Bid
	$11.95

	
	
	No Bid
	$13.95

	11B.
	Trouser Belt
	No Bid
	$12.90

	11C.
	Tie
	No Bid
	$3.20

	11D.
	Tactical Uniform Small-XLarge

2XL-6XL
	No Bid
	$19.90

	
	
	No Bid
	$21.90

	11E.
	Pants Small-XLarge

2XL-6XL
	No Bid
	$19.60

	
	
	No Bid
	$21.60

	11F.
	Caps Small-XXLarge
	No Bid
	$4.50

	11G.
	T-Shirts Small-XLarge

2XL-6XL
	No Bid
	$4.75

	
	
	No Bid
	$6.75

	11Q.
	Shirts Small-XLarge
	$19.95
	$13.90

	11R.
	Twill Long Sleeve Shirt (Small-XLarge)
	$26.95
	$16.90

	
	PRECINCT # 3
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	12A.
	Duty Polo Medium-XLarge
	No Bid
	$12.90

	
	2XLarge-3XLarge
	No Bid
	$14.90

	
	SECURITY-ADMINISTRATION
	MCM SPORTING GOODS
	UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

	13A.
	Breathable Polo Style Bike Patrol Shirt Small-XLarge
	No Bid
	$25.00

	
	2XLarge-3XLarge
	No Bid
	$27.00

	13B.
	Class A Zipper Front Shirt Med-XLarge
	No Bid
	$43.00

	
	2XLarge-3XLarge
	No Bid
	$45.00

	13C.
	Color Block Two Tone Polo Shirt Medium-XLarge
	No Bid
	$40.00

	
	2XLarge-3XLarge
	No Bid
	$42.00

	13D.
	Tactical Uniform Pant Waist Sizes 32-40
	No Bid
	$47.00

	13E.
	All Season Law Duty Jacket Small-XLarge
	No Bid
	$89.00

	
	2XLarge
	No Bid
	$91.00





MCM Sporting Goods Inc 



Uniforms Of Texas




1302 North Conway



6601 Montana Suite B & C




Mission, Texas 78572



El Paso, Texas79925




956-581-1632




915-771-6601





956-581-1685




915-843-6601 Fax




Contact: Jorge Garza



Contact: Hector Ayala





mcmsports@yahoo.com



uniformsoftexas@yahoo.com


