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Diesel Engine Lubricants
Made available in the following sizes: Pint Quart. [ Gallon, 3 Gallon. 59 Gallon. Bulk

SAE15W-40 mceting the following specifications:
Cl-t CH-4, CF-4L Commins CES 20075, BOM+. Volvo VDS2/VDS, Allison C-F, API SL-ST. Minimuwn 10 TBN

HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.77 qt

Gallon $6.42

5 Gallon $28.50

55 Gallon $304.50

Bulk $4.98 gal

SAE 10W 1meeting the following specifications:
CF, CD, SL. §J, Allison C-4, Cat TO-2, Minimum 7.5 TBN

HOLLON OIL

5 Gallon $28.50

55 Gallon $304.50

SAE 30W ineeting the following specifications:

CF-2, CF, CD. SL. §J, Allison C-4, Gat TO-2, Minimum 7.5 TBN

HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.77 qt

Gallon $6.40

5 Gallon $28.50

55 Gallon $304.00

Bulk $5.48

SAE 40W mceting the following specifications:
CF-2, CF, CD, SL, 8], Minimum 7.5 TBN

HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.77

Gallon $6.40

5 Gallon $28.50

55 Gallon $304.00

Bulk $4.79
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Rotella T (15 W-40 C J 4)

1E.

HOLLON OIL

Quart $2.43

Gallon

$9.39

5 Gallon $42.88

55 Gallon

$459.98

Gasoline Engine Lubricants
Made avaitabloin the following sizess Pine Quare, 1 Gallon. 5 Gallon, 53 Gallon, Bulk

mecting the following <pecificutions: APL SL, 8], SHLUILSAC-GF3 Multigrades onlv FORD WSS=N2CIS3H 3W-20 only
20 SAE 5W-30

HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.69

55 Gallon

$293.00

Bulk $4.96

SAE10W-30
HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.69

Gallon

$6.79

5 Gallon $35.00

55 Gallon

$291.40

Bulk $4.96

SAE5W-20

HOLLON OIL

55 Gallon

$291.40

Bulk
SAE30

$4.96

HOLLON OIL

Quart

$1.69

55 Gallon $347.50

Bulk

$6.15

SAE40

HOLLON OIL

$1.69

Quart

55 Gallon $347.50

Bulk $6.15
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Automatic Transmission Lubricants
Made available in the following sizes: Quart, Gallon, 3 Galton, 35 Gallon

Mercon/Dexron I ATF mceting specifications for:
Mercon/Dexron I & HE & THE, Alson C-F Cat ' TO-2

HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.65

55 Gallon $276.25

Type FATF niceting Ford M2C33-F specifications
HOLLON OIL

Quart $1.74

55 Gallon $364.19

Mercon 5 - Trasmission Fluid

HOLLON OIL

12/ 1Qt. $2.45

55 Gallon $456.42

Tractor Hydraulic Fluids
Made available in the following sizes: 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon

Meeting the following specifications: Case Hy-Tran/TCH, Cat TO-2, JD 303/]J20C, Ford-new Holland
M2C134 A/B/G/D Massey M1141, Vickers M-2950-8, I-286-S, Universal Tractor fluid serving

transmissions, final drives, oil immersed brakes and hydraulic systems

HOLLON OIL

5 Gallon $28.50

55 Gallon $293.99

Differential/ Final Drive Gear Lubricants
Made available in the following sizes: 35# Pail, 120 Lb Keg, 400 Lb Drum

HOLLON OIL

35# Pail $27.27

400 Lb $299.98

Drum

SAE 80W-90 Gear lubricant meeting the following specifications:
GL-5, GL-4, Mack GO-J, MIL-L-2105D, MIL-PRF-2105E

HOLLON OIL

$29.95

35# Pail

$117.50

120 Lb Keg

400 Lb $329.43

Drum
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5B SAE 85W-140 Gear lubricant meeting the following specifications:
GL-5, GL-4, Mack GO-J, MIL-L-2105D, MIL-PRF-2105E

HOLLON OIL

35# Pail $29.95

120 Lb Keg $117.50

400 Lb $329.43

Drum

SAE 75W-90 Synthetic Gear lubricant meeting the following specifications:
GL-5, MT-1, Mack GO-J

HOLLON OIL

35# Pail $67.38

120 Lb Keg $217.80

400 Lb $696.69

Drum

SAE 50W Synthetic Transmission lubricant meeting the following specifications:
MT-1 performance for Eaton, Mack, Meritor, Navistar

HOLLON OIL

35# Pail $67.38

120 Lb Keg $213.50

400 Lb $681.86

Drum

SAE50W Synthetic Transmission lubricant meeting the following specifications:
MT-1 performance for Eaton, Mack, Meritor, Navistar

HOLLON OIL

35# Pail $67.38

120 Lb Keg $213.50

400 Lb $681.86

Drum

CAT-T0-4 SAE 30 Drive Train oil for Final Drives meeting the following specifications:
Allison, C4, C3, Cat TO-4, TO-2, SAE 30W

HOLLON OIL

$310.43
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3G CAT TO-4 SAE 50 Drive Train oil for Final Drives meeting the following specifications:
Allison, C4, C3, Cat TO-4, TO-2, SAE 50W

HOLLON OIL

400 Lb $310.43
Drum

Hydraulic Lubricants in various viscosities made available in the following sizes: 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon
Meeting the following specifications: Denison HF-0, Vickers M-2950-S, 1-286-S, TOST min 2000 hrs.

1SO 32

HOLLON OIL

$25.40

$277.16

HOLLON OIL

5 Gallon $25.40

55 Gallon $277.16

ISO 68
HOLLON OIL

5 Gallon $25.40

55 Gallon $277.16

ISO 100
HOLLON OIL

5 Gallon $25.40

55 Gallon $277.16

BRAKE and POWER Steering Fluids made available in the following sizes: Pint, Quarts, Gallon
Meeting the following specifications: DOT3 for Brake Fluid/ Ford, GM, Chrysler for Power Steering

Brake Fluid
HOLLON OIL

Pint $1.17

Quart $2.79

Gallon $12.95

Power Steering Fluid
OIL PATCH HOLLON OIL

no bid $0.71

$29.75 $1.43

no bid no bid
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9A

9B

10

10A

10B

11

11A

Aeroshell Fluid 4 Fluid make available in the following sizes 1 Gallon, 55 Gallon

HOLLON OIL
5 Gallon no bid
55 Gallon no bid

Chassis Grease made available in the following sizes: Case of 10 tubes, 35# Pail, 120# Keg, 55 Gallon
Drums

Lithium Complex High Temp Grease meeting specifications:
NLGI-2, ASTM D4950 GC-LB, Suitable for wheel bearings, chassis, PTO, U-Joints, On & Off Road

Applications

HOLLON OIL
Case 10 $1.14
35# Pail $41.09
120 # Keg $146.90
55 Gallon $461.96

Lithium Complex High Temp Grease w/ 3% moly meeting specifications:
NLGI-2, ASTM D4950 GC-LB, Suitable for wheel bearings, chassis, PTO, U-Joints, On & Off Road

Applications

HOLLON OIL
Case 10 $1.57
120 # Keg $207.52

Antifreeze made available in the following sizes: 1 Gallon, 55 Gallon

Ethylene Glycol Antifreeze meeting specifications for:
ASTM D3306 for automotive/ ASTM D 4985 for Heavy Duty Diesel

HOLLON OIL

1 Gallon $10.63

Extended Life Antifreeze/ Coolant meeting specifications for:
CAT EC-1, TMC RP 329, TMC RP 338, Matching Catepillar Extended Life Coolant, Detroit Diesel

HOILLON OIL
1 Gallon $13.50
55 Gallon $537.62

Shop Chemicals and Products made available in various sizes

Aerosol Brake Cleaner

HOLLON OIL

no bid

Dage 4
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11B Aerosol Engine Degreaser
HOLLON OIL
$1.50
11C Aerosol Starting Fluid
HOLLON OIL
$1.86
11D Aerosol Penetrating Oil
HOLLON OIL
$1.70
11E O1il Absorbent
HOLLON OIL
$4.65
11F Gasoline Fuel Additive
HOLLON OIL
$1.09
11G Diesel Fuel Additive
HOLLON OIL
$4.79
11H Engine Oil Additive
HOLLON OIL
$2.50
111 Aerosol Lubricant
HOLLON OIL
$2.19
13. Easy Slide RB-9512 Dryfilin Lubricant: Sizes 12.8 oz. can
HOLLON OIL

12.8 oz. can no bid




