Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office
“Commissary Supplies”
Bid No. 08-212-06-11-rol
Tabulation Sheet

Categorized by Description R & R Distributing
Item Number
S
oL Hygiene Kit
(4" T-Brush, T-Paste 1.5 oz, Soap 1.5 oz, 00
Deodorant 0.5 oz.)
02. Almond Joy Bar 1.61 oz. $0.51
03. Baby Ruth 2.1 oz. $0.51
04. Butter Finger Bar 2.1 oz. $0.51
05. Snickers Almond Bar 1.76 oz. $0.51
06. Milky Way Bar 2.05 oz. $0.51
07. Pay Day Bar 1.85 oz. $0.51
08. Snickers Bar 2.07 oz. $0.51
09. 3 Musketeers Bar 2.13 oz. $0.51
10. Skittles “Original Fruits” 2.17 oz bag $0.51
11. M & M Peanuts 1.74 oz. bag $0.51
12. Twix Bar 2.0 oz. $0.51
13. Peanut Pattie 1.75 oz. $0.51
14. Reeses Peanut Butter Cups 1.5 oz. $0.51
15. Breath Savers (12 mints) 0.75 oz. $0.51
19. Original Corn Nuts 1.4 oz pk . : $0.39
24. Nacho Cheese Dip w/Jalapenos 4 oz. Tub $0.92
33. Sardines in Hot Tomato Sauce 3.53 oz. No bid
34. Fish Fillets 3.53 oz. Pouch No bid
36. Flaming Hot Cheetos 1.5 oz bag $0.26
37. BB(Q Corn Chips 1.5 oz. bag $0.26
40. Tostadas 12 oz. pack $1.55
47. Cookies 6 oz tray $0.45
{duplex/vanilla/chocolate/p-butter)
43. Zinger Cremes 4 oz. pack $0.59
44, Apples Pies 4 oz. $0.59
45, Cherry Pies 4 oz. $0.59
46. Cherry Rolls 4 oz. $0.59
6l. Sugar Cubes 1 ib. bx $1.99
62. White Sport Bras (med thru 4 XL) $4.00
63. White Sweatshirts $5.99
Med-4XL
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67. White Men Briefs $0.99
Small thru 5 xl
69. White Ladies Panties (size 5 thru 18) $1.97
70. White Mens/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes No bid
Sizes 6 thru 13
71. Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) $0.39
50 ct. box
72. Halls Metho-Lyptus (9 drops) stick $0.49
73. Advil Coated (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. box $0.39
74. Motrin Ibuprofen (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. $0.39
76. Anti Shank Security Razor Single Edge $0.20
77. Jolly Ranchers 3.7 oz. Assorted Bag $0.81
78. Sunflower Kernels 4 oz. Bag $0.82
80. Irish Spring Bar Soap Antibacterial 4.5 oz $0.56
81. Elastic Pony Tailers 18 ct. pk black $0.11
91. Alcohol Free Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic No bid
92. Athletes Foot Créme 0.05 oz. tube $2.29
98. Floss Loops Mint Flavor 30 ct. bag $1.10
100. Alka Seltzer Original Effervescent 2 $0.38
tablet pouch 116 ct. bx
101. Alka Seltzer (Plus Cold Effervescent 2 $0.49
tablet-pouch) 72 ct., bx
104, Contact Lens M/P Solution 8 oz. $4.89 (4 oz)
106. 3 14" Flexible Pencil $0.10
107. Bubble Cushioned Envelope 6”x9” $0.49
108. #10 White Security Envelopes $0.06
110. Twin Pocket Folders $0.45
111, Dictionary (English-Span & Eng) $0.99
112. Word Seek Puzzles $1.59
113. Sketch Pads 50 sheets No bid
114. Playing Cards Deck $0.90
116. Tracing Paper Pad 40 sheets $2.57
117. Tan PVC Shower Sandals Size 8-13 $1.59
118. Colgate Red Gel Toothpaste 4.2 oz. $3.19
120. Dove Bar Soap 3.15 oz. ' $0.53
121. Zest Bar Soap 3. Zoz. $0.55
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124. Lice Control Shampoo 2 oz. $8.29 ( 8 0z.)

125. Nair Hair Removal 9 oz $4.99 (10 oz.)

126. Speed Stick Aqua Sport $1.29
Anti-Perspirant Gel 3 oz.

137. Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Soap 3.6 oz. $0.97

139. Palm Hair Brush Flexible Black $0.39

140. Tampons-Singles $0.21
Regular/Super/Junior 40 ct. box

141. Disposable Douche 6 oz. $0.99




