HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY

BID OPENING DATE: OCTOBER 29, 2008 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DESCRIPTION OF BID: ‘' FUNERAL AND BURIAL SERVICES FOR PAUPERS (POOL) '’

BID NO: 2008-197-10-29-0OTM ' BUYER: OLGA TORRES MONTERO
VENDOR :

Ceballos Funeral Home ﬁemorial Funeral
L & I Funeral Home ome

d
2200 N. Conway Ave. 1023 North 23 st 208 E. Canton
Mission, Texas McAllen Texas Edinburg, Texas

Option A:

Cremation or Traditional Funeral Services

Adults (12 yrs and over)

$ 795.00 $ 700.00 $ 600.00
Child (4-11 years)
$ 695.00 $ 625.00 $ 600.00
Infant (0-3 years)
$ 495.00 $ 625.00 $ 450.00
Cremation (12 years and over) $ 695.00 $ 700.00 $ 550.00
Cremation (0-11 years) § 495.00 $ 700.00 $ 425.00
Internment of Cremated Remains
$ 295.00 $ -0- $ 425.00
Option B:
Cremation or Traditional Burial Services price will include opening/closing costs
Adu tg (12 yr and over)
ker-
‘;i§§ S f°fomar er $ 1195.00 No bid No bid
Child_ (4- l% ears) wi hl
puriat piog marker- single $1095.00 No bid No bid
Infani (g-% %e is) wi thl
urigl Prog Marrer-sing:e $ 295.00 No bid No bid
Cost of Plot $ 495.00 No bid No bid
Opening/Closing Costs $ 300.00 No bid No bid
j Concgete liner (if required by
cemetery $ 300.00 No bid No bid




