HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SHEET

DEPARTMENT NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY

DESCRIPTION OF BID: PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES

BID NO: 2009-016-02-23-MEG BUYER I: ELENA GOMEZ
NAME OF COMPANY ACKNOWLEDGEMENT ADDENDUM NO.1
1. | Welding House Inc. v’ v’

2. Airgas Southwest v \/




HIDALGO COUNTY

TABULATION SHEET

“PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”

- BID NO. 2009-016-02-23-MEG

| BUYER: ELENA GOMEZ

3. Aluminum welding Rods

4. Cast Iron Rods

5. Torch RD-45

6. Alloy 144 Brass Electrode

7. Torch Brass

8. Oxygen (for welding gas)

11. Leather Welding Gloves (standard)

#35

#35

1/8 5 LBS

5/32 5LBS

ITEM DESCRIPTIONS WELDING HOUSE AIRGAS
m
SIZE CASE/ BID PRICE BID PRICE
UNITS
1.Metalwelding Rods (different gauges) § 74,30
la Stainless steal welding Rods (different 7018 18 SULBS 58350 A
cauges) 7018 532 | S0LBS $82.50 $73.35
6011 1/8 50 LBS $95.00 ESAB $76.82
6011 5/32 50 LBS $ 105.00 ESAB $76.00
6011 3/32 S50 LBS $ 115.00 ESAB $81.35

S e ——
2. Rod keeger (storage s-x_stem) 30 LBS $ 205.00 ( 50 Ibs) $301.67

no bid

:different gauges)

no bid

$29.13per Ib

$ 38.76 per Ib

99 % Cast #460 1/8 10 LBS no bid $31.43 ger 1b

1/8

LB

1/8 Steel 1LB no bid $3.69

3/32 1 LB no bid $3.70

1/8 1LB no bid $31.21 perlb
(11.54 bx)

5/32 1LB no bid $37.92 per lb
( 11.54 bx)

M

no bid

$13.47

5/32 1LB no bid $ 10.95 (10# bx)

12. Welding Helmets (2" with flip lens preferred)

BID PRICE BID PRICE
80 Series
$5.60 $7.75
100 Series
$6.25 $8.25
200 Series

$ 33.75 jackson hsi2 blk

$ 8.80 $95.43
9. Acet;lene, (for welding gas) 100 Series $.1990 cf $24.07 s Ber c.f)

10. Welding Goggles standard (square frame, flip lens preferred)

$ 9.50 jackson ws85

e ______________________|

$525reveo 110

$12.30

$3.96

$29.17

e e e ]

Small

$ 39.80 revco

$50.92

13.  Leather Jackets for Welders

Medium

$ 39.80 revco

$50.92

(complete)

Large

$ 39.80 revco




e ]

Auto Darkening

19. Torch Tips

(both torch tips fit
small torch and
medium torch, Torch
tip 1-010-1, Heating
tip 1-010-1)

17. Lens Clear Huntsman

14. Doo- Rag Flame Retardant Cap

and/or Beanies

15. Welding  Blanket Coated
Fiberglass and Acrylic
Coated

16. Bid Apron Leather 36” ~ 48"

“Nitro”

Small Torch
100 Series

Medium
Torch
300 Series

30 oz

1-13/16” x 4-1/16”

Inner ReElacement

18. Torch Lighters ( 3 way)

no bid

no bid

T A

$ 24.00 revco

$ 1.65 (5 per bag)

$230
Type 1-010-1 Size BID PRICE

$4.50

$27.36

$22.19

NO BID

NO BID
BID PRICE

Cutting Tip
Org. Victor 03-101 Victor $9.75 $13.03
#0-W-1 $32.61
Welding Tip #1-W-1 $32.61 $34.79
Victor 2 or #2-W-1 $33.10
equalivant to #3-W-1 $33.90
Heating 1-010-1 Rosebud
or equalivant to Victor 8 $ 59.80 (8mfa-1) $72.03
or equalivant
to
1D PRICE
Cutting Tip
Org. Victor 03-101 Victor $9.75 $13.03
#0-W-1 $33.93
Welding Tip #1-W-1 $35.99 $34.79
Victor 2 or #2-W-1 $35.99
equalivant to #3-W-1 $36.50
Heating 1-010-1 Rosebud
or equalivant to Victor 8 $ 85.08 $72.03
or equalivant
to

20. Torch Gauges-Replacement Gauges for regulators are preferred

a) Victor b) Victor CSR150CR no bid $ 89.00
! Size ﬁmn PRICE BID PRICE
21. Torch Hoses 25 fix U $ 25.00 $21.15
50ftx Y $44.00 $36.52
100 ftx Y4 $ 83.00 $71.26
Small 100 $ 168.00 (med) $209.99
22. Torches Series
Complete Kit is preferred with handle and cutting
attachments Medium 300 $269.00 (lg) $272.28
Gas Tank Size BID PRICE BID PRICE
Oxygen 80 Series $.195 day $4.50
23. Rental of Cylinder (as needed) 100 Series kel e
200 Series $ .195 day $4.50
Acetylene 100 Series $.195 da $4.50
24. No. 1 Cable (by feet) $1.18ft $1.98
25. Tip cleaner- Standard $1.60 $7.85
26. Flat Soap Stone-Standard Square $ 8.35 gross $ 8.00 per box




ADDENDUM NO. 1

February 12, 2009

“PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”
RFB NO.: 2009-016-02-23-MEG

NOTE the ADDITIONAL ITEMS for EXHIBIT “A” are as FOLLOW:

ITEM DESCRIPTIONS

WELDING HOUSE - AIRGAS
WELDING SUPPLY’S PRICE PRICE
1. Safety glasses dark $3.30¢ca $1.53
2. Safety glasses clear $292¢a $2.02
3. Welding .030 cable liners for Millermatic 135 $12.00 $13.82
4. Welding wire spools .030 flux coated $ 38.95 spool $57.52
5. Tips .030 for welder Millermatic 135 $ .56 ea $6.63 pkg of 10 ea
6. Millermatic 135 nozzle tip protector — slip on type $5.69 ea $ 823 pkgofi0ea
7. Screw on 4.1/2 x Y4 x 7/8 grinding discs $220¢ca $2.13
8. Screw on 4.1/2 x 3/4 x 7/8 sanding discs 24 grit $.63 grit $.58/120 grits
fine — medium — coarse grid $.55 ea (B-Line) $298
9. Chop saw blades 14 x3/32x 1 $5.61ea $5.20
10. Striker & flints Striker § 2.30ea/refills $ 1.7 $4.34
11. Cutting dark goggles $7.31 $5.95
GAS PRICE PRICE
1. Oxygen (for welding gas) cylinder size
21 series $4.20 $ 6.00
$6.25 $8.25
125 series
2. Acetylene (for welding gas)
cylinder size: #3, $19.00 $ 15.56
#4 3 .1975ct MC $ 9.25 $10.58

Cylinder size #4, MC
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MEMORANDUM

TO: Noe Montez, Budget Manager
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 1

FROM: Elena Gomez, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: February 24, 2009

RE: HIDALGO COUNTY - “PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”
Bid No. 2009-016-02-23-MEG

Attached you will find two (2) copies of the bids received for the above referenced project. Please review and reply
with your recommendation. We need to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting;
therefore, we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Dept.
via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no later than Tuesday, February 24, 2009 @ 12:00 P.M. in
order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Wednesday, February 25,

2009
If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4855

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
Weltp,ms fous€ Lo Bp R tpTe sors,
HWn 6rp s b~ B,p R, CpTe For
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ACCOUNT: 9, (211-¥S2-00-/12 (- 013-6~ ¥¥2/ /,{ZJ
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Authorized Signature Printed Name Date




MEMORANDUM

TO: Ricardo Cuellar
Hidalgo County Precinct 2
Attm: Yolanda Cisneros

FROM: Elena Gomez, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: February 24, 2009

RE: HIDALGO COUNTY - “PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”
Bid No. 2009-016-02-23-MEG

===

Axtached you will find two (2) copies of the bids received for the above referenced project. Please review and reply
with your recommendation. We need to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting;
therefore, we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Dept.

via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no later than Tuesday, February 24, 2009 @ 12:00 P.M. in
order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Wednesday, February 25,

2009

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4855

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION {BASIS)
Ml tiPle Vemens. | Rused . ou desest  Meos o D FFatet Sepplyes
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Authorized Signature Printed Name Date
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MEMORANDUM

G’Mﬁsmw Flores

TO: k o8
i zﬁgo County EPrecinet No. 4’3
FROM: Elena Gomez, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
DATE: February 24, 2009

RE: HIDALGO COUNTY - “PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”
Bid No. 2008-016-02-23-MEG

Attached you will find two (2) copies of the bids received for the above referenced project. Please review and reply
with your reccommendation. We need to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting;
therefore, we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Dept.
via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no later than Tucsday, February 24, 2009 @ 12:00 P.M. in

order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Wednesday, February 25,

2009
If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4853

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
’ : /
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MEMORANDUM

TO: Juan Manuel Carranza, Admintstralive Assistant
' Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4

FROM: Elena Gomez, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: Februtary 24, 2008

RE: HIDALGO COUNTY — “PURCHASE OF WELDING SUFPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”
Bid Na. 2009-016-02-23-MEG

Attached vou will find two (2) copies of the bids received for (he ubove referenced project. Please review and

Meeting; theretore, we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided betow and reply to the Purchasing Dept.
via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no Iater than Tuesday, February 24, 2000 @ 12:00 P.M. in

order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Wednesday, February 25,
2009

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4855

AWARD TO VENDOR(S); RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
Welding House Maultiple vendors, enly on those ftems which this vendor bid Jowest
Airgas Multiple veadors, anly on those items which this vendor bid lowest

ACCOUNT:  9-1204-431-00-124-007-0-442 613/ 623 / 679

O§ c\iégﬁx Oscar L, Garza Ir. | . 20242009

Authorized Si;;r,nsu.;l\rxeJ Prinled Name Bate




MEMORANDUM

TO: Daniel Flores, Director
Hidalgo County Buildings & Grounds

FROM: Elena Gomez, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: February 24, 2009

RE: HIDALGO COUNTY - “PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES”
Bid No. 2009-016-02-23-MEG

Attached you will find two (2) copies of the bids received for the above referenced project. Please review and reply
with your recommendation. We need to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting;
therefore, we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Dept.
via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no later than Tuesday, February 24, 2009 @ 12:00 P.M. in
order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Wednesday, February 25,
2009

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4855

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
welfvu,. Rouse .
PG Mouv,Q, \(@ Ml - U@mg?@(,
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Authorized Signature Printed Name Date
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MEMORANDUM

TO: Anacleto Martinez, Chief Deputy

Attn: Juan Tapia, Procurement Specialist
Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility

FROM: Elena Gomez, Buyer
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: February 24, 2009

RE: HIDALGO COUNTY — “PURCHASE OF WELDING SUPPLIES AND RELATED SERVICES™
Bid No. 2009-016-02-23-MEG

Attached you will find two (2) copies of the bids received for the above referenced project. Please review and reply
with your recommendation. We need to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting;
therefore, we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concetns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Dept.
via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no later than Tuesday. February 24, 2009 (@ 12:00 P.M. in

T e RO

order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Wednesday, February 25,
2009

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4855

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMIYIENDATION (BASIS)

ALutar b To.wdortzs /4////%;:7/@ | Ve/k’ﬁé&(.ﬁ
Bdder

ACCOUNT: 7 //0- 4232128064 2-0- 542 Rl
2. //00- 4232280 IR~ O~ 625 Supplies

Auyddtprized Signature / Printed Name Date
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Entity Search Results

""/J\?’ Taxabl
Franchise Tax Certification of Account Status

This Certification Not Sufficient for Filings with Secretary of State

Do not include a certificate from this Web site as part of a filing with the Secretary of
State for dissolution, merger, withdrawal, or conversion. The Secretary of State will
reject a filing that uses the certification from this site.

To obtain a certificate that is sufficient for dissolution, merger, or conversion, see
Publication 98-336d, Requirements to Dissolve, Merge or Convert a Texas Entity.

[ Certification of Account Status 1 Officers And Directors Information 1

Entity Information: WELDINGHOUSE, INC
705 NAVIGATION BLVD
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408-2643
Status: IN GOOD STANDING NOT FOR

DISSOLUTION OR WITHDRAWAL
through May 15, 2009

Registered Agent: STEVE W BURCK
4833 LEOPARD
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408

Registered Agent Resignation Date:

State of Formation:

File Number: 0104906100
SOS Registration Date: December 10, 1987
Taxpayer Number: 17424827198

Texas Online  Statewide Search from the Texas State Library = State Link Policy  Texas Homeland
Security

Susan Combs, Texas Comptroller ¢« Window on State Government  Contact Us
Privacy and Security Policy ' Accessibility Policy  Link Policy ~ Public Information Act  Compact
with Texans

http://ecpa.cpa.state.tx.us/coa/servlet/cpa.app.coa.CoaGetTp?Pg=tpid&Search Nm=Weldi... 2/24/2009



