REQUIREMENTS AGREEMENT
C-08-044-04-14

THIS AG REEMENT (the "Agreement") is entered into effective as of April 14,2008
by and between MCM Sporting Goods, Inc. a TEXAS Corporation Company ("Seller")
and HIDALGO COUNTY ("Buyer").

WHEREAS, Buyer has solicited proposals for the supply of its requirements
of Hidalgo County “ Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories,” on an "As Needed
Basis" as further described in Exhibit "A" which is attached hereto and incorporated herein
by reference for all purposes (the "Products") for a period of one year; and

WHEREAS, Seller has submitted a proposal to supply Buyer's requirements; and

WHEREAS, Buyer has determined that Seller has submitted the lowest and best bid
to meet Buyer's requirements for the Product.

NOW THEREFORE, for and in consideration of the mutual covenants and
conditions hereinafter set forth, and other good an valuable consideration, the receipt and
sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto agree as follows:

1. Buyer agrees to purchase from Seller, and Seller agrees to sell to Buyer, all
of the Products that Buyer may require for use by Buyer in “ Hidalgo County” in the areas
of HIDALGO COUNTY projects for a period of April 14, 2008 from_April 13, 2009
with the option to renew for an additional_one (1) year term under the same rates, terms,
and condition, and it is agreed that the Products will meet the specifications set forth in
Exhibit "A" hereto. County reserves the right to continue this bid for an additional sixty (60)
days grace period at the end of the contract term for unforeseen delay in award of new bid.

2. When Buyer determines that it needs a quantity of the Products to be
delivered, it will, according to its Purchasing Policies, complete and submit to Seller a
Purchase Order describing the type and quantity of the Products required. The Products
are to be delivered by Buyer to the location in Hidalgo County specified by Buyer in its
Purchase Order.

3. Buyer agrees to pay Seller for each Purchase Order based on the prices set
out in Exhibit "B". Seller shall render invoices for each Purchase Order, and the invoices
shall be paid by Buyer on or before the 30th day following receipt of the invoice.

4. County and Seller agree that either party may terminate this contract upon
thirty (30) days written notice at any time for any reason or no reason at all.

5. General Provisions.

a. Conflict with Applicable Law. Nothing in this Agreement shall be
construed so as to require the commission of any act contrary to law, and whenever
there is any conflict between any provision of this Agreement and any present or
future law, ordinance or administrative, executive or judicial regulation, order or
decree, or amendment thereof, contrary to which the parties have no legal right to
contract, the latter shall prevail, but in such event the affected provision or
provisions of this Agreement shall be modified only to the extent necessary to bring
them within the legal requirements and only during the time such conflict exists.




b. No Waiver. No waiver by Buyer of any breach of any provision of this
Agreement shall be deemed to be a waiver of any preceding or succeeding breach
of the same or any other provision hereof.

C. Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the entire contract between the
parties hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either directly
or through any agent or representative) any representations or agreements in
connection with this Agreement not specifically set forth herein. This Agreement
may be modified or amended only by agreement in writing executed by Buyer and
Seller, and not otherwise.

d. Texas Law to Apply. This Agreement shall be construed under and in
accordance with the laws of the State of Texas, and all obligations of the parties
created hereunder are performable in Hidalgo County, Texas. The parties hereby
consent to personal jurisdiction in Hidalgo County, Texas.

e. Notice. Except as may be otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement,
all notices, demands, requests or communications required or permitted hereunder
shall be in writing and shall either be (i) personally delivered against a written
receipt, or (ii) sent by registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage
prepaid and addressed to the parties at the addresses set forth below, or at such
other addresses as may have been theretofore specified by written notice delivered
in accordance herewith:

If to Buyer: Hidalgo County
Attention: County Judge
100 E. Cano, 2nd Floor
Edinburg, Texas 78539

If to Seller: MCM Sporting Goods Inc.
1302 N. Conway
Mission, Texas 78572

Each notice, demand, request or communication which shall be delivered or mailed
in the manner described above shall be deemed sufficiently given for all purposes at
such time as it is personally delivered to the addressee or, if mailed, at such time as
it is deposited in the Unites States mail.

f. Additional Documents. The parties hereto covenant and agree that they
will execute such other and further instruments and documents as are or may
become necessary or convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this
Agreement.

. Successors. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit

of the parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal
representatives, successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement.

h. Assignment. This Agreement shall not be assignable.



i. Headings. The headings and captions contained in this Agreement are
solely for convenient reference and shall not be deemed to affect the meaning or
interpretation of any provision or paragraph hereof.

j. Gender and Number. All pronouns used in this Agreement shall include the
other gender, whether used in the masculine, feminine or neuter gender, and the
singular shall include the plural whenever and as often as may be appropriate

k. Authority to Execute. The execution and performance of this Agreement by
Buyer and Seller have been duly authorized by all necessary laws, resolutions or
corporate action, and this Agreement constitutes the valid and enforceable
obligations of Buyer and Seller in accordance with its terms.

l. Commitment of Current Revenues Only. In the event that, during any term
hereof, the Commissioners Court does not appropriate sufficient funds to meet the
obligations of Buyer under this Agreement, Buyer may terminate this Agreement
upon sixty (60) days written notice to Seller. Buyer agrees, however, to use
reasonable efforts to secure funds necessary for the continued performance of this
Agreement. The parties intend this provision to be a continuing right to terminate
this Agreement at the expiration of each budget period of Buyer pursuant to the
provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt. Code Ann. § 271.903 (Vernon Supp. 1996).

m. Insurance. Company shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and
all persons connected with providing services under this Contract naming County as
an additional insured (with coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit “C”
attached hereto and incorporated herein at this point for all purposes), and shall
furnish to County certificates of such insurance coverage.

n. Purchasing Ethics. Seller represents and warrants it has not, during the
process of being awarded this contract violated the following ethical standards of
Buyer and, upon and after the execution of this Agreement, agrees to abide by the
following ethical standards of Buyer:

(1)  Itshall be a breach of ethics to offer, give or agree to give any elected
official, department head or employee, or former elected official, department
head or employee, of Hidalgo County, or for any elected official, department
head or employee or former elected official, department head or employee of
Hidalgo County, to solicit, demand, accept or agree to accept from another
person, entity or organization, a gratuity or an officer of employment in
connection with any decision, approval, disapproval, recommendation,
preparation or any part of a program requirement or purchase request,
influencing the content of any specification or procurement standard,
rendering of advise, investigation, auditing, or in any other advisory capacity
in any proceeding or application, request for ruling, determination, claim or
controversy, or other particular matter pertaining to any program requirement
or a contract or subcontract, or to any solicitation or proposal therefor
pending before any department or agency of Hidalgo County.

(2) It shall be a breach of ethics for any payment, gratuity or offer of
employment to be made by or on behalf of a subcontractor under a contract
to the prime contractor or higher tier subcontractor for any contract for
Hidalgo County, or any person associated therewith, as an inducement for
the award of a subcontract or order.




EXECUTED effective as of the day and year first above written.
APPROVED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON, April 14,2008

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Atlas & Hall, L.L.
By:7%[‘
Date:__4-/2- of
HID UNTY
By:
Juqﬁ). Salinas, lll, County Judge
Date:
ATTEST

Arturo Guajardo,\r., Coutity Clerk
Date:

By:_Z
Printed lN/a onNGa A Ie
Title:  V/cS—

: RES.
Date:_ ¢ //9/08
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“Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories”

Bid No. 2008-044-02-27-YSI

February 27, 2008



Exhibit “A”
Hidalgo County

“Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories”
Bid No. 2008-044-02-27-YSI

SCOPE OF THE CONTRACT

This is a firm fixed-price contract calling for delivery of the products identified in the specifications. Upon
acceptance of a bid by Hidalgo County Commissioners and issuance of a Contract Award by the Hidalgo County
Purchasing Agent, Bidder shall be obligated to deliver the products at the stated prices, within the time specified,
and in accordance with all Terms and Conditions, and General Provisions provided but, not limited to the following:

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

1) The following are the minimum requirements and/or specifications that will be acceptable to the County.
These requirements and/or specifications may be equal or exceeded. Any bid that does not meet the
minimum requirements and/or specifications specified will be rejected.

2) Vendor (s) are encouraged to bid on one or multiple items.

3) Specifications may vary by department. Colors, lettering and logos/emblems/seal may differ and no
additional fees shall be assessed to the County on similar items.

4) Samples may be subjected to laboratory testing at the discretion of Hidalgo County.

5) Bidders are responsible for all testing costs of their sample garments.

6) Bidder must enclose evidence (dated manufacturers catalogs or similar) that this item is currently a
commercial in-stock style. The successful bidder will provide a full size run of try-on garments within ten :
(10) days for approval.

7) Garments will have a warranty covering (at minimum) defects in materials and workmanship for one (1)
year.

8) Garments must be manufactured to ISO 9001 quality assurance standard. (AG0304)
9) All uniforms shall be new and unused.

10) Departments will purchase uniforms “on an as needed basis”; there is no guarantee on annual volume.

11) Other Hidalgo County departments, not stated herein, may be included and may utilize this contract for the
purchasing of uniforms and/or accessories that meet their specifications and those departments will make
minor modifications to the lettering, colors, logos, seals and/or emblems if necessary at no additional
charge.

12) Colors and embroidery will be forwarded to the awarded vendor upon purchase. Colors and embroidery
will vary.

13) All emblem, seal, logos and embroidery fees shall be included in the unit price.



TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1.The initial term of this contract will be for a one (1) year term, with the County’s option to extend the
contract for an additional one (1) year term based upon prior year’s performance evaluation and contingent
upon cost, terms and conditions remaining unchanged.

2 Hidalgo County reserves the right to continue this bid for an additional sixty (60) days grace period at the
end of the contract term for unforeseen delay in award of new bid for next contract term.

3.Vendor will make available a person(s) on an “As Needed Basis” to take measurements of employees
prior to ordering.

4 Insurances required for this project are, general liability, automotive insurance, and worker’s
compensation. {Refer to Exhibit “C”)

5.Hidalgo County reserves the right to award bid to separate/multiple bidders if it is in the best interest of
the County.

6.Hidalgo County may utilize any state contract(s) when it is in the County’s best interest to do so.

7.Standard uniform deliveries will be made within 30 (thirty) days to 45 (forty-five) days from orders being
placed.

8.All costs and expenses associated with the preparation and submission of (bids, proposals and/or quotes)
shall be the responsibility of the bidder and no reimbursements for such charges or expenses shall be passed
onto Hidalgo County. 3




Exhibit “A”
Hidalgo County

“Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories”

Bid No. 08-044-02-27-YSI

SPECIFCATIONS

JUVENILE PROBATION

BDU TROUSERS:

Propper (or equivalent to) pants
60% Cotton/ 40% Polyester
Color — Navy Blue

Sizes- X Small through X-Large

SWAT BOOTS
Sizes (Men) - 9 through 10 /2 W
Sizes (Women) 7 through 9

BELTS
Color- Black
Sizes- Small through X Large

YOUTH T-SHIRTS

Jeerzees Heavy Weight Blend (or equivalent to) t-shirts

50% Cotton/ 50% Polyester

Color- Navy blue with mustard yellow lettering on left side and back
Male and Females sizes- Small through X Large

YOUTH SHORTS

Jeerzees Heavy Weight Blend (or equivalent to) shorts

50% Cotton/ 50% Polyester

Color- Navy Blue with Mustard Yellow Lettering on Left Side.
Male and Female Sizes- Small through X Large

STAFF T-SHIRTS
Jeerzees Heavy Weight Blend (or equivalent to) t-shirts
50% Cotton/ 50% Polyester

Color- Navy Blue with Mustard Yellow Lettering on Left Side and Back

Male and Female Sizes- Small through XX Large

STAFF SHORTS

100% Polyester/ 100% Nylon

Color- Black with no lettering

Male and female sizes- Small through XX Large

WINDBREAKER JACKETS

Color- Blue or Black with Lettering on left side and back
Male and Female Sizes- Small through XX Large

Shell: 100% Nylon coated with 600 MM Acrylic

Body Lining: 65% Polyester/ 35% Cotton

Sleeve Lining; 100% Cotton or Shell: 100% Nylon Lining: 100% Polyester

PICS INCLUDED




V-NECK SHIRTS

Polyester/ Cotton Blend Fabric

Triple Stitch Short Sleeve

Color-Navy with No Lettering

Sizes- Male and Female small through 4 X Large

REGULAR LENGTH WALKING SHORTS
Polyester/ Cotton Blend

Elastic Waistband no drawstring or pockets
Color- navy with no lettering

Sizes- Male and Female small through 4X Large

HEAVY DUTY CANVAS STEP INS DECK STYLE SHOES
Canvas uppers, non skid rubber soles

Color- Navy

Sizes Male and Female 5-13

SPORT BRAS

Two ply lycra/cotton

Hookless pull on style no metal of plastic, racer style back
Color- White

Sizes- small through XX Large

WOMEN’S PANTIES

Brief style

Elastic waistband and leg bands, cotton
Color- white

Sizes 5 through 10

MEN’S BRIEFS

Cotton

Color- White

Size- Small through X Large

TUBE SOCKS

Cotton Polyester blend
Color- white

Size- smali through large

SWEATSHIRTS

50% Cotton/ 50% Polyester
Long sleeves

Color- navy

Size- Medium through 3 XL

SWEATPANTS

50% Cotton/ 50% Polyester

Elastic Waistband, Removable Drawstring
Color- Navy

Size- Medium through 3 XL

DISPOSABLE SHIRTS AND TROUSERS
Spun bonded polypropylene, cloth like fabric
Color- Light blue

Size- Medium through XX Large




FIRE MARSHAL

LONG SLEEVE TWILL

5 ounce, 100% Cotton

Back Pleat

Double Needle Stitching

Patch Pockets

Button- down collars

Button- through sleeve plackets and adjustable cuffs

Fabric is garment washed

Shirts to be embroidered with “COUNTY SEAL” and Office wording

Sizes are M-XXL

Colors: White with Burgundy seal and black lettering
Weathered Blue with Gold Seal and White lettering
Weathered Forest with Gold Seal and white lettering
Bright Burgundy with Navy Blue Seal and white lettering
Classic navy with gold seal and white lettering
Khaki with burgundy seal and black lettering
Stone with burgundy seal and black lettering
Faded Olive with hunter green seal and khaki lettering
Black with gold seal and white lettering
Athletic gold with burgundy seal and black lettering
Sky blue with burgundy seal and khaki lettering
Royal blue with white seal and white/blue lettering

SHORT SLEEVE TWILL

5 ounce, 100% Cotton

Double needle stitching

Patch pockets PICS INCLUDED

Button- down collar

Double needle hemmed at sleeve cuffs

Fabric is garment washed

Shirts to be embroidered with “County Seal” and Office wording

Sizes are M-XXL

Colors: White with Burgundy seal and black lettering
Weathered Blue with Gold Seal and White lettering
Weathered Forest with Gold Seal and white lettering
Bright Burgundy with Navy Blue Seal and white lettering
Classic navy with gold seal and white lettering
Khaki with burgundy seal and black lettering
Stone with burgundy seal and black lettering
Faded Olive with hunter green seal and khaki lettering
Black with gold seal and white lettering
Athletic gold with burgundy seal and black lettering
Sky blue with burgundy seal and khaki lettering
Royal blue with white seal and white/blue lettering

SPORT SHIRT POLO

6.1 ounce, 100% Cotton

Welt Collar

2 Button Placket

Side Seamed with a double needle stitched sleeve and bottom hem
Colorfast to maintain original color

Sizes will vary from M-XXL

Colors- Navy, Khaki, Red, Hunter Green, Black




DUTY POLO

70% Cool Max Fabric or equivalent to

Comfort fit pattern and extra long tails with side vents

30% Polyester Construction

Y inch 3M Scotchlite (or equivalent to) reflective trim around sleeves for greater visibility
Microphone keepers on shoulders and on front placket

Single pocket on left side

Shirts to have department badge embroidered on left chest

Sizes will vary from M-XXL

Colors- Navy, White, Black

T-SHIRTS

6 ounce, 100% Cotton combed ring spun cotton
18 singles

Taped shoulder to shoulder

Cover seamed front neck armholes and shoulders
Double needle sleeve and bottom hem

Sizes will vary from M-XXL

Colors- black, navy, khaki

SWEATSHIRT

Crewneck style with rib-knit collar

Cuffs and bottom

Smooth finish on outside and brushed fleece inside
Color-Navy

CLASS A SHIRT

Lightweight 4.5 oz 65% polyester/ 35% cotton
Military style shirt

Sewn in Creases

Scalloped pocket flap with pleated pockets
Short sleeve style to have convertible collar
Long sleeve style to have banded collar

Sizes will vary from M- XXL

Colors- White and Navy

TACTICAL PANT

Pre-washed

Fade Resistant

8.5 ounce 100 % cotton canvas

Action Waist

59 Heavy duty bartacks for strength and durability
YKK zip front fly with Prym snap

Rear slash pockets

Utility strap

Flashlight/cell phone pocket

Side Cargo Pockets

Solid brass d-ring

Double reinforced seat

Double knees and hidden knee pad pockets

30-44 waist sizes for men and 8-16 sizes for women



HEAVY DUTY WORK PANT

Stain-resistant

8 ounce 65% poly/ 35% cotton twill

Durable press finish so pants need little or no ironing
Button closure and button close back pocket

Full cut thigh, double stitched pockets

30-44 waist sizes for men and 8-16 sizes for women
Colors- Khaki, navy, black

CLASS A TROUSER

5 oz 65% polyester 35% cotton

Brass ratcheting YKK zipper

Crush- proof hook and eye closure

30-44 waist sizes for men and 8-16 sizes for women
Colors- Navy, Black, Khaki

TACTICAL TROUSER

6.5 oz 65% polyester/ 35% cotton twill

Gripper elastic waistband shirtstay

Two 8.5”deep rear flashlight pockets (sap pockets)
Two cargo pockets with extra pockets inside (outer pockets have Velcro closure and inside pockets have
brass zipper closures)

Two back pockets with button tabs

Large keystone belt loops

Brass fly zipper with auto-lock closure

Split seam tailored construction

Extra strength tandem-needle seat seam

Triangular bartacks at all stress points

30-44 waist sizes for men and 8-16 sizes for women
Color- Navy, Black

WINDBREAKER

Two front slash pockets
Drawstring bottom

Snap front closure

Water repellent nylon shell
Lightweight flannel lining

Set in sleeves with elasticized cuffs
Sizes will vary from M- XXL
Color- navy

RAINCOAT

ANSI Class 3 Reversible 50” Raincoat

Has black 200 denier nylon shell that reverses to fluorescent orange-red 250 denier polyester
Made from NFPA 701 flame retardant material

ANSI Side has 360 degrees of 3M Scotchlite (or equivalent to) retroreflective striping
Sealed seams and storm front with snap closure for full protection

Raglan sleeves for easy movement

Coat to come with pass-through pocket for easy access to duty belt and gear.

Sizes will vary from M- XXL



DUTY JACKET

Duty jacket with three ply Taslan and Hiptex 2000 or equivalent.
Double storm flap

Storm collar and adjustable cuffs

Zip out Thinsulate liner for added warmth (or equivalent to)

360 degrees telescopic sleeve system for full arm extension
Convertible 3M Scotchlite reflective trim on cuffs (or equivalent to)
Side zippers for access to equipment

Pit zips for ventilation and easy emblem application

Two outside pockets with side handwarmer openings

Two inside pockets fully accessible with liner

Liner has additional pocket

Detachable epaulets

Sizes will vary from M- XXL

Colors- Navy, Black

OVERALLS

Duck Bib 100% Cotton

Large bib pocket and pencil division in front
Handy double rule pocket and hammer loop
Reinforced back pockets

Crossover high back

Triple stitching and bartacks

Sizes will vary from M- XXL

DUTY BOOT

8” Men’s Waterproof ETC Safety Toe Zipper Boot (or equivalent to)
Lace to toe military styling

Steel toe boot meets ANSI Z41 PT99 M1/75 C/75 and ASTM F2413-05 standards
Side Zipper

Leather/Cordura nylon (or equivalent to)

Walotex membrane (or equivalent to)

Steel shank

Removable insole

Slip resistant vibram outsole (or equivalent to)

Sizes will vary: Men 8-12 and Women 6-9

STRUCTURAL BOOT

16” Bunker fire boots

Shoe fit design

Padded shin protector

Crack resistant poly shell
Black with safety yellow trim
Steel shank

Steel midsole

Steel toe

Waterproof

Lug outsole

Sizes will vary: Men 8-12 and Women 6-9

CAPS

Baseball type

100% polyester
Velcro adjustable strap
Color- Navy




SHERIFF’S OFFICE
POLYPROPYLENE (OR EQUIVALENT) PANTS

Polypropylene (or equivalent to) light weight, spun bonded pants, with elastic waist. In a 1.25 oz material
weight. Porous construction accounts for breathable, economical, and disposable garment.

Color- Navy Blue

Sizes: Small- 5Xlarge

5.7 OZ POLO SHIRTS

Assorted colors of 65% Polyester/ 35% Cotton Polo Shirts in Male and Female Sizes with Embroidery on
both left and right sides of breast of shirt. Embroidery might include %” Office Logo lettering, Dept.
Lettering, Employees Name, or 2 5” by 2 /4” Sheriff’s Decal embroiderer in assorted Colors. On an as
needed basis

Male Sizes with pocket from X-small to 6 XLarge

Female Sizes w/out pocket from X-small to 6 XLarge

Assorted Shirt colors to include red, white, navy, tan, royal, yellow, purple, Kelly, hunter green, black ,
light blue, burgundy and gray.

Blue generation easy-care service wear Poplins (or equivalent) polyester/ cotton blend, Teflon stain release
treated, wash and wear, soft touch finish, rib knit collar & cuffs, wood toned buttons.

5.5 OZ POPLIN SHIRTS

Assorted colors of 65% Polyester/ 35% Cotton Poplin Shirts in Male and Female Sizes with Embroidery on
both left and right sides of breast of shirt. Embroidery might include % Office Logo lettering, Dept.
Lettering, Employees Name, or 2 /2 by 2 2” Sheriff’s Decal embroiderer in assorted Colors. On an as
needed basis

Male Sizes with pocket from X-small to 6 XLarge in both long and short sleeve with pocket

Female Sizes w/out pocket from X-small to 6 XLarge in both long and short sleeve w/out pocket

Assorted Shirt colors to include red, white, navy, tan , royal, yellow, purple, Kelly, hunter green, black ,
light blue, burgundy and gray.

Blue generation easy-care service wear Poplins (or equivalent) polyester/ cotton blend, Teflon stain release
treated, wash and wear, soft touch finish, rib knit collar & cuffs, wood toned buttons

FORCE 10 JACKET (EQUAL OR BETTER)
WATERPROOF/BREATHABLE

Waist length duty jacket with weatherproof windproof/waterproof/ breathable system, zipper front, zipper
fly, pleated two-way pockets, adjustable cuffs, shirt collar style, and zippered side vents with elasticized
side tabs. Removable thermal liner. Color in Navy or Brown.

I. FABRIC/MATERIALS

Outer shell: Extreme all weather laminate technology fabric. Two layer laminated construction with 3-ply
supplex Supreme face fabric. 100% nylon Supplex 70 denier in the warp and in the filling, plain weave, 3-
ply thread construction.

The fabric shall have a minimum non-coated weight of 3.5 ounces per square yard with a thread count of
154 in the warp and 62 in the filling (+-10%). The fabric shall have good color fastness and crocking.

The fabric shall have to maintain a Mullens Hydrostatic rating of 75 psi during the five (5) year guaranteed
life of the jacket. Any jacket tested by the Equipment Services Section that fails to remain at 75 psi shall be
repaired or replaced by the vendor at the vendor’s expense.

Lining Fabric: Black nylon taffeta lining. Plain weave, 70-denier nylon type 66 continuous filament yarns
with 34 filaments, melting point 455 degree Fahrenheit. The fabric shall have a minimum weight of 1.80-
ounces/sq. yard with a thread count of 104 in the warp and 86 in the filling (+-2%). The fabric shall have
good color fastness and crocking.




Breaking Strength: Warp 125 1bs., Filling 85 lbs (+-5%)
Tear Strength: Warp 3.5 Ibs., Filling 2.1 1bs (+-5%)
Shrinkage: Warp 2%, Filling 2%.

Removable Liner: The face of the removable liner shall be 100% nylon taffeta and the inner side shall be
100% nylon tricot, both color black. The thermal batting is to be 7.5-ounce polyester fiber. The stitch
pattern is to be 6" diamond.

Interlining: White Pellon C-39

Knitting: 100% nylon stretch knit, continuous filament yarn 400 denier, with a minimum of 16 wales and
32 courses, rating to light, perspiration and wet/dry cleaning to be a minimum of 4. Wristlet 3 x 8.

Fleece Pocketing: Black, Fleece.
Fasteners: All fasteners shall be as follows or equivalent:

Zippers: Front zipper, #8, Delrin with 2 sliders.
Liner zipper, #5, Delrin with 1 slider.
Pocket zipper #2, coil with 1 slider.
Side zipper, #6, coil with 1 slider.
Sleeve zipper, #2, coil with 1 slider.

Snaps: The snaps shall 24 ligne universal prong snaps that have been oxidized to prevent rusting,
Eyelets: Black, metal, small.

Thread: All thread shall be polyester thread with a wrap with a thirty (36) strength in a fifty
(50) size or better.

Seam Tape: Composite secam sealing tape that is compatible to the composite fabric, 7/8” wide.

Elastic: Natural color, 1-1/2" Bi-swing.
Natural color, 2" Waistband.
Natural color, 1" Cuff.

Binding: Black, 1-3/4" wide, nylon bias.
Velcro: Black, 5/8” wide, hook & loop.
Metal Buttons: 24 Ligne.

Button Rings: Silver rings.

II. DESIGN FEATURES

FRONT: There is to be a front zipper that shall run from the bottom of the jacket to the neck collar seam
with a two-way zipper. Under the zipper and offset on the facing shall be a 1-1/2” wide zipper fly, which
runs the full length of the front to stop water and other liquids. There shall be two-way compartment
pleated pockets that shall be placed 2" above the waistband. There shall be a badge holder above the left
flap, made of shell fabric with two small black metal eyelets set 1-1/8" apart. The holder is to be 1" by 2-
1/4", centered over the pocket flap, at chest height.

POCKETS: Pockets to measure 7-1/2" wide by 8" deep, pleat to measure 1-1/2". Muff pockets shall be
formed under each pocket with a 5-3/4” opening on the sleeve side. Pockets are to close with scalloped
flaps that measure 2-1/2" at the points and 3-3/8”" at the center. Flaps are to be held down with velcro
loops at the flap comers. 24 ligne metal buttons to be attached with rings at the center point through a
buttonhole. A separate pencil pocket shall open between the left flap and pocket.




COLLAR: The collar is to be cut in a shirt collar style with a collar stand. The collar is to measure 3-1/2"
at the points and 4" at the center. Collar to be interlined but not zigzag stitched. There shall be hanger made
out of the outer shell fabric that is set at the center of the neck collar seam.

BACK DESIGN: The back shall be a plain full cut back with an elasticized waistband that extends to the
zippered side vents. The front waistbands shall have a plain section 5” from the front zippers and shirred
with elastic to the zippered side vents. The waistband shall measure 2-1/2” wide.

SLEEVES: The sleeves shall be a one-piece design with elasticized adjustable cuffs.

ADJUSTABLE CUFFS: The cuff shall be a one-piece design made out of self-material and shall measure
1-3/4" wide. The top half of the cuffs shall have heavy-duty 1-1/2” wide elastic stretched and sewn with
double needle stitch. There shall be cuff tabs that measure 1-1/4” wide and taper to 3/4” wide, 3-1/2” long
with a large snap (male portion). There shall be two large snaps (female portion) set 2 apart for cuff
adjustments.

EPAULETS: There shall be epaulets set on the shoulders and sewn into the shoulder and sleeve seam.
The epaulets shall be cross-stitched and shall have a buttonhole. The epaulets are to measure 2-1/4" at the
shoulders and 2" at the points. The epaulets shall be interlined. The epaulets shall be backtacked to the
shoulder neck seam. The epaulets are to fasten with a 24-ligne metal button with a button ring through the
buttonhole.

SIDE VENTS: The zippered side vents are to be finished with a coil #6 size 10" long zipper with a
reversible slider. There shall be side tabs made out of the self-material set to the bottom back vent, which
will be elasticized with 1” elastic. The side tab shall have a snap (male portion) and shall snap across the
bottom vent of the waistband with a snap (female portion) set on the front and back of the zippered side
vent. The side tab shall measure 1" by 3" long.

LINING: The jacket is to be fully lined with nylon taffeta. There is to be a patch pocket made out of outer
shell fabric placed on the left side. It is to have a 6” zipper opening and to measure 7” x 7-1/2". The lining
sleeves shall be a one-piece design with a sieeve zipper to allow emblems and embroidery applied without
affecting waterproofness and contamination. There shall be a shell reinforcement panel sewn into the neck
seam to secure the liner with a 24 ligne snap. The panel shall measure approximately 4” in width and in
length. This panel shall also have the brand label and the permanent size labels sewn on.

FACINGS: The facings are to be made out of outer shell fabric. The facings are to measure approximately
1-1/4” wide and shall be as long as the front length, not including the waistband. The liner attaching
zippers are to be placed on the facings.

REMOVABLE LINER: The removable thermal liner is to have body and sleeve insulation. The cuffs
are to be held in place with metal snaps. In the neck area there will be a black knit collar and a large metal
snap. The liner will be attached to the jacket with #5 delrin zippers, 18" long, set on the front facings.
Under the armholes will be a 4” by 12" knit gussets for movement. There shall be knit wristlets and large
metal snaps at the cuff area for attachment. There will be 5-3/4" vents at the bottom of the side seams. The
quilt parts will be bound with 1-3/4" black nylon bias binding. There shall be one patch pocket on the left
side.

LABELS: Each jacket shall have a permanent brand label, a care instruction label, ID label, and
permanent size labels.

HANGTAGS

SILENCE OF SPECIFICATION: The apparent silence of the specification as to any details or the
omission from it of a detail description concerning any point shall be interpreted as meaning that only the




best commercial practices are to prevail and that only materials and workmanship of first quality are to be
used.

III. MEASUREMENTS

SIZING: The manufacturer shall be capable of providing all sizes for men and women, including any
special size requirements. The manufacturer shall have a company representative or authorized dealer
available to assist with the fittings of the garments at no additional cost.

The following sizes have been established.

SIZE CHART:

SIZE FINISHED CHEST BACK LENGTH SLEEVE INSEAM
SMALL (36-38) 48 26 20
MEDIUM (40-42) 52 26 20
LARGE (44-46) 56 26 20
X-LARGE (48-50) 60 26 20
XX-LARGE (52-54) 64 26 20
XXX-LARGE (56-58) 68 26 20
XXXX-LARGE (60-62) 72 26 20
TOLERANCES +-1" A +1"
LONG LENGTH +1" +1" +1"
X-LONG LENGTH +1" +2" +2"

PRECINCT NO. 4

STANDARD INDUSTRIAL SHIRTS/SMOCKS
Long Sleeve

Short Sleeve

Extended Sizes (Any additional costs)

65% Polyester/ 35% Cotton

Blue Approximately 235

Navy Approximately 20

EMBLEMS

County Emblem (Left Breast Attachment)

*Emblem Consists of White Thread/ Cursive Lettering on a 4 4” x 2 %4” Navy Blue Patch Reading
“HIDALGO COUNTY PCT. #4”

Name (Right Breast Direct Embroidery)

*Name will be Employees First or Last Name in 17 Black Thread Cursive Letters

ELECTIONS DEPARTMENT

DUTY POLO



70% Cool Max Fabric or equivalent to

Comfort fit pattern and extra long tails with side vents

30% Polyester Construction

2 inch 3M Scotchlite (or equivalent to) reflective trim around sleeves for greater visibility
Microphone keepers on shoulders and on front placket

Single pocket on left side

Shirts to have department badge embroidered on left chest

Sizes will vary from Medium to 3XL

Colors- Dark Navy Blue/ Logo Color- Gold

BOOT CAMP

T-SHIRTS

50/50 Poly Cotton Blend, Adult size, short sleeve, full cut round neck, pre-shrunk
Sizes: Medium through 2XI.

Colors: white, navy, green, red, royal, orange, maroon, khaki

All colored shirts need the County Emblem as well as the Boot Camp

BOXER BRIEFS
Preshrunk, white, 50-50 Poly cotton sizes small (30-32) through 2XL (46-48 Waist)

SWEATSHIRT

Crew neck, adult sizes, premium weight fleece
Approximate 50/50 cotton and polyester
Color- ash gray

SWEATPANTS

Adult sizes, premium weight fleece
Approximate 50/50 cotton and polyester
Color- ash gray

LONG SLEEVE TWILL

5 ounce, 100% Cotton

Back Pleat

Double Needle Stitching

Patch Pockets

Button- down collars

Button- through sleeve plackets and adjustable cuffs

Fabric is garment washed

Shirts to be embroidered with “COUNTY SEAL” and Office wording
Sizes are M-XXL

Various Colors

Gold Seal and White Lettering, Burgundy Seal and Black Lettering, Navy Blue Seal and White Lettering

SPORT SHIRT POLO

6.1 Ounce 100 % Cotton

Welt Collar

2 Button Plachet

Colors: navy, red, hunter green, black, white with County Seal and office wording
Sizes vary from Small-2XL

COOKING HATS
Disposable white, (Sizes med, large)

SWEAT ASH GRAY TOP
Crew Neck 50% Cotton, 50% Polyester, Collar, cuffs



Waistband is covered-seamed and ribbed
Sizes small, medium and large

SWEAT ASH GRAY BOTTOM
50% Cotton, 50% Polyester
Elastic cuffs

Sizes small, medium and large

T-SHIRT CREW NECK

White, preshrunk, durable taped neck, shoulder seams, extra long tail,
100% cotton

sizes: small, medium, large adults

BOXER UNDERWARE
Durable, poly/cotton blended white boxer shorts, elastic waistbands and fly front
Sizes: small, medium, large (adult)

SOCKS

White crew socks, 86% cotton, 14% man made fiber
Reinforced gray heel and toe

Extra thick cushioned foot

RUNNING SHOES
Heavy duty with breathable eyelets, reinforced rubber toe cap, full cushion insoles, non-skid, non marking
Sizes 7 'z through 11

PRECINCT NO. 1

PATCHES, EMBLEMS OR EMBROIDERY

Precinct Emblem (Left Breast Attachment)

*Emblem Consists of Blue and Yellow County Shape, with County Emblem Reading PCT. 1 and Star
within it PICS INCLUDED
Name (Right Breast Attachment)

*Name will be Employees First or Last Name in White Thread Cursive Letters on a 3 2” x 1 12” Patch.

IT DEPARTMENT

SHIRTS

Cotton button up shirt with pocket in both long sleeve and short sleeve with County Logo/ IT Department
emblem in color choice of blue, red, maroon, khaki or green

Sizes vary from small through 2XL.

SPORT SHIRT POLO

6.1 ounce, 100% Cotton

Welt Collar

2 Button Placket

Side Seamed with a double needle stitched sleeve and bottom hem

Colorfast to maintain original color

Sizes will vary from S-XXL

With County Logo and IT Department emblem in the following color choices.
Colors- Blue. Red, Maroon, Khaki, Green




332" DISTRICT COURT

JUDICIAL ROBES
Designed to close with a hook and eye at the top and two loops at chest level.
Material must be 100% Polyester or Dacron/Wool

ACADEMIC CAPS
Mortarboard with folding crown. Four, Six and Eight Corner

TASSELS
Regular silk, Two button, silky tassel or gold metallic tassel

MASTER COURT NO. 2

JUDICIAL ROBE

Traditional open sleeve, judicial design with a smooth shoulder yoke and distinctive front panels.
Concealed waist length zipper closure.

Men sizes: Average and Husky

Length: Short, Regular and Tall

Women Sizes: Small and Medium

Should include carry case

CONSTABLE PRECINCT NO. 3

RAINCOAT

48” Vinyl Raincoat with sealed seams, pass through pockets, non-corrosive snap-front closure; detachable,
snap on hood, ventilated back and underarms, and screen printed on the back in Black with Constable in
capital letter 4” (Sizes from small to XXXXL)

TROUSER BELT
1 %" Black leather belt, hand-creased with rubbed edges with removable nickel buckle with plain finish
(Sizes 28 to 50 waist)

TIE
Taupe color, Clip-on tie, with buttonhole you can slide small end of tie through the loop and button to shirt,
size Regular (17'4”) Long (19 2”), 3” wide with permanent knot, made of polyester

TACTICAL UNIFORM

Shirt: Long sleeve, pen/pencil pocket, two large chests pockets with hidden buttons, reinforced elbows,
hidden button front, adjustable waist and cuff tabs, double stitched seams, Brown in color (size from
regular or long from small to XXXXXL)

PANTS

BDU pants, Brown in color, sizes from regular or long from small to XXXXXI, constructed from 7.0 oz./
65% poly / 35% cotton. Roomy thigh back pockets with hidden buttons, reinforced knees and seats, waist
tabs, drawstrings button, button fly

CAPS
Hot weather combat cap, Brown in color, constructed from 65% poly / 35% cotton (size from small to
XXL)

T SHIRTS
Constructed from 65% poly / 35% cotton, brown in color (sizes from small to XXXXL)




NAME STRIPS
Embroidered name strips, Khaki in color with black lettering and applied to shirt to shirt to the tactical
uniform shirt

RED SHOLDER CORDS
See attached photo

UNIFORM PATCHES
See attached photo, subject to change colors

DRESS GLOVES
White in color, with snaps, 100% cotton (sizes medium to X Large)

REPLACEMENT BUTTONS FOR SHIRTS
The Star of Texas with Texas spelled out on the button, one button finish will be silver and the other button
finish will be gold, with toggles/ washers (see attached photo)

RAIN COVERS FOR HATS
Plastic covers for hats 4”’brim

COWBOY HATS

Straw hats, Stetson straw (equal or better) Style: Roper, Color Silver Belly, 4” Brim with brown eyelits,
quality 4 X to 10 X, brown brim strap (sizes: 6 % and up)

Felt cowboy hat: Stetson felt (equal or better), Style: Roper, Color Silver Belly, 4” brim, quality 4X or
better (sizes 6 % and up)

SHIRTS
Button down oxford 60% cotton / 40% poly, colors white, khaki and light blue (Men’s sizes small to XXX
Large and Women'’s small to XX Large)

MISCELLANEOUS

CAPS

Mesh baseball cap 65% polyester / 35% cotton 100% mesh back w/ embroidered department emblem
(emblems may vary) adjustable

SHIRT
Body armor under shirt (sizes small and up)

TWILL LONG SLEEVE SHIRT
Embroidered with name and department emblem or badge (sizes small and up)

POLO SHIRT
Short sleeve polo shirt with name and department emblem or badge (sizes small and up)

TRADITIONAL WORK COAT (equal or better)

Constructed from 12 oz. firm hand 100% cotton duck material, 100% nylon quilted-to-polyester artic
weight lining, corduroy top collar with snaps under the collar and zipper front with Velcro wind flap (color
duck brown) sizes small and up

PRECINT NO. 3

LONG SLEEVE TWILL
5 ounce, 100% Cotton




Back Pleat

Double Needle Stitching

Patch Pockets

Button- down collars

Button- through sleeve plackets and adjustable cuffs

Fabric is garment washed

Shirts to be embroidered with “COUNTY SEAL” and Office wording

Sizes are S-XXL

Colors: White with Burgundy seal and black lettering
Weathered Blue with Gold Seal and White lettering
Weathered Forest with Gold Seal and white lettering
Bright Burgundy with Navy Blue Seal and white lettering
Classic navy with gold seal and white lettering
Khaki with burgundy seal and black lettering
Stone with burgundy seal and black lettering
Faded Olive with hunter green seal and khaki lettering
Black with gold seal and white lettering
Athletic gold with burgundy seal and black lettering
Sky blue with burgundy seal and khaki lettering
Royal blue with white seal and white/blue lettering

SECURITY DEPARTMENT

BREATHABLE POLO STYLE BIKE PATROL SHIRT

Teflon and Supplex plated fabric (or equivalent to) for fade and stain resistance
Underarm vents of Cool Max Fabric or equivalent to

Breathable fabric

Zipper front

Shirts to have department badge embroidered on left chest

Sizes will vary from M-XXXL

Colors-Navy, Black

CLASS A ZIPPER FRONT SHIRT
65% Cool Max Fabric or equivalent to
35% Polyester

Zipper front, mock button closure
Pleated pockets with scalloped flaps
Left pocket pencil divider

Badge Tab with full inner sling
Convertible front collar

Velcro closure

Shoulder epaulets

Sewn—in creases

Extra long tails

Fabric lined yoke

Sizes will vary from M-XXXL
Colors-Navy, Black

COLOR BLOCK TWO TONE POLO SHIRTS

Must be constructed of moisture wicking and fade resistant fabric

Two-tone color blocked body White top /Black bottom

Two-button polo styled placket with integrated microphone keeper

Hidden chest pocket with concealed zipper closure

Reflective tape around the sleeves and piping across the front and back chest




Shoulder epaulets

Long body and split-tail hem longer in the back
Single needle top stitching

Sizes will vary from M-XXXL

TACTICAL UNIFORM PANT
65% Polyester, 35% Rayon
Permanent creases

Large keystone belt loops

Deep rear flashlight pockets
Diamond gusset crotch

Hidden zippered security pocket
With cargo pockets

Un hemmed

Waist Sizes from 32 to 40
Color- Khaki

ALL SEASON LAW DUTY JACKET

100 nylon shell with taffeta lining

Removable lining for versatility

10” zippered side vents with snap closures gun pocket

3 inside pockets, includes snap closure gun pocket

Removable pile fur collar

2-way zipper front closure

2 front pockets with side entry for hands and top entry for items
In sizes from S (34-36) to 2XL (50-52)

Color-Black




EXHIBIT ‘B’
PAYMENT SCHEDULE




Hidalgo County
“Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories”
Bid No. 08-044-02-27-YSI

Tabulation Sheet
Item Description MCM Sporting Uniforms of
Goods Texas
01B. Swat Boots (Men) 9-10 2 W No Bid
(Women) 7-9 No Bid
01C. Belts Small-X Large (Elastic) $4.95
o1F. Staff T-Shirts Small-XLarge $10.50
2XLarge $11.50
o1J. Regular Length Walking Shorts Small- No Bid No Bid
XLarge
2XLarge-4XLarge No Bid No Bid
01K Heavy Duty Canvas Step Ins Deck Style No Bid No Bid
Shoes Sizes 5-13
oiL. Sport Bras Small-XLarge No Bid
2XLarge No Bid
o1P. Sweatshirts Medium-XLarge $8.50
2X1-3XL $9.50
Average: $9.00
01Q. | Sweatpants- XLarge $9.85
2X1-3XL $11.85
02A. Long Sleeve Twill Medium- XLarge No Bid
2XLarge No Bid
02B. Short Sleeve Twill Medium- XLarge No Bid
2XLarge No Bid
02C. Sport Shirt Polo Medium-XLarge No Bid
2XLarge No Bid
o2E. T-Shirts Medium-XLarge No Bid
2 XLarge No Bid
o2F. Sweatshirts Medium- XLarge $7.80
2 Xlarge $9.80
Average $8.80
02G. | Class A Shirt Medium- XLarge No Bid

2 XLarge

No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

o2H. | Tactical Pant Men 30-44 No Bid
W 81
omen 8-16 No Bid
o2l. Heavy Duty Work Pant Men 30-44 No Bid
Wi 8-16
omen No Bid
02J. Class A Trouser Men 30-44 No Bid
Women 8-16 No Bid
o2L. Windbreaker Medium-XLarge $15.00
2XLarge $16.95
02M. | Raincoat Medium-XLarge No Bid
2XLarge No Bid
02N. | Duty Jacket Medium-XLarge No Bid
2XLarge No Bid
02P. Duty Boot Men 8-12 No Bid
Women 6-9 No Bid
02Q. Structural Boot Men 8-12 No Bid
Women 6-9 No Bid
o3D. 5.7 oz Polo Shirts XSmall-XLarge
2XLarge-6XLarge
o3E. 5.5 Oz Poplin Shirts X-Small - X-
Large
2XLarge-6XLarge
osF. Force 10 Jacket Small-XLarge No Bid
2XLarge-4-XLarge
TN MCM SPORTING
PRECINCT #4 GOODS
Standard Industrial Shirts/Smocks
Small-XLarge
2XLarge-5XLarge
- . - MCM SPORTING
ELECTIONS DEPARTMENT GOODS
Duty Polo Medium-XLarge 2XLarge-
3XLarge
AT MCM SPORTING
BOOT CAMP GOODS
Boxer Briefs Small-2XLarge
06J. T-Shirts Crew Neck Small-Large
06L. Socks

UNIFORMS
OF TEXAS

UNIFORMS
OF TEXAS




06M. | Running Shoes 7 V- 11 No Bid No Bid
IT DEPARTMENT MCI\%%P(())II){STING L(Ti\[{l}l:(z)[({lzlf
08B. Sport Shirt Polo- Small- XLarge $17.95
2XLarge $18.95
CONSTABLE PRECINCT # 3 MOMSPORTING - UNIFORMS
11A. Raincoat Small-X-Large No Bid J
2XLarge-6XLarge No Bid
11B. Trouser Belt No Bid
1C. Tie No Bid
1D. Tactical Uniform Small-XLarge No Bid
2XL-6XL No Bid
1E. Pants Small-XLarge No Bid
2XL-6XL No Bid
11F. Caps Small-XXLarge No Bid
11G. T-Shirts Small-XLarge No Bid
2XL-6XL No Bid
11Q. Shirts Small-XLarge $19.95
11R. Twill Long Sleeve Shirt (Small- $26.95
XLarge)
PRECINCT # 3 MCI\{;%P(;)&;“NG ((T)l\i:“]:'(;RMS
12A. Duty Polo Medium-XLarge No Bid -
2XLarge-3XLarge No Bid
SECURITY-ADMINISTRATION MOV SPORTING TR0
13A. Breathable Polo Style Bike Patrol No Bid »
Shirt Small-XLarge
2XLarge-3XLarge No Bid
13B. Class A Zipper Front Shirt Med- No Bid
XLarge
2XLarge-3XLarge No Bid
13C. Color Block Two Tone Polo Shirt No Bid
Medium-XLarge
2XLarge-3XLarge No Bid
13D. Tactical Uniform Pant Waist Sizes 32- No Bid
40
13E. All Season Law Duty Jacket Small- No Bid
XLarge
2XLarge No Bid




MCM Sporting Goods Inc
1302 North Conway
Mission, Texas 78572
956-581-1632
956-581-1685

Contact: Jorge Garza
mcmsports@yahoo.com

Uniforms Of Texas
6601 Montana Suite B& C
El Paso, Texas79925
915-771-6601
915-843-6601 Fax
Contact: Hector Ayala
uniformsoftexas@yahoo.com




Hidalgo County

1

“Purchase of Uniforms and/or Accessories”

Bid No. 08-044-02-27-YSI

Bid Page
01.  Juvenile Probation
A. BDU Trousers W (
Sizes XS-XL $ o
B. Swat Boots iMen) 9-10 2 W $ v I >
(Women) 7-9
5 RZ
C Belts -
' N)
Small- X Large C&\ ‘\er\ C $ q/-
D. Youth T-Shirts 50
Small- X Large $ L.{ A
E. Youth Shorts 2;;‘
Small- X Large $ !{) -
F. Staff T-Shirts Small- XLarge 3 \D‘SD
2XLarge 50
5 L)
G.  Staff Shorts Small- XLarge $ Q>°\°
2XLarge XS
3 &
H. Windbreaker Jackets Small-XLarge $ Y\ / ’b
2XLarge N
$ %
L. V-Neck Shirts Small- XLarge $ 7
2XLarge-4XLarge 5 /
J. Regular Length Walking Shorts Small-XLarge $ K
2XLarge-4XLarge s \
K. Heavy Duty Canvas Step Ins Deck Style Shoes
Sizes 5-13 $
L. Sport Bras Small-XLarge $ [
2XLarge
s\
M. Women's Panties $
Sizes 5-10
N. Men'’s Briefs
Small-XLarge $




0. Tube Socks N
Small-Large $ 6
O
P. Sweatshirts Medium-XLarge $ %6
2XL-3XL 50
$ A,
%3
Q. Sweatpants- XLarge $ Y
2XL-3XL -
$ %"\g/
R. Disposable Shirts & Trousers Med. XLarge $
2 XLarge
$ e
02.  Fire Marshal
A, Long Sleeve Twill Medium- XLarge $ N / ‘K))
2XLarge =
s /
B. Short Sleeve Twill Medium- XLarge $ (
2XLarge
5 N\
C. Sport Shirt Polo Medium-XLarge $ /
2XLarge
s -/
D. Duty Polo Medium-XLarge $ ﬁ
2 XLarge
$ )\
E. T-Shirts Medium-XLarge $ )
2 XLarge 5 C
F. Sweatshirts Medium- XLarge $ ffl, 70
2 XLarge 4
$ §
G.  Class A Shirt Medium- XLarge $ ﬂ/ / %
2 XlLarge t
$ [
H. Tactical Pant Men 30-44 $ (
Women 8-16
$ N\
L Heavy Duty Work Pant Men 30-44 $ Z
Women 8-16
s/
J. Class A Trouser Men 30-44 $ (
Women 8-16 5




K. Tactical Trouser Men 30-44 $ NG @
Women 8-16
5 HE
. . 60
L. Windbreaker Medium-XLarge $ | 5
2XLarge
$ | loqi
M. Raincoat Medium-XLarge $ ,\ ( 97
2XLarge
$ /
N. Duty Jacket Medium-XLarge $ \
2XLarge
s )
0. Overalls Medium-XLarge $ L
2XLarge
$ (
P. Duty Boot Men 8-12 $ \
Women 6-9
s /
Q. Structural Boot Men 8-12 $ i
Women 6-9 Z
$
S
R. Caps $ \Q q/
03.  Sheriff’s Office ,
A. $ N / &,
$ [
B. $ L
$ )
C. $ /
s
D. 5.7 oz Polo Shirts XSmall-XLarge $ | qﬁ S
2XLarge-6XLarge a5 g5 oy
5/3-i9 ~ A0
E. 5.5 Oz Poplin Shirts X-Small - X-Large $ ;ze);‘l,’i
2XLarge-6XLarge $ ( 3)6 ¥ Y q.:& S 5l
s N/
I
F. Force 10 Jacket Small-XLarge $ L
2XLarge-4-XLarge s /




04.  Precinct No. 4 ‘

A. Standard Industrial Shirts/Smocks Small-XLarge $ I~ / @
2XLarge-5XLarge 5 A / 6

B. Emblems $ 5 Q2.

05.  Elections Department

A.  Duty Polo Medium-XLarge $ /1% | 5
2XLarge-3XLarge 5 n I b

06.  Boot Camp

A.  T-Shirts Medium-XLarge $ 198
2XLarge S 50\.5/

B. Boxer Briefs Small-2XLarge $ .

C. Sweatshirts Small-XLarge $ 8 =
2XLarge S 8 G ¥

D. Sweatpants Small-XLarge $ 8 a5
2XLarge 5 CI gy

E. Long Sleeve Twill Medium-XLarge $ I Lb
2XLarge

$ [

F. Sport Shirt Polo Small-XLarge $ v
2XLarge 5 (

G. Cooking Hats $ /’\. /

| Med, Large b

H. Sweat Ash Gray Top Small, Med, Large $ 8 s

L Sweat Ash Gray Bottom Small, Med, Large $ 8 Q:'):

J. T-Shirts Crew Neck Small, Med, Large $ : qg

K. Boxer Underwear Small, Medium, Large $ /\//fb

L. Socks $ 1 /

M. Running Shoes 7 Y2- 11 $ ]




2XL-6XL

07.  Precinct No. 1
A. Patches, Emblems, Embroidery $ 5 0.
08.  IT Department
A. Shirts- Small- XLarge $ 3 Ll G §
2XLarge S
5 AL
. as
Sport Shirt Polo-Small-XLarge $ | %
2XLarge 5 1898
09. 332" District Court
A. Judicial Robes $ W [@
Academic Caps $ (
Tassels $ 7
7
10.  Master Court No. 2
A. Judicial Robes $ v / b
11. Constable Precinct No. 3
A. Raincoat Small-X-Large $ ,\// 5
2XLarge-6XLarge ) v /
Trouser Belt $ L
Tie $ \
Tactical Uniform Small-XLarge $ j
2XL-6XL
$ /
E. Pants Small-XLarge $ /
2XL-6XL
s |
Céps Small-XXLarge $ \
G. T-Shirts Small-XLarge $
3




H. Name Strips .
L Red Shoulder Cords $ /
J. Uniform Patches $ &
K.  Dress Gloves Medium-XLarge $ \
L. Replacement Buttons for Shirts $ J
M.  Rain Covers for Hats h) /
N. Cowboy Hats (See Specifications) $ /
0. Shirts Men’s Small-XLarge $ >
2XL-3XL
Women’s Small-XXLarge 3 /
5 (
>
P. Caps $ ’}(4
Q. Shirts Small-XLarge $ \ q c';_
R.  Twill Long Sleeve Shirt (Small-X-Large) $ g& 3
‘ s
S.  Polo Shirt Small-X-Large $ | Or"
T. Traditional Work Coat Small-X-Large $ n / 5
12.  Precinct No. 3
A. Duty Polo Medium-XLarge $ JAY, / 2,
2XLarge-3XLarge § [
13.  Security -Administration
A. Breathable Polo Style Bike Patrol Shirt Small-XLarge | $ n ZZ)
XX-Large-XXX-Large $ ' /
B. Class A Zipper Front Shirt Medium-XLarge $ (
XX-Large-XXX-Large $ \
C.  Color Block Two Tone Polo Shirt Medium-XLarge $ V
XX-Large-XXX-Large $ W
D. Tactical Uniform Pant Waist Sizes 32-40 3 ]
[




E.  All Season Law L. .y Jacket Small(34-36)-X-Large y M ( &
XXLarge (50-52) 5 n / 2,

BIDDER/COMPANY NAME: 0\ () 6@)(?)‘1(\ r\g 0\0&@ S .
ADDRESS: [ 2ND A I, Con L wp,u
CITYSTATEZIP: W\ \ s o T % NS
PHONE NOFAXNO: 4S(, SRl \(oH N [ 95 S81-1LES
E-MAIL ADDRESS: % ¢ 4\ | (DM
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: %N oy

\T \ O
TITLE: Xmm;;}\_ei((fl




EXHIBIT “C”
INSURANCE
REQUIREMENTS




From:Crissy Cantu FaxiD:

Page 2 of 2

Date:6/9/2008 04:34 PM Page:2 of 2

ACORD, CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE {(MMIDD/YYYY}

OPID CC
MCMSP-1 06/09/08

PRODUCER

Mission/Duncan Ins Agency
P O Box 753

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION
ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE
HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND OR
ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW

Mission TX 78573~0753
Phone: 956-581-2183 Fax:956-581-4226 INSURERS AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED INSURERA: Safeco Insurance Co. 11070
. INSURER 8:
ﬁacn sggg‘:ing GOOd.S INSURER C:
1302 N. C . B
Mission TX 78572 INSURER ©:
INSURER E:
COVERAGES

THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING
ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TC WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR

MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN 1S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH
LTRSPOLICIES. AGGREGATE LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAMS.

R

ADDL

POLICY EFFECTIVE |
DATE (MMWDDYY Y}

[POLICY EXPIRATION
DATE {(MM/DD/YY)

LTR INSRO TYPE OF INSURANCE POLICY NUMBER LIMITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1000000
) DAMAGE TO RENTED
A X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABLITY | 02BP280399540 01/2%/08 01/29/089 | PREMISES (Eaocourence) | $ 1000000
Jctamsmaoe [ ] ocour MED EXP (Any one person) | $ 10000
X {Business Owners PERSONAL & ADVINJURY |$ 1000000
GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2000000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG | $ 2000000
POLICY PB: Loc
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMRINED SINGLE LIMIT s
ANY AUTO (Ea accident)
ALL OWNED AUTOS BODILY INJURY s
SCHEDULED AUTOS (Per person}
|| HIRED AUTOS BODILY INJURY s
NON-OWNED AUTOS {Per accident)
‘ W PROPERTY DAMAGE $
I ({Per accident}
GARAGE LIABILITY AUTO ONLY - EA ACCIDENT | §
ANY AUTO OTHER THAN EAACC | §
AUTO ONLY: AGG | §
EXCESS/UMBRELLA LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $
OCCUR CLAIMS MADE AGGREGATE $
$
DEDUCTIBLE s
RETENTION $ $
WC STATU- OTH-
WORKERS COMPENSATION AND TORY LIMITS ER
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY
IDE
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE EL EACH ACCIDENT s ———
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEH $
If yos, describe under
SPECIAL PROVISIONS below E.L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | §
OTHER
PROPERTY 160000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES / EXCLUSIONS ADDED BY ENDORSEMENT / SPECIAL PROVISIONS

SPORTING GOODS STORE

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Hidalgo County
100 South Closner
Edinburg TX 78539

HIDALG3

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION
DATE THEREOF, THE ISSUING INSURER WILL ENDEAYOR TO MAIL ]L* DAYS WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER NAMED TO THE LEFT, BUT FAILURE TO DO SO SKALL
IMPOSE NO OBLIGATION OR LIABILITY OF ANY KIND UPON THE INSURER, ITS AGENTS OR

REPRESENTA’ 3
A D,

ACORD 25 (2001/08)
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From:Crissy Cantu FaxiD:

Fax

Page 1of 2

Date:6/9/2008 04:34 PM Page:1 of 2

Phone: (956) 581-2183
Fax: (956) 581-4226

From:  Crissy Cantu To: Rocio Villarreal
Pages: 2 Fax: (956) 318-2629
Date: 6/9/2008 04:31:01 PM Phone: ( ) -

Subject: MCM Sporting Goods

Confidential Note: Information in this facsimile is confidential and intended for use by the individual or entity named
If you received this telecopy in error, please immediately telephone us and return the original via U.S. Postal

Message:

Rocio,

Here is the Certificate of Liability Insurance requested. Let me know if you need anything else.

Thank you,

Crissy Cantu



