HIDALGO COUNTY
PRECINCT NOS.1&3
ROADWAY LIGHT FIXTURES MAINTENANCE

RFB NO. 2009-095-03-11-OTM

TABULATION SHEET
DESCRIPTION LUMATEC LIGHTING SERVICE | AUSTIN TRAFFIC SIGNAL
1| Lane closure $5,000.00 per unit $1900.00
2 | Remove and replace luminaire fixtures $425.00 $972.00
3 | Replace wire and fuses $460.00 $155.00
4 | Remove and replace photo calls $95.00 $145.00
5 | Remove and replace lamps $125.00 $130.00
6 | Remove and replace ballasts $325.00 $533.00
Reset up to 50’ pole (includes but not limited to | This item is included in the $4585.00
resetting/replacement of.  pole, mast arm, | $5000.00 cost listed in
luminaires with the reuse of existing concrete base | Item 1 (under Lane Closure)
and anchor bolts) As per vendor
Total labor/materials/equipment per pole
Re-lamp poles (lighting standards up to 50’ foot) | This item is included in the $1200.00
includes work necessary to make light fixtures | $5000.00 cost listed in
function correctly ltem 1 (under Lane Closure)
As per vendor
Trencher and operator: to include trenching and | Common (per foot): $2.25 Common (per foot): $14.00
cable replacement per foot, proper backfill and | Rocky (per foot): $3.15 Rocky (per foot): $18.00
compaction depth of 12" below grade.
A | Foreman $42.50 $55.00
B | Electrician $30.00 $73.00
C | Operator $35.00 $36.00
D | Ground Men/Labor $17.50 $33.00
E | 12ton 56" JLG Crane $150.00 $45.00
F | 4ton 46’ Nat'l Crane with bucket $125.00 $67.00
G | Altec AM 660 bucket 40’ $100.00 $75.00
H | Hiranger TDI 65 55’ $125.00 $95.00
|| 30 HP 360 case trencher/backhoe $120.00 $48.00
J 1 6010 case directional drill up to 4" inch No bid $278.00
K | 6010 case directional drill up to 8” inch No bid $360.00
L | Water truck with mud system No bid $79.00
M | Dump truck $75.00 $95.00
N | 1 ton Pick- up with tools $50.00 $21.00
O | Generator $100.00 $10.00
P | Compressor $95.00 $31.00
Q | Digger Derrick $150.00 $175.00
R | Vacuum excavator No bid $61.00




