RFB DATE:

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING RESPONDENT’S LOG
REQUIREMENTS/RFP PACKETS

JUNE 03,2009

RFB OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DEPARTMENT/DESCRIPTION: _HIDALGO COUNTY-“VENDING MACHINE SERVICES”

RFB NO: 2009-015-06-03-SMA

NAME OF BIDDER: .

SIGNATURE (IF APPLICABII?}

PHYSICAL ADDRESS

COMPANY/FIRM & RE%IXZST OR INITIALS OF STAFF DATE CITY-STATE-ZIP
REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME ADDRESSING MAIL OUT PHONE & FAX NO.s
1) Sunrise Vending i‘{ 091N- M ;0‘{/8550
. ar mgen, Ix
ATTN: Martin Hernandez 800-864-4907 toll free
EMR Sandra Montalvo 05/18/09 9564232107 office
956-428-6615 fax
Martin‘hemandez@onetacc‘com
2) RS Preferred Vending, LLC 520 E, Cedar Ave., Ste. E
i . McAllen, Tx 78501
ATTN: Nancy Silva P Fernando Silva 05/18/09 | 956-972-0900 office
956-972-0902 fax
rspreferred@msn.com
3) Coca Cola Bottling Co. of the 2400 Expressway 83 West
Southwest McAllen, Tx 78501
EMR Sandra Montalvo 05/18/09 | 800-647-2653 toll free
ATTN: Anabel Chavez 956-618-6911 fax
achavez(@cokecce.com
g 205 Paredes Line Rd
4) cv SCI’VICC Brownsville, Tx 78521
ATTN: Norma Hernandez EMR Sandra Montalvo 05/18/09 | §36-459-3472 office
-546- cell
956-546-1728 fax
Norma343Q@aol.com
5y N .S Nsilva2367(@yahoo.com
) Gl S EMR Sandra Montalvo 05/18/09 | 956:321-0387-ccll
6) Pepsi Botﬂlng Group 1601 N. International Blvd. Ste. 400
. . Hidalgo, Tx 78557
ATTN: Chris Martinez EMR Sandra Montalvo 05/19/09 | 956-994-6112 office
956-994-0868
Cecilia.gonzales@pepsi.com
7y R&R Distributing é?jOSbEast iexas8 }52:?9
. inburg, 7/
ATTN: Rene Lucio IP Rene Lucio 05/28/09 | oo 4‘5’;’3 83"1 ol
956-287-9614 Home
8) Get Snacks Vending 414 Country Club
) Alamo, Tx 78516
ATTN: Dennis Trom IP Dennis Trom 05/29/09 | 956-781-8812 hm

956-802-8810 cell

dgtromg@sbeglobal.net

*VIA:

IN PERSON (1P)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR)



HIDALGO COUNTY
“VENDING MACHINE SERVICES”

BID No. 2009-015-06-03-SMA

TABULATION SHEET
PARTICIPATING VENDORS :
VALLEY COCA- PEPSI BOTTLING RS PREFERRED
m“..mmws__%mm  COLA GROUP VENDING, LLC
: MecAllen, Tx Hidalgo, Tx MecAllen, Tx
PRODUCT CATAGORY VEND PRICE VEND PRICE VEND PRICE VEND PRICE

12 oz. Soft Drink (can) $0.75 $0.75 $0.75

20 oz. Soft Drink (bottle) $1.00 $1.25 $1.25

12 oz. Bottled Water $0.60 No Bid No Bid

1.25D i

20 oz. Bottled Water $1.00 $ - ot $1.25
| $1.75 Smartwater
12 0z. Sports Drink No bid No bid No bid

$1.50 PowerAde
20 oz. Sports Drink (bottle) $1.25 3175 Vitewala W dter $1.50
$2.00 Energy Drink (16
0Zz.)
$1.25 $1.50 (15.2 02)

16 oz. Bottled Juice $1.00 $1.25 (12 02) zo BID
_ $1.50 (15.2 0z)
_ $2.00 (18.5 0z)

Chips-1 oz (small bag) $0.60 No Bid No Bid

Chips-2 oz (large bag) $0.75 No Bid No Bid

Cookies $0.60 No Bid No Bid

Crackers $0.60 No Bid No Bid

Popcorn $0.60 No Bid No Bid
 Pastries $0.75 No Bid No Bid

Gum & Mints $0.50 No Bid No Bid

Candy & Other Bars $0.75 No Bid No Bid




