HID&EGO‘@OUNWHEEUR@EASINGﬁEFA‘RFI\IENT"
LEARTIEIEAiI‘IN G.-BI]DDER’r SBEOG

BID OPENING DATE: JULY 15, 2009 TIME; 9:30 A.M.

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:!" Hidalgo County —Purchase of Uniforms & Accessories For All
County Law Enforcement Agencies”

BID NO:_2009-068-07-15-SMA BUYER:___SANDRA MONTALVO

NAME OF BIDDER: COMPANY/FIRM

BID
REQUEST
VIA*

SIGNATURE (IF
APPLICABLE)

OR INITIALS OF STAFF

ADDRESSING MAIL QUT

DATE

PHYSICAL ADDRESS
CITY-STATE-ZIP
PHONE & FAX NO.s

1)

FECHHEIMER BROTHER CO.
Attn: Stephanie Asheraft

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/23/09

5804 Park Road 21
Cleburne, Tx 76033
C: 682-225-7298
F:817-887-4762

sashcraft@fechheimer.com

2)

LONE STAR UNIFORMS
Attn: David Mitrani

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/23/09

8430 N. Sam Houston Parkway W.
Houston, Tx 77064
(:832-237-8000 ext. 134
C:-713-502-6742

F: 832-237-8008
david@lonestaruniforms.com

3)

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
Attn: Hector Ayala or
Norma Navarrette

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/23/09

6601 Montana, Suite A-D

El Paso, Tx 79925

0: 915-771-6601

F: 915-843-6601
Uniformsoftexas@yahoo.com

4)

TACTICAL GEAR NOW, INC.
Aitn: Lisa Bray or
Kirk Rovinsky

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/24/09

401 South Sherman, Suite 215
Richardson, Tx 75081
800-282-3327

972-960-9394

214-351-9606 {fax)
lisagafmo.com
kirk@afmo.com

5}

NARDIS, INC.
Attn: Jack Thurmon or Renc Martinez

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/24/09

500 E Main St
Kilgore, TX 75662
903-984-8900
903-984-8082 fax
renem(@nardisinc.com
jit@nardisinc.com

6)

MILLER UNIFORMS & EMBLEMS,
INC

Attn: Robert A Miller

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/24/09

650 Canion St.

Austin, Tx 78752

512-302-5541

512-302-5516 fax
bobmiller@milleruniforms.com
gareyjackson(@milleruniforms.com

7

G T DISTRIBUTORS
Attn: Chyrlynne Crockett

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/24/09

PO Box 16080
Austin, TX 78761
Ph: 512-691-5856
Fax: 512-453-6149
ixbids@gtdist.com
www.gtdist.com

8)

GALLS
Attn: Terry Jones

BLM

Sandra Montalvo

06/25/09

2680 Palumbe Drive
Lexington, KY 40509-1000
800-876-4242 ext 2194
Cell: 859-537-9805

Fax: 469-362-0207
Jones-te; alls.com




9)

ELBECO INC.
Attn: Chip Clary

EM

Sandra Montalvo

06/25/09

4606 Cedar Springs Road, Unit 1218
Dallas, Tx 75219

800-468-4654 ext 173
Fax:214-292-9711

Cell: 484-269-7420
Cclary(@elbeco.com

10)

LAWMEN’S & SHOOTERS’ SUPPLY,

INC.
Attn: Gail Walker-Keen

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/26/09

7750 9" Street SW

Vero Beach, FL 32968

0:772-569-8700 ext. 218

F: 772-569-2955
ail@lawmens.net

11)

R4 INDUSTRIES, INC.
Attn: Lynn Renfro

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/26/09

803 Avenue H East, Suite 307
Arlington, Tx 76011

0O: 817-265-4800
lynn{@rdeca.com

bids{@rdeca.com

12)

1* Source America
Attn: George Guerrero

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/26/09

10118 Sand Pass Lane
Houston, TX. 77064
0:877-970-4626
F:281-970-4626

georgceg@ﬁrs tsourceamerica.com

13)

The Police Qutlet
Attn: Tom

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/28/09

Vigilant Concepts Group, Inc.
1305 Rosa Guerrero
El Pase, TX. 79936

tom@thepoliceoutlet.com

14)

OKklahoma Leather Producers, Inc.
Attn: Mike Platt

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/25/09

500 26™ Street, NW
Miami, OK. 74354
0O: 918-542-6651

F: 918-542-6653

mikeplati@oklahomaleatherproducts.com

15)

Elbeco
Attn: Steven N. Mellott

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/29/09

0: 610-921-0651 x 1932
smelloti@elbeco.com

16)

Propper International, Inc.
Attn: James Travis

EMR

Sandra Montaivo

06/29/09

16539 Dawncrest Way
Sugarland, TX. 77498
0: 832-704-2792
jamestedpropper.com
radarman708@aol.com

17)

Brite Star Services, Ltd.
Attn: Robert McIntyre

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/29/09

57 5 Reynolds §t.
Alice, Tx. 78332
O: 800-462-5670

rmeintyre@dbritestaruniform.com

18)

Red the Uniform Tailor inc.
Attn: Michael Bucks

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/30/09

0:610-478-9994
maddybucks@aol.com,

19)

HMS Career Apparel Fabrics
Attn: Gary J Mazzie

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/30/09

16 Carter Street

Norwood, New Jersey 07648
Q: 917-669-8840

F: 201-768-0211
garym{@hmsfabrics.com

20)

Outdoor Outfits
AttN: Alexandra Diaz

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

06/30/09

372 Richmond Street West, 4™ floor
Toronto, Canada, M%V 1X6

O: 416-598-4111 * 202

F: 416-598-4626
brn{@outdooroutfits.com

21)

Duratex Apparal
Attn: Leila Tuene

Sandra Montalvo

07/01/09

4115 Pecan Blvd. Ste. C.
McAllen, TX. 78501

0: 956-631-3692

F; 956-686-6548
duratexuniforms@yahgo.com

22)

Safariland LLC.
Attn: Patricia Coppedge

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

07/01/09

13386 International Parkway
Jacksonville, FI.. 32218

0: 904-741-1739

F: 904-807-4984

patricia.coppedge@@baesystems.com

23)

CPS Security Solutions
Attn: Jose Lopez

EMR

Sandra Montalvo

07/01/09

436 W. Walnut St.
Gardena, Ca. 90248
0: 702-289-1136

ilopez@cpssecurity.com




518 N, Interurban Street
24) Regali | Richardson, Tx 75081
egatl ne. EMR Sandra Montalvo 07/09/09 | ©:972-726-8830
Attn: Denise Locke F: 972-726-8860
denise(@regalicreative.com
renee@regaliine.com

3828 South Main Street

Salt Lake Utah, UT. 84115

Q: 801-261-4400

F: 801-261-1580

Cell: 801-455-8179
kpearson@skaggscompanies.com

25) Skaggs Companies, Inc.
Attn: Karen Pearson

EMR Sandra Montalve 07/01/09

*VIA:

[N PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR)



HIDALGO COUNTY

“PURCHASE OF UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES FOR ALL COUNTY LAW ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES”

BID NO 2009-068-07-15-SMA
BID TABULATION

PARTICIPATING VENDORS

G Emnzmmmﬁa Mmm%u OR UNIFORMS OF TEXAS 4 LONESTAR UNIFORMS RECOMMENDATION
EL PASO, TX HOUSTON, TX
PRICE EACH MANUFACTURER PRICE EACH AWARDED VENDOR BASIS
I. CONSTABLE PRECINCT NO.1
UNIFORM 1 Female Female
SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS FECHHEIMER | SSR78M4Z [~ $3595 | PERFECTION | 2300ST | $37.00
L. (perfection uniforms 2300, 2340 zipper front} — LoneStar Uniforms Low Bidder DOES NOT
2. G S TS o) FECHHEIMER | 33W7804Z [T | §3695 | PERFECTION | 2800ST [Fale $39.00 meet Specifications
3. TROUSERS (perfection syle 2600DN) FECHHEIMER | UD39%00 w“_w_a $31.95 | PERFECTION | 2600 DN Hﬁ_n $37.00
UNIFORM-II
L ww%om“u SLEEVE SHIRT (3713X Blaver BLAUER 8713 ”H_n $39.00 . .
NO BID File LoneStar Uniforms Sole Bidder
2. TROUSERS (8810X side pocket} BLAUER 3810X Male $59.00
UNIFORM- 111
POLO- SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS (s.11 Female 71048/ Female
1. T 51 71048 Male $27.95 5.11 41060 Male $38.00 o
2. TACTICAL PANTS (5.11 Tactical 74251) 511 74251 ik | g33.95 5.11 T |t $3g.00 | LoneStar Uniforms meet Specifications
3. JACKETS WHALING 01264 $ 75.00 GERBER TINI $89.00
4. WINDBREAKER NO BID LIBERTY 560MNV $44.00 LoneStar Uniforms Sole Bidder
5. RAINCOATS WHALING | 02252 | $48.95 NO BID
0. CONSTABLE PRECINCT NO. 2
UNIFORM 1 Female Female
SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS FECHHEIMER [ 85R7804z |~ $35.95 | PERFECTION | 2300ST $37.00
1. {perfection uniforms 2300, 2340 zipper front) . ol Low Bidder DOES NOT
LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS FECHHEIMER W Female Fermale LoneStar Uniforms + Snecificati
2. (perfection uniforms 2000,2040 zipper front) BWTEIZ e $36.95 | PERFECTION 2000 ST I $39.00 meet Specifications
3. TROUSERS (perfection style 2600DN) FECHHEIMER | 35203 [S-2C . §39.95 | PERFECTION | 2600 ST o $37.00
UNIFORM-II
I SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT (8713X Biuer Sret NO BID BLAUER TR $39.00 | LoneStar Uniforms Sole Bidder
2. TROUSER (perfection style 1725FG) _.%awh.m.m HS2145 Fermale $29.95 PERFECTION 1725FG Lenmiz $39.00 LoneStar Uniforms B cOﬁw —
Male Male meet Specifications
UNIFORM- II1
POLO- SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS Female 71048/ Female
1. (5.1 Tactical 71045) eHlL 71048 i $29.95 5.1 41060 e $38.00
2 TACTICAL PANTS (5.11 Tactcal %4251) s 74251 | Female | g3395 5.1 s eyl $38.00 | LoneStar Uniforms | L°" Bidder DOESNOT
Male 3 Male meet Specifications
3. BDU PANTS PROPPER F5201 (e $17.00 | propper | FS200-55- | Female $23.00
4. JACKETS WHALING 01264 $73.00 | GERBER 7IN1 $89.00 | LoneStar Uniforms | L°" Bidder DOES NOT
meet Specifications

TABULATION--Page 1 of 3



HIDALGO COUNTY

“PURCHASE OF UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES FOR ALL COUNTY LAW ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES”

BID NO 2009-068-07-15-SMA

BID TABULATION
— —__
PARTICIPATING VENDORS
el EWmnEAMM%ﬂ Mrm%%._-%mc OR czﬂ_,ow?wmmmm_. TEXAS /\ LONESTAR UNIFORMS RECOMMENDATION
ELPASO, TX HOUSTON, TX
MANUFACTURER |  STOE PRICE EACH MANUFACTURER _ STYLE NO. _ PRICE EACH AWARDED VENDOR BASIS
III. CONSTABLE PRECINCT NO. 3
SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS 85R7884 | Female Female . Low Bidder DOES NOT
. 3 FI X o
1 EEeE oo ECHHEIMER P il $35.60 | PERFECTION 2300BN | $37.00 | LoneStar Uniforms meet Specifications
2. %ﬁwﬂuwm@wﬁuﬁm FECHHEIMER | 45W6694 ”ﬂﬂ._n $44.80 | PERFECTION 2000 BN HH_.“ $39.00
LoneStar Uniforms Low Bidder
3. %ﬁwﬂﬂﬂ%ﬁrr LLBALI] FECHHEIMER 32223 ”Mw_n $59.50 | PERFECTION X13506NS ”M_ﬁs_a $37.00
ale
4, PATROL JACKETS WHALING 01264 $73.00 GERBER 7IN3 $89.00 LoneStar Uniforms L s UOmm —
meet Specifications
Femal
5. m.ﬂﬂm%%ubﬂww_b SHORHSUEENE SHIRIS 5.11 71048 LH * | $26.95 511 41060 ”MH; $38.00
Low bidder DOES NOT
6. %ﬂ..»wﬂmn?ﬂm%ﬁ e 511 41060 ”ﬂ__”. i€ $26.95 511 71048 % $38.00 | LoneStar Uniforms meet requirements &
Femal Fernal service
7 AL P 5.11 MBI e | $29.95 5.1 4251 e $38.00
Low bidder DOES NOT
8 ik =t 511 80001 $49.95 s.H 80001 $68.00 { LoneStar Uniforms meet requirements &
service
. BELTS (bianchi §105
9 (el E109) wwn_vﬂn_n_.m gits $12.50 NO BID Department WILL NOT recommend due to
10. CAPS (otto-31-262) RHODES 2915 $795 NO BID minimal use of items
IV. CONSTABLE PRECINCT NO. 4
" SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS FECHHEIMER pA o $36.60 [ PERFECTION | 2300ST |—— $37.00
° {periection uniforms 2300, 2340 zpper front) n
Low Bidder DOES NOT
2. LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS FECHHEIMER | PW7804 L Fmdle | g3990 | pERFECTION | 2000ST |—omele $39.00 | LoneStar Uniforms meet Specifications
{perfection uniforms 2000,2040 zipper front) z Male Male P
3. TROUSERS (perfection style 2600FG) FECHHEIMER 32265 ”_ﬂw_n $29.95 | PERFECTION | 2600FG ”».H_n $37.00
UNIFORM-II
Femal
1. wu%w.-. SLEEVE SHIRT (8713X Blauer Streer NO BID BLAUER 8713 ST % $ 39.00 LoneStar Uniforms Sole Bidder
2. | TROUSERS tperecion sy 17253) HORMCE | Hszias [ =™ ) 2990 | PERFECTION | 172sFG |lomake $39.00 | LoneStar Uniforms | L™ Bidder DOES NOT
SNIFO 5 Male Male meet Specifications
RMS-II1
1. | FOLO. SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS .1 511 71048 |70 | 52695 s Tiosg [ Fomale $38.00
. Female Fernale .
2. TACTICAL PANTS (5.11 Tactical 74251} 51 74251 ale $29.95 5.11 74251 Vo $ 38.00 LoneStar Uniforms _..ei»”.ﬁ_no_. UWmm QO.-.
3. | TACLITE PRO PANTS wem) 5.01 74273 | | $29.05 5.1 M |l $38.00 e prompt service
4. TIES S. BROOME 90010 $295 | SAM BROOME $ 5.00
5, COWBOY HATS (STETSON FELT) NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. JACKETS (Travis Mills #7450) WHALING | 01264 | $ 73.00 Department WILL NOT recomrend due to

TABULATION--Page 2 of 3



HIDALGO COUNTY
“PURCHASE OF UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES FOR ALL COUNTY LAW ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES”
BID NO 2009-068-07-15-SMA
BID TABULATION

PARTICIPATING VENDORS

DESCRIPTION REQUIRED OR UNIFORMS OF TEXAS 4 LONESTAR UNIFORMS RECOMMENDATION
) R R ASOLX HOUSTON, TX
9
MANUFACTURER _ uﬂ_m.m PRICE EACH MANUFACTURER | STYLENO. PRICE EACH AWARDED VENDOR _ BASIS _

minimal use of items

V. CONSTABLE PRECINCT NO. 5

Female FRENCH | Female
L | R S oy SHIRTS FoaCE HsIl T $3395 | ELBECO | BLUE T $37.00
Female FRENCH | Female
2. Aw%uﬂmw“.umwuwwmawﬂmgmzuu _.%__wbm.m RSl Male e CLBECh qu_.mwm Male o L Low Bidder- does not
3. | TROUSERS(Ret: Horace small #134431) PCE HS2158 [T | §3395 | PERFECTION | 2600DN |omot $37.00 | LoneStar Uniforms | ™% P H“wn._._.”-_.ﬁ”_.woa
4. ,ﬂww._um_wa—“vowq SLEEYE SHIRTS (5.11 511 T1048 nﬂﬂ_n $26.95 B 71048 ””H_o $38.00 uniforms, jackets
5. TACTICAL PANTS (5.11 Tactical 74251) 501 M5 (TR 53995 501 M5l [ $38.00
6. PATROL JACKET WHALING 01264 $73.00 GERBER 7INI $89.00

TABULATION--Page 3 of 3



HIDALGO COUNTY
“PURCHASE OF UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES FOR ALL COUNTY LAW ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES”
BID NO 2009-068-07-15-SMA

BID TABULATION

VI. -HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

PARTICIPATING VENDORS

RECOMMENDATION

DESCRIPTION REQUIRED OR e T e S CE R e
_ ITEM (EQUIY. .»r%zd UNIFORMS OF TEXAS | LONESTAR UNIFORMS [
! EL PASO, TX HOUSTON,TX | AWARDED VENDOR | BASIS
_ MANUFACTURER | STYLE KO. l PRICE EACH MANUFACTURER _ STYLENO. | PRICE EACH m
RAINCOATS (NEESE) LIBERTY S58IMYE | NEESE | 1870C Uniforms of Texas | Low Bidder
12, GLOVES (Hatch Frisk Master Fm 2000) | HATCH FM2000 | $24.60 | NO BID Uniforms of Texas | Sole Bidder
COVERALLS-Personal Protection i
3 (TYVEK) NO J_c NO BID
‘ COVERALLS-Polypropylene Disposable
Suit, Long Sleeve Shirt & Pants 1 ZO.—w:u e
Mn.h“_o T Uniforms of Texas | Sole Bidder
| sleeve : - &
| “...n._-_o $14.00 Uniforms of Texas | Sole Bidder
On; !
4 WORK SHIRTS DICKIE s Sicete NO BID
) (Dickies) Mn_”_n._ FE Uniforms of Texas | Sole Bidder
| Sleeve =2
W-_... $14.00 Uniforms of Texas | Sole Bidder
0N o]
| 3 m_nomn o
's. WORK PANTS (Dickies) DICKIE 874 $14.95 NO BID e
6. WOMEN’S FLAT FRONT PANTS DICKIE FPIII $13.95 NO BID SELEOL O oy [
I .1“.9_:”._@ rm_e.cm T 1 Uniforms of Texas Sole Bidder
e L -] -
| “H.u_u $10.95 Uniforms of Texas | Sole Bidder
o BS s e piad] | .
— FASHION SEAL TY Y NO BID Uniforms of Texas | Solc Bidder
T
w_-_m h $13.95 Uniforms of Texas Sole Bidder
e + anis
8. RAIN BOOTS NO BID NO BID NO BID
ﬁ MM._“..“_o HITEC [ Mﬂﬁu_n . Lonestar Uniforms | Low Bidder
9, WATERPROOF SAFETY TOE BOOT THOROGOOD | 804-6191 |- =8 $6L00 | ) o UM 5285 e $ 59.00
Boots Boots
Mﬂ-..nu_o HI TEC M.u__“.s.: Uniforms of Texas | Low Bidder
10. WATERPROOF SAFETY TOE SHOE THOROGOOD | 804-6180 [ $50.00 | |\ GNUM . 5285 e $59.00
. Shoe | Shoc
11. | BDU’s PANTS {Battle Dress Uniforms) PROPPER F5201 (oo §22.90 | PROPPER | F5201-38 |roo | g37pg | UniformsofTexas | Low Bidder
12. | BDU‘s SHIRT (Battle Dress Uniforms) PROPPER FS454 [Tt §2200 | PROPPER | F545238 | o g2g,00 | Uniformsof Texas | Low Bidder

TABULATION-Page 1 of 2




VI. -HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

HIDALGO COUNTY
“PURCHASE OF UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES FOR ALL COUNTY LAW ENFORCEMENT AGENCIES”
BID NO 2009-068-07-15-SMA

BID TABULATION

PARTICIPATING VENDORS RECOMMENDATION
DESCRIPTION REQUIRED OR = e = ——
(EQUIV ;Mzd UNIFORMS OF TEXAS LONESTAR UNIFORMS
= EL PASO, TX 3 HOUSTON, TX | AWARDED VENDOR BASIS
MANUFACTURER | STMLENO. | PRICE EACH mARUFACTURER | sTnewo. | PRICEEACH | £
1o Female Female Uniforms of Texas | Low Bidder
| BDU'sSHIRT S.ER.T. OFFICER (Battle PROPPER | F5454380 512001 PROPPER | wooeeoeeme $28.00
Dress Uniforms) 01 Male Male
1 . OPT-I OPT- | i f Low Bidd
BDU’s SHIRT (Battle Dress Uniforms) pemse | <2000 | proPPER | oo Femste | ¢ 20 00 Uiiferins i Texgs | Row Bidder
(Ripstop Material) _ ".U_J_.._ F _w__..._._.._ :
H . ale e
14, | Ontion I: FOUR (4) BELOW STYLE PROPPER F5454  |-ome e - TR e pere B ey
POCKETS Femsle | $22.90 | PROPPER | - |-EMsl | gogag
Option 2: TWO (2) STYLE POCKETS _w..“_._..u 0 w_”_._..m .
3 ) o
15. | INVESTIGATOR RAID JACKETS LIBERTY | S60MBK $13.95 | LIBERTY | 560 MBK $45.00 | Uniforms of Texas | Low Bidder
SAFETY VESTS - Break-Away High Lonestar Uniforms | *Low Bidder does not meet
16. Visibility NEESE 110V $14.95* BLAUER 3395 aaa.:e: specifications s
Female Female Lonestar Uniforms | *Low Bidder dees not meet
TR O GG BEME S TR T FECHHEIMER | 05W8704 $53.70* | BLAUER | 8450-ST | $68.00 specification Calor does not
(Silver tan) Male Male
- | | match current,
Female Female Lonestar Uniformas =~ *Low Bidder does not meet
18. W*___mwwwlmmé IR FECHHEIMER | S5R8704 $49.70* | BLAUER | 8460-ST $64.00 specifications —Blended material
1 Male Male . does not match. |
Female Female Lonestar Uniforms | *Low Bidder does not meet
TROUSERS (Four Pocket) specifications —No Striping on
L] =
9, (Silver tan) FECHHEIMER 218 Male $48.25* BLALUER 8560-ST Male $£72.00 Trousers was submitted for
cOmpwETISoN.
TACTICAL OUTERSHELL POINT Lonestar Uniforms | Low Bidder
_ua. {Point Blank R20D) NO BID BLANK R20D $120.00 1
COLD WEATHER JACKETS Lonestar Uniforms | Low Bidder |
2l. (Force 10 Jacket) WHALING 02228 $139.95 GERBER TIN3 $89.00
TACTICAL PANTS Female Uniforms of Texas Low Bidder
22 (5.11 Tactical 74251) s $29.95 5.01 74251 — $38.00
| SAM Uniforms of Texas | Low Bidder
23. TIES $. BROOME 90010-5 $2.95 _ BROCME $5.00

TABULATION-Page 2 of 2




