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PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ME M O RCAN DM

TO: Anacleto Martinez, Chief Administrator ; KO i
Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility {1l DEC 10 2009 ! |

ATTN: Juan Tapia, Procurement Specialist g % i)

Zi& By— J’ﬁé@

FROM: Sandy SuareZ, Buyer 1 —
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: October 09. 2009

RE: Bid No. 2009-386-10-07-SGS

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office “Medical Supplies & Equipment”

Attached you will find seven (7) copies of the bids received for the above referenced project. Please review and
reply with your recommendation. We need to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court
Meeting, therefore. we would like to have your response on or before the following deadline.

Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Dept.
via fux t0 (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 by no later than Friday October 16,2009 @ 10:00 A.M. in order
to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday October 27, 2009 @ 1:30
P.M.

It you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 x=4855
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Sandy Suarez

From: juan tapia [juan.tapia@hidalgoso.org]
Sent:  Friday, December 11, 2009 4:22 PM
To: ‘Sandy Suarez'

Cc: Anacleto.Martinez@hidalgoso.org; Joe.Jackson@hidalgoso.org; Rene.Gonzalez@hidalgoso.org;
pete.trevino@hidalgoso.org; eliza.cantu@hidalgoso.org; '‘Darlene Betancourt"
ramon.vela@co.hidalgo.tx.us

Subject: RE: RFB N0.09-386-10-07-SGS "Medical Supplies and Equipment”

Sandy
Following our telephone conversation, we submitted recommendations from Bid Tabulation
Sheet to award to the lowest four overall bidders as follows:
1-  Henry Schein Medical -
ltems: 1,6,8,9,12,13,15,19,20,22,26,27,29,31,32,36,37,39,40 41 43,44,45,46,47 48,50 & 51
2-  San Juan Pharmacy —
ltems: 2,5,7,1418,23,25 & 34
3- Quad Med. Inc. -
items: 4,10,16,33,35 & 42
4-  United Medical ~
ltems: 11,17,24,28 & 30, 14
‘k Items 3, 21 and 49 will be purchased thru co-op vendor Moore Medical.
Should you have any questions or required additional information,

Please contact us. Thanks
JT

From: Sandy Suarez [mailto:sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us]

Sent: Tuesday, December 08, 2009 8:26 AM

To: anacleto.martinez@hidalgoso.org; 'juan tapia’

Cc: 'Darlene Betancourt’; ramon.vela@co.hidalgo.tx.us; martha.salazar@co. hidalgo.tx.us
Subject: 2009-386-10-07-SGS "Medical Supplies and Equipment"

Good Morning, Final Notice

Because of delay in the recommendation process, the Purchasing Department is recommending

12/14/2009



HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

BID OPENING DATE: October 07, 2009

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DESCRIPTION OF BID: “Medical Supplies and Equipment ”

BID NO: 2009-386-10-07-SGS

MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND PROPOSED VENDORS
EQUIPMENT
!«‘V San Juan Bound Tree Moore United Quad Med, Inc, Henry Schein ;.I@M—_cm,m.
Pharmacy Medical Medical Medical Medical Pharmacy
Supplies South
I e S e $ 5841 $52.66 NO BID NO BID $ 4845 NO BID
2. | PHYSICIAN'S DESK REFERENCE $ 80.00 $ 13092 $ 86.52 NO BID $ 87.83 $ 90.31 NO BID
3 | TOENAIL CLIPPERS SMALL NO BID NO BID $7.97 $ 6.786 ea NO BID $ 155 NO BID
4 | KERMZ OTC 160z 67x5yas $ 15.89 $ 0.59 $8.14 $ 2.106 ca $1.13 $ 0.68 NO BID
5 | ETOHPREP OTC l6oz $ 1.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
& | ALCOHOL ISOPROPYL 70% OTC $ 146 $ 19 $ 234 $ 1.836¢ea $ 2.09 $-09% NO BID
T, HYDROGEN PEROXIDE  OTC $ 0.5% $ 1.03 $ 125 $ NOBID $ 1.01 $ 057 NO BID ,
| 8 | LINDANESHAMPOO 1% OTC $ 130.00 $ 13352 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12437 NO BID
g | AVCOHOLPREPPADS  OIC  medium 5228 $ 150 $ 290 $ 2256 bx $ 144 NO BID
10 | IVCANNULAS O7C $ 1.02 $1.71 $ 0.50 $ 0477 ea $ 0.38 $ 1.25 NO BID ~
L1 | IVSTARTKITS O7C $ 1.52 $1.217 $ 1.64 S 0.695 ¢a $ L.09 $ 0.89 NO BID
12| sTERILE 120 O7C $34.02 $1.13 $2.01 $1957 a NO BID $0.95 NO BID H
13 | NS FOR IRRIGATION O7C $ 7.65 $1.14 $ 2,01 NO BID NO BID $1.02 NO BID
| 14 | IVPOLES 07C $ 25.90 $ 149.46 $ 4132 $ 18.56 ea $ 83.44 $ 34.85 NO BID
15 | IVTUBING o1C $ 262 $ 80 $ 201 $ NOBID $ 095 $ 119 NO BID




1 San Juan Pharmacy Bound Tree Medical Moore Medical United Medical Quad Med. Inc. Henry Schein QOchoa
Pharm.

SPUFFLE PLASTIC % OZ. PLASTIC $ 33.47 NO BID $ 2,65 $10.296 bx $ 0.85
SQUAT CUPS OTC NO BID

17 | STAPLE REMOVER KITS $ 166 $12.019 $ 231 $ 1.54 $ 3.70 NO BID

18 | STERILE COTTON APPLICATOR SWABS $ 26.60 $ 3350 $26.65 cs $3.20 $16.61 NO BID

19 | N-95 RESPIRATOR MASKS $ 22.00 $30.97 $20.40 $12.46 bx $19.60 NO BID

20 | SOET PROCEDURE MASKS W/ EAR $ 3.95 $3.87 $747 $ 0.05 ea $3.95 NO BID
LOOPS

21 | WELCH PROBE COVERS $7.73 $ 112 $11.67 $ 14.89 bx $15.25 $ 7.87 NO BID

22 | ULTRA SOUND GEL $ 229 $2.65 $ 1.903 ea $2.95 NO BID

23 | SYRINGES WITHNEEDLES 0.37x12.7 m! $32.00 $ 14.27 $ NOBID $38.13 $ 6.65 NO BID
28 G Y% needle

24 | LIFESCAN UNISTIX $ 60.96 $33.26 $ 166 $19.38 $ 14.49 NO BID

25 | ELECTRODES FOR WELCH/ALLEYN EKG $ 0.592 NO BID $ 4.00 ca $ 57.60 NO BID

26 | SUTURE SETS $ 148.37 $251.44 $10.16 $ 65.47 bx NO BID NO BID

$ 2841 ¢s

5% | SUTURE REMOVAL KITS $ 2.57 $26.50 87.50 $ 3.06 NO BID

28 $ 54.50 $223.89 $ 85.80 NO BID NO BID
SUTURES

29 | COLOSTOMY DRAINABLE POUCHES $ 2837 NO BID $33.49 31.564 bx NO BID NO BID
SIZE - 2547

30 | STOMAHESIVE FLEXIBLE WAFERS $ 59.37 NO BID $61.39 NO BID $ 42,65 NO BID
SIZE - 24"

31 | DIAGNOSTIC PEN LIGHTS $832 $ 474 $ 621 $ 7.826 pk $5.40 NO BID
COTTON TIP APPLICATORS 6" NON-

32 | STERILE (individually wrapped) $ 37.50 $33.10 $57.00 $ 38.129¢cs $3.72 NO BID

33 | SOF-KLING CONFIRMINGBANDAGE 3¢ | $74.70 $ 32.80 $ 4096 $32.89 $ 7.45 NO BID
X4"/1 YDS

34 | SELF ADHERING GAUZE 12"°X10°YDS 53502 NO BID NO BID $ 9.188 bx NO BID $ 4.57 NO BID
X1 W various sizes & amounts

35 $ 7.28 $96.72 $ 57.187 ¢s 3 $ 50.41 NO BID
STERILE EYE PADS, OVAL 2¢" X 2¢" $ 6852 . . 5338 ,




San Juan Pharmacy Bound Tree Medical Moore Medical United Medical Quad Med, Inc, QOchoa
36 Pharm,
, $ 35.70 $31.00 $26.03 $22.032 bx $15.00
SYRINGES WITH NEEDLE 5CC GAUGE 1"
NO BID

37

SCALPEL STERILE STAINLESS $ 487 $13.70 $ 6.71 $ 5356 bx $425 NO BID
38 | GAUGE PADS STERILE 2" X 4" STEEL

DISPOSABLE W/HANDLE  item omitted
39 $ 6.76 $ 34.70 $ 38.129 s $4.36 NO BID

TONGUE BLADE DEPRESSORS $83 90cs
40 | TELA PADS 3" X 4" ADHESIVE $ 96.43 $ 1539 $27.80 NO BID $6.51 5 5569 NO BID
41 | BAND-AIDS 1" X 3" $ 341 $ 197 $ 1.64 $ 1.651 bx $1.38 NO BID
42 | BUTTERFLY STRIPS MED. 1%" X 3/§" $ 936 NO BID $2.09 $ 1.776 bx $148 NO BID
B BUTTERFLY STRIPS LARGE 2%" X 13" $ 6120 NO BID $2.85 $ 2411 bx $2.01 $ 142 NO BID
44 | ALCOHOL PREPS WEBCOL $ 1.36 $ 337 $3.15 $ 2271 bx $2.99 NO BID
45 $ 173 $ 1.20 $ 192 $1.174 tube $2.11 $:0.80 NO BID

KY JELLY OR EQUAL
46 | SPHYGMOMANOMETERS ANEROID 26.85 $ 2938 $ 21.08 NO BID 763 NO BID

LARGE RESISTANT KING 5 268 . . 57

TRU-TOUCH VINYL GREEN NON-
47 | STERILE GLOVES $ 382 NO BID $ 11920 NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 | IRRIGATIVE EYE SOLUTION $ 141 $ 236 $2.93 $ 2941 ea $ 1.56 : NO BID
49 | Yo f-ADHERENT BANDAGE 17X 5 $15.84 $ 2448 $4.07 $34.125 bx $24.24 NO BID
50 | EXPANDOVER ELASTIC MEDICALTAPE | $ 91.34 NO BID $133.04 $ 156.60 cs $21.59 NO BID

1" X 5Yds
51 | QUICK ICE INSTANT COLD $ 15.05 $ 7.07 $ 2320 $9.724 ¢s $9.95 NO BID




@

PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTME

BID OPENING DATE:

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:

OCTOBER 07, 2009

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

“HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE-

MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT”

BID NO.:_2009-386-10-07-SGS

Attn: Pam Harper

BID SIGNATURE (IF APPLICABLE)
NAME OF VENDOR: REQUEST OR INITIALS OF STAFF
COMPANY/FIRM *VIA ADDRESSING MAIL OUT DATE ADDRESS/PHONE NO
I. Westwood Pharmacy E-mail 5823 Patterson Ave.
Richmond, VA. 23226
Attn: Hunter Hoggatt Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 mon
Ph#804-288-1933
hunter.hoggatt@westwoodpharmacy.com
2. Maxor Correctional Pharmacy E-mail 320 South Polk St. Ste 200
Addendum .
Attn: Don Mobbs Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | Amarillo, TX. 79101
Ph# 806-324-5400 & 800-658-6146
don.mobbs@maxorcps.com
E-mail 135 Duryea Rd. E-255
3. Henry Schein Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | Melville, N.Y. 11747
QUL A Ph#800-851-0400 X-8664
specialmarketsbiddept@henryschein.com
4. South Texas Monitoring System 2245 Austin Ave.
Attn: Zorya Gonzalez E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | McAllen, TX. 78501
Addendum
Ph#956-618-4900
stmsbk(@yahoo.com
1101 Ash Ave.
5. Dimart Medical Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | McAllen, TX. 78501
Attn: Jorge Martinez E-mail Ph#956-971-9720
Addendum . . .
jmexport@aol.com & dimartmedical.aol.com
2511 Cornerstone Blvd
6. Comerstone Pharmacy E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | Edinburg, TX. 78539
Attn: Leonel Guerrero Addendum Ph#956-383-1131
cornerstone pharmacy@yahoo.com
1200 S. Ridge Rd.
7. Saenz Medical Pharmacy E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 |McAllen, TX. 78501
Addendum

Ph#956-630-2500

smedicalpharmacv@rey.rr.com




301 Conquest

8. Ochoa's Pharmacy South E-mail/ [P Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | Edinburg, TX. 78539
. Addendum
Attn: Claudia Ph#956-318-5159
{Used to be Medical Plaza Pharmacy) Claude? 7Z@hotmail.com
1690 New Britain Ave.
E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 | Farmington, Ct. 06034
; Addendum
9.  Moore Medical LLC Ph# 800-234-1464 x 5390
Atin: Rinette Dufour rdufour@mooremedical.com
E-mail Sandy Suarez P.O. Box 71582
Addendum .
10. National Environmental, Inc Marietta, Ga. 30007
dba Buy Indian Medical 09/21/09 | Ph#800-965-7786 F#408-790-1305
Attn: Alan Kraimer akraimer@aol.com
E-mail Sandy Suarez 1298 CR 326
; Addendum
11. Cowman Associates, Inc. Giddings, TX. 78942
Atin: Jennifer Leach 09/21/09 | Ph#800-626-5402
ssrsales@cowmanassociates.com
E-mail Sandy Suarez 50120 Pontiac Trail
12. Lynn Medical Addendum Wixom, MI. 48393
Attn: Eddie Murray 09/21/09 | Ph#248-560-4509
emurray@lynnmed.com N
E-mail Sandy Suarez 25 Craig Place
Addendum
13. United Medical Supplies, Inc. North Plainfield, NJ 07060
Attn: Paula Hasan 09/21/09 | Ph#908-757-0075
phasan@unitedmedsupplies.com
E-mail Sandy Suarez
Addendum
14. TIS Medical
Attn: Kathy Arthur 09/21/09 | Ph#248-253-8916
kmk1104(@catholicexchange.com
E-mail Sandy Suarez 1565 W. Main St. Ste 208-118
Addendum Lewisville, TX. 75067
15. Metroplex Medical Supply
09/21/09 | Ph#972-434-2005
Attn: Thomas Maxwell/
(forwarded)Jessie Brown thomas@metromedsupply.com
Bids & Quotes
1690 New Britain Ave./ PO Box 4066
16. Moore Medical LLC E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/22/09 | Farmington, CT. 06034-4066
Attn: Bonnie Irish Addendum Ph#800-234-1464 x 5393 F#877-354-5916

birish@mooremedical.com
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RFB-RFP-RFQ

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

BID OPENING DATE:

OCTOBER 07, 2009

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

“HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE-

MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT”

BID NO.:_2009-386-10-07-SGS

BID SIGNATURE (IF APPLICABLE)
NAME OF VENDOR: REQUEST OR INITIALS OF STAFF
COMPANY/FIRM *VIA ADDRESSING MAIL OUT DATE ADDRESS/PHONE NO
. \
mes Pho 5 P 3ol Conquedgucl.
IMQQ\.( Sandy Suarez 09/21/09 ?{d i} —r(_ '—IQY%
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Sandy Suarez

Sandy Suarez

Sandy Suarez

Sandy Suarez

Sandy Suarez

Sandy Suarez




114 Bracken Road

17. Interboro Packaging Corp. E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/22/09 | Montgomery. NY. 12549
Attn: Ricky Fischer Addendum Ph#845-457-2700 F#457-1927
interboro2/@frontiernet.net
11 Brandywine Drive
18. Eastmed Enterprises; Inc. E-mail Sandy Su 09/22/09 | Marlton, NJ. 08055
ona Putatunda NO TERE STED Ph#856-797- #797-0151
m castmed06(@)yahoo.com
5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd.
19. Bound Tree Medical E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/22/09 | Dublin, Ohio 43016
Attn: Bethany Moore Addendum Ph#614-760-5233
bmoore@boundtree.com vV
167 Myers Corners Rd.
20. Laerdal Medical Cofp. E-mail Sandy Su 09/22/09 | Wappinger’s Falls, NY.
“Catherine A. Masten NO TERESTED Ph#845-297-7770'x 3692 F#800-266-4359
cal ne.masten@laerdal.com
220 Townsend Square
E-mail Sandy Su 09/23/09 | Oyster Bay, NY. 11542
21. Apotheeu§ Pharmaceuticals Corp. NO TERESTED Ph#516-624- x 114 F#624-8201
Attn: Sherrie (@apothecus.com
6215 Rangeline Rd. Ste# 110
Theodore, Al. 36582
22. Port City Medical LLC E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/23/09 | Ph#251-443-7667 F#650-4498
Attn: Ismail Ozokur Addendum ozokuri@portcitymedical.com
P.O. Box 6847
Sandy Su; Laguna Hills, Ca. 92607-
23. Salam Jat€rmational Inc. E-mail NO TERESTED 09/23/09 | Ph#949-699-3624 F#699-3650
ttn: Tim Rhine s nt@aol.com
6255 Barfield Rd. Ste 130
E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/23/09 | Atlanta, Ga. 30328
24. Blue River Medical Addendum Ph#404-748-0365
Attn: Christan Mursten blueskye2003(@gmail.com
E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/23/09 | Ph#773-832-9207 F#484-821-9448
25. B. Braun Medical, Inc. Addendum jennifer.bernsen@bbraun.com

Attn: Jennifer Bernsen




1575 Aviation Center Pkwy #5235

26. MMS- A Medical Supply Co. Daytona Beach, F1 32114
Attn: Julia Onesto E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/23/09 | Ph#386-252-9960 F#252-9961
Addendum Julia.onestor@mmsmedical.com
320 Brookes Rd, Ste 217
Sandy Su Hazelwood, MO. 63042
27. Emed 1cal Co. Afd-:::ii:;m NO TERESTED 09/23/09 | Ph#314-739 267 F#731-3071
ttn: Satonya L. Booker t r@emedmedical.com
H-12 Georgian
28. Central Texas Medical Equipm’t Austin, TX. 78753
E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/23/09 |Ph#512-451-9704
Attn: Mark Ita & Dee Richards Addendum
(sent out 2 packets) ctmes@onr.com
PO BOX 339
Justin, TX. 76247
29. Products, Unlimited, Inc E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/24/09 | Ph#800-865-4683 F#940-648-3407
Attn: Janey Cooper Addendum jcooper@products-unlimited
Ph#800-845-3550 x 336 F#800-533-4793
scott.bruner@henryschein.com
30. Henry Schein Matrx Medical E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/24/09
Attn: Scott Bruner Addendum
DUPLICAT 167 Myers Corners Road.
E-mail Sandy Stdrer Wappinger’s Fall, NY, |
31. Laerd edical Corp. Addendum 09/24/09 | Ph#845-297-7770'x 3692 F#800-266-4359
ttn: Catherine Masten N NTERESTED v ine.masten@laerdal.com
3230 Bethany Lane, Ste 8
Ellicott City, Ma, 21042
32. Medical Device Depot E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/24/09 | Ph#877-646-3300 F#410-505-4567
Attn: John Gladstein Addendum iohn@medicaldevicedepot.com
Ph#254-751-1566
icswacobids/@hotmail.com
33. ICS E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/24/09
Attn: Wyatt Addendum
1205 N Raul Longoria
09/24/09 | San Juan, TX 78589
34. San Juan Pharmacy Ip Sandy Suarez Ph#956-782-6337
Attn: Larry Fliss Addendum Irfliss@hotmail.com




HIO..GO COUNTY PURCHASING DQRTMENT Sh e o
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BID OPBNING DATE OCTOBER 07 2009 g ER ] BID OPENING TIME‘ 9 30 A M.
BID DESCRIPTION: “MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND E IPMEN'I"’ O R Y
DEPARTMENT: HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE | BID NO: 2009-386-10-07-SGS
Sl Iy
NAME OF BIDDER: REQUEST ICABLE) DATE ADDRESS & PHONE NO
A OR INITIALS OF
LB ViA STAFF ADDRESSING
MAIL OUT ﬂb
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Ph#800-933-7334 F#504-880-2303

E-mail aaron‘@quadmed.com
35. QuadMed, Inc. Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/24/09
Attn: Aaron Pratt
837 Isom Road
E-mail San Antonio, TX. 78216
36. Mobius Partners Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/24/09 | Ph#210-979-0380 F# 979-0381
Attn: Katie Schmitz katiesi@mobiuspartners.com
2000 Park Lane
E-mail Pittsburgh, PA. 15275
Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/24/09 | Ph#412-490-1249 F#412-490-1205
37. Micheal Hively michael.hively@thermofisher.com
40 Turner Place
E-mail Piscataway, NJ. 08854
38. All American Poly Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/24/09 | Ph#732-752-3200 x1124 F#752-2305
Attn: Rivka Frank Bids03@allampoly.com
15705 Strathern St. #11
E-mail Van Nuys, CA. 91406
39. SOS Survival Products Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/24/09 | Ph#800-479-7998 F#818-909-0360
Attn: Johnea Jones johnea@sosproducts.com
6255 Barfield Rd. Ste 130
E-mail Atlanta, Ga. 30328
40. Blue River Medical Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/24/09
Attn: Danielle vetcare.danielle@gmail.com
ikarakas@saturotechnologies.com
E-mail
41. Saturo Technologies Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/25/09
Attn: Isabelle Karakas
iamaqtpoo2(@aol.com
E-mail
42. Omni2Max Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/25/09
Attn: Mary Pead
10701 E Winner Road Ste 230
E-mail Independence, Mo. 64052
43. Memco. Inc. Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/28/09 | Ph#816-833-5252 F#816-833-5253

Attn: Bob Niemeyer

bob.niemeyer@themiddletongroup.com




4822 MLK Blvd.

E-mail Houston, TX. 77021
44. Accessibility Medical Supply,
Ine. Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/28/09 | Ph#713-492-2250 C#443-7419
Attn: Janell Johnson-Arzu janelij-a@accessibilitymedicalsupply.com
6658 Youree Drive Ste. 180 PMB 404
E-mail Shreveport, LA. 71105
45. American Screening Corporation Addendum Sandy Suarez 09/28/09 | Ph#318-2274994 F#227-4996 C#286-8767
Attn: Shawn Kilgarlin accounting{@americanscreeningcorp.com
2460 Ash Street
E-mail Vista, CA. 92081
46. PMI Progfessive Medical Intern’l | Addendum ndy Suarez 09/29/09 | Ph#888-296 or 839-9495
ttn: Diana Rayborne OT INTERESTED dr; me@progressivemed.com

47.

48.

*VIA:
IN PERSON (IP)
TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)

BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)

E-MAIL (EM)
FACSIMILE (FAX)

\/ Submitted response to Addendum




