HIDALGO COUNTY HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES
“Purchase of Mosquito Control Chemicals”
Bid No. 2010-045-02-24-SMA

TABULATION SHEET

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
Product Description

Or Equivalent ADAPCO, INC B & G CHEMICALS UNIVAR USA CLARKE MOSQUITO

(Include Brand Name) CONTROL PRODUCT, INC.
(Permanone RTU 4-8) (Evoluer 4-4) (Kontrol 4-4) (Biomist 3 + 15)

Required . L . L . L . L
Size Size Unit Price Size Unit Price Size Unit Price Size Unit Price
1 gal 2x25glcase | $29.64/gl 1 gal $23.49 1 gal $21.69 1 gal $48.62/ gal

PERMANONE or gal. > 9 04/ 9 ' gal- (2.5 gal. jug) gal. 049
Equivalent: 55 gal d 55 qal d $46.39/gal

55 gal drum | 30 gl drum $27.16/gl 55 gl drum $21.20 gal drum $17.75 gal drum $2.551.45/drum
OTHER: No bid No bid 275 gal. $20.11 Other: No bid Other: No bid
SUMMIT B.T.I. 20 CT. 20 Ct Packet No bid 20 ct packet No bid 20 CT. Packet | $57.99/case || 20 CT. Packet No bid
BRIOUETS Packet ' '

m’mm Case 100/Case $68.37/cs 100/case | $62.10/case Case $57.99 Case $68.00/case

OTHER: || Ordersof108 | oo oo, Other: No bid Other: No bid Other: No bid

cases or more




