TABULATION SHEET #**
HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
“DNA TESTING LAB SERVICES”

BID NO: 2010-069-03-10-MEG
ﬂ

Sorenson Forensics, LLC Chromosomal Laboratories, Inc. Orchid Cellmark, Inc.
DNA Analysis Time within 21-28 Business Days Y v N DNA Analysis Time within 21-28 Business Days Y_v_N DNA Analysis Time within 21-28 Business Days | Y_v(1) N
BIOLOGICAL STR Y-STR MINIFILER | MITOCHONDRIAL STR Y-STR MINIFILER MITOCHONDRIAL STR Y-STR MINIFILER MITOCHONDRIAL
FLUIDS
800.00 850.00 900.00 1000.00 500.00 750.00 750.00 1600.00
Blood 689.00 789.00 789.00 no bid
bid
Srihen 68900 | 38900 | 789.00 o 800.00 850.00 | 900,00 1000.00 625.00 | 750.00 | 350.00 100.00
689.00 789.00 789.00 bid
Hlafr S 800.00 850.00 | 900.00 1000.00 500.00 100.00 | 750.00 1600.00
800.00 900.00 1000.00 500.00 750.00 1600.00
Cellular Materiats | 089-00 | 789.00 | 789 00 no bid 850.00 750.00
1200.00 1250.00 1300.00 1600.00 900.00 100.00 1150.00 2000.00
Bone 969.00 1,069.00 | 1,069.00 no bid
969.00 1,069.00 | 1,069.00 1200.00 1250.00 1300.00 1600.00 900.00 100.00 1150.00 1600.00
Teeth no bid
. 850.00 1250.00 1000.00 1000.00 500.00 100.00 1150.00 1600.00
Muascular Tissue 689.00 789.00 789.00 no bid
393.00 493.00 493.00 , 400.00 425.00 450.00 1000.00 350.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
Paternity Testing no bid
Sexual Assault 00.00 550. 550.00 1000.00 25. 750.00 350. 100.00
e 689.00 | 789.00 | 789.00 nobid | 20000 N wakih R
DNA profile from 589.00 689.00 689.00
Known source to 400.00 450.00 450.00 1000.00 400.00 750.00 750.00 1000.00
unknown source
TOTAL
7750.00 8575.00 8650 11,200.00 5800.00 4250.00 7250.00 11,300.00
OVERALL $ 36,175.00 $ 28, 600.00




