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MEMORANDUM

TO: Eduardo Olivarez, Chief Administrator
Hidalgo County Health and Human Services

ATTN: Josie Escalan}? Administrative Asst.

FROM: Sandy Suaref, Buyer Il
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: April 09,2010

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2010-071-04-07-SGS-Hidalgo County Health and Human Services
“TESTING SYSTEM AND RELATEDSUPPL[ES” i

We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
your response no later than Tuesday, April 13, 2010 @ 3:00 p.m. to be able to present to Commissioner’s Court
on April 20, 2010. Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to
the Purchasing Department. yia fax to (956)-318-2629 or_via email to: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.,

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
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Please include the budget account number(s) for the above reference project.
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING DATE: April 07,2010

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DESCRIPTION OF BID: “ TESTING SYSTEMS AND RELATED SUPPLIES”

BID NO: 2010-071-04-07-SGS

BUYER: SANDY SUAREZ

SOLE RESPONDENT: STANBIO LABORATORY
P L -
ANNUAL RODUCT ISTED PRICE PROPOSED-UNIT PRICE
PRICING DESCRIPTION
N
Hemoglobin Analyzer A $ 400.00
15T YEAR 15T YEAR
PRICING Warranty on Analyzer $ 325.00
$ 00.00
Hemoglobin 100 ct 200 ct 100 ct ea bx 200 ct ea bx
Microcuvettes (tests)
$153.00 | $295.00 $ 82.00 § 164.00
Optional Item:-Control N/A Calibrator- NO BID | Non-Calibrator-NO BID
Cuvette
Hemoglobin Analyzer N/A $400.00
2"Y YEAR & Optional Extended $ 325.00 2" YEAR OPTIONAL — 3%°
w YEAR
OPTIONAL - arranty
RD $275.00 ea unit $ 275.00 ea unit
37 YEAR
PRICING Hemoglobin 100 ct 200 ct 100 ct ea bx 200 ct ea bx
Microcuvettes (tests)
$153.00 | $295.00 $ 80.00 $ 160.00
Optional Item:-Control N/A Calibrator- NO BID | Non-Calibrator-NO BID
Cuvette

Optional Extended Warranty needs to be purchased within 30 days of delivery for each unit.

Attached Conditions of Warranty provided by Stanbio Laboratory
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HemoPoint H2 Warranty

The HEMOPoint H2 hemoglobin photometer is warranted against defects in
material and workmanship for the duration of one year.

At the option of the County of Hidalgo — Health and Human Services Dept.

a two (2) year extended warranty may be purchased within 30 days of delivery
of each HemoPoint H2 Unit @ $275.00 per unit for a total warranty period of
three (3) years.

Stanbio Laboratory, or their authorized representative, will supply, free of charge,
the labor and material requlred to repair any defects during the warranty period
at a Stanbio authorized repair facility except as excluded below.

CONDITIONS OF WARRANTY

Warranty excludes repair of failures resulting from mishandling or abuse.

Warranty excludes consumable items.

Warranty does not apply to damage sustained in transit.

We reserve the right to replace or repair any part which is found to be
defective.

Warranty service may only be performed by Stanbio Laboratory or
authorized representatives.

Warranty does not include shipping, freight, transportation or
insurance charges to or from the Stanbio Authorized repair facility.

Warranty is not transferable.

0O LABORATORY HIDALGO COUNTY HEALTH AND
HUMAN SERVICES DEPT.
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE: _April 07, 2010 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: “HIDALGO COUNTY HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT —-TESTING
SYSTEM AND RELATED SUPPLIES”

BID NO: 2010-071-04-07-SGS

SIGNATURE (IF
BID APPLICABLE) ADDRESS
NAME OF BIDDER: REQUEST OR INITIALS OF STAFF E-MAIL
COMPANY/FIRM *VIA ADDRESSING MAILOUT DATE & PHONE NO
1. Stanbio Laboratory 1261 North Main Street
. Boerne, TX. 78006
Attn: Sean Dattoli or Pat Breheny 866-782-6246
. 830-249-0772
E-mail Sandy Suarez 04/22/10 sdattolic@stanbio.com or pbreheny@
stanbio
40 Empire Dr.
2. Hemo C_”e’ S A Lake Forest, CA. 92630
Attn: Kimberly Mullins E-mail Sandy Suarez 04/22/10 | P# 800-881-1611 x116 F#949-598-865 |
kimberly@hemocue.com
. . 8741 Landmark Rd.
3. Mckesson Medical —Surgical Richmond. VA, 23228
Attn: Therese Mugge E-mail Sandy Suarez 04/22/10 | P#800-328-8111 F#800-237-9766
Local Rep. Baltazar Dehoyos Dehoyos-956-497-6752
therese.mugge@mckesson.com or
baltazar.dehoyos(@
i . . 122 Smith Road
4. American Bio Medica Corp. Kinderhook NY 12106
Attn: Jessi Dean E-mail Sandy Suarez 04/22/10 | P#800-227-1243 x 101 Fx#518-758-8171
jdean@abme.com
. . . 2850 Centerville Rd,
5. Agilent Technologies Inc. E-mail Sandy Suarez Wilmington, Del. 19808
Attn: Chiranjeet Bhattacharjee 04/22/10 | FH800-227-9770 F302-993-5941
iscabids/@aligent.com
6.
7.
8.
9.
*VIA:
IN PERSON (IP)
E-MAIL (EM)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
FACSIMILE (FAX)



