“AUTOPSY INSTRUMENTS & EQUIPMENT”
QUOTES

Quantity: Item Description: AUTOPSY SERVICES & The Mustard Seed, Ochoa Medical Synergy Medical
EXPERT TESTIMONY-  LLC - Edinburg, Tx Equipment & Equipment & Supplies-
McAllen, Tx Supplies- Edinburg, Texas
Edinburg, Tx
Unit Total Do not carry items.  No response. No response. Therefore
“No Bid” Therefore is is considered a
considered a “No Bid”
“No Bid”
4 Work Station with sink $75.00 $300.00
2 Water hose reels $25.00 $50.00
6 Stainless Cabinets with glass  $85.00 $510.00
doors
5 Hanging scales $50.00 $250.00
6 Exam Lights $90.00 $540.00
1 Hobart 22x32 Walk In $3,500.00 $3,500.00
Cooler with 4 Evaporators
with 1 Compressor
1 2 Door Body Cooler Self $750.00  $750.00
Contained
6 Autopsy sink with disposal ~ $600.00  $3,600.00
Shipping $2,500.00
Grand total of Items plus $12,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Shipping cost




