e m——r RBBFE GROUP daooz

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
County Of Hidalgo

E-09-373-08-18

August 4, 2009
Terry Schroeder, Regional Viee President via facsimile (972) 272-5387
Blake Taylor, Account Manager via email btaylon(®keefegroup.com

KEEFE COMMISSARY NETWORK, LLC
110} Marquis Drive, Suite 200

Garland, Texas 75042

Fh. (B00) 593-0039

Re: Extension of Contract No. €-08-2 {2-08-19-"Commissary Supplies”-Hidalgo Coun:
Sheriff’s Office .

Dear Mr. Schroeder:

Commissioners’ Court will take applicable wction (Tuesday, August 11, 2009) In connection with ¢
Hidalgo Coumty’s option to extend/renew fer the (First 1™ year) of the additionai Two (2} Cne {.
yedar term extension as provided in the cur ‘ent requirements agreement {Under the same rares, tern
and conditions). Effectiva date of renew/extension August 19, 2009.

Please acknowledge receipt of this notice of extansion by signing balow and returning to the Furchash
Department by no laer than, Thursfay, August &, 2009, 12:00 p.m., via email atr

leticia sagnz@co.hidalgo tx.us and to via facsimile (956) 956.3 8-2629.

By: 7@//\ Date: 7 6/0;

{Tarry gﬁfaeder. Regional Vice President

Should you have any questions or require acditional information, plazse do not hesiate to coptact me
(956) 292-7000 x-4861. Your cooperation to this macter s greatly sppreciated and we hope yo
cofmpany continues its business relationship with Hidalgo County.

ciafH. Jaenz, CPPB/Contracts Manager
idalgo Cagnty Purchasing Department

p {o file

Z812 5. Business Highway 281 % Ldinburg, Texas 78539 & {356} 318.2626 # Fax (956) 318-2629
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CENTR-3

ACORD. CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE o008

PRODUCER

Wells Fargo Insurance Services USA, Inc.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION
ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE
HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND OR
ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED 8Y THE POLICIES BELOW,

1401 South Brentwood Bodlevard, Suife 525
St Louis, MO 63144 INSURERS AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED o p Commissary Network, LLC INSURER A+ Greal Norhern insurance Company (Chubh) 20303
10880 Linpage Place msuRER 8. Federal Insurance Company 20281
INSURER C:
INSURER -
3t. Louis, MO 63132 INSURER & ]
COVERAGES

THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE 'NSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING
ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CGNDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR

MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN I3 SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH
POLICIES. AGGREGATE LIMITS SHIOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUGED BY PAID CLAIMS.

{RER LT POLI N
TR ‘Nj%%g TYPE OF INSURANGE POLICY NUMBER TEATE MMy || DATE GO LIMITS
A GENERAL LIABILITY 7321-00-90 0101110 01/01/11 EACH CGCCURRENCE % 1,600,000
X | commerciaL senERAL LABIITY RAMAGE 10 RENTED 3 Ircloded
I CLAIMS MADE QCoUR MELD EXF [Any onE pergon} 3 100060
PERSONAL & ALY INJURY $ 1.000.000
. i GENERAL AGGREGATE 5 2,600,000
CENL AGGREGATE LIMAIT APPLIES PER: FRODUCTS - COMPOP GG | & 2.000 000
POLICY l | FRG: | X |Loc
B | AUTOMOBILE LiABILITY 7321-00-92 01/01/10 01/01/11 COMBINED SINGLE LT | ¢ 000,000
X ANY AUTG (Ea ace:dent) 1,006,
ALL OWHEF AUTOS BODILY INJURY s
SCHEDUL 0 AUTCS 1 (Per person}
HIRED AUTOS BOGILY ihURY 5
NON-UWNE D AUTOS o (Per accidard]
(N PROPERTY DAMAGE s
tPar acodant)
GARAGE LIABILITY i AUTO ONLY - EA ACCICENT | §
3
ANY ALTO . OTHER THAN EAACC |8
. AUTO GHLY AGG 8
EXCESSUMBRELLA LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE 3
OCCUR CLABS MADE AGGREGATE 3
s
BEDUCTIBLE §
RETENTION  § $
WC STATL- TTH-
B | WORKERS COMPENSATION AND 7165-55-50 D00 0110111 = | 1oiY LTS R
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY c o ACCIDENT 700,000
ANY EROPRIETORPARTNERENECUTIVE L BACH AGCH 3 sk
GFFICERAMEMBER EXCLUGED? £ L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| & + 600,000
IF yas, dascrba under .
SPECIAL PROVISICNS below EL. IMSEASE - POLICY LIMIT | & 1000 (R
GTHER

DESCRIPTION GF GPERATIONS / LOCATIONS ¢ VEHICLES ! EXCLUSFONS ADDED BY ENDORSEMENT / SPECIAL PROVISIONS

Certfficate holder shawn below ts mcluded as an Addilionat Insured as respects General Liablity coverages shown regarding operations of the named insured.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Hidalygo County

41h Floor-Admin Blay
100 East Cano Street
Edinburg, TX 78539

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABCVE DESCRIBED PCLICIES BE CARCELLED BEFORE THE EXFIRATION
i DAYS WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER NAMED TO THE LEFT, BUT FAILURE TO 00 8¢ SHALL

CATE THEREOF, THE ISSUING INSURER WILL ENDEAVOR TO MAIL

IMPOSE NO DBLIGATION OR LIABILITY OF ANY KiND UPON THE INSURER. ITS AGENTS OR
REPRESENTATIVES.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE f m\

ACORD 25 (2001/08) 1 of2 1054456

@ ACORD CORPORATION 1988




AcorD. CERTIFICATS.OF LIABILITY INSURANAE

oPID Mal DATEmmMDDNYYYY
CENTR-3 12/23/08

PRODUCER

Wells Fargoe Insurance Services
of Missouri

1401 S. Brentwood Blvd Ste 625

THIS CERTIFICATE I .-SUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION
ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERYIFICATE
HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND OR
ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW.

St. Louis MO 63144
Phone: 314-918-8000 Fax:314-915-1101 INSURERS AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED INSURER A great Northarn Inaurance Co. 20303 )
iINSURERE. ~ Federal Insurance Company 20281
lfgﬁ:gg g-:_)mmissap Network, LLC INSURER C: S i
inpage ace INSURER D:
8t. Louis, gO 63132 S EE
INSURER £:
COVERAGES
THE POLICIES OF (NSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABGVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING
ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF AMY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR
MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH
POLICIES. AGGREGATE LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUGED BY PAID CLAIMS,
[NERRODL] e e - FOLICY EFFECTIVE [POLICY EXPIRATION T
LTR INSRO TYPE OF INSURANCE POLICY NUMEER DATE (MWDD/YY} | DATE (MMDD{YY] LUATS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE I 31,000,000
[ | - [ DAMAGE TO HENTED Li ]
A X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIARILITY | 7321 -00~530 0L/01/09 01/01/10 | PREMISES (Ea ocomsnce; ! 3 INCLUDED
[ CLAMS MADE [ X ] OCCUR MED EXP (Any one parsony | $ 10, 000
PERSOMAL £ ADVINJURY 151,000,000
 GENERAL AGGREGATE 32,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: _PRODUCTS - COMPIOP 2GG | $ 2,000,000
—l poucv[ R [x ]ec
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY
?an";ELﬁE[}SINGLE LiMiT $1 . 000 ; 000
B X | anv auto 7321-00-92 01/01/10 R R —
ALL OWNED AUTDS BODILY INJURY $
| SCHEDULED AUTOS { {Par person)
: i
i .| HIREDAUTOS BODILY INJURY s
| NON-OWNED AUTOS i Per accident)
- e /L PROPERTY DAMAGE 5
g {Per accident)
GARAGE LIABILITY AUTO ONLY - EA ACCIDENT
|___ ANYAUTO OTHER THAN EAACC
AUTG ONLY:

AGG |

EXCESS/UMEREL LA LIABILITY

CLAIMS MADE =

| QEOUCTIBLE
RETENTION 3

AGGREGATE

@ A (B LA e (S e

WORKERS COMPENSATIONR AND .
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY —_

B ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTHER/EXECUTIVE 7165-55~-50
QFFICERMEMBER EXCLUDED?

H yas, doscribe under
SPECIAL PROVISIONS balow

T W STATD:
X {TORY LIMITS

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT
E.L HSEASE - £A EMPLOYEE
E.L. ISEASE - POLICY LIMIT

e ]
s1,000,000

$1,000,000

$1,000,000

01/01/09 | 01/01/10

i
i

QOTHER

insured.

DESCRIFTION OF OFERATIONS / LOCATIONS { VEHICLES / EXCLUSIONS ADDED BY ENDORSEMENT / SPECIAL PROVISIONS
Certificate heolder shown below is included as an Additional Insured as

reapects General Liability coverages shown regarding operaticons of the named

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

HIDALGO

Hidalgo County

4th Floor -~ Admin. Bldg
100 East Cano Street
Edinburg, TX 78539

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFCRE THE EXPIRATION|
DATE THEREOQF, THE ISSUING INSURER WILL ENDEAVOR TO MAIL ‘3_9__ DAYS WRITTEN
NCTICE TO THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER NAMED TO THE LEFT, BUT FAILURE TO DO SO SHALL
IMPOSE NO OBLIGATION OR LIABILITY OF ANY KIND UPON THE INSURER, ITS AGENTS OR
REPRESENTATIVES.

Auwf RE NTATIVE
r

ACORD 25 (2001/08})

@ ACORD CORPORATION 1988




Print Agenda Item Page 1 of 2

Al-16842 42.0.
HCSO-Various Extensions-Keefe Commissary Supp, R&R Distributing,
Hydro Systems Inc & O.E. Investments Inc

CC REGULAR

Date: 08/18/2009

Submitted By: Letty Saenz, PURCHASING DEPT.
Submitted For:  Marty Salazar

Department: PURCHASING DEPT.

Agenda Category. Purchasing Department

Information
CAPTION
1. Requesting authority to exercise the first (1st) year of the additional two(2) one (1) year
periods as provided in current contracts for: "Commissary Supplies” for Hidalgo County
Sheriff's Office, under the same rates, terms and conditions with mulitple awarded vendors:
1) Keefe Commissary Network-C08-212-08-19 and 2) Rene Lucio d/b/a R&R Distributing-
C-08-212A-08-19.

2. Requesting authority to exercise the first (1st) year of the additional three (3) one (1)
year periods as provided in current contract for: "Water Softener System Maintenance
Service" for Hidalgo County Sheriffs Office, under the same rates, terms and conditions
with: Hydro Systems, Inc.-C-08-325-08-26.

3. Requesting authority to exercise the second (2nd) year of the additional two(2) one (1)
year periods as provided in current contracts for: "Lease of Tower Space" for Hidalgo
County Sheriffs Office, under the same rates, terms and conditions with: O.E. Investments,
Inc.-E-08-309-07-28.

BACKGROUND
Acknowledgment and approval from HCSO

Letters of Extensions from: Keefe Commissary Network, LLC, Rene Lucio dba R & R
Distributing, Hydro Systems, Inc. and O.E. Investments, Inc.

Contract No. C-08-212-08-19-Keefe Commissary Network, LI.C
Contract No. C-08-212A-08-19-Rene Lucio dba R & R Distributing
Contract No. C-08-325-08-26-Hydro Systems, Inc.

Contract No. E-08-309-07-28-0. E. Investments, Inc.

Fiscal Impact

FISCAL YEAR: 2009 ACCT. # 9-1100-423-21-280-002-0-431
FUNDS AVAILABLE Y/N7?: MATCHING FUNDS Y/N?:

BUDGETARY IMPACT:
FISCAL YEAR: 2009 ACCT. # 9-1100-423-21-280-002-0-604

FUNDS AVAILABLE Y/N?: MATCHING FUNDS Y/N?:

http://agenda.hgoco.net/frs/publish/print_ag memo.cfm?seq=16842&rev_num=0&form=...  8/10/2009




Print Agenda Item — — Page 2 of 2
BUDGETARY IMPACT:
Attachments
Link: R & R Distributing
Link: Hydro Systems Inc
Link: Keefe Commissary Network
Link: © E Investments Inc
Link: C-08-212-08-19-Keefe Commissary Network
Link: C-08-212A-08-19-R & R Distributing
Link: C-08-325-08-26-Hydro Systems Inc
Link: E-08-309-07-28-0Q E Investments Inc
Form Routing/Status
Route Seq Inbox Approved By Date Status
(Criginator) Letty Saenz  08/05/2002 04:51 PM CREATED
1 Purchasing Department NEW
2 Budget & Management
3 Auditor's Office
Form Started By: Letty Saenz Started On: 08/05/2009 04:51 PM
http://agenda.hgoco.net/frs/publish/print_ag memo.cfm?seq=16842&rev_num=0&form=...  8/10/2009
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REQUIREMENTS AGREEML.. (1
C-08-212-08-19

THIS AGREEMENT (the "Agreement") is entered into effective as of August 19, 2008
by and between Keefe Commissary Network, LLC, a ("Seller")and Hidalgo County ("Buyer").

WHEREAS, Buyer has solicited proposals for the supply of its requirements of Hidalgo
County “Commissary Supplies,” as further described in Exhibit "A" which is attached hereto and
incorporated herein by reference for all purposes (the "Products") for a period of one year; and

WHEREAS, Selier has submitted a proposal to supply Buyer's requirements; and

WHEREAS, Buyer has determined that Seller has submitted the lowest and best bid to meet
Buyer's requirements for the Product.

NOW THEREFORE, for and in consideration of the mutual covenants and conditions
heremafter set forth, and other good an valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which
is hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto agree as follows:

1. Buyer agrees to purchase from Seller, and Seller agrees to sell to Buyer, all of the
Products that Buyer may require for use by Buyer in “Commissary Supplies” in the areas of
Hidalgo County projects for a period of August 19, 2008 from _Angust 18, 2009 with the option
to renew for an additional two (2) one (1) year term; and an additional sixty (60) day grace period,
under the same rates, terms, and condition, and it is agreed that the Products will meet the
specifications set forth in Exhibit "A" hereto.

2. When Buyer determines that it needs a quantity of the Products to be delivered, it
will, according to its Purchasing Policies, complete and submit to Seller a Purchase Order describing
the type and quantity of the Products required. The Products are to be delivered by Buyer to the
location in Hidalgo County specified by Buyer in its Purchase Order.

3. Buyer agrees to pay Seller for each Purchase Order based on the prices set out in
Exhibit "B". Seller shall render invoices for each Purchase Order, and the invoices shall be paid by
Buyer on or before the 30th day following receipt of the invoice.

4.  County and Seller agree that either party may terminate this contract upon thirty (30)
days written notice at any time for any reason or no reason at all,

5. General Provisions.

a. Conflict with Applicable Law. Nothing in this Agreement shall be construed so as
to require the commission of any act contrary to law, and whenever there is any conflict
between any provision of this Agreement and any present or future law, ordinance or
administrative, executive or judicial regulation, order or decree, or amendment thereof,
contrary to which the parties have no legal right to contract, the latter shall prevatl, but in
such event the affected provision or provistons of this Agreement shall be modified only to
the extent necessary to bring them within the Iegal requirements and only during the time
such conflict exists.




b. No Wa”™™ o waiver by Buyer of any breach ¢~ ~  ‘ovision of this Agreement
shall be deemea 0 be a waiver of any preceding or succeeding breach of the same or any
other provision hereof.

c. Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the entire contract between the parties
hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either directly or through any
agent or representative) any representations or agreements in connection with this Agreement
not specifically set forth herein. This Agreement may be modified or amended only by
agreement in writing executed by Buyer and Seller, and not otherwise.

d. Texas Law to Apply. This Agreement shall be construed under and in accordance
with the laws of the State of Texas, and all obligations of the parties created hereunder are
performable in Hidalgo County, Texas. The parties hereby consent to personal jurisdiction
in Hidalgo County, Texas.

e. Notice. Except as may be otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement, all
notices, demands, requests or communications required or permitted hereunder shall be in
writing and shall either be (i) personally delivered against a written receipt, or (ii) sent by
registered or certified mail, retun receipt requested, postage prepaid and addressed to the
parties at the addresses set forth below, or at such other addresses as may have been
theretofore specified by written notice delivered in accordance herewith:

If to Buyer: Hidalgo County
Attention: County Judge
100 E. Cano, 2nd Floor
Edinburg, Texas 78539

If to Seller: Keefe Commissary Network, LLC
Attn: Terry Schroader, Regional Vice President
3101 Marquis Drive, Suite 200
Garland, TX 75042

Each notice, demand, request or communication which shall be delivered or mailed in the
manner described above shall be deemed sufficiently given for all purposes at such time as
it is personally delivered to the addressee or, if mailed, at such time as it is deposited in the
Unites States mail.

f. Additional Documents. The parties hereto covenant and agree that they will execute
such other and further instruments and documents as are or may become necessary or
convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this Agreement.

g. Successors. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of the
parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal representatives,
successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement.

h. Assignment. This Agreement shall not be assignable.

1. Headings. The headings and captions contained in this Agreement are solely for
convenient reference and shall not be deemed to affect the meaning or interpretation of any

provision or paragraph hereof.
J. Gender and Number. All pronouns used in this Agreement shall include the other




gender, whethegy  in the masculine, feminine or neysax  der, and the singular shall
include the plu.  ~vuenever and as often as may be appr.  .a.

k. Authority to Execute. The execution and performance of this Agreement by Buyer
and Seller have been duly authorized by all necessary laws, resolutions or corporate action,
and this Agreement constitutes the valid and enforceable obligations of Buyer and Seller in
accordance with its terms.

L Commitment of Current Revenues Only. Inthe event that, during any term hereof,
the Commissioners Court does not appropriate sufficient funds to meet the obligations of
Buyer under this Agreement, Buyer may terminate this Agreement upon sixty (60) days
written notice to Seller. Buyer agrees, however, (o use reasonable efforts to secure funds
necessary for the continued performance of this Agreement. The parties intend this provision
to be a continuing right to terminate this Agreement at the expiration of each budget period
of Buyer pursuant to the provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt. Code Ann. § 271.903 (Vernon Supp.
1996).

m. Insurance. Company shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and

all persons connected with providing services under this Contract naming County as an
additional insured (with coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit “C” attached
hereto and incorporated herein at this point for all purposes), and shall furnish to County
certificates of such insurance coverage.

. Purchasing Ethics. Seller represents and warrants it has not, during the process of
being awarded this contract violated the following ethical standards of Buyer and, upon and
after the execution of this Agreement, agrees to abide by the following ethical standards of
Buyer:

(1) It shall be a breach of ethics to offer, give or agree to give any elected official,
department head or employee, or former elected official, department head or
employee, of Hidalgo County, or for any elected official, department head or
employee or former elected official, department head or employee of Hidalgo
County, to solicit, demand, accept or agree to accept from another person, entity or
organization, a gratuity or an officer of employment in connection with any decision,
approval, disapproval, recommendation, preparation or any part of a program
requirement or purchase request, influencing the content of any specification or
procurement standard, rendering of advise, investigation, auditing, or in any other
advisory capacity in any proceeding or application, request for ruling, determination,
claim or controversy, or other particular matter pertaining to any program
requirement or a contract or subcontract, or to any solicitation or proposal therefor
pending before any department or agency of Hidalgo County.

(2) It shall be a breach of ethics for any payment, gratuity or offer of employment
to be made by or on behalf of a subcontractor under a contract to the prime contractor
or higher tier subcontractor for any contract for Hidalgo County, or any person
associated therewith, as an inducement for the award of a subcontract or order.




p— o~

EXECUTED effective as of the day and year first above written.

f .
APPROVED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON, - lﬁl 5 .9—0-0%.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Atlas & Hall, L.L.P

A

Date: g’-;j-o,?

ATTEST:

Ol

Dater G?j" i

Keefe Suppl

By:__,

Printed NAgle: 2 @27 JCM‘OaOe’d
Title: (WA~ (JIeE foJioxpir

Date: ?/ Sof V8




EXHIBIT “A”
SPECIFICATIONS




Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office
“Commissary Services”
Bid No.:08-212-06-11-ROL

Exhibit “A"
Specifications

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

The following are the minimum requirements and/or
specifications that will be acceptable to the
Hidalge County Sheriff’s Office, These
reguirements and/or specifications may be egual
or better. Any bid that does not meet the minimum
requirements and/or specifications will be
rejected.

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s 0Office 1is seeking to
contract with a qualified wvendor(s) tco furnish
“Commissary products” on an  "As Needed RBasis”
including, but not limited to, the following:

TERMS, CONDITIONS AND REQUIREMENTS

All costg and expenses associated with the
preparation and submission of bids shall be the
responsibility of the bidder and nc reimbursement
for such charges or expenses shall be passed onto
Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office.

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office has the authority
to utilize State Contracts from its membership
with their existing or new cooperatives when ever
it iz in the County’s bhest interest to do so.

211 purchases will be on an "“As Needed Basis”,
there are no set quantities to be purchased.

The initial contract term for this project will
be for one (1} vear with the County’s option to
extend for an additional two {2} one (1) vyear
term. -




10.

11.

o~ Eama

L. .algo County Sheriff’s . .fice reserves the
right to continue this bid for an additional
sixty (60) day grace period, under the same

rates, terms and cenditions at the end of the
contract term for unforeseen delays in award of
new bid for the next contract term.

Insurance reqguirements for this project to be
maintained through out the contract term (Refer
to limits on the Exhibit “C” for iimits;).

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s 0Offlice reserves the
right to award to the lowest qualified bid on a
lump sum basis to one bidder or to multiple
bidders if the County determines it 1is in the
be=t interest to do so0.

211 bid prices for i1tems shall take into
consideration shipping and handling costs and any
other items mentioned on specifications as part
of the fixed item price.

Awarded vendor will ensure that all deliveries
will be made in full within two (2) to five (5}
working days from purchase order.

Ssupplies Reguired: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s
Office requires Total/Full Jail Inmate Commissary
products such as but not limited to:

Snacks

Sugar & artificial gweetener

Drinks/drink mix

Candies

Small supplies such as
pens/pencils/envelopes/etc.

Personal items (combs, lotion, etc.)

Personal hygiene items

Dental care items

Various over —the-counter medications

Sports bpras, women’s undergarments, men’s
undergarments, T-shirts, shower shoes

Hidalgo County Sheriff’'s Office Inventory
History: Commissary history for the periocd of

January through December 2006 is as follows:

Total inventory purchases:

$ 436,484.62 {Current average daily total

detention center population is at 1148).




12.

13.

14.

15.

1ls.

17.

18.

19.

e o~

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office reserves the
right to add/delete items as it deems to be in
the begt interest of the County.

Product Containers: No glass or metal containers

shall be allowed. Size and type of containers
shall be approved by Hidalge County Sherifr’s
Office. Hidalge County Sheriff’s Office reserves

the right to increase/decrease products offered
as it deems to be in the best interest of the

County.

Security: All security provisions established
for the facility shall be strictly followed.
Hidalge County Sheriff’s Office zreserves the
right to enforce existing or establish new
security procedures as deemed to be in the best
interest of the County in order to maintain safe
and orderly operation of the detention facility.

A1l food products must be properly labeled, only
fresh and legal proeducts shall be delivered to
the Commissary. Ttem(s) found defective or not
meeting gspecifications shall immediately  be
picked and replaced by the awarded vendor.

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s 0Office reserves the
right to search any bags or personal items
brought intc the jail by the awarded wvendor at
any time. The County may request a complete list
of awarded vendoer’s emplcoyees at any time during
this contract which will include name, date of
birth, social security number, sex, naticnality
and driver’s license. Vendor’s employees shall
pe in company uniform, and be clearly identified
as being employed by the company, and present
themselves in a professicnal manner at all times.

Record/Inventory: ° Hidalgo County Sheriff’s
Office may reguire that the vendor provide a
monthly inventory to account for commissary
activities.

Commissary items may be substituted by wvendors
but, must be egual or better and must be approved
by the Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office.

Market Volatility and Unit Price Adjustments:
Hidalgo County recognizes that during pericds of
national crisis and unstable economic conditions,

3
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1 .oreseen price increases n. _nt affect costs for
goods and services contracted on an annual basis.
The following procedure may be employed to
mediate price volatility:

A) Requesting Price Adjustment: Upcn written
request of the Vendor to the County Purchasing
Lgent, the County may review evidence of

prevailing industry-wide market conditions that
warrant an adjustment in bid prices contained in
the contract.

+ & Vendor must tie any price change clause to
an industry-wide or otherwise nationally
recognized index, or some other form of
verifiakle document. Such written reguest
must ke accompanied by a certified copy of
the supplier's advisory or notification to
the vendecr of the price changes.

= The Vendor must put the Purchasing Agent on
the mailing 1lists for such publicaticns so
that the Purchasing Agent can monitor said
changes. Such membership shall be at no
cost to the County.

s The County Purchasing A&Agent retains the
right to determine whether or not such
proposed price changes are 1in the best
interest of the County.

» No price escalation will be authorized in
excess of the amount of the increase
referred to in the supplier’s notice.

¢ The County may only dgrant a price increase
if the evidence presented is deemed
reliable. Should the County allow a price
increase, the approved price change shall be
honcred for all orders received by the
vendor or contractor after the effective
date of such price change. Approved price
changes are not. applicable to orders already
issued and in process at time of price
change.

B) Price Reduction: Vendor shall notify the County
at the time when the Vendor’s costs for items and/or
supplies reduce due to stabilization in the market

4
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at ich time prices for ite on this contract
ghall be reduced accordingly. Failure by the Vendor
to notify the County of a decrease 1in costs for
items and/or supplies for which the Vendor was
granted a price adjustment, may result in immediate
termination of this contract and the County shall
not be cbligated to pay the Vendor the difference
between the contract price and the price adjustment.

C} Time frame for Adjusted Price Increases: Price
increases are only valid for the quarter in which
they are requested . and approved, Prices shall

return to the original contract price at the
beginning o©of the following quarter unless a
Vendor notifies the County in writing within ten
(10) days of expiration of the gquarter in which
the price increase 1is 1in effect, that it desires
to have the price increase continmue or that the
Vendor 1s reguesting a different price increase
for the following guarter. Such reguest must be
supplemented with sufficient Justification to
demonstrate that the price 1increase remains

necessary. The County Purchasing Department
shall have sole discretion whether to grant the
price increase extension. The County too, shall

have discretion to unilaterally reduce, eliminate
or extend a price adjustment to the Vendor at any
time upon written notice from the County to the
Vendor demonstrating justification for such
reduction, elimination or extensicon cof the price
adjustment. : :

D) Allowable Review Periods: Price adjustment
reviews may only be requested by the Vendor on a
quarterly basgis. However, the County may at its
Owrl discretion, conduct temporary price
adjustment reviews at any time. The County
Purchasing Agent and/or the County  Auditor
reserve the right to audit and/or examine any
pertinent books, documents, papers, records or
invoilces relating directly to the contract
transaction in gquesticn after reasonable notice
and during normal business hours.

E) Dollar Limit to Price Changes: The total
increase in contract price shall not exceed
twenty-five percent {25%) of the original

contract price during the contract term.
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Cont’ -~ SPECIFIC. _IONS

HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE -
COMMISARY ITEMS

Hygiene ¥it { £ T-prush / T-Paste 1.05 oz. / Deodorant

0.05 oz, }

Almond Joy Bax 1.61.cz

Baby Ruth 2.1 oz.

Butter Finger Bar 2.1 oz.

Snickers Almond Bar 1.76 oz.

Milky Way Bar 2.05 oz.

Pay Day Bar 1.8L oz.

gnickers Bar 2.07 cz.

3 Musketeers Bar 2.1l3 oz.

Skittles “Original Fruits” 2.17 oz. bag

M & M Peanuts 1.74 oz. bag

Twix Bar 2.0 o=z.

Peanut Pattie 1,75 oz.

Réeses Peanut Butter Cups 1.5 oz.

Ereath Savers {12 mints} 0.75 oz.

Ramen Scups {chili/beef/chicken/shrimp} 3 oz. Clear Pack
Chili Corn Nuts

Fanch Corn Nuts

Original Coxn Nuts

S5alted Peanuts 1.75 oz. bag

Beef Jerky Steak 1 oz. stick

Chunk Light Tuna 4.23 oz. Pouch

Fefried Beans Resealable Pouch 6 oz.
Nacho Cheese Dip (w/Jalapenc 4 oz. Plastic Tub)
Jalapeno Cheese Spread 8 oz. Plastic Tub
Jelly (Grape & Strawberry) 12 oz. Sgueere Bottle
Peanut Butter Squeezers 1.1Z2 oz

Chili No Beans 1:i.250z. Pouch

Chili w/Beans 11.25cz. Pouch

Hot Chili w/Beans 11.2% oz. Pouch

Beef Stew 11.25 oz. Pouch

Roast Beef & Gravy 10 oz. Pouch

Sardines in Hot Tomato Sauce 3.5%3cz. Fouch
Fish PFillets 3.530z. Pouch

B.R.Q. Potate Chips 1.5 oz. bag

Flaming Hot Cheetos 1.50z. bag

BBQ Ceorn Chips 1.50z. bag

Dorites Hacho Cheese 1.50z.

Tortilla Chips l2oz. bag

Tostadas 1Zoz. pack

Snack Crackers 12 oz. box

Cookies (duplex/vanilla/chocolate/p-butter) & ocz. Tray
Zinger Cremes 4 coz. pack

Apples Ples 4 oz.

Cherxry Pies 4 oz. pk

Cherry Rolls 4 oz.

Cinnamon Rells 4 oz. pk

Honey Bun  6oz. pX

Choceolate Cupcakes (2-pk) - 4 oz.




50.
51.
52.
E3.
54 .
55.
5G.
57
58.
59.
60.
61.
&2 .
63
B4 .
65.
£6.
€7 .
6B .
69.
70.
71
72,
T3
T4
75.
76 .
T
78 .
75,
80.
81 .
82 .
83,
g4 .
85.
86 .
87.
88 .
89,
g0,
853.
92 .
23.
94 .
95.
96 .
27 .
9&.,
oo,

100.
10d.

i02.

103.

—~
Cont’ SPECIFICA. .ONS

Mocnplies {banana/strawverry/chococlate) 2.75 oz.

Coca Cola Classic 20 oz. plastic bottle

Sprite 20 oz. plastic bottle

Fanta Orange 20 oz. plastic bottle

Dx. Pepper 20 oz. rplastic bottle

Diet Coke 20 oz. plastic bottle

Maxwell House Instant Coffee 4 oz. Resealakle Clear Pouch

Coffee Mug w/Lid 14 oz.

Hot Cocoa Mix loz. bag

Cereal Bowl w/Lid 24 oZ.

Ozarka Spring Water 20 oz. plastic hottle

Sugar Cubes 1 1b. hbx

White Sport Bras (Medium thru 3xl)

White Sweatshirts (Medium thru 4x1)

White Boxer Shorts (Small thru exl)

White Thermal Underwear Set (Small thru &x1)

Men White Crew HNeck T-shirts {Medium thru &x1}

White Men Briefs (Small thru 5x1)

Meng/Ladies Crew Socks {one size fits all}

Ladies Socks

White Ladies Pantieg (Size 5 thru 18)

White Mens/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes {(Size 6-13)

Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) 50 ct. bx

Hells Mentho-Lyptus (9 drops) Stick

Advil Coated (2 taklet pouch) 50 ct. box

Motrin Ibuprofen {2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. bx

Enti Shank Security Toothbrush & Clear Cap

2nti-Shank Security Razor - 5ingle Edge

Jolly Ranchers 3.7 oz. Assorted Bag

Sunflower Kernels 4 oz. bag

Stariite Mintse 2.75 oz. kag

Irish Spring Bar Scap Antibacterial 4.5 oz.

Elasgtic Pony Tailers 18 ct. pk-klack

St. Valentines Cards {English/Sparish) 6/pk

Happy Easter Card {Engligh/Spanish) €/pk

Happy Mother’s Day Card (English/Spanish] E/pk

Father’s Day Card {(English/Spanish} &/pk

Happy Birthday Card [(English/Spanish) &/pk

Thanksgiving Day Card (English/Spanish) &/pk

Christmas Card {(English/Spanish} &/pk

Qral Pain Relief 0.32 cz. Tube

Alcohol - Free Mouthwash 8 oz. Plastic Bottle

Alcohel - Free Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic Bottle

Athletes Foot Cream 0.05 oz. Tube

Hydrocortisone Cream 1 oz. Tube

Chap Stick Lip Balm 15 oz,

Hemorrheoidal Ointment 2 oz. Tube

Muscie Rub 3 oz. Tube

Medicated Chest Rub 23.353 o

Floss Leops “"Mint Flavor®” 3

Eye Drops 0.05 oz.

Alka Seltzer {Original Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 11l6.ct.

boax

Alka Seltzer (Plus Cold Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch)
72 ct. bx

Eolaids Intacid (12 Tablets) Stick

Z .
O ¢t. Plastic Bzg




104.
105.
106 .
107.

108.

109,
110.

2111.
11z2.

113.

ii4.
115.
116.
117.
118.
11%.
126.
121,
122.
123.
124,
125.

i1Z¢&.

127,
1Z8.

i25.

120.

131.
132.

123

124,
125,

136.

137.
izg.

135.

140C.
141.
l42.
143,

—~~
Con’ t- SPECIFICx.IONS

Zcne Gel Medication 1 oz. Tube

Contact Lens M/F Solution 8 oz.

Legal Gummecd Pads [ 8 3 x 11"

3 1/2” Flexible Pencil

Bubble Cushioned Envelope (6" » 37}

#10 White Security Envelopes

Ko Clasp Envelope (3" x 127)

Twin Pocket Folders

Dictionary (English - Spanish & English)
Word Seek Puzzles Books

Sketch Pads (50 Sheets)

Playing Cards beck

4 W Flexible Black Ink Psan

Tracing Paper Pad (40 Sheets)

Tan PVC Shower Sandals (Size 8 thru 13)
Colgate “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.2 oz.
Clese Up “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.3 oz,
Dowve Bar Scap 2.1%5 o=z.

Zest Bar Soap 2.2 oz.

Three Flowers Brilliantine 4 oz.
Dandruff Shampoo & Conditioner 14.2 o=z.-
Lice Control Shampoc 2 oz.

Nalr Hair Removal 5 oz.

Speed Stick Agua Sport AZnti-Perspirant Gel 3 cz.

Razorless Hair Removing Cream & oz.
After Shave Lotion 4 oz.

Baby Lotionm 15 oz.

Shaving Gel 3 oz. Clear Tube

White Hankerchisf {15% x 15"

VOL Extra Body Shampoo 15.0 oz.

VG5 Extra Body (Conditioner 15.0 oz,
Suave Powder Fresh Deodorant 1.7 oz. Clear
Hinged Scap Dish Box- Régular Size
Greaseless Skin Cream 4.5 oz.

Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Scap 3.6 ©z.
Hailr Megisturizer 4 oz. Tube

Palm Hair Brush Flexible - Black

Tampons - Singles (Regular/Super/Junicr) 40 ct.

Dispcsable Douche € oz.
White Washcloth {127x12")

Box




EXHIBIT “B”
PAYMENT SCHEDULE




Hidalgo County Sheriffs ~ice

-_— .
“Commissary It~
Bid No.:2008-212-06-11-ROL
Exhibit “B”
Bid Page
Iterns
1. Aygiene Kit{4“T-Brush/T-Paste 1.05 oz./Soep 1.5 cz/Deodeorantl.05 cz.)
TUnit Price § A{f} "ﬂ(ﬁ’\
2. Almond Joy Bar 1.ol.cz Unit Price $ 56 ( '7(00‘2.)
2 Baby Ruth 2.1 cz. Unit Price S 56
4. Butter Finger Bar 2.1 cz. Unit Price § 56
5. Snickers Almond Bar 1.76 oz. Unit Price § 56
G. Milky Way Bar 2.05 oz. Unit Price §$ 66
7 Pay Day Bar 1..85 0Z. Unit Price § 56
3. Snickers Bar 2.07 oz. Unit Price 5 66
9. 3 Musketeers Bar 2.13 oz. Unit Price $ 66
10.  Skittles “Original Fruits” 2.17 oz. bag Unit Price $ .99
11. M & M Peanuts 1.74 cz. bag Unit Price § 56
12. Twix Bar 2.0 oz. Unit Price $66
13. Peanut Pattie 1.7%5 ocz. Unit Price § 3_)
14. Reeses Peanult Butter Cups 1.5 oz. Unit Price $ 56
15. Breath Savers (12 mints) 0.75 oz. Unit Price $ ‘56
16. Ramer: Soups {chili/besf/chicken/shrimp) 3 oz. Clear Pack Unit Price s. A0
17. Chili Corn Nuts 1.4 oz. pacx Unit Price § Z)Ll
1g. Ranch Corn Nuts 1.4 opz. pack Unit Price § 2)"*
19. Original Corn Nuts 1.4 oz. pack Unit Price $NO QID
20. Salted Peanuts 1.75% oz. bag Unit Price $ 2,0
2. Beef Jerky Steak 1 oz. stick Unit Price § . 10O
22. Chunk Light Tuna 4.23 oz. Pouch Unit Price $ -_lq
23 Refried Beans Resealable Pouch 6 oz. Unit Price $ ']q ('8 _O-L)
24.  Nacho Cheese Dip (w/Jalapenc 4 oz. Piastic Tub) Unit Price $|.H43
2%, Jalapeno Chesse Spread 8 oz. Plastic Tub Unit Price § —]O
26. Jelly (Grape & Strawberry) 12 oz. Squeeze Bottle Unit Price §$

Strawbeny 135
rape BT




37

38.

39,

40.

L
¥R

(93]
Y

4
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o
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Peanut But

—

Chili N:

Chili w/Beans

=dns

~ Sgueezers 1.12Z ¢z. Unit Price © |12_

P

11.2%0z. Pecuch Unit Price . 6“{

»1.25cz. Pouch Unit Price § 6"‘{

Eot Chili w/Beans 11.25 oz. Pouch Unit Price §_ - 84

Beef Stew 11.25 oz.

FPouch Unit Price $ q"{

Roast Beef & Gravy 10 cz. Pouch Unit Price $ l-.”

Sardines in Hot Tomatce Sauce 3.530z. Pouch Unit Price $ —]O

Fish Fillets 3.53cz.

Pouch Unit Price § 1.00

B.B.Q. Potato Chips 1.5 oz. bag Unit Price § ?,?_)

Flaming Hot Cheetos 1.502z. bag Unit Price $ o|5

BBQ Corn Chips 1.5c¢z. bag Unit Price § -2,0 (H0+ CD({‘\ Ch.lpr-SCW_)

Doritos Hacho Cheese 1.50z. Unit Price & ao

Tortilla Chips 1202. bag Unit Price $ |.00

Tostadas

Snack Cra

Cockies {duplex/vanilla/chocelate/p-butter} 6 cz. Tray Unit Price 3 - 56

12cz.

ckers

Zinger (remes

Apples Pies 4 oz. Unit Price $ "‘JO (&-LGJL Cﬂ,aw) (509.-)

Cherry Pies 4 o0z. pk Unit Price SNO 6](1

Unit Price $_QL(_MLN6 bOM’f”JJ

Cherry Ro
Cinnamen

Honey Bun

1ls 4

Rolls

Goz.

pack Unit Price § NC) Bid

12 oz. box Unit Price $ LAT {i1loZ)

CE .

4

oDZ.

Chocolate Cupcakss

Moonpies (banana/strawverry/choceolate: 2.75 oz. Unit Price $ 2_8

4 oz. pack Unit Price SM(_') p);d

rk Unit Price $ .L}D

pk Unit Price § "{6

(2-pk) - 4 oz. Unit Price 5 .50

Coca Cola Classic 20 oz. plastic boitle Unit Price S .80

Sprite 20

D .

plastic bottle Unit Price § .20

Fanta Crange 20 cz. plastic keottle Unit Price 5_- 20

Dr. Pepper 20 oz. plastic boitle Unit Price § . 85

Diet Coke 20 cz. plastic beottie Unit Price § - SO

Instant Coffee 4 cz. Resealable Clear Pouch Unit Price §

.85

Coffee Mug w/Lid 14 oz. Unit Price $ .1 (3.3. 02_)

Fot Cocoa

Mix

ioz.

bag Unit Price § -‘O




66,

67 .

68.

79

BO.

B1.

83.

g4.

06

B7.

8.

89,

80.

Cereal Bow' -/Lid 24 pz. Unit Price $ ?)(f‘

’-\. . p—
ing Water 20 cz. plastic botil. aic Price § 36

Czarka

Sugar Cubes 1 1b. bx Unit Price $  Q.H4D

White Sport Bras (Medium thru 3x1} Unit Price § (olq ﬂ}j )
L- :

White Sweatshirts (Medium thru 4xl) Unit Price $Mc,d-.2)[{; ﬁI.{'_',?,('_')O 41‘:._ /2 .C

White Boxer Shorts {(Small thru éxl}) Unit Price $5M’L"ﬂ£.}‘) ¥L-2.29 e ST K,

White Thermal Underweaxr Set (Small thru &xl) Unit Price $5m-¥i-= 3,15 Ayl-

Sxl- s8¢0 Lxt-4.5S
Men White Crew Neck T-shirts (Medium thru 6x1) Unit Price $ Med-yi- 8/, 83
VLN B2 48 oy Lyl =830

a4

White Men Briefs (Small thru 5x1) Unit Price $§m-xL:8/23 Jdvi:7 &2 3¥i=i.

Mens/Ladies Crew Socks [one size fits all) Unit Price $ . O

=ALL 3 PR

Wnite Ladies Panties {Size 5 thru 18) Unit“Price 25-!0,53_90 114z 84.90

White Mens/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes (Size 6-13) Unit Price SAM Bid

Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) 52 ct. bx Unit Price 5. D

Halls Mentho-Lyptus {9 drops) Stick Unit Price $ ]]D

Advil Ceoated (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. box Unit Price $ 3)5‘]

Motrin Ibuprofen (2 tabiet pouch} 50 c¢t. bz Unit Price § {1}

Toothhwieh = B.OS

Enti Shank Security Toothbrush & Clear Cap Unit Price $ Cap =%, 0/

Anti-Shank Security Razor - Single Edge Unit Price $.A0

Jolly Ranchers 3.7 opz. Assorted Bag Unit Price §$., Sq

sunflower Kernels 4 cz. bag Unit Price $ .38 (3.2502)

Starlite Mints 3.75 oz. bag Unit Price § 50

Irish Spring Bar Scap Antibacterial 4.5 coz. Unit Price § 3 C"{‘.OO%)

Eiastic Pony Tailers 18 ct. pk-black Unit Price $_ .90

St. Valentines Cards (English/Spanish) 6/pk Unit Price $ 9.9

Happy Easter Card (Engligh/Spanish) 6/pk Unit Price § 9,9

Happy Mother’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk Unit Price § J.?

Father’'s Day Card (English/Spanish! 6/pk Unit Price § 9\‘:'

Hapry Birthday Card (Engiish/Spanish) &/pk Unit Price § 5LOJ

Thanksgiving Day Card {English/Spanish) &/pk Unit Price $ 9\‘97

Christmas Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk Unit Price § -9\67

oral Pain Reiief 0.33 oz. Tube Unit Price $ .A]

hlechol - Free Mouthwash B oz. Plastic Bottle Unit Price § 55




G1. Alcohol -~ ™ ~e Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic Bottle Unit Price $_[.0() ( Foz)

—
9Z. Athlete. >ot Cream 0.05 oz. Tube Unit Pr . SNO 6Id\
93, Bydrecortisone Cream L cz. Tube Unit Price $_ - 29
Hé. Chap Stick Lip Baim 15 oz. Unit Price § IO“{
95 . Lemorrhoidal Ointment 2 oz. Tube Unit Price $ & .2
96 . Mascle Rub 3 oz. Tube Unit Price § 1.25
97. Medicated Chest Rub 3.53 oz. Unit Price §_.9]
98 . Fioss Loops “Mint Fiavor” 30 ct. Plastic Bag Unit Price § No Bid
95. Eye Drops .05 oz. Unit Price § ltﬂg

100. Z&lka Seltzer (Original Effervescent Z-tablet Pouch) 1l1&.ct. box

Unit Price SNO 6]d

Zlka Seltzer (Plus Cold Effervescent Z2-tablet Pouch)
72 ct. bx Unit Price $ .(p(()

=
&
bt

102. ERolaids EBntacid (12 Tablets) Stick Unit Price § “"7

103. Acne Gel Medication 1 oz. Tube Unit Price § {08

104. Contact Lems M/P Solu<ion B cz. Unit Price sANo pid

105. Legal Gummed Pads ( 8 b x 117) Unit Price $ .HZ

106. 3 1/2” Flexible Penci’ Unit Price $ No bid

107. Bubble Cushioned Envelope (67 x 97) Unit Price $ No Pid

i08. #1C White Security Znvelcopes Unit Price § _”

109. No Clasp Envelope (9% x 12”) Unit Price § 07

21C. Twin Pocket Folders Unit Price $ NO Bld

11i. Dicticnary (English - Spanish & English) Unit Price $Il5

112. Weord Seek Puzzles Beooks Unit Price § ND ?)-id

113. Sketch Pads (50 Sheets) Unit Price $NO 6|d

114. FPlaying Cards Deck Unit Price $ }. 10O

115. 4 7 ¥lexiole Black Ink Pen Unit Price $ 9|

116. Tracing Paper Pad (40 Sheets} Unit Price § NO Bid

117. Tan PVC Shower Sandals (Size 8 thru 13} Unit Price sSm'il}F[,SD Q.XL‘“ZF.

118. Colgate “Red Gel” Toothpastie 4.2 oz. Unit Price $[62~ ([,ltar' (J(J.)

112. Clese Up “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.0 oz. Unit Price § 106

120. Dove Bar Scap 3.15 oz. Unit Price § lOC\

121. Zest Bar Soap 2.2 oz. Unit Price $_ (p9




Three F¥~  Brilliantine 4 oz. Unit prir— |.4]

Dandruff Shampco & Conditioner 14.2 oz. Unit Price 5 qq (,[9.02_\

Lice Control Shampoo 2 oz. Unit Price SMO P)ld

Nair Fair Removal @ cz. Unit Price $ND ?)\d

Speed Stick Agua Sport Anti-Perspirant Gel 3 oz. Unit Price $]~]8 C 9»02-)

Razorless Hair Removing Cream & cz. Unit Price § &Hlp

After Shave Lotion 4 oz. Unit Price $ 1.072-

Baby Lotion 15 oz. Unit Price § '55 [L{ D?.—)

Shaving Gel 3 oz. Clear Tube Unit Price $ 1.00 (701_\

White Hankerchief (157 x 15”) Unit Price § .39

VOE Extrz Body Shampoo 15.0 cz. Unit Price § ‘Oq

Y05 Extra Body Conditioner 15.0 cz. Unit Price $ \Oq

Suave Powder Fresh Deodorant 1.7 oz. Clear Unit Price $ ‘3.6

Hinged Soap Dish Box- Regular Size Unit Price $3\L|

Greaselessz Skin Cream 4.5 oz. Unit Price § \OO

Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Scap 3.6 cz. Unit Price $_}.00

Hair Moisturizer 4 oz. Tube Unit Price § l(pax

FPalim Hair Brush Flexible — Black Unit Price $3a-7

Tampons — Singles !(Regular/Super/Junicr) 40 cf. Box Unit Price $-2.q '

Dispocsable Douche € oz. Unit Price $ } ]2-

White Washcloth (127%127) Unit Price $ .l{p




EXH
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BREAKDOWN
TABULATION OF VENDOR’S
LOW BID PRICES (ONLY)




Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office
“Commissary Supplies”
Bid No. 08-212-06-11-rol

Tabulation: Sheet

Categorized by
Item Number

Description

Keefe Supply Co.

16, Ramen Soups (chili/beef/chicken/shrimp) $0.20
17. Chili Corn Nuts 1.4 0zpk .. .. $0.34
18. Ranch Corn Nuts 1.4 oz pk .~ . - $0.34
20. Salted Peanuts 1.75 oz bag | $0.20
21. Beef Jerky Steak 1 oz. stick $0.70
22. Chunk Light Tuna 4.23 oz. pouch $0.79
23 Refried Beans Re-sealable Pouch 6 oz. $0.79 { B oz.)
25. Jalapeno Cheese Spread 8 oz. Plastic Tub $0.70
26. Jelly (Grape & Strawberty) 12 c:. Strawberry $1.35
Squeeze Bottle Grape $1.17
27. Peanut Butter Squeezers 1.12 oz $0.12
28. Chili No Beans 11.25 oz. Pouch $0.84
29. Chili w/Beans 11.25 oz Pouch $0.84
30. Hot Chili w/Beans 11.25 oz. Pouch $0.84
3L Beef Stew 11.25 oz. Pouch $0.94
32. Roast Beef & Gravy 10 oz, Pouch $1.71
33 Sardines in Hot Tomate Sauce 3.53 oz. $0.70
34. Fish Fillets 3.53 oz. Pouch $1.00
35. BBQ Potato Chips 1.5 oz.bag.... .. .. $0.23
38. Doritos Nacho Cheese 1.5 6z, .. $0.20
39, Tortilla Chips 12 oz. bag $1.00
41. Snack Crackers 12 oz. box $1.27 (16 02)
47. Cinnamon Rolls 4 oz. $0.40
48. Honey Bun 6 oz. pk $0.45
49, Chocolate Cupcakes (2-pk) 4 oz. $0.50
50. Maonpies $0.28
{banana/scrawberry/chocolate) 2.75 oz
51. Coca-Cola Classic 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.80
52. Sprite 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.80
53, Fanta Orange 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.80
54. D1, Pepper 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.85
53. Diet Coke 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.80
56. Instant Coffee 4 oz. Re-sealable $1.85
Clear Pouch
57. Coffee Mug w/Lid 14 oz. $1.66 (22 oz.)
58. e $0.10

Hot Cocoa Mix 1 oz. bag




o~

Hidalgo County Sheriff’'s Offic

“Commissary Supplies”

Bid No. 08-212-06-11-rol

Tabulation Sheet

Categorized by Description Keefe Supply Co.
Item Number
59. Cereal Bowl w/Lid 24 oz. $0.36
60. Ozarka Spring Warer 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.35
64, White Boxer Shorts $2.19 (SM-L)
Sm-6XL $2.29 (XL)
$3.49
(2XL - 6XL)
$3.15 (SM-XL)
65. White Thermal Underwear Set | $3.65 (ZXL-4XL)
Stmall thru 6 x1 e $4.10 (5X1)
| $4.55 (6XL)
66. Men White Crew Neck T-shirts $1.83 (Med-XL)
Medium chru 6xl $2.18 (ZXL-3XL)
$3.10 (4XL-6XL)
$1.62 (2XL)
$1.64 (3XL)
68. Mens/Ladies Crew Socks $0.60
One size fits all
70. White Mens/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes No bid
Sizes 6 thru 13
73. Advil Coated (2 tablet pouch) 30 ct. box $0.39
75. Anti Shank Security Toothbrush & clear $0.05 toothbrush
cap $0.01 cap
76. Anti Shank Security Razor Single Edge $0.20
79. Starlite Mints 3. 75 oz Bag $0.30
82. St. Valentines Card {Eng/Spanish} 6 pk $0.29
83. Happy Easter Card (Eng/Spanish) 6 pk $0.29
84. Happy Mother’s Day Card $0.29
(Eng/Spanish) 6 pk
85, Father’s Day Card (Eng/Spanish} 6 pk $0.29
6. Happy Birthday Card (Eng/Spanish) 6 pk $0.29
87. Thanksgiving Day Card $0.29
{Eng/Spanish) 6 pk -
88. Christmas Card (Eng/Spanish( 6 pk $0.29
89, Oral Pain Relief 0.33 oz tube $0.97
90. Aleohol Free Mouthwash 8 oz, Plastic $0.55
91, Alcohol Free Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic $1.50 (8 oz.)
92. Athletes Foot Créme 0.05 oz. tube No bid
93. Hydrocertisone Cream 1 oz. tube $0.89
04, Chap Suck Lip Balm 15 oz. $1.04
95. Hemeorrhoidal Cintment 2 oz. tube $2.36




P Vst

Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Offic
“Commissary Supplies”
Bid No. 08-212-06-11-rol
Tabulatipn--_ISheet

Categorized by Description Keefe Supply Co.
Item Number
96. Muscle Rub 3 oz. Tube $1.35
97. Medicated Chest Rub 3.53 oz. $0.97

Eye Drops 0.05 cz. $1.65
99,
102. Rolaids Antacid (12 tablets) stick $0.47
103. Acne Gel Medication 1 oz. tube $1.08
105. Legal Gummed Pads 8 ¥4 x 11 $0.42
109. No Clasp Envelope 9"x12" $0.07
113. Sketch Pads 50 sheets No bid
115. 4 2 Flexible Black Ink Pen $0.31
119, Close Up Red Gel Toothpaste 4.0 oz. $1.05
122. Three Flowers Brilliantine 4 oz. $1.41
123. Dandruff ShampoofConditiom_’:r 14. 2 oz. $0.99 (12 oz.)
127. Razorless Hair Removing Creamﬁ ;ﬁz. $2.46
128. After Shave Lotion 4'0z. - ... $1.02
129. Baby Lotion 15 oz $0.33 (4 0z.)
130. Shaving Gel 3 oz, Clear Tube $1.00 (7 0z.)
131. White Kankerchief (15"x15™) $0.49
132, YOS5 Extra Body Shampoo 15.0 oz. $1.09
133. VO3 Extra Body Conditicner 15.0 oz. $1.09
134, Suave Powder Fresh Deodorant 51.25

1.7 oz. Clear
135. Hinged Soap Dish Box Regular Size $0.24
136, Greaseless Skin Cream 4.5 oz, $1.00
138. Hair Moisturizer 4 oz. Tube $1.62
142, White Washcloth (12"x12"™) $0.16
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ACORD. CEKRIIFICAI™ Ul- LIABILIT T INDUIRAN - CERTE-3Y]  os/12/08
PRODUCER N THIS CERTIFICF JUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION
3 ONLY AND CON. .5 NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE

Wells Farge Insurance Serva
of Missouri

1401 8. Brentwood Blvd Sta 625
S+. Louiz MO 63144

HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND OR
ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW.

Phone: 314-918-8000 Fax:314-919-1101 INSURERS AFFORDING COVERAGE . NAIC #
INSURED o INSURERA:  @rout Worthern o, 20303
INgURER 8. Fadaral Ingurance Company 20281
Ifgg:gg Eom; seaL Neework, LLC | INSURERLC: -
inpa aca INSURER D
§09%0.01TPaE8 & R ~ .
INSURER E;
COVERAGES
THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN IESUED YO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHEYANDING
ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITIGN OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DQCUMENT WITH RESPECT T WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE I5SUED OR
MAY PERTAIN, THE INGURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN (5 SUBIECT TO ALL THE TEAMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS DF SUCH
POLICIES AGGREGATE LIITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
NSR DD GY EPFECTIVE | POLICY EXFIRATION -
LTR INSRO TYPE OF INSURANCE POLICY NURBER R Aic MAWDDY). | DATE (MWBBNY LMo
GENBRAL LIABILITY _SACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
AGE TD RENTED
A X, | commERGIaL GENERAL LBty | 7321 -00-90 01/01/08 R1/01/09 | PREMISES (En nccurence) "1 INCLUDED
! _ll CLAMS MADE ; OCCUR MED EXP [anyonaparsory |5 10,000
: [ PERSONAL&ADVINJURY  |51,000,000
[ | GENERAL AGGREGATE | 62,000,000
(GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG 1§ 2, 000,000
—| FOLICY ] e I'x ] LoC
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMBINED SINGLELMY  “ s 1 00 . 600
B| . X]awaure 7321-00-92 01/01/08 | ©01/01/09 | (Easecdn) AR
ALL QWNED AUTOS BODILY INJURY s
SCHEDULED AUTOS {Par persan)
| HIREDAWTOS BODILY INJURY s
| NON-OWNED AUTOS (Par acadent}
N — PROFERTY DAMAGE s
(Prar accidanl)
GARAGE LIABILITY AUTO QNLY - EA ACCIDENT | §
| asev auTo OTHER THAN EAARC S o
AUTO ONLY: GG | 5
_EXCESS/UMBRELLA LIABILITY EACH OCGURRENCE sy _
occur |:| CLAME MARE . ABGREGATE ls
. i _ B .9
| | oepucTeLe L 8
RETENTION % 5
WORKERS COMPENDATION AND X | ro L R
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Seiah
B | aNY AROPRIETORPARTNER/EXECUTIVE 7165-55-50 01/01/08 01 /01 /09 | EL EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
orrucememsn EXCLUDED? E.L. ISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE|$ 1,000,000
a8, $8GcriDE e b e e
IKECI.M. PROVISIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 1 ; 0] ¢]0] ¢ 000
| OTHER
|
| |

DESCRIPTION OP OBERATIONS / WOCATIONS / VEHICLES 7 EXCLUBIONS ADDED BY ENDORSEMENT / SPECIAL PROVIBIONS
Certificate holder shown belew ig ineluded as an Additional Insured as

respects General Liability covaerages shown regarding operations of the named

insurad.
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
HIDALGO | $HOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANGELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATIC
PATE THEREDF, THE I95INNG INSURER WILL ENDEAVOR TO MAlL 30 DAYS WRITTEN
I;Iigalgo Cmm;gm ] 1q NOTIGE TO THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER NAMED TGO THE LEFT, BUT FAILLRE TO DO 50 SHALL
th Floor - in. Bldg BILITY OF A
100 Esst Cane fStreat MPOSE NO OBLIGATION DR LLA NY KIND UPON THE (NSURER, ITS AGENTS OR
Edinburg, TX 78539 REPREBENTATIVES.

A

ACORD 25 (2001/08)

@ ACORD CORPORATION 198




