
HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET
DEPT NAME: COUNTY OF HIDALGO URBAN COUNTY PROGRAM
Bid Opening Date: September 01, 2010 Bid Opening Time: 9:30 am
Description of Bid: TWO(2) Units in the County Wide Area, Along with One (1) Unit in the City of Elsa, One (1) Unit in the City of Mercedes and
One (1) Unit in the city of La Villa
GRANT#: M-09-UC-45-0501

ROLANDO’S GENERAL CONSTRUCTION
. .. .. - ~TOTAI?BASE~ BII~BOND/CASHIER’S.UNITS~ ‘-.~ . ‘. ~

~. CHARGE- - ~CHECK INCLUDED
1 C. LEAL NO BID N/A
2 A. FALCON $48,999.00 CC INCLUDED
3 E. GONZALEZ $39,999.00 CC INCLUDED
4 F.PEREZ NO BID N/A
5 C. GUZMAN $48,999.00 CC INCLUDED

G & G CONTRACTORS
TOTAL BASE BID BOND/CASHIER’SUNITS

.. ~., . : .~ ‘CHARGE~ ~CHECK~INCWDED

1 C. LEAL $41,440.00 BB INCLUDED
2 A. FALCON $49,100.00 BB INCLUDED
3 E. GONZALEZ $41,440.00 BB INCLUDED
4 F. PEREZ $51,760.00 BB INCLUDED
5 C. GUZMAN $49,760.00 BB INCLUDED

QUALITY INVESTMENTS
TOTAL BASE ~ ~BID1Oi~D/~ASHIER’S

... UNITS~ ~ ‘~.

.~ , ~CHARGE ‘~ ..CHECKjINCUUDEDt~4
1 C.LEAL NO BID N/A
2 A. FALCON $53,439.00 CC INCLUDED
3 E. GONZALEZ $42,439.00 CC INCLUDED
4 F.PEREZ NOBID N/A
5 C. GUZMAN NO BID N/A

ARTEX INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS, LLC
E~ ~ • ,.c~.-,’ ~- tb~A~B~E~ ‘BID BOND/CA~’SIiIER~S

t UNITS .~ - ~

.~ ~ ~CHARGE CHECK~INCLUDED
1 C. LEAL NO BID N/A
2 A. FALCON $50,713.00 BB INCLUDED
3 E. GONZALEZ $42,656.00 BB INCLUDED
4 F.PEREZ NO BID N/A
5 C. GUZMAN NO BID N/A

C.R.G. HOMES

~ UNITS’”~’ - ~‘TOT~L~BASE ~‘BID BOND/c~.SHIER’S
.,.. .-~ .. . ~- . -~ CHARGE ~‘ . CHECK.INCLUDED’~:

1 C. LEAL $44,497.00 CC INCLUDED
2 A. FALCON $53,144.00 CC INCLUDED
3 E. GONZALEZ $44,497.00 CC INCLUDED
4 F. PEREZ $55,144.00 CC INCLUDED
5 C. GUZMAN $53,244.00 CC INCLUDED

*WPED AS READ AT BID OPENING, AMOUNTS NOT VERIFIED/CALCULATED


