
URBAN COUNTY PROGRAM
COUNTY OF HIDALGO

Price Quotations
VENDOR #1
Name:__Corky~s Fire Ext. Person Contacted: Sandra Hammer Phone: 956-330-1928

ltem# Quantity Description Amount
1 Maintenance and inspection of five pound fire extinguishers (Unit Price: $4.50) $ 22.50

1 Includes service charges that me be incurred during the inspection, Maintenance such as
but not limited to hydro testing (Unit price per location $13.00 for recharge each and $ 65.00
$20.00 for Hydro-testing each) $100.00

~ 5 Price for Possible replacement per unit (5 pounds) fire extinguisher. $53.00 $265.00

Total Quoted Price: $452.50

VENDOR #2
Name: Flame-Out Fire Extinguisher Person Contacted: James L. Williams Phone: 956-380-2600

ltem# Quantity Description Amount

1 5 Maintenance and inspection of five pound fire extinguishers (Unit Price: $8.00) $ 40.00

1 Includes service charges that me be incurred during the inspection. Maintenance such as
but not limited to hydro testing (Unit price per location $10.00 for recharge each and $ 50.00
$10.00 for Hydro-testing each) $50.00

~ 5 Price for Possible replacement per unit (5 pounds) fire extinguisher. $48.00 $240.00

Total Quoted Price: $380.00

VENDOR #3
Name: Star Buyer & Safety Person Contacted: David Phone: 956-581-6701

ltem# Quantity Description Amount

1 5 Maintenance and inspection of five pound fire extinguishers (Unit Price: $4.50) No bid

1 Includes service charges that me be incurred during the inspection. Maintenance such as
but not limited to hydro testing (Unit price per location $13.00 for recharge each and No Bid
$20.00 for Hydro-testing each)

1 5 Price for Possible replacement per unit (5 pounds) fire extinguisher. $53.00 No Bid

Total Quoted Price: $0.00 NO BID

Recommendation: Requesting that we purchase services from Flame-Out Fire Extinguisher, as they
are the lowest quoted vendor.

Requested by: Nydia VeQa, HR Coordinator 10-18-20 Approved by: _____________

Date Date
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1916 TESORO BLVD., PHARR, TEXAS 78577
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MAtNTENANCES AND INSPECTION OF FIVE
POUND FIRE EXTINGUISHERS. (UNIT PRICE)

INCLUDE ANY SERVICE CHARGES THAT MAY BE
INCURRED DURING THE INSPECTION /
MAINTENANCE SUCH AS BUT NOT LIMITED TO
HYDRO-TESTING. (UNIT PRICE) AT THE
LOCATION.

PRICE FOR POSSIBLE REPLACEMENT PER UNIT;
FIVE POUND (5 Ib.)FIRE EXTINGUISHER.
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I MAINTENANCES AND INSPECTION OF FWE
POUND FIRE EXTINGUISHERS. (UNIT PRICE) 5

2 INCLUDE ANY SERVICE CHARGES THAT MAY BE
INCUR~D DURING THE INSPEcTION /
MAINTENANCE SUCH AS BUT NOT LIMITED TO

SHYDRO-TESTING. (UNJT PRiCE) AT THE
LOCATION.

3 PRICE FOR POSS4BL.E REPLACEMENT PER UNIT; —
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