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BRAND QTY.  per CASE PRICE PER CASE UNIT PRICE BRAND Qty per CASE PRICE PER CASE UNIT PRICE BRAND Qty per 
CASE

PRICE PER 
CASE

UNIT PRICE

1 3M green 6x9 scouring pads  20/box (96HP) or equal 3m 20 $9.63 $0.800 Sysco-1376805 1/20 ct $8.29 $0.415 
2 3M griddle screens  10 per pack (200) or equal 3m 200 $61.88 $0.310 Sysco-5793971 10/20 ct $45.05 $0.22525 
3 Air Freshener- Aerosol Asst Scents Spartan 12-18 oz $28.10 $2.340 Sysco-3530797 1/6 ct $36.07 $6.012 
4 Air Freshener -Time Mist - Asst. Scents 6.6 oz Vectair 12-6 oz $37.12 $3.090 Sysco-5453881 1 ea $20.89 $20.89 

5 Americo 20" beige ultra-high speed burnishing pads  5/box (20MUHSTBP) or equal Americo 5 $13.46 $2.690 Con Mfg.-6707012 5/20 in $28.57 $5.71 

6 Ant &Roach Spray odorless Carroll 12-15 oz $54.76 $4.560 Sysco-4440343 6/15 oz $41.57 $6.93 
7 Ant &Roach Spray odorless to contain deltametrin Carroll 12-15 oz $54.76 $4.560 
8 Baggies- 1/4 Size Slider Bag Ziploc Snack Bags(Hefty) or equal Reynolds 600 $14.45 $0.024 

9 Baggies- 4"x4" Econo Zip (Ziploc Regular Sandwich Bags) or equal Huckster 1000 $8.63 $0.009 Handgard-5161591 2,000ea $29.10 $0.01455 

10 Baggies- Ziploc 16x11 Gallon Size (Hefty) or equal Reynolds 250 $19.97 $0.080 El Kay-0770701 250 ea $24.12 $0.10 
11 Baggies- Ziploc 7x8 Quart Size(Hefty) or equal Reynolds 500 $24.77 $0.050 Hardgard-7349095 500/748 $31.27 $0.06 

12 Baggies-Freezer Bags 10x11-200 Ct/ s (Quick Seal) or  equal Reynolds 200 $22.67 $0.113 Reynolds-7591886 200/1 gal $42.19 $0.21 

14 Bleach -Disinfectant Cleaner Dry Air- Hospital Spantan 12-18 oz $30.61 $2.550 
15 Bleach- Pure Bright Disinfection 6/cs (6BLCH) or equal Pure bright 6 $9.14 $1.52 Sys Re-6366348 6/96 ox $10.56 $1.76 
16 Body Shampoo- per Gallon spartan 4 gals. $26.68 $6.670 
17 Body Towels Standard Size
18 Bowl Cleaner – Liquid( Non Acid) EPA Registered Spartan 12-32 oz $16.12 $1.340 Keystone-7637430 6/32 oz $26.54 $4.42 
19 Bowl Cleaner- Liquid 23%-26% HIC EPA Registered Spartan 12-32 oz $15.35 $1.280 
20 Bowl Mops (Rayon)  or equal Continental 1 $0.60 $0.600 
21 Brooms –(Plastic Angel)  or equal Unisan 12 $71.00 $5.920 Sysco-1341197 1/54 in $13.50 $13.50 
22 Brooms- Janitorial Straw Unisan 12 $69.45 $5.790 Sysco-4194908 6/32 cb $38.49 $6.42 
23 Brooms -Maids - Straw (Waco) or equal Unisan 12 $60.75 $5.060 Sysco-4180642 6 ea $17.34 $2.89 
24 Buffing Pads 17" White Americo 5 $10.21 $2.040 
25 Buffing Pads 20" White Americo 5 $13.25 $2.650 
26 Butcher Paper 24" B&H Bag 1 $22.49 $22.49 Duro-4047155 1/24 in. $30.59 $30.59 
27 Carpet  Shampoo- Liquid Ammonia Free Carroll 4 $34.92 $8.730 

28 Carpet Powder & Deodorizer Big D 
Industries 12-16 oz $29.13 $2.430 

29 Carpet Shampoo Liquid Carroll 4 $34.92 $8.730 
30 Carpet Spot Remover 32 oz. Spartan 12-32 oz $17.02 $1.420 

31 Carroll heavy duty chemical deodorant  4/1gallons (HDCD1) or equal Carroll 4 $37.84 $9.460 

32 Cleaner -Diversey -general purpose  4/1gallons (GPFOR14) or equal Diversey 4 $32.52 $8.130 

33 Cleaner- Oven 24oz  foam cleaner Carroll 12-19 oz $37.90 $3.160 Easyoff-4127627 6/24 oz $27.79 $4.63 
34 Cleaner -Stainless Steel- water less based Spartan 12-18 oz $37.82 $3.150 Keystone-8509370 6/17 oz $24.46 $4.08 
35 Continental 18" rubber floor squeegees (1800) or equal Continental 1 $11.38 $11.380 
36 Continental 24" rubber floor squeegee (2400) or equal Continental 1 $13.33 $13.330 
37 Dart Vented Lid-12J12-or equal Dart 1,000 $12.49 $0.012 Dart-4097473 10/100 ct $10.77 $0.01 
38 Dart Vented Lid-8J8 or equal Dart 1,000 $9.86 $0.010 Dart-4001178 10/100 ct $8.49 $0.01 
39 Degreaser -55 Gallon Spartan 1-55 gal $219.07 $219.070 
40 Deodorant-hygiene

41 Detergent-Colgate Palmolive  Dishwashing-12/32  PAL1232 or equal Palmolive 12-32 oz $34.05 $2.840 Pamolive 4467353 4/1 gal $41.15 $10.29 

42 Dishwashing Capsules- US Chemical- 6/8 lb  (failsafe) or equal U.S. Chemical 6-8 lb $87.46 $14.580 
43 Dishwashing Liquid- 32 oz - (Dawn) or equal Palmolive 12-32 oz $34.05 $2.840 Dawn-648383 8/38 oz $30.66 $3.83 
44 Dishwashing Liquid- 42 oz (Dawn) or equal Palmolive 12-32 oz $34.05 $2.840 
45 Disinfectant & Deodorizer Cleaner Aerosol Spartan 12-18 oz $30.61 $2.550 
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Berry plastics 25 $16.85 $0.6700 100 $58.00 $0.06 13 Bio-Hazard Bag Red 40 X 48 3 mil---- ALREADY IN CONTRACT WITH 
OTHER PROJECT
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46 Disinfectant cleaner - Carroll clear pine mop 4/1gallon (Pine1) or equal Carroll 4 gals $30.84 $7.710 

47 Disinfectant cleaner -Carroll clear lemon mop 4/1gallons (Lemon1) or equal Carroll 4 gals $35.00 $8.750 

48 Disinfectant Deodorant Spray-  Hospital (Tuberculicidal Rated) Spartan 12-18 oz $30.61 $2.840 Keystone-7637352 6/32 oz $50.78 $8.46 

49 Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Aerosol- Hospital (1 Minute Kill time) Spartan 12-18 oz $30.61 $2.840 Sysco-4308417 6/15 oz $27.40 $4.57 

50 Disinfectant Deodorant Spray- Hospital Spartan 12-18 oz $30.61 $2.840 
51 Disinfectant Foam Cleaner- Hospital Spartan 12-18 oz $25.40 $2.130 Keystone-8577217 6/19 oz $27.74 $4.62 

52 Disinfectant/ Deodorant spray- Diversey endbac II 12/15oz (EndBacII) or equal Diversey 12-15 oz $51.23 $4.270 

53 Disinfecting  wipes- (Lysol )or equal Clorox 12-35 $36.29 $3.020 
54 Dispenser-  Air Freshener Time Mist Vectair 1 $24.00 $24.000 Sysco-5453881 1 ea $20.89 $20.89 

55 Dispenser -Roll  Paper Towel- Lever or Crank(Metal or Plastic) Georgia Pacific 1 $15.24 $15.240 Sysco-5854336 1 ea 25.24 $25.24 

56 Dispensers - Liquid Hand Soap (Bulk Soap) Spartan 1 $16.98 $16.980 

57 Dispensers -Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Metal) Georgia Pacific 1 $24.39 $24.390 

58 Dispensers -Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Plastic) Kimberly Clarke 1 $30.00 $30.000 Tork-8010377 1 ea. $11.54 $11.54 

59 Dust Cloths (Disposable) Yw Georgia Pacific 200 $54.70 $0.027 

60 Dust Cloths- Non Disposable M&D 12 $19.00 $1.580 
61 Dust Mop 24" x 3- Disposable Sysco-6052211 1 set $29.85 $29.85 
62 Dust Mop 24" x 5- Non Disposable Rubbermaid 1 $12.22 $12.220 
63 Dust Mop 24"x 3 Non Disposable
64 Dust Mop 24"x 5 Disposable Wilen 1 $5.06 $5.060 
65 Dust Mop Frames 24" x 5 Wilen 1 $2.03 $2.030 
66 Dust Mop Handles- Swivel Snap On Wilen 1 $4.97 $4.970 
67 Dust Mop Treatment (Aerosol) equal or better Spartan 12-16 oz $32.32 $2.690 
68 Dust Mop Treatment RTU Spartan 12-32 oz $19.67 $1.640 
69 Dust Pan Metal- Lobby or equal Continental 1 $24.38 $24.380 Con Mfg.-5653860 1/16” $10.09 $10.09 
70 Dust Pan Plastic- Lobby  or equal Rubbermaid 1 $10.79 $10.790 Sysco-7378989 1 ea $11.95 $11.95 
71 Enzyme Deodorizers- per Gallon - Liquid Spartan 4 gals $30.33 $7.580 

72 Facial Tissue (Georgia Pacific)equal or better Georgia Pacific 30-100 $16.23 $0.540 Georgia Pacifc-
8066090 36/9 ct $54.65 $1.52 

73 Feather Duster Extensions 12 Ft. Unger 13 ft $36.44 $36.440 
74 Feather Duster Extensions 8 Ft. Unger 8 ft $27.21 $27.210 
75 Feather Dusters 21 Inch Ostrich or Equal Lambkin 1 $5.13 $5.130 
76 Feather Dusters 26 Inch  Ostrich or Equal Lambkin 1 $7.80 $7.800 
77 Film Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 2000 Ft  (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 18+2000’ $16.13 $16.130 Sysco-7435266 1/18” $17.96 $17.96 
78 Film Wrap 18"x 3000- Heavy Duty- (Reynolds)915 or equal Reynolds 18+3000’ $26.21 $26.210 Sysco-7435290 1/18” $27.79 $27.79 
79 Filters Windsor exhaust for Sensor XP12 vacuum cleaner  (5143EF) or equal Karcher 1 $10.50 $10.500 

80 Filters- Windsor micro hygiene for Sensor XP12 vacuum cleaner (5301ER) or equal Karcher 1 $25.00 $25.000 

81 Floor Cleaner -Diversey citrus stride neutral 5 gallon box (Stride5) or equal Diversey 1 $19.90 $19.900 

82 Floor Cleaner- Diversey floral fragrance neutral  4/1gallons (FLStride14) or equal Diversey 4 gals $19.04 $4.760 

83 Floor finish/wax -Diversey Ventra 5 gallon box (Vectra5) or equal Diversey 5 gal $58.65 $58.650 

84 Foil Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 500 Ft-Reynolds-624 or equal Reynolds 18’x500’ $30.50 $30.500 SysRel-8458226 4/1gal $16.83 $4.21 
85 Foil Wrap- Potato  (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 6-500 $47.70 $0.0159 Duro-6727242 6/500ct $39.15 $6.53 
86 Furniture Polish- Aerosol Spartan 12-18 oz $27.23 $2.270 Sysco-4176459 6/18oz $26.74 $4.46 
87 Glass Cleaner- Liquid Concentrate (spartan) or equal Spartan 4 gals $29.08 $7.270 Sys Rel-8458226 4/1gal $16.83 $4.21 
88 Glass Cleaner RTU- 32 oz.(Spartan) or equal Spartan 12-32 oz $18.47 $1.540 Keystone-7682790 4/32 oz $17.55 $4.39 
89 Gloves -Food Service - Large Clear (Brand Name) Tidy 1,000 $17.65 $0.01765 Sys c/s-8346538 10/100 ct $20.02 $0.02 
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90 Gloves- Food Service - Medium Clear (Brand Name) Tidy 1,000 $17.65 $0.01765 Sys c/s-8348245 10/100 ct $19.99 $0.02 
91 Gloves -Latex - Small Disposable  (Ansell or Equal) Ansell 1,000 $40.12 $0.04012 Sys c/s-8347692 4/100ct $34.78 $0.09 
92 Gloves- Latex- Large Disposable Ansell 1,000 $40.12 $0.04012 Sys c/s-8338501 4/100ct $24.16 $0.06 
93 Gloves- Latex- Large Non- Disposable Yw. (Ansell or Equal) Ansell 12 $7.36 $0.61 

94 Gloves- Latex –Medium - Non Disposable Yw (Ansell/ Equal) Ansell 12 $7.36 $0.61 Best Value-47446848 36/pr $87.57 $1.04 

95 Gloves- Latex -Medium -Disposable  (Ansell or Equal) Ansell 1,000 $40.12 $0.04012 
96 Gloves -Latex Small Non-Disposable Yellow (Ansell or Equal) Ansell 12 $7.36 $0.610 Best Value-4744659 36/ pr $37.57 $1.04 

97 Gloves- Safety (nitrile) SFZGNPRXL1M-or equal Ansell 1,000 $59.15 $0.05915 Food Handler-8144701 4/100 ea $43.65 $0.11 

98 Hand Cleaner- Waterless Gojo 6-4.5 lb $114.66 $19.110 
99 Hand Towels- Standard Size

100 Hanging Toilet Bowl Blocks Fresh Products 12 $7.54 $0.630 

101 Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent  (for Commercial Laundry System) Spartan 5 gal $72.00 $72.000 Sys Rel-8412142 1/25lb $27.22 $1.09 

102 Janitor cart with yellow vinyl bag- Rubbermaid (6173) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $110.90 $110.900 

103 Laced Dollies (different sizes and types) Sys c/s-5" 2253276 1/1000 ct $8.13 see 
attached 

104 Lice Killer Aerosol
105 Menu Tissue 12x12 Georgia Pacific 10,000 $91.53 $0.009153 Sysco-6829477 1/3000ct $20.77 $0.0069 

106 Mop Bucket Combo Std Size (Rubbermaid 7580) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $51.80 $51.80 Rubbermaid-4250478 1/18 qt $13.85 $13.85 

107 Mop Handles Fiber Glass 54" Jr. Etc-  or equal Impact 1 $15.43 $15.43 Sysco-6760623 1/54” $25.83 $25.83 
108 Mop Handles Wood 54" Junior (QC54) Unisan $5.30 $5.30 
109 Mop Head Cotton- Size 16 oz Wilen 12 $26.22 $2.19 
110 Mop Head Cotton- Size 24 oz. Wilen 12 $39.00 $3.25 Sysco-4179339 1/3 ct $14.33 $4.78 
111 Mop Head Cotton- Size 32 oz. Wilen 12 $51.90 $4.33 Sysco-4179347 1/3 ct $18.85 $6.28 
112 Mop Head Rayon- Size 16 oz. Wilen 12 $35.85 $2.99 
113 Mop head Rayon- Size 24 oz. Wilen 12 $53.85 $4.49 
114 Mop Head Rayon-Size 32 oz Wilen 12 $70.20 $5.85 
115 Mosquito Repellent Lotion
116 Mosquito Repellent Spray Diversey Off 12 $65.72 $5.4800 

117 Napkins- 2 Ply Quarter Fold (Georgia Pacific) or equal SCA 6,000 $35.24 $0.00587 Georgia Pacifc-
8366405 8/350ct $64.78 $8.10 

118 Odor Eliminator- Non Aerosol Spantan 12-32 oz $19.41 $1.6200 
119 Paper Bags #10 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $10.36 $0.02072 Sysco-5113428 2/500ct $19.22 $0.01922 
120 Paper Bags #4 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $6.34 $0.01268 Sysco-5113394 4/500ct $25.73 $0.012865 
121 Paper Bags #8 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $11.46 $0.023 Sysco-5113410 2/500ct $18.14 $0.01814 
122 Paper Bags 1/6 BBL Brown 1657 (Duro )or equal Duro 500 $29.60 $0.0592 
123 Paper Bags-6lb Brown 6BG (Duro)500/pack or equal Duro 500 $8.16 $0.01632 Sysco-5113402 2/500ct $16.02 $0.01602 
124 Paper Cups-Portion-10oz  (Solo)equal or better

125 Paper Roll Towels- Kitchen (Scott- 11s9)  or equal Georgia Pacific 30-85 (2250 
sheets)

$22.00 $0.7300 Sys c/s-4661088 12/210 (2520 
sheets)

$25.47 $2.12 Kruger 30 rolls $22.60 $22.60 

126 Paper Towels- Brown Rolls -Standard Size (Georgia Pacific)  or equal SCA 12-350’ $17.06 $1.420 Sysco-4661245 12/210 
sheets $30.02 $2.50 Putney 12 rolls $17.60 $17.60 

127 Paper Towels Multi Folds (Georgia Pacific)or equal Georgia Pacific 4,000 $15.29 $0.003820 Sys/GP 3864642 16/150ct $30.31 $1.89 Putney 4,000 $17.10 $17.10 

128 Paper Towels Multi Folds White Bleached 9.25 x 9.5 Georgia Pacific 4,000 $18.35 $0.00458 FT Sames/GP 6/320 ct $43.47 $7.25 Putney 4,000 $17.99 $17.99 

129 Paper Towels, (GEP 89460) En-motion high capacity –white 10 x 800 or equal Georgia Pacific 6-800’ $52.94 $8.82 GP-9627761 6/800 ft $59.66 $9.94 Vondrehie 10x800 $36.70 $36.70 

130 Premium Foam Antibacterial Soap Refill (GOJ536202)or  equal Gojo 2 $46.05 $23.03 
131 Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill-GOJ545604- or equal Gojo 4 $60.72 $15.18 
132 Razors- Double Edged

133 Royal griddle bricks for cleaning grills  12/box (Gbrick) or equal Royal 12 $9.22 $1.6000 Sysco-5793963 12/8x4 $18.95 $1.57916 
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Sys CLS- 2253276 (5 in.) 1/1000 ct  $8.13 see attached 
Sys CLS- 2253771 (8 in.) 1/1000 ct $16.96 
Sys CLS- 2254043 (10 in) 1/1000 ct $25.77 
Sys CLS- 2254464 (12 in) 1/1000 ct $31.45
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135 Sanitary Napkins Maxi No. 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc or equal.) Hospeco 250 $29.07 $0.1163 Rochester #4 $33.99 $33.99 

136 Sanitary Napkins- Panty Liners

137 Sanitary Napkins Super No. 4  folded- (Stay free, Rochester, etc or equal Hospeco 250 $29.07 $0.11628 Rochester #4 $37.60 $37.60 

138 Sanitary Napkins- Thin No. 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc or equal Hospeco 250 $29.07 $0.11628 Rochester #4 $38.60 $38.60 

139 Scouring Sponges Yw/ Green Standard Size 3M/ Eq 3m 20 $34.00 $1.700 Sysco-1376805 1/20 ct $8.29 $0.4145 
140 Scrubbing Cleansers- 21 oz (Comet) or  equal Colgate 24-21 oz $22.39 $0.930 Comet-8435178 24/21 oz $28.20 $1.18 
141 Shaving Cream

142 Soap-  Liquid Hand Antibacterial- per gallon (pearl hand cleaner) or equal Spartan 4 gals $26.68 $6.670 Ecolab-5156740 4/ 1 gal $144.67 $36.17 

143 Soap- Anti Bacterial-  Bar  3.5 oz (1,000  per case)
144 Soap- Bar -75 oz - 1,000 per case Cashmiere 1,000 $67.55 $0.068 

145 Soap- Hand - Liquid- ( Bag In Box)  Kim Care 
(antibacterial) 12-800 ml $31.73 $2.64 Sysco-7990278 6/ 800 ml $38.03 $6.34 

146 Spartan 15% orange tough cleaner/degreaser  12/32oz (OT15QT) or equal Spartan 12-32 oz $29.92 $2.49 Ecolab-2977221 6/32 oz. $39.95 $6.66 

147 Spartan antiseptic/antibacterial hand soap  4/1gallons (AntiHsoap1) or equal Spartan 4 gals $31.55 $7.89 

148 Spartan bounce back floor finish restorer  4/1gallons (Bounce1) or equal Spartan 4 gals $40.37 $10.090 

149 Spartan Foamy Q&A phosphoric acid shower cleaner  12/32oz (Foamy RTU) or equal Spartan 12-32 oz $25.33 $2.11 

150 Spartan fresh scent deodorant spray  12/18oz (AirfreshAER) or equal Spartan 12-18 oz $27.23 $2.27 

151 Spartan sanitize quart food service sanitizer  12/32oz (SRTU) or equal Spartan 12-32 oz $17.55 $1.46 Keyslone-7808482 6/32 oz. $22.27 $3.71 

152 Spray Bottles- 24 oz empty bottle (bottle24) or equal Contico 1 $0.50 $0.50 
153 Spray Bottles -32 oz. empty bottle (bottleqt) or equal Contico 1 $0.40 $0.40 
154 Sprayer-(TRIGGER ONLY) red & white (trigqt) or equal Contico 1 $0.35 $0.35 
155 Stripping Pads 17" Black Americo 5 $10.56 $2.11 
156 Stripping Pads 20" Black Americo 5 $13.71 $2.740 
157 Styrofoam Bowl- 6 oz  1,000/case (equal or better)  Dart (6B12) 1,000 $24.84 $0.025 Dart-6526412 20/50 ct $23.19 $0.02319 

158 Styrofoam Bowls 12 oz  (Pacific 1-0012) equal or better Dispozo 1,000 $22.34 $0.02234 Dart-4106530 1000/12 oz. $31.41 $0.03141 

159 Styrofoam Cup 8 Oz.  (8J8) or equal Dart 1,000 $16.05 $0.016 Sysco-4088829 40/25 ct $14.30 $0.0143 
160 Styrofoam Cups 4 oz (UJ4)or equal Dart 1,000 $14.90 $0.015 ConverMex-8717015 1000/4 oz. $12.00 $0.012 
161 Styrofoam Plates 6" Laminated Dispozo 1,000 $20.45 $0.02045 Sys-c/s 5318928 8/125 ct $22.23 $0.0223 
162 Styrofoam Plates 6" Unlaminated Dispozo 1,000 $20.45 $0.020 Sys Rel-8615753 8/125 ct $14.60 $0.0146 
163 Styrofoam Plates 9" Divided  (Mobil TJ 1-0011) or equal Pactiv 500 $20.22 $0.040 Sys Rel-5274840 4/125 ct $14.54 $0.02908 
164 Styrofoam Plates 9" Laminated Dispozo 500 $23.40 $0.047 Sys c/s-5318977 4/125 ct $22.07 $0.04414 
165 Styrofoam Plates 9" Unlaminated Pactiv 500 $20.22 $0.040 Sys Rel-5274832 4/125 ct $14.54 $0.02908 

166 Styrofoam Tray Hinge 9x9x3 three compartment with Lid (Pactiv YTD19903) 150/cs or equal Pactiv 150 $14.94 $0.100 

167 Toilet Brushes- (Standard Size) Plastic Rubbermaid 1 $1.80 $1.800 

168 Toilet Brushes-rubbermaid hard bristle bowl brush (6310) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $1.80 $1.800 

169 Toilet Dispensers Universal  (12" Jumbo Toilet Tissue) Georgia Pacific 1 $50.73 $50.73 Universal 1 $39.99 $39.99 

170 Toilet Seat Covers Hospeco 2,500 $23.73 $0.00949 Hospital Specialty-
5651486 4/250 ct $18.97 $0.01897 Rochester 500 $27.60 $27.60 

171 Toilet Tissue (12/1000' Jr. Jumbo) (Georgia Pacific) or equal SCA 12-1000’ $25.88 $2.16 Sys c/s- 3860541 12/2000 ft $54.12 $4.51 Atlas 12 $23.70 $23.70 

172 Toilet Tissue 2 Ply Small Short Sheet  (Georgia Pacific )or equal Georgia Pacific 80-550 $34.23 $0.4278 FT James-0122945 80/450 
sheet $52.20 $0.6525 Atlas 96 $39.66 $39.66 

173 Toilet Tissue( 6/ Jumbo 2000 ft) (Georgia Pacific)or equal SCA 6-2000’ $29.37 $4.900 Atlas 6 $24.10 $24.10 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

2000/6.547 $41.29 $0.02065 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

Sysco-4022307134 Saddle Bag (SB8.5 CLR 6.5 x 7)-or equal Handi band 2,000 $43.28 $0.0216 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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174 Toothbrush Firm- Specify Size
175 Toothbrush Medium Specify Size
176 Toothbrush Soft Specify Size
177 Toothpaste Std Size, Specify Size
178 Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size

180 Trash Cans & Lids 16 Gallon Rubbermaid 1 $40.00 $40.00 

181 Trash Cans & Lids- 32 Gallon (Rubbermaid ) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $29.10 $29.10 Rubbermaid Each $66.10 $66.10 

182 Trash Cans- 10 Gallon Rubbermaid 1 $7.30 $7.30 

188 Urinal Block w/ Screens Fresh Products 12 $18.87 $1.5700 

189 Urinal Blocks (Blocks Only) Fresh Products 12 $4.48 $0.3700 Sysco-5366885 1/12 ct $22.86 $1.91 

190 Urinal Deodorant Screens- Screens Only Spartan 12 $8.74 $0.7300 

191 Utensils Forks -Plastic 2,000 Ct  (James River Wn F2P) or equal Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.00908 

192 Utensils Forks -Plastic -Dispozo- medium -1,000/cs (WMF) or equal Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.00908 Sys Rel-7970389 1000 ct $11.04 $0.01 

193 Utensils- Forks- Plastic -Medium Weight White 1,000 Ct  (Solo or Equal) Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.00908 I Pack-5810342 1,000 ct $8.00 $0.0080 

194 Utensils Forks-Clear - (1,000 Ct.) Sys c/s-7947327 1000 ct $25.56 $0.0256 
195 Utensils Spoons -Plastic (Solo) or equal Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.009 I Pack-5810359 1000 ct $7.95 $0.00795 
196 Utensils Spoons -Plastic 1,000 Ct  (Solo) or equal Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.009 

197 Utensils Spoons -Plastic –Dispozo medium WMS 1,000/cs or equal Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.009 

198 Utensils -Spoons -Plastic -Medium Weight White (1,000 Ct) Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.009 I Pack-5840359 1000 ct $8.77 $0.00877 

199 Utensils-Party Packs (Spoons, Forks, Knife, Napkin, Salt & Pepper) Dispozo 1,000 $9.08 $0.009 I Pack-7552914 250 ea $15.48 $0.06 

200 Vacuum bags-Windsor s for Sensor XP12 vacuum cleaner  10 pack -(SVB) or equal Karcher 10 $19.64 $1.960 

201 Wasp/ Hornet Spray Spartan 12-17 oz $37.12 $3.090 
202 Wasp/ Hornet Spray - 20 Ft Stream Spartan 12-17 oz $37.12 $3.090 

203 Wax Stripper Floor Finish Liquid- High Speed (vectea) (Johnson & Johnson) or equal Spartan 4 gals $35.87 $8.970 

204 Weed Killer (Round up) or equal 
205 Weed Killer 55 Gallon Concentrated- Specify Dilution

206 Wipers -Workhorse -Rags-(Kimberly Clark) or  equal Kimberley 
Clarke 912 $46.10 $0.051 

$14.30 $14.30 

$0.20 Central Poly 250 $14.20 $14.20 

Central Poly 1,000

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Sysco-33 gal.-4046843  200 ct $33.85 $0.17 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$17.80 

Central Poly 1,000 $15.90 1000 $22.73 $0.0227 NO BID

200 $17.40 

186 Trash Liners-Large Trash Can 16 MIC 33 Gallon 33x40 High Density Can Liners 250 $15.96 $0.0638 

185

Rhino

Sysco-45 gal-5871736

Trash Liners-Large Trash Can 13 MIC 30x37 High Density Can Liners Rhino 500 $20.45 $0.0409 

Pitt Plastic184 Trash liners-- Pitt Plastics 23x33 12-16 gallon black 1000/cs (32BL) or equal

Trash Liners- 45 Gallon- X Large- 40x48 16 MIC High Density Can Liner183 Rhino

NO BID

250 $22.52 $0.0900 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$0.20316 

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

Sysco-30 gal.-4047031 150 ct $30.21 

$15.90 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

250 ct $50.79 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

$17.40 

Central Poly 500 $17.80 

Central Poly

179

187 Trash Liners-Tall Trash Can 8 MIC 24x33 High Density Can Liners Rhino 1,000 $19.26 $0.0193 

NO BID

NO BID NO BIDTrash Can 55 Gallon- XX Large- 38x58 1.5 MIL Berry Plastics 100 $19.50 $0.1950 
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207 Wipers-Kimberly Clark 15x16.5 white - 300/cs  (K41100) or equal Kimberley 
Clarke 300 $44.87 $0.150 Chix-4406096 150 ea. $36.78 $0.25 NO BID
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