
HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG 
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS 

RFB-RFP-RFQ 

BID OPENING DATE:  February 9, 2011                   BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M. 
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:  HIDALGO COUNTY PCTS’ 1 & 3 –ROADWAY 
LIGHT FIXTURES MANTENANCE. 
BID NO.: 2011-017-02-09CGA                                                                         

NAME OF VENDOR: 
COMPANY/FIRM 

 

BID 
REQUEST 

*VIA 

SIGNATURE (IF 
APPLICABLE) 

OR INITIALS OF STAFF 
ADDRESSING MAIL OUT DATE 

PHYSICAL ADDRESS, 
PHONE No., FAX No. and E-

MAIL ADDRESS 

 

Jas Electric Inc. 
David Casarez 
Nyrs1018@yahoo.com 
 
 
 

Email CGA 

Via email 

 

 1/29/11 
 

1943 Portland  
McAllen, Tx   
(956) 287-3233 
 
 

Texas Diamond Construction 
Frank Nava 
Lgonzales10@vanguardeng.com 
 
 

Email CGA 

Via email 

 

1/29/11 
4019 Exp 83 
Weslaco Tx  78596 
(956) 514-5086 

Austin Traffic Signal 
Steve Rutledge  

stever@atscc.com 

Email CGA 

Via email 

 

1/29/11 
2431 FM 493 
Donna Tx  78543 
(956) 239-1615 / (956)461-2452 

Lumatec Lighting Service 
Victor Rios 
Lumateclighting2000@yahoo.com 

 

email 
CGA 

Via email 

 

1/29/11 
PO BOX 2225 
McAllen Tx  78502 
(956) 664-1854 

EFS Industries 
Eddie Fuentes 

Eddie4999@yahoo.com 

Email 
CGA 

Via email 

 

1/29/11 
406 E. 30th 
Mission Tx  78572 
(956) 463-5708 

James L. Bantz, III 

James.bantz@metroelectric-rgv-com 
Email CGA 

  

 

1/29/11 
(956) 686-2323 Ext. 120 
(956) 686-2406 fax 

Asset Lighting & Electric, Inc. 
assetlighting@verizon.net 
 

Email CGA 

  

 

1/29/11 
PH:   732-942-7738 
Fax:  732-942-4671 

 
D&G Energy Corp 
Leo Garcia 
denergycorp@att.net  

 

Email CGA 

  

 

1-25-11 
Ph 956-686-6040 
Fax: 956-686-2405 

SOL Technologies, LLC 
Israel Ortiz 
iortiz@soltechnologiesllc.com 

 

Email CGA 

  

 

1-25-11 
Ph: 956-975-2510 
Fax: 956-447-8019 

Maxine P. Vieyra 
Mp_vieyar316@hotmail.com 

 

Email CGA 

  

  

 

1-31-11 
Ph: 956-624-3701 
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 HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
 BID TABULATION SHEET 
 

  
DEPARTMENT NAME:  HIDALGO COUNTY PRECINCT’S 1 & 3 
 
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 9, 2011 

 
BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

 
DESCRIPTION OF BID: ROADWAY LIGHT FIXTURES MAINTENANCE 
 
BID NO: 2011-017-02-09-CGA 

 
 

BID # 
RFB# 

 
NAME OF COMPANY 

 
AKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT 

 
 

 
#1   

  
Lumatech √ 

 
#2 

   
 

 
  
 

 
#3 

   
 

  
 

 
#4  

 
  
 

#5  

 
  
 

 
#6 
   
 
#7 
   
 
#8 
   
 
#9 
   
 
#10 
   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



HIDALGO COUNTY 
PRECINCT NO’s. 1 & 3 

ROADWAY LIGHT FIXTURES MAINTENANCE 
 

RFB NO. 2011-017-02-09-CGA 
 

TABULATION SHEET 
Item # QTY.  

DESCRIPTION 
 

Unit Cost 
1 1 Lane closure $5,000.00 
2 1 Remove and replace luminaire fixtures $   425.00 
3 1 Replace wire and fuses $   460.00 
4 1 Remove and replace photo calls $     95.00 
5 1 Remove and replace lamps $   125.00 
6 1 Remove and replace ballasts $   325.00 
  Reset up to 50’ pole (includes but not limited to 

resetting/replacement of:  pole, mast arm, luminaires with the 
reuse of existing concrete base and anchor bolts) 
 
Total labor/materials/equipment per pole 

 
 
 
 

$5,000.00 
  Re-lamp poles (lighting standards up to 50’ foot poles) includes 

work necessary to make light fixtures function correctly.  
 
Total Labor, Materials and Equipment per pole. 

 
 
 

$  150.00 
  Trencher and operator:  to include trenching and cable 

replacement per foot, proper backfill and compaction depth of 
12” below grade.   
Common: (per foot)…………………………………………... 
Rocky:      (per foot)………………………………………….. 

 
 
 

$2.50 
$3.25 

    
Item Summary of Labor and Equipment Classifications Hourly Rates 
A Foreman $ 45.00 
B Electrician $ 30.00 
C Operator $ 35.00 
D Ground Men/Labor $ 17.50 
E 12 ton 56” JLG Crane $150.00 
F 4 ton 46’ Nat’l Crane with bucket $125.00 
G Altec AM 660 bucket 40’ $100.00 
H Hi ranger  TDI 65 55’ $125.00 
I 30 HP 360 case trencher/backhoe $120.00 
J 6010 case directional drill up to 4” inch ---No Bid--- 
K 6010 case directional drill up to 8” inch ---No Bid--- 
L Water truck with mud system ---No Bid--- 
M Dump truck $ 75.00 
N 1 ton Pick- up with tools $ 50.00 
O Generator $100.00 
P Compressor $ 95.00 
Q Digger Derrick $150.0 
R Vacuum excavator ---No Bid--- 
 


