Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

DATRE: February 08, 2011

TO: Hon. Jecl Quintanilla, Commissioner Han. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 1 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3
Atin: Mr. Eddy Gonzalez, Exec. Asst. of Community Affairs  Atto: Mr. Saul Ramirez, Field Operations Foreman
TC: Hon. Hector Palacios, Commissioner Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4
Autn: Mr. Ricardo Cyellar, Field Operations Fereman Atin: Mr. Marco Lopez, Chief Administrator
From: Samdy Suarem’:, Luyer L

Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.
RE: BIDAWARDR ATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2011-0G27-81-12-SGS-Hidalge County- “TRAFFIC RCAD SIGNS AND MISC.
EQUIPMENT" (All Funding Sources, Programs and Entities)"'

We have recejved three {3) responses to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the
tabulation sheet along with copies of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner”s Count Meeting; therefore, we need

“your response no later than Tuesddy, February I5. 2011 & 2:00 p.n. (o be'able to present 10 Commissiofer’s

Court on Februvary 22, 2011. Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below
and 1eply o the Purchasing Depurtment. via  fax to  (956).318.2629 or via _emnail

sandy.snarez@co hidalpo.Coys,

Should yon have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate (o call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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Please include the budget account number(s) for the above reference project.
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& e, 2812 S. Business Highway 281
H 3 New Administration Building
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=S MEMORANDUM

DATE: February 08, 2011

TO: Hom. Joel Quintanilla, Commissioner Eon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinet No. 1 Hidatgo County Precinct No. 3
Atin: Mr. Eddy Gonzalez, Exec. Asst. of Community Affairs At Mr. Saul Ramirez, Field Operations Forenan
TO: Hon. Hector Palacios, Commissioner Flon. Joseph Palacios, Coromissioner
Hidalge County Precinct No. 2 Biialgo County Precinct No. 4
Atm: Mr, Ricardo Cf allar, Figld Operations Foreman Attn: Mr. ‘Marco Lopez, Chief Administrater
From: Santly Suarez] Buyet II)
aigo County Purchasing Dept.
RE: BIDAWA COMMENDATI )

T .
Bid Na. 2011-027-01-12-SGE-Hidalzo County- STRAFH ROAD SIGNS AND MISC.
EQUIPMENT" (Al Funding Sources, Programs and Enlities}™

“We have raceived three (3) rasponses to the above mentioned project. Enelosed you will find a copy of the
tabulation sheet along with copies of the bid respeascs for your review and recognrmendation.

We would like to present your recommendation oo the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting: thercfore, we need
“your Tesponse no later than Tuesddy, February 15, 2011 @ 2:00 p.m. to be'able 10 pregent to Commissioncr’s
Court oo Rebryary 22, 2011, Please indicate your recommendaton OF auy CODGEMS on the space provided below
and reply to the Purchasing Department via_fax _to  (956)-318-2629 ia_ email t
sandy.suarez@co.hidalge,fr.us.

Should you have any questions or require further information pleass do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- exx.

4860ﬁ7n2£ yﬁ Zﬁf;ip/‘mz‘tﬁon Td/éﬁ%a@b to this matter,
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Ploase include the budget account number(s) for the above refercace projeck.
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629

-.°"--.7,'§-:2(.?}€‘3-"'-” M E M O R A N D U M

DATE: February 08, 2011

TO: Hon. Joel Quintanilla, Commissioner IIon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No, | Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3
Attn: Mr. Eddy Gonzalez, Exec. Asst. of Community Affairs  Aun: Mr, Soul Ramirez, Field Operations Foreman
TO: Hon. Hector Palacios, Comnuissioner Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2 Hidalga County Precinct No. 4
Atm: Mr. Ricardo Citllur. Field Operations Foreman Attn: Mr. Marco Lopez, Chicl Administrator
i
From: Santly Suarez/ Buyer [

Hidaigo County Purchasing Depl.

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-027-01-12-SGS-Hidalgo County- “TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS AND MISC.

EQUIPMENT" (All Funding Sources, Programs and Entities)”

— N
We have received three (3) responses to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the
tabulation sheet along with copies of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like 1o present your recommendation on the next Cominissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we necd
“your response no later than Tuesday, Februarvy [5, 2011 @ 2:00 p.m. to be able o present to Commissioner's
Court on February 22, 2011, Please indicate your recommendalion or any concerns on the space provided below
and reply to the Purchasing Deportment. vin  fax to (956)-318-2629  or vig__emnil  to:
sandy.suarez@co.hidalpo.tus,

Should you have any guestions or require further information please do not lesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your atiention and cooperation to this matter.

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATTON (BASIS)
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sandy.suarez

From: Norma Ceballos [norma.ceballos@co.hidalgo.tx.us]

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2011 11:39 AM

To: ‘'sandy.suarez’

Subject: RE: 2011-027-01-12-8SGS " Traffic Road Signs and Misc. Equipment” 1100 account

1-1100-432-00-123-001-0-679
1-1100-452-00-123-008-0-679

From: sandy.suarez [mailto:sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us]
Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2011 11:23 AM

To: 'Norma Ceballos'

Subject: 2011-027-01-12-SGS " Traffic Road Signs and Misc. Equipment” 1100 account
Importance: High

Good Morning Norma,

On the Recommendation for the above referenced project that | received on 03/02/11, the 1200 fund was mentioned
and shown and the 1100 fund was also mentioned, but it wasn’t written down. Can you please send it to me? | need to

review the funds.
Thank you,

Sandy Suarez, Buyer ||

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2802 South Bus, Hwy 281

Edinburg, Texas 78539

(956) 292-7000 ext. 4860

(956) 318-2629 fax
sandy.svarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us
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Hidalgo County Puxchasing Office
2812 S, Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

DATE: Febroary 08, 2011

TO: Hon. Yoe! Quintanilla, Commissioner Hon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner

Hidalpo County Precinct No. 1 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3

Antn: Mr. Eddy Gonzalez, Bxec. Asst. of Community Affairs  Attn: Mr, Saul Ramirez, Field Qperations Foremean
TO: Hon. Heetor Palacios, Commissioner Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinet No. 2 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4

Artn: Mr. Ricardn Crellar, Field Operations Foreman Axte: Mr. Marco Lopez, Chief Administrator
From: Sandy Suumz},xuyer o

Hidalse County Purchasimg Diept,

E WARD BECOMMENDATION REQUES )

Bid No. 2011-027-01-12-8GS-Hidalge County- "TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS AND MISC.
EQUIPMENT" (All Funding Sources, Progtams and Entitics)”

We have received three (3) responses o the abave mentioned project, Enclosed you will find 2 copy of the
tabulation sheet along with copies of the bid sespanses for your review and recommendation.

RE:

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we peed

“your tesponse no later than Tuesddy, February 15, 2011 @ 2:00 pm. to be sble to pregent to Commissioner’s

Court up February 22, 201), Please indicate your recommendacion or any concems on the space provided below
and reply to the Purchasing Department. =318-262, H
Jaid 128,

Sheuld yon have any questions or reqaire further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to thiz matter.
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MEMORANDU

TO: Anacleto Martinez, Chief Duty
Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility

ATTN: Juan Tapia ,Pﬁcuremcnt Specialist

FROM: Sandy SuareZ, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: February 08, 2011

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-027-01-12-SGS-Hidalgo County(All Funding Sources)-"TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS AND

MISC. EQUIPME]

We have received ¥i/22(3) responses to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the
tabulation sheet along with copies of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
. your response no later than Monday, February 15.2011 @ 2:00 p.m. to be able to present to Comunissioner’s Court.

on February 22, 2081, Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and

reply to the Purchasing Department via fax to (956)-318-2629 or _via email to: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS) ,
L fard 70 Jediez I | Anard o Lowesl Hiders
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Please include the budget account number(s) for the above reference project.

Budget Acct No.: /)’
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sandy.suarez

From: Juén Tapia [juan.tapia@hidalgoso.org]

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2011 2:35 PM

To: 'sandy.suarez’

Subject: RE: 2011-027-01-12-SGS "Traffic Road Signs and Misc. Equipment” Account Number
Sandy,

The account number 11-1100-421-00-280-001-0-679 applies to this project is the same that shows on your
memo sent for approval of specifications dated 11-22-2010. Should you have any other questions or
required additional information, please contact us.

Respectfuily,

Juan Tapia
Procurement Specialist
Hidaigo Co. Sheriff’s Office

From: sandy.suarez [mailto:sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx,.us]

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2011 2:25 PM

To: 'Juan Tapia'

Subject: 2011-027-01-12-SGS "Traffic Road Signs and Misc. Equipment" Account Number
Importance: High

Mr. Tapia,
Can you please provide the account number(s) that your dept. will be utilizing for the above referenced project please.
It was not stated on the Recommendation. Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter.

Sincerely,

Sandy Suarez, Buyer Il

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2802 South Bus. Hwy 281

Edinburg, Texas 78539

(956} 292-7000 ext. 4860

(956) 318-2629 fax

sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us



Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

3

MEMORANDUM FEEETTE
TO: R?'chard Sunday, Infrastructure Sys. Manager FEB 24 2011
Hidalgo County Facilities Management (‘) . "
ATTN: Daniel Flores @ "( ‘

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: February 08, 2011

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-027-01-12-SGS-Hidalgo County (All Funding Sources)-“TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS AND

MISC. EQUIPMENT”

We have received eight (8) responses. to the above mentioned projeci. Enclosed you will find a cops,' of the
tabulation sheet along with copies of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
.your response no later than Tuesday, February 15, 2011 @ 2:00 p.m. to be able to present to Commissioner’s
Court on February 22, 2011. Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below
and reply to the Purchasing Department via fax to (956)-318-2629 or via __email to:
sandy.suarez @ co.hidalgo.tx.us,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
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Please include the budget count number(s) fgr the abgve referenc, ect.
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9 D

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG '
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE:___JANUARY 12,2011 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: HIDALGQO COUNTY (All Sourcés. Programs and Entities ) “TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS &

MISC. EQUIPMENT?”
BID NO: 20611-027-01-12-SGS
SIGNATURE (IF
NAME OF BIDDER: REg{J%ST APPLICABLE) DATE P%‘;%‘?‘;,}‘  ADDRESS
COMPANY/FIRM VIA* OR INITIALS OF STAFF PHONE & FAX NO
ADDRESSING MAIL QUT -
1.) NIPPON CARBIDE
INDUSTRIES e-mail Sandy Suarez 1227110 | B¥ 800-395-2528
Attn: Mike Gatica meatica@nikkalite.com
2). Delta Specialties . 10%05 E. Hwy 107
. e-mail 12/27/10 | Edinburg, TX. 78542
Attn: Jessica Sandy Suarez
P#956-316-1626
sales(@deltasignsupply.com
PO Box 54091
3)) Custen Products Corp. _rmail Sandy S s Jackson, MS. 39288
Attn: Heidi e-mal andy Suarez 12129710 | py 800-367-1492
heidi@cpesigns.com
3186 CR 550
4.) Rocal, Inc. ) Frankfort, OH. 45628
Attn: Teri Sellers e-mail Sandy Suarez 12/28/10 | Py 740-998-2122- x 129 F# 740-998-2073
tsellers@rocal.com
5.3 Pathmark Traffic Product P.0. Box 1066
) rainmark Iraltlc froducts : San Marcos, TX. 78667
= [ S d ]
Attn: Cody Holtz e-ma andy Suarez 12/28110 | pur 800.547.0874
sales@pathmark.net
6.) Vulcan Signs ;gij' E;%g},vse
Attn: David Beviacqua e-mail Sandy Suarez 12/30/10 P- 1-800-633-6845 F: 1-251-943-1544 :
vulcan3@vulcaninc.com
. 9875 Yucca Rd.
7.) SafeWE{y S.lgn Company e'mail Sandy Suarf:z 01/04/11 Adclanto, ACA. 92301
Attn: Vickie Hanson P# 800-637-7233 F#760-246-5512
sales@safewaysign.com
144 Souix Rd.
8.) Discount Iron Works IP Sandy S 01/04/11 Ir}ﬁlragrr;%’ ;r;; ;33?336 227-1211
] andy Suarez -787- or 227-
Attn; Mike Gonzalez agonzalezdiw@sbeglobal.net
mgonzalezdiw@sbcglobal.net
*VIA;
IN PERSON (IF)
TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)

BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL (EM)




Category A-New

Reflect Hi-Intens | Grade-D
1} 3 Way 12"x6" 2.27 2.67 4.34
f2) 4 way 12"x6" 2.27 2.67 4.34
24"x18" 9.49 11.89 21.90
3} A/C & Ref 18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
4) All Way 18'x5" 3.40 4.00 6.50
5) Arrow Sign 48"x24" 41,57 68.27
20'x8' 3.39 5,70 9.4%
15"x8" 5.10 4.36 7.20
6) Bridge Closed
36"x36" 46,40
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
48"x30" 51.55
7} Bridge Out 30"x30" 18.95 23,95 44.81
8} Brush Area 18" 24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
9} Cable/Util. Warning 9"x3" 1.24 1.42 1.93
12"x3 1/2 1.67 2.44 3.22
12" x4 3.40 4.00 6.50
10) Caution 18"x24" 9.49 11.85 21.90
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
11) children at Play  24"x30" 15.72 19.72 36.41
18"%24" 949 11.8% 21.90
12) Curve: RorlL 24"%24" 12.63 15.83 20.18
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
30"x36" 38.97
13) Const.Zone Waming 18"x18" 7.77 Q.57 14.10
24"24" 12.63 1583 29.18
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 36.49
36" 236" 4640 64.50
48"x48"
15) Const. Zone Signs ~ 12"x18" 5.08 6.29 11.29
24"x12" 5.89 8.49
18"x24" 9.49 11.89 17.88
24"x18" 9.49 11.89 21.90
30"x24" 15.72 19.72 36,41
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 36.44
48"x18" 18.13 22,93
48" k"
48"x30" 51.55
SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF
16) Custon Message 9"x30" 6.33/9.49 7.81/11.71 | 14.37/21.25
12"x18"| 5.09/7.63 6.20/0.43 | 11.29/16.93
18"x24"| 9.45/14.23 | 11.89/17.83 |21.90/
36"x36" 46.40f
17) Dead End 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
24"x24" 12.63 15.83 29.18
18) Detour 30"x34" 15.72 19.72 3541
19} Dip 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
36"x36" 45.40
20) Double Arrow  48"x24" 41.57
21) Flour. Yell/Green 24"x18" 22.14
24"x24" 29.50
30"x30" 45,31
36"x36" 77.16
48"x48"
22) Fresh O1f 24"y24" 12,63 15.83 29,18
23) Handicap Unlimit ed 12"x6" 2.27 .67 4.34
12"x9" 3.40 4.00
22 4,34 .5.14 8.43
12"x18" 5.09 6.29 11.29
12"24" 6.89 8.49
18"x18" .77 9.57 17.08
18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
24) Handicap X-ing ~ 12"x18" 5.09 6.29 11.29
18"x24" 9.49 11,89 21.90

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.
AWARDED ITEMS

Category B- Accessories

73) Brackets & Caps

Past cap 2"/3"

/5.06

Post cap 1 3/4 5q
post flat assy

4.39

3" Post cap
(standard 3" pipe)

Heavy duty 24"
wing bracket

14.04

82) Cones{traffic)

18" Plain bright
orange top/blk base

445

28" Plain bright
orange top/blk base

7.39

28' w/ Reflect callar

13.19

Reflect.

Hi-Intens

D-Grade

11 1/2"x16" decals

B.58

Chevron 18"x24"

9.49

11,89

133) Double Arrow

48"x24" Yellow
reflect. Aluminum
rectangle

41.57

84) Object Markers

reflect. 6"%24

234

20"%30"

7.17

12"x36"

9.49

5"x12" Bridge Markers

2.21

18"x18" End of Road
markers/button deline

14.41

Round plast, Reflect red

0,57

Round plast. Reflect amber

0.57

CATERGORY C- NO BIDS




24"%30" 15.72 19.72 36.41
30'x30°|  18.85 23.95 44.81
36"x36" 46.40
| 48"x48"
26) Arrow Sign 21"x12"
Polnting down R orL 6.89 B.4% 15.32
27) Ice on Bridge 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44,81
28} Interfocal sign-1 side 4"x8" 197.76
2side  4"x8" 296.64 456.96
30) Keep Back 25ft 12"x9" 3.40 4.00 6,50
31) Lto R Marker 8ridge 12"x36" 349 11.89 21.90
18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
32) Mattress 18"x24" 5.49 11.89 21.90
33} Men Working 24"x24" 12,63 15.83 29.18
34} Metal Area 18724 " 9.49 11.89 21.90
35) Mowers Ahead  36"x36" 46,40
36) Narrow Bridge 24" k24" 12.63 15.83 29.18
30'x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
37) Neighborhood 18"x24" 10.22 12.62 22.63
Watch 24"x30" 16.81 20.81 37.50
38) No Dumping 18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
24"x30" 15.72 19.72 36,41
60"x30" 64.32
39) Pavement Ends  30"x30" 18.95 23.95
36"x36" 46.40
40} Pedestrians 36"x36" 46.40
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 45,31
41) Public/Priv Park 12"x18" 5.09 6.29 11,28
18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
42} R to L Marker 12"x36" 9.49 11.89 21.90
18"x24" 949 11.89 21.90
43) Bd Closed Thru Traf 60"x30" 654.32
48"x30" 51.55
44) Road Closed 30"x48" 43,55 51.55 £84.93
48"x30" 51.55
36"x36" 38.20 46.40 76.44
45) Rd Constr. Ahead 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
36"%35" 46.40
46) Rd Mach. Ahead 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
36"x36" 46.40
47) school Ped X-ing  30"x30" 18.95 23.95 45,31
36"x36" 46.40 77.16
48) School Zone/cell  24"x8" 4.52 5.59 10.15
24"x10" 5.65 6.98 12.68
18"x24' 9.49 11.89 22,87
24"x18' 9.49 11.89 22.87
24"x24" 12,63 15.83 29.50
24"x30" 15.72 19.72 36.81
0°x30”" 18.95 23.95 4£5.31
35"%36" 46.40
50) Single Arrow 30"x36" 38.97
51) Single Arrow L/R  30"x36" 38.97
52) Slow 24"x24" 12.63 15.83 2918
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
36"x36" 46.40
53) Slow for Children 24"x30" 15,72 18.72 36.41
18"x24" 2.49 11.8% 22.87
SF/DF SE/DF SF/DF
I 54) Specialities Signs  2"x16"| 1.65/2.47 | 1.58/2.37 | 2.79/4.18
6"x12"| 2.27/3.40 | 2.67/4.00 | 4.34/6.51
12"x9"| 3.40/5.10 | 4.00/6.00 | 6.50/9.75
12"x18"| 5.09/7.63 6.29/9.43 | 11.29/16.93
18"x24"] 9.49/14.23 | 11.89/17.83 | 21.90/32.85
24"x24"| 12.93/18.94 | 15.83/23.74 {29.18/43.77|
24"x36"] 18.13/27.19 | 22.93/34.39| 42.96/64.44
30"x24"| 15.72/23.58 | 19.72/29.58 | 36.41/54.61
30"x30"| 18.95/28.42 | 23.95/35.92 | 44.81/67.21
30"x36"|32.97/ 38.97/ 64,00/
36"x12"| 9.49/14.23 | 11.89/17.83 | 21.90/32.85
48"x24"135.91/ 41.57/ 68.27/




55) Speed Limit 10-40 mph 18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
10-40 mph 24"x30" 15.72 19.72 36.41
56) Stop Ahead 24"x24" 15.24 20.19 35.41
30"x30" 2247 30.20 54.03
36"x356"|  43.53 54.65 809,01
57) Stop Signs 18"x18" 8.23 10.03 17.54
24"%24" 12.27 15.47 28.82
30"x30" 18.23 23.23 44,09
59) Street Names(legend on 1
ar 2 sides) 6"x35"| 9.19/12.09
60) Supplement Plagues 12"x6" 2.27 2.67 4.34
61} "T" Intersection  24"x24' 12,63 15.83 29.18
30"%30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
36"x36" 46,40
B2} Tire Area 18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21.90
63} Tratfic Signs 9"x12" 3.40 4.00 6.50
18"x12" 5.09 6.29 11.29
18"%24" 9,49 11.89 21.90
24"x18" 9.49 11,89 21.90
24"x24" 12.63 15.83 25.18
24"x30" 15,72 19.72 3641
24"x36" 18.13 22.93 42.96
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
30"x36" 1897
36"x12" 9.49 11.89 21.90
64) Trash Area 18"x24" 9.49 11.89 21,90
65) Truck Crossing 36"x36" 46.40
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
£6) Warning Signs S"x12" 3.40 4,00 6,50
18"x12" 5,09 6.29 11.29
24"x18" 9.49 11.89 21.90
24 x24" 12.63 15.83 29,18
24°%30" 15.72 19.72 36.41
24"x386" 18.13 2293 42.56
30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44,81
36"x12" 9,49 11.89
36"x36" 46.40
67) Water On Bridge 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44,81
68) Yield Sign 30'x30"x30" 9.91 12.47 23.15
36"x36"36' 12.58 15.85 29.54
69) "Y" Intersection 30"x30" 18.95 23.95 44.81
70) Your Trash-secure 18"x24" 9.49 11.89 219




Delta Specialties Signs Supplies
Awarded ltems

Category A-New Category C-Refacing Category B- Accessorfes
Reflect | Hi-Intens | Grade-D Reflect Hi-Intens Grade-D 71) 3" Ctr Pavement Reflectors
1) 3 Way 12"x6" 245 4.55 6.65 Amber 1.50
[2) 4 way 12"%6" 245 4,55 6.65 Clear 1.70
24"x18" B.05 11.40 16.80 Red or White 1.85
3) AJC & Ref 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 72] 4" Cir Pavement Reflectors
4) All Way 18'x6" 3.15 4,55 6.6% Amber 1.50
5} Arrow Sign 48"x24" 31.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 Clear 1.70
20"x8" 5.05 8.75 11.60 Red or White 185
15"x8" 4.35 8.05 10.90 73) Brackets & Caps
6) Bridge Closed 36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 Aluminum 6" & 9" 16.95
48"x48"| 61.45 86,70 128.00 43.00 60.75 £9.60 Cross Brackets 2" 3.50
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 fRound Post Bracket 2" 3.50
48"x30"{ 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 U Post Brackets 2" 3.50
7) Bridge Qut 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 90" Bracket 4 way assy 3.50
8) Brush Area 18" 24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 45°/80° Bracket 4 way assy 3.50
8) Cable/Util. Warning 9"x3" 3,15 4,55 7.65 Post cap U Channel 3.50
12"x3 1/2 5.25 5.80 7.90 Post cap 2" 3.50
12"%3" 3.70 5.80 7.90 Post dome caps 3" 4.50
10) Caution 18"x24" 2.05 11.40 16.80 Wing Brackets 12" 13.00
30"x30" 16.30 23.75 35.00 18"| 15.00
11) Children at Play  24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28,00 24" 22,00
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 74} Barricades
12) Curve: Ror L- 24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 Barricade Flashers 16.95
Curve Ahead 330" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Barricade Lights 16.95
30"x36"|  29.00 60.00 20,30 28.45 42.00 76} End Of Road Type | &l Type | Type lll
13) Const.Zane Warning 18"x18" 6.05 8.55 12,60 g' 150.00
24"x24" 10.75 15,20 22.40 10' 155.00
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 12 210.00
36"x36"| 34.50 24.15 34.15 50.40 78} Barricade Tape-Reflective 1"x30 yd 65.00
48"x48" 61.45 £6.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 Gen Purpose Tape red 2"%30yd 135.00
14} Roll Up Mesh 36"x36" 61.00 79,00 No Bid No Bid No Bid white & yellow(rolls) 3"x30 yd 150.00
48"x48" 85.00 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 80) Flexible Road Marker
15) Const, Zone Signs  12"x18" 6.00 8.40 11.90 62" White Road w/white reflect sheeting 38.00
24"x12" 7.70 10.50 14,00 62" White Road w/vellow reflect sheeting 38.00
18"%24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 liggle bars 6" 34" 12.95
24"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80 81) Barrier Fence & Tape
30"x24" 13.30 18.90 28.00 TemporayBarrier Fence per it 0.55
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Temporay Barrier Fence Roll 4’100 43.00
48"x18" 40.00 15.75 20.65 28.00 Quick fence safey system 52.00
48"x24"| 30,00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 Industrial grade Mil Barrier tape 9,95
48"%30"| 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 182)Cones {traffic)
SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SE/DF SF/DE SF/DF 28" Orange/red glow 11.25
16) Custon Message 9"x30" 995/14.95 | 15.00/21.70 | 23.00/3450 Reflect. Hi-Intent |D-grade
12"%18" 7.10/10.65 | 14.45/21.68 | 22.00/33.00
I 18"x24" 72.00/ 9,95/14.95 15.00/21.70 | 23.50/34.50 183} Double Arrow
36"%36" | 34.50/51.75 25.00/37.50 | 32.00/48.00 | 52.00/78.00 48"x24 yell. Reflect
17) Dead End 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Aluminum rectangle 31.00 64.00
24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 Municipal Emblem 12.95
18) Detour 30"x24" 13.30 18.90 28.00 {pressure sensitive)
19} Dip 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 85) Safety Flags
36"x36"| 3450 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 24" Safety Flag | I 5.25
20) Double Arrow A48"x24" 31.00 64.00 21.70 30.40 4480 86) Felding Signs
21) Flour. Yell/Green 24"x18" No Bid No Bid 19,60 24"x24" Binder sign 32,00
24"x24" No Bid No Bid 26.20 folding sign
30"x30" No Bid No Bid 40.20 Port. Stands{3 &4} 140.00
36"x36" No Bid No Bid 58.40 legs Quad flex 36"
48"x48" 135,00 No Bid Na Bid 94.50 B'x10" upright sign 15.00
22) Fresh Oil 24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 post
23) Handicap Unlimit  12"x6" 2.45 4.55 6.65 30"x30"Roll up Mesh 75.00
12"x9" 3,70 5.80 7.90 stop/slow Paddle fold
12"x12" 5.60 8.40 11.90 187) Stub Post
12"x18" 6.00 8.40 11.90 square post 2'x2" 12" 35.00
12"x24" 7.70 10.50 14.00 88) Sign Assy Hardware
18"x18" 6.05 8.55 12.60 anti theft bolts 0.25
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 5/16 bolts 2 1/2 x 3 0.35
24) Handicap X-ing 12"x28" 6.00 8.40 11.90 1/4 bolts 2" 0.35
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 156.80 190} Dome Drums
24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00 | 4" x Transfer Tape | ] 13.28
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 |91} speed Bumps
36"x36"|  34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.00 | & SpeedBump (alast) | ! 112.50




Delta Specialties Signs Supplies
Awarded ltems

48"x48"{ 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 5" Speed Bump (plast) 157.50
25) Handicap Stencil 48" 65.00 120,00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6" Speed Sump (plast) 194.92
26) Arrow Sign 21"%12" No Bid No Bid No Bid vell/black
Pointing down Ror L 7.70 10.50 14.00 193) Misc.
27) Ice on Bridge 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Slow Moving Vehicle 9.95
28) Interlocal sgn-1 side 4"x8" 250,00 360.00 No Bid 040 Aluminum
2side  4"x8" 350.00 495.00 No Bid Slow Maving Vehicle 6.95
29) Office & Shop signs 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid decal -triangle
30) Keep Back 25ft 12"%9" 4,10 5.61 7.00 Keep Back 500 ft. decal 9,95
31) Lto R Matker Brid 12"x38" 9.95 15.00 23.00 33"x3" reflective
18"x24" 9.85 15.00 23.00 Tape-Caution Buried 3'x1000" 14.95
32) Mattress 18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00 Electrical Lines
23} Men Working 24"x24" 12.95 18.00 29.00 Post Driver 325.00
34) Metal Area 18"%24" 9.95 15,00 23.00 18" Double faced 16.95
35) Mowers Ahead  36"x36" 34.50 72.00 25.00 36.00 52.00 Hand Paddles
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 45.00 52.00 92.00
36) Narrow Bridge 24"x24" 12.95 18.00 29.00
30"%30" 20.00 28.00 39.00
37} Melghborhood Wat  18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00
24"x30" 13.95 19.00 37.00
38} No Dumping 18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00
24"x30" 13.95 12.00 37.00
60"x30"] 48.00 100.00 25.00 32.00 52.00
39) Pavement Ends  30"x30" 20.00 28.00 39.00
36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24,15 34.15 50,40
40) Pedestrians 36"%36" 34.50 72.00 2415 34,15 50.40
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60,70 89.60
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
41) Public/Priv Park 12"x18" 6.00 8.40 11.90
18"x24' 8.05 11.40 16.80
42) R to L Marker 12"x36" 10.85 13.25 19.75
18"x24" 8.05 14,40 16.80
43) Rd Closed Thru Tral  60"x30" 48.00 100.00 33.60 47.45 70.00
48"x30"| 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00
44) Road Closed 48"x30" 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00
45) Rd Constr. Ahead 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35,00
36"x36"] 34.50 72.00 24.50 34.15 50.40
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
46) Rd Mach, Ahead 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24,15 34.15 50,40
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
47) School Ped X-ing  30"x30" No Bid No Bid 36.40
36"x36"| 38.00 Na Bid No Bid 56,70
48) School Zone/fcell  24™x8" 8.55 12.75 21.55
24"x10" 8.95 12.75 21.55
18"x24" 8.05 1140 16,80
24"x18" 8.05 1140 16.80
24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40
24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
24"x48"| 30.00 35.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
48"x48"| 6145 85.70 128.00 43.00 60,70 89.60
36"x36"{ 34.50 72.0 24.15 34.15 50.40
49) Signs & Blanks _ 6"x18" 6.25 8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"x24" 7.89 10.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
£"x30" 9.86 13.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
&"x36" 10.95 14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30"x30" 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35,00
50} Single Arrow 30"x36" 29.00 60.00 2030 28.45 42.00
48"x24'| 30,00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44,80
51) Single Arrow L/R  30"x36" 29.00 60.00 20.30 28.45 42.00
48"x24"°] 30,00 39.00 51.00 21,70 30.40 44.80
52) Slow 24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24,15 34.15 50.40
53) Slow for Children 24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
SF/DF SE/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF
|54} Specialities Signs _ 2"x16" 2.80/4.20 3.65/5.45 No Bid
6"x12" 2.80/4.20 3.65/5.45 No Bid
12"x3" 3,15/4.55 4.00/5.80 No Bid
12"x18" 5.50/8.40 7.30/10.95 No Bid
18"x24" 1130/16.80 | 14.55/21.80 No Bid
24"x24" 14.95/22.40 | 19.40/29.05 No Bid
24"x36" 22.40/33.60 | 2%.05/43.60 No Bid




Delta Specialties Signs Supplies
Awarded items

30"x24" 18.70/28.00 | 18.70/28.00 No Bid
30"x30" 23.40/35.00 | 30.30/45.45 No Bid
30"x36" 2805/4210 | 36.35/54.50 No Bid
36"x12" 11.20/16.80 | 14.55/21.80 No Bid
48" x4 29.90/44.80 | 38.75/58,10 No Bid
48"x48" 59.80/89.75 | 77.55/116.20 No Bid
4'x8' 227.50/341,25 | 301.004451.50 No Bid
55) Speed Limlt 10-40 mph 18"x24“ B.05 11.40 16.80
10-40 mph 24"x30" 13.30 18.90 23.00
56) Stop Ahead 24"x24" 12,60 19.95 29,40
30"x30" 19.60 30.10 45.50
36"x36" 35.00 44.10 66.50
57} Stop Signs 18"x18" 10.35 12.95 19.57
24"x24" 11,87 15.75 24.50
30"x30" 18.20 24.50 37.80
36"%36" 75.00 26,60 32.90 52.50
48"x48" 63.00 77.00 105.00
60} Supp! Plagues 12"x6" 2.45 4,55 6.65
61) "T" Intersection  24"x24' 10.75 15.20 22.40
30"x30" 16,80 23.75 35.00
36"x356"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
62) Tire Area 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
63) Traffic Signs 9"x12" 3,70 5.80 7.90
18"x12" 6.00 §.40 11.90
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16,80
24"x18" 3.05 11.40 16.80
24"24" 10.75 15.20 22,40
24"30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
24"%36" 16.10 22.75 33.60
30"x30" 16.80 23.95 35.00
30"x36"( 29.00 50,00 20.30 28.45 42.00
36"x32" 10.85 13.25 19.75
48"x24"{ 30.00 39.00 51.00 2170 30.40 44,80
48"%48"]  61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
64) Trash Area 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
65) Truck Crossing 36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
66) Warning Signs g"x12" 3.70 5.8Q 7.90
18"x12" 6.00 3.40 11,90
24"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80
24"x24" 10.75 15,20 22.40
24"x30" 1330 18.90 28.00
24"%x36" 16.10 22.75 33.60
30"x30" 16.80 23,75 35.00
36"x12" 10.85 13.25 19.75
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
48"x24"| 30.00 39.00 51.00 21,70 30.40 44.80
48"x48"|  £1.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 83.60
67) Water On Bridge 30"x30" 126.80 23.75 35.00
48"x48"|  61.45 86.70 128.00 43,00 60.70 89.60
68) Yield Sign 30'x30"x30" 18,90 25.15 36.40
36"x36"x36" 25.55 35.55 51.80
69) "Y" Intersectlon 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
70} Your Trash-secure 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80




PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS

AWARDED ITEMS
Category A-New Category B~ Accessories
Reflect Hi-Intens Grade-D 58) Stop Stencil 25.00
14) Rolt Up Mesh 36"x36" 33.75 36"x36" 75.00
48"x48" 42.00 73) Brackets & Caps
15) Const. Zone Slgns  24"x12" 14.10 Cross Brackets 3" 3.78
SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF Round Post Bracket 3" 5.25
16) Custon M 18"x24" /3L.00] U Post Brackets 3" 5.25
36"%36" /64.00 /100,00] Reflect.  Hi-intens  D-Grade
21) Flour. Yell/Green 48"x48" 77.60 51.00 74} Barricades
23) Handlcap Unlimited  12"x9" 6.29 A frame 30"ht/6' w Sf or DF |SFor DF  |SF or DF
12"x24" 14,10 plastic frame 45,00/52.00 |55.00/62.00
25) Handlcap Stencil 44"x38" 110,00 &' Type Iil Orange / Red/white DF DF
28B) Interlocal sign-1 side  4"x8" 160.00 288.00 sheeting Type A & C 175.00 195.00
2side  4"x8"| 215.00 10" Type 1l Barricade DF DF
36) Pavement Ends  30"x30" 36.80 sheeting 1 or 2 sides 195.00 225.00
49} Signs & Blanks 6"x18" 2.96 75) Panels
5"x24" 3.98 46 x 8 Reflect 1" thick 25.00 35.00
5"%x30" 4.98 orange/white
6"x36" 5.98 77) Barve) Tape white
30"x30" 17.30 red/yellow
SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF 2"x50 yds 26.00 52.00
[54) specialities Signs _ 26"x36" J43.00 /55.00 f89.00 4"x50 yds 52.00 104.00
48"x24" /48.00 /60.60 /100.00 6"x50 yds 78.00 156.00
48"x48"| 77.60/29.60 | 91.20/105.00 [147.20/187.00 79} Type A & C Orange
4'x8' |160,00/190.00 [152.00/250.00 |234.00/385.00 Left-Right Type Il
57) Stop Signs 30"x30" 36.46 41.63 8"x50 yd 105.00 205.00
48"x48" 65.00 74.00 137.60 8"x100 yd 210.00 410.00
59) Str Natnes {legend 1-2 sides) 82) Cones {Traffic)
6"x181 5.35/7.67 | 6.99/8.99 | 8.60/13.85 35" Plain Bright 12.80
6"%24"(7.13/10.22 [8.21/11.95 |11.46/18.46 orange top/blk base
6"x30"|8.91/12.78 |10.27/14.98 |14.33/23.08 Chevrons 18"x24" 2100
6"%X36" 12.32/17.98 [17.20/27.69 24) Object Markers
6" Delineator Posts flex 7.60
Rectanglular Reflec. 3.95
CATEGORY C-NO BIDS 3"'%8" Type ARC
85) Safety Flags
Flugys. wy stiffener 3.95 nfr
18"x18"
86) Folding signs
Quad stands for roll
up Mesh sign 135.00
87) Stub Post
Tubular Post 8" 168] 13.46
Tubular Post 10" 168} 16.85
Tubular Post 12" 16g] 20.19
38) Sign Assy Hardware
Locknuts 0,10
1/4" Bolts 2" 0.35
1/4 " screws -bracket 0.20
{blade holders}
Scraw set vandle proof 0.39
89} U Channel
12"x3" hvy gauge-green war| 18,59
U shape galvanized 10' 18.58
12 22.30
Safety splice U channel 12.00
Sign Post system
90) Dome Drums
Super dome drums 40.00 top
Molded rubber base aon]  35.00
92) Epoxy
1 Gal. Epoxy kit 95.00
5 Gal. Epoxy kit 425.00
Epoxy Pads sxa’| 0.95
Epoxy Quick Sticks 5.00
93) Misc.
8'x4' MDO Specialty 160.00
sign
6"x50 yds roll-EG viny! 78.00
£"150 yds roll-HIP vinyl 150.00




