HIDALGO COUNTY
(All Funding Sources)
"TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS AND MISC. EQUIPMENT"
RFB NO.: 2011-027-01-12-SGS

LOWEST BID REFACEING BIDS NO BID / NB DO NOT MEET SPECS
DELTA SPECIALITIES SIGN & SUPPLY PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION
CATEGORY B
ITEM CATEGORY A-NEW CATEGORY B ACCESS. CATEGORY C-RE-FACING CATEGORY A-NEW CATEGORY B ACCESS. CATEGORY C-RE-FACING CATEGORY A-NEW ACCESS. CATEGORY C-RE-FACING
REFLECTIVE HIGH INTENSITY | D-GRADE | | REFLECTIVE |HIGH INTENSITY |D7GRADE REFLECTIVE-EG HIGH INTENSITY | D-GRADE | | REFLECTIVE | HIGH INTENSITY | D-GRADE REFLECTIVE HIGH INTENSITY |D7GRADE | | REFLECTIVE |H\GH \NTENS\TYl D-GRADE
1) 3 Way
12°X &' | 3.50 6.50 | 9.50 | | | 2.45 | 4.55 | 6.65 4.18 5.29 | 669 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 2.27 267 | 434 | | | ] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
[2 A WAY
12" 6' | 3.50 | 6.50 | 950 | | | 2.45 | 4.55 | 6.65 4.18 | 5.29 | 669 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 2.27 267 | 434 | | | | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
24"x 18’ | 11.50 [ 16.25 [ 2400 | | | 8.05 | 11.40 | 16.80 14.55 17.10 27.60 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 9.49 11.89 21.90 | | | ] NoBid [ NoBid | NoBid
|3) A/C & REFRIDGERATION
18"x 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 2400 | | | 8.05 | 11.40 | 16.80 14.55 | 17.10 | 2760 | | | No Bid | No Bid |~ NoBid 9.49 1189 [ 2190 | | | | NoBid [ NoBid [ NoBid
[H ALCCWAY
18 X 6 | 4.50 | 6.50 | 950 | | | 3.15 | 4.55 | 6.65 6.98 | 7.98 | 1029 | | | No Bid | No Bid |~ NoBid 3.40 400 | 650 | | | | NoBid [ NoBid [ NoBid
[5) ARROW
48" x 24' 31.00 43.40 64.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.17 41.57 68.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20" x 8" 7.18 12.46 16.57 5.05 8.75 11.60 9.00 11.00 16.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.89 5.70 9.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
157X 8" 6.18 11.46 15.57 4.35 8.05 10.90 8.80 10.80 16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.10 4.36 7.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
|6) BRIDGE CLOSED
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 43.65 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.75 89.60 77.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 30" 38.40 54.20 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 49.00 57.00 92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid .100 43.55 51.55 84.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7) BRIDGE OUT
30" 30" | 24.00 | 33.90 | 5000 | | | 16.80 | 23.75 | 35.00 30.31 | 35.63 | 5750 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 18.95 2395 | 4481 | | | ] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
8) BRUSH AREA
18" X 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 2400 | | | 8.05 | 11.40 | 16.80 I 14.55 | 17.10 | 2760 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 9.49 11.89 | 2190 | | | ] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
9) CABLE UTILITY WARNING SIGNS
9"x 3" 4.50 6.50 10.90 3.15 4.55 7.65 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.24 1.42 1.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" x 31/2" 7.50 7.85 11.10 5.25 5.80 7.90 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.67 2.44 3.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid
127X 9" 5.25 8.25 11.25 3.70 5.80 7.90 | | 4.85 5.70 9.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.40 4.00 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10) CAUTION
18"x 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 2400 | | | 8.05 | 11.40 | 16.80 14.55 | 17.10 | 2760 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 9.49 1189 [ 2190 | | | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
30" x 30" | 24.00 | 33.90 | 5000 | | | 16.80 | 23.75 | 35.00 30.31 | 35.63 [ 5750 | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 18.95 2395 | 4481 | | | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
11) CHILDREN AT
PLAY
24" x 30" | 19.00 27.00 | 4000 | | | 13.30 | 18.90 | 28.00 24.25 | 28.50 | 46.00 | | | | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 15.72 19.72 [ 3641 | | | | NoBid | NoBid [ NoBid
18" X 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 2400 | | | 8.05 | 11.40 [ 16.80 14.55 | 17.10 [ 2760 | [ [ | No Bid [ No Bid |~ NoBid 9.49 1189 | 2190 | [ [ | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
12) RIGHT OR LEFT CURVE AHEAD
24" x 24' 15.35 21.70 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 36" 29.00 40.65 60.00 20.30 28.45 42.00 36.38 42.75 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid .100 32.97 38.97 64.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
13) CONSTRUCTION ZONE WARNING SIGNS(Orange background w/black copy
18" x 18" 8.64 12.20 18.00 6.05 8.55 12.60 11.13 13.16 20.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.77 9.57 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 24' 15.35 21.68 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.88 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 36.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 43.65 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid .100 39.20 46.40 64.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.7 89.60 77.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125 86.23 99.03 131.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid
14) ROLL -UP MESH SIGNS Legends needed for Roll-up Signs(including rib w/orange background) will be as followed, but not limited to (i.e. Road Construction ahead,
Mowers Ahead, Right Lane Closed Ahead, Men Working Ahead, Right & Left Lane Closed Ahead)
18" x 18" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 24' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 49.00 61.00 79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 55.00 85.00 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15) CONSTRUCTION ZONE SIGNS & SUPPLEMENTAL SIGNS (Orange background w/black copy)
12'x 18" 8.60 12.00 17.00 6.00 8.40 11.90 7.42 8.77 13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24"'x 12" 11.00 15.00 20.00 7.70 10.50 14.00 9.90 11.60 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.89 8.49 15.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" X 24" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 17.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 18" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 24 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 28.00 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 36.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 18" 22.50 29.50 40.00 15.75 20.65 28.00 29.10 34.20 55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.13 22.93 42.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48'x 24" 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid .100 35.91 41.57 57.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48"x 30" 38.40 54.20 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 49.00 57.00 92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125 43.55 51.55 84.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16) CUSTOM MESSAGE (Legend on 1 or 2 sides -one color-reflective grade will vary) SF-Single Face DF-Double Face
9" x 30" SF| 11.40 15.00 24.00 9.95 15.00 23.00 9.50 10.80 17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.33 7.81 14.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF| 17.10 22.50 36.00 14.95 21.70 34.50 13.50 15.80 24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.71 21.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" x 18" SF 8.60 12.00 17.00 7.10 14.45 22.00 7.20 14.50 19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF| 12.90 18.00 25.50 10.65 21.68 33.00 9.50 17.50 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.63 9.43 16.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" x 24" SF 11.50 16.25 24.00 9.95 15.00 23.50 14.55 22.00 24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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DF| 17.25 24.38 36.00 14.95 21.70 34.50 18.00 26.00 31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.23 17.83 32.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" SF 34.50 48.50 72.00 25.00 32.00 52.00 43.65 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF| 51.75 73.20 108.00 37.50 48.00 78.00 54.00 64.00 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 58.80 69.60 114.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid
17) DEAD END
30" x 30" | 24.00 | 33.90 | 50.00 16.80 23.75 | 35.00 30.31 35.63 | 5750 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 18.95 | 2395 | 4481 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
24" x 24 | 15.35 | 21.70 | 32.00 10.75 15.20 | 22.40 19.40 22.80 | 36.80 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 12.63 | 1583 | 2918 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
18) DETOUR
30" x 24" | 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 | 28.00 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid | No Bid |~ NoBid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
19) DIP
30" x 30" | 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 | 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid NoBid | No Bid
36" x 36" | 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 [ 50.40 43.65 51.30 82.80 No Bid [ No Bid |~ NoBid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
20) DOUBLE ARROW
487x 24" | 31.00 | 43.40 | 64.00 21.70 30.40 | 44.80 39.00 46.40 | 74.40 No Bid | No Bid |~ NoBid .100 3591 | 4157 | 6827 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
21) FLOURESCENT YELLOW GREEN SAFETY
24" x 18" No Bid No Bid 27.00 No Bid No Bid 19.90 No Bid No Bid 32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 24 No Bid No Bid 36.00 No Bid No Bid 26.20 No Bid No Bid 44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" No Bid No Bid 56.00 No Bid No Bid 40.20 No Bid No Bid 66.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" No Bid No Bid 82.00 No Bid No Bid 58.40 No Bid No Bid 99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" No Bid No Bid 135.00 No Bid No Bid 94.50 77.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125 154.63 154.63 154.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid
22) FRESH OIL
24" x 24 | 15.35 | 21.68 | 32.00 10.75 15.20 | 22.40 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
23) HANDICAP UNLIMITED WORDING & SYMBOLS (blue & white)
12'x6" 3.50 6.50 9.50 2.45 455 6.65 3.29 4.29 5.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.27 2.67 4.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid
129" 5.25 8.25 11.25 3.70 5.80 7.90 3.69 4.89 6.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.40 4.00 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12'x 12" 8.00 11.00 16.00 5.60 8.40 11.90 559 6.49 9.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.34 5.14 8.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12"x 18" 8.60 12.00 17.00 6.00 8.40 11.90 7.35 8.78 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 x 24" 11.50 15.50 24.50 7.70 10.50 14.00 9.90 11.60 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.89 8.49 15.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" x 18" 8.64 12.20 18.00 6.05 855 12.60 11.13 13.16 20.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.7 9.57 17.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18"X 24" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.10 21.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24) HANDICAP X-ING
12" x 18" 8.60 12.00 17.00 6.00 8.40 11.90 | 7.35 8.78 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" X 24" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 | 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 30" 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 28.00 | 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.88 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 | 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.00 | 43.65 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid .100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 | | 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid I125 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid I
25) HANDICAP STENCIL
18" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32" x 24" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44" x 38" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" Handicap stencil duro 65.00 maxi 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid I
26) ARROW SIGN |
21" X 12 POINTING
DOWN, R OR L 11.00 15.00 ‘ 20.00 7.70 10.50 14.00 I 14.55 17.10 ‘ 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.89 | 8.49 | 15.32 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
27) ICE ON BRIDGE
30" X 30" | 24.00 [ 33.90 | 50.00 16.80 23.75 | 35.00 | | 30.31 35.63 | 57.50 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid I 18.95 | 2395 | 4481 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
[28) INTER-LOCAL PROJECT SIGNS
4"x 8" 1 side pylwood 325.00 | 430.00 | No Bid 250.00 360.00 | No Bid | | 160.00 208.00 | 288.00 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 172.16 | 19776 | 304.64 No Bid NoBid | No Bid
4"x 8" 2 side pylwood 537.50 [ 612.50 [ NoBid 350.00 495.00 [ NoBid [} 215.00 320.00 | 470.00 No Bid [ No Bid [ NoBid 258.24 | 29664 [ 456.96 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
[29) OFFICE & SHOP SIGNS
No description | 120.00 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid | NoBid I No Bid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
[30) KEEP BACK 25 FT
12" x 9" No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 4.10 5.61 | 7.00 I 4.85 5.70 | 9.20 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 3.40 | 4.00 | 6.50 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
[32) LEFT TO RIGHT MARKER BRIDGE
12' x 36' | 15.47 | 18.90 | 2820 9.95 15.00 | 23.00 | 14.55 17.10 | 27.60 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 9.49 | 1189 | 21.90 No Bid NoBid | No Bid
18" x 24" | 11.50 [ 16.25 [ 24.00 9.95 15.00 | 23.00 | | 14.55 17.10 [ 27.60 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 9.49 | 118 | 2190 No Bid No Bid [ No Bid
[32) MATTRESS
18" x 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 24.00 9.95 15.00 | 23.00 | | 14.55 17.10 | 27.60 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 9.49 | 1189 | 21.90 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
[33) MEN WORKING
24" x 24" | 15.35 | 21.68 | 32.00 12.95 18.00 | 29.00 | | 19.40 22.80 | 36.80 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 12.63 | 1583 | 29.18 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
34) METAL AREA
18" x 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 24.00 9.95 15.00 | 23.00 | | 14.55 17.10 | 27.60 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 9.49 | 1189 | 21.90 No Bid NoBid | No Bid I
35) MOWERS AHEAD
36" x 36" | 34.50 | 48.80 | 72.00 25.00 36.00 | 52.00 | | 43.66 51.30 | 82.80 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I.100 39.20 | 4640 | 7644 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
48" x 48" | 61.45 | 86.70 | 128.00 45.00 52.00 | 92.00 | | 72.60 91.20 | 147.20 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 125 86.23 | 99.03 [ 15243 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
|36) NARROW BRIDGE
24" x 24" | 15.35 | 21.70 | 32.00 12.95 18.00 | 29.00 | | 19.40 22.80 | 36.80 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 12.63 | 1583 | 29.18 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
30" x 30" | 24.00 | 33.90 | 50.00 20.00 28.00 | 39.00 | | 30.31 35.63 | 5750 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 18.95 | 2395 | 4481 No Bid No Bid [ No Bid
[37) NEIGHBOR HOOD WATCH
18" x 24" | 11.50 | 16.25 | 24.00 9.95 15.00 | 23.00 | | 14.55 17.10 | 27.60 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 10.22 | 12562 | 22.63 No Bid No Bid | No Bid I
24" x 30" | 19.00 | 27.00 | 40.00 13.95 19.00 | 37.00 | | 24.25 28.50 | 46.00 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid 16.81 | 2081 | 3750 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
138) NO DUMPING
18" x 24" 11.50 16.25 24.00 9.95 15.00 23.00 | 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 30" 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.95 19.00 37.00 | 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" x 30" 48.00 67.75 100.00 25.00 32.00 52.00 | | 60.60 71.25 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid I.100 54.32 64.32 106.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid I
]39) PAVEMENT ENDS
30" x 30" | 24.00 [ 33.88 [ 50.00 20.00 28.00 | 39.00 | | 30.31 35.63 | 36.80 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid I 18.95 | 2395 | 4481 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
36" x 36" | 34.50 [ 48.80 | 7200 24.15 34.15 50.40 1 43.66 51.30 [ 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 | 4640 | 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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]40) PEDESTRIANS

36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 | 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 | 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125 86.20 99.03 154.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 | | 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 45.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid

41) PUBLIC/PRIVATE PARKING SIGN
12" x 18" 8.60 | 12.00 | 1700 | | | 6.00 8.40 11.90 7.35 8.78 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
187X 24" 11.50 | 16.25 [ 2400 | [ [ 8.05 11.40 16.80 I 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid I 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid NoBid [ NoBid
42) RIGHT TO LEFT MARKER
12" x 36" 15.47 | 18.90 [ 2820 | [ [ 10.85 13.25 19.75 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
18" x 24" 11.50 | 16.25 [ 2400 | [ [ 8.05 11.40 16.80 I 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid I 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid NoBid [ NoBid
43) ROAD CLOSED TO THRU TRAFFIC
60" x 30" | 48.00 | 67.75 | 10000 | | | 33.60 47.45 70.00 60.60 71.25 115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 54.32 64.32 106.04 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
487X 30" | 38.40 | 54.20 | 8000 | [ [ 26.90 37.95 56.00 49.00 57.00 92.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 43.55 51.55 84.93 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
44) ROAD CLOSED!

30" x 48' 61.45 86.70 128.00 _|< Road closed ahead> 43.00 60.70 89.60 49.00 57.00 92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 43.55 51.55 84.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
487X 307 38.40 54.20 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 49.00 57.00 92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 4355 51.55 84.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 |<Road closed ahead> 24.15 34.15 50.00 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid

45) ROAD CONSTRUCTION AHEAD
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.50 34.15 50.40 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125  83.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
46) ROAD MACHINERY AHEAD
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 Pentagon 16.80 23.75 35.00 | | 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 [ [ 24.15 34.15 50.40 | | 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 [ [ 43.00 60.70 89.60 | | 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125  83.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid

[47) SCHOOL PED X-ING
30" x 30" | 25.99 | 33.50 | 5200 | | No Bid No Bid 36.40 | | 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 45.31 No Bid NoBid | No Bid
36" x 36" 38.00 52.00 [ 81.00 [ No Bid No Bid 56.70 | | 43.66 51.60 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid Iloo 39.20 46.40 77.16 No Bid NoBid | NoBid

[48) SCHOOL ZONE SIGNS & SCHOOL ZONE SIGNS(CELL PHONE USE PROHIBITED UP TO $200.00 FINE)

24" x 8" 12.78 18.18 30.75 8.95 12.75 21.55 | | 8.35 10.00 15.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.52 5.59 10.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 10" 12.78 18.18 30.75 8.95 12.75 21.55 | | 9.00 11.00 18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.65 6.98 12.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" X 24" 1150 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 | | 14.55 17.00 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 22.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid
[24"x 18" 1150 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.00 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 22.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid
[24"x 24" 15.35 21.70 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 30" 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 28.00 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 48" 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 3591 41.57 68.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 45.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 12800 43.00 60.70 89.60 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 125 86.23 99.03 153.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 43.66 51.30 82.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 77.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
49) SIGNS & BLANKS
6" x 18" 5.22 6.25 8.50 with sheeting only No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 24" 6.75 7.89 10.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 30" 8.44 9.86 13.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 36" 8.95 10.95 14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 17.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50) SINGLE ARROW
30" x 36" 29.00 [ 40.65 | 6000 | | | 20.30 28.45 42.00 36.40 42.75 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 32.97 38.97 64.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
48" x 24" 30.00 [ 39.00 [ 5100 | [ [ 21.70 30.40 44.80 I 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid I.100 35.91 41.57 68.27 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
51) SINGLE ARROW LEFT/RIGHT
30" x 36" | 29.00 | 40.65 | 6000 | | | 20.30 28.45 42.00 | | 36.40 42.75 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 32.97 38.97 64.00 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
48" x 24" | 30.00 [ 39.00 [ 5100 | [ [ 21.70 30.40 44.80 | | 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid I.100 35.91 41.57 68.27 No Bid No Bid | No Bid
52) SLOW
24" x 24" 15.35 21.70 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 | 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.88 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 | 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 | | 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
53) SLOW FOR CHILDREN
24" x 30" | 19.00 | 27.00 | 4000 | | | 13.30 18.90 28.00 | | 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid NoBid | NoBid
187X 24" 11.50 | 16.25 [ 2400 | [ [ 8.05 11.40 16.80 | | 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid I 9.49 11.89 22.87 No Bid NoBid [ NoBid
54) SPECIALTIES SIGNS

2"x 16' SF 4.00 5.20 7.15 prices do not include removal 2.80 3.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.65 1.58 2.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 6.00 7.80 10.75 4.20 5.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 247 2.37 4.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6" x 12" SF 4.00 5.20 7.15 2.80 3.65 No Bid 3.98 4.98 6.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.27 2.67 4.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 6.00 7.80 10.75 4.20 5.45 No Bid 4.98 5.98 8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.40 4.00 6.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12X 9" SF 4.50 5.70 7.65 3.15 4.00 No Bid 4.85 5.70 9.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.40 4.00 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 6.50 8.30 11.25 4.55 5.80 No Bid 6.10 6.90 12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.10 6.00 9.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12'x 18" SF 8.00 10.40 14.25 5.60 7.30 No Bid 7.20 14.50 19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 12.00 15.60 21.40 8.40 10.95 No Bid 9.50 17.50 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.63 9.43 16.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

18" X 24" SF 16.00 20.75 28.50 11.20 14.55 No Bid 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 24.00 31.15 42.75 16.80 21.80 No Bid 19.55 24.10 42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.23 17.83 32.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

24" x 24" SF 21.35 27.68 38.00 14.95 19.40 No Bid 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 32.00 41.50 57.00 22.40 29.05 No Bid 25.40 29.80 52.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.94 23.74 43.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid

24'x 36" SF 32.00 41.50 57.00 22.40 29.05 No Bid 29.10 34.20 55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.13 22.93 42.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 48.00 62.26 85.50 33.60 43.60 No Bid 34.10 41.20 70.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.19 34.39 64.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30" x 24' SF 26.70 26.70 47.50 18.70 18.70 No Bid 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 40.00 40.00 71.25 28.00 28.00 No Bid 29.25 35.50 63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.58 29.58 54.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30" x 30" SF 33.40 43.25 59.40 23.40 30.30 No Bid 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 50.00 64.90 89.10 35.00 45.45 No Bid 35.31 45.63 77.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.42 35.92 67.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30" x 36" SF 40.05 51.90 71.25 28.05 36.35 No Bid 36.00 45.00 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 32.97 38.97 64.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 60.10 77.85 106.90 42.10 54.50 No Bid 43.00 55.00 89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.45 58.45 96.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

36" x 12" SF 16.00 20.75 285 11.20 14.55 No Bid 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF 24.00 31.15 4275 16.80 21.80 No Bid 19.55 24.00 42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.23 17.83 32.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

48" x 24" SF| 42.72 55.35 76.00 29.90 38.75 No Bid 38.00 45.60 73.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.91 41,57 68.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Page 3




DF] 64.00 83.00 114.00 44.80 58.10 No Bid 48.00 60.60 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.86 62.35 102.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" SF 85.45 110.75 152.00 59.80 77.55 No Bid 77.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF| 128.20 166.00 228.00 89.75 116.20 No Bid 89.60 105.00 187.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 129.34 148.54 228.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4'x8 SF 325.00 430.00 No Bid 227.50 301.00 No Bid 160.00 192.00 294.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 176.16 197.76 304.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DF| 487.50 645.00 No Bid 341.25 451.50 No Bid 190.00 250.00 395.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 258.24 296.64 456.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55) SPEED LIMIT
18" x 24" 10-40 MPH
(depending on Specs) 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 I 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 30" 10-40 MPH
(depending on Specs) 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 28.00 I 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
56) STOP AHEAD (Symbols & Words)
24" x 24" 17.95 28.50 42.00 12.60 19.95 29.40 | | 21.40 24.80 38.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.24 20.19 35.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 28.00 43.00 65.00 19.60 30.10 45.50 | | 32.31 37.63 59.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.47 30.20 54.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 50.00 63.00 95.00 35.00 44.10 66.50 | | 45.66 53.30 83.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.53 54.65 89.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid
57) STOP SIGNS
18" x 18" 14.78 18.50 27.95 10.35 12.95 19.57 | | 12.98 16.98 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.23 10.03 17.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 24" 16.95 22.50 34.95 11.87 15.75 24.50 | | 15.62 21.25 41.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.27 15.47 28.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 24" 26.00 35.00 54.00 18.20 24.50 37.80 | | 25.45 28.91 53.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.23 23.23 44.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 38.00 47.00 75.00 26.60 32.90 52.50 | | 36.46 41.63 77.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.06 45.26 75.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 90.00 110.00 150.00 63.00 77.00 105.00 | | 65.00 74.00 137.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
58) STOP STENCIL (Separate letters & one stencil)
36" x 36' | | 1/16" No Bid
Stencil | | No Bid
59) STREET NAME SIGNS (Legend to be on 1 - 2 sides)
6"x 18" 16.50 25.50 28.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.35- 7.67 6.99 - 8.99 8.60 - 13.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.19-12.07 12.70-18.35 |21.44-34.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 24" 16.50 25.50 28.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.13-10.22 8.21-11.98 11.46 - 18.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.19-12.07 12.07-18.35 | 21.44-34.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 x 30" 17.50 26.95 29.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.91/12.78 10.27-14.98  [14.33-23.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.19-12.07 12.70-18.35 | 21.44-34.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 36" 19.50 29.95 39.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.69 - 15.33 12.32-17.98 [17.20 - 27.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.19-12.09 12.70-18.35 [ 21.44-34.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
|60) SUPPLEMENT PLAQUES
12" x 6" 3.50 | 6.50 9.50 2.45 4.55 6.65 l 3.98 4.98 6.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.27 | 2.67 4.34 | | No Bid No Bid | No Bid
61) "T" INTERSECTION
24" x 24" 15.35 21.68 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 18.98 24.98 36.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.88 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
62) TIRE AREA
18" X 24" 11.50 | 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 l 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 | 11.89 21.90 | | No Bid NoBid | No Bid
[63) TRAFFIC SIGNS
9"X12" 6.18 11.46 15.57 3.70 5.80 7.90 4.85 5.70 9.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.40 4.00 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18' X 12' 8.60 12.00 17.00 6.00 8.40 11.90 7.35 8.78 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18' X 24" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 18" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 24" 15.35 21.70 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 19.40 22.80 36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 30" 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 28.00 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 36" 23.00 32.50 48.00 16.10 22.75 33.60 29.10 34.20 55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.13 22.93 42.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 36" 29.00 40.65 60.00 20.30 28.45 42.00 36.38 42.75 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.97 38.97 64.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" X 12" 11.50 16.20 24.00 10.85 13.25 19.75 14.55 17.10 27.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 24" 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.91 41.57 68.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
|64) TRASH AREA
18' X 24" 11.50 | 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 l 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 | 11.89 21.90 | | No Bid NoBid | No Bid
65) TRUCK CROSSING
36" x 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 43.65 51.63 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.20 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.88 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
66) WARNING SIGNS
9" X 12" 6.18 11.46 15.57 3.70 5.80 7.90 4.85 5.95 6.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.40 4.00 6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18' X 12' 8.60 12.00 17.00 6.00 8.40 11.90 7.35 8.78 14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.09 6.29 11.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 18" 11.50 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 24" 15.35 21.70 32.00 10.75 15.20 22.40 19.40 22.80 36.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.63 15.83 29.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 30" 19.00 27.00 40.00 13.30 18.90 28.00 24.25 28.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.72 19.72 36.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" X 36" 23.00 32.50 48.00 16.10 22.75 33.60 29.10 34.20 55.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.13 22.93 42.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 30" 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 23.95 44.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" x 12" 11.50 16.20 24.00 10.85 13.25 19.75 14.55 17.10 27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 11.89 21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" X 36" 34.50 48.80 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 43.66 51.30 82.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.50 46.40 76.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 24" 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 39.00 46.40 74.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.91 41.57 68.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" x 48" 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 72.60 91.20 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.23 99.03 152.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
67) WATER ON BRIDGE
30" x 30" | 24.00 | 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 30.31 35.63 57.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 | 2395 44.81 | | No Bid NoBid | No Bid
48" x 48" | 61.45 | 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 72.60 91.20 147.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.23 [ 99.03 152.43 | | No Bid No Bid [ No Bid
68) YIELD SIGN
30" x 30' x 30" | 27.00 [ 35.90 52.00 18.90 25.15 36.40 13.49 16.32 41.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.91 [ 1247 23.15 [ [ No Bid NoBid [ NoBid
36" x 36" x 36" 36.50 [ 50.80 74.00 25.55 35.55 51.80 19.10 21.37 98.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.58 | 1585 29.54 [ [ No Bid NoBid [ NoBid
69) "Y" INTERSECTION
30" x 307 24.00 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00 | 30.31 35.63 57.50 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.95 [ 2395 44.81 [ [ No Bid NoBid | Nobid JJj
70) YOUR TRASH MUST BE SECURE AT ALL TIMES
187X 24" | 11.50 [ 16.25 24.00 8.05 11.40 16.80 | | 14.55 17.10 27.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 | 11.89 21.90 | | No Bid No Bid | No Bid .
71) 3" CENTER PAVEMENT REFLECTORS-(Ceramic)
Amber No Bid No Bid
Clear No Bid No Bid
Red Or White No Bid No Bid

72) 4" CENTER PAVEMENT REFLECTORS-(Ceramic)
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Amber 1.50 3.95 No Bid
Clear 1.70 3.95 No Bid
Red or White 1.85 4.50 No Bid
73) BRACKETS & CAPS
Aluminum Brackets
6"& 9" buckle 16.95 No Bid No Bid
Cross Brackers 2" 3.50 3.79 5.5" |3.60
3" 8.50 3.78 3.60
Round Post Brackets 3.50 3.99 5.5" |3.92
i 8.50 5.25 5.06
U Post Brackets 2" 3.50 3.99 5.5" |3.60
3" 9.50 5.25 3.60
90° Bracket -4 Way Assy
(all types & size post &
sign height) 3.50 No Bid No Bid
45 °/ 180° Bracket -4
Way Assy (all types &
size post & sign height) 3.50 No Bid No Bid
Post Cap U Channel 3.50 3.99 3.60
Post Cap -
2" 3.50 3.99 3.92
3" 8.50 5.25 5.06
Post Cap-13/4 Sq Post
Flat Assy 5.25 4.90 4.39
3" Post Cap (Standard
3" pipe) 8.50 5.25 5.06
POST DOME
CAPS(Standard 3' pipe) 4.50 5.25 No Bid
Wing Bracket-All Sign
Plates straps or bolts to side of wall or pole 12" 13.00 | 18" 15.00 |24" 22.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard 16" Wing
Bracket 14" x 18 1/4" Metro#8 9.00 No Bid 14.5" 4.59
Heavy Duty 24" Wing
Bracket meto#800 16.00 No Bid 14.04
|74) BARRICADES
A-Frame 30" ht x 6" wt-
All Plastic Frames(SF
OR DF) SF N/B  DF 150.00 [SF 125.00 DF N/B No Bid SF 45.00 DF 52.00 |SF 55.00 DF 62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8' Type Il Orange or
Red/Wh Type A & C (DF) DF 310.00) 175.00 195.00 No Bid No Bid
10" Type IlI-
Barricade(DF) Sheeting 1
-2 SIDE) DF 351.00) 195.00 225.00 No Bid No Bid
Barricade Marker 24'x
24" 18"x18" 25.00 No Bid No Bid
Barricade Flasher 16.95 17.00 No Bid
Barricade Lights 16.95 17.00 No Bid
75) PANELS
96x 8" Reflective 1"
thick Orange/white 52.00 I 25.00 35.00 No Bid | ’ I No Bid |
76) TYPE I & IIl Typel Typelll
End Of Road wood g' No Bid 150.00 8' No Bid | 195.00 8' No Bid
10 No Bid 195.00 10 No Bid | 225.00 10' No Bid
12 No Bid 210.00 12 No Bid 255.00 12' No Bid
77) BARREL TAPE (WHITE, RED OR YELLOW)
2"x 50 yds 80.00 26.00 52.00 No Bid No Bid
4" x50 yds 160.00 52.00 104.00 No Bid No Bid
6" x 50 yds 240.00 78.00 156.00 No Bid No Bid
78) BARRICADE TAPE
Reflective Gen. Purpose 1"x30 yd 65.00 1"x30 yd No Bid 1"x30 yd [No Bid
Tape-Red, White & 2"x30yd | 135.00 2"x30yd | No Bid 2"x30 yd No Bid
Yellow (Rolls) 3'x30yd | 150.00 l 3"x30yd | No Bid 3"x30 yd No Bid
79) TYPE A & C ORANGE LEFT/RIGHT-TYPE llI
8" x 50 yd 232.00 | 300.00 No Bid | | 105.00 205.00 No Bid | | No Bid |
8" x 100 yd 464.00 [ 600.00 No Bid | [ I 210.00 410.00 No Bid | [ I No Bid [
80) FLEXIBLE ROAD MARKER
62" White Road
Marker w/white
reflector sheeting 38.00 3x9 13.95 14.95 16.95 No Bid
62" White Road
Market w/yellow
reflector sheeting 38.00 3x9 13.95 14.95 16.95 No Bid
Jiggle bars 6" 34" 12.95 No Bid No Bid
81) BARRIER FENCE & TAPE
Temporay Barrier
fence per ft. 0.55 No Bid No Bid
Temporay Barrier
fence Roll 4'x100' 43.00 4'x100' 55.00 No Bid
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Quick Fence Safety

System 52.00 No Bid No Bid
Industrial Grade Mil

Barrier Tape 9.95 No Bid No Bid
82) CONES (TRAFFIC

18" Plain, Bright

Orange top, black

base 7.25 5.60 4.45
28" Plain Bright

Orange top, black

base 11.25 7.95 7.39
36" Plain Bright

Orange top, black

base 18.95 12.80 17.17
28" Orange/Red Glow 11.25 No Bid No Bid
28" with Reflective

collars 15.95 T# 13.95 13.19
11 1/2" x 16" Decals 12.95 12.00 8.58 14.42 18.92

Chevrons 18" x 24" 11.50 16.25 24.00 21.00 9.49 11.89 21.90

83) DOUBLE ARROW

48" x 24" Yellow

Reflective Aluminum

Rectangle 31.00 43.40 64.00 No Bid .100 35.91 41.57 68.27

Municipal Emblems

(pressure sensitive) 12.95 No Bid No Bid
84) OBJECT MARKERS REFLECTIVE

6" x 24" 6.55 11.00 15.00 25.00 4.34 5.14 8.48

10" x 30" 11.95 14.10 17.10 27.60 7.17 8.84 15.79

12" x 36" 15.25 14.10 17.10 27.60 9.49 11.89 21.90

6" Dellineator Posts

(flexible) 38.00 1.12# 7.60 No Bid
Plastic

delineators(stand

alone) 42.00 No Bid No Bid
6" x 12" Bridge

Markers 4.25 3.95 5.95 10.95 2.21 2.61 4.28

Markers/Button

delineators 25.00 23.00 35.00 60.00 14.41 16.46 24.48

Round Plastic

Reflectors-Red 1.00 3" 0.75 0.57
Round Plastic

Reflectors-Amber 1.00 3" 0.75 0.57
Rectanglular

Reflectors 3' x 8" Type

A&C 5.50 3.95 5.95 10.95 No Bid
85) SAFETY FLAGS

Fluorescent wi/stiffener I

16"x16" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fluorescent wi/stiffener I

18"x18" 5.25 N/R 3.95 No Bid
24' Safety Flags 5.25 I No Bid No Bid
86) FOLDING SIGNS

24"x 24' Binder Signs

(folding sign) 32.00 No Bid No Bid
Portable stands(3&4

legs) Quadra flex 36'

stand 140.00 No Bid No Bid
8"x10" upright Sign

post 15.00 No Bid No Bid
Quad stands for Roll

Up Mesh sign 140.00 135.00 No Bid
30" x30" Roll Up Mest

Stop/Slow

Paddle(folding sign) collapsable  Jroll up 75.00 140.00 No Bid
87) STUB POST

Tubular Post 8" 15.95 16 g 13.46 No Bid
Tubular Post 10" 18.95 169 16.85 No Bid
Tubular Post 12" 21.25 169 20.19 No Bid
Square Post 2"x2" x 12'> 35.00 No Bid No Bid
88) SIGN ASSEMBLY HARDWARE

Locknuts 0.25 0.10 No Bid
anti-theft Bolts 0.25 0.65 No Bid
5/16 Bolts 2 1/2 x 3' 0.35 0.45 No Bid
1/4 Bolts 2' 0.35 0.35 No Bid
1/4" Screws for

Brackets (blade

holders) bx/100 5.93 0.20 No Bid
Srew set (vandle

proof) bx/100 11.00 0.39 No Bid

189) U CHANNEL
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Estimated Delivery Time for Non-Standard (Not In-Stock) - Small Orders: 2 weeks

Large Orders: 30 Days

Estimated Delivery Time for Non-Standard (Not In-Stock) - Small Orders: 14-21 Days

Large Orders: 21-28 Days

Estimated Delivery Time for Non-Standard (Not In-Stock) -

Small Orders: 21 Days

Large Orders: 30 Days

12' x 3" heavy guage

(green) 37.00 2#ILF 18.59 No Bid

U Shape Galvanized

10 ft 31.68 18.58 No Bid

12 fi 38.02 22.30 No Bid

Safety Spice Uchannel

Sign Post System 37.00 12.00 No Bid

90) DOME DRUMS

Super Dome Drums 44.00 Top ony 40.00 45.00 No Bid No Bid

Molded Rubber Base 25 Ibs 28.86 40# 35.00 No Bid

Blue Net Sheeting 15' No Bid No Bid No Bid

4" Transfer Tape 13.28 16.00 No Bid

91) SPEED BUMPS

6' Speed Bump

(plastic) 112.50 125.00 No Bid

9" Speed Bump

(plastic) 157.50 205.00 No Bid

6' Speed Bump Yellow

& Black (plastic) 194.92 255.00 No Bid

[92) EPOXY

1 Gal. Epoxy Kit 97.00 95.00 No Bid

5 Gal. Epoxy Kit No Bid 425.00 No Bid

Epoxy Pads 4"x4" 1.50 8"x8" 0.95 No Bid

Epoxy Quick Sticks 19.95 5.00 No Bid

[93) mISC.

Slow Moving Vehicle-

040 Aluminum 9.95 25.00 30.00 No Bid

Slow Moving Vehicle-

Decal (triangle) 6.95 25.00 30.00 No Bid

Keep Back 500 Feet

33" x 3" Reflective Decal 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tape-Caution Buried

Electrical Lines 3'x1000 [ 14.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8' x 4' MDO Specialty

Sign single sided |non reflec| 285.00 160.00 224.00 352.00 No Bid

6" x 50 yds Roll of EG-

Engineer Grade Vinyl 101.00 78.00 No Bid

6' x 50 yds Roll of HIP-

High Intensity

Prismatic 157.50 150.00 No Bid

Post Driver 325.00 manual> | 395.00 No Bid

18" Double Faced

Hand Paddles 16.95 30.00 45.00 No Bid No Bid
[ ]
[ ]

Estimated Delivery Time for Statndard (In-Stock) signs: _2-5 Days Estimated Delivery Time for Statndard (In-Stock) signs: 3-5 Days Estimated Delivery Time for Statndard (In-Stock) signs: ~ _3-5 Days
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