Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: All Precincts and Facilities Management
Hidalgo County Pepartments

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept,

DATE: June 09, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-028B-04-27-5GS-Hidalgo County (All Funding Sources}-“ADDITIONAL WELDING

SUPPLIES AND MISC.EQUIPMENT”

We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulaticn
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence io award the low bidder meeting ali
specifications/requirements and refurn to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, Jupe 16, 2011@10:00
A.M. in grder to plice this item on_the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesda

June 28,2011,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me al 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 8. Business Highway 281
New Administration Bailding

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: All Precincts and Facilitics Management
Hidalgo County Departments

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer [l
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: June 09,201]

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-028B-04-27-SGS-Hidalgo County {Al] Funding Sources)-*ADDITIONAL WELDING

SUPPLIES AND MISC.EQUIPMENT”

We have received one (1) response (o the above memioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response far your review and concurrence.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence to award the [ow bidder meeting all

specifications/requiremenis and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-262% or (956) 292~
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, June 16, 2011@@10:00

lace this item on Lhe agenda Jor nexi Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesda

June 28,2611,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate 1o cal! me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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Hidalge County Purcluasing Office
2812 8, Business Highway 281
New Administration Buoilding

Edinhury, Texas 78530
(956) 318-26206/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: All Precinets and Facilities Management
Hidalgo County Departmuents

FROM:  Samdy Suarez, Buyer 1]
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dup,

DATE:  June (9, 20011

IRE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 201 1-0288-04-27-SGS-Hidalge County (Al Funding Sourtes)-*ADDITIONAL WELDING
SUPPLIES AND MISC.EQUIPMENT

We have received ane (1) response 1o the above mentioned project. Enclesed you will find a copy oi the bubation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrenee,

Please acknowledge by signing Delow, your concurrence 1w award the low  Didder mecting  all
specificationsirequirements and return 10 the Porchasing Depl. via_fax o (956)-318-2629 ar (956) 2Y2.
2612 or email:  sandv.suarez@ co.hidalgo.txus by no Jater than Thursday, June 16, 201 147 10:00
AL in order to place this item on the agenda foc next Commissioners Court eeling, ‘Tuesday,

Should you hive any questions or require firtier informtion please do not hesiine w call me at 118-26326- ext.
ARA0, Thank you fur your attemtion and cooperation to this matter,
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 3182629

MEMORANDUM

TO: All Precincts and Facilities Management
Hidalge County Departments

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: June 09,2011
RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE REQUEST

Bid No. 201 1-028B-04-27-SGS-Hidalgo County {All Funding Sources)-“ADDITIONAL WELDING
SUPPLIES AND MISCEQUIPMENT”

We have received one (I) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find 2 copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concucrence.

Piease acknowledge by signing below, your concumence to award the low bidder meeting all

specifications/requirements and return. to the Purchasing Dept. yia fax to (956)-318-2629 or {956) 292-
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.(x.u no later than Thursday, June I§, 2011@10:00

A.M. in order to place this jtem on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,
June 28, 2011,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 313-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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LY O, Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
{956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: All Precincts and Facilifies Management
Hidalgo County Departments

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: June (95,2011

RE:  BID AWARD CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-028B-04-27-8GS-Hidalgo County (All Funding Sources)-“ADDITIONAL WELDING
SUPPLIES AND MISC.EQUIPMENT”

‘We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence.

Please acknowledge by signing below, yowr comcwrrence fo award the low bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and retumn to the Purchasing Dept. yia fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalge.tx.us by no later than Thursday, June 16, 2011@10:00
A.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesda

June 28, 2011,

Shouid you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank yon for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: Anacleto Mariinez, Chief Duty

Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility m E @ E il w I'E
ATTN: Juan Tapia ,Procurement Specialist Jﬂ _

: JUN 21 201
FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I

Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept. By é f " zz 2

DATE: June 09, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-028B-04-27-5GS-Hidalgo County (All Funding Sources)-“ADDITIONAL WELDING
SUPPLIES AND MISC.EQUIPMENT”

We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and concurrence.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurence to award to the low bidder meeting all

“specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-" "~ "~
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, June 16, 2011 @10:00
AM. in order to place this item on the agenda for next Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,

June 28, 2011,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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TABULATION SHEET

HIDALGO COUNTY
“ADDITIONAL WELDING SUPPLIES AND MISC. EQUIPMENT?
BID NO. 2011-028B-04-27-SGS | BUYER: SANDY SUAREZ
SOLE BIDDER
ITEM DESCRIPTIONS SGS INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLIES
. o
SIZE | CASE/ BID PRICE
UNITS
1. Alloy 144 Brass Electrode 1/8 1LB No Bid
5/32 | LB No Bid
SIZES
2.No. 1 AWG-Cable (by feet) copper I 2,74 1t
2 241 ft
4 1.88 ft
1/0 3401t
2/0 3.94 1t
3/0 No Bid
4/0 5.82 ft
3. Brazing Alloy Safety Silv - 15% No Bid
4. Tig Weld Rods 30”- 36 (mild steel) 1116 20.37 36"-10 b bx
ER-70S 6 3/32 17.68 36™-10 b bx
1/8 16.83 36™-101b bx
5/32 16.83 36-10 lb bx
5. Stainless steel ER-308-L 1/16 57.93 36™-10 1b bx
3/32 56.71 36”-101b bx
1/8 55.49 36"-101b bx
5/32 5549 36"-101b bx
6. Aluminum ER-4043 1/16 48.17 36™-101b bx
3/32 3171 36"-101b bx
1/8 30.49 36™-101b bx
5/32 32.93 36™-101b bx
7. Aluminum ER- 5356 1716 48.17 36"-101b bx
3132 32.93 36"-10 1b bx
178 3171 36™-10 b bx
5/32 32.93 36"-101b bx
8. Mild Steel ER-80S6 1/16 No Bid
3/32 No Bid
1/8 No Bid
5/32 No Bid
9. Doo- Rag Cap and/or Beanies Flame- Retardant 4.15 ea.
10. Welding Blanket Coated Fiberglass 6x4 No Bid
and Acrylic Coated 3oz 6x6 No Bid
6x8 No Bid
6x 10 No Bid
8x8 No Bid
8§x10 No Bid
10x 10 No Bid
11. Plastic Rod Canister (Rod Guards) 16" No Bid
{water tight-tig brazing rods)
12. Torch Brass 5/32 1 LB No Bid
1/8 1LB No Bid
13. Torch RD-45 1/8 Steel 1LB No Bid
5/32 iLB No Bid
14. Argon — CO2 75-25%-Mig welder-
mild steel 20 No Bid
40 No Bid
§0 No Bid
100 No Bid
15. Torch Gauges-Replacement Gauges OXYGEN HIGH
for reguiators are preferred
Victor CSR150CR 27 gauge No Bid
2 1/2" gauge
No Bid




OXYGEN LOW

2" pauge No Bid
2 1/2" gauge No Bid
ACETYLENE HIGH
2" gauge No Bid
2 1/2" gauge No Bid
ACETYLENE LOW
2” gauge No Bid
2 1/2” pauge No Bid
16. Nozzle tip protector-{siip on type for No Rid

Millermatic 135)

17. Sanding Disc-Screw On- (med. Coarse

HUB STYLE4 ¥ X 5/8" X 11

grid-Zircowia flap disc) Z-40 6.70
Z-60 6.70
Z-80 6.70
Z-100 No Bid
HUB LESS 4 % X 7/8"
Z-40 5.98
Z-60 5.98
Z-80 5.98
Z-108 No Bid
18. Adaptor for Flux Core No Bid
19. Female Terminals No Bid
20, Nozzle tip for shield gas No Bid
21, Flux cored welding wire (used with 030 1LB No Bid
Shielding gas) 10LB No Bid
035 1LB No Bid
10LB No Bid
22. Flux coated (ET-IT-GS) mild steel .030 1LB 533
10LB 45,12
035 I[LB 5.00
10 LB 43.91
23. Stainless Steel (ER 308LSI) 11b 030 No Bid
24. High Purity Regulator for Nitrogen No Bid
25. Shaft Knot wheel brush CRIMPED
Carbon 014 No Bid
020 No Bid
Stainless .014 No Bid
steel 020 No Bid
KNOTTED
Carbon .04 No Bid
020 No Bid
Stainless . 014 No Bid
steel 020 No Bid
26, Mig Welding Machine SINGLE FACE
120 volt No Bid
single & triple face 120 volt No Bid
208 volt No Bid
240 volis No Bid
TRIPLE FACE
120 volt No Bid
180 volt No Bid
208 volt No Bid
240 volts No Bid
27. Welding Screens 75"w x 5’h No Bid
28. Tri-Gas Argon-CO2-Helium CYLINDER SIZE
7.5%- 2.5-90% for stainless steel 20 No Bid
40 No Bid
80 No Bid
100 No Bid
125 No Bid
200 No Bid
300 No Bid
29. Refill of Co. owned cylinders- Argon CO2 Tri-Gas Nitrogen
Argon CO2-Tri-Gas-Nitrogen 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid




HIDALGO ™

PuxXTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

UNTY PURCHASING DEPART?} )'\IT

BID OPENING DATE:

April 27, 2011

BID OPENING TIME: 9:3¢ A.M

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: ___HIDALGO COUNTY (All Sources, Programs and Entities ) © ADDITIONAL WELDING

SUPPLIES and MISC. EQUIPMENT”
BID NO: 2011-028B-04-27-SGS

NAME OF BIDDER:
COMPANY/FIRM

BID
REQUEST
VIA*

SIGNATURE (IF
APPLICABLE)
OR INITIALS OF STAFF
ADDRESSING MAIL OUT

DATE

PHYSICAL ADDRESS
CITY-STATE-ZIP
PHONE & FAX NO.s

1.} Weldinghouse, Inc.
Attn: Roel Davila

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

2901 N. Sugar Rd.

Pharr, TX. 78577

P# 682-6844 F# 631-8749
rdavila@weldinghouse.com

2.) Alrgas
" Attn: Rey Garcia Jr.

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

200 N, 23" St,

McAllen, TX. 78501

P# 956-686-7622 FF# 956-682-6936
donald.martinez{@atrgas.com

3.} AOC Welding Supply
Attn: Fernando

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

2508 8. 23" St.
McAllen, TX. 78501
P# 956-682-0181 F# 956-682-5338

fernando@aoctx.com

4.) United Welding Supply
Attn: Frank

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

3206 Richasrson Rd. Ste E.
Edinburg, TX. 78541
P#956-316-1198 F# 316-1158

{imel@@msn.com

5.) Scott-Gross Company, Inc.
Attn: Ted Osborn, Jr. Branch Mgr.

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

704 Holtes Street

Frankfort, KY 40601
P#502-227-8257 F#502-227-8258
frank fort@scottgross.com

6.) Discount Iron Works

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/201

144 Souix Rd.

Alamo, TX. 78516

P# 956-787-7033 or 227-1211
agonzalezdiw@sbcglobal.net

mgonzalezdiw@sbceglobal.net

7.} Retco Alloy Co.
Attn: Jeff Holm

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

820 Sivert Dr.
P#800-722-3307 F#888-422-3307
jelfiedretcoalloy.com

8.) Prime Vendor Inc.
Aitn; Carysa Morse

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

4622 Cedar Ave Ste # 123
Wilmington, N.C. 28403-4429
P# 300-746-9554 Fit800-746-8307

Bids | 7@prime-vendor.com

10) MATHESON TRI-GAS
Attn: Reynaldo Rivera

IP

Sandy Suarez

04/11/2011

1801 W. Highway 77

San Benito, TX, 78586

P# 956-399-2706 F#956-399-6045
CH956-867-1331

rriverg@matheson-tirgas.com

11) SGS INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES
Atin: Rick Pena

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/13/2011

5312 N. Cage
Pharr, TX. 78577
956-227-5312

rpena@sesindustrial.com

12} Burton Companies
Attn: Eliberto Hernandez

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

04/27/2011

956-686-3725
C#956-650-9682 FA#956-686-6520
ghernandez be@gmail.com

*V]A:
IN PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL (EM)



