HIDALGO COUNTY

RFSQ TABULATION - “FIBERGLASS MANHOLES”

RFSQ NO: 11-080-06-08-YSI

ENDOR NAME: | HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS VENDOR NAME: | FERGUSON
Size | 42" 48" 54" 60" 72" 92" 42" 48" 54" 60" 72" 92 84"
diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter diameter
3 $874.52 $ 935.28 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,033.36 $1,048.91 | $1,108.02 | $1,205.58 $1,308.02 $2,827.80
4 $956.63 $1,031.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,114.47 $1,142.24 | $1,510.02 | $1,557.80 $1,684.47 $3,183.36
5’ $1,023.30 | $1,123.00 | $1,849.76 | $1,941.68 | $2,308.56 NO BID $1,193.36 $1,231.13 | $1,605.58 | $1,671.13 $1,903.36 $3,538.91
6’ $1,131.57 | $1,218.81 | $1,960.37 | $2,031.25 | $2,531.34 NO BID $1,312.24 $1,324.47 | $1,701.13 | $1,785.58 $2,145.58 $3,894.47
7 $1,207.91 | $1,316.18 | $2,073.32 | $2,186.27 | $2,754.12 | $3,464.52 $1,396.69 $1,416.69 | $1,846.21 | $1,900.02 $2,421.13 $4,250.02
8’ $1,285.80 | $1,406.54 | $2,155.89 | $2,396.89 | $2,976.89 | $3,756.62 $1,480.02 $1505.58 $1,892.24 | $2,121.13 $2,594.47 $4,605.58
9’ $1,363.70 | $1,503.13 | $2,225.99 | $2,575.74 | $3,198.90 | $4,273.07 $1,563.36 $1,598.91 | $1,988.91 | $2,300.02 $2,917.80 $4,961.13
10' | $1,440.03 | $1,594.27 | $2,295.32 | $2,858.50 | $3,421.68 | $4,580.75 $1,648.91 $1,686.69 | $2,084.47 | $2,535.58 $3,100.02 $5,438.91
11’ | $1,579.47 | $1,685.40 | $2,363.87 | $3,015.07 | $3,645.23 | $4,897.00 $1,796.69 $1,775.58 | $2,180.02 | $2,718.91 $3,285.58 $5,872.24
12" | $1,743.82 | $1,776.54 | $2,433.97 | $3,212.40 | $3,867.23 | $5,205.47 $1,963.36 $1,863.36 | $2,275.58 | $2,989.54 $3,470.02 $6,285.58
13" | $1,826.39 | $1,888.71 | $2,502.52 | $3,346.12 | $4,023.02 | $5,513.15 $2,056.69 $1,974.47 | $2,371.13 | $3,145.58 $3,653.36 $6,708.91
14’ | $1,914.41 | $1,964.27 | $2,589.76 | $3,505.80 | $4,241.13 | $5,820.83 $2,150.02 $2,046.69 | $2,467.80 | $3,290.02 $3,837.80 $7,132.24
15 | $2,001.65 | $2,049.17 | $2,694.92 | $3,731.70 | $4,388.35 | $6,136.31 $2,244.47 $2,127.80 | $2,563.36 | $3,548.91 $4,022.24 $7,555.58
16’ | $2,088.90 | $2,124.73 | $2,806.31 | $3,904.62 | $4,603.34 | $6,444.77 $2,337.80 $2,202.24 | $2,660.02 | $3,697.80 $4,204.47 $7,978.91
17" | $2,176.92 | $2,237.68 | $2,916.92 | $4,072.10 | $4,818.33 | $6,752.45 $2,431.13 $2,310.02 | $2,754.47 | $3,848.91 $4,390.02 $8,402.24
18 | $2,258.71 | $2,338.16 | $3,027.53 | $4,241.13 | $5,032.54 | $7,060.92 $2,522.24 $2,410.02 | $2,851.13 | $4,000.02 $4,573.36 $8,825.58
19" | $2,345.95 | $2,429.30 | $3,139.70 | $4,409.38 | $5,254.97 | $7,368.60 $2,616.69 $2,497.80 | $2,946.69 | $4,148.91 $4,756.69 $9,248.91
20" | $2,433.19 | $2,504.07 | $3,251.87 | $4,577.63 | $5,460.18 | $7,677.07 $2,707.80 $2,570.02 | $3,041.13 | $4,298.91 $4,941.13 $9,676.69
21’ | $2,593.65 | $2,636.50 | $3,367.15 | $4,741.99 | $5,682.96 | $7,985.53 $2,816.69 $2,673.36 | $3,166.69 | $4,487.80 $5,162.24 $10,104.47
22" | $2,676.22 | $2,733.86 | $3,477.76 | $4,899.34 | $5,897.95 | $8,293.99 $2,923.31 $2,774.47 | $3,292.24 | $4,772.24 $5,494.47 $10,523.36
23" | $2,758.79 | $2,830.45 | $3,588.37 | $5,057.47 | $6,113.15 | $8,602.45 $2,991.13 $2,876.69 | $3,417.80 | $5,008.91 $5,771.13 $10,946.69
24" | $2,840.58 | $2,921.59 | $3,701.32 | $5,214.81 | $6,327.15 | $8,909.36 $3,085.58 $2,978.91 | $3,543.36 | $5,245.58 $6,047.80 $11,370.02
25" | $2,923.15 | $3,017.40 | $3,811.93 | $5,372.94 | $6,541.36 | $9,217.04 $3,180.02 $3,081.13 | $3,668.91 | $5,482.24 $6,324.47 $11,793.36
Is Custom manhole fabrication with PVC/stubouts/bottoms/bench and Is Custom manhole fabrication with PVC/stubouts/bottoms/bench and
inverts and 12" high manhole cone neck extensions available? YES inverts and 12" high manhole cone neck extensions available? YES
(*see prices below)
| *$584.21 | *$748.42 *$960.00 *$1,240.00 *$1,737.89 *$2,620.00
Stubout for 12” $512.22 Stubout for 12" $362.67
Stubout for 15” $626.42 Stubout for 15” $433.33
Stubout for 18” $790.06 Stubout for 18” $505.33
Stubout for 24" NO BID Stubout for 24” $646.67
Stubout for 30” NO BID Stubout for 30” $866.67




