












HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
BID TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office 

DESCRIPTION OF BID: “Commissary Supplies” 

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE  15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

BID NO:  2011-083-06-15-SMA BUYER: Sandra Montalvo 

NAME OF COMPANY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT  

1.  

 

R&R DISTRIBUTING-RENE LUCIO √ 

2.  KEEFE SUPPLY √ 

3.  REGAL GREETINGS CO.-LATE BID 
 

4.  ICS- LATE BID 
 

5.  

  

6.  

  

7.  

  

8.  

  

9.  

  

10.  

  

11.  

  

12.  
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG 

BID OPENING DATE:    June 15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M. 
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:  Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies               

BID NO.: 2011-083-06-15-SMA Buyer:  Sandra Montalvo 

NAME OF VENDOR 
COMPANY/FIRM 

BID 
REQUEST 

*VIA 

SIGNATURE (IF 
APPLICABLE) 

OR  INITIALS OF 
STAFF 

DATE MAILING ADDRESS, PHONE No &  
E-MAIL ADDRESS 

 
1)  

KEEFE SUPPLY CO. 
Attn: Blake Taylor 

BLM Sandra Montalvo 05/31/11 

3101 Marquis Dr. Suite 200 
Garland, Tx75042 
800-593-0039 
972-272-5387 fax 
btaylor@keefegroup.com 

2)  VALLEY  BOTTLE WATER, LLC 
Attn: Martin Hernandez 

BLM/ 
EMAIL Sandra Montalvo 05/31/11 

109 N. FM 509 
Harlingen, Tx 
(O)956-423-2107 
(F)956-428-6615 
Martin.hernandez@onetacc.com 

3)  R & R DISTRIBUTING 
Attn: Rene Lucio 

BLM/ 
EMAIL Sandra Montalvo 05/31/11 

5705 E. Texas Rd. 
Edinburg, Tx  78542 
956-451-1831 
956-287-9614 fax 
roselucio@sbcglobal.net 

4)  SWANSON SERVICES CORPORATION 
Attn: Tom Cardenas Or Maddie Synnott EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/01/11 

1133 Pennsylvania Street 
Denver, CO 80203 
Phone - (303) 832-3920 
Fax - (303) 832-7795 
E-mail - sscmarketing@swansons.net 
 masynnott@swansons.net 

5)  
SHAVER FOODS, LLC 
Attn:  Krista Kidd EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/01/11 

1419 S Beechwood Ave 
Fayetteville, AR 72701 
P: 479-442-6340 x 343 
F: 479-582-3578 
krista.kidd@shaverfoods.com 
bids@shaverfoods.com 

6)  PROPAC, INC. 
Attn:  Karen Larrison EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/01/11 

2390 Air Park Road 
N. Charleston, SC 29406 
Phone: 800-345-3036 x 224 
Fax: 888-877-6722 
klarrison@propacusa.com 

7)  TELEPRO COMMUNICATIONS  
 Attn:  Jesse Rodriguez  EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/02/11 

3315 N. Ware Rd.  
McAllen, TX 78501 
956-618-2360 
telepro@sbcglobal.net 

8)  PRESCRIPTION SUPPLY 
Attn:  William VanMetre EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/01/11 

11720 Marksberry lane unit D 
Cincinnati, Ohio 45249 
fax to 1-513-353-0538 
wvanmetre@prescriptionsupply.com 

9)  
EARLY BIRD POULTRY DISTRIBUTORS, 
LLC 
Attn:  Natalia Bury 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/01/11 

521 N Bentsen Palm Dr 
Mission, Tx 78572 
956-585-5858 
Fax # 956-584-8451 
e-mail earlybird50@att.net 

10)  
 

SHOE CORPORATION OF BIRMINGHAM 
Attn:  Brad Isbell EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/06/11 

3221 1st Ave. N. 
Birmingham, Al. 35222 
Ph: 205-326-2800 
Fax: 205-326-2808 
http://www.shoecorp.com 

11)  PRIME VENDOR INC EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/06/11 

4622 Cedar Avenue, Suite 123 
Wilmington, North Carolina 28403-4429 
Phone: 800 746-9554   
Fax: 800 746-8307 
bids17@prime-vendor.com 
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG 

BID OPENING DATE:    June 15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M. 
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:  Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies               

BID NO.: 2011-083-06-15-SMA Buyer:  Sandra Montalvo 

NAME OF VENDOR 
COMPANY/FIRM 

BID 
REQUEST 

*VIA 

SIGNATURE (IF 
APPLICABLE) 

OR  INITIALS OF 
STAFF 

DATE MAILING ADDRESS, PHONE No &  
E-MAIL ADDRESS 

12)  AMERICAN AMENITIES, INC. 
Attn:  Larry Kong 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/07/11 

17280 Woodinville-Redmond  
Road NE Ste#804 
Woodinville, WA 98072 
Tel. 425-489-1899 
Fax. 425-487-2939 
Email: larry@aai-info.com 

13)  MOORE MEDICAL LLC 
Attn:  Bonnie Irish 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/08/11 

1690 New Britain Avenue 
PO Box 4066 
Farmington, CT 06034-4066 
Tel 1.800.234.1464 Ext. 5393 
Fax 1.877.354.5916 
Email birish@mooremedical.com 
www.mooremedical.com 

14)  JENNY SERVICE COMPANY 
Attn:  Silvanna Smith 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/10/11 

Toll free 888-358-8696 
Fax 775-358-6767 
Cell 562-964-7203 
 Silvannasmith@jennyservicecompany.com 

15)  
MAXIMA SUPPLY LLC 
Attn:  Wayne T. Elliott 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/13/11 

3909 Holt Rd,  
Holt, Michigan     48842 
PH   877-662-9462 
FX    800-695-7095 
welliott@maximasupply.net 

16)  
ELLIOTT APPAREL INC. 
Attn:  Cara Schuerman EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/13/11 

7704 Lanac Street 
Lansing, Michigan 48917 
Phone: 1(888) 968-9327 
Fax: 1 (888) 467-8259 
Cara@ElliottApparel.com 

17)  
REGAL GREETINGS & GIFTS CO.  
Attn:  Maryam Rahbari 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/14/11 

9293 Ninth St.  
Rancho Cucamonga, Ca. 91730  
Tel: (909) 466-7071 x-102  
Fax: (909) 466-7074  
email : regalgreetings@verizon.net 

18)  
ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC. 
Attn:  Lauriann Williams 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 06/14/11 

P.O. Box 21056 
Waco, TX 76702 
800-524-5427 
254-751-1566 
254-751-0299 fax 
WWW.ICSWACO.NET 

 *VIA: 
IN PERSON (IP) 
TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR) 
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM) 
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR) 
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
BID TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office “Commissary Supplies”  

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE  15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

BID NO:  2011-083-06-15-SMA BUYER: Sandra Montalvo 

LIST OF ITEMS 

R&R 
Distributing 

Edinburg, Tx 

KEEFE SUPPLY 
Garland, Tx 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

1.  Hygiene Kit ( 4” T-Brush / T-Paste 1.05 oz. / Deodorant(0.05oz)  $ 1.29 --------- 
2.  Almond Joy Bar 1.61.oz $ 0.63 $0.62 
3.  Baby Ruth 2.1 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
4.  Butter Finger Bar 2.1 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
5.  Snickers Almond Bar 1.76 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
6.  Milky Way Bar 2.05 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
7.  Pay Day Bar 1.85 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
8.  Snickers Bar 2.07 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
9.  3 Musketeers Bar 2.13 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 

10.  Skittles “Original Fruits” 2.17 oz. bag $ 0.63 $0.62 
11.  M & M Peanuts 1.74 oz. bag $ 0.63 $0.62 
12.  Twix Bar 2.0 oz. $ 0.63 $0.62 
13.  Peanut Pattie 1.75 oz. $ 0.63 NO BID 
14.  Reese’s Peanut Butter Cups 1.5 oz.  $ 0.63 $0.62 
15.  Ramen Soups 3 oz. Clear Pack (chili,beef,chicken,Shrimp Chili 

Lime Shrimp, Spicy Chicken, Spicy Beef)  $ 0.20 $0.19 
16.  Chili Corn Nuts-1.4 oz $ 0.49 $0.40 
17.  Ranch Corn Nuts -1.4 oz $ 0.49 $0.40 
18.  Salted Peanuts 1.75 oz. bag $ 0.39 $0.24 
19.  Chunk Light Tuna 4.23 oz. Pouch $-0- $0.85 
20.  Refried Beans Resealable Pouch 6 oz. $-0- $0.80 
21.  Jalapeno Cheese Spread 8 oz. Plastic Tub $-0- $0.90 
22.  Beef Jerky Stick 2 oz. $0.89 $1.18  

(KC masterpiece 2 oz) 

23.  Jelly (Grape & Strawberry) 12 oz. Squeeze Bottle $-0- 
$1.68 

(jelly-grape/strawberry) 20.5 oz squeeze 
bottle) 

24.  Peanut Butter Squeezers 1.12 oz.  $-0- $0.16 
25.  Chili No Beans 11.25oz. Pouch $-0- $1.07 
26.  Chili w/Beans 11.25oz. Pouch $-0- $1.07 
27.  Hot Chili w/Beans 11.25 oz. Pouch $-0- $1.07 
28.  Roast Beef & Gravy 10 oz. Pouch $ -0- $2.15 
29.  Sardines in Hot Tomato Sauce 3.53oz. Pouch $-0- $0.75 
30.  Fish Fillets 3.53oz. Pouch $-0- $0.75 
31.  B.B.Q. Potato Chips 1.5 oz. bag $ 0.39 $0.24 
32.  Flaming Hot Cheetos 1.5oz. bag $ 0.39 $0.34 

(flaming hot cheetos 1.75 oz. bag) 

33.  BBQ Corn Chips 1.5oz. bag $ 0.39 $0.24 
(hot BBQ corn chips 1.5 oz. bag) 

34.  Doritos Nacho Cheese 1.5oz $ 0.39 $0.34 
(Doritos nacho cheese 1.75 oz.bag) 
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
BID TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office “Commissary Supplies”  

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE  15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

BID NO:  2011-083-06-15-SMA BUYER: Sandra Montalvo 

LIST OF ITEMS 

R&R 
Distributing 

Edinburg, Tx 

KEEFE SUPPLY 
Garland, Tx 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

35.  Tortilla Chips 12 oz. bag $ 1.45 $0.94 
(CA round tortilla chips 12oz. bag) 

36.  Tostadas 12oz. pack $ 1.59 NO BID 
37.  Tabikos or Takis 4 oz. bag $ 0.89 $1.15 

(takis 4oz. Nitro & fuego flavors) 
38.  Hot/Spicy Pork Cracklings 2 oz.  $ 0.89 $0.53 
39.  Snack Crackers 12 oz. box $-0- $1.48 

40.  Cookies (duplex/vanilla/chocolate/strawberry) 6 oz. Tray $0.59 
$0.42 

(zippy cakes cookies duplex/vanilla)6oz 
ray 

41.  Zinger Cremes 4 oz. pack $0.69 NO BID 
42.  Cinnamon Rolls 4 oz. pk $0.69 $0.42 
43.  Honey Bun  6oz. pk $0.69 $0.45 
44.  Chocolate Cupcakes (2-pk) – 4 oz.  $0.69 $0.50 
45.  Moon pies (banana/strawberry/chocolate) 2.75 oz. $0.49 $0.33 
46.  Cherry/Strawberry Danish $0.69 $0.42 
47.  Coca Cola Classic 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.20 $0.88 
48.  Sprite 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.20 $0.88 
49.  Fanta Orange 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.20 $0.80 
50.  Dr. Pepper 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.20 $0.88 
51.  Diet Coke 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.20 $0.80 
52.  Diet Dr. Pepper  20 z. plastic bottle $1.20 $0.88 
53.  Maxwell House Instant Coffee 4 oz. Resealable Clear Pouch $-0- $2.35 
54.  Coffee Mug w/Lid 14 oz.  $-0- $1.10 
55.  Hot Cocoa Mix 1oz. bag $-0- $0.13 
56.  Cereal Bowl w/Lid 24 oz.  $-0- $0.52 
57.  Ozarka Spring Water 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.39 $0.55 
58.  Sugar Cubes 1 1b. bx $2.39 $1.55 
59.  Grey Sweatshirts (small thru 4XL) $3.29 $9.90 
60.  White Sport Bras (medium thru 3XL) $6.99 $2.25 
61.  White Boxer Shorts (small thru 6XL) $2.99 $2.35 
62.  White Thermal Underwear Set (small thru 6XL) $-0- NO BID 
63.  Men White Crew Neck T-shirts (Small thru 6XL) $3.19 $2.55 
64.  White Men Briefs (small thru 5XL) $2.39 $1.65 
65.  Men’s/Ladies Crew Socks (one size fits all) $-0- $0.78 
66.  White Ladies Panties (Size 5 thru 18) $4.29 ------- 
67.  White Men’s/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes (Size 6-13) $-0- NO BID 
68.  Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) 50 ct. bx $0.55 $0.42 

(2-pack) 

69.  Advil Coated (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. box $.055 $0.42 
(2-pack) 
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
BID TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office “Commissary Supplies”  

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE  15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

BID NO:  2011-083-06-15-SMA BUYER: Sandra Montalvo 

LIST OF ITEMS 

R&R 
Distributing 

Edinburg, Tx 

KEEFE SUPPLY 
Garland, Tx 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

70.  Motrin Ibuprofen (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. bx $.055 NO BID 
71.  Tums $1.10 $0.32 
72.  Anti Shank Security Toothbrush & Clear Cap $-0- NO BID 
73.  Anti-Shank Security Razor – Single Edge $-0- $0.21 
74.  Jolly Ranchers 3.7 oz. Assorted Bag $1.39 $0.55 

(3.7oz..bag) 
75.  Sunflower Kernels 4 oz. Bag $0.92 $0.50 
76.  Starlite Mints 3.75 oz. Bag $1.99 $0.36 
77.  Elastic Pony Tails 18 ct. pk-black $0.29 $0.60 
78.  St. Valentines Cards (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
79.  Happy Easter Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
80.  Happy Mother’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
81.  Father’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
82.  Happy Birthday Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
83.  Thanksgiving Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
84.  Christmas Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $-0- $0.75 each 
85.  Oral Pain Relief 0.33 oz. Tube $-0- $0.95 
86.  Alcohol – Free Mouthwash 8 oz. Plastic Bottle $-0- $0.61 
87.  Alcohol – Free Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic Bottle $-0- $1.58  

(next1 hair gel 15oz.) 
88.  Athletes Foot Cream 0.05 oz. Tube $-0- $1.05 
89.  Hydrocortisone Cream 1 oz. Tube $-0- $0.99 
90.  Chap Stick Lip Balm 15 oz. $1.19 $1.18 
91.  Hemorrhoid Ointment 2 oz. Tube $-0- $2.55 
92.  Muscle Rub 3 oz. Tube $-0- $1.75 
93.  Medicated Chest Rub 3.53 oz. $-0- $1.20 
94.  Floss Loops “Mint Flavor” 30 ct. Plastic Bag $-0- NO BID 
95.  Eye Drops 0.05 oz. $2.19 $1.60 
96.  Alka Seltzer (Original Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 116.ct. box $0.79 $0.45 

(2-pack) 

97.  Alka Seltzer (Plus Cold Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 72 ct. bx $0.79 $0.45 
(2-pack) 

98.  Acne Gel Medication 1 oz. Tube $-0- $1.10 
(Dr. Sheffield’s acne cream 1oz tube) 

99.  Contact Lens M/P Solution 8 oz. $-0- NO BID 
100.  Legal Gummed Pads ( 8 ½ x 11”) $-0- $0.55 
101.  3 ½” Flexible Pencil $-0- NO BID 
102.  Bubble Cushioned Envelope (6” x 9”) $0.49 NO BID 
103.  #10 White Security Envelopes $0.29 $0.02 
104.  No Clasp Envelope (9” x 12”) $0.29 $0.09 
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
BID TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office “Commissary Supplies”  

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE  15, 2011 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

BID NO:  2011-083-06-15-SMA BUYER: Sandra Montalvo 

LIST OF ITEMS 

R&R 
Distributing 

Edinburg, Tx 

KEEFE SUPPLY 
Garland, Tx 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

105.  Twin Pocket Folders $0.51 NO BID 
106.  Dictionary (English – Spanish & English) $1.89 $1.45 
107.  Word Seek Puzzles Books $2.69 NO BID 
108.  Sketch Pads (50 Sheets) $-0- $0.55 
109.  Playing Cards Deck $1.69 $0.98 

(aviator playing cards (deck) 
110.  4 ½” Flexible Black Ink Pen $-0- $0.35 
111.  Tracing Paper Pad (40 Sheets) $4.39 NO BID 
112.  Tan PVC Shower Sandals (Size 8 thru 13) $-0- $1.75 
113.  Colgate “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.2 oz. $-0- $1.75 
114.  Close Up “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.0 oz. $-0- $1.20 
115.  Three Flowers Brilliantine 4 oz. $-0- $1.41 
116.  Dandruff Shampoo & Conditioner 14.2 oz. $-0- NO BID 
117.  Nair Hair Removal 9 oz.  $6.99 NO BID 
118.  Speed Stick Aqua Sport Anti-Perspirant Gel 3 oz. $2.69 $1.98 
119.  Razorless Hair Removing Cream 6 oz. $8.99 $3.24 
120.  After Shave Lotion 4 oz. $-0- $0.95 
121.  Baby Lotion 15 oz. $-0- $1.55 

(Baby oil 14 oz). 

122.  Shaving Gel 3 oz. Clear Tube $-0- $1.05 
(protection shave gel 7oz. clear tube) 

123.  White Handkerchief (15” x 15”) $-0- $0.52 
124.  VO5 Extra Body Shampoo 15.0 oz. $-0- $1.10 
125.  VO5 Extra Body Conditioner 15.0 oz. $-0- $1.10 
126.  Suave Powder Fresh Deodorant 1.7 oz. Clear $1.99 $1.18 
127.  Hinged Soap Dish Box- Regular Size $-0- $0.35 
128.  Dial -Hypo Allergenic Soap $1.05 NO BID 
129.  Dial Soap 4 oz. $0.95 $0.70 
130.  Greaseless Skin Cream 4.5 oz. $-0- $1.15 
131.  Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Soap 3.6 oz. $-0- $0.45 

(Next1 cocoa butter soap 5oz.) 
132.  Hair Moisturizer 4 oz. Tube $-0- $1.75 
133.  Palm Hair Brush Flexible – Black $-0- $0.30 
134.  Tampons – Singles (Regular/Super/Junior) 40 ct. Box $0.39 NO BID 
135.  Disposable Douche 6 oz. $1.29 $1.65 

(massengill extra cleansing douche 2pk) 
136.  White Washcloth (12”x12”) $0.39 $0.32 
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