
 

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

BID TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY   

BID OPENING DATE: June 22, 2011  BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

DESCRIPTION OF BID: “ PURCHASE OF MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS” 

BID NO: 2010-168-06-22-NMC   BUYER: Nielda Cavazos  

NAME OF COMPANY PRODUCT 

DESCRIPTION 
UOM 

UNIT PRICE 

AMOUNT 

1)  

Clarke Mosquito  

Control Products, Inc 

Roselle, Ill 

PERMANONE or 
equivalent, Biomist 
3+15 

Equivalent: Alternate 
(Anvil 2+2) 

1 gal. $ 40.00/gal 

55gal. drum 

 

$2,200.00/dru
m 

Other: $41.61/gal 
$2,290.20/dru

m 

SUMMIT B.T.I. 
BRIQUETS or 
equivalent  

Equivalent:_ Bactimos 
Briquettes (100 case)  

20 CT. Packet  

Case 

 
$ 68.00/cs 

2)  
ADAPCO, Inc 

Sanford, Florida 

PERMANONE or 
equivalent ,  
Permanone 4-8 RTU  

Equivalent:____________ 

2x2.5 gl case $ 30.23/gl 

30 gal drum $ 28.73/gl 

Other 275 gl tote $ 25.20/gl 

SUMMIT B.T.I. 
BRIQUETS 

Equivalent:____________ 

Perm-X UL 4-4 
Perm-X UL 4-4 

20ct packet $ No bid 

case $ 57.69/case 

55 gl drum 

275 gl tote 

$ 21.81/gl 

$ 21.18/gl 

3)  

Univar USA, Inc  

Corpus Christi, Texas 

 

 

PERMANONE  

Equivalent:_ ALT Bid 
Kontrol 4- 4 

1 gal. $ 21.50 

55 gal. drum $ 1182.50 

  

SUMMIT B.T.I. 
BRIQUETS 

Equivalent:____________ 

20 ct. packet No bid 

CASE 
$ 60.00 100 ct 

4)  
Target Specialty Products 

San Antonio, Texas  

PERMANONE 
Equivalent: Evoluer 

1 gal. $32.35 

55 gal. drum $1,275.45 

Other  275 gal $6,256.25 

SUMMIT B.T.I. 
BRIQUETS 
Equivalent:_____________
____________ 

20 ct. packet No Bid 

CASE (100) $ 67.15 

OTHER n/a No Bid 


