HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET

DEPT NAME: COUNTY OF HIDALGO URBAN COUNTY FROGRAM
Bid Opening Date: September 14, 2011

Bid Opening
Description of Bid: Demolition and Reconstruction of One {1) unit in the city of Donna, One (1) unit in the city of Elsa, One (1

La Villa, and three (3} units in the county wide are. Grant#: M

RIGNEY CONSTRUCTION & DVLPMNT LLC MOMENTUS ’
TOTAL BID BID BOND/CASHIER’S TOTAL BID
UNITS AMOUNT CHECK INCLUDED UNITS AMOUNT
1 | LOBATO $48,499 98 BB INCLUDED 1 | LoBaTO $48,150.00
2 | DE LEON $48499.98 BB INCLUDED 2 | DELEON $48,150.00
3 | HINOJOSA $43,100.00 BB INCLUDED 3 | HINOJOSA $38,250.00
4 | CORTEZ $79,912.00 BB INCLUDED 4 | CORTEZ $60,900.00
5 | BALLI $41,900.00 BB INCLUDED 5 | BALLI $38,250.00
ARGO CONSTRUCTION J R LIMAS CONSTRUCTION
TOTAL BID BID BOND/CASHIER’S TOTAL BID
UNITS AMOUNT CHECK INCLUDED UNITS AMOUNT
1 | LOBATO $48,800.00 CC INCLUDED 1 | LoBATO $48,000.00
2 | DE LEON NO BID N/A 2 | DELEON $48,000.00
3 | HINOJOSA NO BID N/A 3 | HINOJOSA $39,000.00 ' CCINCLUDED |
4 | CORTEZ $63,800.00 CC INCLUDED 4 | CORTEZ NO BID nrin !
5 | BALLI NO BID N/A 5 | BALLI $39,000.00
BENCHMARK CONSTRUCTION DE LEON CONSTRUCTION
TOTAL 8ID BID BOND/CASHIER'S | TOTAL BID Bl
UNITS AMOUNT Cl | UNITS AMOUNT
1 | LOBATO $48,300.00 | 38,198.00 =+ $47,000.00 i1
2 | DELEON $48,300.00 55+898.00 + | $47,000.00
3 | HINOJOSA $45,500.00 38,198.00 + A $39,400.00
4 | CORTEZ $63,798.00 132,294 Lp0g+ $59,000.00
5 | BALLI $38,500.00 . $38,400.00
0000+
G & G CONTRACTORS 2
TOTAL BID BIC :
UNITS gem e ¢ r 7+000-00 +
1 | LOBATO $47,798.00 47-000-00 +
2 | DELEON $47,798.00 24 .000+00(C+
3 [ HINOJIOSA $38,198.00
4 | CORTEZ $55,898.00 0+00¢+
5 | BALLI $38,198.00
*TYPED AS REA 94-000+-00 + JERIFIED/CALCULATED

132:294 00 +
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