. $ 5, Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
B 5, 2812 S. Business Highway 281
O N

7 New Administration Building
o Edinburg, Texas 78539
< (956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

o TEXAG .

Teer %t

MEMORANDUM

TO: Guadalupe “Lupe” Trevino, Sheriff
Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility

ATTN: Lt Richard Ozuna
Juan Tapia, Procurement Specialist

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: September 23, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE/ RECOMMENDATION REQUEST .
Bid No. 2011-193-09-21-SGS- Hidalgo County Sherifi’s Office —Including all other Hidalgo County
Law Enforcement-Agencies-“Purchase of Tires-Including Installation and Other Related Services”

e — ———————————
‘We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence /recommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence/recommendation to award to the gole bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. yia fax to. (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, September 29, 2011
@2:00 P.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for Commlssmners Court Meeting, Tuesday,
October 18, 2011.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter,

-

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

Plaase E’M@f/cé 79 -6«5/@ /@@)c/a/

Budget Acct No.: /’//ﬂ/ ..-/é‘;?'/_- dg -Qgﬁ 40/~ 57‘/0‘2.

A A ‘i’sanzwf»///aﬁ%e% MESD /o

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NlME DEPARTMENT DATE

Enclosures
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 28]
New Administration Building

Edimburg, Texas 78530
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: Celestino Avila, Jr,, Constable
Hidalgo County Pct. 1

ATTN: Blanca Sanchez

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer IT
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: Seprember 23, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE COM ATION REQUES
Bid No, 2011-193-89-21-8GS- Hidalgo County Sheriff's Office —Including all other Hidulgo County
Law EnfoAgencieaSe of ires-nc:ludi Installation and Other Related Services”

We have recejved one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence frecommendatiop.

Flease acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence/recommendation to award to the sole bidder meeting all

specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 ox (956} 292.

7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.bidalgo.tx.us by no latey than Thursday, September 29, 2011

pcalgo.tx.us by no latey than Thursday, September 29, 2011
@2:00 P.-M. ip order to place this item on the agenda for Coramissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,

Qctober 18, 2011,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS: ..

Soubhern Tre Yok e

Budget Acct No.: |- 100 MU ~90- 291 ~O0| - . 172

j-j Chie £ Doapudey
X@mm _garu:‘r\a'l— Fn-r\q"kz_})\g PA L SR

AUTHORIZED SIGNA L PRINTED NAME DEPARTMENT DATE

Enclosures %




- Y\‘YO Hidalge County Purchasing Office
_.-‘0‘5 & 2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

OS'N“

.
"

acr
MEMORANDUM (/7
TO: Gilbert Alaniz, Constable ;(7 P
Hidalgo County Pet, 2 '25

ATTN: Frank Sanchez

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: September 23, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE/ RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-193-09-21-8GS- Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office —Including ali other Hidalgo County
Law Enforcement Agencies-“Purchase of Tires-Including Installation and Other Related Services”

We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence /recommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence/recommendation to award to the sole bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, September 29, 2011
@2:00 P.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,

October 18, 2011,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

S cecdhara. Tirt Mot

Budget Acct No.: _L Jfoo- 4p/-00-292-c0i-o

7%/  Frunts Sewcdes b2 Lon st / 9//;///

-ZJTHO ATURE PRINTED NAME DEPARTMENT DATE

Enclosures

ot &
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: Lazaro “Larry” Gallarde, Constable
Hidalgo County Pct. 3

ATTN: Rachel Ramos

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer 11
Hidalge County Purchasing Department

DATE: Scptember 23, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE/ RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2011-193-09-21-SGS- Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office —Including all other Hidalge County
Law Enforcement Agencics-“Purchase of Tires-Including Installation and Other Related Services”

We have received one (1) response to the sbove mentioned project. Bicelosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence /frecommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence/recommendation to award to the sole bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-
7612 _or email: _sandy.snarez@co.hidalgotx.us by no later than Thursda September 29, 2011

@2:00 P.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,
Octobey 18, 2011.

———— O e A

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitaic to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this mattcr.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

Southe Tire )\Jli‘hwl';r LLC

Budget AcctNo.:_11060 Y2100 293 0p] p 672

H@«o@o[a Quwé Howtde Sl Hodedso C"’“ﬁ’ Conddeble pcr”’B [0 -5+ 2511

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTHED NAME EPARTMENT DATE
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CONSTABLE PRECINCT 4

J. E. “EDDIE” GUERRA

MEMO
TO: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I1
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
FROM: Constable Chief Deputy Joel River&/
DATE: September 29, 2011 |

REFERENCE: Bid Award Concurrence/Recommendation Request
Bid No. 2011-193-09-21-SGS

This notice is to inform you that we respectfully decline the bid of Southern Tire Mart
pricing, as a Law Enforcement Agency for Hidalgo County we are very satisfied with
Goodyear quality and pricing that has been given to our office throughout the fiscal year
2011. The vehicles we utilize for the protection of our community need to be reliable for
our deputies to perform and we have found that reliability in Goodyear. Thank you for
your time and consideration in this matter, if you would like to address any concern or
questions please contact Chief Deputy Joel Rivera at Extension 4302 from Hidalgo
County Constable Pct 4.

Hancy Pouce

Aedmiidpnaltive Ffeiotant
Hidalgo Constable Pct 4
2814 South Highway 281
Edinburg, Texas 78539

Constable Pct 4

Office: (956) 383-8560 e Fax: (956) 383-8565 e 2814 S. Highway 281 Edinburg, Texas 78539



sandy.suarez
Typewritten Text
Constable Pct 4


Oct. 19, 2001 2:41PM No. 0308 P 1

Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 8. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO; Daniel Marichalar, Constable
Hidalgo County Pet. 5

ATTN: Deputy Felix Ramos

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: September 23, 2011

RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE/ RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No, 2011-193-09-21-5GS- Hidalgo County Sherifl*s Office —Including all other Hidalgo County

Law Enforcement Agencies-"Purchase of Tires-Incloding Installation and Other Related Services™

We have received one (1) response Lo the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies ol the bid response for your review and concurrence frecommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence/recommendation to award to the sole bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, September 29, 2011

@2:00 P.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,

October 18, 2011.

Should you have any questions or require further inlormation please do not hesiiate (o call me al 3 18-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attlention and cooperation to this matter.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

Soudhen. e Wlart—
BudgelAcclNo.:J - lw*q}I “OO”ME‘; M/" o- (o?}‘

Diteel WMaichalar Copcate RLS /4// /I

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME DEPARTMENT DATE

Enclosures

Constable
Pct.5
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. \5$’§Y6F ] Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
0 i 2812 S. Business Highway 281
;ff ¥a3 New Administration Building
i o Edinburg, Texas 78539
‘3 < (956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TO: Juan Martinez, Fire Marshal
Hidalgo County Fire Marshal’s Office

ATTN: Yolanda Orozco, Administration Assistant

\A\';" . ,«l ‘l'Q;\\
FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer II %E? ¢
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
DATE:  September 23, 2011 b Q:;L:,U’*’"'
3 —,:‘i. :,’ ’
RE: BID AWARD CONCURRENCE/ RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2011-193-09-21-SGS- Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office —Including all other Hidalgo County
Law Enforcement Agencies-“Purchase of Tires-Including Installation and Other Related Services”

We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and concurrence /recommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concurrence/recommendation to award to the sole bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-
7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, September 29, 2011

@2:00 P.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,
October 18, 2011.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

Budget Acct No.: |-l - LPQ—Q"‘{O’*BUQ —OOf "_0""‘_/&-.’) o~

m ) _j;-‘“’\ W\«L;nez Fire W\ar‘s\ﬂql T/Z?lb

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME DEPARTMENT DATE

Enclosures

—-:‘\



TO:

ATTN:

FROM:

DATE:

RE:

e
e

Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

Dora L. Munoz, Commandey
Hidalgo County Task Force

Senia Lopez, Administration Assistam

Sandy Svarez, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

September 23, 2011

BID AWARD CONCURRENCE/ RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No, 2011-193-09-21-5SGS- Hidalgo County Sheriff's Office —Including all other Hidalgo County
Law Enforcement Agencics-“Purchase of Tires-Including Installation and Other Related Services”

We have received one (1) response to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid response for your review and ¢oncurrence /recommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your concwrence/recommendation to award to the sole bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to_(956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-

7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, September 29, 2011

@2:00 P'.M. in order to place this jtem on the agenda for Commissioners Court Meeting, Tuesday,

October 18, 2011,

Should you have any questions ot require further information please do not hesitate 10 call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and ¢cooperation to this matter,

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

SOUTHERN TIRE MART
MEISSING TIRE SIZE P255/70R18

Budger Acct No.;_1-1254-412-00~-270—-014-0-672

~
AUTH&R]’%ED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME DEPARTMENT DATE

Hottto &
3 /W%”‘? D I A

Enclosures

&



TABULATION SHEET
HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

(Including all Other Hidalgo Co. Law Enforcement Agencies)

“PURCHASE OF TIRES-INCLUDING INSTALLATION AND OTHER RELATED SERVICES”

BID NO. 2011-193-09-21-SGS

SOLE BIDDER
ITEM TIRE SIZE & DESCRIPTION
e SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC
Tire Brand Unit Mounting Rotation | Balancing
Price (Including stem valve)

1 235-85-R16  (hwy all steel 10 ply) Bridgestone Duravis R250 all steel (206-278) $164.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
5 LT235-75-R15 (all terrain 10 ply) Firestone Transforce AT 6 ply (189-650) $ 86.50 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00
3 P215-60-R16 Firestone Precision Touring (104-718) $61.00 $8.00 $ 6.00 $ 8.00
4 LT265-70-R17  (all terrain 10 ply) Firestone Transforce AT 10 ply (200-190) $111.90 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
. P225-60-R16 (speed rated) Firestone FireHawk PV -41 (607-911) $71.60 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
6 LT245-78-R16 (all terrain 10 ply) Firestone Transforce AT 10ply (189-582) $94.50 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00
- LT265-75-R16  (all terrain 10 ply) Firestone Transforce AT 10 ply (189-599) $ 104.00 $8.00 $ 6.00 $ 8.00
8 P265-70-R18 Firestone Destination LE SL (066-173) $108.80 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
9 P255.70-R16 Firestone Destination LE SL (147-033) $92.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
10 P205-65-R15 Firestone Precision Touring (140-633) $ 53.50 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
11 P205-55-R16 Firestone Precision Touring (140-701) $ 68.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
15 P205-50-R16 Firestone Precision Sport (138-168) $ 66.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
= 245-70-R19.5  (hwy) Firestone FS560 12 ply (169-981) $ 254.00 $18.00 $22.00 | $20.00
14 P205-75-R15 Firestone Destination AT SL (026-490) $ 75.50 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00
15 LT235-75-R16 Firestone Destination LE XL (054-358) $87.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
16 P235-70-R17 Firestone Destination LE XL (097-538) $93.50 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
17 LT325-65-R18 (all terrain) Firestone Destination AT 10 ply (192-353) $ 196.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
18 325-65-18 Firestone Destination MT 10 ply (205-188) $211.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
19 285-45-22 Firestone Destination ST  (133-782) $121.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00

1]
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ltem Tire size & Description Tire Brand Unit Price Mounting Rotation | Balancing
No. (Including stem valve)

20 225-60-18 Firestone FireHawk GT Pursuit (005-254) $ 96.00 $8.00 $ 6.00 $8.00
21 265-35-22 Venezia Crusade SUV (VZ-4157) $116.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
22 275-60-20 Firestone Destination LE SL (108-741) $131.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
23 215-60-17 Firestone Affinity Touring TA (043-716) $69.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
24 225-45-17 Venezia Crusade HP (VZ-277) $76.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
25 275-55-20 Firestone Destination ST (232-123) $111.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00
26 225-55-17 Firestone Wide Oval Indy 500 (136-978) $ 85.80 $ 8.00 $ 6.00 $ 8.00
27 255-50-19 Firestone Destination ST XL (232-140) $130.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
28 295/75/R22.5 HanKook TL 01 14 ply (3001158) $ 290.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
29 305-55-20 Hankook Dyna Pro 10 ply (2001433) $ 350.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
30 8.25R20 Pacifica Hwy TT set 14 ply (PFT-3012) $203.00 $18.00 $22.00 | $20.00
31 9.00R20 Pacifica Hwy TT set 14 ply (PFT-3015) $ 233.00 $18.00 $22.00 $ 20.00
32 10.00/20 Pacifica Hwy TT set 14 ply (PFT-3221) $ 252.00 $18.00 $22.00 | $20.00
33 11R22.5 Ling Long Premium STEER 14 ply (MTR- $ 305.00 $18.00 $22.00 | $20.00

2002-LL)
34 11R24.5 Ling Long Premium STEER 14 ply (MTR- $ 335.00 $18.00 $22.00 | $20.00
2102-LL)

35 37X12.50X17 Yokohoma Geolander A/TS (01273) $ 370.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
36 235/55 R17  (speed rated) Firestone FireHawk GT Z (077-325) $ 86.25 $ 8.00 $6.00 | $8.00
37 P235-55-R17 (speed rated) Firestone FireHawk GT Z (077-325) $86.25 $8.00 $6.00 | $8.00
38 P235-75-R17 (10 ply) Firestone Destination AL ST (054-239) $103.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 | $8.00
39 P245-65-R17 (regular tire) Firestone Destination LE SL (040-928) $102.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
40 P245-70-R17 (10 ply) Firestone Transforce HT 10 ply (191-316) $100.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
41 P255-70-R17 (10 ply) Firestone Destination AT SL (054-290) $107.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
42 P265-60-R17 (speed rated) Firestone Fire Hawk Pursuit GT V (023-189) $106.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
43 P265-70-R17 (10 ply) Federal Couragia AT (48FF73FA) $110.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00
44 235/55 R17 Firestone Wide Oval Indy 500 (136-995) $89.50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
45 235/55 ZR17 Firestone FireHawk GT Z (077-325) $ 86.25 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
46 235/55-ZR17 99W M +S Firestone FireHawk GT Z (077-325) $86.25 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
47 255/60R16 Firestone Firehawk PT 41 Firestone FireHawk PT 41 (067-911) $71.60 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
48 265/70R17 M+ S Firestone Transforce HT 10 ply (200-156) $110.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00

2|



ltem Tire size & Description Tire Brand Unit Price Mounting Rotation | Balancing
No. (Including stem valve)

49 285/60R18 M+ S Bridgastone Dueler HT 684 1l (112-889) $130.00 $8.00 $ 6.00 $8.00
50 P255/65R17 Firestone Destination LE (083-190) $116.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
51 P255/70R17 110T Silent Amor Firestone Destination AT SL (054-290) $109.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
52 P255/70R17 M+S 110T Silent Armor Firestone Destination AT SL (054-290) $109.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
53 P265/60R17 108-H Firesione TransForce HT 10 ply (200-156) $ 110.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
54 P265/90R17 108-H Firesione Destination AT (026-784) $104.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
55 T265/70R17  Transforce A/T Firesione TransForce AT 10 ply (200-190) $114.00 $8.00 $ 6.00 $8.00
56 215/85-R16 A/T (front) Firestone TransForce AT 10 ply (189-565) $93.00 $ 8.00 $ 6.00 $ 8.00
57 225/75-R16 (back) Firestone TransForce AT 10 ply (189-667) $89.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $8.00
58 235/65-R17 Firestone Destination LE SL  (040-911) $100.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
59 245/75-R16 A/T Firestone TransForce AT 10 ply (189-582) $96.00 $8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
** 60 | 245/75-R16 A/T Firestone TransForce AT 10 ply (189-582) $ 96.00 $ 8.00 $6.00 $ 8.00
61 P85/60-R18 NO BID NO BID $8.00 $6.00 $8.00

** Note: #60 will not be awarded, due to erroneously duplicating tire #59

3|Page



@, D

Sandy Suarez

From: Sandy Suarez [sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us]

Sent: Thursday, October 06, 2011 2:16 PM

To: 'HIDTA-S. Lopez (slopez@hidtataskforce.com)

Subject: 2011-193-09-28-8GS- Purchase of Tires-Including Installation and Other Related Services'

Missing-P255/70-18

Importance: High

Good Afternoon Sonia,

In reference to the project stated ahove. | erroneously duplicated tire No. 60 (59) on the Bid page and left off the tire
size 255/70-18 (P255/70R18), which was requested to be added on by your department.

Unfortunately | can’t correct it, because the Bid Opening has already taken place and that tire size will have to be left
out. After researching, done by our Po Administrator’s, this tire size can be purchased through TXMAS.

I sincerely apologize for all the inconveniences this has caused and | appreciate all of your assistance with this matter.
If there are any questions or concerns please let me know.

Thank you,

Sandy Suarez, Buyer II

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2802 South Bus. Hwy 281

Edinburg, Texas 78539

{956) 292-7000 ext. 4860

(956) 318-2629 fax
sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us




Pricing is valid from 2/12/2011 until 12/31/2011

FIRESTONE BRAND - PASSENGER & LIGHT TRUCK TIRES - TXMAS PRICING

SR/LR/
LOAD 2011
INDEX'R TREAD ARTICLE GOVT
BRAND GROUP PATTERN SIZE PLY IMSIZE DEPTH NUMBER PRICE
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P245/75R17 110 13 077563 $125.58
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P255/65R17 108 13 054307 $126.29
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P255/70R16 109 13 026869 $103.40
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P255/70R17 110 13 054290 $112.79
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T ol |P255/70R18 112 13 108843 $139.99
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P255/75R17 113 13 108860 $130.61
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P265/60R18 109 11 108877 $156.35
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P265/65R17 110 13 066156 $130.62
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P265/70R16 111 13 027481 $109.55
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P265/70R17 113 13 026784 $119.28
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P265/70R18 114 12 077546 $129.45
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P265/75R16 114 13 026648 $105.39
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P275/55R20 111 11 108911 $171.04
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P275/60R20 114 11 108894 $165.47
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P275/65R18 114 10 054324 $142.46
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION A/T P285/70R17 117 11 066139 $126.54
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE 225/65R17 102 13 083173 $100.72
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P215/70R15 97 12 030439 576.46
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P215/70R16 99 12 083224 $82.62
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P215/75R15 100 12 146914 578.84
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P225/70R14 98 12 147543 581.56
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P225/70R15 100 12 146948 $84.71
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P225/70R16 101 12 147560 $87.80
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P225/75R15 102 12 146931 581.88
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P225/75R16 XL 106 12 040860 $87.00
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/60R17 100 10 112379 $105.72
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/65R16 101 10 065068 $95.40
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/65R17 103 13 040911 $106.01
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/65R18 104 12 108792 $146.78
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/70R15 102 12 146982 586.66
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/70R16 XL 107 12 054375 $93.72
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/70R17 XL 108 12 097538 $109.57
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/75R15 105 12 146965 584.40
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P235/75R16 XL 109 12 054358 592.99
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P245/60R18 104 11 108248 $125.53
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P245/65R17 105 13 040928 $115.35
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P245/70R16 106 13 123838 $94.81
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P245/70R17 108 13 087389 $109.25
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P245/75R16 109 13 147016 $93.02
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P255/65R16 106 13 040877 $111.69
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P255/65R17 108 13 083190 $119.39
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P255/70R15 108 13 146829 $88.62
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P255/70R16 109 13 147033 $100.47
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P265/50R20 106 11 108809 5172.08
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P265/60R18 109 11 054409 5136.54
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P265/65R17 110 13 054392 $123.55
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P265/65R18 142 13 090177 $131.39
FIRESTONE PASSENGER DESTINATION LE P265/65R18 112 12 090279 $137.95




EXHIBIT “B”

HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
(Including All Other Hidalgo County Law Enforcement Agencies)

“PURCHASE OF TIRES — INCLUDING INSTALLATION AND OTHER RELATED SERVICES”

BID NO. 2011-193-09-21-SGS

BID PAGE
OPTIONAL SERVICES- FEES
NO. TIRE SIZE AND DESCRIPTION BRAND UNIT PRICE
PER TIRE Mounting Rotation Balancing
{Including Valve Stem)
BRIDGESTONE DURAVIS
1 | 235-85-R16 (hwy all steel 10 ply)R250 ALL STEEL (206-278) $164.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTQNE TRANSFORCE
2 | LT235-75-R15 (all terrain 10 ply)AT 6 PLY (189-650) $86.50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE PRECISION TOURING $800 $6.00 $500
3 | P215-60-R16 (140-718) $61.00
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE
4 | LT265-70-R17 {all terrain 10 ply) AT 10 PLYf (200-190) $111.90 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONH FIREHAWK PV-41
5 P225-60-R16  (speed rated) (067-911) $71.60 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE
6 LT245-78-R16 (all terrain 10 ply) AT 10 PLY (189-582) $94.50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIREST
7 | LT265-75-R16 (all terrain 10 ply) AT 10 HLY (189-599) $104.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE QJESTINATION LE 31 ' ; :
8 P265-70-R18 (066-173) $108.80 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE DESTINATION TE ST
9 | P255-70-R16 (147-033) $92.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE PRECISTON TOURING
10 | P205-65-R15 (140-633) $53.50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE PRECISION-TOURING;
11 | P205-565-R16 (140-701) $68.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRES TUNE PRECTSTON SPORT
12 | P205-50-R16 (138-168) $66.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE F$560 T2 PLY
13 | 245-70-R19.5  (hwy) (169-981) $254.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT SC
14 | P205-75-R15 (026-490) $75.50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE DESTINATION TE XT
15 | LT235-75-R16 (054-358) $87.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE XL
16 | P235-70-R17 (097-538) $93.50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT TUPL
17 | LT325-65-R18 (192-353) $196.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
FIRESTUNE DESTINATION T TOPLY
18 | 22565-18 (205-188) $211.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
19 | 2854522 FIRESTONE DESIINATION 5 $121.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
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20 225-60-18 FIRESTONE FIREHF%Q 5EP§§UI|’ $96.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
21 265-35.22 VENEZIA br:;::‘l: SOUVVZAT15T) $116.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
22| 2756020 e $131.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
23 | 215-60-17 FIRESTONE AFFINITY T&nga) TA Sepi $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
24 225-45-17 VENEZIA CRUSALQE HP (VZ-277) $76.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
25 | 2755520 RIRERTONE DEBTNATION 3 $111.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
26 225.55-17 FIRESTONE WIDE Vﬁlagtié.)?‘g}bﬂ(] $35.80 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
27 | 255-50-19 EIRER IR DES TR B Pl $130.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
28 | 295/75/R22.5 HANKGOK TL 07 14 PLY (3001158) $560/00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
29 305-55-20 HANKOOK DYNA PRO 10|PLY (2001433) $350.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
30 ] 8.25R20 PACIFICA HWY TT SET 14 PLY (PFT-3012) | $203.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
31 9.00R20 PACIFICA HWY TT SET 14 PLY (PFT-3015) | $233.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
32 | 10.00R20 PACIFICA HWY TT SET 14 PLY (PFT-3221) | $252.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
33 11R22.5 LINGTONG PREMIUM STEER T4 PLY
) {(MTR-2002-LL) | $305.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
34 | 11R24.5 HG D EREMI STER [(MTR-2102LL) | $335.00 $18.00 $22.00 $20.00
35 | 37x12.60x17 YOROHOMA GFEI()LANUt‘!j fr:i(u 1 zml — po— <8 a5 $6.00 $8.00
36 | 235/55R17 (speedrated) ' - | V077-328) ' = | $86.25 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
37 | P235-55-R17 (speed rated)l IRES TONE FIREFRWEGTZ 0 = $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
38 P235-75-R17 (10 p[y)HRtal ONE DESTH Al(b\.ézl_é-\alg;)n. $103.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
39 | P245-65-R17 (regular tire)FTRESTONED ~040-628) - | $102.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
AD P245-70-R17 (10 ply) FIRESTONE TRAN bl—(%}&k:?lﬁ g)l TOPC $100.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
41 | P255:70-R17 (10 ply) FIRESTONE DESTRATOVATSE 0 0 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
42 | P265-60-R17 (speed rated) 'S5RENF N3350y © | $106.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
43 | P265-70-R17 (10 ply) 0 CO R ey | $110.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
24 | 235555 R17 FIRESTUNE WIDE OVAL 'N('ﬂe?é’gS) pr—_ g S0 $8.60
45 235/55 ZR17 FIRESTONE FIREAR GTZ
(077-325) $86.25 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
46 | 235/55-ZR17_99W M +5 T ESTONETIREMATICEY 7 $86.25 $8.00 S50 $8.00
47 | 255/60R16  Firestone Fire hawk PT 41 | (067.911) $71.60 o $6.00 $5.00
48 2665/70R17 M + & FIRESTONE TRANSFUH u:(Eblo_%gj_r $110.00 $8.00 36.00 $8.00
490 2865/60R18 M + S PRIDGESTONE DUELER Hr(??g_lésg) $130.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
50 | P255/65R17 FIRESTONE DESTWEHB§4 190) $116.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8'_00
51 | P255/70R17 1107 Silent Amor’ ol | eagoony 10 $109.00 — $6.00 prm—s
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52 | P255/70R17 M+S 110T Sllent Armor st or oaraony - | 8100.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
53 | P265/60R17 108-H FIRESTONE TRANSHORTRATIIRPLY T ) 50 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
54 | P265/90R17 108-H "'~ TUNEDESTINRTICRAT ) $104.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
56 | T265/70R17  TransForce ATT™> TRANYFORGRRG ITFET o 14 00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
56 | 215/85-R16 AT (fronty > TRANSFORCE BT $93.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
57 | 225/75-R16 (back)" RESTONE TRANSFORCERT TRFLY T ea0 5 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00
58 | 235/65-R17 P R DESTINATIONEE o ) $100.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00

59 245/75-R16 A/T FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE ;&%&Pﬁglz_; $96.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00

60 245]75_R1 6 AT FIRESTONE TRANSFURCE algg-l_%gzl-jy $96.00 $800 $600 5800
61 | PB5/60-R18 NO BID NO BID $8.00 $6.00 $8.00

Note: If you do offer the service of mounting, rotation or balancing tires please put dollar amount, and if you do
not offer the service of mounting, rotation or balancing tires please specify by puiting “NA” inside the boxes.

ol
BIDDER'S INFORMATION: q : DQ{( e

BIDDER/COMPANY NAME:  SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC 9 / > , l¢

ADDRESS: 5051 SHARP STREET
CITYISTATE/ZIP CODE:  DALLAS, TEXAS 75247

PHONE & FAX NO'S:
877-786-4681 TOLL FREE PHONE 214-389-7111 FAX

CELLULARNO:  817-247-6845

E-MAIL ADDRESS:  bharms@stmtires.com
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: /2, A - /l.. e
g

PRINTED NAME:

BOBBY HARMS

TITLE
DIRECTOR OF GOVERNMENT SALES
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE: _SEPTEMBER 21, 2011 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION “Hidalgo Co. Sheriff’s Office-Including all other Co. Law Enforcement

Agencies —“Purchase of Tires —Including Installation and gther Related Services”
RFB NO: 2011-193-00-00-SGS

BID SIGNATURE (IF
NAME OF BIDDER: REQUES || om Itiars OF ADDRESS
COMPANY/FIRM T STAFF DATE E-MAIL
*VIA & PHONE NO
ADDRESSING
MAILOUT
229 W, Park
1. Art's Automotive Tire E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/06/11 | Pharr, TX. 78577
Repair Service P# 9b6-787-1118
Attn: Fernando Fernande@arisautoservice.net
5051 Sharp St.
2. Southern Tire Mart, LLC Dallas, TX 75247
Attn: Pat E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/06/11 | (877)786-4681 office
pcave@stmtires.com
812 West 4™ P.O. Box 9138
3. Ato ZTire & Battery, Inc Amarillo, TX 79101
Attn: Glen E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/06/11 | {806) 373-2592 office
(806) 373-6504 fax
gphillips@atoziire.com
403 E. Expressway 83
4. Tire Centers, LLC E-rnail Sandy Suarez 08/06/11 | Pharr, TX 78577
Attn: Rodolfo {Rudy) (956) 283-8887 office
Rodriguez (manager) (956) 227-9651 cell
Tci617mgr@tirecenters.com
4109 S McColl Rd
6. Discount Tire E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/06/11 | Edinburg, TX.
Attn: Brenton Kamaiski (956) 994-3883 office
txc_08mgr@discounttireco.com
200 E. Hwy 83
7. GCR Tires E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/06/11 Pharr, TX. 78577
Attn; Juan Hinojosa P#787-5571
juanhincjosa@gecrtires.com
4201 N. 23"
8. Good Year Tires E-mail McAllen, TX. 785074
Attn: Juan “mai Sandy Suarez | 09/06/11 | puagq 317
gsr4752@qgoodyear.com
BILM 118 N. 12 Ave.
9. Expert Tires \E/e|°CIty o8/ Edinburg, TX. 78541
Attn: Steve Xpress | Sandy Suarez | 09081 | oy 56 380.0371 Fo56-318-3064
No E-mail address
10. GCR Tire Center Pharr, Texas
Attn: Greg Dozier E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/13/11 | P# 956-787-5571 F# 956-787-1673
gregdozier@gcrtires.com




11. Lopez Tires & Wheels, LLC

1220 S. 23" St.

Afttn: Jesse Lopez E-mail Sandy Suarez 08/13/11 | McAllen, Texas 78501
P#956-628-5571
jesselopeztiresandwheels@yahoo.com

12. Valley Tire Sales BLM 801 E. Whitewing Ave.

Attn: Rick Alaniz Velocity Sandy Suarez 09/13/11 [ McAllen, Texas 78501
Express P# 956-687-7789 F# 687-7071
13. Firestone Tire & Auto Center BLM 1401 N. 10" St.
Atftn: Fred Sanchez Velocity Sandy Suarez 09/13/11 | McAllen, Texas 78501
Express P# 956-686-1749 F# 956-631-5892
14. Superior Oil Express 1704 S. Sugar Road
Attn: Homer Jasso, Jr. E-mail Sandy Suarez 09/16/11 | Edinburg, TX. 78539

P#383-3338
superioroilexpress@sbcglobal.net

IN PERSON (IP)
E-MAIL (EM)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
FACSIMILE (FAX)






