R P Y

DEPARTMENT NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY - URBAN COUNTY PROGRAM

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET

BID OPENING DATE: February 22, 2012

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

Street)”

DESCRIPTION OF BID:“City of Donna-2007/2008 Water & Sewer Improvements (Alley between South Main & s*

BID NO: 2007-5008-15-0310-1500-UCP-PDLC

PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST:

Bid Bond/
Cashier’s Check
RFB NO. Name of Company Addendum # 1 Alternate Price Total Price Included
Bid Bond
: R.M Walsdorf Inc. Acknowledged $50,343.44 $101,546.06 i o
. Inciunded
Bid Bond
2, O.M.T. Utilities Acknowledged $67,500.00 $69,719.00
Included
NOT Bid Bond
3. 2 Submitted $116,782.00
S Acknowledged NoseSaos Included
Bid Bond
4. Tapia Construction Company Acknowledged None Submitted $120,782.00 1@ Bon
Included
Bid Bond
5. Jimmy Closner & Sons Const. Co., Inc. Acknowledged £160,295.00 $172,895.00 tncluded
n
6.
7.
8.
9.

*TYPED AS READ AT BID OPENING, AMOUNTS NOT VERIFIED/CALCULATED.




CRUZ-HOGAN @onsatzante. Tuc.

Engineers ® Planners ¢ Consultants

McAlien * Harlingen
TBPE Firm Reg. No. FO04B60

February 29, 2012

Diana Serna, Director
Urban County Program
1916 Tesoro Bivd.
Pharr, Texas 78577

RE: Letter of Recommendation
Donna Water/Sewer Improvements Project
Urban County Program No.: 5007/08-15-0310-5000-1500-UCP-PDLC

Dear Ms. Serna,

Bids were received on February 22, 2012 for the above referenced project. We are happy to
have received 5 bids. The low bidder was O.M.T. Utilities from Waeslaco, Texas. Enclosed you

will find a bid tabulation for your review.

Upon review of the submitted bids, | recommend awarding O.M.T. Utilities which submitted the
low bid of $69,719.00 which includes using alternate bid units. The estimated cost of the

project was approximately $90,000.00.

If you have any questions please feel free to contact me at {956) 682-5022.

Sincerely,

Ronnje Cruz, P.E.
CRUZ-HOGAN Coxsatzants, Jxc.

RC/cl

Enclosure

Cc: Pete De La Cruz, Colonia Manager
Tony Barco, Deputy Director

605 E. Violet, Suite 5 * McAllen, Texas 78504
(956) 682-5022 *+ Fax (956) 682-5089
www.cruzhogan.net




City of Donna Water/Sewer Improvements Project

(Alley between South Main and 8" Street)

Urban County Program No.: 5007/08-15-0310-5000-1500-UCP-PDLC

COMPANY BiD AMOUNT WITH ALTERNATE BIDS
O.M.T. Utilities No Bid $69,7I1‘9.00
RM Walsdorf Inc. $ 101,546.06 $86,396.94
2GS, LLC. $ 110,782.00 No Bid
Tapia Construction $ 120,782.00 $120,782.00
Jimmy Clasner and Sons S 172,895.00 $160,295.00

Const. Co.




Bohna

The Heant of the Valless

February 29, 2012

Diana R. Sema, Director

Urban County Program

1916 Tesoro Blvd.

Pharr, TX 78577

Re:  Water/Sewer Improvements Project (2007-2008 Funds)

Dear Ms. Serna,

This letter is to inform you that the City of Donna is recommending awarding O.M.T.
Utilities (the lowest bidder in the amount of $69,719.00, alternate bid) the Donna
Water/Sewer Improvements Project. Please see attached.

Thank you in advance for your cooperation.

Sincerely,

éﬁ%f

Planning Director

CC: Oscar Ramirez, City Manager
Pete De La Cruz, CDBG Coordinator
Ronnie Cruz, P.E., Cruz-Hogan Consultants, Inc.

Attachment

307 S. 12th St. Donna, Texas 78537 (956) 464-3314 Fax (956) 464-9923




City of Donna Water/Sewer Improvements Project

{Alley between South Main and 8" Street)

Urban County Program Na.: 5007/08-15-0310-5000-1500-UCP-PDLC

COMPANY BID AMOUNT WITH ALTERNATE BIDS
0.M.T. Utilities No Bid $69,719.00
RM Walsdorf Inc. $ 101,546.06 $86,396.94
2GS, LLC. S 110,782.00 No Bid
Tapia Construction S 120,782.00 $120,782.00
Jimmy Closner and Sons $ 172,895.00 $160,295.00

Const. Co.




