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-"C;Q L Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
ROl % 2812 S. Business Highway 281
“ﬂ AT o New Administration Building
T\ % Edinburg, Texas 78539

RN (956) 318-2626/ Fax: (356) 318-2629
March 7, 2012
Delta Specialties Signs & Supplies Via Email: sales@deltasignsupply.com

Attn: Martin Pena
10205 E. Hwy. 107
Edinburg, Texas 78542

Re: Extension Of Service Contract No: C-11-027-03-28
“Traffic Road Signs & Miscellaneous Equipment”

Dear Mr. Pena:

Hidalgo County Purchasing Department will be requesting Commissioners’ Court to consider the
County’s sole option to exercise its” option to exiend the one (1) year as provided under the Contract for
Hidalgo County. Extension will be at the same rates, terms and conditions.

This notice will be sent via certified mail as well as by email, please forward back this acknowledge
receipt of notice of such request in order to proceed forward in placement on the Commissioners’ Court
meeting of Tuesday, March 27, 2012 for discussion, consideration and action, by signing below and
returning to the Purchasing Department, by no later than 3:00 p.m., Tuesday, March 13, 2012 or
soomer, via facsimile to (956) 956-318-2629 or emall to: evangelina.garcia/@co.hidalgo.tx.us so as to
meet the agenda request form deadlines.

By: o v D 71_‘ b~ Date:_ 3~ 13 -/>

Additionally, we are requesting your company provide an updated certificate of insurance as required
through Hidalgo County’s Request for (Bid, Quote, Proposal, Statement of Quelification), if
applicable.

Should you have any questions or require additional information, please do noct hesitate to contact me at
(956) 318-2626. Your cooperation m this matter is greatly appreciated and we hope your company
continues its business relationship with Hidalgo County.

Sincerely,
Vangie Y. Garcia, Contract’s Manager
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department




REQUIREMENTS AGREEMENT
C-11-027-03-28

THIS AGREEMENT (the "Agreement") is entered into as of the March 28, 2011 by and
between Martin & Margarita Pena dba Delta Specialties and Supplies, ("Seller") and Hidalgo
County ("Buyer").

WHEREAS, Buyer has solicited proposals for the supply of its requirements of “Traffic
Road Signs & Miscellaneous Equipment,” as further described in Exhibit "A" (the “Products”).
Request for Bid (RFB) Procurement Packet, which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by
reference for all purposes (the "RFB") for a period of one year; and

WHEREAS, Seller has submitted a proposal to supply Buyer's requirements; and

WHEREAS, Buyer has determined that Seller has submitted the lowest and best bid to meet
Buyer's requirements for the Product.

NOW THEREFORE, for and in consideration of the mutual covenants and conditions
hereinafter set forth, and other good an valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which is
hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto agree as follows:

L Buyer agrees to purchase from Seller, and Seller agrees to sell to Buyer, all of the
Products that Buyer may require for use by Buyer in “Traffic Road Signs & Miscellaneous
Equipment,” in the areas of Hidalgo County projects for a period of one (1) year commencing
April 21,2011 and ending April 20, 2012 and may be extended with the County’s sole discretion for
an additional one (1) year period, and it is agreed that the Products will meet the specifications set
forth in Exhibit “A” hereto. Hidalgo County reserves the right to continue this bid for an additional
sixty (60) day grace period at the end of the contract term for unforeseen delay in award of new bid
for next contract term.

2 When Buyer determines that it needs a quantity of the Products to be delivered, it
will, according to its Purchasing Policies, complete and submit to Seller a Purchase Order describing
the type and quantity of the Products required.

8. Buyer agrees to pay Seller for each Purchase Order based on the prices set out in
Exhibit "B". Seller shall render invoices for each Purchase Order, and the invoices shall be paid by
Buyer on or before the 30th day following receipt of the invoice.

4.  County may terminate this contract upon thirty (30) days written notice at any time for
any reason or no reason at all.

5. General Provisions.

a. Conflict with Applicable Law. Nothing in this Agreement shall be construed so as
to require the commission of any act contrary to law, and whenever there is any conflict
between any provision of this Agreement and any present or future law, ordinance or
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administrative, executive or judicial regulation, order or decree, or amendment thereof,
contrary to which the parties have no legal right to contract, the latter shall prevail, but in
such event the affected provision or provisions of this Agreement shall be modified only to
the extent necessary to bring them within the legal requirements and only during the time
such contflict exists.

b. No Waiver. No waiver by Buyer of any breach of any provision of this Agreement
shall be deemed to be a waiver of any preceding or succeeding breach of the same or any
other provision hereof.

S Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the entire contract between the parties
hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either directly or through any
agent or representative) any representations or agreements in connection with this Agreement
not specifically set forth herein. This Agreement may be modified or amended only by
agreement in writing executed by Buyer and Seller, and not otherwise.

d. Texas Law to Apply. This Agreement shall be construed under and in accordance
with the laws of the State of Texas, and all obligations of the parties created hereunder are
performable in Hidalgo County, Texas. The parties hereby consent to personal jurisdiction in
Hidalgo County, Texas.

g, Notice. Except as may be otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement, all
notices, demands, requests or communications required or permitted hereunder shall be in
writing and shall either be (i) personally delivered against a written receipt, or (ii) sent by
registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage prepaid and addressed to the
parties at the addresses set forth below, or at such other addresses as may have been
theretofore specified by written notice delivered in accordance herewith:

If to Buyer: Hidalgo County
Attn:  County Judge
1615 S. Closner, Suite J
Edinburg, Texas 78539

If to Seller: Delta Specialties
Attn: Martin Pena
RR 1 Box 276/10205 E. Hwy. 107
Edinburg, Texas 78539

Each notice, demand, request or communication which shall be delivered or mailed in the
manner described above shall be deemed sufficiently given for all purposes at such time as it
is personally delivered to the addressee or, if mailed, at such time as it is deposited in the
Unites States mail.

f. Termination. . County may terminate this Agreement at any time for any reason or
no reason at all upon giving thirty (30) days written notice.



g. Additional Documents. The parties hereto covenant and agree that they will execute
such other and further instruments and documents as are or may become necessary or
convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this Agreement.

h. Successors. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of the
parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal representatives,
successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement.

1. Assignment. This Agreement shall not be assignable.

] Headings. The headings and captions contained in this Agreement are solely for
convenient reference and shall not be deemed to affect the meaning or interpretation of any
provision or paragraph hereof.

k. Gender and Number. All pronouns used in this Agreement shall include the other
gender, whether used in the masculine, feminine or neuter gender, and the singular shall
include the plural whenever and as often as may be appropriate

i, Authority to Execute. The execution and performance of this Agreement by Buyer
and Seller have been duly authorized by all necessary laws, resolutions or corporate action,
and this Agreement constitutes the valid and enforceable obligations of Buyer and Seller in
accordance with its terms.

m. Insurance. Company shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and

all persons connected with providing services under this Contract naming County as an
additional insured (with coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit AC@ attached
hereto and incorporated herein at this point for all purposes), and shall furnish to County
certificates of such insurance coverage.

n. Commitment of Current Revenues Only. Inthe event that, during any term hereof,
the Commissioners Court does not appropriate sufficient funds to meet the obligations of
Buyer under this Agreement, Buyer may terminate this Agreement upon sixty (60) days
written notice to Seller. Buyer agrees, however, to use reasonable efforts to secure funds
necessary for the continued performance of this Agreement. The parties intend this provision
to be a continuing right to terminate this Agreement at the expiration of each budget period
of Buyer pursuant to the provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt. Code Ann. ' 271.903 (Vernon Supp.
1996).

0. Purchasing Ethics. Seller represents and warrants it has not, during the process of
being awarded this contract violated the following ethical standards of Buyer and, upon and
after the execution of this Agreement, agrees to abide by the following ethical standards of
Buyer:
(1) It shall be a breach of ethics to offer, give or agree to give any elected official,
department head or employee, or former elected official, department head or
employee, of Hidalgo County, or for any elected official, department head or
employee or former elected official, department head or employee of Hidalgo
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County, to solicit, demand, accept or agree to accept from another person, entity or
organization, a gratuity or an officer of employment in connection with any decision,
approval, disapproval, recommendation, preparation or any part of a program
requirement or purchase request, influencing the content of any specification or
procurement standard, rendering of advise, investigation, auditing, or in any other
advisory capacity in any proceeding or application, request for ruling, determination,
claim or controversy, or other particular matter pertaining to any program
requirement or a contract or subcontract, or to any solicitation or proposal therefor
pending before any department or agency of Hidalgo County.

(2) It shall be a breach of ethics for any payment, gratuity or offer of employment
to be made by or on behalf of a subcontractor under a contract to the prime contractor
or higher tier subcontractor for any contract for Hidalgo County, or any person
associated therewith, as an inducement for the award of a subcontract or order.

EXECUTED effective as of the day and year first above written.
HIDALGO COUNTY

By: : &z
Ramon Garcia, County Judge

Approved by Commissiosers* Ceurt
on

Martin & Margarita Pena dba Delta
Specialties and Suppties

By: j/lvg.‘%: (/9—/ |
/ v — ~ —
Printed Name: M A ( wJ Pﬁ—' V(2

Title: Ol p & v~

Date: 4%/ 9‘8'//

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

ATLAS & HALL, LLP

By: %

Stephen L. Crain

APPROVED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT: March 28, 2011




EXHIBIT “B”
PAYMENT SCHEDULE
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Delta Specialties Signs Supplies
Awarded Items

Category A-New Category C-Refacing Category B- Accessories
Reflect | Hi-Intens | Grade-D Reflect Hi-Intens Grade-D 71) 3" Ctr Pavement Reflectors
1) 3 Way 12"x6" 2.45 4.55 6.65 Amber 1.50
[2)a way 12"x6" 2.45 4.55 6.65 Clear 1.70
24'"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80 Red or White 1.85
3) A/C & Ref 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 72) 4" Ctr Pavement Reflectors
4) All Way 18'%6" 3.15 4.55 6.65 Amber 1.50
5) Arrow Sign 48"x24" |  31.00 21.70 30.40 44,80 Clear 1.70
20"x8" 5.05 8.75 11.60 Red or White 1.85
15'"x8" 4.35 8,05 10.90 73) Brackets & Caps
6) Bridge Closed 36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 Aluminum 6" & 9" 16.95
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60,75 89.60 Cross Brackets 2" 3.50
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Round Post Bracket 2" 3.50
48"x30"| 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 U Post Brackets 2" 3.50
7) Bridge Out 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 90" Bracket 4 way assy 3.50
8) Brush Area 18" 24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 45°/80° Bracket 4 way assy 3.50
9) Cable/Util. Warning 9"x3" 3.15 4.55 7.65 Post cap U Channel 3.50
12"x3 1/2 5.25 5.80 7.90 Post cap 2" 3.50
12"x9" 3.70 5.80 7.90 Post dome caps 3" 4.50
10) Caution 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 Wing Brackets 12" 13.00
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 18"| 15.00
11) Children at Play  24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00 24" 22.00
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 74) Barricades
12) Curve: RorlL- 24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 Barricade Flashers 16.95
Curve Ahead 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Barricade Lights 16.95
30"x36"[ 29.00 60.00] 20.30 28.45 42.00 76) End Of Road Type | &IlI Type | Type lll
13} Const.Zone Warning 18"x18" 6.05 8.55 12.60 8' 150.00
24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 10' 195.00
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 12 210.00
36"x36"| 34.50 24.15 34.15 50.40 78) Barricade Tape-Reflective 1"%30 yd 65.00
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60 Gen Purpose Tape red 2"x30yd 135.00
14) Roll Up Mesh 36"x36" 61.00 79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid white & yellow(rolls) 3"x30 yd 150.00
48"x48" 85.00 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 80) Flexible Road Marker
15) Const. Zone Signs  12"x18" 6.00 8.40 11.90 62" White Road w/white reflect sheeting 38.00
24"x12" 7.70 10.50 14.00 62" White Road w/yellow reflect sheeting 38.00
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 Jiggle bars 6" 34" 12.95
24"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80 81) Barrier Fence & Tape
30"x24" 13.30 18.90 28.00 TemporayBarrier Fence per ft. 0.55
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Temporay Barrier Fence Roll 4'x100 43,00
48"x18" 40,00 15.75 20.65 28.00 Quick fence safey system 52.00
48"x24"| 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 Industrial grade Mil Barrier tape 9.95
48"x30"| 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00 82)Cones (traffic)
SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF 28" Orange/red glow 11.25
16) Custon Message 9"x30" 9.95/14.95 | 15.00/21.70 | 23.00/34.50 Reflect, Hi-Intent |D-grade
12"x18" 7.10/10.65 | 14.45/21.68 | 22.00/33.00
| 18"x24" 72.00/ 9.95/14.95 | 15.00/21.70 | 23.50/34.50 83) Double Arrow
36"x36"| 34.50/51.75 25.00/37.50 | 32.00/48.00 | 52.00/78.00 48"x24 yell. Reflect
17) Dead End 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 Aluminum rectangle 31.00 64.00
24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 Municipal Emblem 12.95
18) Detour 30"x24" 13.30 18.90 28.00 (pressure sensitive)
19) Dip 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 |85) Safety Flags
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40 |24" safety Flag | 5.25
20) Double Arrow  48"x24" 31.00 64.00 21.70 30.40 44.80 86) Folding Signs
21) Flour. Yell/Green 24"x18" No Bid No Bid 19.00 24"x24" Binder sign 32.00
24"x24" No Bid No Bid 26.20 folding sign
30"x30" No Bid No Bid 40.20 Port. Stands(3 &4) 140.00
36"x36" No Bid No Bid 58.40 legs Quad flex 36"
48"x48" 135.00 No Bid No Bid 94.50 8'x10' upright sign 15.00
22) Fresh Oil 24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40 post
23) Handicap Unlimit  12"x6" 2.45 4.55 6.65 30"x30"Roll up Mesh 75.00
12"x9" 3,70 5.80 7.90 stop/slow Paddle fold
12"x12" 5.60 8.40 11.90 87) Stub Post
12'x18" 6.00 8.40 11.50 square post 2"x2" 12' [ 35.00
12"x24" 7.70 10.50 14.00 88) Sign Assy Hardware
18"x18" 6.05 8.55 12.60 anti theft bolts 0.25
18'"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 5/16 bolts 2 1/2 x 3" 0.35
24) Handicap X-ing 12"x18" 6.00 8.40 11.90 1/4 bolts 2" 0.35
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80 90) Dome Drums
24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00 4" x Transfer Tape | [ [ [ 1328
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00 91) Speed Bumps
36"x36"| 3450 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.00 6" Speed Bump (plast) | [ ] [ 11250




Delta Specialties Signs Supplies
Awarded Items

48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60

25) Handicap Stencil 48" 65.00 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

26) Arrow Sign 21"x12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pointing down R or L 7.70 10.50 14,00
27) Ice on Bridge 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00

28) Interlocal sgn-1 side 4"x8" 250.00 360.00 No Bid

2side  4"x8" 350.00 495.00 No Bid

29) Office & Shop signs 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30) Keep Back 25ft 12"x9" 4.10 5.61 7.00
31) Lto R Marker Brid 12"x36" 9.95 15.00 23.00
18"x24" 9,95 15.00 23.00

32) Mattress 18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00
33) Men Working 24"x24" 12.95 18.00 29.00
34) Metal Area 18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00
35) Mowers Ahead  36'"x36" 34.50 72.00 25.00 36.00 52.00
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 45.00 52.00 92.00

36) Narrow Bridge 24"x24" 12.95 18.00 29.00
30"x30" 20.00 28.00 39.00

37) Neighborhood Wat 18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00
24"x30" 13.95 19.00 37.00

38) No Dumping 18"x24" 9.95 15.00 23.00
24"x30" 13.95 19.00 37.00

60"x30"| 48.00 100.00 25.00 32.00 52.00

39) Pavement Ends  30"x30" 20.00 28.00 39.00
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40

40) Pedestrians 36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60

30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00

41) Public/Priv Park 12"x18" 6.00 8.40 11.90
18"x24' 8.05 11.40 16.80

42) R to L Marker 12"x36" 10.85 13.25 19.75
18"x24" 8.05 14.40 16.80

43) Rd Closed Thru Traf 60"x30" 48.00 100.00 33.60 47.45 70.00
48"x30"| 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00

44) Road Closed 48"x30" 38.40 80.00 26.90 37.95 56.00
45) Rd Constr, Ahead 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.50 34.15 50.40

48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60

46) Rd Mach, Ahead 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40

48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60

47) School Ped X-ing 30"x30" No Bid No Bid 36.40
36"x36"| 38.00 No Bid No Bid 56.70

48) School Zone/cell  24"x8" 8.95 12.75 21.55
24'"x10" 8.95 12.75 21.55

18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80

24"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80

24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40

24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00

24"x48"| 30.00 35.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80

30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00

48"x48"| 6145 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60

36"x36"| 34.50 72.0 24.15 34.15 50.40

49) Signs & Blanks 6"x18" 6.25 8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6"x24" 7.89 10.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6"x30" 9.86 13.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6"x36" 10.95 14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30"x30" 33.90 50.00 16.80 23.75 35.00

50) Single Arrow 30"x36" 25.00 60.00 20.30 28.45 42.00
48"x24'|  30.00 39.00 51.00 21,70 30.40 44.80

51) Single Arrow L/R  30"x36" 29.00 60.00 20.30 28.45 42.00
48"x24"| 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80

52) Slow 24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00

36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40

53) Slow for Children 24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80

SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF SF/DF

|54) Specialities Signs  2"x16" 2.80/4.20 3.65/5.45 No Bid

6"x12" 2.80/4.20 3.65/5.45 No Bid

12"x9" 3.15/4.55 4.00/5.80 No Bid

12"x18" 5.60/8.40 7.30/10.85 No Bid

18"x24" 11.20/16.80 | 14.55/21.80 No Bid

24"x24" 14.95/22.40 | 19.40/29.05 No Bid

24"x36" 22.40/33.60 | 29.05/43.60 No Bid

9" Speed Bump (plast) 157.50
6" Speed Bump (plast) 194.92
yell/black
93) Misc.

Slow Moving Vehicle 9.95
040 Aluminum

Slow Moving Vehicle 6.95

decal -triangle

Keep Back 500 ft. decal 9.95

33"x3" reflective
Tape-Caution Buried 3'x1000' 14,95
Electrical Lines
Post Driver 325.00
18" Double faced 16.95

Hand Paddles




Delta Specialties Signs Supplies
Awarded Items

30"x24" 18.70/28.00 | 18.70/28.00 No Bid
30"x30" 23.40/35.00 | 30.30/45.45 No Bid
30"x36" 28,05/42.10 | 36.35/54.50 No Bid
36"x12" 11.20/16.80 | 14.55/21.80 No Bid
48"x24" 29.90/44.80 | 38.75/58.10 No Bid
48"x48" 59.80/89.75 | 77.55/116.20 No Bid
4'x8' 227.50/341.25 | 301.00/451.50 No Bid
55) Speed Limit 10-40 mph 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
10-40 mph 24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
56) Stop Ahead 24"x24" 12.60 19.95 29.40
30"x30" 19.60 30.10 45.50
36"x36" 35.00 44,10 66.50
57) Stop Signs 18"x18" 10.35 12.95 19.57
24"x24" 11.87 15.75 24.50
30"x30" 18.20 24.50 37.80
36"x36" 75.00 26.60 32.90 52.50
48"x48" 63.00 77.00 105.00
60) Supplement Plaques 12"x6" 2.45 4,55 6.65
61) "T" Intersection  24"x24' 10.75 15.20 22.40
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
62) Tire Area 18'"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
63) Traffic Signs 9"x12" 3.70 5.80 7.90
18"x12" 6.00 8.40 11.90
18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
24"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80
24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40
24'"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
24"x36" 16.10 22.75 33.60
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
30"x36"| 29.00 60.00 20.30 28.45 42,00
36"x12" 10.85 13.25 19.75
48"x24"| 30.00 39.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44.80
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
64) Trash Area 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80
65) Truck Crossing 36"x36" 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
66) Warning Signs 9'"x12" 3.70 5.80 7.90
18'"x12" 6.00 8.40 11.90
24"x18" 8.05 11.40 16.80
24"x24" 10.75 15.20 22.40
24"x30" 13.30 18.90 28.00
24"x36" 16.10 22.75 33.60
30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
36"x12" 10.85 13.25 19.75
36"x36"| 34.50 72.00 24.15 34.15 50.40
48"x24"|  30.00 35.00 51.00 21.70 30.40 44,80
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
67) Water On Bridge 30"x30" 126.80 23.75 35.00
48"x48"| 61.45 86.70 128.00 43.00 60.70 89.60
68) Yield Sign 30'x30"x30" 18.90 25.15 36.40
36"x36"x36" 25.55 35.55 51.80
69) "Y" Intersection 30"x30" 16.80 23.75 35.00
70) Your Trash-secure 18"x24" 8.05 11.40 16.80




EXHIBIT “B”

HIDALGO COUNTY

(All funding sources)

TRAFFIC ROAD SIGNS AND MISC. EQUIPMENT
RFB NO: 2011-027-01-12-SGS

Lelta \;)/p:za rathes Oigns ¥ Jﬂﬁ,ﬁﬁ

T

BID PAGE(S)

Vendor must thoroughly fill in each section of the Bid Page, if applicable. INCOMPLETE submittals shall be considered a
probable cause for disqualification. All must be in compliance to the Texas Department of Transportation standards and Federal Highway

standards.

Legends on signs will be on one or two sides: reflective grade will vary by dept.

Bid Prices are on a unit price basis.

R R ? Category A- New bl ety o '.,_Q.alt_'éﬁér;@,'l?é-facing of Signs
ol et Reflective |  High Diamond f:iii:ﬁ.fs | Reflective | High | Diamond
' Intensity Grade ' | Intensity Grade

1) 3 Way

) |12 xer 250 | (50 | 950 145 |455 |Ce%
2) 4 Way

0_/ 12" x 6" Tt G50 .50 =-S5 HrE | g 65

5‘ 24"x 18" (/50 | 625 |FHed £05 | vo |80
3) AJC And Refrigeration

¢/ [18x2e 50 | /695 |2900 Fos |y /o8
4) All Way

5| 18" xer Y. 50 G50 G s 3./5 Y55 16.65
5) Arrow Signs

b a8 x2ar 3/ 90 | Y320 | (e P70 |30 |54

7 | 20°x " 7/8 /2-%¢ | /.57 Sgs | 875 |Hew

§ | 15°xer C/8 Ve /5 57 4325 |505 | /e
6) Bridge Closed

G | 6% 36" 3450 |45 I | 722 0o JY 5 139/5 | 5040

/)| 48" x 48" Gl Y5 | &b. 70 | /2.2 Y200 (Lp 25| 8960

J/. | 30" x 30" JY ¢o | 73.9p | 0. ¢ JE .50 LgAE |85 %

/7] 48" x 30" 35 Y0 |5920 |dF0.°° 6. %p |37 75| 5¢.00
7) Bridge Out

&1 Rt Dy 00 |33 9p |Sv.eo (680 |A3.75|35-2¢
8) Brush Area _ ‘ri

e/ 18x24:w /;‘%?5'0 /:;,,.;)_5’ LY. v F.85 V7 vo | 680

- =3 :

&

|

A
~

o,
e
s




Category A~ New

 Category B-

 Category C- Re-facing of Signs

e M D nineenve | High - Diamond | Accessories | Reflective |- “High |’ Diamond
g Intensity Grade "] < ke TS bt s | -Intensity | -~ Grade
9) Cabie/ Utility Wamning Signs
5| o x 460 | (.50 /09D 3./5 455 | 765
Jb| 128 x3 % 2.5 % BT | e 5.246 | 5.80 |0 90
/77| 12"xe" 5. 25 | g25 |//25 LT 5.80 |9 9p
10) Caution
/4| 18" x 24" 50 | {495 | v £.05 |/ %0 | /680
[ | 30"x30" g7.5% |Zr.% |50.% [6.80 |A2.75 |35.00
11) Children At Play
0| 24" x 30" /709 |27 00 | Yoo /3.30 |/fZe |25 ¢~
/| 18 x 24" [A50 |/6.25 | 2 o0 $08 | JARD \PLID
12) Curve: Right or Left Curve Ahead
I |24 x4 2E-8s | B4 9y 22. 00 /0. 75 Vs Jgo | 220
J3.1 30" x 30" 2 vo | 32.70 |B0.00 (¢.80 (2375 |35 .77
I | 30" x 36" Ao.00 | Y065 | Lo o . 2430 | JR¥5 |99
13) Construction Zone Warning Signs  (Orange background wrbiack copy)
57| 18 x 18 oY | /e | /5 oo .05 |55 |fage
S, | 24" x 24" /535 | A48 | 32, 00 0. 7% /590 | 2.0
J7 | 30" x30r JdY oo |32 48 | 50 e /6.8 | 22.757| 9500
Jb. | 36"x36" ¢/ 56 | 4580 | D200 7905 |24 /5| 50 50
9. | 48 x4 Gl.y5 | 8670 \/og. e Y3.00 {4200 #5460

14) Roll-up Mesh Signs

Legends needed for Roll -Up Mesh Signs (including rib w/ orange background) will be as followed, but not limited to:
(i.e. Road Construction Ahead, Mowers Ahead; Right Lane Closed Ahead; Men Working Ahead , Right & Left Lane

Closed Ahead)

!

3@ 18" x 18" /)///_? o i /U/Z - e
: 30" x 30" s o
e+l B N/ A
36" x 36" & I —
33" 7500 4f o | P00 N/ B
. Tx 48" . ’
jd/ 48" x 55" o é 005" vy /J— do /L/’/g —— —
15) Construction Zone Signs & Supplemental Signs (Crange background w/black copy)
Zs. pzxw dide |F24F |49 77 G.ve | 570 |~ 2P0




‘ Cate'goty A-_Néw .

| category - Re-facing of Signs

" Category B-

| Reflective | . High = | Diamond | accessories | Reflective | -High - | Diamond
S Intensity -Grade el e L Intensity Y| Grade
Tb.| 24" x12" o le /5400 | Do.vo 770 (050 | /¥ <o
37| 18" x24" 50 N /6.95 | Ay oo 505 e | Je. 52
g1 24"x 18" At s A2 A y o5 iy | e go
39 | 30"x 24" /G.00 |29 00 S.4 (3-30 |50 | 2& o2
G| 30"x 307 SLY0 123250 | 5p. % lG-&0 | P3.75 | 35 e
4 | 48" x18" 7J 50 A7 50 G /575 | 2oes | D& Y
]| 48" x 24" 30.¢0 | 3% 0o 5/ % M0 | B | v sp
44| 48" x 30" 570 | s 9, Su 2620 |390.95 | 5¢. 00
16) Custom Message )
g;%z?gn:n Cg?; or both S/F | DIF | SIF | DIF | SIF D/F | SIF (single faced) or Dlz,déqule faced)%/( e NE
reflective grade will vary) SE__OF  SF DF Sr . oF
4 . 14g 700 (1528|9058 | 0420 [36. 40 795 | /y 95Y/5:00| 94| 237 |9.50
2[5} 12°x 18" 560 |/2.90 /300 | 187 | /7. | 25 50 718 | le 65)/4 4519448 207 |33
4| 18" x 24" .50 )7 35/t 7512435 94/ 00 |3 o0 4.95 /¥ G5 .00 | g LI P | 3Y.5¢
¢/7| 36"x 36" 2450|8775 |4 £50\78.90 |72 4 /st v 520395032 4| g 5«?-“’” 754
17} Dead End ' ‘ ‘
98| 30" x 30 2702 32.7p | 50.49 /(.80 P2 s | 3500
Y9 24 x 24 /5.35 | A/ 70 |32 00 (025 | /520 |22 v0
18) Detour
50 | a0 x24" /7.9 9008 | 4p v /220 | /590 2o
19) Dip
57/ | 30" x30" Jyce 123.90 | 5p op /G Jo |F3.75| 35 e
57| 36"x 36" 3950 | Y880 | D9, 20 Py s5 |34/5 |50 ¢
20) Double Arrow
57| 48" x 24 300 434 e? vo .20 |20.% | b0
21) Fluorescent Yellow Green Safety Di¢  on / 4
54| 24 x 18" . — 27 o0 - — /7%
55| 24" x 24" — | — 2¢. 7Y - - e 20
&% | 30" x 30" SO - s o - — Yo .20
W a2 v - — | 58 90

6



AL ' Category A- New 1 _ Category C- Re-fa'ciné of ngns
Sl g T Category B- a0 e
B .| Reflective High Diamond |- Accessories Reflective '| . High Diamond
B i intensity Grade .« | . b v as Bt | Intensity | - Grade
58] 487x 48" — e /3522 _ e %
22) Fresh Oil
59| 24" x 24° /585 | 2/.e8 |34 .00 (95 | Foda | S
23) Handicap unlimited wording & symbols  (blue & white)
L | 12'xe" 350 | (.50 g5 e Y55 | ¢ e5
bl | 129" 5.2 |Fas | /a5 3.70 598 | 290
G| 12 x 2 ., Y/, Jb. 7Y 5. Lo g0 | 1/ 90
43 12'x 18" re@ | fagve | /7P .o Fre | /150
(Y] 12 x2e i5e | /5.5 | A5 7.70 /050 | /Y00
45| 18 x e ¥ ey |/r2.80 | JF e G055 §55 | ra2-6¢
4| 18 x2e ALEE [JE ax | 2a $.05 |\ppyo | /g 2o
24) Handicap X-ing
(7| 12 x e fiop |fdwa | fA ¢.°° g% |//50
4| 18 x2e (/50 | /695 | 2o 505 \Mve | /680
é,?_ 24'x30 /D te | D988 | Y07 /3.30 |/pp0 |28 ¢/
7). 30 x30 dv o0 | 32.5¢ | 5077 6-F0 | P35 | 35w
7/.| 38" x 36" 3950 | L5850 | 79 0 FRAE foves | B9 2
7,0, 48" x 48" Gr-s L 5670 | /98 %7 Y500 |¢ono | £9.¢0
25) Handicap Stencil
77| 18"x 12 — . i i - o~
24| 322 - __# - - - pins
75 [ /__ - o o .
74, 44" x 38" Dulo Max | . - l =
77 48" Handicap Stencil Q 5. 00 /2. w0 sy — ‘
28) Arrow Sign
21" x 12" pointi
75 dow):l righF;(:;:Igf‘tg // 0 /5, ,,?y a4 7,70 LO.5¢ | 7. da
27) lce on Bridge
30" x 30" - - 4
™" 29 12390 | 55 Iy 8o |92.95 |35.00
| 28) Inter-locall Project Signs |
- f; : T | I
| =~ E% % 7




‘Category A- New

Category B-

o Categ'_ory.ic-:'Ré-.f,éc_:lh_g of Signs

| Reflective |  High Diamond | :Accessories | Reflective | .High | Diamond
o e T | intensity Grade .. ) S o] Intensity | . Grade
o sasome 135~ | gz00] — 250 200 | —
7| dountesided . |537.50 | (1250 | — 1500 | g5 | —
iRl ST el vl ipedgel Iy -
: Weludes Jend Co WAeEr , Sudo 2| Phlane # | Lo stalef )
30) Keep Back 26 Feet Jeca/
83| 12xe = s — Y s 5.¢0 | 700
31) Left to Right Marker Bridge
§4 12'x 36 /5v7 /890 | 2820 795 |r5.00 | g5.00
5| 18" x 24" /50 |/ J5 | 2w 7. 55 L5028
32) Mattress
Sb| 187 x 24" /50 S35 | A ev G G5 | fomop | A3.090
33) Men Working
97| 24" x 24" /535 | pL 68 | BA.ev /2.95 | opov | 2200
34) Metal Area
59| 18" x 24" 1050 \[L.05 | Ay G957 /500 |23
35) Mowers Ahead
§9 36" x 36" Y50 | 4¥ .50 | pp.00 A5.20 | 3 00 | S3.00
g/ | 48" x 48" GLr s | S¢6 D0 S5 v Y5 o0 |B2ev |DPg.e0
36) Narrow Bridge
G| 22 1535 | 2/ 20 | 22,00 (2.55 |/800 |25
23] 30" x 30 Jv.00 | 3390 |50 00 2o.00 | 28w |33 <
37) Neighborhood Watch
93| 18" x 24" /) 50 i 25 | d¥.de G F5 Yoy, A3 o
(M 24" x 30" /P00 2. v Sy o0 ’3.95 |/Feo | 27 04
38) No Dumping
45| 18" x 24" /)50 Ve 95 | J420 9.95 | /5ge |7 e
AR g 7o 29 oo R 3.95 |, 97 2177
g7 60" x 30" L. o0 L9 95 |faa ™ dS5w00 |g9 8 |B52¢
38) Pavement Ends
97| 30" x 30" 32 .88 | 4p. 0 YR SE® gy

d]f/ 44




Category A- New

Category B-

Category C- Re-facing of Signs

T ‘
ern - |- Reflective High Diamond | - Accessories | Reflective | . High | Diamond
T Sl A s Intensity Grade - W5 et o Intensity | - Grade
94| 36"x 38 3950 | 4g 50 | T 2.5 | 308ds | 25 s
40} Pedestrians
/0] 36" x 38" Ly . 5m Y5 50 | 7200 L AT | 35 | B8k
/01| 48" x 48" @5 | 8670 | y28 00 75.%0 | Lpe | 38 fu
/(4| 30"x 30" 2v0o |33.90 |50 00 (6 -850 | 22.75 | 35 00
41) Public/ Private Parking Sign
05, 12 x 18° §60 | j2.00 | s7 00 G.ooo | §v0 (/7 %0
JU¥| 18" x 24" M50 i .25 | 2vieo £ o5 | oo | 4 so
42) Rightto Left Marker
/5] 12" x 38" /597 | /850 | 2820 Jo .85 |/2.95 | )9 05
0] 18 x2% 50 | 25 | dYew 5§05 |\ /5o |/C-J0
43) Road Closed to Thru Traffic
/]| 80" x30" &Y. o0 6275 | oo o0 3260 |97245 | 7000
/&IX 48" x 30" ZX S 5‘/ 20 g’zﬂ Zil g]éj?d 37 ?j/ 5@.”0
44). Road Closed . i ’
! " om Road 20
/09| s “rl S Gy ws | S0 |ros e 43.00 (2070 |8F¢0
Ji| 48 x30 2";?25,5_ 3950 154 25 | sy 2¢.90 |37.95 |s5¢.00
(1 3ex3e 9 | 3vs0 | vgs0 | Do 2405 |35 |50 00
45) Road Construction Ahead
/1| 30" x 30" 2y 02 33.90 | 5o (¢ KV | 2875 | 3549
/13 2::"32: 3¢50 | 98-80 | 7" FYs0 |3y /5|50 40
X
/19 ¢r. 5 | 9670 | /2877 INPENEBIM 7342 (4020 |85 ¢ 0
46) Road Machinery Ahead il
2 9’{'{3;
//5.| 30" x 30" Y00 |23 .Fp | F9 0 — R K i1 7 S0 D3.75 | 21500
/)| 38 % 3" 3450 | 450 | 792 o |12 5 15 [39.05 |09
& ¢/ %5 560 | /28 WIHNESSED| o3 00 |4, 70 | #co
47) School Ped X-ing /21 729,17 o, D/
/4| 30" x 30" 2s.99 | 3350 |50 ¢ — - S
//77 36" x 36" g X - 6"7/) 06) X‘/ \ G T - e T yes 5& ‘ 7 C)
/;J AdA  Pyitpoom fig%\'; wl fjméo/ - JPEE ¥ édhif\? gl .ﬂmj Standagd colofs
§'v 6" 15. %8 gy




- Category A-New =~ ' ' Categoryc Re- facmg ofS:gns
Réfléctwe High DJamond E::':ﬁgg,fs Reﬂectwe ngh ; Dlamond
ER L T | -Intensity -| .. Grade .. ' Intensity | Grade
/ 7/, [48) School Zone Signs & Sohool Zone Signs (Call Phons Use Prombiied Up 7o § 200,00 Fing) Q/z/)(/f T T 92
e /2 7717270 1 3075 79517 75055
145 20 x 10 27811878 | 50 75 775\ /] 7517/ 5%
JH) 18 %24 /50 /0. 75| A0 P/ W A AV B ol
/5] 18 /S0 b 25 |2 00 JO05 |\ /50| 1680
(b e )5 35 | 2270 3200 W75 | 502040
/97| 24 x50 /90010700 | <p.00 /330 /8907800
| s 2007900 5700 AR
(] 50 %30 TS0\ 33 90| 57900 L. 0 | 2375| 3500
17| 4 x 28 414157 S 7| L2800 LB.00| 60 70, F9.40
7l FLD 470 7200 24/5 1 351 spp
49) Blanks JU/J%@&%M [%? /(?%
130 &x1er 522 1 4625 | 50 A8 | — | =
/ﬁ 6" x 24" 475; % JW/ /f A /(]/E o’ i
/7 & x30 LI 95 (/345 B 4 = =
/35| ' x36" 295\ /.95 | /Y 95 A | = | =
[ 30 x30 TS 001 3390 | 5700 /6. R | 23 75| 3540
50) Single Arrow
/37| 30 w36 900\ W45 | 40 00 I FONIR A 7200
A 3000 | 39200 5708 L T\ 300\ <450
51) Single Arrow Left/Right
134 wrwoe 7700|7451 2270 7.30| 7545] 72700
j)| 48 28 I0001 39001 5700 W 70| syl 50
52) Slow {)P}}’;]ﬁ g”é‘ L
e (5351 P 52001 oyl [ 751 m a0l 207
I Y00 S5 52,00 6. 50 | I375| 3500
07 R 345058 50 Z;Xﬂ& l/ll 20 FY /5| 34 /51 5940
53) Slow For Children witnessed
[ /700 127001 <030 /5301 /2 | 520
il 18 %24 /50 |/J6.25 | K00 7__%( .05 /)< /6.80)
0|



B ek Category A- New Categ‘ory,clRé facing of Signs
dieedtem o - : ] CategoryB :

Al S s .~ | Reflective High Dlamqnd_ Accessones Reﬂeetwe :  High Dlamoud
ety W ol e Intensity Grade . | Intensity | - Grade
/gg}/aé%éjc::;:is{ gi;/r?sr SIF DiF | SIF DiF | SIF DiF @g(sﬁgylgesfaggz;ﬂb%/éggub%?ggé’ﬁ/ }f - ﬂ[//ﬁn/M -

Pl B FI% YW\bIO\5 0\ 780\ 745 g5 F/f% »f’?f ﬁif ﬁf A//ér.) Zy = Héfgg
B W SOD\OD\T 0 780\ 7/5 075|280 | 40 | 3.45| 45
oy wwy I9450\50183017¢5.95|  3./5 | Zs5 Lo s/
(49 SON2000D0 V54 IS S fo) S50 | 730 )5
/90 &' x24 LODIIANZS 315\ KNI 2/ 20 | L6800 | Jed 55| N
£ il 3SBIIIBN N FBplaza] /4 95~ | 2290 | /70 D905
/527 . AN BN D I 2650050 T2 T 133 460 | D205 <340
/53 LI DA PN D778 .70 2540 | /9 20| 28 1))
/57| 30 x 2 HPDUBIES DTN 3.7 | 3500|3030\ <5 /5]
&3] it SN SP05\ 7 5 I) E L5 2. 10| 3. 35| 545
g DL BIDINB 35\ D 200 /20 | b 80 | /4 58] 280
[57) 2 WP ss B0 200000 DT ) |4~/ 8D |38 75| 58/
/58] x4 I SISl 200N 5780 | §975 | 7755\ b Y
/59 axs BISOOBISNIRS? —— |97 5p B 25 \qmo0 | 5157
55) Speed Limit
[0, cevemiroonzeecs) | // 570 | 10, 75 | X/ 05\ /050
W | fepominamon | /9200 | 7700 { 2000 e VLt A V. /A V) &
56) Stop Ahead (Symbols & words) ! d
T 17295 |05 L0 1 T 17740 1/97 179
/(3] x50 W00 14300 | 450 ,4240“ /9 40 130 /1P| /5767
/4] 56" x 36" 5000 14300 | 9520 |Nifisnessed 75-00 [54/ /0| 46509
57) Stop Signs
/5] 1w x (678 | 1250|2795 o, /935 | L1951 ]957
JLb) 2 %2 (695 050 | /95 14 Vg7 /575 /50

11
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‘o o2 Category A- New o bl e 2 -;-Ca:tegory_é},jﬂe-facing"ofSighs
o % ;_ A',Ref-!ec,tive High ,'Diamon'd- _ -Eg;igggii F{éﬂeétfﬁef _'.High' »Di?mODd
SE e s e kT Intensity Grade L. L. | Intensity | Grade
/7 Ab- 0D 135 0D {SY. dD [X. 20 | 2450127 &D
i 36" x 36" 3€00 (47.00|75. D0 2b. b0 | 3290 |52.50
[P 48 xae 90-00 [/7D.0b | /50 b b3.00 {77.00|/05 00
58) Stop Stencil  (separate letters & one stencil} 2 ée}:'ters ,ﬂep% 7,
|/ ] — | — | — lgsmlrow] — [ — |-
53) Street Name Signs  (legend to he on one or both sides)
/7| & x 18" /.CD | H5.50 | 28.05 N B s
[ 7]| & 24 [b. S0 2 50 |28.95 WA = || =
/73] &% /750 | 24.9C |29. 95 @ B sl
JY| & x3e" 9. $0 129.9¢ |39.9C A6 | - |~
60) Supplemental Plaques
/75 12*xe" 3.0 | 4.50 | 9,80 R4S |4-88 | b v
61) “T” Intersection
)74 24" x2a" [5.35 1 2) b€ | 3200 | /0.7 [/ 20|22.90
/77] 20" x 30" 24- DD |33.8% 1 50.00D /.80 |23.75|35. 00
[ 78| 38 x 38" 34. S0 [4€.80 | 72,00 24.)S |34.75]50-90
62) Tire Area
/79| 18" x 24" 11.50 1625 |2Y. 00 £ 08 {1190 |/4.80
63) Traffic Signs
/80| &x 12" )8 [ll.496 |/5.57 3.70 (580 |7.90
/4| 18 x 12" .60 1/2.00 |17. 0D .00 | L.HO |//. S0
/g0 18 x 24" [1- 50 () b.25 (2.4, 0D ODENED .05 /. 40|/b.40
431 24" x 18" J/.50 | /b.25 |24 00 |7 w . 180< 1) 90l/6 .40
B 24 x2a 15.35 |2/ 70132 00-—AYD __/p.7¢ )5 20| 0040
146 24 x0° /9. 00 |27.00 |40 06| (4" 1/3.30 |/§.90]|28 00
166 | 24" x 38" A3.00 | 35D |4€. 00 [Withessed /- /0 122.7¢(33. 60
[E7] 30" x 30" 29.00 [33.9p|S0.00 | [b. 80 [23.75|35-00
/88| 30 x 3 2900 |40.6S {60 0D o 20-30 |2 8.45|4A- 0D
/49| 36" x 12" 1.0 | 1.20 |29 0 Al ), 85 1/ 3, 2|18, 75~

12




e 7 Category A- New e . Category G- Re-facing of Signs
S Ulem Category B- e et
ez | Reflective High Diamond | - Accessories | Reflective | - ‘High | Diamond
o oemt Intensity Grade | .. | Intensity | Grade
= 2D.00 |3%.00 | S/ 0D 2.70 |30 Up|dy. 0
AR bl-4S |8k.70 [128.00 73.00 |(0.70|87. 40
64) Trash Area
/47| 18 x 24 [ $0 [ /.25 |24. DD g.05 |/l4o |/t 8D
65) Truck Crossing
/9] 36 x 36" 3Y.5D |4£.80 |72 00 2405 |34 )< | sp.do
/74| 48" x 48" bl-4Y< |8&-70 |} 28 0p Y300 |40 70 | £9. Lo
/75] 30" x 30" 24-00 |33.48 | S0.00 [b-80 123.7¢7135.00
66) Warning Signs
(]2 1€ 11196 |]557 Aon |lew) [
/97| 18" 12 . b0 |/2.0D]| /7 0D b.ovo |€¥e [/1.9p
JH) 24 x 18 11.50 |Jb-25124-0p €0< 1/)-4Yo |/b. g0
/99] 24 /S35 | M- 70 |32. 0D [0.75 1S 20|22.90
A 24" x 30" /9. DD 22.00 [H0. 0D /3.20 1/8 90 |2€. 00
A | 24 x 38" 2%: pp 3280 | 98086 [b. 10 1 22.7¢ 133, bo
7| 30" x 30 Y. 0P tS3. 051 CH: DD J b 8D |23.75(35 60
3| 86" x 12" [1-S0 | /.20 |2¢.00 /0-85 |/ B3.2c14. 757
Jpy) % *% 34.50 |48 4D |72 po 2Y./S 345 | SD-40
v/ 3000 |39 00 |S/.00 270 |30 Yp|4Y &0
.| 48" x 48" bl 45 |£b.70 |/ 28. 0D Y3-00 |60.70 |£9. Lo
67) Water on Bridge
707 | 30"x 30" 24.00 |33.90| 5000 )l -80 |23.7¢ |35.00
V.| 48" x a8 bl 95 | §b.70 1)28. bD g raage | A3 00 (6070|489 Lo
68) Yield Sign UFENEGL?
T8 P —— 27.00 |25°90|52.00 | Qi /€90 [22/<|30.90
20| % 536" x 30 3b:S0 [50.80 |74 00 | |28 2655 |35 ¢ e 40
69) Y Intersection YJC«'FGLE‘G'&\MF.QF@}@
/| 30" x 30" 24.00 [33.9p | <ppp | /b 8D |23.7¢ 2¢ 00
70) Your Trash Must Be Secure At All Times
I 18" x 24" J1-S0 |/l 25 | 2¢.0p Q/ L0 ). Y0 [/l 8D

13




Category A- New

- Category B- |5

‘Categoty C- Re-facing of Signs

A7

JH

N5

o ;Reﬂ_eqtive High Diamor_sd Accessories .| Reflective -:'High Diamond
spdEeR R B e Bl Bl T Intensity oarade. T s T IR R ) o “oi|-Intensity | Grade
71) 3" Center Pavement Reflectors-{ceramic)

Amber / ) CS O
Clear / 7 O
Red or white / /g/ S

Al

72) 4" Center Pavement Reflectors-{ceramic)

7

b

A

Amber / ; 5 E\,
Clear ¥ 7 D
Red or white /. &5

73) Brackets & Caps

A

Aluminum Brackrts for

6" 9" Pyni/{ L

2

Cross Brackets

X
AL
C

A

Round Post Bracket

293

U Post Brackets

B

90° Bracket for 4 Way
Assembly (all types& size ~
post & sign height)

AP

45° 1 180" Bracket for 4
Way Assembly (all types &
Size post & sign height)

L
47
I

Post Cap for U Channel
Posts

Post Cap for 2" & 3"
Posts

Post Cap - 1 3/4 Sq
Pest for Flat Assy

.

3" Post Caps
(standard 3" pipe)

.....

A3l

Post Dome caps
(standard 3” pipe)

OPENE

I3

| Plate

Wing Bracket -All Sign

Shye ps o

4 da 0 W

Aol+s ‘o
U v Pola

1 948

239
A,

Standard 14" Wing
Bracket jyvy @ Yy Y

(

() 00

| 12°%

D/ (

J%.

Heavy Duty 24" Wingx &

)

7

‘?‘n{LroﬂEB
1

/&; e,

%fef@:zswlﬁ

Bracket ((MLLH} )
74) Barricades

)37

A-Frame 30" Tall x 6

SIF DiF

SIF DiF

SIF

DIF

Wide -All Plastic Frame
{single or double faced)

150%

/2500

14




C
ategory A- N
ew

cate

9°ry } oW

Re'faclng of Si
'Qﬂs

Category B .

3§ Reat e Reflective
T ed) ‘:’) > Inten D
jjy (d?:;;![ .Bam,cé//f) Ze//j .r(L hlmg_/ sity gmond
or2 sig.;:)"e‘fﬁhggﬁ -10" ?’/ ﬁ dare e [)‘? ﬂ rade AcCess
eting i n . N ; 0r|e
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EXHIBIT “C”
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS
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ACORD' CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE g

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE GERTIFICATE HOLDER,

IMPORTANT: [f the certiicate holder iz an ADDITIONAL INSURED, tha policy(ies) muat be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
tha terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate doas not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lisu of such endorsement(s).

CONTAGT

PRD‘;UGERG NAME CUSTOMER SBRVICE CENTER
t oup, Ina. i FAX
g’.’o?naoxrmgso .m&’.‘tfq.jm (866) 972-7378 | IAIG, wa (800) 455-8611
el ZSBEERVICECENTER®ZISINTERNET . COM
JACKSONVILLE FL 32247-0660 e
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAICHE |
—— INSURER A : Maryland Capualty 19356
INSURED INSURER B : Asurance Company of America 19308
MARTIN & MARGARITA PEMA DEA DELTA — s
SPECIALTIES, SIGNE & fUPPLIES NathERG2
10205 E Btate Highway 107 INSURER D -
Bdinburg TX 78542 INBURER € | —
INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: Cazt ID 87662 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSLED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN I$ SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUGED BY PAID CLAIMS.

3 TYPE OF INSURANGE ﬁﬁ POLICY NUMBER | e ;r:_g,'-“c'n%* ) LIMITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE | F 1,000,000
B R | COMMERGIAL GENERAL LIABILITY : 4 PAB03B483617 7/9/3011 (7/9/2042 _gngMl_s__hgs_;E.if:;.,E.-fLm) |s 1,000,000
CLAMS-MADE | % | 06CUR MEOEXP (Anyanaparson) | & 10,000
L PERSONAL & ADVINJURY _|S 1,000,000
] GENERAL AGGREGATE § 2,000,000
GENL AGGREQATE LIMIT APFLIES PER: ‘ PRODVCTS - COMP/ORAGG | § 2,000, 000
PQLICY m B I x | oe | B §
| AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY PR aaNED SINGLELIMIT. [ ™3 666,600
B | __ | AaNyauTQ Y PAGO38483617 7/9/2011 |7/8/2012 BODILY INJURY (Per paracn) | §
L AL NED -7 i [ | BODILY INJURY (Par accizant)| &
| X | HREDAUTDS | X | NONQWNED || [ PROPERTY SAMAGE 3
‘ | | 'HIRED AUTO FHY DAM| S 50,000
B | X |UMBRELLALAE | X | seeur ¥ PASO38483617 7/9/2011 |7/9/2012 | EACH OCCURRENGE s 1,000,000
EXCESS LIAB | CLAIMB-NMADE ARAREGATE |8 1,000,000
peo | | meranmon s E s
A fﬁ?gﬁﬁiﬂ”ﬁ'ﬁmm« yin | : wCo38670213 7/8/2011 |7/9/z2012 L-E er&'s‘r_ ITOETF;‘
;‘%EA%?E’E?E%%EE%EE?S':‘ECWVE |:| N/A E.L. EACH ACCIDENT : $ 100,000
If yas, describe under | | E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE § 100,000
DESCRIPTION OF UFERATIONS below : E.L. DISEASE « POLICY LIMIT I $ 500,000
‘ 5
3

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS | LOIATIONS / VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Adaitional Remarks Schadula, if mars APACH 18 required)

HIDALGO COUNTY IS& DESIGNATED AS ADDITIONAL INSURED AFFORDED B
FEE R e ¥ THIS POLICY AS SUBJECT TO THE POLICY

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

HIDALGO COUNTY ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
2802 § BUSINESS HIGHWAY 281 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
e e
EDINRURG TX 78538 “"—'//-X -
ACORD 2 @ 1988-,
= (2070/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marke ofil;%:gORD CORPORATION. All rights reserveq
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