
Project: Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4 - Construction of a New Multi-Purpose Facility and Mechanical Shop
ERO project No.: 11016
District: County of Hidalgo
Proposal Date and Time: Wednesday, February 29, 2012 @ 3:00 PM

COURIC ENTERPRISES  LLC DKIII HORNBACK ENRIQUEZ ENTERPRISES, HIGHMARK CONSTRUCTION JOURNEYMAN MATA G  CONSTRUCTION  

TABULATION

CASTLE ENTERPRISES, LLC COURIC ENTERPRISES, LLC
(FOREMOST CONSTRUCTION)

DKIII HORNBACK 
ENTERPRISES, LTD. DONALD D. FERGUSON, INC.

,
INC.

(E-CON GROUP)

HIGHMARK CONSTRUCTION 
CO., INC.

JOURNEYMAN 
CONSTRUCTION

MATA G. CONSTRUCTION, 
INC. TOPCON, INC.

 

NO BID

$4,935.00 - ADD $2,950.00 - ADD
$4,700.00 - ADD

NO BID $3,300,000.00 $3,150,000.00 $3,470,000.00

$8,500.00 - ADD

3 $76,248.00 - DEDUCT

Total Base Proposal Amount

ALT. NO. 02:
PARKING CANOPIES: 
DEDUCT CANOPIES AND 
RELATED ITEMS

ALT. NO. 3:

$25,000.00 - DEDUCT

2

$13,977.00 - ADD

ALT. NO. 01:  MAINTENANCE 
BUILDING PAINT FOR SHOP 
FLOOR

1 $3,343,900.00

$15,660.00 - ADD

$3,250,000.00

$10,500.00 - DEDUCT$30,000.00 - DEDUCT

$5,000.00 - ADD

NO BIDNO BID

6
ALT NO. 5:
STRUCTURAL STEEL
BASE BID

$10,000.00 - ADD NO BID NO BID NO BID $9,200.00 - DEDUCT

7
ALT. NO. 5:
STRUCTURAL STEEL
DEDUCT ALTERNATE BID 
ITEM

$10,000.00 - DEDUCT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$157,401.34 - ADD
ALT. NO. 3:
REFER TO CIVIL 
SPECIFICATIONS AT THE 
END OF PROJECT MANUAL

$60,000.00 - ADD4 $30,000.00 - ADD$285,438.00 - ADD $217,877.00 - ADD

$88,000.00 - DEDUCT $82,000.00 - DEDUCT$15,000.00 - DEDUCT5

ALT. NO. 4:
EMERGENCY BACKUP 
GENERATOR: DEDUCT 
GENERATOR AND TRANSFER 
SWITCH

$100,000.00 - NOT INDICATED $88,465.00 - DEDUCT

8
Addenda 
No. 1 & 2
Received

YES YES YES YES YES

9 Delivery Schedule-
Number of Calendar Days 270 199 38.46 WEEKS 37 WEEKS 30 WEEKS

10 BID BOND YES YES YES YES YES
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