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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Adnzinistration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(9506) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

TOQ: Dora Munoz, Commandor
Hidalgo County Task Force

ATTN:  Sonin Lopez, Admin, Assistant

FROM: Sandy Suarcx, Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: Marcch 16,2012

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION/CONCURRENCE REQUEST

Bid-Na. 2012-030-02-29-SGS-Hidalgo County - LEASI/RENTAL OF VEHICLES"

We have seceived two (2) responses (o (he above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find 4 copy of the rabulation
sheet aleng with copies of the. bid responses for your review and secommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your rccniumendalicniconcnr_mncc to award to the bidder meeting all
specifications/requiremnents and retorn fo the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-

7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hldalgo.fx.us by no later than Thursday, March 22, 2012 @10:00
A.M. in order: fo place this item on the agenda for next proposed Commissioners Court Meeting,

Tuesday, April 10, 2012

Indieate the name Vendor(s) in the box below. Showld you have any quesiions or require further information
please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext, 4860, Thank you for your altention and cooperation to this mater.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS: Enterprise

Request Enterprise employees stop use of driver!s personal addiess

be used for billing purposes, when payments have not been reciéved.

&/fe Aﬂ/Dora L. Munoz, Commander HIDTA 03-19-2012

v
:\UTH#MED SIGNATORE PIUNTED NAME DEPALRTMENT DATE

Enclosures



Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM = ow

TO: Anacleto Martinez, Chief Deputy
Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office

ATTN: Richard Ozuna, Lt. III / Juan Tapia, Procurement Specialist

FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer 11
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: March 16, 2012

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION/ CONCURRENCE REQUEST

Bid No. 2012-030-02-29-SGS-Hidalgo County -“LEASE/RENTAL OF VEHICLES”
Bl ———————— e 1
We have received two (2) responses to the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of the tabulation
sheet along with copies of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

Please acknowledge by signing below, your recommendation/concurrence to award to the bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-

7612 or email: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, March 22, 2012 @10:00
A.M. in order to place this item on the agenda for next proposed Commissioners Court Meeting,

Tuesday, April 10, 2012.

Indicate the name of the Vendor(s) in the box below. Should you have any questions or require further
information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext. 4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation

to this matter.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS: 1/ o« = Ay @ N vd))
LnTERPRISE Re? A Cak.
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
TABULATION SHEET- 2 RESPONDENTS

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County

DESCRIPTION OF BID: Iease/Rental Of Vehicles

BID NO.: 2012-030-02-29-SGS BUYER: SANDY SUAREZ
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 29, 2012 TIME: 9:30 A.M.
1. ENTERPRISE RENT A CAR 2. CAPPS VAN & CAR RENTAL
; Long Term Long Term % Long Term Long Term
Description of Vehicle: Daily Weekly Monthly x : Daily Weekly Monthly ; 3
3 Total Total Total ¥t ot Total Total Total bl W iiou
Insurance Insurance Insurance Insurance
Compact - i.e. Escort, Neon, Cavalier; or similar $36.50 $219.00 $ 803.00 $ 750.00 $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
models
Intermediate - i.e. Grand Am, Stratus, Sonata, $38.50 $231.00 $ 847.00 $775.00 $625.00 NO BID NO EID NO BID NO BID NO BID
626: or similar models
Full-Size Vehicle (2 to 4 door) - i.e. Taurus, $ 40.50 $243.00 $891.00 $ 800.00 $675.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,145.00 $ 895.00
Grand Prix, Intrepid, Monte Carl; or similar
models
Minivan - i.e. Montana Vuyager, Windstar, $55.00 $336.00 $1,232.00 $ 1,100.00 $900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Astro, Caravan; or similar models
Midsize SUV 2 or 4 wheel drive - i.e. Blazer, $60.00 $360.00 $1,320.00 $1,100.00 $950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Explorer, Cherokee: or similar models
Large SUV 2 or 4wheel drive - i.e. Suburban, $99.00 $594.00 $2,178.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 1,550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,600.00 $1,350.00
Excursion, Expedition; or similar models
‘ull size Van - i.e. Passenger, Econoline F150, $99.00 $594.00 $2,178.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 1,550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
250, 350; or similar models
Midsize Pickup single or double cab 2 or 4 wheel $ 50.00 $300.00 $ 1,100.00 $975.00 $ 800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
drive - i.e. Ranger, S-10; or similar models
Large Pickups single or double cab 2 or 4 wheel $ 65.00 $ 390.00 $ 1,430.00 $ 1,250.00 $ 950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,245.00 $995.00
drive - i.e. F-150 F-250 F-350, 1500, 2500, 3500;
or similar models
Unlimited miles on daily & weekly rates Long term miles- free up to 1500 miles - over $ 0.25
3,000 free miles on monthly & long term rentals Long term rental with Insurance - $1,000.00 Deductible
Long term rental with Insurance — No Deductible o 24 hr. Roadside Assist. Toll free number: 1-800-969-9329
e 24 hr, Roadside Assist. Toll free number:1- 800-307-6666 . Location of Fleet: San Antonio, TX.
° Location of Fleet: Edinl:turg= TX.-no deiiverz charge




HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE: _ February 29, 2012 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: “HIDALGO COUNTY-LEASE/ RENTAL OF VEHICLES”

BID NO.:_2012-030-02-29-SGS

SIGNATURE (IF

Bryan Hughes
Director of Operations

BID APPLICABLE)
NAME OF VENDOR: REQUEST | OR INITIALS OF STAFF
COMPANY/FIRM *VIA ADDRESSING MAIL OUT DATE ADDRESS & PHONE NO
CAPPS Rent A Car Inc BL Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 Houston, TX.
Mat Brading, EMail Brading@Goeapps.Com
Enterprise Rent A Car BL Sandy Suarez 02/14/2012 | 956-227-6149 -local
Gilberto Gonzalez IP Gilberto.gonzalez(werac.com
Lone Star BL Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 john.montgomery(@lonestarchevrolet.com
John Montgomery Caaail
Union Leasing Trust BL Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 fred@unionleasing.com
Fred Bulterman Email 2/16/12 will not be submitting an offer
Muncipal Services Group BL Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 donnam(@munibank.com
Donna J. Mount Email
Mac Haic Ford BL Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 | tsmith@machaikflm.com
Tim Smith Email
Penske BL Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 steve.tuleya@penske.com
Steven J. Tuleya Email
Capps Van and Truck Rental Email Sandy Suarez 02/13/2012 8555 John Carpenter Fwy

Dallas, TX 75247

C214.457.7900 O 214.630.6300x 013
F 866.669.7199

hugh@gocapps.com

Allstate Leasing
Brent Z. Baron

9428 Reisterstown Road

E-mail Sandy Suarez 02/14/12 | Owings Mills, Maryland 21117

P 410-363-6500 F 410-363-9532
bbaron(@allstateleasing.com

Mac Haik Ford Lincoln
Rick Krause
Commercial Acct. Mgr.

7201 S IH35

E-mail Sandy Suarez 02/15/12 Georgetown, TX. 78626

P 512-930-3673 C 512-423-5839
F 512-930-6340
RKraus@machaikflm.com

South Texas Freightliner
Eddie Vaughan

3103 N Cage Blvd
E-mail Sandy Suarez 02/16/12 Pharr, TX. 78577
956-782-8202 x13

edvaughan(@sbcglobal.net

Prime Vendor Inc.

4622 Cedar Avenue, Ste 123
E-mail Sandy Suarez 02/16/12 Wilmington, N. C. 28403-4429

P 800-746-9554 F 800-746-8307
Bids| 7@prime-vendor.com

Philpott Motors
Jarrod Runnels

P 888-973-5338 x 6521
E-mail Sandy Suarez 02/1712 F 409-724-0886
Jarrod.runnels@philpottmotors.com

krunnels@gt.rr.com

Acme Auto Leasing
Erin Maturo

P 203-234-6899 x 118
E-mail Sandy Suarez 02/22/12 C 203-627-1436 F 203-234-6850
cmamro(r'tlacmcautoleasina.com

*VIA:

IN PERSON (IP) TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR), BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM) E-MAIL(EM) FACSIMILE (FAX)






