
CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS INC. 
C-13-064-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 
CATEGORY A – “PIPES” 

REINFORCED POLYTHYLENE PIPE – 20 FOOT JOINT  

 
CONTECH ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS LLC 

24” NO BID 

30” 37.30 

36” 56.54 

42” 67.86 

48” 72.76 

54” 101.12 

60” 112.27 

66” 189.58 

72” 199.81 

84” 254.59 

96” 279.08 

CORRUGATED POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) STORM SEWER PIPE  

12” 4.54 

15” 6.99 

18” 9.93 

24” 19.94 

30” 26.10 

36” 41.48 

42” NO BID 

48” NO BID 

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER  PIPE (TYPE “IR”, “I” AND  “IA”)  

TYPE “IR”  

12” NO BID 

18” 17.25 

24” 23.00 

30” 28.75 

36” 34.50 

42” 42.00 

48” 50.00 

54” 61.25 

60” 71.50 

66” 124.20 

72” 135.00 

78” 145.80 



CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS INC. 
C-13-064-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 
CATEGORY “A” PIPES 

 
CONTECH ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS LLC 

84” 156.00 

90” 175.00 

96” 186.20 

102” 196.00 

108” NO BID 

114” NO BID 

120” NO BID 

126” NO BID 

132” NO BID 

138” NO BID 

144” NO BID 

TYPE “I”  

12” NO BID 

18” NO BID 

24” NO BID 

30” NO BID 

36” NO BID 

42” NO BID 

48” NO BID 

54” 99.60 

60” 110.40 

66” 121.20 

72” 132.00 

78” 142.80 

84” 153.60 

90” 164.40 

96” 176.40 

102” 186.00 

108” 198.00 

114” 208.80 

120” 219.60 

126” 234.00 

132” 244.80 

138” 255.60 

144” 338.40 

 



CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS INC. 
C-13-064-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 

CATEGORY “A” PIPES 

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE CONTINUATION 

TYPE “IA” 
CONTECH ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS LLC 

12” NO BID 

18” NO BID 

24” NO BID 

30” NO BID 

36” NO BID 

42” NO BID 

48” NO BID 

54” NO BID 

60” NO BID 

66” 174.00 

72” 188.40 

78” 201.60 

84” 217.20 

90” 232.80 

96” 249.60 

102” 266.40 

108” 282.00 

114” 297.60 

120” 338.00 

126” 358.80 

132” 375.70 

138” 390.00 

144” 552.50 

 



FERGUSON SUPPLY WATERWORKS 
C-13-064a-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 
  

 

 

 

AWWA C905 PVC PLASTIC WATER PIPE: 

DR 18 FERGUSON WATERWORKS 

14” 29.63 

16” 38.25 

18” 48.63 

24” 87.68 

30” 172.99 

36” 249.00 

42” NO BID 

48” NO BID 

DR 25  

14” 21.69 

16” 27.99 

  

CATEGORY A – “PIPES” 

REINFORCED POLYTHYLENE PIPE – 20 FOOT JOINT  

24” 15.60 

30” 22.00 

36” 28.70 

42” 34.60 

48” 45.60  

54” NO BID 

60” 75.00 

66” NO BID 

72” NO BID 

84” NO BID 

96” NO BID 

CORRUGATED POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) STORM SEWER PIPE 

12” 5.53 

15” 9.24 

18” 12.99 

24” 24.86 

30” 35.81 

36” 52.98 

42” 69.43 

48” NO BID 



FERGUSON SUPPLY WATERWORKS 
C-13-064a-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 
 
AWWA C905 PVC PLASTIC WATER PIPE: 

DR 25 CONTINUATION 

18” 35.29 

24” 62.75 

30” 102.39 

36” 153.78 

42” 217.46 

48” 323.94 

DR 32.5  

14” NO BID 

16” NO BID 

18” NO BID 

24” NO BID 

30” NO BID 

36” NO BID 

42” 202.53 

48” 280.59 

DR 41  

14” NO BID 

16” NO BID 

18” NO BID 

24” NO BID 

30” NO BID 

36” NO BID 

42” 161.58 

48” 227.48 

DR 51  

14” NO BID 

16” NO BID 

18” NO BID 

24” NO BID 

30” NO BID 

36” NO BID 

42” 129.43 

48” 183.76 

  

  



FERGUSON SUPPLY WATERWORKS 
C-13-064a-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 

CATEGORY D “MISCELLANEOUS 

 FERGUSON WATERWORKS 

8” PVC SCHEDULE 40 
WATER LINE DR 18 

8.60LF 

1.5” PVC SCHEDULE 40  .60LF 

0.75” PVC SCHEDULE 40 .26LF 

0.5”-PVC SCHEDULE 40  .21LF 

 



HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS 
C-13-064b-03-19 

TERM: MARCH 19, 2013 THRU FEBRUARY 28, 2014 
 

CATEGORY A – “PIPES” 

 
48” CORRUGATED POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) STORM SEWER PIPE  

 HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS 

48” $88.00 

 


