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THE STATE OF TEXAS § 
§ 

COUNTY OF HIDALGO § 
 

SERVICE CONTRACT 
C-14-013-04-08 

 
 

THIS CONTRACT is made and entered into this 8th day of APRIL, 2014 by and between the 

County of Hidalgo, Texas ("County") and UNIFIRST HOLDINGS, INC. (“Company"). 

WHEREAS, Company responded to notices for Request for Sealed Bids (RFB) for:  Rental 

and/or Purchase of Industrial Uniforms (on an as needed basis) for Hidalgo County (the 

"Services"); and 

WHEREAS, Company submitted a sealed quote to provide services in accordance with 

Exhibit “A” Request for Sealed Bids (RFB) Procurement Packet attached hereto respectively, and 

incorporated herein for all purposes of (the "RFSQ"); and; 

WHEREAS, in recognition of and in consideration of Company's agreement to perform the 

Services in accordance with Specifications within Exhibit “A” Request for Sealed Bids (RFB) 

Procurement Packet, the Commissioners Court of County awarded the sealed quote to Company. 

NOW, THEREFORE, in mutual consideration of the foregoing and the further consideration 

of the following, the parties hereto agree as follows: 

1. County and Company hereby agrees that this Contract is entered into in order to 

provide the Services to Hidalgo County. This Contract does not extend to any third parties any 

duties or benefits conferred in any manner hereunder or otherwise. 

2. Company hereby promises and agrees to render and provide, during the term of this 

Contract, and shall be obligated to render and provide the services in accordance with the 

Specifications contained in Exhibit “A” Request for Sealed Bids (RFB) Procurement Packet within 

Hidalgo County following a request for Services by designee(s) of Hidalgo Countywide 
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Departments.  Company agrees in performing the Services that it will use proper professional 

standards, comply with any and all appropriate laws and regulations in providing the Services, and 

devote such time as is necessary to safely and efficiently provide the Services. Further Hidalgo 

County reserves the right to request these services from other sources other than the successful 

vendor and shall not be in violation of any terms or conditions of said contract.  

3. This Contract shall be for a period of two (2) years, commencing on APRIL 30, 2014 

and expiring on APRIL 29, 2016 and may be extended at the sole discretion of the County for an 

additional one (1) year term under the same rates, terms and conditions.  Hidalgo County also 

reserves the right to continue this sealed quote for an additional sixty (60) day grace period at the 

end of the contract term for unforeseen delay of award for the next term and contingent upon cost 

remaining unchanged.   

4. As a condition of this Contract, Company shall hold and maintain throughout the term 

of this Contract all licenses and permits required, or which may be required by any authority during 

the term hereof to provide the Services. 

5. All trucks or vehicles operated by the Company to perform the Services shall contain 

all equipment required by any authority to operate on streets and roads and all persons in the 

employ of Company who operate such trucks or vehicles shall have the required licenses, 

qualifications, skill and expertise to perform such Services and shall comply with all laws, rules and 

regulations prescribed by any agency or authority having jurisdiction with regard to the operation of 

such trucks or vehicles in providing the Services.  

6. As consideration for rendering the Service provided for in this Contract, the County 

agrees to pay Company the amounts specified in Exhibit "B" attached hereto payable against 

written invoice submitted by Company. 

7. Company shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and all persons 

connected with providing services under this Contract naming County as an additional insured (with 
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the coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit "C" attached hereto and incorporated herein 

at this point for all purposes), and shall furnish to County certificates of such insurance coverage. 

8. Company shall provide a sufficient number of trucks, vehicles, personnel and 

equipment available to safely and efficiently provide the Services. 

9. Company shall indemnify and hold harmless County, its elected officials, employees 

and agents from any and all claims, damages, losses, and expenses including attorney's fees for 

the defense of any action against County arising out of, resulting from, or connected with the 

provision of the Service by Company under this Contract.  Said indemnity shall cover any act or 

failure to act by the Company, its agents or employees. 

10. This Contract shall not be assignable in whole or in part by either party without prior 

written consent of the other party. 

11. It is expressly agreed that this Contract and the performance by the parties 

hereunder does not create any agency relationship or master-servant relationship, that County has 

no supervision of the performance of the Services provided by Company, and that Company is an 

independent contractor under this Contract. 

12. Any notice required or permitted to be given hereunder shall be in writing and shall 

be delivered personally or sent by certified mail, postage prepaid, as set forth below: 

 If to County:   County of Hidalgo 
     Attn: County Judge   

    302 West University Drive 
    Edinburg, Texas 78539 

 
If to Company:   Unifirst Holding Inc. 
    Attn: Victor Garcia, General Manager 
    515 East Beech Avenue 
    McAllen, Texas  78501 
 
13. In case any one or more of the provisions contained in this Agreement shall for any 

reason be held to be invalid, illegal or unenforceable in any respect, such invalidity, illegality, or 

unenforceability shall not affect any other provision thereof and this Agreement shall be construed 
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as if such invalid, illegal, or unenforceable provision had never been contained herein. 

14. This Agreement may be terminated by County without cause upon thirty (30) days 

written notice. 

15. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of and be enforceable 

by the parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal representatives, 

successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement. 

16. This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of 

the State of Texas and shall be performable in Hidalgo County. 

 17. Commitment of Current Revenues Only.  In the event that, during any term hereof, 

the Commissioners Court does not appropriate sufficient funds to meet the obligations of County 

under this Agreement, County may terminate this Agreement upon ninety (90) days written notice to 

Company. County agrees, however, to use reasonable efforts to secure funds necessary for the 

continued performance of this Agreement. The parties intend this provision to be a continuing right 

to terminate this Agreement at the expiration of each budget period of County pursuant to the 

provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt. Code Ann. ' 271.903 (Vernon Supp. 1996). 

18. Entire Agreement. This Agreement contains the entire contract between the parties 

hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either directly or through any agent or 

representative) any representation or agreement in connection with this Agreement not specifically 

set forth herein. This Agreement may be modified or amended only by agreement in writing 

executed by the parties hereto, and not otherwise. 

19.  Company represents and warrants to County that the person signing this agreement 

on behalf of Company has the authority to bind the Company to the terms and provisions of this 

contract. 
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WITNESS our hands in duplicate originals this  day of    , 2014. 

 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM  
Atlas, Hall & Rodriguez, L.L.P. 
 
 
 
By:                                                
 Stephen L.  Crain, Attorney 

 
 
 
COUNTY OF HIDALGO 

 
 
 
ATTEST:      By:   
                                                                          Ramon Garcia, County Judge 
 
By:        
 Arturo Guajardo, Jr., County Clerk 

 
 

 
 

COMPANY: UNIFIRST HOLDING INC. 
 
 
By:  
Printed Name: Victor Garcia    
Title:  General Manager                            
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EXHIBIT “A” 
REQUEST FOR SEALED BIDS (RFB) PROCUREMENT PACKET 
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EXHIBIT “B” 
 VENDOR’S BID PRICE & TABULATION  
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
TABULATION SHEET 

DESCRIPTION OF BID: Hidalgo County -RENTAL and /or PURCHASE of INDUSTRIAL UNIFORMS 
BID NO: 2014-013-02-05-SMA 

BID OPENING DATE: February 05, 2014 @   9:30 A.M BUYER:  Sandra Montalvo 

 PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

Item Description 

UNIFIRST HOLDING, INC. 
McAllen, TX 

MODEL LAUDRY, LLC 
LOS INDIOS, TX 

G & K SERVICE 
SAN ANTONIO, TX 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

1. 
SHIRTS- LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.26 $1.71 $13.00 $11.00 $3.90 $2.50 $15.00 $16.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

2. 
SHIRTS-LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
 100% cotton 

$4.25 $3.00 $15.00 $13.00 $5.04 $3.00 $18.43 $20.00 $2.80 $1.50 $20.95 $20.95 

3. 

SHIRTS- LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
Reflective & Fluorescent Green Stripes on 
the sleeves, Front pockets & back of the 
Shirt 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$6.68 $3.78 $22.00 $18.00 $9.00 $5.66 $31.95 $35.00 $3.25 $1.78 $24.85 $24.85 

4. 
SHIRTS-SHORT SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 65% 
Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.15 $1.65 $11.00 $9.00 $3.75 $2.25 $12.25 16.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

5. 
SHIRTS-SHORT  SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL  (men & women) 
100% cotton 

$4.10 $2.94 $13.00 $11.00 $4.85 $2.90 $17.82 $20.00 $2.80 $1.50 $20.95 $20.95 

6. 

SHIRTS- SHORT SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
Reflective & Fluorescent Green Stripes on 
the sleeves, Front pockets & back of the 
Shirt 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$6.50 $3.41 $19.00 $16.00 $9.00 $5.44 $31.95 $35.00 $3.25 $1.78 $24.85 $24.85 

7. 
SHIRTS- EXECUTIVE WESTERN 
STYLE (Men)  65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton 

$3.92 $2.07 $15.00 $13.00 $4.88 $3.50 $19.43 $20.00 $3.60 $2.05 $23.95 $23.95 

8. POLO SHIRTS (men & women) 50% 
Polyester 50% Cotton $3.88 $2.06 $15.00 $13.00 $4.88 $3.50 $17.95 $20.00 $3.60 $2.05 $23.95 $23.95 

9. 

SHORT SLEEVE SMOCK (women) 
65 % Polyester 35% Cotton $3.52 $2.38 $16.00 $13.50 $4.88 $3.50 $17.00 $20.00 $2.65 $1.47 $20.95 $20.95 

10. TROUSERS-Industrial (men) 65% 
Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.08 $1.68 $16.50 $13.90 $3.99 $2.50 $16.00 $18.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

11. TROUSERS-INDUSTRIAL (WOMEN) 
65% Polyester 35% Cotton $3.96 $2.16 $18.00 $15.00 $5.00 $2.90 $18.00 $18.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

12.

EXECUTIVE PANTS  (Men) *must be 
available for Supervisory positions as 
requested by dept. 65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton 

$3.41 $1.86 $17.00 $15.00 $5.50 $3.50 $22.95 $30.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

13.
RIPSTOP PANTS-(MEN)100% ripstop 
cotton pants military-grade heavyweight 
10-oz 

NO BID  NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID  
Dickies 
Cargo 
$4.25 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$2.75 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$29.00 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$29.00 

14.
DENIM BLUE JEANS-100% Cotton- 
(MEN)  (Boot Cut, Flare & Straight Leg)14 
3/4 Oz. Denim 

$4.40 $2.40 $18.00 $15.00 $4.90 $2.95 $17.35 $18.00 $4.25 $2.75 $29.00 $29.00 

15. SHORTS- Pleated Uniform  (Men) 65% 
Polyester/35% Cotton $2.64 $1.68 $12.50 $10.00 $5.20 $3.08 $17.45 $18.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

16. SHORTS- Pleated Uniform (Women) 
65% Polyester/35% Cotton N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.20 $3.08 $17.45 $18.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

17. COVERALLS- 65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton ---- ----- $19.00 $16.00 $7.92 $3.35 $29.00 $30.00 $4.25 $2.75 $29.00 $29.00 

18. PATCHES AND/OR LOGOs-- one 
time charge for Shirt $57.75 $31.50 

$5.25 
/pc N/A $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 N/A NO CHARGE 

19.

ADDITIONAL FEES (if any):   per shirt per shirt per shirt ----- ------------------------------------ 
SHIRTS---3XL-5XL   
upcharge per pcs  20% 20% 25% N/A 

  
PANTS -Size 44’plus/ 
Size 20” plus upcharge per pcs. 20% 20% 25% N/A 
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EXIBIT- A 
QUESTIONAIRE  

UNIFIRST	HOLDING,	
INC.	

McAllen,	TX	
(vendors	response) 

MODEL	LAUDRY,	LLC	
LOS	INDIOS,	TX	

(vendors	response) 

G	&	K	SERVICE	
SAN	ANTONIO,	TX	
(vendors	response) 

1) Is there a fee for returned 
uniforms upon 
termination or resignation 
of an employee?  If so, 
what is your fee and how 
long must an employee 
lease a uniform without 
paying termination 
charges? 

no termination fee or charge for 
employee no linger employee no 
longer employed with county 

NO 

loss/damage only applies if 
garments are not returned or 
damaged when an employee 
leaves the program 

2) Will your company be 
capable of depicting 
actual charges? 

there are no definite numbers of 
employees for rental, value lease 
or purchase that will allow my 
company to depict and actual 
charges for any given program 

YES YES 

3) Will your company 
furnish coveralls, free of 
charge, with the rental or 
purchase of uniforms?  If 
so, how many? 

Loaners are available of Grade 2 
(semi used garments ) for up to 
but not exceeding 20 business 
days, when there is a delay of 
specified uniform at no charge to 
be reviewed on case by case 
method of rental uniforms 
service only this does not apply 
to purchased uniforms 

NO 
we can add coveralls to the 
rentals or lease program, but 
not for free 

4) If contract is awarded to 
your company, the prices 
will be in effect for the 
length of the contract. 

there will be a 2% price increase 
per anum for life of contract 

YES   

5) Please list any warranties 
and any other policies not 
described in Attachment 
A. 

Manufactures warranties 
extended to all programs for 
defective or faulty merchandise 
no other warranties or guarantees 
apply 

------ 
covered under G&K 
SERVICES “CUSTOMER 
PROMISE” 



 

 
 8 

EXHIBIT “C” 
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 






