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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
TABULATION SHEET 

DESCRIPTION OF BID: Hidalgo County -RENTAL and /or PURCHASE of INDUSTRIAL UNIFORMS 
BID NO: 2014-013-02-05-SMA 

BID OPENING DATE: February 05, 2014 @   9:30 A.M BUYER:  Sandra Montalvo 
 PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

Item Description 

UNIFIRST HOLDING, INC. 
McAllen, TX 

MODEL LAUDRY, LLC 
LOS INDIOS, TX 

G & K SERVICE 
SAN ANTONIO, TX 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

option 
1 

option 
2 

option 
3 

Price For 
Lost 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

Full 
Service 
Weekly 

rate  
rental 

per 
employee 

Value 
Lease 

Weekly 
rate per 

employee 

Purchase 
of 

Garment 

1.  
SHIRTS- LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.26 $1.71 $13.00 $11.00 $3.90 $2.50 $15.00 $16.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

2.  
SHIRTS-LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
 100% cotton 

$4.25 $3.00 $15.00 $13.00 $5.04 $3.00 $18.43 $20.00 $2.80 $1.50 $20.95 $20.95 

3.  

SHIRTS- LONG SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
Reflective & Fluorescent Green Stripes on 
the sleeves, Front pockets & back of the 
Shirt 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$6.68 $3.78 $22.00 $18.00 $9.00 $5.66 $31.95 $35.00 $3.25 $1.78 $24.85 $24.85 

4.  
SHIRTS-SHORT SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 65% 
Polyester 35% Cotton 

$3.15 $1.65 $11.00 $9.00 $3.75 $2.25 $12.25 16.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

5.  
SHIRTS-SHORT  SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL  (men & women) 
100% cotton 

$4.10 $2.94 $13.00 $11.00 $4.85 $2.90 $17.82 $20.00 $2.80 $1.50 $20.95 $20.95 

6.  

SHIRTS- SHORT SLEEVE 
INDUSTRIAL (men & women) 
Reflective & Fluorescent Green Stripes on 
the sleeves, Front pockets & back of the 
Shirt 65% Polyester 35% Cotton 

$6.50 $3.41 $19.00 $16.00 $9.00 $5.44 $31.95 $35.00 $3.25 $1.78 $24.85 $24.85 

7.  
SHIRTS- EXECUTIVE WESTERN 
STYLE (Men)  65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton 

$3.92 $2.07 $15.00 $13.00 $4.88 $3.50 $19.43 $20.00 $3.60 $2.05 $23.95 $23.95 

8.  POLO SHIRTS (men & women) 50% 
Polyester 50% Cotton $3.88 $2.06 $15.00 $13.00 $4.88 $3.50 $17.95 $20.00 $3.60 $2.05 $23.95 $23.95 

9.  
SHORT SLEEVE SMOCK (women) 
65 % Polyester 35% Cotton $3.52 $2.38 $16.00 $13.50 $4.88 $3.50 $17.00 $20.00 $2.65 $1.47 $20.95 $20.95 

10.  TROUSERS-Industrial (men) 65% 
Polyester 35% Cotton $3.08 $1.68 $16.50 $13.90 $3.99 $2.50 $16.00 $18.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

11.  TROUSERS-INDUSTRIAL (WOMEN) 
65% Polyester 35% Cotton $3.96 $2.16 $18.00 $15.00 $5.00 $2.90 $18.00 $18.00 $2.15 $1.15 $19.95 $19.95 

12.  
EXECUTIVE PANTS  (Men) *must be 
available for Supervisory positions as 
requested by dept. 65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton 

$3.41 $1.86 $17.00 $15.00 $5.50 $3.50 $22.95 $30.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

13.  
RIPSTOP PANTS-(MEN)100% ripstop 
cotton pants military-grade heavyweight 
10-oz 

NO BID  NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID  
Dickies 
Cargo 
$4.25 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$2.75 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$29.00 

Dickies 
Cargo 
$29.00 

14.  
DENIM BLUE JEANS-100% Cotton- 
(MEN)  (Boot Cut, Flare & Straight Leg)14 
3/4 Oz. Denim 

$4.40 $2.40 $18.00 $15.00 $4.90 $2.95 $17.35 $18.00 $4.25 $2.75 $29.00 $29.00 

15.  SHORTS- Pleated Uniform  (Men) 65% 
Polyester/35% Cotton $2.64 $1.68 $12.50 $10.00 $5.20 $3.08 $17.45 $18.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

16.  SHORTS- Pleated Uniform (Women) 
65% Polyester/35% Cotton N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.20 $3.08 $17.45 $18.00 $3.50 $2.10 $23.95 $23.95 

17.  COVERALLS- 65% Polyester 35% 
Cotton ---- ----- $19.00 $16.00 $7.92 $3.35 $29.00 $30.00 $4.25 $2.75 $29.00 $29.00 

18.  PATCHES AND/OR LOGOs-- one 
time charge for Shirt $57.75 $31.50 $5.25 

/pc N/A $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 N/A NO CHARGE 

19.  

ADDITIONAL FEES (if any):   per shirt per shirt per shirt ----- ------------------------------------ 
SHIRTS---3XL-5XL   
upcharge per pcs  20% 20% 25% N/A 

  
PANTS -Size 44’plus/ 
Size 20” plus upcharge per pcs. 20% 20% 25% N/A 
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EXIBIT- A 
QUESTIONAIRE  

UNIFIRST HOLDING, 
INC. 

McAllen, TX 
(vendors response) 

MODEL LAUDRY, LLC 
LOS INDIOS, TX 

(vendors response) 

G & K SERVICE 
SAN ANTONIO, TX 

(vendors response) 

1) Is there a fee for returned 
uniforms upon 
termination or resignation 
of an employee?  If so, 
what is your fee and how 
long must an employee 
lease a uniform without 
paying termination 
charges? 

no termination fee or charge for 
employee no linger employee no 
longer employed with county 

NO 

loss/damage only applies if 
garments are not returned or 
damaged when an employee 
leaves the program 

2) Will your company be 
capable of depicting 
actual charges? 

there are no definite numbers of 
employees for rental, value lease 
or purchase that will allow my 
company to depict and actual 
charges for any given program 

YES YES 

3) Will your company 
furnish coveralls, free of 
charge, with the rental or 
purchase of uniforms?  If 
so, how many? 

Loaners are available of Grade 2 
(semi used garments ) for up to 
but not exceeding 20 business 
days, when there is a delay of 
specified uniform at no charge to 
be reviewed on case by case 
method of rental uniforms 
service only this does not apply 
to purchased uniforms 

NO 
we can add coveralls to the 
rentals or lease program, but 
not for free 

4) If contract is awarded to 
your company, the prices 
will be in effect for the 
length of the contract. 

there will be a 2% price increase 
per anum for life of contract YES   

5) Please list any warranties 
and any other policies not 
described in Attachment 
A. 

Manufactures warranties 
extended to all programs for 
defective or faulty merchandise 
no other warranties or guarantees 
apply 

------ 
covered under G&K 
SERVICES “CUSTOMER 
PROMISE” 


