HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG

| BID OPENING DATE: May 21, 2014 || BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 AM. |

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies for HC
Adult Detention Facility (Jail)

BID NO.: 2014-107-05-21-SMA Buyer: Sandra Montalvo
Bid Signature
Name of Vendor R — (if applicable) Date Mailing Address, Phone No &
Company/Firm *g/ia or Initials of E-Mail Address
Staff
3101 Marquis Dr. Suite 200
Garland, Tx75042
1 KEEFE SUPPLY CO. BLM Msantd:a 05/09/14 | 800-593-0039
: Attn Blake Taylor ontalvo 972-272-5387 fax
btaylor@keefegroup.com
. A 477 Commerce Blvd.
) Trinity Services Group EMR Sandra 05/05/14 | Oldsmar, FL 34677
" | Attn: Amanda Sumrall Montalvo 936-641-3247 )
amanda.sumrall@trinityservicesgroup.com
5705 E. Texas Rd.
Edinburg, Tx 78542
956-451-1831
3. | R&RDISTRIBUTING E?\I/I‘X:/L Msantd:a 05/09/14 | 956-287-9614 fax
Attn: Rene Lucio ontalvo roselucio@sbcglobal.net
rrdistributing@sbcglobal.net
1419 S Beechwood Ave
Fayetteville, AR 72701
n SHAVER FOODS, LLC EMR Sandra 05/05/14 | P: 479-442-6340 x344
Attn: Kathryn Remell Montalvo F: 479-582-3578
kathryn.remell@shaverfoods.com
8600 Freeport Pkwy. Ste. 320
Irving, TX 75063
Direct: (469) 359-4150
UNION SUPPLY GROUP Sandra Main: (469) 359-4147 X 4150
> Attn: Charles Thomas EMR Montalvo 05/05/24 1 \opile: 214-392-6758
Fax: (972) 929- 2999
CThomas@UnionSupplyGroup.com
www.UnionSupplyGroup.com
Sandra 580 North Beach St.
6. | MID-STATES SERVICES INC. EMR Montal 05/05/14 | Fort Worth, TX 761111
ontalvo bposton@21mssi.com
13151 Midway Place
Cerritos, CA 90703
7. AM_ERICAN TEXTILE SYSTEMS EMR MSantdlia 05/05/14 | P: 562 229 0036
Attn: Jennifer J Schroeder ontalvo £ 562 229 0597
jennifer@amtexsys.com
Based in Houston, TX
Cell: 816-830-9334
QUADMED INC. EMERGENCY MEDICAL Sandra Office: 800-933-7334
8. PRODUCTS EMR Montalvo 05/06/14 | Fax: 877-367-7759
Attn: Brett Archer brett@quadmed.com
www.quadmed.com
www.tacticalsupplyhg.com
1751 County Rd B W, Suite 300
A’VIANDS Sandra Roseville, MN 55113
S Attn: Brad Chandler EMR Montalvo 05/06/14 | g32.917.7499
bchandler@aviands.com
Po Box 21056
Waco, Tx 76702
10.| ICS :]AIL SUPPLIES EMR Sand:a 05/06/14 | (254 751.1866 Ext 110
Attn: Sonya Sterling Montalvo (254) 751-0299 Fax
Bids@Icswaco.Com
4622 Cedar Ave. Suite 124
PRIME VENDOR, INC. Sandra Wilmington, NC 28403
11. ! EMR 05/07/14 | Phone: 800-746-9554
: Montalvo one:
Attn: Ashley Reed Fax: 500-746.8307
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG

| BID OPENING DATE: May 21, 2014 || BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 AM. |

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies for HC
Adult Detention Facility (Jail)

BID NO.: 2014-107-05-21-SMA Buyer: Sandra Montalvo
Bid Signature
Name of Vendor R — (if applicable) Date Mailing Address, Phone No &
Company/Firm *g/ia or Initials of E-Mail Address
Staff
work41@prime-vendor.com
1417 Rio Grande St
San Juan Tx
- Edgar ki (956)566-7089
800-253-2352(p)
JUSTICE PACKAGING Sandra 866-554-2569 (f)
131" Attn: Susan L. Hagan EMR Montalvo | %1314 | e12-260-4018 (¢)
susan@justicepkg.com
BULLEYE INTERNATIONAL INC.
R h Sandra julie@buybullseye.com
14.{ Attn: Julie A. Gibbs EMR Montalvo 05/13/14
800-334-9880 (place orders/general
Bob Barker C | questions)
0 arker company, Inc Sandra 888-722-0250 ext 2138
151 Attn: Nenna Mann EMR Montalvo | 01314 | s00.322-7537 fax
919-346-2138 direct
nennamann@bobbarker.com
2234 North Federal Hwy, Suite 394
Boca Raton, FL 33431
561-297-4401 office
16.| INMATEAID, LLC EMR Msa”td:a 05/13/14 | 561-445-7244 cell
Attn: Shawn A Friedkin ontalvo 561-584-6575 fax
866-966-7100
www.inmateaid.com
90 Washington Valley Road
Bedminster, NJ 07921
Big 3 Packaging LLC Sandra Cell: 973-727-1018
17, Attn: Nancy Garcia EMR Montalvo 05/13/14 | Direct: 908-719-8044
Fax: 908-719-6006
PO Box 630C
First Preference Products Corp. Sandra Lakeville, CT 06039
18. Attn: Bill Schwaikert EMR Montalvo 05/13/14 | mail@frstpref.com
900 Corporate Woods Pkwy
SWAGGER FOODS CORP. Sandra Vernon Hiils, 1L 60061
19. Attn: Maria Whalen EMR Montalvo 05/13/14 maria@swaggerfoods.com
200 Echelon Drive, Ste. A
Negaunee, M1 49866
NO-SHANK, INC. Sandra 800-705-4545
. ! EMR 05/13/14
20 Attn: Jeremy Applekamp Montalvo 906-401-0406
906-401-0407 (Fax)
1721summit@gmail.com
956-388-0617 Oliva cell
GATWAY PRINTING & OFFICE SUPPLY Sandra 956-874-4422 Butch cell
21. N IP Montal 05/13/14 | Edinburg, Tx
Attn: Olivia Perez or Butch Shook ontalvo Olivia@gatewayp.com
butch@gatewayp.com
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG

| BID OPENING DATE: May 21, 2014

|| BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 AM. |

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION
Adult Detention Facility (Jail)

: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies for HC

BID NO.: 2014-107-05-21-SMA

Buyer: Sandra Montalvo

Bid Signature
Name of VVendor R — (if applicable) Date Mailing Address, Phone No &
Company/Firm *?/. or Initials of E-Mail Address
ia
Staff
1401 West 94th Street
Bloomington, MN 55431
Toll Free: 1.888.454.2296
2p.| PHOENIX SUPPLY EMR Msantd:a 05/13/14 | Fax: 1.866.687.6165
Attn: Dan Moes ontalvo Office: 952.223.8346
Cell: 651.442.1669
www.buyphoenixsupply.com
Robinson Textiles
152 W. Walnut St. #250
23. ROETINSON TEXT”._ES EMR MSandlia 05/13/14 | Gardena, CA 90248
Attn: Rosa Cota or Cindy Murphy ontalvo 800-421-5582 ext. 248
robtexemail@aol.com
14000 Hwy 20
Madison, AL. 35756
o CORNERSTONE INSTITUTIONAL, LLC EMR Sandra 05/14/14 | Direct Line: 256-560-4245
Attn: Heather Lang Montalvo Fax: 256-560-4248
hlang@cornerstonedetention.com
P: 800-221-3147 ext. 100
25, Char.m—Tex, Inc. EMR Sandra 05/14/14 | F: 718-258-8303
Attn: Kayla Kayner Montalvo kaily@charm-tex.com
65 Deer Park Drive
JOZEV PRODUCTS East Longmeadow, MA 01028
Sandra T: 413.525.2700
26. Attn: Maggie Raker EMR Montalvo 0514714 | ¢ 4135252787
Mobile: 413.262.3925
WWW.jozev.com

*VIA:

IN PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR)
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ACCEPTANCE/TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office

DESCRIPTION OF BID: Commissary Supplies for Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility (Jail)

BID OPENING DATE: May 21, 2014 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30A.M.
BID NO: 2014-107-05-21-SMA BUYER: Sandra Montalvo
NAME OF COMPANY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT

BOB BARKER

RenelLuciod/b/aR & R DISTRIBUTING

ICSJAIL SUPPLIESINC.

KEEFE GROUP

S L I P




HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF' SOFFICE

BID TABULATION SHEET
“Commissary Suppliesfor Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility (Jail)”
BID No. 2014-107- 05-21-SMA

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
BOB R&R ICSIAIL | cere
LIST OF ITEMS BARKER CO. pistrisuting | SUPPEIES | Groyp
Fuguay Varina, NC Edinburg, TX V\Ilalglo?'ll'x Garland, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
. | Hygiene Kit (4" T-Brush/T-Paste 1.0 oz. $.069 ea. $1.35 $0.44 ea. NO BID
/Deodorant 0.05 oz. /Soap 1 0z.) *144 min. order (.85 02)
2. | Almond Joy Bar 1.61.0z NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
3. | Baby Ruth 2.1 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
4. | Butter Finger Bar 2.1 0z. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
5. | Snickers Almond Bar 1.76 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
6. | Milky Way Bar 2.05 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
7. | Pay Day Bar 1.85 0z. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
8. | Snickers Bar 2.07 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
9. | 3 Musketeers Bar 2.13 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
10. | Skittles “Original Fruits” 2.17 0z. bag NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
11. | M & M Peanuts 1.74 0z. bag NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
12. | Twix Bar 2.0 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
13. | Peanut Pattie 2.25 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID NO BID
14. | Reese’s Peanut Butter Cups 1.5 0z. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
| Seen Sovs 3, Gl Pk 14 v 020 | oo | w02
16. | Chili Corn Nuts-1.4 oz NO BID $0.49 NO BID $0.47
17. | Ranch Corn Nuts -1.4 0z NO BID $0.49 NO BID $0.47
18. | Salted Peanuts 1.75 oz. bag NO BID -0- NO BID $0.30
19. | Chunk Light Tuna 4.23 0z. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $1.12
20. | Refried Beans Resealable Pouch 6 0z. NO BID -0- NO BID $0.87
21. | Jalapeno Cheese Spread 8 oz. Plastic Tub NO BID -0- NO BID $1.03
22. | Jelly (Grape & Strawberry) 12 oz. Squeeze Bottle NO BID -0- NO BID $1.90
23. | peanut Butter Squeezers 1.12 0z. NO BID -0- NO BID $.020
24. | Chili No Beans 11.250z. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $1.28
25. | Chili w/Beans 11.250z. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $1.28
26. | Hot Chili w/Beans 11.25 oz. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $1.28
27. | Roast Beef & Gravy 10 oz. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $2.55
28. | Sardines in Hot Tomato Sauce 3.530z. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
29. | Fish Fillets 3.530z. Pouch NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
30. | B.B.Q. Potato Chips- 1.5 0z. bag NO BID $0.30(1 oz bag) NO BID $.025
3L | Flaming Hot Cheetos- 1.50z. bag NO BID $0.30(1 oz bag) NO BID $0.34
32. | BBQ Corn Chips- 1.50z. bag NO BID $0.30(1 oz bag) NO BID $0.25
33. | Doritos Nacho Cheese- 1.50z NO BID $0.30(1 oz bag) NO BID $0.34
34. | Tortilla Chips- 12 oz. bag NO BID $1.45 NO BID $1.08
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HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF' SOFFICE

BID TABULATION SHEET
“Commissary Suppliesfor Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility (Jail)”
BID No. 2014-107- 05-21-SMA

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
BOB R&R S'SF?F;]S'ES K EEFE
LIST OF ITEMS BARKER CO. DISTRIBUTING ING GROUP
Fuquay Varina, NC Edinburg, TX Waco. T Garland, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
35. | Tostadas- 120z. pack NO BID $1.65 NO BID $1.25
36. | Takis or Extremes- 3.7 0z. bag NO BID $0.95 NO BID $1.07
37. | Hot/Spicy Pork Cracklings- 2 oz. NO BID $0.90 NO BID $0.60
38. | Snack Crackers- 12 0z. box NO BID -0- NO BID $1.55
39. Cookies duplex/(vanilla/chocolate/strawberry)-6 oz. Tray NO BID $O-60(502) NO BID $0.44
40. | Zinger Cremes- 4 0z. pack NO BID $0.79 NO BID $1.24
41. | Cinnamon Rolls- 4 oz. pk NO BID $0.69 NO BID $0.50
42. | Honey Bun- 60z. pk NO BID $0.42 NO BID $0.50
43. | Chocolate Cupcakes (2-pk) — 4 oz. NO BID $0.50 NO BID $0.50
44. Moon pies (banana/strawberry/chocolate) -2.75 oz. NO BID $O39 NO BID $0-37
45. | Cherry/Strawberry Danish- 4.25 oz. NO BID $0.69 NO BID $0.50
46. | Coca Cola Classic -20 oz. plastic bottle NO BID $0.80 (16.902) NO BID $0.90
47. | Sprite- 20 oz. plastic bottle NO BID $0.80 (16.902) NO BID $0.90
48. | Fanta Orange- 20 oz. plastic bottle NO BID $0.80 (16.902) NO BID $0.90
49. | Dr. Pepper- 20 oz. plastic bottle NO BID $0.80 (16.902) NO BID $0.90
50. | Diet Coke- 20 oz. plastic bottle NO BID $0.80 (16.902) NO BID $0.90
5. | Diet Dr. Pepper- 20 z. plastic bottle NO BID $0.80 (16.902) NO BID $0.90
52, Q{I)Sz(hwell House Instant Coffee- 4 0z. Resealable Clear NO BID -0- NO BID $2.70
53. | Coffee Mug w/Lid- 14 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $1.13
54. | Hot Cocoa Mix- 10z. bag NO BID -0- NO BID $0.14
55. | Cereal Bowl w/Lid- 24 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $0.52
56. | Ozarka Spring Water 20 oz. plastic bottle NO BID $0.53 NO BID $0.39
57. | Sugar Cubes- 1 1b. bx NO BID $2.00 NO BID $1.48
58. | Grey Sweatshirts (small thru 4XL SXL $6.18 ea $11.00 $10.28 ea $5.33
' y ( ) 2XLAXL $7.44 ea ' . '
59, White Sport Bras (medium thru 3XL) MED-2XL $19.97 dz $6.00 $2.27 ea $2.25
3XL $22.00dz
S-XL $12.22dz
60. | White Boxer Shorts (small thru 6XL) 2XL-3XL $14.90 dz $3.99 $1.22 ea $2.35
4XL-6XL $18.00 dz
tops s-2xl $34.20 dz
White Thermal Underwear Set -6x | $37.99dz
6L. (small thru 6XL) s-2xI $29.90 dz $650 $921 ea $7OO
bottoms 3XL-
XU | $36.90dz
S-L $21.00 dz
. . XL-2XL $23.40 dz
62. | Men White Crew Neck T-shirts (Small thru 6XL) XL XL 426,60 dz $4.10 $2.39 ea $2.85
5XL-6XL $29.99 dz
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HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF' SOFFICE

“Commissary Suppliesfor Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility (Jail)”

BID TABULATION SHEET

BID No. 2014-107- 05-21-SMA

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
BOB R&R Jes L KEEFE
LIST OFITEMS BARKER CO. pistriBuTinG | SYPPLIES GROUP
Fuguay Varina, NC Edinburg, TX V\Ila’;IoF'll'x Garland, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

S-M $8.94dz
63. | White Men Briefs (small thru 5XL) ')‘(f_ZXL sffd?%ddzz $3.20 $1.01ea $1.68

3XL-5XL $12.52 dz
64. | Men’s/Ladies Crew Socks (one size fits all) $5.49 dz $0.95 $0.45 (ea. pair) $0.79

5-6 $6.12 dz

7-8 $6.32 dz
65. | White Ladies Panties (Size 5 thru 18) 9-10 $8.39 dz $2.89 $0.87 ea $1.80

11-13 $8.88 dz

14-16 $9.60 dz
66. | White Men’s/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes $6.38 pair _ $6.90 $5.67 ea NO BID

(Size 6-13) (sllp on deck shoes)

67. | Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) 50 ct. bx NO BID $0.41 NO BID $0.42
68. | Advil Coated (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. box NO BID $0.41 NO BID $0.42
69. | Motrin Ibuprofen (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. bx NO BID $0.55 NO BID $1.17
70. | Tums- 3-roll pack NO BID $0.99 NO BID $0.87
71| 4” Anti Shank Security Toothbrush & Clear Cap NO BID -0- $0.45 ea $0.05
72. | Anti-Shank Security Razor — Single Edge $68.90 (case of 500) -0- $0.10 ea $0.17
73. | Jolly Ranchers 3.7 oz. Assorted Bag NO BID $1.19 NO BID $0.60
74. | Sunflower Kernels 4 oz. Bag NO BID -0- NO BID $0.50
75. | Starlite Mints 3.75 oz. Bag NO BID $1.29 NO BID $0.45
76. | Elastic Pony Tails 18 ct. pk-black $0.81 $0.50 NO BID $0.04
77. | St. Valentines Cards (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
78. | Happy Easter Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
79. | Happy Mother’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
80. | Father’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
8L. | Happy Birthday Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
82. | Thanksgiving Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.79
83. | Christmas Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk NO BID -0- NO BID $0.50
84. | Oral Pain Relief- 0.33 oz. Tube NO BID -0- NO BID $1.14
85. | Alcohol-Free Mouthwash 8 oz. Plastic Bottle NO BID -0- NO BID $0.63
86. | Alcohol — Free Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic Bottle NO BID -0- NO BID $1.58
87. | Athletes Foot Cream 0.05 oz. Tube NO BID -0- $0.65 ea $1.05
88. | Hydrocortisone Cream 1 oz. Tube NO BID -0- $0.98 ea $1.37
89. | Chap Stick Lip Balm 15 oz. $29.80 $1.18 $0.52 ea $1.19
90. | Hemorrhoid Qintment 2 oz. Tube NO BID -0- NOBID $2.84
91. | Muscle Rub 3 oz. Tube NO BID $2.60 NO BID $1.75
92. | Medicated Chest Rub 3.53 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $1.23
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HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF' SOFFICE
BID TABULATION SHEET

“Commissary Suppliesfor Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility (Jail)”

BID No. 2014-107- 05-21-SMA

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
BOB R&R ICSIAIL | cere
LIST OFITEMS BARKER CO. pistriBuTinG | SYPPLIES GROUP
Fuguay Varina, NC Edinburg, TX V\Ila’;IoF'll'x Garland, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
93. | Eye Drops 0.5 0z. NO BID -0- NO BID $1.20
94, Q)I)I((a Seltzer (Original Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 116.ct. NO BID $0.44 NO BID $0.48
95. ﬁ;(lka Seltzer (Plus Cold Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 72 ct. NO BID $0.44 NO BID $0.57
96. | Acne Gel Medication 1 oz. Tube NO BID -0- NO BID $1.25
97. | Contact Lens Solution 4 0z. NO BID -0- NO BID $4.18
98. | Legal Gummed Pads (8% x 117) NO BID -0- NO BID $0.55
99. | 3 %" Flexible Pencil NO BID -0- $0.40 ea $0.24
100. | Bubble Cushioned Envelope (6" x 97) NO BID $0.49 NO BID $0.31
101. #10 White Security Envelopes NOBID $0.03 $1O5'§>} > $0.02
102. | No Clasp Envelope (9" x 127) NO BID $0.09 NO BID $0.09
103. | Twin Pocket Folders NO BID $0.51 NO BID $0.32
104. | Dictionary (English - Spanish & English) NO BID $1.89 $2.16 ea $1.20
105. | Word Seek Puzzles Books NO BID $3.19 $0.81 ea $0.67
106. | Sketch Pads (50 Sheets) NO BID -0- NO BID $0.91
107. | Playing Cards Deck NO BID $0.94 NO BID $0.98
108. | 414” Flexible Black Ink Pen NO BID $0.34 NO BID $0.35
109. | Tracing Paper Pad (40 Sheets) NO BID $6.29(30 sheets) NO BID $1.12
110. | Tan PVC Shower Sandals (Size 8 thru 13) $1.93 $3.00(brown) $1.75 $1.42
111. | Colgate “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.2 0z. $22.53 $2.49 NO BID $1.89
112. | Close Up “Red Gel” Toothpaste- 4.0 0z. $24.87 -0- NO BID $1.20
113. | Three Flowers Brilliantine- 4 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $1.76
114. | Dandruff Shampoo & Conditioner 14.2 oz. $23.60 -0- NO BID $3.72
115. | Nair Hair Removal- 9 0z. NO BID -0- NO BID $5.72
116. | Speed Stick Agua Sport -Anti-Perspirant Gel 3 oz. $27.01 -0- $2.62 ea $2.18
117. | Razorless Hair Removing Cream- 6 0z. $20.14 $3.85 NO BID $3.24
118. | After Shave Lotion- 4 0z. NO BID $0.95 $0.64 ea $1.93
19| Baby Lotion- 4 oz. NO BID (fi%'ggt) $0.39 ea $0.45
120. | Shaving Gel 3 oz. Clear Tube $43.92 (4 02) $1.03 $1.02 ea $0.74
2L | white Handkerchief (15" x 15™) NOBIP (‘ongg) $0.59 ea $0.60
122. | \O5 Extra Body Shampoo- 12.5 0z. NO BID $1.04 NO BID $1.20
123. | VOS5 Extra Body Conditioner- 12.5 oz. NO BID $1.04 NO BID $1.20
124. | Syave Powder Fresh Deodorant 1.7 oz. Clear $6.19 (freschscen) -0- NO BID $1.27
125. | Hinged Soap Dish Box- Regular Size $2.86 dz $0.34 $14.39 $0.35
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HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF' SOFFICE

BID TABULATION SHEET

“Commissary Suppliesfor Hidalgo County Adult Detention Facility (Jail)”

BID No. 2014-107- 05-21-SMA

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
BOB R&R JESIAIL KEEFE
LISTOFITEMS BARKER CO. pistriBuTinG | SYPPLIES GROUP
Fuguay Varina, NC Edinburg, TX V\Ila’;IoF'll'x Garland, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
(bx 100)

126. Dial -Hypo Allergenic Soap- 3-3.2 oz. bar $20.91 $1.15 2?.?7’?3 $0.46
127. Dial Soap- 4 oz. bar $64.75 $0.70 2?.?7’?3 $0.82
128. | Greaseless Skin Cream 4.5 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $1.15
129. | Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Soap 3.6 0z. NO BID -0- NO BID $0.42
130. | Hair Moisturizer 4 oz. Tube NO BID -0- NO BID $2.04
131. | Palm Hair Brush Flexible — Black $14.00(case of 24) $0.30 NO BID $0.38
132. | Tampons — Singles (Regular/Super/Junior) 40 ct. Box $33.12 $0.45 $0.08 ea $5.04 20ct)
133. | Disposable Douche- 4.5 oz. NO BID $1.59 NO BID $1.66
134. | White Washcloth -(12x12") $1.79dz $0.33 $0.11 ea $0.32
135. | Topitos Salsa Verde Chips- 3.7 oz. NO BID $0.95 NO BID $0.93
136. | Super Cantinero Peanuts & Tortilla Chips-5 % oz. NO BID $1.79 NO BID NO BID
137. | Gummy Bears- 4 oz. NO BID $0.99 NO BID $0.52
138. | Mild Dill Pickle- 5 oz. NO BID $0.99 NO BID $0.43
139. | Beef & Cheese Snack Pack, Hot Flavor- 1.2 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $0.89
140. | Caramel Popcorn-3.53 oz. Bag NO BID -0- NO BID $0.44
141. | Vanilla Caramels- 3 0z. Bag NO BID -0- NO BID $0.42
142. | Hormel Spam Single Classic Pouch- 3 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID $1.15
143. | Chicken Vienna Sausages Pouch- 3 oz. NO BID -0- NO BID discorﬁirrTl]Seudr item-

no longer available
144. | Hershey’s Chocolate Almond- 1.45 oz. NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.68
145. | Plastic Reading Glasses NO BID -0- NO BID $1.09
146. | Postcards NO BID -0- NO BID $0.19
147. | Topochico Beverage Mineral Water- 20 oz. NO BID $0.85 NO BID NO BID
148. | Topochico Beverage Apple- 20 oz. NO BID $0.85 NO BID NO BID
149. | Topochico Beverage Peach- 20 oz. NO BID $0.85 NO BID NO BID
150. | Topochico Beverage Strawberry- 20 oz. NO BID $0.85 NO BID NO BID
151. | Topochico Beverage Pineapple- 20 oz. NO BID $0.85 NO BID NO BID
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Ofnce
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539 E [B E B W E

(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629
JUN -5 2014

MEMORANDUM |, 2

Eddie Guerra
Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office

ATTN: Juan Tapia, Procurement Specialist

Sandra Montalvo, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: May 21, 2014

FROM:

Request for Recommendations: Bid No. -2014-107-05-21-SMA
Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office- “Commissary Supplies for Hidalgo County Adult
Detention Facility (Jail)'™

We have received FOUR (4) responses to the above mentioned project.. Refer to enclosed copy of the bid
tabulation sheet for your review and recommendation/non-recommendation. Please advice if you wish to
proceed with this bid to award or do you wish to reject and re-advertise?

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting: therefore, we
need your response _June 02, 2014 @ 10:00 a.m. or_if possible earlier __ Please indicate your
recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Department
via fax to (956) 318-2629 or via email to: sandra.montalvo@co.hidalgo.tx.us

1 APPROVE ] DISAPPROVE and/or REJECT

BUDGET ACCOUNT#: . ’

Recommendations/Concerns; "J/ e@d5e Al AN P D / L _;a/ |7 L{/zﬁg o
V74 fff;é’éL Biddcr” py oMueh dooumeds

o

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 292-
7000- ext. 48635. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

PR Quiiz] Cpiah Bl Ly Shatl oize 4-420

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME

Enclosures



Awarded items to:

KEEFE SUPPLY

RIS T e
16. | Chili Comn Nuts-1.4 oz $0.47
17. | Ranch Com Nuts -1.4 oz $0.47
18. | Salted Peanuts 1.75 oz. bag $0.30
19. | Chunk Light Tuna 4.23 oz. Pouch $1.12
20. | Refried Beans Resealable Pouch 6 oz. $0.87
21. | Jalapeno Cheese Spread 8 oz. Plastic Tub $1.03
22. | Jelly (Grape & Strawberry) 12 oz. Squeeze Bottle $1.90
23. | Peanut Butter Squeezers 1.12 oz. $0.20
24. | Chili No Beans 11.250z. Pouch $1.28
25. | Chili w/Beans 11.250z. Pouch $1.28
26. | Hot Chili w/Beans 11.25 oz. Pouch $1.28
27. | Roast Beef & Gravy 10 oz. Pouch $2.55
28. | Sardines in Hot Tomato Sauce 3.530z. Pouch $0.79
29. | Fish Fillets 3.530z. Pouch $0.79
30. | B.B.Q. Potato Chips 1.5 oz. bag. $0.25
31. | Flaming Hot Cheetos 1.50z. bag $0.34
32. | BBQ Com Chips 1.50z. bag $0.25
33. Doritos Nacho Cheese 1.50z $0.34
34. | Tortilla Chips 12 oz. bag $1.08
35. | Tostadas 120z. pack $1.25
37. | Hot/Spicy Pork Cracklings 2 oz. $0.60
38. | Snack Crackers 12 oz. box $1.55
39. Cookies (duplex/vanilla/chocolate/strawberry) 6 oz. Tray $0.44
41. | Cinnamon Rolls 4 oz. pk $0.50
43. | Chocolate Cupcakes (2-pk) — 4 oz. $0.50
44. | Moon pies (banana/strawberry/chocolate) 2.75 oz. $0.37
45. | Cherry/Strawberry Danish 4.25 oz. ‘ $0.50
46. | Coca Cola Classic 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.90
47. | Sprite 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.90
48. | Fanta Orange 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.90
49. | Dr. Pepper 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.90
50. | Diet Coke 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.90
S1. | Diet Dr. Pepper 20 z. plastic bottle $0.90
52. | Maxwell House Instant Coffee 4 oz. Resealable Clear Pouch $2.70
53. | Coffee Mug w/Lid 14 oz. $1.13
54. | Hot Cocoa Mix loz. bag $0.14
55. | Cereal Bowl w/Lid 24 oz. $0.52
56. | Ozarka Spring Water 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.39
57. | Sugar Cubes 1 1b. bx $1.48
58. | Grey Sweatshirts (small thru 4XL) $5.33

_ — .
Awarded Items - KEEFE SUPPLY
Grace Martinez 6/3/2014 Page 1



| Ghofg..  LISTOEITEMS UNIT PRICE
59. | White Sport Bras (medium thru 3XL) $2.25
70. | Tums 3-roll pack $0.87
71. | 4” Anti Shank Security Toothbrush & Clear Cap $0.05
73. | Jolly Ranchers 3.7 oz. Assorted Bag $0.60
74. Sunflower Kemels 4 oz. Bag $0.50
75. | Starlite Mints 3.75 oz. Bag $0.45
76. Elastic Pony Tails 18 ct. pk-black $0.04
77. | St. Valentines Cards (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.79
78. | Happy Easter Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.79
79. Happy Mother’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.79
80. | Father’s Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.79
81. | Happy Birthday Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.79
82. | Thanksgiving Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.79
83. | Christmas Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.50
84. Oral Pain Relief 0.33 oz, Tube $1.14
85. | Alcohol — Free Mouthwash 8 oz. Plastic Bottle $0.63
86. Alcohol — Free Hair Gel 16 oz. Plastic Bottle $1.58
90. Hemorrhoid Qintment 2 oz. Tube $2.84
91. | Muscle Rub 3 oz. Tube $1.75
92. | Medicated Chest Rub 3.53 oz. $1.23
93. Eye Drops 0.5 oz. $1.20
96. Acne Gel Medication 1 oz. Tube $1.25
97. Contact Lens Solution 4 oz. $4.18
98. | Legal Gummed Pads (8 %4 x 11™) $0.55
99. | 3 K" Flexible Pencil $0.24
100. | Bubble Cushioned Envelope (6” x 9”) $0.31
101. | #10 White Security Envelopes $0.02
102. | No Clasp Envelope (9” x 12”) $.09
103. | Twin Pocket Folders $.32
104. | Dictionary (English — Spanish & English) $1.20
105. | Word Seek Puzzles Books $0.67
106. | Sketch Pads (50 Sheets) $0.91
109. | Tracing Paper Pad (40 Sheets) $1.12
110. | Tan PVC Shower Sandals (Size 8 thru 13) $1.42
111. | Colgate “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.2 oz. $1.89
112. | Close Up “Red Gel” Toothpaste 4.0 oz. $1.20
113. | Three Flowers Brilliantine 4 oz. $1.76
114. | Dandruff Shampoo & Conditioner 14.2 oz. $3.72
115. | Nair Hair Removal 9 oz. $5.72
116. | Speed Stick Aqua Sport Anti-Perspirant Gel 3 oz. $2.18
117. | Razorless Hair Removing Cream 6 oz. $3.24
120. | Shaving Gel 3 oz. Clear Tube $£0.74
124. | Suave Powder Fresh Deodorant 1.7 oz. Clear $1.27
126. | Dial -Hypo Allergenic Soap 3-3.2 oz. bar $0.46
128. | Greaseless Skin Cream 4.5 oz. $1.15
129. | Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Soap 3.6 oz. $0.42

Awarded Items — KEEFE SUPPLY
Grace Martinez 6/3/2014

Page 2



Awarded items to:

R&R Distributing

b S UISTORITEMS. | |~ &, | JUNITPRICE ©
1. | Hygiene Kit (4” T-Brush/T-Paste 1.05 oz. /Deodorant 0.05 oz. /Soap 1 oz.) $1.35
2. | Almond Joy Bar 1.61.0z $0.63
3. | Baby Ruth 2.1 oz. $0.63
4. | Butter Finger Bar 2.1 oz. $0.63
5. | Snickers Almond Bar 1.76 oz. $0.63
6. | Milky Way Bar 2.05 oz. $0.63
7. | Pay Day Bar 1.85 oz. $0.63
8. | Snickers Bar 2.07 oz. $0.63
9. | 3 Musketeers Bar 2.13 oz. $0.63
10. | Skittles “Original Fruits” 2.17 oz. bag $0.63
11. | M & M Peanuts 1.74 oz. bag $0.63
12. | Twix Bar 2.0 oz. $0.63
13. | Peanut Pattie 2.25 oz. $0.63
14. | Reese’s Peanut Butter Cups 1.5 oz. $0.63
Ramen Soups 3 oz. Clear Pack (chili,beef,chicken,Shrimp Chili Lime $0.20
15. | Shrimp,Spicy Chicken, Spicy Beef)
36. Takis or Extremes 3.7 oz. bag $0.95
40. Zinger Cremes 4 oz. pack $0.79
42. Honey Bun 60z. pk $0.42
61. White Thermal Underwear Set (small thru 6XL) $6.50
67. | Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) 50 ct. bx $0.41
68. Advil Coated (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. box $0.41
69. Motrin Ibuprofen (2 tablet pouch) 50 ct. bx $0.55
94. Alka Seltzer (Original Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 116.ct. box $0.44
95. Alka Seltzer (Plus Cold Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 72 ct. bx $0.44
107. | Playing Cards Deck $0.94
108. | 4 %" Flexible Black Ink Pen $0.34
122. | VOS5 Exira Body Shampoo 12.5 oz. $1.04
123. | VOS5 Extra Body Conditioner 12.5 oz. $1.04
125. | Hinged Soap Dish Box- Regular Size $0.34
127. | Dial Soap 4 oz. bar $0.70
131, | Palm Hair Brush Flexible — Black $0.30
133. | Disposable Douche 4.5 oz. $1.59
136. | Super Cantinero Peanuts & Tortilla Chips 5 Y oz. $1.79
144. | Hershey’s Chocolate Almond 1.45 oz. $0.63
147, | Topochico Beverage Mineral Water 20 oz. $0.85
148. | Topochico Beverage Apple 20 oz. $0.85
149, Topochico Beverage Peach 20 oz. $0.85

e T T e
Awarded Items - R & R Distributing
Grace Martinez 6/3/2014 Page |



Awarded items to:

ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC,

%

| LIST OF ITEMS UNIT PRICE:
60. | White Boxer Shorts (small thru 6XL) $1.22
62. | Men White Crew Neck T-shirts (Small thru 6XL) $2.39
63. | White Men Briefs (small thru 5XL) $1.01
64. Men’s/Ladies Crew Socks (one size fits all) $0.45
65. | White Ladies Panties (Size 5 thru 18) $0.87
66. | White Men’s/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes (Size 6-13) $5.67
72. | Anti-Shank Security Razor — Single Edge $0.10
87. Athletes Foot Cream 0.05 oz. Tube $0.65
88. Hydrocortisone Cream 1 oz. Tube $0.98
89. | Chap Stick Lip Balm 15 oz. $0.52
118. | After Shave Lotion 4 oz. $0.64
119. | Baby Lotion 4 oz. $0.39
121. | White Handkerchief (15” x 15”) $0.59
132. | Tampons — Singles (Regular/Super/Junior) 40 ct. Box $0.08
134. | White Washcloth (127x12") $0.11

Awarded Ttems — ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC.
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