Q > F% Hidalgo County Purchasing Office ", R 18 200 \\.“\J\\

il 43 2812 S. Business Highway 281 ! o
> & New Administration Building e
Edinburg, Texas 78539 ==

e EXAR (956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

(Departments Recommendation)

TO: Daniel Flores via email: daniel.flores@co.hidalgo.tx.us.
Hidalgo County Facilities Mgt. Dept.

Attn: Joe Castillo

FROM: Sandra Montalvo, Buyer 11 )
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

DATE: March 12,2015

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST - Bid No. 2015-077-03-04-SMA- HIDALGO
COUNTY-Construction Building Materials & Related Supplies

We have received two (2) bid responses to the above mentioned project. Refer to enclosed copy of the
bid tabulation sheet for your review and recommendation/non-recommendation. Please advice if you wish
to proceed with this bid to award or do you wish to reject and re-advertise?

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Court Meeting: therefore, we
need your response AS SOON AS POSSIBLE. Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns
on the space provided below and reply to the Purchasing Department via fax to (956) 318-2629 or via
email to: sandra.montalvo@co.hidalgo.tx.us :

[l APPROVE [ ] DISAPPROVE and/or REJECT

BUDGET ACCOUNT#:_ &5-100-Y419-Yp-22.0~00l-0- (|0

Recommendations/Concerns: /'4 // W#ﬂ( 5 d'ﬁé Cﬁ‘ 24 6/ A

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-
ext. 4865. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.

/D«Jr’%m ZZ.o ?/1@//5

/
\AUJX{ORIZED SIGNATURE PRINTED NAME DEPARTMENT AA" E

Enclosures



HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ACCEPTANCE FORM

| Department/Bid Description: HIDALGO COUNTY-Construction Building Materials & Related Supplies

Bid Opening Time: MARCH 04, 2015 @ 9:30 A.M.

BID NO.: 2015-074-03-04-SMA

Buyer: Sandra Montalvo

NAME OF COMPANY ACKNORVI\E”(—:EE'ID;EMENT
1) MATT’S BUILDING MATERIAL v
2) DIAZ FLOORS & INTERIORS, INC. v
3)
4)
5)
6)
7)

8)




HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER'SLOG

| BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 4, 2015

|| BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

I DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: HIDAL GO COUNT Y -Construction Building Materials & Related Supplies

[ BID NO.: 2015-077-03-04-SM A

|| Buyer: Sandra M ontalvo

NAME OF VENDOR Elly SA%ESE\%EE)F MAILING ADDRESS, PHONE No &
: o)
COMPANY/FIRM RES/lfig OR INITIALSOF Sl E-MAIL ADDRESS
STAFF
404 East Expressway 83
Pharr, Texas 78577
Office # 956-787-5589
MATT'S CASH & CARRY BUILDING Stor # 956-TT-5561,
e - -
1) | MATERIALS BLM/EM | Sandra Montalvo 0217115 | £ 4 oep.787-6053
Attn: Isaac D. Smith or Ben Dxke2099a@aol
bsmith@mattsbuildingmaterials.com
mattscorp@aol.com
1205 W Polk A
DIAZ FLOORS & INTERIORS, INC. Pharr. TX 78577
2) Attn: Andy Diaz or Victoria Vigil EMR Sandra Montalvo 02//17/15 | 956) 787-0056 /
(956) 781-7917 fax
diazfloor8586@sbcglobal.net
1601 N. Cage Suite "C"
3) READYN_IEN CONSTRUCTION EMR Sandra Montalvo 02//18/15 | Pharr, Texas 78577
Attn: Lupita Sauceda readymenconstruction@gmail.com
4622 Cedar Avenue Bldg 5 Suite 124
Wilmington NC 28403
4) PRIME _VENDOR INC_' EMR Sandra Montalvo 02/18/15 | Phone: 800-746-9554
Attn: Kimberly Doumit Fax: 800-746-8307
bids20@prime-vendor.com
P.O. Box 471103
Fort Worth, Tx76147
1.866.280.1846
5) ADVANTAGE SUPPLY EMR Sandra Montalvo | 02/23/15 | Fax 817.377.8095
ATTN: LARRY VRANA Cell 214.334.6375
www.advantagesupply.us
Larry.vrana@advantagesupply.us
Address: 3710 S. Expressway 281,
Edinburg, TX 78542
victor.garza@cemex.com
6) CEM EX EMR Sandra Montalvo 02/23/15 | www.cemexusa.com
Victor Garza Mobile: (713)249-7030
Office : (956)386-1452
Fax: (281)715-4902
516 S McLennan Loop
P2 EMULSIONS PLANTS LLC i Mot X 76690
7) | David Williams/ Cheryl Helms EMR Sandra Montalvo | 02/23/15 | 361 877-2584
254 829-0330
Tel. #956-580-2502 Ext. 1128.
8) S:AI.DA 0 EMR Sandra Montalvo | 02/23/15 | mission tx
unior Ocampo
lilliewilliams@outlook.com
9) \If\/"”—ﬁvol'l\' CULVERTS, INC. EMR | SandraMontalvo | 02/24/15 | 903-764-5605
Ilie Hirams
4047 Naco Perrin, Suite 100
Karen Sesters San Antonio, TX 78217
10) Virtual Builders EMR Sandra Montalvo 02/24/15 Ph: 210-564-6900. Ext. 126
Fax: 210-564-6902
6110 South 42" Street
McAllen, Texas 78503
ABC SUPPLY CO. INC. Phone: 956.661.8900
11)| Jaime Rubio EMR Sandra Montalvo 03/3/15 | Mobile: 956.227.0800
Fax: 956.668.8066
jaime.rubio@abcsupply.com
www.abcsupply.com
*VIA:
IN PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR)
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
TABULATION SHEET

Department/Bid Description: HIDALGO COUNTY-Construction Building Materials &
Related Supplies

BID NO.: 2015-077-03-04-SMA Bid Opening Time: MARCH 04, 2015 @ 9:30 A.M

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS MATT'S BUILDING DIAZ FLOORS &
MATERIALS INTERIORS INC.

Manufac
turer
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS Manutacturer 1 yom o e oy |7 iy
A) BOARDS(LUMBER)

1 2 X 4 -PC (92-5/8) WW STUD LUMBER 104 EA. $2.79 No bid
2 2 X 4-9 PC (104-5/8) WW/HF STUD LUMBER 1049 EA. $3.49 No bid
3 2 X 4-10' PC (116-5/8) WW/HF STUD LUMBER 10410P EA. $3.89 No bid
4 2 X 4-8 STD&BTR/#2 SPF/H STUD LUMBER 1048 EA. $2.85 No bid
5 2 X 4-10 STD&BTR/#2 SPF/ STUD LUMBER 10410 EA. $4.19 No bid
6 2 X 4-12 STD&BTR/#2 SPF/HF STUD LUMBER 10412 EA. $5.19 No bid
7 2 X 4-14 STD&BTR/#2 SPF/ STUD LUMBER 10414 EA. $6.09 No bid
8 2 X 4-16 STD&BTR/#2 SPF/HF STUD LUMBER 10416 EA. $7.09 No bid
9 2 X 4-18 STD&BTR#2 SPF/H STUD LUMBER 10418 EA. $7.79 No bid
10 2 X 4-20 STD&BTR #2 SPF/HF STUD LUMBER 10420 EA. $8.89 No bid
11 2 X 6-8PC (925/8) #2 SP LUMBER 1068P EA. $4.69 No bid
12 2 X 6-9(1045/8) STUD-GP LUMBER 1069 EA. $5.79 No bid
13 2 X 6-10PC (116-5/8) STUD LUMBER 10610P EA. $5.79 No bid
14 2 X 6 -8 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 1068 EA. $4.75 No bid
15 2 X 6 -10#2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10610 EA. $6.29 No bid
16 2X6-12 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10612 EA. $7.39 No bid
17 2 X 6 -14 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10614 EA. $8.69 No bid
18 2 X 6 -16 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10616 EA. $9.89 No bid
19 2 X 6 - 18 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10618 EA. $11.19 No bid
20 2 X 6 - 20 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10620 EA. $12.49 No bid
21 2 X 6 - 22 #2 SPF/HF LUMBER 10622 EA. $18.95 No bid
22 2 X 6 - 24 #2 SPF/HF LUMBER 10624 EA. $19.99 No bid
23 2 X 6 - 26 #2 SPF/HF LUMBER 10626 EA. $24.95 No bid
24 2 X 8-8 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 1088 EA. $6.29 No bid
25 2 X 8 - 10 #2 SPF/HF/Y LUMBER 10810 EA. $7.29 No bid
26 2 X 8-12 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10812 EA. $9.29 No bid
27 2 X 8 - 14 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10814 EA. $11.49 No bid
28 2 X 8-16 #2 SPF HF/YP LUMBER 10816 EA. $11.99 No bid
29 2 X 8 - 18 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10818 EA. $14.99 No bid
30 2 X 8 -20 #2 SPF/HF/Y LUMBER 10820 EA. $15.89 No bid
31 2 X 8-22 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10822 EA. $26.99 No bid
32 2 X 8-24 #2 SPF/HF/Y LUMBER 10824 EA. $28.99 No bid
33 2 X 10-8 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10108 EA. $7.89 No bid
34 2 X 10-10 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101010 EA. $9.29 No bid
35 2 X 10-12 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101012 EA. $11.79 No bid
36 2 X 10-14 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101014 EA. $15.49 No bid
37 2 X 10-16 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101016 EA. $16.49 No bid
38 2 X 10-18 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101018 EA. $18.89 No bid
39 2 X 10-20 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101020 EA. $21.49 No bid
40 2 X 10-22 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101022 EA. $29.49 No bid
41 2 X 10-24 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101024 EA. $34.99 No bid
42 2 X 12-8 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 10128 EA. $10.79 No bid
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43 2 X 12-10 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101210 EA. $13.59 No bid
44 2 X 12-12 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101212 EA. $18.99 No bid
45 2 X 12-14 #2 SPF/HF LUMBER 101214 EA. $22.49 No bid
46 2 X 12-16 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101216 EA. $24.29 No bid
47 2 X 12-18 #2 SPF/HF LUMBER 101218 EA. $26.49 No bid
48 2 X 12-20 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101220 EA. $32.99 No bid
49 2 X 12-22 #2 SPF/HF/YP LUMBER 101222 EA. $34.99 No bid
50 2 X 12-24 #2 SPF/HF LUMBER 101224 EA. $42.99 No bid
51 2 X 2-8' WP STRIP WP228 EA. $2.79 No bid
B.) TREATED BOARDS (LUMBER)

1 2 X 4-8' TREATED LUMBER 2048 EA. $3.99 No bid
2 2 X 4-10' TREATED LUMBER 20410 EA. $5.49 No bid
3 2 X 4-12' TREATED LUMBER 20412 EA. $6.49 No bid
4 2 X 4-14' TREATED LUMBER 20414 EA. $7.69 No bid
5 2 X 4-16' TREATED LUMBER 20416 EA. $8.99 No bid
6 2 X 6-8' TREATED LUMBER 2068 EA. $5.89 No bid
7 2 X 6-10' TREATED LUMBER 20610 EA. $7.69 No bid
8 2 X 6-12' TREATED LUMBER 20612 EA. $8.89 No bid
9 2 X 6-14' TREATED LUMBER 20614 EA. $10.49 No bid
10 2 X 6-16' TREATED LUMBER 20616 EA. $11.49 No bid
11 2 X 6-20' TREATED LUMBER 20620 EA. $14.99 No bid
12 2 X 8-8' TREATED LUMBER 2088 EA. $9.49 No bid
13 2 X 8-10' TREATED LUMBER 20810 EA. $11.29 No bid
14 2 X 8-12' TREATED LUMBER 20812 EA. $12.89 No bid
15 2 X 8-14' TREATED LUMBER 20814 EA. $15.69 No bid
16 2 X 8-16' TREATED LUMBER 20816 EA. $17.49 No bid
17 2 X 8-20' TREATED LUMBER 20820 EA. $20.49 No bid
18 2 X 12-8 TREATED LUMBER 20128 EA. $14.89 No bid
19 2 X 12-12' TREATED LUMBER 201212 EA. $25.89 No bid
20 2 X 12-16' TREATED LUMBER 201216 EA. $32.84 No bid
21 2 X 12-20' TREATED LUMBER 201220 EA. $43.99 No bid
22 4 X 4-8' TREATED 20448 EA. $8.29 No bid
23 4 X 4-10' TREATED 204410 EA. $12.49 No bid
24 4 X 4-12' TREATED 204412 EA. $15.29 No bid
25 4 X 4-14' TREATED 204414 EA. $17.49 No bid
26 4 X 4-16' TREATED 204416 EA. $21.49 No bid
27 4 X 4-20' TREATED 204420 EA. $37.99 No bid
28 4 X 6-8' TREATED 20468 EA. $14.79 No bid
29 4 X 6-10' TREATED 204610 EA. $20.99 No bid
30 4 X 6-12' TREATED 204612 EA. $24.19 No bid
31 4 X 6-14' TREATED 204614 EA. $28.89 No bid
32 4 X 6-16' TREATED 204616 EA. $34.49 No bid
33 4 X 6-20' TREATED 204620 EA. $57.89 No bid
34 6 X 6-8' TREATED POST 20668 EA. $24.49 No bid
35 6 X 6-12' TREATED 206612 EA. $37.49 No bid
36 6 X 6-16' TREATED 206616 EA. $47.99 No bid
37 1X6-6'#1 %" TREATED FENCE 20164 EA. $1.95 No bid
C) CEDARLUMBER

1 1 X 2-8'#2 CEDAR 1301208 EA. $2.24 No bid
2 1 X 2-10 #2 CEDAR 13012010 EA. $2.80 No bid
3 1 X 2-12 #2 CEDAR 13012012 EA. $3.36 No bid
4 1 X 2-14'#2 CEDAR 13012014 EA. $3.92 No bid
5 1 X 12-10' CEDAR WESTERN RED 15112310 EA. $24.90 No bid
6 1 X 12-12' CEDAR WESTERN RED 15112312 EA. $29.88 No bid
7 1 X 12-8 CEDAR WESTERN RED 1511238 EA. $19.92 No bid
8 1 X 4-8' CEDAR 151448 EA. $3.99 No bid
9 1 X 4-10' CEDAR 1514410 EA. $4.99 No bid
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10 1 X 4-12' CEDAR 1514412 EA. $5.99 No bid
11 1 X 6-8' CEDAR WESTERN RED 151648 EA. $6.38 No bid
12 1 X 6-10' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1516410 EA. $7.98 No bid
13 1 X 6-12' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1516412 EA. $9.59 No bid
14 1 X 6-14' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1516414 EA. $10.98 No bid
15 1 X 6-16' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1516416 EA. $12.98 No bid
16 1 X 8-8 CEDAR WESTERN RED 151858 EA. $8.90 No bid
17 1 X 8-10' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1518510 EA. $11.50 No bid
18 1 X 8-12' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1518512 EA. $13.80 No bid
19 1 X 8-14' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1518514 EA. $15.90 No bid
20 1 X 8-16' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1518516 EA. $20.00 No bid
21 1 X 8-20' CEDAR WESTERN RED 1518520 EA. $25.00 No bid
22 1X6-6"%" CEDAR PICKET 2016 EA. $2.89 No bid
D.) LUMBER (PINE)1INCH

1 1 X 10-10"#2 S4S Y.P. 15110210 EA. $9.96 No bid
2 1X10-8 #2Y.P. 1511028 EA. $8.39 No bid
3 1 X 12-10' SELECT W.P. 15112110 EA. $18.75 No bid
4 1 X 12-12' SELECT W.P. 15112112 EA. $21.69 No bid
5 1 X 12-16' SELECT W.P. 15112116 EA. $28.90 No bid
6 1 X 12-8 SELECT W.P. 1511218 EA. $14.75 No bid
7 1 X 12-16 SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 15112416 EA. $39.00 No bid
8 1 X 12-8' SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 1511248 EA. $19.00 No bid
9 1 X 2-8 SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 151268 EA. $2.79 No bid
10 1 X 2-16' REAL TRIM 1512RT EA. $3.20 No bid
11 1 X 4-10"#1 SAS Y.P. 1514110 EA. $4.50 No bid
12 1 X 4-12"#1 S4S Y.P. 1514112 EA. $5.20 No bid
13 1X4-8#1 S4SY.P. 151418 EA. $3.70 No bid
14 1 X 4-10' D-GRADE Y.P. FLOORING 1514310 EA. $5.79 No bid
15 1 X 4-8' D-GRADE Y.P. FLOORING 151438 EA. $4.59 No bid
16 1 X 4-16' SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 1514516 EA. $7.84 No bid
17 1 X 4-8 SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 151458 EA. $4.49 No bid
18 1 X 4-16' REAL TRIM 1514RT EA. $5.12 No bid
19 1 X 6-10"#1 SAS Y.P. 1516110 EA. $6.50 No bid
20 1X6-12"#1 SAS Y.P. 1516112 EA. $8.90 No bid
21 1 X 6-8"#1 S4S Y.P. 1516118 EA. $5.40 No bid
22 1 X 6-10"#2 SAS Y.P. 1516210 EA. $4.50 No bid
23 1 X 6-12"#2 SAS Y.P. 1516212 EA. $5.80 No bid
24 1 X 6-14'#2 S4S Y.P. 1516214 EA. $6.30 No bid
25 1 X 6-16'#2 S4S YP/WP 1516216 EA. $7.60 No bid
26 1X6-8#2S4SY.P. 151628 EA. $3.60 No bid
27 1 X 6-12' D-GRADE #117 1516312 EA. $9.89 No bid
28 1 X 6-8 SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 151658 EA. $9.95 No bid
29 1 X 6-12' BEADED 1516612 EA. $8.92 No bid
30 1 X 6-16' REAL TRIM 1516RT EA. $7.84 No bid
31 1 X 8-10"#1 SAS Y.P. 1518110 EA. $8.30 No bid
32 1 X 8-12"#1 SAS Y.P. 1518112 EA. $10.20 No bid
33 1 X 8-8"#1 S4S Y.P. 151818 EA. $6.80 No bid
34 1 X 8-10"#2 SAS Y.P. 1518210 EA. $6.90 No bid
35 1 X 8-12"#2 SAS Y.P. 1518212 EA. $8.30 No bid
36 1 X 8-14'#2 SAS Y .P. 1518214 EA. $8.90 No bid
37 1 X 8-16"#2 S4S Y.P. 1518216 EA. $10.80 No bid
38 1 X 8-8#2S4S Y .P. 151828 EA. $5.60 No bid
39 1 X 8-10"#2 S/L 1518310 EA. $6.90 No bid
40 1X8-12'#2 S/L 1518312 EA. $8.40 No bid
42 1X8-8#2S/L 151838 EA. $5.80 No bid
43 1 X 8-10"#2 105 Y.P SIDING 1518410 EA. $7.40 No bid
44 1 X 8-12"#2 105 Y.P SIDING 1518412 EA. $8.88 No bid
45 1 X 8-14'#2 105 Y.P SIDING 1518414 EA. $10.36 No bid
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46| 1X8-16 #2 105 Y.P SIDING 1518416 EA. $11.84 No bid
47 | 1X8-8 #2105 Y.PSIDING 151848 EA. $5.92 No bid
48| 1X 816 SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 1518616 EA. $15.84 No bid
49 | 1X8-8 SELECT FJ WHITE PINE 151868 EA. $10.99 No bid
50 [ 1X8-16 REAL TRIM 1518RT EA. $13.60 No bid
51 [ 1X2-8WPSTRIP WP128 EA. $1.45 No bid
52 | 1X12-10'#3 W/P 15112210 EA. $11.89 No bid
53 | 1X12-12'#3W.P. 15112212 EA. $14.27 No bid
54 | 1X12-14 #3 W/P 15112214 EA. $16.94 No bid
55 | 1X12-16'#3 W/P 15112216 EA. $19.92 No bid
56 | 1X12-8 #3W/P 1511228 EA. $9.52 No bid
57 | 1X4-10'#3 & BETTER SP 1514210 EA. $3.48 No bid
58 | 1X4-12'#3 & BETTER SP 1514212 EA. $4.19 No bid
50 | 1X4-14'#3 & BETTER SP 1514214 EA. $4.89 No bid
60 | 1X4-16'#3 & BETTER SPF 1514216 EA. $5.59 No bid
61 | 1X4-8#3&BETTER SPF 151428 EA. $2.79 No bid
62 | 1X12-14' SELECT W.P, 15112114 EA. $25.29 No bid
E.) PLYWOOD (REGULARPLYWOOQOD)

1 [3/8PTS. PLYWOOD 2511 EA. $18.99 No bid
2| 3/8 CDX PLYWOOD 251 EA. $15.99 No bid
3| % (15/32) CD PLYWOOD 252 EA. $19.49 No bid
4 | 5/8 (19/32) CD PLYWOOD 253 EA. $21.99 No bid
5 | % (23/32) CD PLYWOOD 254 EA. $26.99 No bid
6 | % (23/32) T & G PLYWOOD 2541 EA. $29.49 No bid
7 | 4X81 18 T&G 25118 EA. $49.99 No bid
FINISH PLYWOOD

8 | 4x8% BCPLYWOOD 3014 EA. $20.79 No bid
9 | 4x8-3/8 BCPLYWOOD 3038 EA. $19.49 No bid
10 [4X8-% BCPLYWOOD 3012 EA. $25.49 No bid
11 [ 4X8-5/8BCPLYWOOD 3058 EA $29.49 No bid
12 [ 4X8-3% BCPLYWOOD 3034 EA. $35.89 No bid
13 [ 4X8-% BIRCHPLYWOOD 3011 EA. $16.99 No bid
14 | 4X8-9% BIRCH CAB GRADE PLYWOOD 3013 EA. $37.99 No bid
15| 4X8-5/8 BIRCH CAB GRADE PLYWOOD 3015 EA. $31.99 No bid
16| 4X8-% ASHPLYWOOD 3021 EA. $25.99 No bid
17 | 4X8-% ASHPLYWOOD 3023 EA. $54.99 No bid
18 | 4X8-% RED OAK PLYWOOD 3041 EA. $25.99 No bid
19 [ 4X8-% RED OAK PLYWOOD 3043 EA. $49.99 No bid
20 | 4X8-1/8 LUAN PLYWOOD 3068 EA. $12.99 No bid
21 | 4X8-% LUAN PLYWOOD 3061 EA. $13.99 No bid
22_| 4X8-% LUAN PLYWOOD 3062 EA. $25.99 No bid
23 | 4X8-5/8 LUAN PLYWOOD 3065 EA. $29.99 No bid
24| 4X8-% LUAN PLYWOOD 3063 EA. $43.99 No bid
25 | 4X8%" MDOPLYWOOD 252MDO EA. $39.50 No bid
SIDING PLYWOOD

26 [ 3/8 "4 X 8 CLASSIC BEADED SIDING 2513 EA. $23.99 No bid
27 | 3/8 T-1/11 SIDING 2512 EA. $20.99 No bid
28 | 5/8-4 T-1/11 SIDING 2534 EA. $28.99 No bid
29 | 5/8-8" T1-11 SIDING 25381 EA. $28.99 No bid
30 | 5/8-12 T1-11 SIDING 25312 EA. $29.99 No bid
31 [ 4Xx8-3/8 "SMART PANEL 2515 EA. $22.99 No bid
OSB PLYWOOD

32 | 4x87/16 0SB 2516 EA. | $889 | No bid
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33 | 4 x8-7/16 OSB Thermo sheet 2516R EA. $12.49 No bid
34 | 4x8-19/32 0SB 2531 EA. $15.99 No bid
TREATED PLYWOOD

35 | 4X8% TREATED PLYWOOD 3012T EA. $26.99 No bid
36 | 4X8% TREATED PLYWOOD 3034T EA. $33.99 No bid
37 | % TREATED LATTICE 48T34 EA. $21.99 No bid
F) METAL ROOFING

1 10' GALVANIZED CORRUGATED IRON (31 GAUGE) 5510 EA. $11.45 No bid
2 10' GALVANIZED CORRUGATED RIDGE ROLL 5510C EA. $10.99 No bid
3 10'6" GREEN RIDGE CAP 5510GN EA. $17.99 No bid
4 10' PLAIN RIDGE ROLL CORRUGATED 5510P EA. $10.99 No bid
5 10'6" RED RIDGE CAP 5510RD EA. $17.99 No bid
6 38" X 10' RIB PANEL IRON 5510RP EA. $20.75 No bid
7 10'6" WHITE RIDGE CAP 5510WH EA. $17.99 No bid
8 12' GALVANIZED CORRUGATED IRON (31 GAUGE) 5512 EA. $13.45 No bid
9 37" X 12' GREEN ROOF 5512GN EA. $30.75 No bid
10 | 37" X 12' RED ROOF 5512RD EA. $30.75 No bid
11 | 38" X 12' RIB PANEL IRON 5512RP EA. $24.75 No bid
12 | 37" X 12" WHITE ROOF 5512WH EA. $30.75 No bid
13 | 14' GALVANIZED CORRUGATED IRON (31 GAUGE) 5514 EA. $15.95 No bid
14 | 38" X 14'RIB PANEL IRON 5514RP EA. $28.75 No bid
15 | 16' GALVANIZED CORRUGATED IRON (31 GAUGE) 5516 EA. $17.95 No bid
16 | 37" X 16' GREEN ROOF 5516GN EA. $40.75 No bid
17 | 37" X 16' RED ROOF 5516RD EA. $40.75 No bid
18 | 38" X 16' RIB PANEL IRON 5516RP EA. $32.75 No bid
19 | 37" X 16' WHITE ROOF 5516WH EA. $40.75 No bid
20 | 6' GALVANIZED CORRUGATED IRON (31 GAUGE) 556 EA. $6.95 No bid
21 | 8 GALVANIZED CORRUGATED IRON (31 GAUGE) 558 EA. $8.95 No bid
22 | 37" X 8 GREEN ROOF 558GN EA. $20.75 No bid
23 | 37" X 8' RED ROOF 558RD EA. $20.75 No bid
24 | 38" X 8 RIB PANEL IRON 558RP EA. $16.75 No bid
25 | 37" X 8 WHITE ROOF 558WH EA. $21.99 No bid
26 | 10' CORNER GREEN 55CGN EA. $21.99 No bid
27 | 10' CORNER RED 55CRD EA. $21.90 No bid
28 | 10' CORNER WHITE 55CWH EA. $19.99 No bid
29 | 10'6" EVE RED 55ERD EA. $20.75 No bid
30 | 10%6"EVEWHITE 55EWH EA. $19.99 No bid
G.) MASONRY CEMENT

1 CONCRETE MIX (80 LBS.) 851 EA. $3.49 No bid
2 SAND & CEMENT MIX (80 LBS.) 852 EA. $3.99 No bid
3 MORTAR MIX (60LBS.) 853 EA. $3.95 No bid
4 LIME 504 BAG (50LBS.) 854 EA. $6.99 No bid
5 PORTLAND CEMENT (92.59 LBS) 855 EA. $8.89 No bid
6 MASONRY CEMENT (70.55 LBS) 856 EA. $7.89 No bid
7 WHITE PORTLAND CEMENT (92.59 LBS) 857 EA. $19.99 No bid
8 WHITE MASONRY CEMENT (70.55 LBS) 858 EA. $15.49 No bid
9 ALL-PURPOSE SAND-70# (70 LBS) 859 EA. $3.29 No bid
H) FIBER CEMENT

1 5/16 X 8 ¥4 X 12' FICMNT FACIA 25512F EA. $5.49 No bid
2 5/16 - 4 X 8 8" OC FIBER CEMENT SIDING 255488C EA. $22.99 No bid
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3 5/16 - 4 X 8 FIBER CEMENT STUCCO SIDING 25582 EA. $22.49 No bid
4 5/16 - 4 X 8 TEXTURE FIBER CEMENT SIDING 25548C EA. $22.49 No bid
5 12" X 12' F/IC CEMPLANK CLASSIC LAP SIDING 25512C EA. $7.89 No bid
6 8Y4" X 12' F/IC CEMPLANK CLASSIC LAP SIDING 255814C EA. $5.69 No bid
7 8v," X 12' F/IC HARDIPLANK COLONIAL LAP SIDING 255814H EA. $7.79 No bid
8 16" X 12' F/C CEDARMILL VENTED HARDISOFFIT 25516H EA. $17.99 No bid
9 3% " X 12'X7/16" FIC CEMTRIM 2554716C EA. $6.49 No bid
10 7%" X 12'X %" FIC RUSTIC HARDIETRIM 2558H EA. $19.95 No bid
11 4 X 8 F/IC CEMPLANK 8" O.C. 255488C EA. $22.49 No bid
12 4'X 8' X 5/16" F/IC CEMPLANK CEDARMILL 25548C EA. $22.49 No bid
13 3% " X 12'X %" FIC RUSTIC HARDIETRIM 2554H EA. $9.79 No bid
14 5% " X 12' X %" FIC RUSTIC HARDIETRIM 2556H EA. $15.39 No bid
l.)  NAILS

FINISH NAILS

1 16D EG FINISH 7616F LB. $1.99 No bid
2 3D EG FINISH 763F LB. $1.99 No bid
3 8D BRIGHT FINISH 758F LB. $1.59 No bid
4 4D EG FINISH 764F LB. $1.99 No bid
5 3D BRIGHT FINISH 753F LB. $1.59 No bid
6 4D BRIGHT FINISH 754F LB. $1.59 No bid
7 16D BRIGHT FINISH 7516F LB. $1.59 No bid
8 6D BRIGHT FINISH 756F LB. $1.59 No bid
9 6D HG FINISH 766F LB. $1.99 No bid
10 8D EG FINISH 768F LB. $1.99 No bid
ROOFING NAILS

11 LARGE TINCAPS 5057 LB. $1.15 No bid
12 1-% " EG ROOFING NAILS 5112R LB. $1.59 No bid
13 1- ¥4 " EG ROOFING NAILS 5114R LB. $1.59 No bid
14 1- %" PLASTIC CAP NAIL 5134C LB. $3.25 No bid
15 1- %" EG RS NEO ROOFING NAIL 5134R LB. $1.59 No bid
16 1" EG ROOFING NAILS 51R LB. $1.59 No bid
17 2" EG ROOFING NAILS 52R LB. $1.59 No bid
18 %" GRIP CAP-PLASTIC ROOFING 534C LB. $3.25 No bid
19 %" EG ROOFING NAILS 534R LB $1.59 No bid
20 1- %" BRT RS LEAD HEAD ROOFING 5525 LB. $3.59 No bid
21 1- %" NEOPRENE WASHER ROOFING NAILS 5526 LB. $2.59 No bid
22 1 %" THS FLU MASONRY 75112 LB. $1.99 No bid
23 12 X 1- %" GALV HWH S/D W/NEO-WASHER 1125DS LB. $5.99 No bid
24 12-14 X 2" GALV HWH S/D W/NEO-WASHER 2SDS LB. $5.59 No bid
25 2 %" THS FLU MASONRY 75212 LB. $1.99 No bid
SHEETROCK NAILS

26 | 13/8" SHEETROCK GALVANIZED NAILS 759LB LB. $1.99 No bid
GALVANIZED NAILS

27 16D HG BOX 7616B LB. $2.25 No bid
28 16D HG COMMON 7616C LB. $2.25 No bid
29 6D HG BOX 766B LB. $2.25 No bid
30 6D HG COMMON 766C LB. $2.25 No bid
31 8D HG BOX 768B LB. $2.25 No bid
32 8D HG COMMON 768C LB. $1.99 No bid
REGULAR NAILS

33 16D BRIGHT BOX 7516B LB. $1.49 No bid
34 16D BRIGHT COMMON 7516C LB. $1.49 No bid
35 30D BRIGHT COMMON 7530C LB. $1.79 No bid
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36 | 60D BRIGHT COMMON 7560C LB. $1.59 No bid
37 | 6D BRIGHT BOX 756B LB. $1.49 No bid
38 | 6D BRIGHT COMMON 756C LB. $1.49 No bid
39 | 8D BRIGHT BOX 7588 LB. $1.49 No bid
40 | 8D BRIGHT COMMON 758C LB. $1.49 No bid
41 | 8D DUPLEX NAILS 7708 LB. $1.69 No bid
42 | 10D COATED SINKER 7710C LB. $1.69 No bid
43 | 12D COATED SINKER 7712C LB. $1.69 No bid
44 | 16D BRIGHT DUPLEX NAILS 77161 LB. $1.69 No bid
45 | 16D COATED SINKER 7716C LB. $1.69 No bid
46 | 8D COATED SINKER 778C LB. $1.69 No bid
J.) WEDGE ANCHOR

1 [% X2-%" WEDGE ANCHOR WA12234 EA. $1.99 No bid
2 | % X3-%" WEDGE ANCHOR WA12334 EA. $1.99 No bid
3 |% X4-%" WEDGE ANCHOR WA12412 EA, $1.59 No bid
4 | % X5-%" WEDGE ANCHOR WA12512 EA. $1.59 No bid
5 |% X7 WEDGE ANCHOR WA127 EA. $1.99 No bid
6 |% X1-%" WEDGE ANCHOR WA14134 EA. $0.59 No bid
7 | % X2-¥%' WEDGE ANCHOR WA14214 EA. $0.79 No bid
8 |% X3- %" WEDGE ANCHOR WA14314 EA. $0.79 No bid
9 | 3/8 X2-%"WEDGE ANCHOR WA38214 EA. $1.09 No bid
10 [ 3/8 X 3" WEDGE ANCHOR WA383 EA. $0.99 No bid
11 [3/8X3-%" WEDGE ANCHOR WA38334 EA. $0.99 No bid
12 [3/8 X5" WEDGE ANCHOR WA385 EA. $1.09 No bid
13 [5/8 X 3-% " WEDGE ANCHOR WA58312 EA. $1.59 No bid
14 [5/8 X 4 %" WEDGE ANCHOR WA58412 EA. $1.69 No bid
15 [ 5/8 X 5" WEDGE ANCHOR WA585 EA. $1.79 No bid
16 [ 5/8 X 6" WEDGE ANCHOR WA586 EA. $1.99 No bid
17 [ 5/8 X 7" WEDGE ANCHOR WA587 EA. $3.29 No bid
K.) SCREWS

EXTERIOR SREWS

1 [1 %"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 1LB 6466652832 EA. $4.99 No bid
2 |1 %"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5LB 6466652833 EA. $19.99 No bid
3 | 15/8" PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 1LB 6466652837 EA. $4.99 No bid
4 | 15/8"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5LB 6466652838 EA. $19.99 No bid
5 | 15/8" PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5M 6466652839 EA. $69.99 No bid
6 | 15/8" EXTERIOR SCREWS 25 LBS. 6466652840 EA. $54.99 No bid
7 | 2"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 1LB 6466652842 EA. $4.99 No bid
8 | 2"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5LB 6466652843 EA. $19.99 No bid
9 |2 %"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 1LB 6466652848 EA. $4.99 No bid
10 [ 2 %" PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5LB 6466652849 EA. $19.99 No bid
11 [ 3"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 1LB 6466652853 EA. $4.99 No bid
12 | 3"PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5LB 6466652854 EA. $19.99 No bid
13 i"BzgelMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 2M (25 6466652855 EA $69.99 NG bid
14 [ 3 % "PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 1LB 6466652858 EA. $6.99 No bid
15 [ 3 %" PRIMEGUARD TEN EXTERIOR SCREWS 5LB 6466652859 EA. $24.99 No bid
DRYWALL SCREWS

16 | 1-%" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 25LB 6466651102 EA. $59.99 No bid
17 | 1-5/8" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 25 LBS | 6466651104 EA. $49.99 No bid
18 | 2" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 25 LBS 6466651105 EA. $49.99 No bid
19 | 2-%" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 25 LBS. | 6466651106 EA. $49.99 No bid
20 | 3" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 25 LBS 6466651108 EA. $49.99 No bid
21 | 1" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651469 EA. $3.99 No bid
22 | 1- 1/8" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651470 EA. $3.99 No bid
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23 1- % " COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651471 EA. $3.99 No bid
24 1-5/8" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651473 EA. $3.99 No bid
25 2" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651474 EA. $3.99 No bid
26 2- %" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651476 EA. $3.99 No bid
27 3" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1LB 6466651477 EA. $3.99 No bid
28 1" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LBS 6466651478 EA. $17.99 No bid
29 1-1/8 " COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LB 6466651479 EA. $17.99 No bid
30 1- %" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LBS 6466651480 EA. $17.99 No bid
31 1-5/8" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LBS 6466651482 EA. $17.99 No bid
32 2" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LBS 6466651483 EA. $17.99 No bid
33 2-% " COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LB 6466651485 EA. $17.99 No bid
34 3" COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LBS 6466651486 EA. $17.99 No bid
35 3-%2 " COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 5LBS 6466651487 EA. $17.99 No bid
36 3-%2 " COARSE THREAD DRYWALL SCREWS 1 LB 6466652797 EA. $4.69 No bid
L) COMMERCIAL TILE

1 X5CS-|I;- 1/8 " 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL SHADOW BLUE 51807 EA $29.99 $45.00
2 VCT-1/8" 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL COOL WHT 45SF 51899 EA. $29.99 $45.00
3 VCT-1/8" 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL TILE 45SF 51903 EA. $29.99 $45.00
4 VCT-1/8" 12"" X 12" COMMERCIAL TILE 45SF 51906 EA. $29.99 $45.00
5 VCT-1/8" 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL TILE BLACK 45SF 51910 EA. $29.99 $150.00
6 VCT-1/8" 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL TILE WHITE 45SF 51911 EA. $29.99 $190.00
7 VCT-1/8" 12X12 COMMERCIAL SANDY BEACH 45SF 51929 EA. $29.99 $45.00
8 VCT-1/8" 12X12 COMMERCIAL IVORY 45SF 52507 EA. $29.99 $190.00
9 VCT-1/8" 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL CIQUE WHT 45SF 52513 EA. $29.99 $45.00
10 VCT-1/8" 12" X 12" COMMERCIAL JUBILEE WHT 45SF 52514 EA. $29.99 $45.00
11 Z/SCS'I';-US" 12X12” COMMERCIAL IMPERIAL NOUGAT 57501 EA $29.99 $45.00
12 VCT-1/8" 12X12” COMMERCIAL CHOCOLATE 45SF 57504 EA. $29.99 $45.00
M. INSULATION

1 R13 X 15 INSULATION (88.12SQ FT/BAG) 801315 EA. $29.99 No bid
2 R13 X 23 INSULATION (120.11SQ FT/ROLL) 801323 EA. $43.99 No bid
3 R30 X 16 INSULATION (53.33SQ FT/ROLL) 803015 EA. $36.99 No bid
4 R30 X 24 INSULATION (80 SQ FT/ROLL) 803024 EA. $56.99 No bid
5 R11 X 15 INSULATION (88.12 SQ FT/ROLL) 80315 EA. $25.49 No bid
6 R11 X 15 INS MINI ROLL (50 SQ FT) 803151 EA. $12.99 No bid
7 IF:Q_IZI:;I.R)éIZI_.5L)MINI-ROLL INSULATION(40SQ 80315M EA. $12.99 No bid
8 R11 X 23 INSULATION (135.12 SQ FT/ROLL) 80323 EA. $38.99 No bid
9 R19 X 15 INSULATION(48.96 SQ FT/ROLL) 80615 EA. $22.99 No bid
10 R19 X 23 INSULATION(75.07 SQ FT/ROLL) 80623 EA. $33.99 No bid
N.) MOLDING

FJ MOLDING

1 14'FJ 2 1/8 COLONIAL TRIM M-ACOL218F) 13020514 EA. $5.18 No bid
2 7'FJ2 1/8 COLONIAL TRIM 1302057 EA. $2.99 No bid
3 10' 2- 1/8 " HW WEDGE CASE A 13010110 EA. $6.59 No bid
4 14' 2-1/8 " HW WEDGE CASE A 13010114 EA. $9.22 No bid
5 7' 2-1/8 " HW WEDGE CASE A 1301017 EA. $4.61 No bid
ASH MOLDING

6 1X1%"-8 ASH RAIL 161128 EA. $6.99 No bid
7 1 X 2-8" ASH RAIL 1628 EA $7.99 No bid
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8 1"X 2% "-8" ASH RAIL 162128 EA. $8.99 No bid
9 1 X 3-8 ASH RAIL 1638 EA. $10.49 No bid
10 1X4-8" ASH RAIL 1648 EA. $10.99 No bid
11 1 X 6-8' ASH RAIL 1668 EA. $26.99 No bid
12 1 X 8-8 ASH RAIL 1688 EA. $34.99 No bid
13 1X1%-8 OAK RAIL 151128 EA. $10.99 No bid
14 1X2-80AKRAIL 1528 EA $11.99 No bid
15 1X 2% -8 OAK RAIL 152128 EA. $12.99 No bid
16 1X 3-8 OAK RAIL 1538 EA. $13.99 No bid
17 1X 4 -8 OAK RAIL 1548 EA $14.99 No bid
18 1X6 -8 OAK RAIL 1568 EA. $26.99 No bid
19 1 X8 -8 OAK RAIL 1588 EA. $34.99 No bid
20 ASH CROWN 4 %" X 8' 5544310803 EA. $17.99 No bid
21 ASH CROWN 2 7/8" X 8' 5544310804 EA. $9.99 No bid
22 ASH CROWN 15/8" X 8' 5544310805 EA. $5.69 No bid
23 ASHPM6 %" X 8 5544310806 EA. $5.99 No bid
24 ASHFLUTED 5%" X8 5544310813 EA. N/A No bid
25 ASHFLUTED 3%" X8 5544310814 EA. $11.25 No bid
26 ASHLIP 15/8" X 8 5544310815 EA. $6.99 No bid
27 ASHLIP 1%" X8 5544310816 EA. $5.95 No bid
28 ASH 8' DOOR STOP 5544310817 EA. $4.59 No bid
29 ASH O/CORNER %" X 8' 5544310818 EA. $5.59 No bid
30 ASH CORE %" X &' 5544310820 EA. $5.59 No bid
31 ASHRAIL 2" X 8 5544310821 EA. N/A No bid
32 ASHRAIL 2%" X 8 5544310822 EA. N/A No bid
33 ASHRAIL 3" X 8 5544310823 EA. N/A No bid
34 ASHPM 7 X8 5544310827 EA. $7.99 No bid
35 ASH O/CORNER 1" X 8' % 5544310828 EA. $7.59 No bid
36 ASHBASE 3% " X 8 5544310833 EA. $9.99 No bid
37 ASHBASE 2% " X 8 5544310836 EA. $6.59 No bid
38 ASHRAIL 1%" X 8 5544310838 EA. N/A No bid
39 TM 407" 2% ASH COL CASE 5544310840 EA. $5.99 No bid
40 ASHPM 1X#8 5544310842 EA. $6.95 No bid
41 8 X% ASH SCREEN 45" MOULDING $5544310844 EA. $4.95 No bid
42 ASH CH/RAIL 5% " X 8 5544310846 EA. $19.99 No bid
43 ASH 8 X % QT RND MOULDING 5544310858 EA. $5.95 No bid
44 ASH CH/MOULD 3% " X 8' 5544310870 EA. $12.75 No bid
45 41/8 X8 ASH DENTIL CROWN 5544310871 EA. $23.99 No bid
46 41/8 X8 ASH ROPE CROWN MOULDING 5544310872 EA. $27.99 No bid
a7 ¥ X 8 ASH ROPE MOULDING 5544310873 EA. $11.99 No bid
48 ¥ X 8'ASH DENTIL MOULDING $5544310874 EA. $8.99 No bid
49 4 1/8 X 8 ASH CROWN 5544310875 EA. $15.99 No bid
50 3% X8 ASH ROPE CROWN MOULDING 5544310877 EA. $21.99 No bid
0.) STAIN/GLOSS

1 GAL. CHERRY 116 7994111613 EA. $28.99 No bid
2 GAL. DK. MAHOGANY 118 7994111813 EA. $28.99 No bid
3 GAL. SALEM MAPLE 110 7994110913 EA. $28.99 No bid
4 1GL COLONIAL PINE STAIN 7994120413 EA. $37.99 No bid
5 QUICK DRY ZAR GAL. 20413 7994111513 EA. $28.99 No bid
6 GAL. MODERN WALNUT 115 7994111113 EA. $28.99 No bid
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7 GAL. WALNUT 111 7994111313 EA. $28.99 No bid
8 GAL. FRUITWOOD 113 79941111313 EA. $28.99 No bid
9 OIL-BASED WOOD 114 PROV 1GAL 7994111413 EA. $28.99 No bid
10 GAL. MODERN WALNUT 115 7994111513 EA. $28.99 No bid
11 HONEY MAPLE 1GL 7994111713 EA. $28.99 No bid
12 GAL MOCHA WOOD STAIN 11913 7994111913 EA. $29.99 No bid
13 GAL TEAK NATURAL 120 7994112013 EA. $28.99 No bid
14 WOOD STAIN 123 MOORISH TEAK 7994112313 EA. $28.99 No bid
15 WOOD STAIN 124 ROSEWOOD 7994112413 EA. $28.99 No bid
16 WOOD STAIN EARLY AMERICAN 7994112813 EA. $28.99 No bid
17 WOOD STAIN AGED VARNISH 7994112913 EA. $28.99 No bid
18 1 GL WOOD STAIN DRIFTWOOD 7994113013 EA. $28.99 No bid
19 WHITE OAK 1GL 7994113713 EA. $28.99 No bid
20 GAL. SPANISH OAK 138 7994113813 EA. $28.99 No bid
21 GAL. COUNTRY WHITE 13913 7994113913 EA. $28.99 No bid
22 GAL MERLOT WOOD STAIN 14013 7994114013 EA. $28.99 No bid
23 GAL BLACK ONYX BLACK 12113 7994112113 EA. $29.99 No bid
24 GAL ZAR ULTRA MAX OMU GLOSS 7994136013 EA. $46.99 No bid
25 ZAR ULTRA MAX SATIN GL. 36213 7994136213 EA. $46.99 No bid
26 ULTRA SEMI-GLOSS ZAR 33013 7994133013 EA. $35.99 No bid
27 ULTRA CLEAR GLOSS (1GAL) 32813 7994132813 EA. $37.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR CLEAR BASE ALKYD .
28 GLOSS (DP58157) 2236727656 EA. $26.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR WHITE ALKYD GLOSS .
29 (DP58101) 1 GAL. 2236721201 EA. $26.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR BLACK ALKYD GLOSS .
30 (DP58103) 1 GAL. 2236721204 EA. $26.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR SAFETY RED ALKYD .
31 GLOSS (DP58106) 1 GAL. 2236721206 EA. $54.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR HIGH HIDE BASE ALKYD .
32 GLOSS (DP58149) 2236722007 EA. $26.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR DEEP BASE ALKYD .
33 GLOSS DP58153) 1 GAL. 2236722013 EA. $26.99 No bid
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR ULTRA DEEP BASE .
34 ALKYD GLOSS (DP58155) 2236722016 EA. $26.99 No bid
35 ZAR WOOD PATCH OAK PT 31041 7994131041 EA. $2.99 No bid
36 ZAR WOOD PATCH %2 PT 30906 7994121041 EA. $4.59 No bid
37 ZAR WOOD PATCH 1 PT. 30911 7994130911 EA. $5.99 No bid
38 QT ZAR NEUTRAL WOOD PATCH 30912 7994130912 EA. $9.99 No bid
39 QT. RED OAK WOOD PATCH 31012 7994131012 EA. $9.99 No bid
P) PAINT/PRIMER
1 IlN(;I'AEfIOR/EXTERIOR - WHITE BASE (DR23649) 2236751309 EA $20.99 No bid
2 LN(;I'AEEIOR/EXTERIOR - WHITE BASE (DR23649) 2236751311 EA $99.99 No bid
3 BAR-OX SHOP & FIELD ALKYD METAL PRIMER .
RED OXI DP27118) 2236721187 EA. $26.99 No bid
4 PRIMER DRYWALL- (DRN54301) 5 GAL 2236759222 EA. $45.99 No bid
5 PRIMER KILZ 2 LATEX 5GL 516520000 EA. $89.99 No bid
6 PRIMER KILZ 2 LATEX GL 516520001 EA. $17.99 No bid
Q) PAINT THINNER /REMOVER
1 PAINT THINNER IN PLASTIC CAN 3019294400 EA. $9.99 No bid
2 QT SEMI-PASTE PAINT REMOVER 3019200315 EA. $9.99 No bid
3 GAL SEMI-PASTE PAINT REMOVER 3019200325 EA. $26.99 No bid
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4 | QT CREAMY PAINT STRIPPER 3019200615 EA. $5.99 No bid
5 | GAL CREAMY PAINT STRIPPER 3019200625 EA. $16.99 No bid
6 | QT ACETONE THINNER 3019201815 EA. $3.49 No bid
7 | GAL ACETONE THINNER 3019201825 EA. $15.99 No bid
8 | XYLOL SOLVENT/TOLUENE SUB QT 3019202415 EA. $4.99 No bid
9 | GAL XYLOL SOLVENT/TOLUENE SUB 3019202425 EA. $12.99 No bid
10 | DENATURED ALCOHOL THINNER 3019202615 EA. $3.99 No bid
11 | DENATURED ALCOHOL THINNER 3019202625 EA. $7.99 No bid
12 | QT VMP NAPHTHA THINNER 3019204615 EA. $5.99 No bid
13 | GAL VMP NAPHTHA THINNER 3019204625 EA. $11.99 No bid
14 | QT GUM TURPENTINE 3019206915 EA. $7.79 No bid
15 | GUM TURPENTINE GAL 3019206925 EA. $27.99 No bid
16 | QUART MEK THINNER 3019207115 EA. $7.39 No bid
17 | 18 oz INT/EXT PAINT STRIPPER 3019207299 EA. $5.49 No bid
18 | SEMI-PASTE ADHESIVE REMOVER 3019207825 EA. $22.99 No bid
19 | 180Z. GRAFFITI REMOVER EGA166 3019216698 EA. $7.99 No bid
20 | GRAFITTI REMOVER CAN 3019216699 EA. $7.99 No bid
21 | QT LACQUER THINNER 3019217015 EA. $4.99 No bid
22 | GAL LACQUER THINNER 3019217025 EA. $13.99 No bid
23 | QT SPRAYABLE PAINT REMOVER 3019222115 EA. $8.99 No bid
24 | GAL PAINT REMOVER SPRAY 3019222125 EA. $26.99 No bid
25 | PHOSPHORIC PREP & ETCH GALLON 3019230220 EA. $16.99 No bid
26 | MINERAL SPIRITS QUART ODORLESS 3019294005 EA. $5.49 No bid
27 | MINERAL SPIRITS ODORLESS 3019294006 EA. $16.99 No bid
R.) PAINT BRUSHES & ACCESSORIES
1 RC142 %" NAP 77089114212 EA. $2.09 No bid
2 RC143 3/8" NAP 7708914312 EA. $1.99 No bid
3 RC144 %" NAP 7708914412 EA. $2.59 No bid
4 RC145 %" NAP 7708914512 EA. $2.59 No bid
5 RC146 1" NAP 7708914612 EA. $2.09 No bid
6 RC147 1% " NAP 7708914712 EA. $2.59 No bid
7 %" CHIP BRUSH WHITE BRISTLE 7708915000 EA. $0.39 No bid
8 1" CHIP BRUSH WHITE BRISTLE 7708915001 EA. $0.49 No bid
9 1.5 CHIP BRUSH WHITE CHINA 7708915002 EA. $0.59 No bid
10 2" CHIP BRUSH WHITE CHINA 7708915003 EA. $0.79 No bid
11 2.5 CHIP BRUSH WHITE CHINA 7708915004 EA. $0.89 No bid
12 3" CHIP BRUSH WHITE CHINA 7708915005 EA. $0.99 No bid
13 4" CHIP PAINT BRUSH 7708915007 EA. $2.69 No bid
14 3" POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708911600 EA. $5.99 No bid
15 1-% POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708911602 EA. $3.99 No bid
16 2" POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708911603 EA. $3.99 No bid
17 2-% " ALL PAINTS BRUSH 7708911604 EA. $4.99 No bid
18 4" POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708911607 EA. $7.99 No bid
19 1-% 2160 POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708911602 EA. $3.99 No bid
20 2" 2160 POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708921603 EA. $3.99 No bid
21 2-12" 2160 POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708921604 EA. $4.99 No bid
22 3in SASH BRUSH ANGULAR 7708921605 EA. $5.99 No bid
23 1" 2163 POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708921631 EA. $2.99 No bid
24 2" 2168 POLY BLEND BRUSH 7708921683 EA. $3.99 No bid
25 3" 3/16 WAP ROLLER 7708910005 EA. $1.29 No bid
26 11" MINI ROLLER 7708910011 EA. $1.19 No bid
27 RC100 3/16" NAP ROLLER 7708910012 EA. $2.99 No bid
28 MR100 4" FABRIC 2PK REFILL 7708910024 EA. $3.99 No bid
29 6" TWIN PACK FABRIC 7708910026 EA. $3.49 No bid
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30 SHOE HANDLE WIRE BRUSH 300 7708930000 EA. $1.29 No bid
31 300SC CP WIRE BRUSH 7708930001 EA. $1.99 No bid
32 3" MINI ROLLER & TRAY SET RS300 7708930002 EA. $3.99 No bid
33 MR300 4" FABRIC REFILL 7708930004 EA. $2.99 No bid
34 3" TRIM ROLLER W/FRAME 7708930005 EA. $1.99 No bid
35 4" 2PACK PAINT ROLLER COVER MR300-2 7708930024 EA. $2.29 No bid
36 6" 2PACK PAINT ROLLER COVER (WHITE) 7708930029 EA. $4.89 No bid
MR300-2
S) ADHESIVES
1 GAL MURIATIC ACID 1792600001 EA. $4.99 No bid
2 CARP. WOOD GLUE 4fl. oz 2600000700 EA. $1.99 No bid
3 CARP. WOOD GLUE 8fl. oz 2600000701 EA. $2.99 No bid
4 CARP. WOOD GLUE 16fl. oz 2600000702 EA. $4.59 No bid
5 CARP. WOOD GLUE qt. 2600000704 EA. $6.99 No bid
6 CARP. WOOD GLUE GAL. 2600000705 EA. $17.99 No bid
7 CONCRETE BONDER qt. BOTTLE 2600000862 EA. $7.99 No bid
PROJECTS CONSTRUCTION ADHESIVE 100z .
8 (LIQUID NAILS) 2207860172 EA. $1.99 No bid
9 10.50z PAN MOL ADHESIVE 2207891072 EA. $2.99 No bid
10 HEAVY DUTY ADHESIVE 100z (LIQUID NAILYS) 2207819072 EA. $2.49 No bid
11 WHITE 100% SILICONE 0816 7533900816 EA. $3.99 No bid
12 CAULKING GUN, 1/10 RATCHET 7667060111 EA. $2.49 No bid
13 SERIES 6000 1/10 SMOOTH CAULKING GUN 7708960000 EA. $2.49 No bid
SERIES 6004P 1/10 SMOOTH ROTATING BARREL .
14 CAULKING GUN 7708960041 EA. $5.99 No bid
15 10.10z GP WHITE ACRYLIC CAULK 0736 7533900736 EA. $0.99 No bid
16 5GL GALV. BUCKET GRID 7708941612 EA. $1.99 No bid
17 ODORLESS CONTACT CEMENT (LIFETIME) ORDERLESS 1 GAL $79.99 No bid
18 500 CONTACT CEMENT 2466709412 1 GAL $34.99 No bid
T) SANDPAPER
1 WET OR DRY TRI-M-ITE 5114402000 EA. $0.69 No bid
2 3M GARNET PAPER COAT 220A 5114410002 EA. $0.39 No bid
3 WET OR DRY TRI-M-ITE 5114402002 EA. $0.69 No bid
4 9" X 11" SHEET GARNET PAPER 180A 5114410003 EA. $0.39 No bid
5 WET OR DRY TRI-M-ITE A&C 5114402004 EA. $0.69 No bid
6 110N SANDPAPER 5114410004 EA. $0.39 No bid
7 WET & DRY SANDPAPER 5114402007 EA. $0.69 No bid
8 3M GARNET PAPER 9 X 11 120C 5114410031 EA. $0.59 No bid
9 9 X 11" SHEET WET OR DRY 5114402014 EA. $0.89 No bid
10 3M GARNET PAPER OPEN COAT 100C 5114410032 EA. $0.49 No bid
11 GARNET PAPER 9 X 11 80D 5114410033 EA. $0.69 No bid
12 3M GARNET PAPER OPEN COAT 50C 5114410035 EA. $0.59 No bid
U) SHEETROCK & ACCESSORIES
SHEETROCK
1 4 X 8% " SHEETROCK 7512 EA. $7.29 No bid
2 4 X 8% " MOIST RESISTANT SHEETROCK 75121 EA. $9.99 No bid
3 4 X 8% " IMPORT SHEETROCK 7512M EA. $7.19 No bid
4 4 X 8Y," SHEETROCK 7514 EA. $8.79 No bid
5 4 X 8 3/8" SHEETROCK 7538 EA. $8.19 No bid
6 4 X 8 5/8" FIRE CODE SHEETROCK 7558 EA. $10.29 No bid
ACCESSORIES
7 48LB/BOX JOINT COMPOUND/READY MIX 7540 EA. $7.99 No bid
MURCO M-700 3 % GAL/BOX READY MIX/ .
8 JOINT COMPOUND 7541M EA. $7.09 No bid
3.5 GAL/BOX LIGHTWEIGHT JOINT .
9 COMPOUND/READY MIX 7541 EA. $7.99 No bid
10 GAL LIGHT SPACKLING COMPOUND 7533900541 EA. $13.99 No bid
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11 % PINT ONE TIME SPACKLING 7533900542 EA. $2.99 No bid
12 | 1 QUART ONE TIME SPACKLING 7533900544 EA. $5.99 No bid
13 | 1 PINT ONE TIME SPACKLING 7533900548 EA. $3.59 No bid
14 | PLAST DRYWALL POLE SANDER 4107200011 EA. $6.49 No bid
15 | SPRAY TEXTURE 200Z. 4107204055 EA. $11.99 No bid
16 | 200Z. SPRAY KNOCKDOWN 4107204065 EA. $11.99 No bid
17 | 160z. CAN ACOUSTIC TEXTURE 4107204070 EA. $8.99 No bid
18 | #4092 WATER BASE SPR/TEXT 10 oz 4107204092 EA. $13.99 No bid
19 | POPCORN CEILING TEXTURE 140z 4107204099 EA. $10.99 No bid
20 [ HOMAX WALL TEXTURE OIL BASED 250z 4107204555 EA. $17.99 No bid
21 | HOMAX WALL TEXTURE WATER BASED 250z 4107204592 EA. $17.99 No bid
22 | TRIPLE EXP FOAM 120z. 7533900909 EA. $4.99 No bid
23 | STANDARD PLASTIC DROP SHEET 9' X 12' 7708900500 EA. $0.99 No bid

COMMERCIAL DOOR HANDLES (CLOSET, .
24 HALL, ENTRY, ADA), 4969444269 EA. $59.99 No bid
V.) LAMINATIING COUNTER TOP (Formica)
$2.18 sq.ft $2.35 sq.ft

1. 4 X 8 ANTIQUE ROCA MAMINATE SHEET 48SFAR EA. (32 50.t) $75.20 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.35 sq.ft/

2. 4 X8 BLACK MATTE LAMINATE SHEET 48SFB EA. (32saft) $75.20 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.75s sq.ft/

3. 4 X 8 BLACKSTAR GRANITE LAMINATE SHEET 48SFBG EA. (32saft) $88.00 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.75sq.ft/

4. 4 X 8 BRONZED FUSION LAMINATE SHEET 48SFBRF EA. @G2saft) $88.00 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.35 sq.ft

5. 4 X8 MILANO BROWN LAMINATE SHEET 48SFMB EA. (32saft) $75.20 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. (32 $2.35 sq.ft

6. 4 X8 MILANO BLAZE LAMINATE SHEET 48SFMBL EA. sqft) $75.20 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. (32 $2.75sq.ft

7. 4 X8 MADURA GARNET LAMINATE SHEET 48SFMG EA. i $88.00 sht

$2.18 sq.ft $2.75sq.ft

8. 4 X 8 MADURA PEARL LAMINATE SHEET 48SFMP EA. (32 saft) $88.00 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.75sq.ft

9. 4 X 8 TRUSS MAPLE LAMINATE SHEET 48SFTM EA. @G2saft) $88.00 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.35 sq.ft

10. 4 X 8 TUMBLED ROCA LAMINATE SHEET 48SFTR EA. (32saft) $75.20 sht

$2.18 sq.ft $2.35 sq.ft

11. 4 X 8 FROSTY WHITE LAMINATE SHEET 48SFW EA. (32 sa.t) $75.20 sht

$2.18 sq.ft. $2.35 sq.ft

12. 4 X 8 WILD CHERRY LAMINATE SHEET 48SFWL EA. (32saft) $75.20 sht

W.) CEILINGTILE

1. 2 X 2’ (65 sq. ft) 120949 PER BX $41.99 $53.00

2. 2 X 4’ (64 sq. ft) 120942 PER BX $46.99 $57.00

3. 12 * WALL ANGLE 34” 12054 EA $6.59 No Bid

X.) ROOFING MATERIALS

GACODECK or equivalent

1. GACODECK KIT-OYSTER W/FILLER 8505518733 3.5 GAL. $342.99 No Bid

2. GACODECK KIT-PEWTER W/FILLER 8505518876 3.5 GAL $342.99 No Bid

3. GACODECK KIT-SHALE W/FILLER 8505519019 3.5 GAL $342.99 No Bid

4. GACODECK KIT-ADOBE W/FILLER 8505519162 3.5 GAL $342.99 No Bid

5. GACODECK KIT-SEDONA W/FILLER 8505519200 3.5 GAL $342.99 No Bid

6. GACODECK KIT-DESERT W/FILLER 8505519305 35GAL $342.99 No Bid

7. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-OYSTER 8505519611 GALLON $97.99 No Bid

8. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-OYSTER 8505519621 | 5GALLON $394.99 No Bid

9. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-PEWTER 8505519631 GALLON $97.99 No Bid

10. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-PEWTER 8505519641 | 5GALLON $394.99 No Bid

11. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-SHALE 8505519651 GALLON $97.99 No Bid

12. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-SHALE 8505519661 | 5 GALLON $394.99 No Bid

13. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-ADOBE 8505519671 GALLON $97.99 No Bid

14. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-ADOBE 8505519677 | 5 GALLON $394.99 No Bid
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15. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-SEDONA 8505519681 GALLON $97.99 No Bid
16. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-SEDONA 8505519688 | 5 GALLON $394.99 No Bid
17. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-DESERT 8505519691 GALLON $97.99 No Bid
18. GACODECK KIT TOP COAT-DESERT 8505519697 | 5 GALLON $394.99 No Bid
19. GACODECK PRIMER 8505519723 GALLON $51.90 No Bid
20. GACOGRIP TEXTURE GRANULES 8505518664 16 OZ. $8.99 No Bid
21. GACOGRIP TEXTURE GRANULES 8505514729 50 LBS. $52.99 No Bid
22. GACODECK TAPE 8505515444 | 47X120"ROLL $18.99 No Bid
23. GACODECK FILL 8505515481 100z $9.99 No Bid
GACOROOF or equivalent

24. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-WHITE 8505566926 GALLON $62.99 No Bid
25. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-WHITE 8505566928 | 5 GALLON $265.99 No Bid
26. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-GRAY 8505566946 GALLON $62.99 No Bid
27. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-GRAY 8505566950 | 5 GALLON $265.99 No Bid
28. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-GREEN 8505566956 | 5 GALLON $278.99 No Bid
29. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-LIGHT TAN 8505566964 | 5 GALLON $278.99 No Bid
30. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-RUSTIC 8505566966 | 5 GALLON $289.99 No Bid
31 (BSfSEOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-MEDIUM 8505566968 | 5 GALLON $289.99 No Bid
32. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-BLACK 8505566976 | 5 GALLON $289.99 No Bid
33. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-BROWN 8505566978 | 5 GALLON $289.99 No Bid
34. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-RED 8505566980 | 5 GALLON $289.99 No Bid
35. LIQUID ROOF TAPE 8505566970 GALLON $74.99 No Bid
36. LIQUID ROOF TAPE 8505566974 | 5 GALLON $318.99 No Bid
37. GACOROOF TEST KIT-40Z. 8505566924 | 4 0Z.CAN $22.99 No Bid
38. GACOROOF COLORANT-BLACK 8505531800 PINT-8 OZ $14.99 No Bid
39. GACOROOF COLORANT-MOJAVE 8505531815 | PINT-16 OZ $21.99 No Bid
40. GACOROOF TAPE (SELF-ADHESIVE) 8505566934 2"X 50 $21.99 No Bid
COMPLIANT

41, GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-WHITE 8505566926 GALLON $62.99 No Bid
42. GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-WHITE 8505566928 | 5 GALLON $265.99 No Bid
43, GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-GRAY 8505566946 GALLON $62.99 No Bid
44, GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-GRAY 8505566950 | 5 GALLON $265.99 No Bid
45, GACOROOF SILICONE ROOF CTG-GREEN 8505566956 | 5 GALLON $278.99 No Bid
46. SILICONE SOLVENT VOC COMPLIANT 8505585412 | 5 GALLON $315.99 No Bid
S20 SERIES or equivalent

47. 2-PART EPOXY PRIMER/FILLER KIT 8505585207 2 gallon kit $133.99 No Bid
48. 2-PART EPOXY PRIMER/FILLER KIT PART A 8505585202 5 gallon $204.99 No Bid
49, 2-PART EPOXY PRIMER/FILLER KIT PART B 8505585105 5gallon $204.99 No Bid
50, wﬁtEWEYSOLVENT—FREE SILICONE 8505585111 5 gallon $438.99 No Bid
51. WALKPAD GRANULES 8505585310 1.5 Ib Jar $14.99 No Bid
52. SILICONE SOLVENT 8505585407 gallon $28.99 No Bid
53. SILICONE SOLVENT 8505585409 5gallon $438.99 No Bid
54, GACOWASH CONCENTRATED CLEANER 8505585421 quart $29.99 No Bid
55. GACOWASH CONCENTRATED CLEANER 8505585425 gallon $80.99 No Bid
56. GACOWASH CONCENTRATED CLEANER 8505585428 5gallon $367.99 No Bid
57. 66S REINFORCING POLYESTER MESH 4”X300’ 8505585301 | 4”x300’ roll $31.99 No Bid
58. 66S REINFORCING POLYESTER MESH 67X300’ 8505585303 | 6”x300’ roll $43.99 No Bid
50, \(/:V(|)_|AI:'||—'I|E[;|SGOLVENT-FREE 100% SILICONE 8505585102 5 gallon $286.99 No Bid
60, \(/:V(|)_|AI:'||—'I|E[;|SGOLVENT-FREE 100% SILICONE 8505585103 55 gallon $2.791.99 No Bid
61, ggﬁ_l\fl-NS((;)LVENT-FREE 100% SILICONE 8505585105 5 gallon $286.99 No Bid
62. ggﬁ_l\fl' ng LVENT-FREE 100% SILICONE 8505585106 | 55 gallon $2,791.99 No Bid
63. TAN-SOLVENT-FREE 100% SILICONE COATING | 8505585104 5 gallon $300.99 No Bid
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64. TAN-SOLVENT-FREE 100% SILICONE COATING | 8505585110 55 gallon $2,839.99 No Bid

SEAMSEAL SOLVENT-FREE SILICONE No Bid
65. SEALANT 8505585107 gallon $87.99

SEAMSEAL SOLVENT-FREE SILICONE No Bid
66. SEALANT 8505585108 5 gallon $380.99

GACOFLASH FOAM 3 LB SPRAYED . No Bid
67 | POLYURETHANE FOAM 8505590103 | 41 lb. kit $432.99
GACOFLEX COMMERCIAL or equivalent
68. GACOCRETE Al71 gallon $108.99 No Bid
69. GACOCRETE Al175 5 gallon $335.99 No Bid
70. WATERBASED WHITE ACRYLIC A39005 5 gallon $305.99 No Bid
71. WATERBASED WHITE ACRYLIC A390055 55 gal drum $2,255.99 No Bid
72. WATERBASED GRAY ACRYLIC A39115 5 gallon $299.99 No Bid
73. WATERBASED GRAY ACRYLIC A391155 55 gal drum $2,201.99 No Bid

OYSTER ACRYLIC COATING (VOC No Bid
74. COMPLIANT) GCA38011 gallon $111.99

OYSTER ACRYLIC COATING (VOC No Bid
75. COMPLIANT) A38015 5 gallon $355.99

PEWTER ACRYLIC COATING (vVOC No Bid
76. COMPLIANT) A38021 gallon $111.99

PEWTER ACRYLIC COATING (vVOC No Bid
7. COMPLIANT) A38025 5 gallon $355.99
78. SHALE ACRYLIC COATING (VOC COMPLIANT) A38161 gallon $111.99 No Bid
79. SHALE ACRYLIC COATING (VOC COMPLIANT) A38165 5 gallon $355.99 No Bid
80. ADOBE ACRYLIC COATING (VOC COMPLIANT) A38181 gallon $111.99 No Bid
81. ADOBE ACRYLIC COATING (VOC COMPLIANT) A38185 5 gallon $355.99 No Bid
82. BLACK ACRYLIC PRIME A41215 5 gallon $245.99 No Bid
83. | BLACK ACRYLIC PRIME A412155 52?3210” $1,595.99 No Bid
84. 100% SOLIDS 2-PART EPOXY PRIMER PT A E5990AK1A gallon $110.99 No Bid
85. 100% SOLIDS 2-PART EPOXY PRIMER PT B E5990AK1B quart $89.99 No Bid

URETHANE W/PFG MEMBRANE KIT A+B .
86. HORIZONTAL LMBOHK1A 5 gallon $82.99 No Bid

URETHANE W/PFG MEMBRANE KIT A+B .
87. HORIZONTAL LMBOHKA4A gallon $184.99 No Bid

URETHANE W/PFG MEMBRANE KIT A+B .
88. VERTICAL LMB0VK1A 5 gallon $84.99 No Bid

URETHANE W/PFG MEMBRANE KIT A+B .
89. VERTICAL LMBOVKAA gallon $225.99 No Bid
90. URETHANE MEMBRANE PT B-8 OZ JAR LM60B80OZ 8 OZ JAR $23.99 No Bid
91. URETHANE MEMBRANE PT B-QUART CAN LM60BQ QT $38.99 No Bid
92. ALUM NEOPRENE COATING N1730K5A 5 gallon $810.99 No Bid
93. THINNER & CLEANER T51121 gallon $54.99 No Bid
94. THINNER & CLEANER T51125 5 gallon $165.99 No Bid
95. URETHANE COATING THINNER T51161 gallon $58.99 No Bid
96. URETHANE COATING THINNER T5165 5 gallon $185.99 No Bid
97. URETHANE COATING TROWEL THINNER T51181 gallon $67.99 No Bid
98. URETHANE COATING TROWEL THINNER T51185 5 gallon $230.99 No Bid

URETHANE COATING ACCELERATOR (FOR 10 . No Bid
99. GAL BATCH) U565140Z 4 oz jar $49.99
100. | URETHANE PRIMER-SEALER uUs56771 gallon $128.99 No Bid
101. | URETHANE PRIMER-SEALER U56775 5 gallon $440.99 No Bid
102. | PEWTER URETHANE CTG POLY SIDE U6402P1 gallon $127.99 No Bid
103. | PEWTER URETHANE CTG POLY SIDE U6402P5 5 gallon $435.99 No Bid
104. | OYSTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6601P1 gallon $152.99 No Bid
105. | OYSTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6601P5 5 gallon $560.99 No Bid
106. | OYSTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6601P5 gallon $224..99 No Bid
107. | OYSTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6601PC1 5 gallon $920.99 No Bid
108. | PEWTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6601PC5 gallon $152.99 No Bid
109. | PEWTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6602P1 5 gallon $560.99 No Bid
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110. | SHALE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6616P1 gallon $152.99 No Bid
111. | SHALE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6616P5 5 gallon $560.99 No Bid
112. | ADOBE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6618P1 gallon $152.99 No Bid
113. | ADOBE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE U6618PC1 5 gallon $224.99 No Bid
114. | URETHANE COATING ISO SIDE ue6l1C gallon $152.99 No Bid
115. | URETHANE COATING ISO SIDE u66I5 5 gallon $560.99 No Bid
116. | URETHANE ALIPHATIC-POLY UA7090P1 gallon $238.99 No Bid
117. | URETHANE ALIPHATIC-POLY UA7090P5 5 gallon $990.99 No Bid
118. | URETHANE ALIPHATIC-ISO UA709011 gallon $184.99 No Bid
119. | URETHANE ALIPHATIC-ISO UAT709015 5 gallon $720.99 No Bid
120. | REGULAR URE BASE CTG POLY SIDE UB6407P1 gallon $111.99 No Bid
121. | REGULAR URE BASE CTG POLY SIDE UB6407PS 5 gallon $355.99 No Bid
122. | URE BASE CTG ISO SIDE UB64I gallon $124.99 No Bid
123. | URE BASE CTG ISO SIDE UB6415 5 gallon $420.99 No Bid
124. | SHELFIL GRANULES 18/40-50 LB BAG BG1840 bag $52.99 No Bid
125. | SHELFIL GRANULES 12/20-50 LB BAG BG1220 bag $52.99 No Bid
126. | SHELFIL GRANULES 40/60-50 LB BAG BG4060 bag $52.99 No Bid
127. | POLYESTER SPUNBOUNDED TAPE 47X300’ BT66B4 roll $19.99 No Bid
128. | POLYESTER SPUNBOUNDED TAPE 67X300’ BT66B6 roll $26.99 No Bid
129. | POLYESTER MAT 36”X 360’ BT66B36360 roll $170.99 No Bid
130. | 1/4 “ SCRIM MESH 48” X 100’ BMESH roll $229.99 No Bid
COMPLIANT
PEWTER URETHANE CTG POLY SIDE VOC .
131. COMPLIANT U6402PC1 gallon $164.99 No Bid
PEWTER URETHANE CTG POLY SIDE VOC .
132. COMPLIANT U6402PC5 5 gallon $620.99 No Bid
133. | URETHANE CTG ISO SIDE VOC COMPLIANT u64l-1 gallon $145.99 No Bid
134. | URETHANE CTG ISO SIDE VOC COMPLIANT U64IC5 5 gallon $525.99 No Bid
OYSTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE VOC .
135. COMPLIANT U6601P1 gallon $152.99 No Bid
OYSTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE VOC .
136. COMPLIANT U6601PC5 5 gallon $920.99 No Bid
PEWTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE VOC .
137. COMPLIANT U6602PC1 gallon $224.99 No Bid
PEWTER AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE VOC .
138. COMPLIANT U6602PC5 5 gallon $920.99 No Bid
SHALE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE VOC .
139. COMPLIANT U6616PC1 gallon $224.99 No Bid
SHALE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE vVOC .
140. COMPLIANT U6616PC5 5 gallon $920.99 No Bid
ADOBE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE vVOC .
141. COMPLIANT U661815 gallon $151.99 No Bid
ADOBE AROMATIC URE POLY SIDE vVOC .
142. COMPLIANT U6618CI5 5 gallon $920.99 No Bid
URETHANE COATING ISO SIDE VOC .
143. COMPLIANT uU66CI1 gallon $151.99 No Bid
URETHANE COATING ISO SIDE VOC .
144, COMPLIANT uU66IC5 5 gallon $555.99 No Bid
REGULAR URE BASE CTG POLY SIDE vVOC .
145. COMPLIANT UB64070C1 gallon $145.99 No Bid
REGULAR URE BASE CTG POLY SIDE vVOC .
146. COMPLIANT UB6407PC5 5 gallon $525.99 No Bid
147. | URE BASE CTG ISO SIDE VOC COMPLIANT UB64CI1 gallon $145.99 No Bid
148. | URE BASE CTG ISO SIDE VOC COMPLIANT UB64IC5 5 gallon $525.99 No Bid
149. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 6”X100’ NF62106 roll $334.99 No Bid
150. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 9”X100’ NF62109 roll $477.99 No Bid
151. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 12”X100’ NF62112 roll $685.99 No Bid
152. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 18”X100’ NF62118 roll $799.99 No Bid
153. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 24”X100’ NF62124 roll $885.99 No Bid
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154. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 307X100’ NF62130 roll $1,149.99 No Bid
155. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 36”X100° NF62136 roll $1,295.99 No Bid
156. | BLK UNCURED NEOPRENE SHEET 48”X100’ NF62148 roll $1,699.99 No Bid
157. | NEOPRENE ADHSV VOC COMPLIANT N12071 gallon $165.99 No Bid
158. | NEOPRENE ADHSV VOC COMPLIANT N12075 5 gallon $625.99 No Bid
Hidalgo County will receive % off the 20 %

. . . . . 0
price list for any special orders item not in
stock.
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