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g % New Administration Building
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MEMORANDUM

Department’s Recommendation
1

TO Hon. AC Cuellar, Jr., Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct #1

ATTN: Raul Lozano/Katia Garcia
A
FROM: Sandy Suarez, Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: August 17,2015

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2015-210-08-12— SGS - HIDALGO COUNTY

“Purchase of Sand and Bc(ldinE Material sou an as needed basis !”

We have reccived TWO (2) bid responses in reference with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a
copy of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Mecting; therefore, we need
your response no later than FRIDAY, August 21, 2015 @ 1:00 p.m, to be able to present to Commissioner’s Court
as soon as possible, Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply
to the Purchasing Department via fax to (956)-292-7612 or via email to: sandy.suarez@co,hidalgo.tx.us,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter,
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Please include the budget account number(s) for the above reference project.
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2812 S, Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Ldinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2620/ F'ax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

(Department’s Recommendation)

TO Hon, Eduardo “Eddie” Cantu, Conmmissioner
Hidalgo County Precinet # 2

ATTN:  Armando Pompa/ Yolanda Cisneros

i

i
FROM: Sandy Suaraé, Buyer [l
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATIE:  August 17, 2015
RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-210-08-12-5SGS - HIDALGO COUNTY
“Prrchase of Sand and Bedding Material (on an as needed basis

We have received Two (2) bid responses in reference with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a
copy of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid responses for your review and recommendation,

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
your response no later than Friday, Angust 21, 2015 @ 1:00 p.n, to be able to present to Commissioner’s Court ag
goon as possible, Please indicate your recommendation or any congerns on the space provided below and reply to
the Purchasing Department via fax (o (956)-292-7612 or via email to: sundy.sunrezgoco.hidalgo.ix.us,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do nol hesilate to call me al 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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AWARD TO VENDOR(S): RECOMMENDATION (BASIS)
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Please include the budget account number(s) for the above reference project.
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Hidalgo Countfy Purchasing Department
2812 8. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Edinbwrg, Texns 78539
(956) 318-2626/ ¥ax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

{Department’s Recommendalion)

Fa: Hon. Joe Flores, Commissloner
Hidalgo County Precinet # 3

ATTN: Norma Ceirallm

FROM: Sandy Suare;f, Buyer [I
Hidalge Counly Purchasing Department

DATT:  August 17,2015
RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No, 2015-210-08-12-8GS - HIDALGO COUNTY

W have reccived TWO (2) bids in reference with the above mentiongd projecl. Enclesed you will find a copy of
the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.
We would like to present yowr recomumnendution on the next Conmmissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we neoed
your response no later thae Friday, August 21, 2013 @ 1:00 n.in, to be able to present to Commissioner’s Coutd as
soon as possible.  Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided bslow and veply o
the Purchasing Department via fox to (956)-292-7612 or via email tor snndv.suarezigeo hidalgo.tx.us,

Stould you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me ar 318-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your altention and cooperntion (o this malter.
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.0‘\3 fﬁ%. Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
e A 2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
2 Sf Edinburg, Texas 78539

(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

A ERAS
MEMORANDUM
(Department’s Recommendation)
To: Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct # 4

ATTN: Roman Rodriguez/ Veronica Lopez-Davis

FROM: Sandy Suaret‘,\/l Buyer I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: August 17, 2015

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-210-08-12—-SGS - HIDALGO COUNTY

“Purchase of Sand and BcddinE Material !011 as needed basis!”

We have received TWO (2) bids in reference with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy of
the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid responses for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
your response no later than Friday, August 21, 2015 @ 1:00 p.m. to be able to present to Commissioner’s Court as
soon as possible, Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply to
the Purchasing Department via fax to (956)-292-7612 or via email to: _sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matler,
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TABULATION SHEET
“PURCHASE OF SAND and BEDDING MATERIAL (on an as needed basis)”
RFB NO.: 2015-210-08-12-SGS

Gravel 750-77

Upper Valley Materials (CAPA)

Vendor(s) 7301 W. Expressway 83 Frontera Material, Inc
Mission, Texas PO Box 1449
Elsa, TX. 78543
Pit Location Tom Gill 3 Mile Line NO BID

Penitas, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 1

(locati

on of site for reference only)
Mile 11 North & 1 %2 West
Mercedes, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 2

(location of site for reference only)
4011 S. Veterans Blvd
San Juan, TX 78589

Aggregate $  (per ton) Aggregate $  (perton)
Grade No. Normal Size Grade No. Normal Size
Upper Valley | Frontera Upper Valley Frontera
1 27 NO BID NO BID 1 27 NO BID NO BID
2 1-1/2 « « « 2 1-1/2 « « “
3 1-1/2” 16.25 « 3 1-1/2” 16.25 «
4 1” 16.25 « 4 17 16.25 «
5 3/4” 15.00 « 5 3/4” 15.00 «
6 1/2” 15.00 « 6 1/2” 15.00 «
7 3/8” 15.00 « 7 3/8” 15.00 «
8 3/8” NO BID ¢ 8 3/8” NO BID ¢
Other 27 -3 « « Other 2573 « «
Tunnel rack 1%-2Y 14.00 “ Tunnel rack 1% -2Y 14.00 «“
Oversized rack 37-6” 14.00 NO BID Oversized rack 37-6” 14.00 NO BID

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 3
(location of site for reference only)

FM 2221 & lowa Rd.

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 4
(location of site for reference only)
1051 N. Doolittle Rd.

Mission, Texas Edinburg, Texas
Aggregate $  (perton) Aggregate $  (perton)

Grade No. Normal Size  ["Upper Valley | Frontera Grade No. Normal Size ["Upper Valley Frontera
1 27 NO BID NO BID 1 2” NO BID NO BID

2 1-12« « « 2 1-1/2 « «

3 1-1/2” 16.25 “ 3 1-1/2” 16.25 “

4 1” 16.25 “ 4 17 16.25 “

5 3/4” 15.00 “ 5 3/4” 15.00 “

6 1/2” 15.00 “ 6 1/2” 15.00 “

7 3/8” 15.00 “ 7 3/8” 15.00 “

8 3/8” NO BID “ 8 3/8” NO BID “

Other 27 -3W%” « « Other 27 -3W%” « “

Tunnel rack 1% -2Y 14.00 “ Tunnel rack 1% -2Y 14.00 “
Oversized rack 37-6” 14.00 NO BID Oversized rack 37-6” 14.00 NO BID




TABULATION SHEET
“PURCHASE OF SAND and BEDDING MATERIAL (on an as needed basis)”
RFB NO.: 2015-210-08-12-SGS

Sand 750-77
Upper Valley Materials (CAPA) Frontera Material, Inc.
Vendor: 7301 W. Expressway 83 Po Box 1449
Mission, Texas Elsa, TX. 78543
Pit Location Tom Gill 3 Mile Line Fine Sand- Mission, TX
Penitas, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 1
(location of site for reference only)
Mile 11 North & 1 % West
Mercedes, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 2
(location of site for reference only)
4011 S. Veterans Blvd
San Juan, TX 78589

Price (per ton)

Price (per ton)

) Upper Upper Valley
Find Aggregate Valley Frontera Find Aggregate Frontera
Price per Ton Price per Ton
18.00 20.00 18.00 20.00

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 3
(location of site for reference only)
FM 2221 & lowa Rd.
Mission, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 4
(location of site for reference only)
1051 N. Doolittle Rd.
Edinburg, Texas

Price (per ton)

Price (per ton)

Upper Upper Valley
Find Aggregate |  Valley Frontera Find Aggregate Frontera
Price per Ton Price per Ton
18.00 20.00 18.00 20.00

FILL SAND

Vendor: 7301 W. Expressway 83
Mission, Texas

Upper Valley Materials (CAPA)

Frontera Material, Inc.
Po Box 1449
Elsa, TX. 78543

Pit Location Tom Gill 3 Mile Line

Penitas, Texas

Fill Sand- 490 Pit

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 1
(location of site for reference only)
Mile 11 North & 1 %5 West
Mercedes, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 2
(location of site for reference only)
4011 S. Veterans Bivd
San Juan, TX 78589

FILL SAND Upper Valley Frontera

Price per Ton
P 4.00 8.00

FILL SAND Upper Valley Frontera

Price per Ton 4.00 8.00

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 3
(location of site for reference only)
FM 2221 & lowa Rd.

Mission, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct NO. 4
(location of site for reference only)
1051 N. Doolittle Rd.
Edinburg, Texas

FILL SAND Upper Valley Frontera

Price per Ton

4.00 8.00

FILL SAND Upper Valley Frontera

Price per Ton

4.00 8.00




HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER=S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE: August 12, 2015 BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF SAND & BEDDING
MATERIAL (ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS)”
BID NO: 2015-210-08-12-SGS

SIGNATURE (IF
APPLICABLE)
BID | oR INITIALS OF
REQU STAFF ADDRESS
NAME OF BIDDER: EST ADDRESSING E-MAIL
COMPANY/FIRM *VIA MAILOUT DATE & PHONE NO
Frontera Materials, Inc P.O. Box 1917
Attn: Barry Ehlinger Email Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 Weslaco, TX 78599
956-607-5965
bmefrontera@aol.com
Martin Marietta Materials 5710 W. Hausman Rd. Suite 121
Attn: Rhonda Jung Email Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 San Antonio, Texas 78249-1646
cell (210) 294-3373
Office (210-208-4056
mark.higgins@martinmarietta.com
Valley Caliche Products, Inc 3 Mile Line Minnesota Rd
Attn: Mark Motheral Email Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 Mission TX, 78572
956-581-2751
valleycaliche@aol.com
Upper Valley Materials 7301 W Exp 83
Attn: Bernice Gonzalez Email Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 Mission, TX 78572
Larry Hinojosa 432-0600
sales@capatexas.com
cc_sales@riovalleypipe.com
International Materials LLC 3408 N. Conway
Attn: Javier Garza Email- 07/27/15 Mission, Texas 78574
Sandy Suarez 956-240-1423
& 956-862-3701
fax 956-584-3206
internationalmats@at&t.net
Border Pacific Materials Rio Grande City, Tx. 78582
Jose A. Escamilla Email- Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 Office 956.487.5606
Mobile 956.500.2562
jaescamilla@boprr.com
4622 Cedar Avenue
Prime Vendor Inc. Email- Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 Wilmington NC 28403
Kimberly Doumit Phone: 800-746-9554
bids20@prime-vendor.com Fax: 800-746-8307



mailto:sales@capatexas.com
callto:956.487.5606
callto:956.500.2562
callto:800-746-9554
callto:800-746-8307

Delta Aggregate & Landscaping PO Box 2443

Materials Email- Sandy Suarez 07/27/15 Elsa, Texas 78543

Eustacio Rubio (956) 472-0174 or (956) 966-0709
delataggregate@aol.com

300 Spring Bldg, Suite 900

Green Dream International Email- Sandy Suarez 07/28/15 Little Rock, AR 72201

Victor D. Vincent T: 501-481-4460 F: 501-481-4459:
v.vincent@greendreamgr.com

3408 N. Conway
International Materials, LLC /P Sandy Suarez 07/31/15 Mission, TX. 78574

Javier Garza 956-240-1423
internationalalmats@att.net

4047 Naco Perrin, Suite 100

Virtual Builders Exchange Email- Sandy Suarez San Antonio, TX 78217
08/05/15 210-564-6900 x 126
Karen Siesters 210-564-6902 F
9312 E. Curb
10C Company EMR Sandy Suarez 08/11/15 Edinburg, TX. 78542
Sebastin Salinas 956-380-2897

ssalinas@ioccompany.com

IN PERSON (IP)
E-MAIL (EM)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)



mailto:delataggregate@aol.com
callto:%28956%29%20472-0174
callto:%28956%29%20966-0709
callto:501-481-4460
callto:501-481-4459
mailto:v.vincent@greendreamgr.com
mailto:internationalalmats@att.net
mailto:ssalinas@ioccompany.com



