Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Iidinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORAND UM

(Department’s Recommendation)

TO Hon, AC Cucllar, Jr. Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct #1

ATTN: RaulLozauo/KT

tia Garcia

FROM: Sandy Suare}, Buyer Il
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: August 17,2015

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-208-08-12— SGS - HIDALGO COUNTY
“Lubricants (Grease-Oil-Hydraulic Fluids & Anti-Freeze) Products”

We have received two (2) qualified bid responses in reference with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will
find a copy of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and recommendation,

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
your response no later than FRIDAY, August 21, 2015 @ 11:00 a.m, to be able to present to Commissioner’s Courl
as soon as possible. Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply
to the Purchasing Department via fax to (956)-318-2629 or via email fo: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.(x,us.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext,
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2812 8, Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ FPax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORAND UM

(Department’s Recommendalion)

TO Hon, Bduardo “Eddie” Cantiu, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct # 2

ATTN:  Armando Pompa/ Yolanda Cisneros

‘}
FROM: Sandy Suam%f%uycr 1I
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE:  Aungust 17,2015

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-208-08-12~ SGS - HIDALGO COUNTY
“Lubricants (Grease-Qil-ITydraulic Fluids & Anti-Freeze) Produets”

We have received Two qualilied bid responses in reference with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will
find a copy of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and recommendation,

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
your response no later than Friday, August 21, 2015 @ 11:00 a.m. to be able to present to Commissioner’s Courl

as soon as possible, Please indicale your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply
to the Purchasing Department via fax to (956)-318-2629 or vin email (o2 snndy.sunrezdeo.idalgo.ix,us,

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext,
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation lo this matier,

AWARD TO VENDOR(S): ' RECOMMINDATION (BASIS)
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Zimbra https://email.co.hidalgo.tx.us/h/printmessage?id=62495&tz=America...

Zimbra sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us
Recommendations
From : Yolanda Cisneros Tue, Aug 18, 2015 03:16 PM
<yolanda.cisneros@co.hidalgo.tx.us> »3 attachments

Subject : Recommendations

To : Sandy Suarez
<sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us>

Recommendations:

Bid #2015-210-08-12-SGS - Award to Upper Valley Materials (CAPA)
Bid #2015-208-08-12-SGS - Award to Multiple Bidders/ Lowest Bidder.

If you have any questions do not hesitate to call me.
Thank you,

Yoli M. Cisneros
Administrative Assistant II

HipaLco CounTy
PreciNneT 2

Cormissionenr Epme Cantu

4011 So. Veterans Blvd.
San Juan, TX 78589

Office * (956) 787-1891 Ext. 2002
Fax * (956)787-4683

NEW Pct 2 Logo FINAL (1).png
HipaLco CounTy
P RECINCTZH 41 KB

Camuissionen Epoie Cany

1of2 8/18/2015 3:24 PM
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Hidalge County Purchasing Department
2812 S, Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

(Department’s Recommendation)

Tos Hen. Joe Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct # 3

ATTN:  Noraa Ceballos

Jz
TFROM: Sandy SlaareﬁbBuym' 1
Hidalgo County Purchasing Departiment

DATE; August 17, 2018

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST
Bid No. 2015-208-08-12— SGS§ - HIDALGO COUNTY

_“Lubricants (Grease-Oil-Hydraulic Fluids & Anti-Froeze) Produets”

We have reecived ONE qualificd bid in referonce with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find a copy

of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefors, we need

your vespouse ne later than Friday, Augyst 21, 2015 @ 11:00 0.m. o be able lo present to Commissioner's Court

as soon as possible,  Please indicate your recommendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply

to the Purchasing Department yin fax to (956)-292-7612 or via email to: sandy.suaresi@co.bidabao. ix.us,

Showld you have any questions or-require further information please do not hesitate to call me. at 318-2626- ext.

4869, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Department ' E—MA“'ED AUG 16 Zﬂﬁ
2812 S, Business Highway 281 C
New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORAND UM

(Department’s Recommendation]

To: Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct# 4

ATTN: Sandra Solis/ Roman Rodriguez

FROM: Sandy Sua’r.el;l Buyer 11
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: August 17, 2015
RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQULST

Bid No. 2015-208-08-12- $GS - HIDALGO COUNTY
mubricants (Grease-Qil-Hydraulic Fluids & Anti-Freeze) Producis”

We have received ONE qualified bid in reference with the above mentioned projeet, Enclosed you will find a copy
of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and recommendation,

We would like fo present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Coimt Meeting; therefore, we need
p I

your response no later than Friday, August 21, 2015 @ 11:00 a.m. to be able to present to Commissionets Court
as soon as possible.. Please indicaté your recommendation of any concerns on the space provided below and reply
to the Purchasing Depariment yia fax to (956)-318-2629 or' via email to: sandy.suarez@co:hidalgo.ty,ns.

Should you have any questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860, Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter,
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Department
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

-?,.E.?(.&, u (Department’s Recommendation)

To: Capt. Richard Ozuna
Hidalgo County Sheriff's Office

ATTN: Juan Tapia, Purchasing Specialist

FROM: Sandy Sunref( Buyer Il
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: August 17,2015
RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-208-08-12- SGS - HIDALGO COUNTY
“Lubricants (Grease-QOil-Hydraulic Fluids & Anti-Freeze) Products”

We have received ONE qualified bid in reference with the above mentioned project. Enclosed you will find & copy
of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and recommendation,

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner's Count Meeting; therefore, we need

your response no later than Friday, August 21, 2015 @) 11:00 a.m. to be able to present to Commissioner’s Court
as soon as possible. Please indicate your recornmendation or any concerns on the space provided below and reply

to the Purchasing Department via fax to {956)-318-2629 or via email to: sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us.

Should you have sny questions or require further information please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext.
4860. Thank you for your attention and cooperation to this matter.
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2812 8. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626/ Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

(Department’s Recommendation)

To: Daniel Flores, Facilities Manager
Hidalgoe County Facilities Management

FROM; Sandy Sudroy, Buyei It
Hidalgo County Purchasing Department

DATE: August17,2015
RE:  BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-208-08-12— 8GS : HIDALGO COUNTY
“Luybricants (Grease-Oil-Hydraulic Fluids & Anti-Fiéeze) Products”

We have received ONE qualified bid in réfersnce with the above mentioned project. Enclosed-you will find a copy
of the tabulation sheet along with copy of the bid response for your review and recommendation.

We would like to present your recommendation on the next Commissioner’s Count Meeting; therefore, we need
your responsé ho later than Friday, Angust 21, 2015 @ 11:00 a.m, to be gble t6 pregent to Commissioner’s Court
as s06n as possible, Please indicate your fecominendation of ary coticeris ofi the space provided bielow and 7éply
1o the Puichasing Depaitment via fax to (956)-318-2629 or via émiail {o: sandy.suarez@co:hidalgo.txus,

S]io_uid you haveé any questions or require further infoimation please do not hesitate to call me at 318-2626- ext,
4860. Thank you for youi attention aiid cooperation to this fiatter.
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“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

OPTION 1

1

Diesel Engine Lubricants-NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90

HIDALGO COUNTY

TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS

CLASS 405-FUEL, OIL, GREASE & LUBRICANTS

Made available in the following sizes: Pint, Quart, 1 Gallon, 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon, Bulk

1A SAE15W-40 meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90
Cl-4, CH-4, CF-4, Cummins CES 20078, EOM+, Volvo VDS2/VDS, Allison C-4, APl SL-SJ, Minimum 10 TBN
Arguindegui Oil Co. Il Ltd King Corportion/dba Arnold Oil Company
Mercedes, Texas
Laredo, Texas arr, Texas
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart Conoco Fleet S”ngjolzc 3.59 Motorcraft 3711 44.33 cs
Supreme FC
Gallon Conoco Fleet 15W40 11.30 NO BID
AOC
5 Gallon Premium CJ-4 15W40 38.21 NO BID
55 Gal EC AOC CJ-4 15W40
Fleet Supreme Premium 345.40 Motorcraft 3716 663.94
AOC CJ-4 15W40
Bulk Premium 7.29 NO BID
1B SAE 10W meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90
CF, CD, SL, SJ, Allison C-4, Cat TO-2, Minimum 7.5 TBN
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
Gallon
NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon
NO BID NO BID
55 Gallon
NO BID NO BID
Bulk
1C SAE 30W meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90
CF-2, CF, CD, SL, SJ, Allison C-4, Cat TO-2, Minimum 7.5 TBN
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart NO BID NO BID
Gallon Conoco T5X HP30 11.87 NO BID
NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon
55 Gallon NO BID Purus | FIt30w 2936 366.43
Bulk NO BID NO BID

1D  SAE 40W meeting the following specif

ications:CF-2, CF, CD, SL, SJ, Minimum 7.5 TBNN

IGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Product No. Price Per Unit
Brand

Quart NO BID NO BID

Gallon Conoco T5X HD40 11.21 NO BID
NO BID

5 Gallon NO BID

55 Gallon | conoco T5X HD40W 490.24 Purus 2946 379.40

Bulk Conoco T5X HD40W 8.46 NO BID

TABULATION SHEET Page 1 of 10




HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

1E. Rotella T (15 W-40 CJ4) NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

Quart Conoco Fleet EC 15w40 3.59 Shell 3711 40.96 cs
Gallon Conoco Fleet EC 15w40 11.30 NO BID
5Gallon | AOC Premium | CJ-4 15w40 38.21 Shell 3714 67.04
55 Gallon | AOC Premium | CJ-4 15w40 345.40 Shell 3716 691.75
Bulk AOC Premium | CJ-4 15w40 7.29 gal NO BID

2 Gasoline Engine Lubricants NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39

Made available in the following sizes: Pint, Quart, 1 Gallon, 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon, Bulk meeting the following specifications:
API, SL, SJ, SH, ILSAC-GF3 (Multigrades only) FORD WSS=M2C153H (5W-20 only)

2A SAE 5W-30 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Product No. Price Per Unit
Brand
Quart Conco Super AS5W30 3.20 Motorcraft 3601 44.24 cs
Gallon NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon AOC Premium 5w30 28.20 NO BID
55 Gallon | AOC Premium 5w30 310.20 Motorcraft 3606 647.54
Bulk AOC Premium 5w30 5.64 gal NO BID
2B SAE10W-30 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart Conco Super AS10w30 3.20 Motorcraft 3611 42.95 cs
Gallon NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon AOC
Premium 10w30 28.20 NO BID
55 Gallon AOC
FormulaShell Premium 10w30 310.20 NO BID
Bulk AOC
Premium 10w30 5.64 gal NO BID
2C SAE5W-20 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart Conco Super AS 5w20 3.20 Motorcraft 3641 49.93 cs
Gallon NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon AOC
Premium 5w20 28.20 Motorcraft 3645 73.64
55Gal Prem AOC
Synthetic Blend Premium 5w20 310.20 Motorcraft 3646 647.59
Bulk AOC
Premium 5w20 5.64 gal NO BID

2D SAE30 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart NO BID NO BID
Gallon NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon NO BID NO BID
55 Gallon NO BID Purus 2936 366.43
Bulk NO BID NO BID

TABULATION SHEET Page 2 of 10



HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

2E SAE40 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
NO BID NO BID
Quart
NO BID NO BID
Gallon
NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon
55 Gallon NO BID Purus 2046 379.40
NO BID NO BID
Bulk
2F SAE5W-20 SIMI SYNTHETIC NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart Conoco Super AS 5w20 3.20 NO BID
Gallon NO BID NO BID
5 Gallon | A€ Premium 5W20 28.20 NO BID
AOC Premium 10.2 M 4 47.54
55 Gallon 5W20 310.20 otoercraft 3646 647.5
Bulk AOC Premium 5W20 5.64 gal NO BID
2G SAE2W-50 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-39
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart NO BID Castrol 3661.6 20.45 cs
NO BID
Gallon NO BID
NO BID
5 Gallon o NO BID
55 Gallon NQ BID Castrol 3666 810.93
NO BID NO BID
Bulk
3 Automatic Transmission Lubricants NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-36
Made available in the following sizes: Quart, Gallon, 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon
3A Mercon/Dexron 111 ATF meeting specifications for: Mercon/Dexron Il & 111 & I1IE, Allison C-4, Cat TO-2
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart Conoco Super ATF 2.96 Castrol 5511 24.99 cs
Gallon NO BID NO BID
AOC MDILIATF 26.80 Castrol 5514 39.47
5 Gallon Premium ' '
55Gallon AOC
. MD111ATF 294.80 NO BID
Formula Shell Premium

TABULATION SHEET Page 3 of 10




HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

3B Type F ATF meeting Ford M2C33-F specifications NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-36
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Quart Conoco Type F ATF 3.45 Motorcraft 5521 45.14 cs
Gallon NO BID NO BID
NO BID
5 Gallon NO BID
NO BID
55 Gallon NO BID
3C Mercon 5 - Trasmission Fluid NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-36
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
12/1Qt. Conoco Versa Tran 4.42 Motorcraft 5511V 54.28 cs
16 Gallon NO BID NO BID
55 Gallon Conoco Versa Tran 959.59 NO BID
3D Allison — Castrol Transmission TranSynd NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-36
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
NO BID
12/1Qt. NO BID
NO BID
16 Gallon © NO BID
55 Gallon Conco Syrcon HP ATF 1649.31 Castrol 59.16 1662.29
4 Tractor Hydraulic Fluids NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51
Made available in the following sizes: 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon Meeting the following specifications: Case Hy-Tran/TCH,
Cat TO-2, JD 303/J20C, Ford-new Holland M2C134 A/B/C/D Massey M1141, Vickers M-2950-S, 1-286-S, Universal
Tractor fluid serving transmissions, final drives, oil immersed brakes and hydraulic systems
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
5 Gal Steiner | | AOC THF 28.13 Purus 5534 36.15
Hydraulic Qil remium
55 Gal o AOC THF 309.47 Purus 55.36 311.56
Lubriguard 303 | ""emium
5 Differential/ Final Drive Gear Lubricants NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-57
Made available in the following sizes: 35# Pail, 120 Lb Keg, 400 Lb Drum
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
35# Pail NO BID NO BID
120 Lb Keg NO BID NO BID
400 Lb Drum Spirax NO BID NO BID

5A SAE 80W-90 Gear lubricant meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-57
GL-5, GL-4, Mack GO-J, MIL-L-2105D, MIL-PRF-2105E
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
35# Pail Conoco | UGL 80w90 55.74 Purus 4924 39.26
120 LbKeg | onoco | UGLBow0 179.35 Purus 4925 142.78
400 Lb Drum | COMo®© | UGL 80w 555.59 Purus 4926 438.13

TABULATION SHEET Page 4 of 10




HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

5B SAE 85W-140 Gear lubricant meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-57
GL-5, GL-4, Mack GO-J, MIL-L-2105D, MIL-PRF-2105E

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. . .
Price Per Unit
. Purus
35# Pail Conoco UGL 85w/40 55.74 41.44 40.37
120LbKeg | Conoco | UGL B85w/40 179.35 Purus 4145 143.75
400Lb Drum |  Conoco | UGL 85w/40 555.59 Purus 4146 441.23
5C SAE 75W-90 Synthetic Gear lubricant meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-57
GL-5, MT-1, Mack GO-J
Brand | Product No. | Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
35# Pail Conoco | Triton Syn 148.31 Coastal 4904 85.19
NO BID
120 Lb Keg NO BID
400 Lb Drum Spirax Conoco | Triton Syn 1665.63 NO BID

5D  SAE 50W Synthetic Transmission lubricant meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-57
MT-1 performance for Eaton, Mack, Meritor, Navistar

Brand Product Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
No.
35# Pail Conoco Triton Syn 157.71 Costal 5504 89.17
NO BID
120 Lb Keg NO BID 0
400 Lb Drum Conoco Triton Syn 1783.53 NOBID

5E.  SAE50W Synthetic Transmission lubricant meeting the following specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-57
MT-1 performance for Eaton, Mack, Meritor, Navistar

Brand Product Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
No.
35# Pail AOC Premium | Syn Trans 157.71 NO BID
NO BID
120 Lb Keg NO BID
400 Lb Drum | AOC Premium | Syn Trans 1783.53 NO BID
5F CAT-TO0-4 SAE 30 Drive Train oil for Final Drives meeting the following specifications:
Allison, C4, C3, Cat TO-4, TO-2, SAE 30W NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90
Brand Product No. | Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
35# Pail Conco Power Drive 76.12 Purus 5714 49.16
120 Lb Keg NO BID NO BID
‘gf_ll_-b Drum Conoco Power Drive 650.29 Purus 5716 458.64
5G CAT TO-4 SAE 50 Drive Train oil for Final Drives meeting the following specifications:
Allison, C4, C3, Cat TO-4, TO-2, SAE 50W NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-90
Brand Product No. | Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
35# Pail Conoco Power Drive 76.24 Purus 5814 50.39
120 Lb Keg NO BID NO BID
400 Lb Drum CAT | Conoco Power Drive 797.82 Purus 5816 464.78

TABULATION SHEET Page 5 of 10



HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

6 Hydraulic Lubricants in various viscosities made available in the following sizes: 5 Gallon, 55 Gallon
Meeting the following specifications: Denison HF-0, Vickers M-2950-S, 1-286-S, TOST min 2000 hrs.
NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51

6A 1SO 32 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Purus
5 Gallon Conoco Mega Flow AW32 45.56 1714 33.21
55 Gallon | Conoco | Mega Flow AW32 419.06 Purus 1716 279.72
6B 1SO 46 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Purus
5 Gallon Conoco Mega Flow AW46 45.56 1724 33.21
55 Gallon | Conoco | Mega Flow AW46 419.06 Purus 1746 279.72
6C 1SO 68 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
5 Gallon Conoco | Megaflow AW68 44.21 Purus 1734 33.21
55 Gallon | Conoco | Megaflow Awes 42876 Purus 1736 279.72

6D 1SO 100 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
NO BID
5 Gallon Conoco Megaflow 59.50
Quincy AW/100
Megaflow NO BID
55 Gallon Conoco AW/100 756.82
7 BRAKE and POWER Steering Fluids made available in the following sizes: Pint, Quarts, preferably in Gallons

Meeting the following specifications: DOT3 for Brake Fluid/ Ford, GM, Chrysler for Power Steering
NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-85

7A Brake Fluid NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-85
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Pint NG BID Federated BF12 1.38
Quart NQ BID Costal BFQT 3.20
NO BID
Gallon-Shell NO BID
7B Power Steering Fluid NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-85
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Pint NO BID Tru-south PS 85
Quart NOBID Costal PSQT 2.00
NO BID
Gallon-Gunk © NO BID

TABULATION SHEET Page 6 of 10



HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

8 Aeroshell Fluid 4 Fluid make available in the following sizes 1 Gallon, 55 Gal NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-51
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
NO BID
5 Gallon NO BID
55 Gallon NO BID NO BID
9 Chassis Grease made available in the following sizes: Case of 10 tubes, 35# Pail, 120# Keg, 55 Gallon Drums

NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-24

9A Lithium Complex High Temp Grease meeting specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-24
NLGI-2, ASTM D4950 GC-LB, Suitable for wheel bearings, chassis, PTO, U-Joints, on & off Road Applications
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Case 10 Conoco | Dyna Life HT#2 23.08 Mystik 7250 2.64 tube
354 Pail Conoco | pyna Life HT#2 81.94 Mystik 7254 97.24
120 # Conoco . .
Keg-Mystik Dyna Life HT#2 276.71 Mystik 7255 318.40
55 Gallon Conoco | pyna Life HT#2 922.35 NO BID
9B Lithium Complex High Temp Grease w/ 3% moly meeting specifications: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-24
NLGI-2, ASTM D4950 GC-LB, Suitable for wheel bearings, chassis, PTO, U-Joints, On & Off Road Applications
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Case 10-CAT | oMot | Megaplex 31.55 Castrol 7200 3.47 tube
. Conoco Megaplex
354 Pail ot 117.56 NO BID
120 # Keg-CAT | CON0%0 | Meeplex 432,71 Castrol 7205 42353
CLASS 060- AUTOMOTIVE & TRAILER EQUIPMENT & PARTS
10 Antifreeze made available in the following sizes: Gallon, 55 Gallon

10A Ethylene Glycol Antifreeze meeting specifications for: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 060-03
ASTM D3306 for automotive/ ASTM D 4985 for Heavy Duty Diesel

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
NO BID
1 Gallon © NO BID
55Gallon-Shell AOC Coolant Plus ANTI55
zone Premium 100% 377.00 KOS 50/50 262.63

10B Extended Life Antifreeze/ Coolant meeting specifications for: NIGP COMMODITY CODE 060-03
CAT EC-1, TMC RP 329, TMC RP 338, Matching Catepillar Extended Life Coolant, Detroit Diesel

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
1 Gallon NO BID Purus Elc 50/50 8.99
55 Gallon | AOC Premium | ELC 50/50 275.80 Purus EIC 55 50/50 369.19

10 C Volvo-Antifreeze — Coolant VCS NIGP COMMODITY CODE 060-03

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
NO BID NO BID
1 Gallon
NO BID NO BID
55 Gallon
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HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

CLASS 075-AUTOMOTIVE SHOP AND RELATED EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

11 Shop Chemicals and Products made available in various sizes
11A Aerosol Brake Cleaner NIGP COMMODITY CODE 075-66
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Product No. Price Per Unit
Brand
NOBID CRC 05088F 2.49

11B Aerosol Engine Degreaser NIGP COMMODITY CODE 075-66

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

NO BID CRC 05025 3.17

11C Aerosol Starting Fluid-Spray Can NIGP COMMODITY CODE 075-66

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

11D Aerosol Penetrating Oil - WD 40 NIGP COMMODITY CODE 075-66

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

NO BID WWD 11 5.00

11E Oil Absorbent — Absorb & Dry NIGP COMMODITY CODE 075-66

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

Oil Absortbant 50 Ibs 7.35 DRI 5.92

CLASS 405-FUEL, OIL, GREASE & LUBRICANTS

12A Gasoline Fuel Additive — Seafoam NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-07

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

NO BID Seafoam SF16 7.18 160z

12B Diesel Fuel Additives NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-07

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
Power Serv Cetune Boot 75.76 25gal Seafoam SF16 7.18 160z
Diesel Kleen

12C Engine Oil Additive NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-38

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

NO BID NO BID

12D Aerosol Lubricant NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-27

Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit

NO BID

NO BID
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HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

12E Easy Slide RF-9512 Dryfilm Lubricant-Lube-A-Boom NIGP COMMODITY CODE 405-66
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
12.8 0z. can
NO BID NO BID

CLASS 630-PAINT, PROTECTIVE COATINGS, VARNISH, WALLPAPER, AND RELATED PRODUCTS
5 Gallon, 55 Gallon NIGP COMMODITY CODE 630-90

13 Mineral Spirits made available in the following sizes:
13A Mineral Spirits meeting specifications for:
Naptha, Parts Cleaner
Brand Product No. Price Per Unit Brand Product No. Price Per Unit
5 Gallon | AOC | Mineral Spirits 40.29 NO BID
55 Gallon | AOC | Mineral Spirits 346.18 NO BID

OPTION 2 - BULK TANK- 275 GALLONS- price per gallon

CLASS 405- FUEL, OIL GREASE AND LUBRICANTS

14  Synthetic Petroleum Products NIPG CODE: 405-90

TANK Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon
275 gallons
Premium Synthetic AOC 5W20 5.64 NO BID
Blend 5W-20
Premium Synthetic AOC 5W30 5.64 NO BID
Blend 5W-30
15 Transmissions Fluid NIPG CODE: 405-36
TANK . .
275 gallons Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon
Spirax S3 ATF MD3
AOC ATF 5.76 NO BID
16 Tractor Hydraulic Fluids- NIGP : 405-51
TANK . .
Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon
275 gallons
Lubriguard 303 AOC THF 6.04 NO BID
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HIDALGO COUNTY
TABULATION SHEET-RFB 2015-208-08-12-SGS
“LUBRICANTS (GREASE OIL, HYDRAULIC FLUIDS & ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

CLASS 060-AUTOMOTIVE AND TRAIL EQUIPMENT & PARTS

17  Anti-Freeze NIPG CODE: 060-03

ANTI-FREEZE/COOLANT

271;2’::'(0”5 Brand | Product No. Price Per Brand Product No. Price Per Gallon
Gallon
Premix 50/50 Coolant AOC | PLUS 50/50 4.23 NO BID
Ethylene Glycol AOC |PLUS100% |  7.38 NO BID
Extenteded Life Antifreeze | AOC ELL 50/50 5.70 NO BID
Volvo Anti-freeze NO BID NO BID
KING CORP-
ARGUINDEGUI OIL OPTION 1 & 2 dba ARNOLD OIL- OPTION 1
Ao e Awarded Items
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE:_AUGUST 12, 2015

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:_“HIDALGO COUNTY — “LUBRICANTS — (GREASE, OIL,
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS AND ANTI-FREEZE) PRODUCTS”

BID NO.: 2015-208-08-12-SGS

BUYER: Sandy Suarez

i BID SIGNATURE (IF APPLICABLE)
NégﬁSAFN\ﬁgﬁ%R' REQUEST OR INITIALS OF STAFF DATE ADDRESS & PHONE NO
*VIA ADDRESSING MAIL OUT
. . 4506 Hwy 359
itgrgﬂ;njszgu(l:lca):rlkmmpany Email Lindsay.clark@argpetro.com 7/27/15 |Llaredo, Texas 78043
: y Tel: 956-722-5251
. 4004 N. Cage Blvd.
2 | Patch Fuel & I i i .
Attr?lDaiiccj uel & Supply Email david@oilpatchfuelandsupply.com 7/27/15 Pharr, Texas 78577
’ Tel: 956- 781-9047
. 7373 Ardmore St, Suite 1227
ittQ_u;htykS?ndard Petroleum Email brocks@qualitystandardpetroleum.com 7/27/15 Houston, Texas 77054
n: Brocicsimmons Tel: 832-314-7262
4 Prime Vendor Inc 4622 Cedar Avenue
Attn. Kimberl Doum.it Email |Bids20@prime-vendor.com 7/27/15 Wilmington, NC 28403
' y Tel: 800-746-9554
. 801 Edwards Drive
DAL
ittn Ja:jzgcsi?:sg;mpany Email jsciascia@dalube.com 7/27/15 Lebanon, IN 46052
’ Tel: 800-6415-5823
6 Phillips 66 Phillips 66 Lubricants, CLS
Attn Russell Boone Email russell.Boone@p66.com 7/27/15 |Cell: 832.232.1613
7 RGV Pumps
l.
Attn Eluid George Email rgvpumps@aol.com 07/28/15| 956-281-8177
Will not be part. This time 8/11/15
8 Ford Motor Company Fleet Service Organization
dgoebell@ford.com iehi
Attn: Dave Goebel Email d @ 07/28/15 | Dearborn, Michigan.
313-206-4411
330-804-9106p
9 Ports Petroleum . roblay@portspetro.com 330-804-9107f
Attn: Robert Lay Email 07/29/15
10 Arnold Oil Company Printed | rodriguez@arnoldoilco.com 0 -956-565-4737 C 956-532-4735
Attn: Jay Rodriguez from- | Lrodrie : F -956-565-9571
Online
11
*VIA:

IN PERSON (IP)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT

(BLM)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)

E-MAIL (EM)

FACSIMILE (FAX)
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