Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629

- JEXNR MEMORANDUM

Date: September 10, 2015

TO: Hon. A. C. Cuellar, Jr., Commissioner Hon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 1 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3
Attn: Raul Lozano /Katia Garcia Attn: Mr. Saul Ramirez / Norma Ceballos

TO: Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4
Attn: / Veronica Lopez-Davis

From: Sandy Suarez*, Buyer II
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION/CONCURRENCE REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-265-09-09-SGS-Hidalgo County (All Funding Sources)-“CRS-2 (Cationic Rapid Setting) Emulsified Asphalt”
e e L T e T A T SR T |

We received two (2) bid responses for the above referenced project. Enclosed you will find the copy of the Tabulation
sheet and along with copies of the Bid responses for your review and recommendation

Please acknowledge by signing below, of your recommendation/concurrence to award to the lowest bidder meeting all

specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 or email:

sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursdayv, September 17, 2015 @10:00 A.M. in order to place this

item on the agenda for next Commissioner’s Court Meeting.

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 ext.4860

Please indicate below, the Vendor name and the Account number to be utilized for this project.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

«Q/f 5/;c;b ol Lozano et | SIS

Authorized Signéthre Printed Name Department Date

Enclosures



Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S, Business Highway 281
N New Administration Building
Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629
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MEMORANDUM

Date: September 1, 2015

TO: Hoa A, C. Ciellay, Jr., Cemmissioner Hon Joe M, Flores, Commissioner
idalgo County Precinet No. 1 Hidualge Comly Precinet No, 3
Aun: Raul Lozano /Katia Gareia Aty Me. Saaf Ramirez / Nonna Cebaflos

TO:  Hon. Joseph Palselos, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinet No. 4
Attn: / Veronica Lopez-Davis

From: Sandy Suarez®, Buyer H
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept,

Ril: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION/CONCURRENCE REQUEST

Bid No. 2015-265-09-09-SGS-Hidaipo County (Al Funding Sources)-"CRS-2 (Catlonic Rapid Seiting) Bmwlsilicd Asphalt”

We received two (2) bid responses for the above referenced pmject Enclosed you will find the copy of the T abutation
sheet and along with coples of the Bid responses for yowr review and recommendation

Pleaae acknowledge by signing below, of your recemmendation/concurrence to award to the lowest bidder meeting all
specificationsfrequirements dnd return to the Pm‘ch't‘;mg Pept, ' 6)- 318~2( 2) or (956) 292 7§12 oy enail

item on the agenda for ne\t Comm fssioner’s Couvt Vleeting,

If you should have any questions or need additiona] informalion please contact me at (956) 3182626 ext, 4860

Plense:iidicnte helow, the-Venii
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Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

Date: September 10, 2015

TO: Hon. A. C. Cuellar, Jr., Commissioner Hon. Joe M. Flores, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 1 Hidalgo County Precinct No. 3
Attn: Raul Lozano /Katia Garcia Attn: Mr. Saul Ramirez / Norma Ceballos

TO: Hon. Joseph Palacios, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 4
Attn: / Veronica Lopez-Davis

From: Sandy Suarez=s, Buyer 11
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION/CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 2015-265-09-09-8SGS-Hidalgo County (All Funding Sources)-“CRS-2 (Cationic Rapid Setting) Emulsified Asphalt”

We received two (2) bid responses for the above referenced project. Enclosed you will find the copy of the Tabulation
sheet and along with copies of the Bid responses for your review and recommendation

Please acknowledge by signing below, of your recommendation/concurrence to award to the lowest bidder meeting all
specifications/requirements and return to the Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 or email:

sandy.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later than Thursday, September 17, 2015 @10:00 A.M. in order to place this

item on the agenda for next Commissioner’s Court Meeting.

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 ext.4860

Please indicate below, the Vendor name and the Account number to be utilized for this project.

COMMENTS/CONCERNS:

BUDGET ACCOUNT# D ~ 1L 00 “Y3[ — 00 —\LY— 00} -0 — (- [0
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Authorized Signature Printed Name Department Date

Enclosures




HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
TABULATION SHEET

DEPARTMENTS NAME: HIDALGO COUNTY (ALL FUNDING SOURCES, PROGRAMS AND ENITITIES)

BID OPENING: September 9, 2015

OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

DESCRIPTION OF BID: RFB “CRS-2 (CATIONIC RAPID SETTING) EMULSIFIED ASPHALT”

BID NO. 2015-265-09-09-SGS

PRICE PER GALLON (FREIGHT INCLUDED) -ON AN “AS NEEDED BASIS”

ADDITIONAL
LOADS PER GALLON UP TO 1000 1001 TO 2000 2001 TO 3000 3001 TO 4000 4001 TO 5000 | COST (SPECIFY)
VENDOR
Ergon Asphalt & 2.5663 2.1331 2.0388 2.0166 2.0233 80.00
Emulsions
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon DEMURRAGE:
(freight included) (freight included) (freight included) (freight included) (freight included) (After 2 hrs.)
Cleveland Asphalt No Bid 3.5601 2.6055 2.2871 2.0324 80.00
Products
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon DEMURRAGE:
(freight included) (freight included) (freight included) (freight included) (freight included) (After 2 hrs.)
Martin Asphalt Co No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.50 2.40 60.00
NON-COMPLIANCE Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon DEMURRAGE:

(freight included)

(freight included)

(freight included)

(freight included)

(freight included)

(After 2 hrs.)




HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS

RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 09, 2015 BID OPENING TIME:_9:30 A.M

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION:
SETTING) EMULSFIED ASPHALT

HIDALGO COUNTY (All Sources, Programs and Entities)”CRS-2(CATIONIC RAPID

BID NO: 2015-265-09-09-SGS

SIGNATURE (IF
NAME OF BIDDER: RESIIJDEST APPLICABLE) DATE PHC\:_?_I\EQ_::AAF%I?ZRIESS
COMPANY/FIRM VIA* OR INITIALS OF STAFF PHONE & FAX NOs
ADDRESSING MAIL OUT '
3 RIVERWAY STE# 400
. HOUSTON, TX. 77056
1) Martin Asphalt, Co. Inc. e-mail Sandy Suarez 08/24/15 | Ph#800-662-0987
Attn: Jack Nimmo Fax# 800-552-2415 D#713-350-6849
jnimmo@martinmlp.com
6746 Up River Rd.
3.)) Eraon A & E Inc. Corpus Christi, TX. 78409
) Erg . e-mail Sandy Suarez 08/24/15 | p#830-708-6647
Attn: David Kopp david.kopp@ergon.com
i One Oakbrook Terrace Ste. 510
4.) Construction Data Company Oak Brook Terrace, 1I. 60181
. . P#512-634-5633
CDC/Bidtool e-mail Sandy Suarez 08/24115 | 0 e ea71a.0554
Attn. Laura Cobb plans@cdcnews.com or
Icobb@cdcnews.com
) 426 St Thomas Dr
5.) Vaquero Enterprises . 08/24/15 | Laredo, Texas 78045
Attn: Mr. LeRoy Soliz e-mail Sandy Suarez (956) 236-2411
vaguero.soliz@yahoo.com
7.) Jonathan Winkelman e-mail Sandy Suarez 08/24/15 | Jonathan.winkelman@gmail.com
100 Asphalt Lane
Shepard, TX. 77371
8) Cleveland Asphalts e-mail Sandy Suarez 08/24/15 | Ph#800-334-0177
capcoasphalt@msn.com
ccmcapco@msn.com (Greg Moore)
4047 Naco Perrin Ste. 100
9) Virtual Builders Exchange Sandy Suarez San Antonio, TX 78217
Jeannette Olguin EM 08/24/15 | P#:210.564.6900 f#: 210.564.6902
direct: 210.918.1124
jeannette@virtualbx.com
10) Prime Vendor Inc. 4622 Cedar Avenue
Kimberlv Doumit Wilmington NC 28403
y e-mail Sandy Suarez 08/24/15 | Phone: 800-746-9554
Fax: 800-746-8307
Bids20@prime-vendor.com



mailto:david.kopp@ergon.com
mailto:plans@cdcnews.com
mailto:Jonathan.winkelman@gmail.com
mailto:capcoasphalt@msn.com
mailto:ccmcapco@msn.com
callto:210.564.6900
callto:210.564.6902
callto:210.918.1124
callto:800-746-9554

11) CADCon Corp
Oscar A. Chavez
capcoasphalt@msn.com

e-mail

Sandy Suarez

08/24/15

1424 Mckinley St.
Brownsville, Tx. 78521
C: (956)-909-6659

*VIA:

IN PERSON (IP)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
E-MAIL (EM)



callto:%28956%29-909-6659



