Hidalgo County Purchasing Office
2812 S. Business Highway 281
New Administration Building

Edinburg, Texas 78539
(956) 318-2626 / Fax: (956) 318-2629

MEMORANDUM

Date: December 11, 2015

TO: Hon. Eduardo “Eddie” Cantu, Commissioner
Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2
Attn: Armando Pompa /Yolanda Cisneros

From: Sandy Suarez “, Buyer I1
Hidalgo County Purchasing Dept.

RE: BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION/CONCURRENCE REQUEST
Bid No. 2016-007-12-09-SGS-Hidalgo Precinct No. 2 “"HAULING OF DIRT”

We received two (2) bid responses for the above referenced project. Enclosed you will find the copy of the Tabulation
sheet and along with copy of the Bid response for your review and consideration.

Please indicate a check if Approve Or Disapprove and acknowledge by signing below, of your
recommendation/concurrence to award to the lowest bidder meeting all specifications/requirements and return to the
Purchasing Dept. via fax to (956)-318-2629 or (956) 292-7612 or email: sandv.suarez@co.hidalgo.tx.us by no later
than Thursday, December 17. 2015 by 4:00 P.M

If you should have any questions or need additional information please contact me at (956) 318-2626 ext.4860

APPROVE rd DISAPPROVE 0O

Please indicate below, the Vendor name and the Account number to be utilized for this project.

ORI R 2 Ben OPceanons l’?—l IS! K

=
Authoriz%d Signature Printed Name Department Date

Enclosures



TABULATION

HIDALGO COUNTY PRECINCT NO.2
“HAULING OF DIRT”
RFB NO.: 2016-007-12-09-SGS

OPTION |
“HAULING OF DIRT”
Roy’s Hauling Service, Inc. Southern Star Transport, LTD
Radius_ Total Cost Fuel Cost Current/Base Total Cost Total Cost Current/Base
(Round Trip) Per Cubic Percentage Fuel Cost Per Cubic Yard Per Cubic Yard Fuel Cost
Yard Per Cubic Yard
SAMPLE $3.00 33.00% $1.00
1-05 Mile 3.20 75% 2.40 2.40 35% 85
6-10 Mile 3.20 [Ee. 2.40 3.37 250 85
0,
11-15 Mile 5.20 75% 3.90 4.55 19% 85
16-20 Mile 5.20 5% 3.90 5.70 15% -85
21-25 Mile 7.15 5% 5.36 6.48 13% -85
26-30 Mile 7.15 5% 5.36 7.32 12% -85
31-35 Mile 9.45 75% 7.09 8.20 10% -85
10.60 5% 7.95 10.75 8% 85
36-45 Mile ' : : 0
46-50 Mile 11.75 75% 8.81 12.04 7% .85
OPTION Il
Loading & Hauling Of Dirt”
. Total Cost Total Cost Current/Base
Radius Total Cost Fuel Cost Current/base ST BN B
(Round trip) |per cubic Yard Percentage Per Fuel Cost
Cubic Yard
SAMPLE $3.00 33.00% $1.00
NO BID NO BID
1-05 Mile 4.20 5% 3.15 NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
6-10 Mile 4.20 75% 3.15
NO BID NO BID NO BID
11-15 Mile 6.20 75% 4.65
NO BID NO BID NO BID
16-20 Mile 2y 75% 4.65
NO BID NO BID NO BID
21-25 Mile 8.15 75% 6.11
NO BID NO BID NO BID
26-30 Mile 8.15 750 6.11
31-35 Mile 10.45 50t 7.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID
- i 0,
36-45 Mile 11.60 75% 8.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID
- i 0,
46-50 Mile 1275 75% 956 NO BID NO BID NO BID

RFB No.: 2016-007-12-09-SGS
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG
SPECIFICATIONS/BID PACKETS
RFB-RFP-RFQ

BID OPENING DATE: _December 09, 2015

DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: “Hidalgo County Precinct No. 2 -HAULING OF DIRT”

BID NO: 2015-007-12-09-SGS

BID OPENING TIME: 9:30 A.M.

BID
REQUE SIGNATURE (IF APPLICABLE) ADDRESS
NAME OF BIDDER: ST OR INITIALS OF STAFF ADDRESSING E-MAIL
COMPANY/FIRM *VIA MAILOUT DATE & PHONE NO
906 Princeton
1. Ortiz Dump Truck Service Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Mission, TX. 78572
Attn: Arturo Ortiz E-mail P# 956-321-5015 F#956-424-6359
superslick4949@aol.com
P.O. Box 1896
2. Roy's Hauling Service, Inc. Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 Edinburg, TX. 78540
Attn: Roy Balderas, Jr. or Christina E-mail P# 956-383-2206 F# 956-383-2569
royshaulinginc@aol.com
3247 N. Sharp Rd.
3. R. Quintanilla Trucking Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 Edinburg, TX. 78541
Attn.: Mr. Quintanilla E-mail P# 956-343-6590
rquintanilla75@hotmail.com
4. Frontera Materials P.0. Box 1086
Attn: Barry Ehlinger E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Weslaco, TX. 78596
(956)- 607-5965
bmefrontera@aol.com (?)
barry@fmtitex.com
5. Reed Construction Data 30 Technology Pkway S. # 100
Attn: Trevali T. Wescott E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Norcross, GA 30092-2925
P#770-417-4000 F#770-417-4002
erp@reedbusiness.com
7. Coastal Resources, Ltd. 8641 Agnes
Attn: Mike Mendez E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Corpus Christi, TX. 78406
P# 361-533-0660
coastalresourcesltd864 1@yahoo.com
934 Santa Rosa Ave.
8. Jacob Ortega Farms E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Edcouch, Texas 78538
Attn: Jacob Ortega Cell: 463-6984
iacoborteaa?4@vahoo com
9. Prime Vendor Inc. 4622 Cedar Avenue
E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Wilmington NC 28403
P: 800-746-9554 Fax: 800-746-8307
bids20@prime-vendor.com
10. Joe Salinas E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | jsalinas@ssttex.com
11. International Materials, LLC 3408 N. Conway
J. Garza P Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 Mission, TX. 78574
956-240-1423
internationalmats@att.net



mailto:royshaulinginc@aol.com
mailto:bmefrontera@aol.com
mailto:barry@fmtitex.com
callto:800-746-9554
callto:800-746-8307
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1424 Mckinley St.

Marivel Saenz

12. Oscar A. Chavez E-mail Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Brownsville, Tx. 78521
CADCon Corp Ph: (956)-909-6659
oachavezm@gmail.com
13. Attn: April Greene AprildSRS@aol.com
ER 11/23/15
14. Kamuran Sokmensuer ER kamuran.sokmensuer@ceresenvironmental | 11/23/15 | 6960 Professional Parkway East
Marketing Associate .com Sarasota, FL 34240
Ceres Environmental Services, Inc. (941) 358-6364 Direct
15. Global Disaster Services, Inc. 409805 So. Evangeline Lane
Albert Isakson TR Sandy Suarez 11/23/15 | Beaumont, TX. 77706
409-656-9444
16. R. Reyes Trucking 2139 La Paloma Cut Off Rd.
TR Sandy Suarez 11/24/15 | San Benito, TX. 78586
rrevestruckina@amail.com
17. DRC Emergency Services, LLC 6258 Marshall Foch St.
Jolie ER Sandy Suarez 11/24/15 | New Orleans, LA 70124
504-482-2848 F 504-482-2852
Jolie@drcusa.com
18 D. Watson Companies 14050 Southern Rd Ste 500
IP Sandy Suarez 11/30/15 | Elmendorf, TX. 78112
Joel Gonzalez joelgonzalez@hotmail.com
956-388-0350
19 Pyramid Construction Services ER Sandy Suarez 12/01/15 | McAllen,TX 78501
Lucia 956-862-4670
Pcs8184@gmail.com
20 Nick -www.RFP4Free.biz ER Sandy Suarez 12/02/15 nick@netaaindresults.com
21 Saenz Construction TR Sandy Suarez 12/07/15 | 22290 N FM 88

Edcounch, TX. 78543
P-956-262-8506 F 956-262-6493
accounts@saenzutility.com

*VIA:

IN PERSON (IP)

E-MAIL (EM)

TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR)
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM)
FACSIMILE (FAX)
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