HIDALGO COUNTY
"JANITORIAL SUPPLIES INDUSTRIAL CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
RFB 2016-288-10-05-FAZ

PARTICIPATING VENDORS
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS Gulf Coast Paper - Brownsville, TX CC Distributors, Inc. - Corpus Christi, TX Unipak Corp. - Brooklyn, NY All American Poly - Piscataway, NJ
BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Q(t:);szer Unit Price Price per Case BRAND |Qty. per Case| Unit Price Price per Case
1 3M Green 6x9 Scouring Pads 20/box (96HP)or equal Americo 20 $0.26 $5.20 SSS 20 $0.27 $5.40 No Bid No Bid
2 3M Griddle Screens 10 per pack (200) or equal 3M 20 $0.35 $6.90 Nexstep 20 $2.40 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
3 Air Freshener - Aerosol Asst Scents Spartan 12 $2.67 $32.04 SSS 12 $2.85 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
4 Air Freshener - Time Mist Asst Scents 6.6 0z. Vectair 12 $3.02 $36.24 Airworks 12 $2.30 $27.60 No Bid No Bid
5 [Ant & Roach Spray Odorless Spartan 12 $3.86 $46.32 Raid 12 $4.04 $48.48 No Bid No Bid
6 IAnt & Roach Spray Odorless to contain deltamaetrin Spartan 12 $3.86 $46.32 Raid 12 $4.04 $48.48 No Bid No Bid
||7 Bowl Cleaner - Liquid (Non Acid) EPA Registered Spartan 12 $1.55 $18.60 SSS 12 $2.12 $25.44 No Bid No Bid
8 [[Bowl Cleaner - Liquid 23% - 26% HIC EPA Registered Spartan 12 $1.4750 $17.70 sss 12 $2.25 $27.00 No Bid No Bid
o |[Bowl Mops (Rayon) or equal Tolco 1 $0.60 $0.60 Wilen 144 $0.59 $84.96 No Bid No Bid
10 |[Brooms (Plastic Angle) or equal Unisan 12 $7.05 $84.60 Wilen 12 $5.50 $66.00 No Bid No Bid
11 |[Brooms - Janitorial Straw Unisan 12 $7.80 $93.60 SSS 12 $5.87 $70.44 No Bid No Bid
12 ||Brooms Maids Straw (Waco) or equal Unisan 12 $6.90 $82.80 Lasswell 12 $5.40 $64.80 No Bid No Bid
13 |(carpet Shampoo - Liquid Ammonia Free Spartan 4 $6.63 $26.52 SSS 4 $11.19 $44.76 No Bid No Bid
14 |[Carpet Powder & Deodorizer Big D 12 $2.65 $31.80 SSS 12 $2.35 $28.20 No Bid No Bid
15 |[carpet Shampoo Liquid Spartan 4 $6.63 $26.52 SSS 4 $11.19 $44.76 No Bid No Bid
16 |lCarpet Spot Remover 32 oz Spartan 12 $1.65 $19.80 SSS 12 $3.51 $42.12 No Bid No Bid
17 |[carroll Heavy Duty Chemical Deodorant 4/1 Gallons or equal Carroll 4 $11.00 $44.00 SSS 4 $13.65 $54.60 No Bid No Bid
18 ||Cleaner - Diversey General Purpose 4/1 Gallons or equal Diversey 4 $9.60 $38.40 SSS 4 $9.08 $36.32 No Bid No Bid
19 |[[Cleaner Oven 24 oz. Foam Cleaner Spartan 12 $3.10 $37.20 SSS 12 $3.28 $39.36 No Bid No Bid
20 |[Cleaner Stainless Steel waterless based Spartan 12 $3.58 $42.96 Hillyard 12 $3.38 $40.56 No Bid No Bid
21 |[Continental 18" Rubber Floor squeegee (1800) or equal Continental 1 $13.50 $13.50 Continental 2 $12.00 $24.00 No Bid No Bid
22 ||Continental 24" Rubber Floor squeegee (2400) or equal Continental 1 $14.50 $14.50 Continental 2 $14.00 $28.00 No Bid No Bid
23 |[Degreaser - 55 Gallon Spartan 1 $252.00 $252.00 SSS 55 $4.92 $270.60 No Bid No Bid
24 ||Detergent - Colgate Palmolive Dishwashing 12 / 32 or equal Palmolive 9-828ml $3.00 $27.00 Palmolive 9-280z $2.90 $26.10 No Bid No Bid
25 ||Detergent Power Dishwashing (Cream Suds) or equivalent - 50 Ib box Cream Suds 1 $116.00 $116.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26  |IDetergent Pot & Pan 2-Ltr. Clean On The Go (Spar Clean) or equal Spartan Cl 4 $9.95 $39.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 ||Dish Sanitizer 2-Ltr Sani-T (Spar Clean) or equal Spartan CI 4 $10.39 $41.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 ||Di5hwashing Capsules - US Chemicals 6 / 8 Ib (failsafe) or equal No Bid Amer Chem 4 $23.33 $93.32 No Bid No Bid
29 |[Dishwashing Liquid 32 oz. (Dawn) or equal Spartan 12 $3.25 $39.00 Dawn 8 $5.12 $40.96 No Bid No Bid
30 ||Di5hwa5hing Liquid 42 oz. (Dawn) or equal Palmolive 9 $3.00 $27.00 Dawn 8 $5.12 $40.96 No Bid No Bid
31 |[Disinfectant & Deodorizer Cleaner Aerosol Claire 12/15.50z $2.1660 $26.00 SSS 12-190z $2.73 $32.76 No Bid No Bid
32 ||Di5infectant Cleaner Carrol Clear Pine Mop 4/1 GAL (Pinel) or equal Tidal Wave 4 $8.25 $33.00 Quest 4 $7.20 $28.80 No Bid No Bid
33 ||Disinfectant Cleaner Carrol Clear Lemon Mop 4/1 Gal (Lemon1) or equal Tidal Wave 4 $9.25 $37.00 Quest 4 $7.20 $28.80 No Bid No Bid
34 ||Disinfectant Deodorant Spray - Hospital (Tuberculicial Rated) Spartan 12 $2.91 $34.92 Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56 No Bid No Bid
35 |[Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Aerosol - Hospital (1 Minute Kill time) Spartan 12 $2.91 $34.92 Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56 No Bid No Bid
36 |[Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Hospital Spartan 12 $2.91 $34.92 Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56 No Bid No Bid
37 |[Disinfectant Foam Cleaner - Hospital Spartan 12 $2.43 $29.16 SSS 12 $2.73 $32.76 No Bid No Bid
38 ||Disinfectant - Cleaning compound for Animal Cage - Consume Eco-Lyzer (Spartan) or Spartan 4 $11.58 $46.32 SSS 4 $26.83 $107.32 No Bid No Bid
39 |[Disinfectant / Deodorant Spray - Diversely 12/15 oz. (Endbaci) or equal Diversey 12 $4.98 $59.76 Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56 No Bid No Bid
40 |[Disinfectant / Cleaner 1 qt. Non-Acid Bathroom Cleaner Spartan 12 $1.55 $18.60 SSS 12 $2.28 $27.36 No Bid No Bid
41 |[Dispenser - Air Freshener Time Mist Vectair 1 $24.50 $24.50 Hillyard 12 $18.00 $216.00 No Bid No Bid
42 ||Dispenser - Roll Paper Towel - Lever or Crank (Metal or Plastic) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 |[Dispensers - Liquid Hand Soap (Bulk Soap) Spartan 1 $11.55 $11.55 Continental 12 $12.00 $144.00 No Bid No Bid
44 |[Dispensers - Paper Towels Multi Fold Universal (Metal) Georgia Pac 1 $19.74 $19.74 Continental 6 $28.48 $170.88 No Bid No Bid
45 |[Dispensers - Paper Towels Multi Fold Universal (Plastic) Georgia Pac 1 $21.00 $21.00 Bobrick 1 $21.80 $21.80 No Bid No Bid
46 |[Dust Cloths - (Disposable) Yw Georgia Pac 200 $0.2880 $57.60 Chicopee 2 $27.35 $54.70 No Bid No Bid
47 _ |[Dust Cloths - Non Disposable No Bid SSS 24 $0.89 $21.36 No Bid No Bid
48 |[Dust Mop 24" x 3 Disposable No Bid SSS 12 $5.11 $61.32 No Bid No Bid
49 ||Dust Mop 24" x 5 Non - Disposable JRubbermaid 12 $12.00 $144.00 SSS 12 $6.69 $80.28 No Bid No Bid
50  |[Dust Mop 24" x 3 Non - Disposable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 |[Dust Mop 24" x 5 Disposable Wilen 12 $5.70 $68.40 Wilen 12 $4.15 $49.80 No Bid No Bid
52 ||Dust Mop Frames 24 x 5 Wilen 12 $2.15 $25.80 SSS 12 $2.00 $24.00 No Bid No Bid
53 |IDust Mop Handles - Swivel Snap On Wilen 12 $5.40 $64.80 Wilen 12 $5.40 $64.80 No Bid No Bid
54 |[Dust Mop Treatment (Aerosol) Spartan 12-160z $3.09 $37.08 SSS 12 $3.18 $38.16 No Bid No Bid
55  |[Dust Mop Treatment TRU Equal Spartan 12 $1.88 $22.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 |[Dust Pan Metal - Lobby or equal Continental 1 $16.70 $16.70 Continental 6 $15.87 $95.22 No Bid No Bid
57 |[Dust Pan Plastic - Lobby or equal Continental 1 $7.40 $7.40 Nexstep 6 $7.76 $46.56 No Bid No Bid
58 ||Enzyme Deodorizers - per gallon Liquid Spartan 4 $8.70 $34.80 SSS 4 $8.93 $35.72 No Bid No Bid
59 |[Feather Duster Extensions 12 ft Urger 1 $42.62 $42.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 |[Feather Duster Extensions 8ft Unisan 1 $8.20 $8.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
I61 [[Feather Duster 21 inch Ostrich or equal Lambkin 1 $5.50 $5.50 Boardwalk 12 $15.04 $180.48 No Bid No Bid
|62 |IFeather Duster 26 inch Ostrich or equal Unisan 1 $5.50 $5.50 Broadwalk 12 $20.48 $245.76 No Bid No Bid
63 |[F1oor Cleaner - Diversey Citrus Stride Neutral 5 gal Bx (Stride%) or equal No Bid SSS 2-25 $6.76 $33.60 No Bid No Bid
"64 "Floor Cleaner - Diversey Floral Fragrance Natural 4 / 1 Gal (FLStride14) or equal Diversey 4 $5.20 $20.80 SSS 4 $6.60 $26.40 No Bid No Bid
65 |[F10or Finish / Wax - Diversey 5 Gal (Vectra5) or equal Diversey 1 $68.97 $68.97 SSS 2-2.5 $14.41 $72.05 No Bid No Bid
Il66 |[Floor Finish - 1 gal SunnySide1 (Spartan) or equal Spartan 4 $10.56 $42.24 SSS 4 $15.87 $63.48 No Bid No Bid
67 [[Furniture Polish Aerosol Spartan 12 $2.61 $31.32 Hillyard 12 $2.49 $29.88 No Bid No Bid
Il6s |[Glass Cleaner - Liquid Concentrate (Spartan) or equal Spartan 4 $8.35 $33.40 SSS 4 $8.00 $32.00 No Bid No Bid
69 [[Glass Cleaner RTU - 32 oz (Spartan ) or equal Spartan 12 $1.77 $21.24 SSS 12 $2.20 $26.40 No Bid No Bid
I[70 [|Hand Cleaner - Waterless Gojo 6 $14.83 $88.93 Gojo 6 $14.80 $88.80 No Bid No Bid
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PARTICIPATING VENDORS
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS Gulf Coast Paper - Brownsville, TX CC Distributors, Inc. - Corpus Christi, TX Unipak Corp. - Brooklyn, NY All American Poly - Piscataway, NJ
BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Q(t:);szer Unit Price Price per Case BRAND |Qty. per Case| Unit Price Price per Case
71 |[Hanging Toilet Bowl Blocks Frech 12 $0.8170 $9.80 Boardwalk 12 $8.75 $105.00 - No Bid No Bid
72 |[Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent (for Commercial Laundry System) Spartan 5 $11.00 $55.00 Amer Chem 5 $19.89 $99.45 No Bid No Bid
73 ||Janit0ria| Cart w/Yellow Vinyl Bag - Rubbermaid (6173) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $128.00 $128.00 Continental 1 $99.99 $99.99 No Bid No Bid
74 |[Mop Bucket Combo Std Size (Rubbermaid 7580) or equal Continental 1 $45.62 $45.62 Continental 1 $45.00 $45.00 No Bid No Bid
75 |[Down Press Wringer 35 Qt. Bucket (Wave Brake) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $70.00 $70.00 R-Maid 1 $61.45 $61.45 No Bid No Bid
76 |[Mop Bucket 35 Qt. (Wave Brake) w/3" casters or equal Rubbermaid 1 $45.00 $45.00 R-Maid 1 $61.45 $61.45 No Bid No Bid
77 ||Mop Handles Fiber Glass 54"Jr. Etc. or equal Impact 81 12 $15.14 $181.68 SSS 12 $9.98 $119.76 No Bid No Bid
78 |[Mop Handles Wood 54" Junior Unisan 12 $5.90 $70.80 SSS 12 $6.20 $74.40 No Bid No Bid
79 |[Mop Head Cotton - Size 16 oz. Wilen 12 $2.48 $29.76 SSS 12 $2.13 $25.56 No Bid No Bid
80 |[Mop Head Cotton - Size 24 oz. Wilen 12 $3.60 $43.26 SSS 12 $3.01 $36.12 No Bid No Bid
81 |[Mop Head Cotton - Size 32 oz. Wilen 12 $4.83 $57.96 SSS 12 $3.84 $46.08 No Bid No Bid
|IB2]{Mop Head Rayon Size 16 oz. Wilen 12 $3.60 $43.20 SSS 12 $3.00 $36.00 No Bid No Bid
|83 |[Mop Head Rayon Size 24 oz. Wilen 12 $5.30 $63.60 SSS 12 $4.39 $52.68 No Bid No Bid
|84 ]IMop Head Rayon Size 32 oz. Wilen 12 $6.90 $82.80 SSS 12 $5.48 $65.76 No Bid No Bid
Il85 |[Mosquito Repellent Lotion No Bid Off 12 $5.31 $63.72 No Bid No Bid
|86 ]IMosquito Repellent Spray Off Deep 12 $5.37 $64.44 Deep Wood 12 $5.49 $65.88 No Bid No Bid
|87 |lodor Eliminator - Non Aerosol Spartan 12 $1.85 $22.20 SSS 4 $13.65 $54.60 No Bid No Bid
|88 ][Premium Foam Antibacterial Soap Refill (GOJ536202) or equal Gojo 2 $23.50 $47.00 Gojo 2 $23.00 $46.00 No Bid No Bid
|89 [[Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill (GOJ545604) or equal Purell 2/1200ml $32.50 $65.00 Gojo 4/1200ml $19.30 $77.20 No Bid No Bid
||90 Royal Griddle Bricks for Cleaning Grills 12 box (GBRICK) or equal Royal 12 $1.97 $23.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
[l91 Saddle Bag (SB8.5 Clr 6.5 x 7) or equal Tidi 2,000 $0.0140 $28.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
[l92 Scouring Sponges Yw/Green Standard Size 3M or equal 3M 20 $1.72 $34.40 Norton 4 $8.13 $32.52 No Bid No Bid
|lo3 Scrubbing Cleansers 21 oz (Comet) or equal Ajax 24 $1.12 $26.88 Ajax 24 $1.1250 $27.00 No Bid No Bid
||94 Soap - Liquid Hand Antibacterial per gallon (pearl hand cleaner) or equal Spartan 4 $7.66 $30.64 SSS 4 $8.38 $33.52 No Bid No Bid
||95 Soap Anti Bacterial - Bar 3.5 0z. (1,000 per case) Safeguard 48 $0.75 $36.00 Dial 72 $0.98 $70.56 No Bid No Bid
[lo6 Soap Bar 75 0z. - (1,000 per case) Sweet Bouq 1,000 $0.0680 $68.00 Boardwalk 1,000 $0.0540 $54.00 No Bid No Bid
|l97 Soap Hand - Liquid (Bag in Box) Inopak 12 $2.00 $24.00 SSS 12 $2.53 $30.36 No Bid No Bid
||98 Spartan 15% Orange Tough Cleaner / Degreaser 12 / 32 0z (OT15QT) or equal Spartan 12 $2.86 $34.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 Spartan antiseptic / antibacterial hand soap 4/1 gal (Anti-Hsoap1) or equal Spartan 4 $9.05 $36.20 SSS 4 $8.38 $33.52 No Bid No Bid
100 Spartan bounce back floor finish restorer 4/1 gal (Bouncel) or equal Spartan 4 $12.39 $49.56 SSS 4 $10.97 $43.88 No Bid No Bid
101 Spartan Foamy Q&A phosphoric acid shower cleaner 12/32 oz (Foamy RTU) or equal Foamy 12 $2.43 $29.16 SSS 12 $2.61 $31.32 No Bid No Bid
102  [[Spartan Fresh Scent Deodorant spray 12/18 oz (Airfresh AER) or equal Spartan 12 $2.60 $31.20 SSS 12 $2.95 $35.40 No Bid No Bid
103 Spray Bottles - 24 oz. empty bottles or equal Tolco 1 $0.47 $0.47 Continental 100 $0.42 $42.00 No Bid No Bid
104  [|Spray Bottles - 32 oz. empty bottles or equal Tolco 1 $0.59 $0.59 Continental 100 $0.52 $52.00 No Bid No Bid
105 Pump #10 1 oz. 1 gal. #10 Tube or equal Contico 1 $1.60 $1.60 Continental 144 $1.50 $216.00 No Bid No Bid
106  [[Toilet Dispenser Universal (12" Jumbo Toilet Tissue) Georgia Pac 1 $15.00 $15.00 Bay West 1 $25.00 $25.00 No Bid No Bid
107 Toilet Seat Covers Hospeco 5,000 $0.0056 $28.00 Nutrend 20 $1.97 $39.40 No Bid No Bid
108  [[Trash Can 55 Gal - XX Large 28 x 58 1.5 Mil Berry 100 $0.22 $21.50 SSS 100 $0.3142 $31.42 No Bid No Bid
109 Trash Can & Lids 16 Gal Rubbermaid 1 $27.00 $27.00 Continental 4 $46.70 $186.80 No Bid No Bid
110 Trash Can & Lids 32 Gallon (Rubbermaid) or equal Continental 1 $24.55 $24.55 Continental 6 $25.52 $153.12 No Bid No Bid
111 Trash Cans 10-Gal Rubbermaid 1 $7.37 $7.37 Continental 6 $8.45 $50.70 No Bid No Bid
112 [|Urinal Block w/Screens Frech 12 $1.58 $18.96 Nutrend 12 $15.60 $187.20 No Bid No Bid
113 ||Urina| Blocks (Blocks Only) Frech 12 $0.81 $9.72 Nutrend 12 $4.25 $51.00 No Bid No Bid
114 Urinal Deodorant Screens - Screens Only Tolco 12 $0.75 $9.00 Nutrend 12 $9.53 $114.36 No Bid No Bid
115  [[Wasp/Hornet Spray Spartan 12-170z $3.55 $42.60 Enforcer 12-160z $3.92 $43.92 No Bid No Bid
116  ||Wasp/Hornet Spray - 20 ft Stream Spartan 12 $3.55 $42.60 Enforcer 12 $3.92 $43.92 No Bid No Bid
117  ||Wax Stripper Floor Finish Liquid - High Speed (Vectea) (Johnson & Johnson) or equal Spartan 4 $10.38 $41.52 SSS 2-2.5 $14.41 $72.05 No Bid No Bid
118 Baggies % Size Slider Bag Ziploc Snack Bags (Hefty) or equal Reynolds 250 $0.0790 $19.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
119 ||Baggies 4" x 4" Enono Zip (Ziploc Regular Sandwich Bags) or equal Huckster 1,000 $0.0965 $9.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
120  |[Baggies Ziploc 16x11 Gallon Size (Hefty) or equal Reynolds 250 $0.0830 $20.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
121 ||Baggies Ziploc 7x8 Quart Size (Hefty) or equal Reynolds 500 $0.0512 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
122 |[Baggies Freezer Bags 10x11 - 200 ct (Quick Seal) or equal Reynolds 200 $0.11 $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
123 |[Butcher Paper 24" B&H Supp 1000' $0.0265 $26.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
124 |[Facial Tissue (Georgia Pacific) equal or better Georgia Pac 30/100 $0.5830 $17.49 Bay West 30 $0.6173 $18.52 No Bid No Bid
125 ||Fi|m Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 2,000 ft. (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 2000 $0.0083 $16.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 |[Film Wrap 18"x3000 - Heavy Duty (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 3000’ $0.0092 $27.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 |[Foam Bowls 60z. w/lids Dart 1,000 $0.0490 $49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
128 |[Foil Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 500 ft (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 500' $0.0550 $27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
129 ||Foi| Wrap Potato (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 3000' $0.0173 $51.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
130 [[Laced Dollies (different sizes and types) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
131 ||Menu Tissue 12 x 12 Bag Craft 10,000 $0.0084 $84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 |[Napkins 2 Ply Quarter Fold (Georgia Pacific) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
133 ||Pactiv or equal 9 x 6 5.2.75 foam hinged Tray Pactiv 150 $0.11 $16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
134 |[Pan Liners (Dispozo) 1,000 cs Bag Craft 1,000 $0.0390 $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
135 ||Paper Bags #10 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.0270 $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
136 |[Paper Bags #4 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.0154 $7.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
137 ||Paper Bags #8 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.0220 $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 |[Paper Bags 1 /6 BBL Brown 1657 (Duro) or equal Duro 400 $0.09 $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
139 ||Paper Bags 6Ibs. Brown 6BG (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.02 $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
140  |[Paper Cups Portion 10 oz (Solo) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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PARTICIPATING VENDORS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS Gulf Coast Paper - Brownsville, TX CC Distributors, Inc. - Corpus Christi, TX Unipak Corp. - Brooklyn, NY All American Poly - Piscataway, NJ
BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Q(t:);szer Unit Price Price per Case BRAND |Qty. per Case| Unit Price Price per Case
141 [|Paper Roll Towels Kitchen (Scott 1159) or equal Georgia Pac 30 $0.80 $24.00 Bay West 30 $0.7440 $22.32 B No Bid No Bid
142 |[Paper Towels Brown Rolls Standard Size (Georgia Pacific) or equal SCA 12 $1.46 $17.52 Bay West 12/350' $0.5710 $17.12 No Bid No Bid
143 ||Paper Towels Multi Fold NPS 4,000 $0.0037 $14.80 Bay West 16 $0.9530 $15.25 No Bid No Bid
144 ||Paper Towels Multi Fold White Bleached 9.25x9.5 NPS 4,000 $0.0044 $17.60 Bay West 16 $1.2430 $19.88 No Bid No Bid
145 Paper Towels (GEP89460) En-motion high capacity - white 10x800 or equal Georgia Pac No Specs No Specs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
146 Styrofoam Bowl - 6 0z 1,000 case Dart 1,000 $0.03 $30.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
147 Styrofoam Bowl - 12 oz (Pacific 1-0012) equal or better Pactiv 1,000 $0.0200 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
148 Styrofoam Cup 8 0z (8J8) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.02 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
149 Styrofoam Cups oz. ((UJ4) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.0170 $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
150 Styrofoam Plates 6" Laminated Pactiv 1,000 $0.0223 $22.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
151 Styrofoam Plates 6" Un-Laminated Pactiv 1,000 $0.0174 $17.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
152 Styrofoam Plates 9" Divided (MobilTJ1-0011) or equal Pactiv 500 $0.0349 $17.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
153 Styrofoam Plates 9" Laminated No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
154 Styrofoam Plates 9" Un-Laminated Pactiv 500 $0.0349 $17.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
155 DlyIUIIUdIII TTdy TTITYTES JAIXS TTITET bUlllpa'l UTETIT WU (Falliv T T 1I9U5 ) LOU LS UT PaCtiV 150 $009 $1350 NO Bld NO Bld NO Bld
156 Styrofoam Hinged Lid container 9 3/6 in. x 6 1/2 in. x 2 3/4 in. rectangular white 150/case Pactiv 150 $0.11 $16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
157 Toilet Tissue (12/1000 Jr Jumbo) (Georgia Pacific) or equal SCA 12 $2.00 $24.00 Bay West 12 $2.0070 $24.08 No Bid No Bid
158 Toilet Tissue 2 Ply Small Short Sheet (Georgia Pacific) or equal Georgia Pac 96/500 $0.3200 $30.72 Bay West 96/500 $0.36 $35.55 No Bid No Bid
159 Toilet Tissue (6/Jumbo 2000 ft) (Georgia Pacific) or equal SCA 6 $4.80 $28.80 Bay West 6 $4.33 $25.98 No Bid No Bid
160 Utensils Forks - Plastic 2,000 ct (James River WN F2P) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
161 ||Utensi|s Forks - Plastic Dispozo - medium 1,000 ct (Solo or equal) D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
162 ||Utensi|s Forks - Plastic Medium weight white 1,000 ct (Solor or equal) D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
163 |[Utensils Forks Clear 1,000 ct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
164 |[Utensils Spoons Plastic (Solo) or equal D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
165 ||Utensils Spoons Plastic 1,000 ct. (Solo) or equal D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
166 ||Utensi|s Spoons Plastic Dispozo Medium WMS 1,000 ct or equal D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
167  |[Utensils Spoons Plastic Medium Weight white 1,000 ct D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
168 Utensils Party Packs (Spoons, Forks, Knife, Napkin, Salt & Pepper) D&W Pack 250 $0.07 $17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
169 Vented Lid Dart (12J12) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.0142 $14.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
170  ||Vented Lid Dart (8J8) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.0112 $11.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
171  [[Vented Lid Dart (20JL) 10/100 case or equal Dart 1,000 $0.019 $19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
172 [[wipers Workhorse Rags (Kimberly Clark) or equal KC 912 $0.0578 $52.71 Kimberly 152 $0.1639 $24.91 No Bid No Bid
173 \Wipers (Kimberly Clark) 15x16.5 white (300 cs) (K41100) or equal KC 300 $0.11 $33.00 Kimberly 300 $0.1267 $38.01 No Bid No Bid
174  [|Body Shampoo - Per gallon Spartan 4 $7.66 $30.64 SSS 4 $8.49 $33.96 No Bid No Bid
175 |[Deodorant - Hygiene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
176 |[Lice Killer - Aerosol No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
177 Razors - Double Edged No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
178 Sanitary Napkings Maxi No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or equal) Hospeco 250 $0.11 $28.50 Nutrend 250 $0.1260 $31.50 No Bid No Bid
179  [|Sanitary Napkins Panty Liners No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180 Sanitary Napkins Super No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or equal) Hospeco 250 $0.11 $27.50 Nutrend 250 $0.1260 $31.50 No Bid No Bid
181 Sanitary Napkins Thin No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc, or equal) Hospeco 250 $0.11 $27.50 Nutrend 250 $0.1260 $31.50 No Bid No Bid
182 Shaving Cream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
183 Toothbrush Firm - Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
184 Toothbrush Medium Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
185 Toothbrush Soft Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
186 Toothpaste Std Size, Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
188  ||Americo 20" Beige Ultra High Speed Burnishing Pads 5/bx(20MUHSTBP) or equal Americo 5 $2.7320 $13.66 Norton 5/cs $2.71 $13.55 No Bid No Bid
189  [|Buffing Pads 17" White Americo 5 $2.06 $10.30 Norton 5/cs $2.29 $11.45 No Bid No Bid
190 "Buffing Pads 20" White Americo 5 $2.7320 $13.66 Norton 5lcs $2.71 $13.55 No Bid No Bid
191 "Filters Windsor Exhaust for Sensor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner (5143EF) or equal Karcler 1 $11.45 $11.45 APC Jan 50/cs $1.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
192 Filters Windsor Micro Hygiene for Sensor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner (5301ER) or equal Karcler 1 $30.00 $30.00 APC Jan 25/cs $10.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid
193 Stripping Pads 17" Black Americo 5 $2.06 $10.30 Norton 5/cs $2.29 $11.45 No Bid No Bid
194 Stripping Pads 20" Black Americo 5 $2.7320 $13.66 Norton 5/cs $2.71 $13.55 No Bid No Bid
195 \VVac. BagsWindsor for Sensor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner 10pk (Johnson & Johnson) or equal Karcler 10 $2.0950 $20.95 APC Jan 10-10/cs $15.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
196 Gloves - Food Service Large Clear (Brand Name) Tidi 1,000 $0.0190 $19.00 Ambitex 20-500/cs $2.438 $48.75 No Bid No Bid
197 ||Gloves - Food Service Medium Clear (Brand Name) Tidi 1,000 $0.0190 $19.00 Ambitex 20-500/cs $2.438 $48.75 No Bid No Bid
198 [[Gloves - Latex Small Disposable (Ansell) Yw or equal Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00 Ambitex 10dz/cs $6.24 $62.40 No Bid No Bid
199 ||Gloves - Latex Large Disposable Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00 Ambitex 10dz/cs $6.24 $62.40 No Bid No Bid
200 ||Gloves - Latex Large Non -Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 12 $0.47 $5.64 Ambitex 12dz/cs $6.00 $72.00 No Bid No Bid
201 ||Gloves - Latex Medium Non Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 12 $0.47 $5.64 Ambitex 12dz/cs $6.00 $72.00 No Bid No Bid
202 ||Gloves - Latex Medium Disposable (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00 Ambitex 10dz/cs $6.24 $62.40 No Bid No Bid
203 "Gloves - Latex Small Non Disposable Yellow (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 12 $0.47 $5.64 Ambitex 12dz/cs $6.00 $72.00 No Bid No Bid
204 "Gloves Safety (Nitrile) SFZGNPRXL1M or equal Hospeco 1,000 $0.0491 $49.10 Ambitex 12dz/cs $11.02 $132.24 No Bid No Bid
205 "Gloves Vinyl, Small Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0220 $22.00 Ambitex 10-100/cs $22.00 $22.00 No Bid No Bid
206 "Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0220 $22.00 Ambitex 10-100/cs $22.00 $22.00 No Bid No Bid
207 "Gloves Vinyl, Large Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0220 $22.00 Ambitex 10-100/cs $22.00 $22.00 No Bid No Bid

BID TABULATION--Page 3




PARTICIPATING VENDORS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS Gulf Coast Paper - Brownsville, TX CC Distributors, Inc. - Corpus Christi, TX Unipak Corp. - Brooklyn, NY All American Poly - Piscataway, NJ
BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Qty. per Case Unit Price Price per Case BRAND Q(t:yésier Unit Price Price per Case BRAND |Qty. per Case| Unit Price Price per Case
208  ||Gloves Vinyl, Small Powder Free Hospeco 1,000 $0.0240 $23.50 Ambitex 10-100/cs $22.75 $22.75 No Bid No Bid
209  |[Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powder Free Hospeco 1,000 $0.0240 $23.50 Ambitex 10-100/cs $22.75 $22.75 No Bid No Bid
210  ||Gloves Vinyl, Large Powder Free Hospeco 1,000 $0.0240 $23.50 Ambitex 10-100/cs $22.75 $22.75 No Bid No Bid
211  ||Gloves Latex, Small Powder Free Hospeco 1,000 $0.0400 $39.74 Ambitex 10-100/cs $37.35 $37.35 No Bid No Bid
212  ||Gloves Latex, Medium Powder Free Hospeco 1,000 $0.0400 $39.74 Ambitex 10-100/cs $37.35 $37.35 No Bid No Bid
213  ||Gloves Latex, Large Powder Free Hospeco 1,000 $0.0400 $39.74 Ambitex 10-100/cs $37.35 $37.35 No Bid No Bid
214  |[Gloves Latex, Small Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00 Ambitex 10-100/cs $34.70 $34.70 No Bid No Bid
215  ||Gloves Latex, Medium Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00 Ambitex 10-100/cs $34.70 $34.70 No Bid No Bid
216  |[Gloves Latex, Large Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00 Ambitex 10-100/cs $34.70 $34.70 No Bid No Bid
217 Body Towels Standard Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
218 Hand Towels Standard Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
219 Trash Liners - 45 Gal X-Large 40x48 16 Mic High Density Can Liner Berry 250 $0.10 $24.00 SSS 250/cs $0.1087 $27.18 UPC 250 $0.09196 $22.99 All Amer. Poly| 150 $17.09
220  |[Trash Liners - Pitt Plastics 23x33 12-16 gal Black 1000 cs (32 BL) or equal Pitt 1,000 $0.0320 $31.61 SSS 1000/cs $0.0253 $25.30 UPC 1,000 $0.0245 $24.50 All Amer. Poly| 500 $23.50
221 Trash Liners - Large Trash Can 13 MIC 30x37 High Density Can Liners Berry 500 $0.0430 $21.30 SSS 500/cs $0.0478 $23.90 UpPC 500 $0.04396 $21.98 All Amer. Poly| 250 $16.46
222 Trash Liners - Large Trash Can 16 MIC 33 Gal 33x40 Hgh Density Can Liners Berry 250 $0.0660 $16.50 SSS 250/cs $0.7530 $18.82 UPC 250 $0.06996 $17.49 All Amer. Poly| 250 $19.58
223 |[Trash Liners - Tall Trash Can 8 MIC 24x33 High Density Can Liners Berry 1,000 $0.0220 $21.94 SSS 1000/cs $0.0223 $22.30 UPC 1,000 $0.0208 $20.80 All Amer. Poly| 500 $24.93
224 Trash Liners - 1.5 MIL 38x58 Black Berry 1,000 $0.2150 No Bid SSS 100/cs $0.25 $25.00 UPC 100 $0.2295 $22.95 All Amer. Poly| 100 $16.05
225 Toilet Brushes - (Standard Size) Plastic Rubbermaid 1 $1.60 $1.60 Continental 12/cs $2.15 $25.80 No Bid No Bid
226 Toilet Brushes - Hard Bristle Bowl Brush (0310) (Rubbermaid) or equal Rubbermaid 1 $1.60 $1.60 Rubbermaid 24]/cs $2.40 $57.60 No Bid No Bid
227 \Weed Killer (Round Up) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
228 \Weed Killer 55 Gallon concentrated - Specify Dilution No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
229 Spartan Sanitize Quart Food Service 12/32 oz (SRTU) or equal Spartan 12 $1.75 $21.00 AmerChem 6-gt/cs $3.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid
230 Sprayer (Trigger/Nozzles Only) Red & White Tolco 1 $0.40 $0.40 Continental 200/cs $0.41 $82.00 No Bid No Bid
231 Bleach Disinfectant Cleaner Dry Air - Hospital Pure Bright 6 $1.8330 $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
232 "Bleach Pure Bright Disinfection 6/cs (6BLCH) or equal Pure Bright 6 $1.8330 $11.00 KIK Pure 6-gal/cs $1.77 $10.62 No Bid No Bid
233 ||Bio Hazard Bag Red 40x48 3 mil Berry 50 $0.5200 $26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
234 ||Di5infectant Wipes (Lysol) or equal Clorox 450 $0.0660 $29.70 Clorox 6-75ct/cs $5.11 $30.66 No Bid No Bid
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