CC DISTRIBUTORS, INC., Corpus Christi, TX

AWARDED ITEMS

RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ
“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

UNIT PRICE PER
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY. PRICE CASE
2 | 3M Griddle Screens 10 per pack (200) or equal Nexstep 20 $2.40 $48.00
4 | Air Freshener - Time Mist Asst. Scents 6.6 o0z. Airworks 12 $2.30 $27.60
9 | Bowl Mops (Rayon) or equal Wilen 144 $0.59 $84.96
10 | Brooms (Plastic Angle) or equal Wilen 12 $5.50 $66.00
11 | Brooms - Janitorial Straw SSS 12 $5.87 $70.44
12 | Brooms Maids Straw (Waco) or equal Lasswell 12 $5.40 $64.80
14 | Carpet Powder & Deodorizer SSS 12 $2.35 $28.20
18 | Cleaner - Diversey General Purpose 4/1 Gallons or equal SSS 4 $9.08 $36.32
20 | Cleaner Stainless Steel waterless based Hillyard 12 $3.38 $40.56
21 | Continental 18" Rubber Floor squeegee (1800) or equal Continental 2 $12.00 $24.00
22 | Continental 24" Rubber Floor squeegee (2400) or equal Continental 2 $14.00 $28.00
24 | Detergent - Colgate Palmolive Dishwashing 12 / 32 or equal Palmolive 9-280z $2.90 $26.10
28 | Dishwashing Capsules — US Chemicals 6/8 1b. (Failsafe) or equal Amer Chem 4 $23.33 $93.32
30 | Dishwashing Liquid 42 oz. (Dawn) or equal Dawn 8 $5.12 $40.96
32 | Disinfectant Cleaner Carrol Clear Pine Mop 4/1 GAL (Pinel) or equal Quest 4 $7.20 $28.80
33 | Disinfectant Cleaner Carrol Clear Lemon Mop 4/1 Gal (Lemon1) or equal Quest 4 $7.20 $28.80
34 | Disinfectant Deodorant Spray - Hospital (Tuberculicial Rated) Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56
35 | Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Aerosol - Hospital (1 Minute Kill time) Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56
36 | Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Hospital Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56
39 | Disinfectant / Deodorant Spray - Diversely 12/15 oz. (Endbacl) or equal Hillyard 12 $2.88 $34.56
41 | Dispenser - Air Freshener Time Mist Hillyard 12 $18.00 $216.00
42 | Dispenser - Roll Paper Towel - Lever or Crank (Metal or Plastic) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 | Dust Cloths - Non Disposable SSS 24 $0.89 $21.36
48 | Dust Mop 24" x 3 Disposable SSS 12 $5.11 $61.32
49 | Dust Mop 24" x 5 Non - Disposable SSS 12 $6.69 $80.28
50 | Dust Mop 24" x 3 Non - Disposable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 | Dust Mop 24" x 5 Disposable Wilen 12 $4.15 $49.80
52 | Dust Mop Frames 24 x 5 SSS 12 $2.00 $24.00
53 | Dust Mop Handles - Swivel Snap On Wilen 12 $5.40 $64.80
56 | Dust Pan Metal - Lobby or equal Continental 6 $15.87 $95.22
63 | Floor Cleaner - Diversey Citrus Stride Neutral 5 gal Bx. (Stride%) or equal SSS 2-2.5 $6.76 $33.60
68 | Glass Cleaner - Liquid Concentrate (Spartan) or equal SSS 4 $8.00 $32.00
70 | Hand Cleaner - Waterless Gojo 6 $14.80 $88.80
71 | Hanging Toilet Bowl Blocks Boardwalk 12 $8.75 $105.00
73 | Janitorial Cart w/Yellow Vinyl Bag - Rubbermaid (6173) or equal Continental 1 $99.99 $99.99
74 | Mop Bucket Combo Std. Size (Rubbermaid 7580) or equal Continental 1 $45.00 $45.00
75 | Down Press Wringer 35 Qt. Bucket (Wave Brake) or equal R-Maid 1 $61.45 $61.45
77 | Mop Handles Fiber Glass 54"Jr. Etc. or equal SSS 12 $9.98 $119.76
79 | Mop Head Cotton - Size 16 oz. SSS 12 $2.13 $25.56
80 | Mop Head Cotton - Size 24 oz. SSS 12 $3.01 $36.12
81 | Mop Head Cotton - Size 32 oz. SSS 12 $3.84 $46.08
82 | Mop Head Rayon Size 16 oz. SSS 12 $3.00 $36.00
83 | Mop Head Rayon Size 24 oz. SSS 12 $4.39 $52.68
84 | Mop Head Rayon Size 32 oz. SSS 12 $5.48 $65.76
85 | Mosquito Repellent Lotion Off 12 $5.31 $63.72
88 | Premium Foam Antibacterial Soap Refill (GOJ536202) or equal Gojo 2 $23.00 $46.00
89 | Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill (GOJ545604) or equal Gojo 4/1200ml $19.30 $77.20
92 | Scouring Sponges Yw/Green Standard Size 3M or equal Norton 4 $8.13 $32.52
96 | Soap Bar 75 oz. - (1,000 per case) Boardwalk 1,000 $0.0540 $54.00
99 | Spartan antiseptic / antibacterial hand soap 4/1 gal (Anti-Hsoap1) or equal SSS 4 $8.38 $33.52
100 | Spartan bounce back floor finish restorer 4/1 gal (Bouncel) or equal SSS 4 $10.97 $43.88
103 | Spray Bottles - 24 oz. empty bottles or equal Continental 100 $0.42 $42.00
104 | Spray Bottles - 32 oz. empty bottles or equal Continental 100 $0.52 $52.00
105 | Pump #10 1 oz. 1 gal. #10 Tube or equal Continental 144 $1.50 $216.00
112 | Urinal Block w/Screens Nutrend 12 $15.60 $187.20
113 | Urinal Blocks (Blocks Only) Nutrend 12 $4.25 $51.00
121 | Baggies Ziploc 7x8 Quart Size (Hefty) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CC DISTRIBUTORS, INC., Corpus Christi, TX

“CONTINUED” AWARDED ITEMS

RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ
“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

UNIT PRICE PER
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY. PRICE CASE

130 | Laced Dollies (different sizes and types) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 | Napkins 2 Ply Quarter Fold (Georgia Pacific) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
140 | Paper Cups Portion 10 oz. (Solo) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 | Paper Roll Towels Kitchen (Scott 11s9) or equal Bay West 30 $0.7440 $22.32
142 | Paper Towels Brown Rolls Standard Size (Georgia Pacific) or equal Bay West 12/350' $0.5710 $17.12
145 E(?E;r Towels (GEP89460) En-motion high capacity - white 10x800 or No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
153 | Styrofoam Plates 9" Laminated No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
159 | Toilet Tissue (6/Jumbo 2000 ft.) (Georgia Pacific) or equal Bay West 6 $4.33 $25.98
160 | Utensils Forks - Plastic 2,000 ct. (James River WN F2P) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
163 | Utensils Forks Clear 1,000 ct. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
175 | Deodorant - Hygiene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
176 | Lice Killer - Aerosol No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
177 | Razors - Double Edged No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
179 | Sanitary Napkins Panty Liners No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
182 | Shaving Cream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
183 | Toothbrush Firm - Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
184 | Toothbrush Medium Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
185 | Toothbrush Soft Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
186 | Toothpaste Std. Size, Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 | Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Americo 20" Beige Ultra High Speed Burnishing Pads 5/box
188 | (OMUHSTBP) fr cqual g Sp J Norton 5 $2.71 $13.55
190 | Buffing Pads 20" White Norton 5 $2.71 $13.55
191 Zcilll’izs Windsor Exhaust for Sensor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner (5143EF) or APC Jan 50 $1.00 $50.00
192 Filters Windsor Micro Hygiene for Sensor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner APC Jan 25 $10.00 $250.00

(5301ER) or equal
194 | Stripping Pads 20" Black Norton 5 $2.71 $13.55
195 Vac. Bags Windsor for Sensor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner 10pk (Johnson & APC Jan 10 $15.00 $150.00

Johnson) or equal
196 | Gloves - Food Service Large Clear (Brand Name) Ambitex 20-500/cs. $2.438 $48.75
197 | Gloves - Food Service Medium Clear (Brand Name) Ambitex 20-500/cs. $2.438 $48.75
205 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powdered Ambitex 10-100/cs. $22.00 $22.00
206 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powdered Ambitex 10-100/cs. $22.00 $22.00
207 | Gloves Vinyl, Large Powdered Ambitex 10-100/cs. $22.00 $22.00
208 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powder Free Ambitex 10-100/cs. $22.75 $22.75
209 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powder Free Ambitex 10-100/cs. $22.75 $22.75
210 | Gloves Vinyl, Large Powder Free Ambitex 10-100/cs. $22.75 $22.75
211 Gloves Latex, Small Powder Free Ambitex 10-100/cs. $37.35 $37.35
212 | Gloves Latex, Medium Powder Free Ambitex 10-100/cs. $37.35 $37.35
213 | Gloves Latex, Large Powder Free Ambitex 10-100/cs. $37.35 $37.35
214 | Gloves Latex, Small Powdered Ambitex 10-100/cs. $34.70 $34.70
215 | Gloves Latex, Medium Powdered Ambitex 10-100/cs. $34.70 $34.70
216 | Gloves Latex, Large Powdered Ambitex 10-100/cs. $34.70 $34.70
217 | Body Towels Standard Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
218 | Hand Towels Standard Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
227 | Weed Killer (Round Up) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
228 | Weed Killer 55 Gallon concentrated - Specify Dilution No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
232 | Bleach Pure Bright Disinfection 6/cs. (6BLCH) or equal KIK Pure 6-gal/cs. $1.77 $10.62
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'L | 3M:Gueers 6x9 Scourifig Pads 20/Box (96HP) orequal  © | SSS 75118496 " | 20/bx | $.27%ea | $5.40bx"
2 | 3MGriddle Screens 10 per pack (200) or equal NEXSTEP 93188 20-10 1$2.40/pk | $48.00/cs
3 | AirFreshener — Aerosol-Asst:Scents SSS 21XXX 12/cs | $2.85 ea | $34.20/cs
4 | Air Preshenei — Time Mist Asst Scents:6.6 0z AIRWORKS 079  [12-70z{$2.30 ea| $27.60/cs
5 | Ant-& Roach Spray-odarless RAID FRAGRANCE FREE 17.5 OZ | RAID 11717 12/cs |$4.04 ea | $48.48/cs
6 | Ant & Roach Spray odorless to contain deltametrin RAID 11717 12/cs | $4.04 ea | $48.48/cs
7 | Bowl Cleaner - Liquid (Non Acid) EPA Registered SSS 13007 Pleascent Cli2gtics | $2.12 qt | $25.44/cs
8 | Bowl Cleanér Liquid 23% - 26% HIC EPA Registered SSS 1300&mulsion | 12qt/cs| $2.25 qt | $27.00/cs
9 | Bowl Mops (Rayon) or equal Wilen WJ510000 144/cs|$0.59 ea| - $84.96/cs
10 | Brooms (Plastic Angle) or equal ) Wilen E507012 12/cs | $5.50 ea| $66.00/cs
11 | Brooms — Janitorial Straw SSS 37220 #26 12/cs | $5.87 ea| $70.44/cs
12 | Brooms Maids-Straw (Waco)-or equal Lasswell 24AC 12/cs | $5.40 ed $64.80 cs
13 | Carpet Shampoo — Liquid Ammonia Free SSS 48007 Shampoo 4 gal/asp 11.19dl $44.76/cs
14 | Carpet Powder & Deodorizer SSS 08019 12-160£$2.35 ea| $28.20/cs

15 | Carpet Shampoo Liquid SSS 48007 Shampoo| 4 gal/cg $11.19 gl| $44.76/cs
16 | Carpet Spot Remover 32.0z SSS 48017 Spotter | 12qt/cs| $3.51 gt | $42.12/cs
17 | Carroll Heavy Duty Chemical Deodorant 4/1 Gallons or equal SSS 1310Rleascent |4 gal/cs $13.65d1 $54.60/cs
18 | Cleaner-Diversey General Purpose 4/1 Gallons or equal SSS 1314@rimo M/P |4 gal/cs| $9.08 gl $36.32/cs
19 | Cleaner Oven 24 oz. Foam Cleancr SSS 21023 Oven Cleari@-200r$3.28 ea | $39.36/cs

20 | Cleaner Stainless Steel waterless based Hillyard HIL103455 Oil|[B48écs | $3.38 ea | $40.56/cs

21 | Continental 18” rubber floor squecgees (1800) orequal Continental 1800 2/cs | $12.00 ep $24.00/cs

22 | Continental 24: rubber floor squeegee (2400) or equal Continental 2400 2/cs $14.00 e$ $28.00/cs

23 | Degteaser—55 gallon SSS 48092 Breakawd#p gal | $4.92 gl| $278.68 dn

24 | Detergent — Colgate Palmolive-Dishwashing — 12/32 or equal Palmolive #46303 |9-280z $2.90 eqd $26.10/cs

25 | Detergent- Power Dishwashing(Cream Suds ) or equivalent -50 Ib box NO BID

‘26 | Detergent Pot & Pan 2-Ltr Clean On The Go (Spar Clean) or equal NO BID

27 | Dish Sanitizer 2-Ltr Sani-T (Spar-Clean) or equal NO BID

28 | Dishwashing Capsules — US Chemicals 6/8 Ib, (failsafe) or equal Amer Chem 200255 | 4-8#/cg $23.33 ed $93.32/cs

29 | Dishwashing Liquid 32 oz. (Dawn) or equal Dawn 45112 8-38027 $5.12 ed $40.96/cs

30 | Dishwashing Liquid 42 oz. (Dawn) or equal Dawn 45112 8-380z | $5.12ea | $40.96/cs

31 | Disinfectant & Deodorizer Cleaner Aerosol SSS 21006F0am Disinf Cinr12-190z/£s§2.73 ea | $32.76/cs

32 | Disinfectant Cleaner Carroll clear pine mop #/1 gallon (Pinel) or-equal Quest #3750 dgalics | $7.209 | $28.80/cs

13 Zlits];:;fedtant Cleaner Carroll Clear Lemon Mop 4/1 gallon (Lemonl) or Quest #3760 . éal/cs s7.204 —

34 | Disinfectant Deodorant Spray — Hospital (Tuberculicial Rated) Hillyard HIL0105654 12-160z| $2.88ea | $34.56/cs
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35 I?,iéiquk::fz_xnt‘éD.éb@lﬂ'x‘ant,;.Spiay~Aérc'>sb1.—Hbspi'taI (1 Mitufe Xill titie) Hillyard HILO105654 12-160z | $2.88eh $34.56/cs’
36 | Disinfectarit, Deodorant.Spray-Hospital Hillyard HILO105654 | 12-160z | $2.88ed $34.56/cs
37" | Disinfegtant:Foam Cleaner— Hospital SSS 210060am Disinf Clnr| 12-190z | $2.73ep  $32.76/cs
33 Dis@hféclgn,t;(??gay?qg compound for:Animal Cage-Consume:Eco-Lyzer

< | (Spaitan) or éqiiivilent SSS VO01-14MN ProVet Logic 4 gal/cs | $26.83 ¢l 107.32/cs
39 | Disinfectant/Deodorant Spray — Diversely 12/150z (E-hdbac I) or equal Hillyard HIL0105654 12-160z | $2.88 e4 $34.56/cs
40 | Disinfectant/Cleaner lqt. Non-Acid Bathroom Cleaner SSS #48096 Fast Break 12qgt/lcs | $2.28ed $27.36/cs
41 | Dispenser - Air Freshener Time Mist Hillyard HIL20400 12/cs $18.00eh $216.00/cs
42 | Dispenser —Roll Paper Towel — Lever or Crank (Metal or Plastic) Continental 675 Metal Crank  6/cs
43 | Dispensers- Liquid Hand Soap (Bulk Soap) Continental 730 Plastic 30dz 12/cs $12.00 | $144.00/cs
44 | Dispensers- Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Metal) Continental 991C Chrome | 6/cs $28.48 $170.88/cs
45 | Dispeiisers — Paper Towéls Multi Folds Universal (Plastic:) Bobrick 5262 each $21.80ep $21.80 ea
46 | Dust Cloths (Disposable) Yiv Chicopee 0911 2424 2-50pk/cs | $27.35/gk $54.70/cs
47 | Dust Cloths—Non Disposable  16x16 Microfiber Cloth SSS 19040 24/cs $.89ea| $21.36/cs
48 | Dust Mop 24”x3 Disposable SSS 37101 12/cs | $5.11ed $61.32/cs
49 | Dust Mop 24” X 5 Non Disposable SSS 36665 12/cs $6.69e3 $80.28/cs
50 | Dust Mop 24” x 3 Non Disposable NO BID
51 | Dust Mop 24”:x 5 Disposable Wilen C401024 12/cs $4.15 eg $49.80/cs
52 | DustMop Frames 24 x5 SSS 37373 12/cs $2.00 | $24.00/cs
53 | Dust Mop Handles — Swivel Sriap On Wilen C801060 12/cs | $5.40ed $64.80/cs
54 | Dust Mop Treatment (Aerosol) SSS 21010 12/cs $3.18 ea] $38.16/cs
55 | Dust Mop Treatment TRU Equal NO BID
56 | Dust Pan Metal — Lobby or equal Continental #808 6/cs $15.87 ¢a$95.22/cs
57. | Dust Pan Plastic — Lobby or equal NexStep 96208 6/cs $7.76 ea| $46.56/cs
58 | Enzyme Deodorizers — per gallon Liquid SSS 48099 Alley OOP 4gallcs | $8.93¢gl| $35.72/cs
59 | Feather Duster Extcusions 12 ft NO BID
60 | Feather Duster Extensions 8ft NO BID
61 | Feather Dusters 21 inch Ostrich or Equal Boardwalk 20GY 12/cs $15.04 ga $180.48/cs
62 | Feather Dusters 26 inch Ostrich or Equal Boardwalk 28GY 12/cs $20.48 da $245.76/cs
63 | Fldor Cleaner -- Diversey Citrus Stride Neutral 5 gal bx (Stiide%) orequal | g5 481 33 Power Play 2-2.5gallch $6.76gl| $33.60/cs
64 ch;l: Cleancr — Diversey Floral Fragrance Neutral 4/1 gal (FLStride 14) or SSS 48102 Power Play ! agalics | s6.60g| $26.40/cs
65 | Floor Finish/Wax — Diversey 5 Gal (VectraS) or equal SSS 48104 DownForce 2-2.5gallcq $14.41g $72.05/cs
66 | Floor Finish ~1 gal SunnySidel (Spartan) or equal SSS 13117 Omega 20 4galics | $15.87g| $63.48/cs
67 Filmiﬁxre Polish Aerosol Hillyard HILO103155 12-160z | $2.49ed $29.88/cs
68 | Glass Cleaner ~Liquid-Concertrate (Spartan) or-equal SSS 48114 Clear Out 4gallcs | $8.00gl| $32.00/cs




EXBUBIY “B”
BID PAGE
REB N 2016-288-10-05-FAZ

“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES INDUSTRIAL CHIJMICALS & SUPPLIES”
ST TR == =

12qtics

- $2.20 ed

$26.40/cs

69" | Glnss Cléanet RTU 32,0z (Spattai) o équal S8 48112 Clear Out
70 | Hawd Cleaner = Waterless GoJo 111-06 6-4.54/cs | $14.80 pa $88.80/cs
71 | Hanging Toilet Bowl Blocks Boardwalk 04 12dzfcs | $8.75d7 $105.00/cs
72 | Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent (for Commercial Laundry-System) Amer Chem #900903 5-gal Pail | $99.45pl $99.45 pl
73 | Janitorial Cart w/Yellow Vinyl Bag—Rubbermaid (6173) or equal Continental 184GY/BL EACH $99.99 ¢a $99.99 ea
74. | Mop Bucket-combo Std Size (Rubbermaid 7580) or-equal Continental 335-312YW EACH $45.006a $45.00 ea
75 | Down Picss Wringer 35 Qt. Bucket (Wave Brake) or equal R-Maid #7580-88 EACH $61.45ep $61.45 ea
76 | Mop Bucket, 35 Qt. (Wave Brake) w/3" casters or equal R-Maid #7580-88 EACH | $61.45¢a $61.45 ea
77 | Mop Handles Fiber'Glass 54" Jr. Etc. or equal SSS 36269 12/cs $9.98e3 $119.76/cs
78 | Mop Handles Wood 54" Junior SSS 37798 12/cs $6.20 ep $74.40/cs
79 | Mop Head Cotton — Size 16 oz 12/cs $2.13eh $25.56/cs

: SSS 37657 :
80 | Mop Head Cotton - Size 24 oz SSS 37659 12/cs $3.01da $36.12/cs
81 | Mop Head Cotton — Size 32 oz. SSS 37660 12/cs | $3.84ed $46.08/cs
82 | Mop Head Rayon— Size 16-0z. SSS 37002 12/cs | $3.00ep $36.00/cs
83 | Mop Head Rayon — Size-24 oz. SSS 37004 12/cs $4.39ea $52.68/cs
84 | Mop Head Rayon — Size 32 oz, SSS 37005 12/cs | $5.48eq  $65.76/cs
85 | Mosquito Repellent Lotion. OFF! Family Care Pump 12-6oz/cd $5.31e3 $63.72/cs
86 | Mosguito Repellent Spray Deep Woods OFF! 12-6oz/cs| $5.49ea $65.88/cs
87 | Odor Eliminator —Non Aerosol SSS 13102 Pleascent 4galics | $13.65 gl $54.60/cs
88 | Premium Foam Antibacterial Soap Refill (GOJ536202) or équal GoJo 5362-02 2-1200ml/4s$23.00 da $46.00/cs
89 | Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill-GOJ545604 or equal GoJo 5456-04 4-1200ml/ds$19.30 €a$77.20/cs
90 | Royal griddle Bricks for Cleaning Grills 12/box (GBRICK) or equal NO BID
91 | Saddle Bag (SB8.5 Clr 6.5x7) or equal NO BID
92 | Scouring Sponges Yellow/Green Standard Size 3M/equal Norton 59403 #74 4-10/cs | $8.13 pk| $32.52/cs
93 | Scrubbirig Cleanscrs — 21 oz (Comeét) or equal Ajax 14278 24-210z/ck $1.125 ea $27.00/cs
94 | Soap-Liquid Hand Antibacterial per-gallon (pearl hand cleaner) or equal SSS 13023 Control Medicat¢d4 gallcs | $8.38 gl | $33.52/cs
95 | Soap Anti Bacterial - Bar 3.5 oz (1,000pcr casc) Dial 00910 72[cs $.98eqd $70.56/cs
96 | Soap Bar—75 0z — (1,000 per case) Boardwalk NO34Soap 1000/cs $.05 eal $4.00/cs
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SSS 44105 12-800m] $2.53 ea | $30.36/cs
o8 ‘Spattad 15%. Oraiige Tough cleaier/degréaser 12/32'0z (OT15QT) or
equal NO BID
99 Spartan antiseptic/antibacterial hand soap 4/1 gal (AntiHsoapl) or equal SSS 13023 Control Medicate d4 gllcs v $8.384l | $33.52/cs
100 | Spartan bounce back floor finish restorer 4/1 gal (Bouncel) ér equal SSS 13096 Meteor 4 gl/cs $10.97g| $43.88/cs
101 i{;ﬁa{r}t)agic;a;:{ Q&:A phosphoric acid shower-cleaner-12/32 oz (Foamy SS5 T39S e 12qt/cq $2.61¢a | $31.36/0s
102 | Spartan fresh scent deodorant spray 12/18 oz (Airfiesh AER)-or equal SSS 21XXX 12/100z/ 25$2.95 ga335.40/cs
103 | ‘Spray Bottles — 24 ozempty bottles or cqual Continental 9248 100/cs| .42 ea $42.00/cs
104 | Spray Bottles—32 oz empty bottles (bottleqt) or cqual Continental 932bg 100/cs| .52ea $52.00/cs
105 | Pump #10 I oz. Igal. #10 Tube or cqual Goritinantal 40k 144/cs | $1.50 e®216.00/cs
106 | Toilet Dispenser Universal (12" Jumbo toilet Tissue) Bay West 887 Each | $25.00 4525.00 eq
107 | Toilet Seat Covers NuTrend HG-5000 20-250/G551.97 pk | $39.40/cs
(08 | Trash Can 55 Gal -XX Large.28x58 1.5 mil SSSCR6028 100/Cs | g31.42¢s| $31.42/cs
{09 | Trash Cans.& Lids 16 Gal Continental 8316/7325 4/cs | $46.70sef $186.80/cs
110 ' Trash Cans & Lids 32 Gallon (Rubbermaid) or equal Continental 3200/3201 Blcs  [$25.52 sp$153.12/c$
IT1 | Trash Cans — 10'Gal Continental 1001GY 6lcs | $8.45eq $50.70/cs
112 | Urinal Block w/Screens NuTrend 01901 12dz/cs| $15.60 oz | $187.20/cs
113 | Urinal Blocks (Blocks Only) NuTrend 04901 12dz/c$ $4.256z | $51.00/cs
114 | Urinal Deodorant Screcns — Screens Only NuTrend 03901 12dz/cs $§.53 dz $114.36/cq
115 | Wasp/Hornet Spray Enforcer FWH16 - 12-160z/c$3.92 ea $43.92/cs
116 | Wasp/Hornet Spray — 20 Ft Stream Enforcer EWHIK16 12-160z/¢$3.92 ea] 43 9p/cs
(7 }Z:);Si;r;p(ﬁf:;g:lor Finish Liquid — High Speed (Vectea)(Johnson & e 2-2.5gl/ds $14.41 gI $72.05/cs
118 | Baggics Y% Size Slider Bag Ziploc Snack Bags (Hefty) or equal NO BID
119 | Baggies 4”x4" Enono Zip (Ziploc Regular Sandwich Bags) or equal NO BID
120 | Baggies Ziploc 16x11 Gallon Size (Hefty) orequal NO BID
121 | Baggics Ziploc 7x8 Quatt Size (Hefty or equal NO BID
122 | Baggies Freezer Bags [0x11 —200 ct (Quick Seal) or equal NO BID
123- | Butcher Paper24” NO BID
124 | Facial Tissue (Georgia Pacific) equal or better BayWest 13000 EcoSoft 30-100/gs6173bx | $18.52/cs
125 | Film Wrap 18" Heavy Duty Z,OOO'ﬂ. (Reynolds) or cqual NO BID
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126 | Filin Wrap té»xaoop-nca{;y Duty (Reynolds) or egal NO BID
127 | Foam—Bows.6 0z w/lids NO BID
128 | Foil Wrap 18" Hedvy Duty 500 f: (Reyaolds) orcqual I
129 | Foil Wrap Potato (Reynolds) or cqual NO BID
130 | Laced Dollies (different sizes and types) NO BID
131 Menu Tissue 12 x 12 NO BID
132 | Napkins 2 Ply Quarter Fold (Georgia Pacific) or equal NO BID
133 | Pactiv—or cqual — 9x6 5.2.75 foam hinged Tray NO BID
134 | Pan Liﬁ'érs"— (Dispoza) 1,000 cs NO BID
135 | Paper Bags #10'Brown (Duro) or equal NO BID
136 | Paper Bags #4 Brown (Duro) or equal NO BID
137 | Paper Bags #8 Brown (Duro) or equal NO BID
38 | Paper Bags 1/6 BBL Brown 1657 (Duro ) or cqual NO BID
139 | Paper Bags 6lb. Brown 6BG (Duro) or equal NO BID
140 | Paper Cups Portion 10 oz (Solo) equal or: better NO BID
141 | Paper Roll Towels Kitchen (Scott.L [s9) or equal Bay West 41000 EcoSoft | 30 rl/cs | $.7441 | $22.32/cs
142 | Paper Towels Brown Rolls Standard Size(Georgia Pacific) or equal Bay West 46200 EcoSoft 12-350"/cps.5711 $17.12/cs
143 | Paper Towels Multi Fold Bay West 48000 EcoSoft | 0200 Ps.053 pk_| $15.250cs
144 | Paper Towels Multi Folds White Bleached 9.25X9.5 Bay West 48500 EcoSt&t250/cs 1.243pk |$19.88/cs
145 5;5:{ Towels (GEP89460) En-motion high capacity —white (0X800 or GEID
146 Styrofo-am Bowl - 6 oz. 1,000 case NO BID
147 | Styrofoam Bowls 12 oz. (Pacific 1-0012) equal or better NO BID
148 | Styrofoam Cup 8 oz. (818) or equal NO BID
149 | Styrofoam Cups oz. (UJ4) or equal NO BID
150 | Styrotoam Plates 6” Laminated NO BID
151 Styrofoam Plates 6” Un-laminated NOBID
152 | Styrofoam Plates 9” Divided (Mobil TJ 1-001 1) or equal NO BID
153 | Styrofoam Plates 9 Laminated NO BID
154 | Styrofoam Plates 9 Un-laminated NO BID
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Stytofoain Tray Hinges 9x9x3 Three Compartment. w/Lid (Pactiv YTD

I55 19903) 150 ¢s or equal: NO BID
156 Sty-li)qur.h Hinged Lid container 9 3/6 in. x 6 1/2in. x'2 % in. rectangular

white 150/case NO BID
157 | Toilet Tissue (12/1000 Jr Jumbo) (Georgia Pacific) or equal BayWest 1002 EcoSoft 12-1000Ycs2.007d | $24.08/cs
158 | Toilet Tissue 2 Ply Small Short Sheet (Georgia Pacific) or equal BayWest 54000 Ecosoft | $6-500/cs| 8381 | 83455
159 | Toilet Tissue.(6/Jurabo 2000 ft) (Georgia Pacific) or equal BayWest 2002 EcoSoft | © 2000 /S| $4.331 | $25.98/cs
160 | Utensils Forks — Plastic 2,000 ct.(James River Wn F2P) or cqual NO BID
161 | Utensils Forks — Plastic Dispozo — medium (,000 cs (WMF) or equal NO BID
162 | Utensils Forks—Plastic medium Weight White 1,000 ct (Solo or Equal) NO BID
163 | Utensils Forks Clear (1,000 ct) NO BID
[64 | Utensils Spoons Plastic-(Solo) or equal NO BID
165 Utensils Spoons Plastic 1,000 ct (Solo).or equal NO BID
166 | Utensils Spoons Plastic Dispozo medium WMS 1,000 ct or equal NO BID
167 | Utensils Spoons Plastic medium Weight White (1,000 ct) NO BID
168 | Utensils Party Packs (Spoous, Forks, Knife, Napkin, Salt & Pepper) NG BID
169 | Vented Lid-Dart (12712) or equal NO BID
170 | Vented Lid — Dart (8J8) or equal NO BID
171 | Vented Lid — Dart.(20JL) 10/100 case or equal NO BID
172 Wipers Workhorse Rags (Kiiberly Clark) orcqual Kimberly Clark 41300 152/bx $24.91bx | $24.91/bx
173 | Wipers — (Kimberly Clark) 15x16.5 white (300cs) (K41100) or equal Kimberly Clark 41100 300/bx | $38.00bx | $38.00/bx
174 | Body Shampoo — Per Gallon SSS 13021 LHS 4glics  |$8.49g  |$33.96/cs
175 | Deodorant—Hygiene NO BID
176 | LiceKiller— Aerosol NO BID
177 | Razors—Double Edged - NO BID
178 | Sanitary Napkins Maxi No 4 Folded (Stayfree; Rochester, etc. or equal) NuTrend Maxi #4 250/cs $.126 ea $31.50/cs
179 | Sanitary Napkins Panty Liners NO BID
180 | Sanitary Napkins Super No 4 Folded (Stayfiee, Rochester, etc: or equal) | NuTrend Maxi #4 250/cs $126€a |34 50/cs

181 Sanitary Napkins: Thin No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc or equal NuTrend Ultra Thin MT-4 | 250/cs $.126 ea $31.50/cs
NO BID

182 | Shaving Cream

183 | Toothbrush Firm — Specify Size NO BID
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184 | Toothbrush Medium Specify Size NO BID
185 | Toothbrush Soft Specify Size NO BID
186 | Toothpaste Std Size, Specify Size ) NO BID
187 Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size NO BID
188 Americo 20” Beige Ultra High Speed Burnishing Pads 5/bx- ]

(20MUHSTBP) or equal Norton Merit 80069 Natural|P&fts $2.71ea | $13.55/cs
189 | Buffing Pads 17" White Norton Merit 90061 5/cs $2.29ea | $11.45/cs
190 | Buffing Pads 20" White Norton Merit 80064 5lcs $2.71ea | 13.55lcs
191 Filters Windsor Exhaust for Sensor Xp!12 Vacuum Cleaner (§143EF) or

equal APC JAN-IVF-282 50/cs $1.00ea | $50.00/cs
192 Filters Windsor Micro Hygiene for Sensor XP12 Vacuun Cleaner

(5301ER) or equal APC JAN-IVF155 25/cs | $10.00 ea | $250.00/cs
193 Stripping Pads 17" Black Norton Merit 80020 5/cs $2.29ea | $11.45/cs
194 | Stripping Pads 20” Black Norton Merit 80023 5/cs $2.71ea | $13.55/cs
195 (\E;:;\;; l?;gji }Kir;ﬂ;o;rf:; uSacinsor XP12 Vacuum Cleaner 10 pk e daSER:S 10-10/cs | $15.00pk | $150.00%cs
196 | Gloves - Food Service Large Clear (Brand Name) Ambitex P6505 20-500/cs| $2.438 bx | $48.75/cs
197 | Gloves — Food Service — Medium clear (Brand Naine) Ambitex P6505 20-500/05! $2.438 bx | $48.75/cs
198 Gloves Latex Small Disposable (Auscll )Yw or equal Ambitex L116L 10dz/cs | $6.24 dz $62.40/cs
199 Gloves Latex Large Disposable Ambitex L116L 10dz/cs | $6.24dz | $62.40/cs
200 | Gloves Latex Large Non-Disposable Yw (Ansell) 6r equal Ambitex L6500 12dz/cs |$6.00 dz $72.00/cs
201 Gloves Latex Medium Non Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equal Ambitex L6500 12dz/cs $6.00dz | $72.00/cs
202 Gloves Latex Medium Disposable (Ansell) or equal Ambitex L116L 10dz/cs | $6.24 dz $62.40/cs
203 Gloves Latex Small Non Disposable Yellow (Ansell) or equal Ambitex L6500 12dz/cs | $6.00 dz $72.00/cs
204 | Gloves Safety (Nitrile) SFZGNPRXLIM or equal Ambitex NTL650 12dz/cs | $11.02dz | $132.24/cs
205 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powdered Ambitex V5101 10-100/cs| $22.00/cs | $22.00/cs
206 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powdered Ambitex V5101 10-100/cd $22.00/cs | $22.00/cs
207 Gloves Vinyl, Large Powdercd Ambitex V5101 10-100/cs | $22.00/cs | $22.00/cs
208 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powder Free Ambitex V5201 10-100/cs | $22.75/cs | $22.75/cs
209 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powder Free Ambitex V5201 10-100/cs| $22.75/cs $22.75/cs
210 | Gloves Vinyl, Large Powder Free Ambitex V5201 10-100/cs| $22.75Ics $22.75/cs
211 | Gloves Latex, Small Powder Free Ambitex L5201 10-100/c§ $37.35/CS| $37.35/Cs
212 Gloves Latex, ¥Medium Powder Free Ambitex L5201 10-100/cs | $37.35/CS | $37.35/CS
213 | Gloves Latex, Large Powder Free Ambitex L5201 10-100/cs | $37.35/CS | $37.35/CS
214 | Gloves Latex, ‘Small Powdered Ambitex L5101 10-100/cs| $34.70/CS| $34.70/CS
215 | Gloves Latex, Medium Powdered Ambitex L5101 10-100/cs | $34.70/CS | $34.70/CS
216 | Gloves Latex, Large Powdered Ambitex L5101 10-100/cs | $34.70/CS | $34.70/CS
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217 | Bady Towels Standard Size NO BID
218 | Hand Towels Standard Size NO BID
219 | Trash:Liners - 45 Gal XiLarge40x48 16 Mic High Density Can Liner SSS NA04816CR -~ * | 250/cs | $.1087ea | $27.18/cs -
990, | Trash Liners —Pitt-Plastics 23x33'12-16.gal Black 1000¢s (32:BL) or ' o i

" | equal SSS CR32LB .3mil 1000/cs | $.0253 ea | $25.30/cs
971 | TrashLiners— Large Trash Can 13 MIC 30:x 37 High Density Cani
221 ) (e, ; SSS N303713CR 500/cs | $:0478¢€a | o3 go/cs
o5y | Teash Litiors —Largé Trash Gan' T6MIC 33 Gal 33x40 High Density Can

Liners SSS N334016CR 250/cs $.0753ea | $18.82/cs

223 Trash Linérs — Tall Trash Can 8 MIC 24 x 33 High Deris'ity Can Liners SSS N243308CR 1000/cs $.0223 ea $22.30/cs
224 | Trash Liucrs — 55 gallons SSS CRSB0GY 1.15mil | 100/cs | $ .25ea | $25.00/cs
225 | Toilet Brushes (Standard:Size) Plastic Continental J501001 12/cs $2.15ea | $25.80/cs
226 | Toilet Brushes — Hard Bristle Bowl Brush (0310) (Rubbermaid) or equal | Rubbermaid 6310 24/cs $2.40 ea | $57.60/cs
227 | Weed Killer-(Round Up) or equal NO BID
228 | Weed Killer 55 Gallon concentrated — Specify Dilution NO BID
229 | Spartan Sanitize Quart Food Service 12/32 oz (SRTU) or equal Amer Chemical 170011702 6-qtics $3.22ea | $19.32/cs
230 | Sprayer (Trigger/Nozzles Only) red & white Continental 902RW9 200/cs | .41ea $82.007cs
231 | Bleach — Disinfectant Cleaner Dry Air — Hospital NO BID
232 | Bleach —Pure Bright Disinfection 6/cs (6BLCH) or:equal KIK Pure Bright 6-gallcs | $1.77 gl $10.62/cs
233 | Bio-Hazard Bag Red 40 X 48 3-mil NO BID
234 | Disinfectant Wipes (Lysol) or equal Clorox #15948 6-75ct/cs | $5.11 ct $30.66/cs

ACKNOWLEDGMENT FORM/BIDDER INFORMATION

I/We the undersigned hereby certify that I/'We am/are a duly authorized official of the company and have the authority to sign on behalf
of the company-and assure.that all statements made in the bid are-true. I/We agree to furnish and deliver the specified items/services at
the prices stated heiein, and have read, understand, aiid agreeto the terms-and.conditions contained herein and on all of the attachments.

BIDDER/COMPANY.
NAME: C C DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
ADDRESS: 210 McBRIDE LANE

CITY/STATE/ZIP CODE:  oRpys CHRISTI, TEXAS 78408

TELEPHONE NUMBER 361-289-0200

E-MAIL ADDRESS: RCole@CCDistributors.coMGonzales@CCDistributors.com

CELLULAR NUMBIRS:  956.873-3555 Mario Gonzales®aul Vera @ 361-765-1483

FAX NUMBER: 361-289-2021

AUTHORIZED -

sowrne (g LIAL w2
~__/

PRINTED NAME: Richard E. Cole, Sr.

TITLE: Purchasing

DATE: 3 October, 2016
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DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

s -
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 1010412016

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

Bpgcr)gngI':lsurance ﬁgﬂg\m Borden Insurance
P. O. Box 1066 PHONE  £x; 361-882-6543 | FAR o) 361-654-2008
orpus Christi, TX 78403-1066 E-MAIL - .
Allen Borden, CIC, CPCU AbprEss: Mail@bordenins.com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAI(? #
nsurer A : Travelers Indemnity Company
INSURED CC Distributors, Inc; Fin, Inc nsurer B : The Travelers Ind Co of Conn
210 Mc Bride Lane
Corpus Christi, TX 78408 INSURER G :
INSURERD :
INSURERE :
INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

DDL SUBR
IE‘?RR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD |WvD POLICY NUMBER (,ﬁﬂh&%‘/&@@, (ﬁﬂ%é%ﬁ%’% LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000,
| cLaMs-MADE OCCUR Y-660-3F86965A-TIA-15 01/01/2016 | 01/01/2017 | PRF e I G R ) |5 100,000
— MED EXP (Any one person) $ 5,000
| PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $ 1,000,000]
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000,
POLICY l:, RS l:] Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $ 2,000,000,
OTHER: $
| AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY &%’ﬁ?&%%ﬁ)s INGLELIMIT™ g 1,000,000
A | X | any AuTO BA-3F86965A 01/01/2016 | 01/01/2017 | BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
B AL OWHED Al ToCHEED BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| $
NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
HIRED AUTOS AUTOS (Per accident)
$
| X |umsreLtatiae | X | occur EACH OCCURRENCE $ 2,000,000
B EXCESS LIAB T YSMCUP-3F86965A 01/01/2016 | 01/01/2017 | AcGReEGATE s 2,000,000
oep | X | Rerentionss 10,000 $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY iN X I STATUTE I l ER
B |ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/IEXECUTIVE YEUB-3F86965-A-15 01/01/2016 | 01/01/2017 | ... EACH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? @ N/A
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $ 1,000,000
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
Policy includes Blanket Addltlonal Insured and Blanket 30 Day Notice of

Cancellation (except 10 days for non payment of prem|um2 when required by
written contract. This would apply in favor of the certificate holder.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER . CANCELLATION
HIDA-03

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
. ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

Hidalgo County

Purchasing Dept

2812 S Highway Bus. 281 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
Edinburg, TX 78539 -
&M. Executive Vice President

© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2014/01) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES Form 1295

1of1

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2016-131572

C C Distributors, Inc.

Corpus Christi, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 11/01/2016

being filed.

Hidalgo County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

2016-288A
Custodial Supplies & Equipment, Industrial Chemicals and Supplies

SO

4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling | Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.
sttt SIS SIS IS S SIS S SN X
o ‘E KAREO 19317 \: | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

TARY PUBLIC, STATE OF TEXAS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES §

JUNE 25, 2020
h’///f/‘///f/f/f./‘/.//////f./f @Q /‘ } / Z‘Q‘Z )

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE -

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said %] d‘w d E &l@ g)" , this the /S 7L day of N oV |

20 I (4 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

%M Kovren LU Pose &o&w\r ;)\3 v la/ e

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of offiee? administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

Form 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

of business.
C C Distributors, Inc.
Corpus Christi, TX United States

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place

being filed.
Hidalgo County

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is

OFFICE USE ONLY
CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:
2016-131572

Date Filed:
11/01/2016

Date Acknowledged:
11/02/2016

2016-288A

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Custodial Supplies & Equipment, Industrial Chemicals and Supplies

4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
5 ARFIRAVIF | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Swaorn to and subscribed before me, by the said , this the day of ;
20 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.
Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277



