GULF COAST PAPER CO. INC., Brownsville, TX
AWARDED ITEMS

RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ

“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICCAESEER
1 | 3M Green 6x9 Scouring Pads 20/box (96HP)or equal Americo 20 $0.26 $5.20
3 | Air Freshener - Aerosol Asst. Scents Spartan 12 $2.67 $32.04
5 | Ant & Roach Spray Odorless Spartan 12 $3.86 $46.32
6 | Ant & Roach Spray odorless to contain deltametrin Spartan 12 $3.86 $46.32
7 | Bowl Cleaner — Liquid (Non Acid) EPA Registered Spartan 12 $1.55 $18.60
8 | Bowl Cleaner Liquid 23% - 26% HIC EPA Registered Spartan 12 $1.4750 $17.70
13 | Carpet Shampoo — Liquid Ammonia Free Spartan 4 $6.63 $26.52
15 | Carpet Shampoo Liquid Spartan 4 $6.63 $26.52
16 | Carpet Spot Remover 32 oz. Spartan 12 $1.65 $19.80
17 | Carroll Heavy Duty Chemical Deodorant 4/1 Gallons or equal Carroll 4 $11.00 $44.00
19 | Cleaner Oven 24 oz. Foam Cleaner Spartan 12 $3.10 $37.20
23 | Degreaser — 55 gallon Spartan 1 $252.00 $252.00
25 g%tclaggel:)not)—(Power Dishwashing(Cream Suds ) or equivalent Cream Suds 1 $116.00 $116.00
26 | Detergent Pot & Pan 2-Ltr Clean On The Go (Spar Clean) or equal Spartan Cl 4 $9.95 $39.80
27 | Dish Sanitizer 2-Ltr Sani-T (Spar Clean) or equal Spartan Cl 4 $10.39 $41.56
29 | Dishwashing Liquid 32 oz. (Dawn) or equal Spartan 12 $3.25 $39.00
31 | Disinfectant & Deodorizer Cleaner Aerosol Claire 12/15.50z $2.1660 $26.00
37 | Disinfectant Foam Cleaner - Hospital Spartan 12 $2.43 $29.16
38 Eisinfectant ~Cleaning. compound for Animal Cage -Consume Eco- Spartan 4 $11.58 $46.32
yzer (Spartan) or equivalent
40 | Disinfectant/Cleaner 1gt. Non-Acid Bathroom Cleaner Spartan 12 $1.55 $18.60
42 | Dispenser - Roll Paper Towel - Lever or Crank (Metal or Plastic) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 | Dispensers - Liquid Hand Soap (Bulk Soap) Spartan 1 $11.55 $11.55
44 | Dispensers- Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Metal) Georgia Pac 1 $19.74 $19.74
45 | Dispensers- Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Plastic ) Georgia Pac 1 $21.00 $21.00
46 | Dust Cloths (Disposable) Yw Georgia Pac 200 $0.2880 $57.60
50 | Dust Mop 24" x 3 Non - Disposable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
53 | Dust Mop Handles - Swivel Snap On Wilen 12 $5.40 $64.80
54 | Dust Mop Treatment (Aerosol) Spartan 12-160z $3.09 $37.08
55 | Dust Mop Treatment TRU Equal Spartan 12 $1.88 $22.56
57 | Dust Pan Plastic - Lobby or equal Continental 1 $7.40 $7.40
58 | Enzyme Deodorizers — per gallon Liquid Spartan 4 $8.70 $34.80
59 | Feather Duster Extensions 12 ft. Urger 1 $42.62 $42.62
60 | Feather Duster Extensions 8ft Unisan 1 $8.20 $8.20
61 | Feather Duster 21 inch Ostrich or equal Lambkin 1 $5.50 $5.50
62 | Feather Duster 26 inch Ostrich or equal Unisan 1 $5.50 $5.50
64 Floor Cleaner — Diversey Floral Fragrance Neutral 4/1 gal (FLStride Diversey 4 $5.20 $20.80
14) or equal
65 | Floor Finish/Wax — Diversey 5 Gal (Vectra5) or equal Diversey 1 $68.97 $68.97
66 | Floor Finish — 1 gal SunnySidel (Spartan) or equal Spartan 4 $10.56 $42.24
67 | Furniture Polish Aerosol Spartan 12 $2.61 $31.32
69 | Glass Cleaner RTU — 32 oz. (Spartan) or equal Spartan 12 $1.77 $21.24
72 | Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent (for Commercial Laundry System) Spartan 5 $11.00 $55.00
76 | Mop Bucket, 35 Qt. (Wave Brake) w/3” casters or equal Rubbermaid 1 $45.00 $45.00
78 | Mop Handles Wood 54” Junior Unisan 12 $5.90 $70.80
86 | Mosquito Repellent Spray Off Deep 12 $5.37 $64.44
87 | Odor Eliminator - Non Aerosol Spartan 12 $1.85 $22.20
90 | Royal Griddle Bricks for Cleaning Grills 12 box (GBRICK) or equal Royal 12 $1.97 $23.64
91 | Saddle Bag (SB8.5 Clr 6.5x7) or equal Tidi 2,000 $0.0140 $28.00
93 | Scrubbing Cleansers 21 oz. (Comet) or equal Ajax 24 $1.12 $26.88
94 §§S§1~ Liquid Hand Antibacterial per gallon (pearl hand cleaner) or Spartan 4 $7.66 $30.64
95 | Soap Anti-Bacterial — Bar 3.5 oz. (1,000per case) Safeguard 48 $0.75 $36.00
97 | Soap Hand — Liquid — ( Bag in Box) Inopak 12 $2.00 $24.00
08 (S)f:l(']tszl 15% Orange Tough cleaner/degreaser 12/32 oz (OT15QT) Spartan 12 $2.86 $34.32
101 Spartan Foamy Q&A phosphoric acid shower cleaner 12/32 oz. Boarmy 12 $2.43 $29.16

(Foamy RTU) or equal




GULF COAST PAPER CO. INC.
“CONTINUED” AWARDED ITEMS

RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ
“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICCAESEER

102 Sgs;an Fresh Scent Deodorant spray 12/18 oz. (Airfresh AER) or Spartan 12 $2.60 $31.20
106 | Toilet Dispenser Universal (12" Jumbo Toilet Tissue) Georgia Pac 1 $15.00 $15.00
107 | Toilet Seat Covers Hospeco 5,000 $0.0056 $28.00
108 | Trash Can 55 Gal - XX Large 28 x 58 1.5 Mil Berry 100 $0.22 $21.50
109 | Trash Can & Lids 16 Gal Rubbermaid 1 $27.00 $27.00
110 | Trash Can & Lids 32 Gallon (Rubbermaid) or equal Continental 1 $24.55 $24.55
111 | Trash Cans 10-Gal Rubbermaid 1 $7.37 $7.37

114 | Urinal Deodorant Screens - Screens Only Tolco 12 $0.75 $9.00

115 | Wasp/Hornet Spray Spartan 12-170z $3.55 $42.60
116 | Wasp/Hornet Spray - 20 ft. Stream Spartan 12 $3.55 $42.60
117 }Nax Strippfar Floor Finish Liquid - High Speed (Vectea) (Johnson & Shaitan 4 $10.38 $41.52

ohnson) or equal

118 | Baggies Y Size Slider Bag Ziploc Snack Bags (Hefty) or equal Reynolds 250 $0.0790 $19.75
119 Ij;faglies 4" x 4" Enono Zip (Ziploc Regular Sandwich Bags) or Huckster 1,000 $0.0965 $9.65

120 | Baggies Ziploc 16x11 Gallon Size (Hefty) or equal Reynolds 250 $0.0830 $20.75
121 | Baggies Ziploc 7x8 Quart Size (Hefty) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
122 | Baggies Freezer Bags 10x11 - 200 ct. (Quick Seal) or equal Reynolds 200 $0.11 $22.00
123 | Butcher Paper 24" B&H Supp 1000° $0.0265 $26.50
124 | Facial Tissue (Georgia Pacific) equal or better Georgia Pac 30/100 $0.5830 $17.49
125 | Film Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 2,000 ft. (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 2000 $0.0083 $16.65
126 | Film Wrap 18"x3000 - Heavy Duty (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 3000 $0.0092 $27.60
127 | Foam Bowls 60z. w/lids Dart 1,000 $0.0490 $49.00
128 | Foil Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 500 ft (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 500' $0.0550 $27.50
129 | Foil Wrap Potato (Reynolds) or equal Reynolds 3000' $0.0173 $51.90
130 | Laced Dollies (different sizes and types) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
131 | Menu Tissue 12 x 12 Bag Craft 10,000 $0.0084 $84.00
132 | Napkins 2 Ply Quarter Fold (Georgia Pacific) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
133 | Pactiv or equal 9 x 6 5.2.75 foam hinged Tray Pactiv 150 $0.11 $16.50
134 | Pan Liners (Dispozo) 1,000 cs Bag Craft 1,000 $0.0390 $39.00
135 | Paper Bags #10 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.0270 $13.50
136 | Paper Bags #4 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.0154 $7.70

137 | Paper Bags #8 Brown (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.0220 $11.00
138 | Paper Bags 1/ 6 BBL Brown 1657 (Duro) or equal Duro 400 $0.09 $36.00
139 | Paper Bags 6lbs. Brown 6BG (Duro) or equal Duro 500 $0.02 $10.00
140 | Paper Cups Portion 10 oz. (Solo) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
143 | Paper Towels Multi Fold NPS 4,000 $0.0037 $14.80
144 | Paper Towels Multi Fold White Bleached 9.25x9.5 NPS 4,000 $0.0044 $17.60
145 E:izz;flowels (GEP89460) En-motion high capacity - white 10x800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
146 | Styrofoam Bowl - 6 oz. 1,000 case Dart 1,000 $0.03 $30.23
147 | Styrofoam Bowl - 12 oz. (Pacific 1-0012) equal or better Pactiv 1,000 $0.0200 $20.00
148 | Styrofoam Cup 8 oz. (8J8) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.02 $20.00
149 | Styrofoam Cups oz. ((UJ4) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.0170 $17.00
150 | Styrofoam Plates 6" Laminated Pactiv 1,000 $0.0223 $22.30
151 | Styrofoam Plates 6" Un-Laminated Pactiv 1,000 $0.0174 $17.40
152 | Styrofoam Plates 9" Divided (MobilTJ1-0011) or equal Pactiv 500 $0.0349 $17.45
153 | Styrofoam Plates 9" Laminated No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
154 | Styrofoam Plates 9" Un-Laminated Pactiv 500 $0.0349 $17.45

Styrofoam Tray Hinges 9x9x3 Three Compartment w/Lid (Pactiv :
155 | 3¢ 0005) o0 cs o P ( Pactiv 150 $0.09 $13.50
156 Styrofoam .Hin.ged Lid container 9 3/6 in. x 6 1/2 in. x 2 3/4 in. Dt 150 $0.11 $16.50
rectangular white 150/case

157 | Toilet Tissue (12/1000 Jr. Jumbo) (Georgia Pacific) or equal SCA 12 $2.00 $24.00
158 | Toilet Tissue 2 Ply Small Short Sheet (Georgia Pacific) or equal Georgia Pac 96/500 $0.3200 $30.72
160 | Utensils Forks - Plastic 2,000 ct. (James River WN F2P) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
161 | Utensils Forks - Plastic Dispozo - medium 1,000 ct. (Solo or equal) D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50
162 Utensils Forks - Plastic Medium weight white 1,000 ct. (Solo or D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50

equal)




GULF COAST PAPER CO. INC.
“CONTINUED” AWARDED ITEMS

RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ
“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICCZESEER

163 | Utensils Forks Clear 1,000 ct. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
164 | Utensils Spoons Plastic (Solo) or equal D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50
165 | Utensils Spoons Plastic 1,000 ct. (Solo) or equal D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50
166 | Utensils Spoons Plastic Dispozo Medium WMS 1,000 ct or equal D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50
167 | Utensils Spoons Plastic Medium Weight white 1,000 ct D&W Pack 1,000 $0.0115 $11.50
168 | Utensils Party Packs (Spoons, Forks, Knife, Napkin, Salt & Pepper) D&W Pack 250 $0.07 $17.50
169 | Vented Lid Dart (12J12) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.0142 $14.20
170 | Vented Lid Dart (8J8) or equal Dart 1,000 $0.0112 $11.20
171 | Vented Lid Dart (20JL) 10/100 case or equal Dart 1,000 $0.019 $19.00
172 | Wipers Workhorse Rags (Kimberly Clark) or equal KC 912 $0.0578 $52.71

173 z\éil}:l:rs (Kimberly Clark) 15x16.5 white (300 cs.) (K41100) or KC 300 $0.11 $33.00
174 | Body Shampoo - Per gallon Spartan 4 $7.66 $30.64
175 | Deodorant - Hygiene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
176 | Lice Killer - Aerosol No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
177 | Razors - Double Edged No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
178 S;Ll;tla)n'y Napkins Maxi No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or Hospeco 250 $0.11 $28.50
179 | Sanitary Napkins Panty Liners No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180 Sglrll;tla)lry Napkins Super No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or Hspeco 250 $0.11 $27.50
181 g;lrll;tle;ry Napkins Thin No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or Hospeco 250 $0.11 $27.50
182 | Shaving Cream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
183 | Toothbrush Firm - Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
184 | Toothbrush Medium Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
185 | Toothbrush Soft Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
186 | Toothpaste Std. Size, Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 | Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
189 | Buffing Pads 17" White Americo 5 $2.06 $10.30
193 | Stripping Pads 17" Black Americo 5 $2.06 $10.30
198 | Gloves - Latex Small Disposable (Ansell) Yw or equal Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00
199 | Gloves - Latex Large Disposable Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00
200 | Gloves - Latex Large Non -Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 12 $0.47 $5.64

201 | Gloves - Latex Medium Non Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 12 $0.47 $5.64

202 | Gloves - Latex Medium Disposable (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 1,000 $0.0360 $36.00
203 | Gloves - Latex Small Non Disposable Yellow (Ansell) or equal Hospeco 12 $0.47 $5.64

204 | Gloves Safety (Nitrile) SFZGNPRXLIM or equal Hospeco 1,000 $0.0491 $49.10
205 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0220 $22.00
206 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0220 $22.00
207 | Gloves Vinyl, Large Powdered Hospeco 1,000 $0.0220 $22.00
217 | Body Towels Standard Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
218 | Hand Towels Standard Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
220 Trash Liners - Large Trash Can 16 MIC 33 Gal 33x40 High Density Bty 250 $0.0660 $16.50

Can Liners

225 | Toilet Brushes - (Standard Size) Plastic Rubbermaid 1 $1.60 $1.60

226 Z(;)lillafit Brushes - Hard Bristle Bowl Brush (0310) (Rubbermaid) or Rubbermaid 1 $1.60 $1.60

227 | Weed Killer (Round Up) or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
228 | Weed Killer 55 Gallon concentrated - Specify Dilution No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
229 | Spartan Sanitize Quart Food Service 12/32 oz. (SRTU) or equal Spartan 12 $1.75 $21.00
230 | Sprayer (Trigger/Nozzles Only) Red & White Tolco 1 $0.40 $0.40

231 | Bleach Disinfectant Cleaner Dry Air - Hospital Pure Bright 6 $1.8330 $11.00
233 | Bio Hazard Bag Red 40x48 3 mil Berry 50 $0.5200 $26.00
234 | Disinfectant Wipes (Lysol) or equal Clorox 450 $0.0660 $29.70




EXHIBIT “B”
BID PAGE
RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FFAZ

“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CH_EMICALS & SUPPLIES” 7 =,

el Jamtorlal&lndustrial Supplies .

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND Qry | e [T EacEER
1| 3M Green 6x9 Scouring Pads 20/Box (96HP) or equal ALP | Ameice 2o | 20 |5, 20
2 | 3M Griddle Screens 10 per pack (200) or equal ?{ ) 3 M "}0 o ZD ] ?5 é ?O
3 | Air Freshener — Aerosol Asst Scents , - [eox S /ﬂ mw | 2 2 é 7 2*0 I/
4 | Air Freshener — Time Mist Asst Scents 6.6 0z vgd/ ol | 2 ‘7 e} |9 b. };
5 | Ant & Roach Spray odorless (4/(7/‘1/ [ (4 oY ;;ﬂd { 2 7 g& %,3 p=
6 | Ant & Roach Spray odorless to contain deltametrin éﬂﬂ / b b ;gﬂaﬂﬁz A {2 3, }95 ﬂ 42
7 | Bowl Cleaner - Liquid (Non Acid) EPA Registered  Ji/ 4 L 2102 fpﬂrzﬁw [T [-65 |/ g, Lo
8 | Bowl Cleaner Liquid 23% - 26% HIC EPA Registered D22 52()4 ,{j; " [ 2 i¥n g | .o
9 | Bowl Mops (Rayon) or equal 97/5 {es / e . é() ]
10 | Brooms (Plastic Angle) or cqual w,;jé 43 A [/"'V\/\k $a — ( 51 7. 9; g"{~ é}é)
11 | Brooms — Janitorial Straw 42 Y Upi ¢aen (o— "Lf 4 Q; X
12 | Brooms Maids Straw (Waco) or equal 4?.5 % [/i\,/'gﬂ A (A é %0 82_Y0
13 | Carpet Shampoo — Liquid Ammonia Free g 2| 5 g@%_/ tf é L Z 2; R lﬁ
14 | Carpet Powder & Deodorizer / b o 0 (> ,2 A é; .?/w‘f ig
15 | Carpet Shampoo Liquid 12 SWWW k/ é (2 |25
16 | Carpet Spot Remover 32 oz ?Q»o% W [ > I é( /é/‘, Fo
17 | Carroll Heavy Duty Chemical Deodorant 4/1 Gallons or equal Q iy / / ‘/ . // oD L/ V' Vi)
18 | Cleaner-Diversey General Purpose 4/1 Gallons or equal [7 Ve /ﬂ( l/% ‘:/ ? 6 o 23 . %
19 | Cleaner Oven 24 oz Foam Cleaner [ 5 ok fﬂW [2 | 3. /0 . 2e
20 | Cleaner Stainless Steel waterless based / Ié oL ,wzﬁ%- / > ?.)»f ﬁ, oP
2] | Continental 18” rubber floor squeegees (1800) or equal / f Y ﬁ%ﬂéﬂ]ﬁﬁﬂ / / 31 cs /3 .5
22 | Continental 24: rubber floor squeegee (2400) or equal 9 (_f v g '\44'» (,7"/7%' { J /L/ 5 o / 4.5
23 | Degreaser — 55 gallon CnBl205¢ {;pmﬁ A / ISk dp| 250 .z¢
24 | Detergent — Colgate Palmolive Dishwashing — 12/32 or equal e, 4 28 pd. //ﬁ/m D/ vl ? 5,60 | 2709
25 | Detergent- Power Dishwashing(Cream Suds ) or equivalent -50 1b box C ’ﬂl,tfm f MA/;‘ / //@W /d " 6-p
26 | Detergent Pot & Pan 2-Ltr Clean On The Go (Spar Clean) or equal F /m %ﬂ“’ ?/ ?‘ﬂ ? r 3 9/ 2
27 | Dish Sanitizer 2-Ltr Sani-T (Spar Clean) or equal ;pd%ﬁ_ afm (% /b, . 3 g C{/, _5’ é
28 | Dishwashing Capsules — US Cheinicals 6/8 Ib. (failsafe) or equal 0 . J
29 | Dishwashing Liquid 32 oz. (Dawn) or equal ?-)-o Z ?ﬁlzféw / j&, g > Lﬁ/ ‘ ?QL (/‘c)_
30 | Dishwashing Liquid 42 oz. (Dawn) or equal @)P ml / 7 /M D// vé ‘? j‘, 02 | FL.eD
31 | Disinfectant & Deodorizer Cleaner Aerosol 7 C /4 e / 22— ;, /éé Zé Y
32 | Disinfectant Cleaner Carroll clear pine mop 4/1 gallon (Pinel) or equal //‘Z/A/ A/M E (?/ ‘p' by J‘" ? 3 OD
13 (E)qilsliar;foctant Cleaner Carroll Clear Lemon Mop 4/1 gallon (Lemonl) or -/—: gé‘/g WAV &7 (_,/ q 2 r 27‘— D
34 | Disinfectant Deodorant Spray — Hospital (Tubcreulicial Rated) /o §/f ﬁ?%/(/t (2. |2.9/ |7Y T2

17




EXHIBIT “B”
BID PAGE
RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ,

Jamtomal&fndﬂstnal Supplles i L S

7 “JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”
UNIT | PRICE PER

DESCRIPTION OFITEM(S) QY gy | e

Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Aerosol — Hospital (1 Minute Kill time) [ {5# gﬁﬁm% “ { 20— QZQ / 2y, “2d
Disinfectant Deodorant Spray Hospital / Lé 2> %ﬁ / /~ }/g / ?i{ y%_
Disinfectant Foam Cleaner — Hospital ’7'}1/'7/ / g‘@ & %ﬂ}gﬁ%w / >~ ZJ{? %Ff é

Disinfectant —Cleaning compound for Animal Cage -Consume Eco-Lyzer é// h?éf; 9/ / f/f C/ é , Z;

(Spartan) or equivalent

Disinfectant/Deodorant Spray — Diversely 12/150z (Endbac I) or equal Iﬂl V[;;% 6//47 I L (f qu 5 9 '74

Disinfectant/Cleaner 1qt. Non-Acid Bathroom Cleaner 2}9 & /ﬂ A / s ffr / d()é@
Dispenser - Air Freshener Time Mist Al ;’(/ ZQ/ 2 Z{/ﬁ
Dispenser —Roll Paper Towel — Lever or Crank (Metal or Plastic) - o 7; ) '. ﬂ” L - - T
Dispensers- Liquid Hand Soap (Bulk Soap) %j /2 é/fﬂ#fﬂ, , /.55 / //J/ T
Dispensers- Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Metal) éi(’é f_gl 741 E/ 4, 7 / ?;7 S/
45 | Dispensers — Paper Towels Multi Folds Universal (Plastic ) 1 i ;Z{t 03 ,2?{ o
46 | Dust Cloths (Disposable) Yw )'%/ ‘é &q/f’ gf '7;/1/
47 | Dust Cloths — Non Disposable '
48 | Dust Mop 24”x3 Disposable ) b 5 20
49 | Dust Mop 24” X 5 Non Disposable Ly bbg twais MM o0
Dust Mop 24" x 3 Non Disposablc ) Va7 g Lo
Dust Mop 24” x 5 Disposable M//t[ L//t\/ / ,2 {,’70 é? ﬁ (/ 0
Dust Mop Frames 24 x5 W[[E/\- /2 .15 Zf o
Dust Mop Handles — Swivel Snap On W/ /L:Z"' [ — 4"/0 é q' yd
Dust Mop Treatment (Aerosol) /é cx gﬂgﬁﬁy\ = ? D? 37. ¢ X

£/ foo, (2 |85 |22.5%

Dust Mop Treatment TRU Equal Z2r0z2

Dust Pan Metal — Lobby or equal fﬂg é;,qlzﬂ\; M [ /L (] /{P 10
Dust Pan Plastic — Lobby or equal g) bl 6)0)4,;4(/) f/\]‘Z& / 7o | 9 -0
Enzyme Deodorizers — per gallon Liquid @ N / By /ﬁquﬂ‘ ne ‘7/ 9 7 o ?‘/ - }' 0
Feather Duster Extensions 12 ft @b#ﬂfb M DV*é/é/{/L ‘/ ‘/—l {,Z q,'l ~é,2
Feather Duster Extensions 8ft 4 li(/'(-/ &/ W[YM../ / 9 0 g.%
Feather Dusters 21 inch Ostrich or Equal 6 ),{,3 Lﬁ e _‘) k b / g ; J 5, co
Feather Dusters 26 inch Ostrich or Equal L2 Uniean ( 5.5 | 56D
Floor Cleaner ~ Diveisey Citrus Stridé Neutral 5 gal bx (Stride%) or equal o g / J

f;l]?](; Cleaner — Diversey Floral Fragrance Neutral 4/1 gal (FLStride 14) or 0 " UE w fé% g“ *p %‘ g 0

Floor Finish/Wax — Diversey 5 Gal (VectraS) or equal I} {M"M DI :/ fn,gqf?' (4} Q'? @8 ,6‘7

[0 56 ql;'lﬁ/

Floor Finish — 1 gal SunnySidel (Spartan) or equal vy (; & (

Fumiture Polish Aerosol &&7%0( (9 e {ﬂﬁdm Z,é/ Z/ '33(

N
§m
Ny ST Y

Glass Cleaner —Liquid Concentrate (Spartan) or equal § W M 'Sp,{' m @ s 3; 2 ’5; ‘fb
v
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' “JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUI’PLIES” _ '

I amtorlal & Industrlal Supphes

PRICE PER

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY l}gICTE Lrels
69 | Glass Cleaner RTU — 32 oz, (Spartan) or equal %309 4 Y2 'L#M [ (111 2, L4/
70 | Hand Cleancr — Waterless Gode 4.O)b (29 2 6 1493|9893
71 | Hanging Toilet Bow! Blocks ’ ///ngA/ / X |,57 2%0
72 | Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent (for Commercial Laundry System) (1)/ ﬁé 9 ok 5?@{ J.00| 55,80
73 | Janitorial Cart w/Yellow Vinyl Bag —Rubbernaid (6173) or equ: é (7% I’Z’/fr bz/’dﬂ%/ / / 739 (28 oz
74 | Mop Bucket combo Std Size (Rubbermaid 7580) or equal C?gm;{,lt 7 J / t% ) L/gé 2
75 | Down Press Wringer 35 Qt. Bucket (Wave Brake) orequal ) /5] 5 IZL/ ébfW/ f 70.08 18 .00
76| Mop Bucket, 35 Qt. (Wave Brake) wi3” casters or equal  *) 557 M Dy, [ | s0| 5.000
77 | Mop Handles Fiber Glass 54 Jr. Etc. or equal b% ( jfwﬂgcf f / [2. |/ 5, ,/9/ / Jj hé g
78 | Mop Handles Wood 54” Junior REGY Mméf Ve (A |5F0 70,80
79 | Mop Head Cotton — Size 16 0z (bt I / i (v Z,L{f 2916
80 | Mop Head Cotton - Size 24 0z 2 (L W / S \>- |36 |47 26
81 | Mop Head Cotton — Size 32 oz. 'Z‘}, oL D\)v', lg 1>~ Y Y 5.9
82 | Mop Head Rayon — Size 16 oz. I b {L{/\, Wi l\g— i 2 (o6 Y Z,/H)
83 | Mop Head Rayon — Size 24 oz. MU, W, (@,v V2| g ) é 7.0
84 | Mop Head Rayon — Size 32 oz. 7 VN wile— \ 2> } Yo 3140
85 | Mosquito Repellent Lotion A M/D é«,’z
86 | Mosquito Repellent Spray (sa ‘&Hf‘ pr Wee J{ (- 152764 ({7
87 | Odor Eliminator — Non Acrosol 25 K 22 0% ;ﬂﬁ ﬂjg\m (>~ |-¢ Ol 2,20
88 | Premium Foam Antibacterial Soap Refill (GOJ536202) or cquald; 3_& N’ @94 0 e S| 9.09
89 | Purell Hand Sanitizer Refill-GOJ545604 or equal VW [ 2 32.50 |45 .60
90 | Royal griddle Bricks for Cleaning Grills 12/box (GBRICK) or equal /Lg = | 197 234
91 | Saddle Bag (SB8.5 Clr 6.5x7) or equal Q/Q 0 /“J,g /zodvmgé 2000 |l l"f ) 7 b b
92 | Scouring Sponges Yellow/Green Standard Size 3M/equal ] ¢f 3 M 20 1] 7YYe
93 | Scrubbing Cleansers—21 oz (Comet) or equal ;2_; oy /h‘ )3 W/ ﬁ[fml/ W A [ M S ¥
94 | Soap-Liquid Hand Antibacterial per gallon (pearl hand cleaner) or equal [Mﬁ, ‘)gm,l_, Ll gﬁ[ 146 | 264
95 | Soap Anti Bacterial - Bar 3.5 oz (1,000per casc) £ mﬁ/ Fva .@/ %/ 15 (34 .0~
96 | Soap Bar— 75 oz. — (1,000 per case) 24 bbe¢ fwm;‘f? BM [ so0 | 06T 68 s




EXHIBIT “B”

BID PAGE

RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ

“JANII' ORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES” 7
= Lio Janitorial & Industrihl Supplies Tee it S F i
R i ' " PRICE
DESCRIPTION OF I'I‘EM(S) BRAND QTY PER

: R CASE

97 | Soap Hand — Liquid — ( Bag in Box) go D A Z [ g !/A/p {} j' 6D 7/(/ «
S 15% O Tough ol /d 12/32 0z (OT15S
08 e(];;i;an range Tough cleaner/degreaser oz ( Qa or vﬂ Mf\ m ; ( )f ?\i z 2
929 Spartan antiseptic/antibacterial hand soap 4/1 gal (AntiHsoapl) or equal § 0&« n% 48 ‘lpﬁ éé/ ﬁ_ 0 5 gé .0),6
100 | Spartan bounce back floor ﬁm‘sfl res.torer 4/1 gal (Bouncel) or equal S‘lﬂ‘/ﬁ@%ﬁ KW 7 ‘% A(I“ L[?’gﬂé
101 ilr}?&ang:qzr;l{ Q&A phosphoric acid shower c!h}zjir 1 %S;—Z 9f;oam_y !’/P q WU/I @ +)4 [ 2= 2 Q@ / é
102 | Spartan fresh scent deodorant spray 12/18 oz (Airfresh AER) or equa% 2 %M%L / )\ 2 ,é 0 ? A M
103 Spray Bottles — 24 oz empty bottles or equal % / O [ ' {,/ 7
104 | Spray Bottles — 32 0z empty bottles (bottleqt) or cqual ﬁ / w / > %
105 | Pump #10 1 oz. 1gal. #10 Tube or equal ,Qﬂ/@ﬂVW\,ﬂ K& ,\44—@0) / /,ég [ééo
106 | Toilet Dispenser Universal (12” Jumbo toilet Tissue) & /é’? %) / ¢L é‘f(z ’?{’A: // kg; l& [ / g,m /f .
107 | Toilet Seat Covers D 5'5%0 %M% %@9 IODQ % p=s)
108 | Trash Can 55 Gal XX Large 28x58 1.5 mil  20SP v 2 /3 JSul |/e2 2.S0o
109 | Trash Cans & Lids 16 Gal Wﬂ/L g7 l/ﬁ ? ﬂ 2. %/é 55/W / ;_9 V), ‘7}\?‘ 20
110 | Trash Cans & Lids 32 Gallon (Rubbermaid) or equal ?ﬂfﬁ? Z % MWM [ }?’gs Zsﬂ’ ; j‘/
11 | Trash Cans— 10 Gal 2GSV G~ /Zy}}f / 1,9/ / F57 757
112 | Urinal Block w/Screens M {(\OCA{% / 2/ ‘ é? \'g ,Qé
113 | Urinal Blocks (Blocks Only) FML{’@& ‘{% /‘ y M q )"
114 | Urinal Deodorant Screens — Screens Only 7:0 /(’/b ’ )-’ q 0@
115 | Wasp/Homet Spray [Doz %ﬁ/‘ﬁm [ |%.55 Ulo0
116 | Wasp/Hornet Spray — 20 Ft Stream ' Yo Y 4 {' g bt / o~ 7 ;5 4 21 é d
117 Kﬁ:sitg;g)regg:lor Finish Liquid — High Speed (Vectea)(Johnson & % w %ﬁ é . / 9 2 f lﬂ ] 9« ,Z/
118 | Baggies Y% Size Slider Bag Ziploc Snack Ba_és (Hefty) or equal /w/ é 2% p / 6 ,?‘3
119 | Baggies 4”x4” Enono Zip (Ziploc Regular Sandwich Bags) or equal MC/‘L}?Z g VM o f‘ 6‘- é !’
120 | Baggies Ziploc 16x11 Gallon Size (Hefty) or equal Zﬁ:y N0 /d’ 5‘ zéﬁ ws% QO~7;
121 | Baggies Ziploc 7x8 Quart Size (Hefty or equal @ /Zﬂ /djj ; = , 0 5 2; ] é /
122 | Baggies Freezer Bags 10x11 —200 ct (Quick Seal) or equal Mw / é 29 ) }2_ /D
/ ¥
123 | Butcher Paper 24” 24 4 fo0o é L4/ ﬁ'ﬂ, 0 [! v’ | 0M5 .50
124 | Facial Tissue (Georgia Pacific) equal or better L?E 1\612: &_& A d’/ Zp J / ‘7 . ;@
125 | Film Wrap 18” Heavy Duty 2,000 fi. (Reynolds) or equal 4( (f ﬁd%é ?26 oy ( /ébfg /év é ;
/




EXHIBIT “B”
BID PAGE
RFB No 2016-288-10-05-FAZ
“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES, INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

Jamtorml & Industnal Supphes S0

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND ory | oo R
126 | Film Wrap 1853000~ Heavy Duty (Reynolds) or equal ~ &5 /%7”/; éé/ ]Jv o' | 009% 2940
127 | Foan-BowsGozwhids /62, 9, FL ﬁﬂl ,,j"" /% oYl |2z
128 | Foil Wrap 18" Heavy Duty 500 f. (Reynolds) or equal / ?(/ &517 Jp /J; g ve! |,p5! G 2.bd
129 | Foil Wrap Potato (Reynolds) or equal 711 ) %1 4 Zops |0 /’)Z 5 ;Z,oﬁ
130 | Laced Dollies (different sizes and types) ' ’ ﬂ o 41&/
131 | Menu Tissue 12 x 12 QQ/ éaﬁ C’W /0/000 .0057'{ g% v
132 | Napkins 2 Ply Quarter Fold (Georgia Pacific) or equal
133 | Pactiy —or equal — 9x6 5.2.75 foam hinged Tray W (/ I '3y { ’é Y Ny [ l é 69‘
134 | Pan Liners ~ (Dispozo) 1,000 cs L? o {ﬁéﬁ W ) gt | gp} 3&,‘ 7,§
135 | Paper Bags #10 Brown (Duro) or equal yv o (o g/,Lé» 6&’7} °rd f ?. 6 D
136 | Paper Bags #4 Brown (Duro) or equal gww Lf’gé« gro |,0l6Y |0
137 | Paper Bags #8 Brown (Duro) or equal e 3{{! |50 02| |Lov
138 | Paper Bags 1/6 BBL Brown 1657 (Duro ) or equal 9/7320 [b 5’7 t/’wD ,09 j(é D
139 | Paper Bags 6lb. Brown 6BG (Duro) or equal ﬁ/@ b At |Gy |0 2 | Jo 0
140 | Paper Cups Portion 10 oz (Solo) equal or bettér 4. /2 & éiﬂ/
141 | Paper Roll Towels Kitchen (Scott 1159) or equal 2136 éﬁ;ﬁ\% . é&/ 7’% 5 " g 0 7,[/, o
142 | Paper Towels Brown Rolls Standard Size(Georgia Pacific) or equal  J | & (44 ' / 7/36 [YL 119,23
143 | Paper Towels Multi Fold 21 50D /) / G L/NO 0037015, vo
144 | Paper Towels Multi Folds White Bleached 9.25X9.5 ?, [250 Vl pﬁ’ A 0/N o |,004 j n 4’ 2
Tas CP;}]):{ Towels (GEP89460) En-motion high capacity —whit %8{00 ar t 75 % f’ { 2 ?’ ; 06 55«' féf
146 | Styrofoam Bowl - 6 oz. 1,000 case Da ,qﬂ LB29 |Jesw |03 |F0.23
147 | Styrofoam Bowls 12 oz. (Pacific 1-0012) equal or better M o TH[ 00 ) / 20D 0D }ﬂ,i; f ‘
148 | Styrofoam Cup 8 oz. (8J8) or equal ”ﬂ ST7F Jovo |, 02 |25 . 09
149 | Styrofoam Cups oz. (UJ4) or equal Wﬂ ' ij’ L/ /0 oD |0 M| ). 0P
150 | Styrofoam Plates 6” Laminated / ﬂ{Z(/ le/""l’ ol /M o |03 7230
151 | Styrofoam Plates 6” Un-laminated P/wAu TH 08¢ |[ovo | -2114 ['“'( s
152 | Styrofoam Plates 9" Divided (Mobil TJ 1-0011) or equal 'Pa 0’7 U ‘f K oogd 0 %4 445
153 | Styrofoam Plates 9” Laminated ' N ny ,é,zl
154 | Styrofoam Plates 9” Un-laminated )w}é}/ Sep | 07Y9 |1N-YS




EXHIBIT “B”
BID PAGE
RFB Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ

L

“JANITORIAL SUPPLIES INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

Jamtonal & Iudust I l% Supphes
, ) UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OF ITEV(S) BRAND QTY | ppicE PER
' CASE

Styrofoam Tray Hinges 9x9x3 Three Compartment w/Lid (Pactiv YTD

lodign 14401

5o

09

(375

30 19903) 150 cs or equal

Styrofoam Hinged Lid container 9 3/6 in. x 6 1/2in. x 2 % in. rectangular . N
156 | white 150/case [)_/,Lu&u { pros |16v | .1 [&50
157 | Toilet Tissue (12/1000 Jr Jumbo) (Georgia Pacific) or equal ; Cﬂr 0@ )/,LA %ﬂ"ﬁﬁ 2( o % V),
158 | Toilet Tissue 2 Ply Small Short Sheet (Georgia Pacific) or equal 21T ﬂ? 5(; ﬂ’\ff ;ﬁ's@f‘b 5@;’5 : 'Bgf ?36”. )"z /
159 | Toilet Tissue (6/Jumbo 2000 ft) (Georgia Pacific) or equal [9-019’9( %f} }}jﬁ (ﬂ l#,g 0 Zy . y 2
160 | Utensils Forks — Plastic 2,000 ct (James River Wn F2P) or equal n o f ‘d
161 Utensils Forks — Plastic Dispozo — medium 1,000 cs (WMF) or equal ﬂaﬂ./ / Ti“;éi / QP 0 , 0 [{ ; [ ‘ ‘g/p
162 | Utensils Forks —Plastic medjum Weight White 1,000 ct (Solo or Equal) O W D{M}, “&] , U 5 ) “ g , l :9 O
163 | Utensils Forks Clear (1,000 cf) "M A4
164 | Utensils Spoons Plastic (Solo) or equal 0-{'\\} )[ Mo/ v |, 0 It ( ]1-€9
165 | Utensils Spoons Plastic 1,000 ct (Solo) or equal OW ) 4 @l(;: i oup |eo 0 { [l ;b
166 | Utensils Spoons Plastic Dispozo medium WMS 1,000 ct or equal My\) M‘V:&’) )U‘U’U Lo [} 5 “ S’D
167 | Utensils Spoons Plastic medium Weight White (1,000 ct) ‘{) W UL l ovoe | ,pll 5 | (. Q
168 | Utensils Party Packs (Spoons, Forks, Knife, Napkin, Salt & Pepper) OW é}W' M 2; O ,0/) )7 ¥ ‘7 j
169 | Vented Lid-Dart (12712) or equal [/mg‘/ ]2 T [2e6 |01 2 Cr
170 | Vented Lid— Dart (838) or equal Dot §a0 | fowo |01 | /128
171 | Vented Lid — Dart (20JL) 10/100 case or equal ,bﬂf prEY [0 e |, 0! ‘2 19 .o%
172 | Wipers Workhorse Rags (Kimberly Clark) or equal W( 00 [é(/ q () 309/]2 4; P
173 | Wipers— (Kimberly Clark) 1516.5 white (300cs) (K41400) or equal \k\{( L o7, [[,{;, Qev | ] |2%.8p
174 | Body Shampoo — Per Gallon // WL’ é yY ‘ aép /L@Q 2@&(/
175 | Deodorant—Hygiene 4 No B é)’ ) '
176 | Lice Killer — Aerosol /) © M
177 | Razors — Double Edged . no 4
178 | Sanitary Napkins Maxi No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or equal) Hq) 5{)‘? to ‘\{ A 74 9,90 . ' [ ") v
179 | Sanitary Napkins Panty Liners ' /4 [J
180 | Sanitary Napkins Super No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochester, etc. or equal) H—b;/)"/w ‘\{ 1 e/ QQ ) l 7’57 -")O
181 | Sanitary Napkins Thin No 4 Folded (Stayfree, Rochétcr, etc or equal Np Q/)Vcé’ l \{/\ (= ;LFD o | { 210
182 Shaving Cream - % b ZZ/

183

Toothbrush Firm — Specify Size

2%

Pzl




REVISED EXHIBIT “B”
BID PAGE
RI'B Ne 2016-288-10-05-FAZ
“JANITORIAL SUPPLIFS INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS & SUPPLIES”

: Jamtm lal&Industrlal Supphes s

UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM(S) BRAND QTY PRICE. PER
CASE

Toothbrush Medium Specify Size

184
185 | Toothbrush Soft Specify Size Ne 4.7

186 | Toothpaste Std Size, Specify Size /) g M

187 | Toothpaste Travel Size, Specify Size I7r e

| b s L ge | 2 1517201344
189 | Buffing Pads 17” White Y2y, < P06 /e Fe
190 | Buffing Pads 20” White ’ Lo S 272327344
6 :(;]l;zlls Windsor Exhaust for Sensor Xp12 Vacuum Cleaner (5143EF) or W 045; N / / / /. L/ T2
192 gnérgllsE %7)11‘1)?5:(; :Illcm Hygiene for Sensor XP 12 Vacuum Cleaner . ;/L/ / / 3 5 207
193 Stripping Pads 17 Black l 90 DL
194 | Stripping Pads 20” Black %% g 5_,‘2:] fi, //3 [f ¢
B | S e A [0 | o4 2095
196 Gloves - Food Service Large Clear (Brand Name) ﬂ% / e | D Lq / ? o720
197 | Gloves — Food Service — Medium clear (Brand Nam) 7.3 froo | 019 /9.
198 | Gloves Latex Small Disposable (Ansell )Yw or equal % 14 ﬂy (24 / poo ’(D M ZA L0
199 | Gloves Latex Large Disposable Iéé) Zﬂfw /M D 3 é zé . (}’ﬂ
200 | Gloves Latex Large Non-Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equa (- | lp L Qb’ 17 / ~ |, Y7 g

201 | Gloves Latex Medium Non Disposable Yw (Ansell) or equal| | [ é m %4) ey [ 2 L/‘7 5’,2(7
202 | Gloves Latex Medium Disposable (Ansell) or equal % é’ o Jowo |03 b 2 . 10
203 | Gloves Latex Small Non Disposable Yellow (Ansell) or equal //7% {Ip 710 J— g ; é c/’
204 | Gloves Safety (Nitrile) SFZGNPRXLIM or equal é Z v )%‘)4 2177 /po0 |,09 ( yé' /0
205 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powdered V9o hP% 7\/19 g@fw Vsao |, 022—|7 00
206 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powdered \,}I/D/g P-,\,«/ LLD Vo / svo | 022,00
207 | Gloves Vinyl, Large Powdered \/ 0% P|/ /{,L; fw } opo | 0P | 2R 1D
208 | Gloves Vinyl, Small Powder Free Vied F5 loov |,02¢ (2350
209 | Gloves Vinyl, Medium Powder Free l/j/v')) FM ﬂf w /‘9 0P D;LL/ % @
210 | Gloves Vinyl, Large Powder Free Vi|o% (L ;Aé (0 /gro o 'D}i 2. S0
211 | Gloves Latex, Small Powder Free L/eS F{ / /gw  Jeoo |,p (/0 95‘ ’)Z
212 | Gloves Latex, Medium Powder Free L[oSF ,Lrlbé(/b’&? vop | pUYD| 39 24
213 | Gloves Latex, Large Powder Free L/p (FL 64'9_{/(/60 /pgD Yo 34,1 f/_
214 | Gloves Latex, Small Powdered Lios ‘05 /}D{/ﬁ@ [p@o |, D326 3/ Ve
215 | Gloves Latex, Medium Powdered Livg I /4/79 ;“/ éco ogp | .03 |2 é v
216 | Gloves Latex, Large Powdered Lios PL %—k;jﬁ (o Joso | b Fd 6. 9D |
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4
217 | Body Towels Standard Size ﬂ) M
=7
flo| LA

218 Hand Towels Standard Size

: n
219 | Trash Liners - 45 Gal X-Large 40x48 16 Mic High Density Can Liner %/W l/q Q;p . be @ }Z/ W

Trash Liners — Pitt Plastics 23x33 12-16 gal Black 1000cs (32 BL) or ] N :
20 | o H (o0 |,037—|3)-4/
Trash Liners — Large Trash Can 13 MIC 30 x 37 High Density Can ,/ ~
221 | [0 é«lmbi S0 | bY3 |24, 20
292 E:Z?SUHCFS —Large Trash Can 16 MIC 33 Gal 33x40 High Density Can &;W 2 5‘ p) W) é é) / /é :
223 | Trash Liners— Tall Trash Can 8 MIC 24 x 33 High Density Can Liners W M Z&'ﬂ o|,007— | & g (/
) )

224 | Trash Liners — 55 gallons 05T oo | Bennly Vowo | AU |84 50
225 | Toilet Brushes (Standard Size) Plastic ' &yﬁéfw ‘ { |/ s |/.Co
226 | Toilet Brushes — Hard Bristle Bowl Brush (0310) (Rubbermaid) or equal | 44 bt pra A /! |/ to|/ts
He £

227 | Weed Killer (Round Up) or equal

228 | Weed Killer 55 Gallon concentrated — Specify Dilution L, N M

229 | Spartan Sanitize Quart Food Service 12/32 oz (SRTU) or equal /)7%? fﬂﬂﬂ#{e\/ [ P . / ,_ﬂ; :2[ 7>y ]
230 | Sprayer (Trigger/Nozzles Only) red & white ) N 7‘70 / %L?i/ é/ p l./ b P l@
231 Bleach — Disinfectant Cleaner Dry Air — Hospital é é 4 3 ‘ - f 37? /,' 2y
232 | Bleach - Pure Bright Disinfection 6/cs (BLCH) or equal Y/Z/éf;/ Ig;,ﬁgﬁ,?u/ é //,27 73 j/, op
233 | Bio-Hazard Bag Red 40 X 48 3 mil - %{Lﬂ#‘i % , g LD ‘;Zé 7.
234 | Disinfectant Wipes (Lysol) or equal é ~1 5 J/ﬁ V3 & [F; 2 106 é ,2,% <

ACKNOWLEDGMENT FORM/BIDDER INFORMATION

I/We the undersigned hereby certify that I/We am/are a duly authorized official of the company and have the authority to sign on behalf
of the company and assure that all statements made in the bid are true. I/We agree to furnish and deliver the specified items/services at
the prices stated herein, and have read, understand, and agree to the terms and conditions contained herein and on all of the attachments.

MINCONISNY £y [ Lot fapin G
ADDRESS: L35 Rk Wt di 7t BIod
CITY/STATE/ZIP CODE: [T/ 5 snsnss [1Z , TE4AL 1EE 2
TELEPHONE NUMBER (QA’Z) SY/- pagl

E-MAIL ADDRESS: GCll S @ aée. Covn
CELLULAR NUMBERS: @D <7 39— LYY

FAX NUMBER: GLLD Sl- 208

T pugh e
PRINTED NAME: ’ [ﬁﬂfg M. o quna
TITLE: Sadlere Hep

DATE: [o— % -20l(
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e ] GULFC-3 OP ID; FJ
ACERO CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE e
ONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND C
D OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEN
ONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A C
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies ma

policy(ies) must be sndorsed. if SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
y require an endorsement. A statement on this cerificate does not confer rights to the

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURA
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY RE UIREMENT,
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE

certificate holder in lleu of such endorsement(s).
PRODUGCER CONTACT
GSM Insurors-Victora P&C PHONE FAX
P, O. Box 2447 (Ll ) (A/C, No):
Victoria, TX 77802 ADDRESS:
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIG #
INSURER A ;: Phoenix Insurance Company 25623
INSURED Guif Coast Paper Co., Inc. imsurer 8 : Travelers Indemnity Company ' |25682
P O Box 4227 INSURER G :
Victoria, TX 77903-4227 :
INSURERD ;
INSURERE :
INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

INSURANCE AFFORD

NCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOGUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

ED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO

ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. UMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAINS.
Ve TYPE OF INSURANCE SR POLICY NUMBER (RBa N !E%% LIMITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE 1,000,00
v | [ DAMAGE 70 RENTED
A | X | cOMMERGIAL GENERAL LIABILITY 660-1A578276 06/30/2016 | 06/30/2017 pREmSEE§ (Ea assumvence) 100,00
| cLamsmane OCCUR MED EXP (Any one parson) 5,00
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY 1,000,000
j GENERAL AGGREGATE 2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUGTS - COMP/OP AGG 2,000,000
poucy [ X PR [ | 1oc S
| AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY SOMBRIED SINGLE LIy 1,000,000
B | X |anvauro BA-1A635521 06/30/2018 | 06/30/2017 | BODILY INJURY (Per parson)
|| AVOWNED [ ] SCHEDULED BODILY INJURY (Per accldant)
\i HIRED AUTOS zg%gwnao PROPERTY DGMAGE
| [umereLtavae | X [ occur EAGH OCCURRENGE 5,000,000
B EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE ICUP-3A301589 06/30/2016 | 06/30/2017 AGGREGATE 5,000,000
DED | X | RETENTION 10,000
WORKERS COMPENSATION X [ JC STATU. oTH-
A AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY S OBAs12308
%Agg&zg%ﬁmggxswms filla 6 06/30/2016 | 06/30/2017 | £... gAcH ACGIDENT 1,000,000
anaato, n .
"E“’ y H n;. . E.L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYE 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT f 1,000,000/

see notes

DESCRIPTION OF OFERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remarka Sehedule, If more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Hidalga County
Purchasing Department
2812 8. Business Hwy, 281
[Edinburg, TX 78539

HIDAEDI

SHOULD ANY QF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED

THE EXPIRATION DATE THE

REOF,

ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

P £F

© 1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION, All rlahts reserved.
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. HOLDER CODE HIDAEDI GULFC-3 PAGE 2
NOTEPAD: INSURED'S NawE  Gulf Coast Paper Co., Inc. OP ID: FJ Date  10/04/2016

The General Liability, Buto Liability, and Excess Liabilit{ goliciea .
includes a blanket automatic additional insured endorsemen hat provides
additional insured status to the certificate holder only whan there is a
written contract between the named insured and the certificate holder that
requires such gtatus.

The General Liability, Auto Liability, Excess Liability, and Workers .
COmpensatign Ko%icies includes a blanket automatic waiver of subrogation

endorsemen gﬁovidas thie feature only when there is a written
contract between the named insured and the eertificate holder that

requires it.




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES
ForM 1295

lofl

OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2016-116726

Gulf Coast Paper Co

Brownsville, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 09/27/2016

being filed.

Hidalgo County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

RFB Project No. (2016-288)
Janitorial Supplies & Industrial Chemical & Supplies

Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

9 AFFIDAY'T ) " = | sweg¥{ or affirm, ynder penalpyof perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.
CAROLINA CLEGHORN
My Commission Expires
January 7, 2018
S{g }L/e of authorized agent of contracting business entity .
AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE
Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said [21’1/ lna é//// heirn , this the 4’/ day of /ﬁéﬁéfl/ ,

20 Q , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

[Z’f//r%w-t/) /%/%/ Cawtivie lzalem N o7#d

Signature of ofﬁceéédministering oath Printed name of oﬁiceraﬂministering oath Title of officer admllnistering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOorM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

of business.
Gulf Coast Paper Co
Brownsville, TX United States

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place

being filed.
Hidalgo County

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is

OFFICE USE ONLY
CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:
2016-116726

Date Filed:
09/27/2016

Date Acknowledged:
11/02/2016

RFB Project No. (2016-288)
Janitorial Supplies & Industrial Chemical & Supplies

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
6 AFFIDAVIT | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said , this the day of ;
20 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.
Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath
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