HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET
|

“MATS, DUST MOPS & SHOP RAGS & TOWELS”

BID No.: 2017-057-04-26-FAZ

PARTICIPATING VENDORS

SOLE BIDDER

Estimated MODEL LAUNDRY, LLC
ITEM DESCRIPTION Quantity
P. O.Box 178
Los Indios, TX 78567
UNIT COST | WEEKLY COST
Product #1 Floor Mats - Non Slip
3 x4 200+/- $1.28 ea. $ 256.00
3’x5 140+/- $1.28 ea. $ 179.20
3’ x 5° scrapper 6+/- $.85 ea. $5.10
3’ x 10’ 5+/- $2.55 ea. $12.75
X6 134+/- $1.70 ea. $227.80
4’ x 6° scrapper 10+/- $1.28 ea. $12.80
5x8 25+/- $3.40 ea. $85.00
X 1 $3.40 ea. $3.40

(w/Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office Logo)

Product #2 — Dry Mops, Dust Mops & Bar Mops (Handles & frames are to be included for all sizes listed below)
Color/Material: Red, Blue & Orange / Synthetic Blend

24” 154+/- $0.22 ea. $33.88
28” 2+/- No Bid No Bid
327 19+/- No Bid No Bid
36” 447+/- $0.325 ea. $145.28
48” 60+/- $0.43 ea. $25.80
Dust Forever Mops 30+/- $0.22 ea. $6.60
Wet Forever Mops 2+/- $0.22 ea. $0.44
Collapsible Mop 1+/- $0.25 ea. $0.25

Product #3 - Wipers
Color / Material: Red / 100% Cotton
18x 18 94-+/- $0.04 ea. $3.76

Product #4 - Wet Mops
Material: Synthetic Blend

16 oz. 150+/- $0.42 ea. $63.00
24 oz. 150+/- $0.465 ea. $69.75
32 0z. 226+/- $0.51 ea. $115.26

Product #5 — Terry, Microfiber & Grid Towels
Material: Terry Cotton

17 X 20 | 298+/- | $0.11 ea. | $32.78

Product #6 - Shop Rags
Color / Material: Red / 100% Cotton

18 x 18 | 300+/- | 04 ea. | $12.00

Product #7 - Yellow Duster Wiper
Material: Rayon

18 x 22 10+/- $0.17 ea. $1.70

24 x 24 10+/- $0.17 ea. $1.70




