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CATEGORY (A) – PIPES 
CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE 

NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe 
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT) 

TYPE “IR” PIPE 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

12” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

15” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

18” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

24” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

30” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

36” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

42” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

48” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

54” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

60” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

66” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

72” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

78” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

84” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

90” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

96” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

102”LF  No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

108” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

114” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

120” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

126” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

132” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

138” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

144” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

CORRUGATED POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) STORM SEWER PIPE 
NIGP CODE: 665-89 Polyvinyl Chloride (PVC) 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

12” LF No bid 7.53 No bid 6.69 No bid 

15” LF No bid 11.12 No bid 11.71 No bid 

18” LF No bid 16.14 No bid 15.74 No bid 

24” LF No bid 32.38 No bid 30.82 No bid 

30” LF No bid 39.68 No bid 44.40 No bid 

36” LF No bid 55.17 No bid 65.63 No bid 

42” LF No bid No bid No bid 85.86 No bid 

48” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 
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“CONTINUED” 

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE 

NIGP CODE:  210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe 
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT) 

TYPE “I” PIPE 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

12” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

15” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

18” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

24” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

30” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

36” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

42” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

48” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

54” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

60” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

66” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

72” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

78” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

84” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

90” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

96” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

102” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

108” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

114” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

120” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

126” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

132” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

138” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

144” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

 

“CONTINUED” 

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE 

NIGP CODE:  210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe 
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT) 

TYPE “IA” PIPE 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

12” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

15” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

18” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

24” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

30” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

36” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

42” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

48” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

54” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

60” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

66” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

72” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

78” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

84” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

90” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

96” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

102” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

108” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

114” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

120” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

126” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

132” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

138” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

144” LF No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 
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REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE – RUBBER GASKET JOINT PIPE 
NIGP CODE:  658-68 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a 

CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

 
CLASS 

III 

CLASS 

IV 

CLASS 

V 

CLASS 

III 

CLASS 

IV 

CLASS 

V 

CLASS 

III 

CLASS 

IV 

CLASS 

V 

CLASS 

III 

CLASS 

IV 

CLASS 

V 

CLASS 

III 

CLASS 

IV 

CLASS 

V 

12” LF 15.64 20.10 22.22 17.05 17.05 18.95 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

15” LF 18.40 23.28 25.39 21.47 24.00 24.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

18” LF 21.16 26.45 28.57 24.63 26.53 29.05 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

24” LF 29.60 33.86 35.97 34.11 42.32 44.84 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

30” LF 43.80 47.49 50.91 46.74 56.84 73.89 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

36” LF 61.85 67.71 72.30 70.11 88.42 104.21 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

42” LF 82.12 83.05 95.31 93.47 117.47 146.53 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

48” LF 94.67 104.74 120.41 113.05 146.53 194.53 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

54” LF 112.78 128.34 146.64 133.26 205.89 223.58 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

60” LF 141.43 159.51 188.88 168.00 234.32 267.16 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

72” LF 195.29 225.18 276.28 235.58 298.74 366.95 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE – TONGUE & GROOVE PIPE 
NIGP CODE:  658-68 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a 

CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

 CLASS 
III 

CLASS 
IV 

CLASS 
V 

CLASS 
III 

CLASS 
IV 

CLASS 
V 

CLASS 
III 

CLASS 
IV 

CLASS 
V 

CLASS 
III 

CLASS 
IV 

CLASS 
V 

CLASS 
III 

CLASS 
IV 

CLASS 
V 

12” LF 12.88 16.93 18.22 15.05 15.05 17.11 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

15” LF 15.64 20.10 21.25 16.42 17.11 21.89 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

18” LF 18.40 23.28 24.29 20.53 21.89 23.95 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

24” LF 26.00 29.62 30.36 28.74 36.26 37.63 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

30” LF 39.68 41.45 50.37 40.37 49.26 64.32 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

36” LF 54.37 60.09 70.57 58.84 68.42 108.79 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

42” LF 73.98 76.18 85.29 83.47 98.53 152.58 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

48” LF 93.21 100.10 113.74 99.89 146.42 202.53 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

54” LF 109.49 121.93 137.07 137.53 202.53 232.63 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

60” LF 135.22 153.30 174.65 160.11 230.58 279.84 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

72” LF 195.29 225.18 254.98 230.58 289.42 381.11 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

REINFORCED POLYTHYLENE PIPE – 20 FOOT JOINTS 
NIGP CODE:  658-58 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply 

Ferguson 
Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

24” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

30” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

36” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

42” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

48” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

54” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

60” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

72” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

84” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 

96” LF No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid 
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AWWA C900 PVC PLASTIC PRESSURE PIPE 
NIGP CODE:658-56 PLASTIC PIPES OR 

NIGP CODE:  658-60 PVC PIPES 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a 

CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

 
DR 

14 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

14 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

14 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

14 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 
DR 14 DR 18 DR 25 

4” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.72 2.13 1.55 2.82 2.21 1.61 2.48 1.94 1.42 No bid No bid No bid 

6” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.28 4.20 3.06 5.52 4.39 3.20 4.82 3.84 2.79 No bid No bid No bid 

8” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.07 7.28 5.26 9.48 7.60 5.48 8.28 6.65 4.80 No bid No bid No bid 

10” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.81 10.94 7.95 14.42 11.42 8.30 12.60 9.98 7.25 No bid No bid No bid 

12” LF No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.52 15.43 11.24 20.38 16.12 11.73 17.80 14.08 10.25 No bid No bid No bid 
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 *-- No Bid        *-- No Bid           *-- No Bid 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

AWWA C905 PVC PLASTIC WATER PIPE 
NIGP CODE:  658-56 PLASTIC PIPES OR 

NIGP CODE:  658-60 PVC PIPES 
VENDORS Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a CAPA HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

 
DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

32.5 

DR 

41 

DR 

51 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

32.5 

DR 

41 

DR 

51 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

32.5 

DR 

41 

DR 

51 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

32.5 

DR 

41 

DR 

51 

DR 

18 

DR 

25 

DR 

32.5 

DR 

41 

DR 

51 

14” LF -- -- -- -- -- 27.89 20.53 15.79 13.16 No Bid -- -- -- -- -- 20.58 15.12 -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

16” LF -- -- -- -- -- 36.32 26.32 20.53 18.42 No Bid -- -- -- -- -- 26.63 19.59 -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

18” LF -- -- -- -- -- 45.79 33.35 25.79 23.16 No Bid -- -- -- -- -- 33.49 24.77 -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

24” LF -- -- -- -- -- 80.32 58.95 45.26 41.05 No Bid -- -- -- -- -- 75.11 54.98 -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

30” LF -- -- -- -- -- 131.58 91.58 70.53 65.26 60.00 -- -- -- -- -- 120.13 91.24 -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

36” LF -- -- -- -- -- No Bid 131.58 102.11 91.58 82.11 -- -- -- -- -- 206.71 150.76 -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

42” LF -- -- -- -- -- No Bid 236.84 138.95 123.16 100.00 -- -- -- -- -- No Bid No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 

48” LF -- -- -- -- -- No Bid 315.79 247.37 230.53 198.95 -- -- -- -- -- No Bid No Bid -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 
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HIGH DESTINY POLYETHYLENE PIPE (HDPE) 
NIGP CODE: 658-58 Polyethylene Pipe And Fitting 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 

Act Pipe & 

Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks 

Pipe & 

Supply 

4”LF No Bid .93 .94 1.07 .94 

6”LF No Bid 2.32 2.33 2.66 2.33 

8”LF No Bid 3.84 3.85 4.39 3.85 

10”LF No Bid 5.40 5.40 6.17 5.40 

12”LF No Bid 5.58 5.59 6.17 5.59 

15”LF No Bid 8.54 8.55 9.42 8.55 

18”LF No Bid 11.60 11.61 12.80 11.61 

24”LF No Bid 18.00 18.00 19.84 18.00 

30”LF No Bid 27.75 27.75 30.59 27.75 

36”LF No Bid 34.91 34.92 38.49 34.92 

42”LF No Bid 48.57 48.58 53.55 48.58 

48”LF No Bid 53.86 53.87 59.58 53.87 

54”LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

60”LF No Bid 93.13 93.13 102.60 93.13 

 
 
 
 

SDR 26 AND SDR 35 GASKETED GRAVITY SANITARY SEWER PIPE 
NIGP CODE:  210-35 

SEWER PIPE JOINT SEALING COMPOUND 
VENDORS 

Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a 

CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

 SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35 SDR 26 SDR 35 

4” LF No Bid No Bid 1.17 .87 1.22 .91 1.07 .80 No Bid No Bid 

6” LF No Bid No Bid 2.51 1.89 2.63 1.98 2.28 1.72 No Bid No Bid 

8” LF No Bid No Bid 4.52 3.39 4.74 3.55 4.12 3.09 No Bid No Bid 

10” LF No Bid No Bid 7.08 5.32 7.42 5.57 6.46 4.84 No Bid No Bid 

12” LF No Bid No Bid 10.09 7.63 10.57 8.00 9.20 6.95 No Bid No Bid 

15” LF No Bid No Bid 15.34 11.36 16.05 11.89 13.98 10.30 No Bid No Bid 

HIGH PERFORMANCE (HP) POLYPROPYLENE STORM PIPE 
VENDORS 

Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a 
CAPA 

HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks 
Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

12” LF No Bid 7.26 7.27 8.15 7.27 

15” LF No Bid 9.07 9.07 10.17 9.07 

18” LF No Bid 11.96 11.97 13.42 11.97 

24” LF No Bid 20.18 20.19 22.25 20.18 

30” LF No Bid 31.39 31.39 34.60 31.39 

36” LF No Bid 36.34 36.34 40.06 36.34 

42” LF No Bid 46.64 46.65 51.42 46.64 

48” LF No Bid 61.16 61.16 67.42 61.16 

60” LF No Bid 95.86 95.87 105.67 95.87 
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PLUMBING PIPES – 20 FOOT SECTIONS 
NIGP CODE:  967-60 

PVC 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 

Act Pipe & 

Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks 

Pipe & 

Supply 

½” No Bid .40 No Bid 2.80 No Bid 

1 ½” No Bid .75 No Bid 9.20 No Bid 

2” No Bid .95 No Bid 11.60 No Bid 

3” No Bid 1.50 No Bid 23.80 No Bid 

4” No Bid 2.25 No Bid 37.80 No Bid 

 
 
 PLUMBING PIPES – 20 FOOT SECTIONS 

NIGP CODE:  967-60 

COPPER 

VENDORS 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 

Act Pipe & 

Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks 

Pipe & 

Supply 

½” No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 No Bid 

¾” No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.60 No Bid 
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CATEGORY (B) – INLETS  
NIGP CODE:  210-31 

INLETS, AREA, SEWER DRAIN, PRECAST, CONCRETE, STORM DRAIN, NO BOTTOM FLOORS 

DESCRIPTION Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply Water 

Works 
Act Pipe & Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

Type "A" 

Inlet 

(5' x 3') 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 915.00 No Bid 

2 ½’ 904.14 No Bid No Bid 981.00 No Bid 

3’ 908.98 No Bid No Bid 1,025.00 No Bid 

3 ½’ 928.50 No Bid No Bid 1,092.00 No Bid 

4’ 968.58 No Bid No Bid 1,136.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ 1,023.16 No Bid No Bid 1,203.00 No Bid 

5’ 1,079.06 No Bid No Bid 1,247.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ 1,143.25 No Bid No Bid 1,314.00 No Bid 

6’ 1,224.10 No Bid No Bid 1,358.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ 1,293.84 No Bid No Bid 1,425.00 No Bid 

7’ 1,363.59 No Bid No Bid 1,469.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ 1,430.57 No Bid No Bid 1,481.00 No Bid 

8’ 1,483.68 No Bid No Bid 1,581.00 No Bid 

8 ½’ 1,501.12 No Bid No Bid 1,647.00 No Bid 

9’ 1,516.34 No Bid No Bid 1,691.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ 1,570.92 No Bid No Bid 1,758.00 No Bid 

10’ 1,626.82 No Bid No Bid 1,803.00 No Bid 

Type "A-1" 

Inlet 

(5' x 4') 
 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "A-2" 

Inlet 

(5' x 5') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 995.00 No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,076.00 No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,140.00 No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,212.00 No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,267.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,347.00 No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,402.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,484.00 No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,538.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,620.00 No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,675.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,756.00 No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,810.00 No Bid 
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 8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,893.00 No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,945.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,026.00 No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,083.00 No Bid 

Type "A-3" 

Inlet 

(5' x 6') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "A" 

(SPL-1) Inlet 

(5' x 3') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "A-1" 

(SPL-1) Inlet 

(5' x 4') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "A-2" 

(SPL-1) Inlet 

(5' x 5') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid 3,538.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid 3,628.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid 3,718.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid 3,808.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid 3,898.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid 3,988.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid 4,078.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid 4,168.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid 4,258.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid 4,348.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid 4,437.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "A-3" 

(SPL-1) Inlet 

(5' x 6') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

TYPE “C” 

Inlet 

(2’ X 2’) 

2’ No Bid 442.89 No Bid 412.00 No Bid 

2 ½’ 640.02 484.51 No Bid 478.00 No Bid 

3’ 696.79 526.12 No Bid 468.00 No Bid 
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3 ½’ 753.57 567.73 No Bid 700.00 No Bid 

4’ 806.78 609.34 No Bid 728.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ 863.57 650.95 No Bid 850.00 No Bid 

5’ 916.78 692.56 No Bid 895.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ 973.56 734.17 No Bid 962.00 No Bid 

6’ 1,026.77 775.78 No Bid 1,006.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ 1,090.67 817.39 No Bid 1,128.00 No Bid 

7’ 1,136.77 859.00 No Bid 1,173.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ 1,193.55 900.61 No Bid 1,295.00 No Bid 

8’ 1,246.76 942.22 No Bid 1,339.00 No Bid 

8 ½’ 1,303.55 983.83 No Bid 1,462.00 No Bid 

9’ 1,356.76 1,025.44 No Bid 1,512.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ 1,413.55 1,067.05 No Bid 1,634.00 No Bid 

10’ 1,466.76 1,108.66 No Bid 1,673.00 No Bid 

TYPE “C” 

Inlet 

(3’ X 3’) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid 1,043.26 No Bid 784.00 No Bid 

2 ½’ 829.80 1,043.26 No Bid 815.00 No Bid 

3’ 901.51 1,043.26 No Bid 946.00 No Bid 

3 ½’ 973.21 1,098.74 No Bid 1,076.00 No Bid 

4’ 1,044.91 1,154.21 No Bid 1,090.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ 1,116.61 1,209.68 No Bid 1,220.00 No Bid 

5’ 1,188.31 1,265.16 No Bid 1,252.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ 1,260.01 1,320.63 No Bid 1,382.00 No Bid 

6’ 1,331.71 1,376.11 No Bid 1,414.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ 1,403.41 1,431.58 No Bid 1,544.00 No Bid 

7’ 1,475.11 1,487.05 No Bid 1,576.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ 1,546.81 1,542.53 No Bid 1,699.00 No Bid 

8’ 1,618.51 1,598.00 No Bid 1,738.00 No Bid 

8 ½’ 1,690.22 1,653.47 No Bid 1,868.00 No Bid 

9’ 1,761.92 1,708.95 No Bid 1,900.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ 1,833.62 1,765.42 No Bid 2,030.00 No Bid 

10’ 1,905.32 1,819.89 No Bid 2,062.00 No Bid 

TYPE “C” 

Inlet 

(4’ X 4’) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid 1,690.16 No Bid 1,022.00 No Bid 

2 ½’ 1,136.62 1,690.16 No Bid 1,076.00 No Bid 

3’ 1,240.17 1,690.16 No Bid 1,270.00 No Bid 

3 ½’ 1,347.26 1,690.16 No Bid 1,324.00 No Bid 

4’ 1,450.81 1,690.16 No Bid 1,517.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ 1,554.35 1,690.16 No Bid 1,711.00 No Bid 

5’ 1,661.45 1,764.42 No Bid 1,765.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ 1,764.99 1,838.68 No Bid 1,958.00 No Bid 

6’ 1,868.53 1,987.21 No Bid 2,012.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ 1,972.07 2,061.47 No Bid 2,206.00 No Bid 

7’ 2,079.17 2,135.74 No Bid 2,260.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ 2,182.71 2,210.00 No Bid 2,453.00 No Bid 

8’ 2,286.26 2,284.26 No Bid 2,507.00 No Bid 
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8 ½’ 2,396.91 2,358.53 No Bid 2,701.00 No Bid 

9’ 2,500.46 2,432.79 No Bid 2,755.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ 2,604.00 2,507.05 No Bid 2,948.00 No Bid 

10’ 2,711.10 2,581.32 No Bid 3,002.00 No Bid 

TYPE “CC” 

Inlet 

(5’ x 3’) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid 1,082.63 No Bid 1,144.00 No Bid 

2 ½’ 1,262.14 1,082.63 No Bid 1,180.00 No Bid 

3’ 1,267.29 1,082.63 No Bid 1,360.00 No Bid 

3 ½’ 1,288.03 1,082.63 No Bid 1,396.00 No Bid 

4’ 1,303.28 1,082.63 No Bid 1,526.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ 1,357.86 1,175.26 No Bid 1,756.00 No Bid 

5’ 1,413.76 1,266.95 No Bid 1,792.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ 1,477.95 1,359.11 No Bid 1,972.00 No Bid 

6’ 1,558.80 1,451.26 No Bid 2,008.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ 1,628.54 1,543.42 No Bid 2,188.00 No Bid 

7’ 1,698.29 1,635.58 No Bid 2,224.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ 1,765.27 1,727.74 No Bid 2,404.00 No Bid 

8’ 1,818.38 1,819.89 No Bid 2,440.00 No Bid 

8 ½’ 1,835.79 1,912.05 No Bid 2,620.00 No Bid 

9’ 1,851.04 2,004.21 No Bid 2,656.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ 1,905.62 2,096.37 No Bid 2,836.00 No Bid 

10’ 1,961.52 2,188.53 No Bid 2,872.00 No Bid 

Type "F" Inlet 

(W=3') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,035.00 No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,220.00 No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,300.00 No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,485.00 No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,565.00 No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,750.00 No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,830.00 No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,015.00 No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,095.00 No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,280.00 No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,360.00 No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,545.00 No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,625.00 No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,810.00 No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,940.00 No Bid 

Type "F-1" 

Inlet 

(W=4') 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "F-2" 

Inlet 

(W=5') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "F-3" 

Inlet 

(W=6') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "F" 

(SPL-1) Inlet 

(W=3') 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "F-1" 
(SPL-1) Inlet 

(W=4') 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Type "F-2" 
(SPL-1) Inlet 

(W=5') 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

Type "F-3" 
(SPL-1) Inlet 

(W=6') 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

2’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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CATEGORY (C) – MANHOLES, NO BOTTOM FLOORS 

DESCRIPTION 
VENDORS / PRICE 

 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 
Act Pipe & Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

TYPE “A” 

MANHOLE 

3’  845.20 No Bid 945.00 No Bid 

3 ½’  845.20 No Bid 1,012.00 No Bid 

4’  886.06 No Bid 1,056.00 No Bid 

4 ½’  926.78 No Bid 1,123.00 No Bid 

5’  967.49 No Bid 1,167.00 No Bid 

5 ½’  1,008.21 No Bid 1,234.00 No Bid 

6’  1,048.93 No Bid 1,278.00 No Bid 

6 ½’  1,089.64 No Bid 1,345.00 No Bid 

7’  1,130.36 No Bid 1,389.00 No Bid 

7 ½’  1,171.07 No Bid 1,456.00 No Bid 

8’  1,211.79 No Bid 1,500.00 No Bid 

8 ½’  1,252.51 No Bid 1,567.00 No Bid 

9’  1,293.22 No Bid 1,612.00 No Bid 

9 ½’  1,333.94 No Bid 1,678.00 No Bid 

10’  1,374.65 No Bid 1,723.00 No Bid 

TYPE “A-1” 

MANHOLE 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

3’ 596.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ 650.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ 703.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ 739.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ 789.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ 825.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ 881.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ 917.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ 970.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ 1,006.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ 1,060.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ 1,096.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ 1,145.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ 1,181.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ 1,288.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

TYPE “M” 

MANHOLE 

 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

3’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

5 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

7 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

9 ½’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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CATEGORY (D) – MISCELLANEOUS  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

DESCRIPTION  

Vendors 
Rio Valley Pipe 

LLC d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 

Act Pipe & 

Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

WATER VALVE      

2” ea. No Bid 295.00 353.40 210.00 No Bid 

4” ea. No Bid 576.00 453.38 350.00 No Bid 

6” ea. No Bid 770.00 578.54 440.00 No Bid 

8” ea. No Bid 995.00 921.48 698.00 No Bid 

10” ea. No Bid 1,440.00 1,436.85 1,160.00 No Bid 

90 DEGREE ELBOW      

2” ea. No Bid 92.10 No Bid 16.54 No Bid 

4” ea. No Bid 140.00 No Bid 30.34 No Bid 

6” ea. No Bid 160.00 No Bid 49.61 No Bid 

8” ea. No Bid 270.00 No Bid 72.16 No Bid 

10” ea. No Bid 350.00 No Bid 114.80 No Bid 

45 DEGREE ELBOW      

2” ea. No Bid 105.10 No Bid 16.54 No Bid 

4” ea. No Bid 147.50 No Bid 25.01 No Bid 

6” ea. No Bid 160.00 No Bid 40.18 No Bid 

8” ea. No Bid 270.00 No Bid 58.63 No Bid 

10” ea. No Bid 350.00 No Bid 85.69 No Bid 

STEEL PIPE CASING WITH 

SPACERS 
     

4” lf No Bid 61.11 No Bid 5.95 No Bid 

6” lf No Bid 83.85 No Bid 12.50 No Bid 

12” lf No Bid 98.57 No Bid 26.00 No Bid 

16” lf No Bid 128.66 No Bid 35.00 No Bid 

24” lf No Bid 190.20 No Bid 49.00 No Bid 

FIRE HYDRANT W/VALVE ea. No Bid 2,495.00 No Bid 2,080.00 No Bid 

PVC SCHEDULE 40 WATER 

LINE DR 18 
     

2” lf No Bid .85 No Bid .58 No Bid 

8” lf No Bid 7.40 No Bid 6.65 No Bid 

PVC SCHEDULE 40      

1.5” lf No Bid .65 No Bid .46 No Bid 

0.75”lf No Bid .45 No Bid .23 No Bid 

0.5”lf No Bid No Bid No Bid .15 No Bid 

WATER SADDLE W/2’ 

CORPORATE VALVE 
     

8” x 2” ea. No Bid 470.00 358.83 307.75 No Bid 
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HP Dual Wall Marmac Couplers 

Vendor 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 

Act Pipe & 

Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

PIPE SIZE      

12” ea. No Bid 46.00 43.44 47.11 No Bid 

15” ea. No Bid 52.11 49.22 53.38 No Bid 

18” ea. No Bid 64.11 60.56 65.66 No Bid 

24” ea. No Bid 82.94 78.33 86.94 No Bid 

30” ea. No Bid 101.23 95.61 103.67 No Bid 

36” ea. No Bid 118.45 111.88 121.31 No Bid 

42” ea. No Bid 131.90 124.58 135.08 No Bid 

48” ea. No Bid 145.97 137.87 149.50 No Bid 

60”ea.  No Bid 239.61 225.86 244.90 No Bid 

 

 

HP Dual Wall Fabricated Tees 

Vendor 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC 

d/b/a CAPA 

HD Supply 

Water Works 

Act Pipe & 

Supply 

Ferguson 

Waterworks 

Aguaworks Pipe & 

Supply 

PIPE SIZE      

12” ea. No Bid 174.29 164.61 177.42 No Bid 

15” ea. No Bid 260.51 246.04 265.20 No Bid 

18” ea. No Bid 365.44 345.14 372.01 No Bid 

24” ea. No Bid 565.01 533.62 568.35 No Bid 

30” ea. No Bid 1,378.23 1,301.67 1,346.56 No Bid 

36” ea. No Bid 1,553.81 1,448.60 1,498.56 No Bid 

42”ea.  No Bid 2,048.08 1,934.30 2,001.00 No Bid 

48” ea. No Bid 2,075.20 2,474.17 2,559.49 No Bid 

60” ea. No Bid 4,503.24 4,253.06 4,399.69 No Bid 
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HP Dual Wall Fabricated Bends 

Vendors 
Rio Valley Pipe LLC d/b/a 

CAPA 
HD Supply Water Works Act Pipe & Supply Ferguson Waterworks Aguaworks Pipe & Supply 

PIPE 

SIZE 

11.25 
Bend 

22.5 
Bend 

30* 
Bend 

45* 
Bend 

90* 
Bend 

11.25 
Bend 

22.5 
Bend 

30* 
Bend 

45* 
Bend 

90* 
Bend 

11.25 
Bend 

22.5 
Bend 

30* 
Bend 

45* 
Bend 

90* 
Bend 

11.25 
Bend 

22.5 
Bend 

30* 
Bend 

45* 
Bend 

90* 
Bend 

11.25 
Bend 

22.5 
Bend 

30* 
Bend 

45* 
Bend 

90* 
Bend 

12” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 74.79 74.79 83.60 103.01 90.72 70.63 70.63 78.96 97.29 85.68 75.68 76.13 85.10 105.49 92.90 -- -- -- -- -- 

15” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 103.75 115.95 125.82 120.92 163.99 109.51 109.51 118.83 134.20 154.88 118.75 118.75 128.86 145.52 167.94 -- -- -- -- -- 

18” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 157.75 157.75 173.04 189.33 230.06 148.99 148.99 163.42 178.81 217.28 161.65 161.65 177.20 193.89 235.60 -- -- -- -- -- 

24” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 336.92 342.40 363.22 386.66 454.91 318.19 323.38 343.04 365.18 429.63 334.93 340.40 361.10 384.40 452.25 -- -- -- -- -- 

30” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 466.36 528.73 608.96 602.14 775.68 440.46 499.36 575.12 568.69 732.59 463.64 525.64 605.40 598.62 771.13 -- -- -- -- -- 

36” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 658.41 753.63 854.81 816.65 988.46 621.83 711.77 807.32 771.28 933.54 650.76 744.87 844.36 870.64 976.96 -- -- -- -- -- 

42” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 830.24 996.79 1,030.03 1,058.05 1,271.88 784.11 941.41 972.80 999.27 1,201.22 815.84 979.51 1,012.16 1,039.70 1,249.82 -- -- -- -- -- 

48” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 1,017.08 1,247.73 1,291.33 1,316.46 1,385.39 960.58 1,178.41 1,219.59 1,243.32 1,308.42 993.70 1,219.05 1,261.65 1,286.19 1,353.54 -- -- -- -- -- 

60” ea. -- -- -- -- -- 1,512.47 2,006.56 1,960.08 2,222.88 2,571.40 1,428.44 1,895.09 1,851.18 2,099.39 2,428.54 1,460.91 1,938.16 1,893.25 2,147.10 2,483.74 -- -- -- -- -- 
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