TABULATION SHEET
Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
RFB No.: 2017-141-05-31-FAZ

CORRUGATED POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) STORM SEWER PIPE

NIGP CODE: 665-89 POlyvinyl Chloride (PVC)

VENDORS

Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC

48 LF

No bid

CATEGORY (A) — PIPES

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE
NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT)
TYPE “IR”’PIPE
VENDORS Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC
12” LF 11.03
15” LF 13.21
18” LF 16.36
24” LF 20.81
30” LF 25.93
36” LF 31.51
42” LF 36.96
48” LF 41.11
54” LF 54.86
60” LF 61.55
66” LF 67.94
72” LF 72.33
78” LF 79.55
84” LF 112.70
90” LF 119.35
96” LF 127.75
102”LF 135.90
108” LF 180.45
114 LF 200.95
120” LF 211.40
126” LF 265.70
132” LF 292.95
138” LF 305.50
144” LF 318.85
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Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
RFB No.: 2017-141-05-31-FAZ

“CONTINUED”
CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE
NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT)
TYPE “I” PIPE

VENDORS Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC
12" LF No bid
15" LF No bid
18" LF No bid
24 LF No bid
30” LF No bid
36" LF No bid
42" LF No bid
48" LF No bid
54” LF No bid
60" LF No bid
66" LF No bid
72” LF No bid
78" LF No bid
84” LF No bid
90” LF No bid
96” LF No bid
102” LF No bid
108” LF No bid
114” LF No bid
120" LF No bid
126” LF No bid
132” LF No bid
138” LF No bid
144” LF No bid

“CONTINUED”

CORRUGATED STEEL STORM SEWER PIPE
NIGP CODE: 210-29 Corrugated Galvanized Metal Pipe
(UNIT PRICE INCLUDES ONE GASKETED BAND CONNECTION FOR EVERY 20 FOOT JOINT)

TYPE “IA” PIPE
VENDORS Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC
12" LF No bid
15" LF No bid
18" LF No bid
24” LF No bid
30” LF No bid
36” LF No bid
42" LF No bid
48" LF No bid
54" LF No bid
60” LF No bid
66” LF No bid
72" LF No bid
78” LF No bid
84” LF No bid
90” LF No bid
96” LF No bid
102" LF No bid
108” LF No bid
114" LF No bid
120" LF No bid
126” LF No bid
132" LF No bid
138” LF No bid
144" LF No bid
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TABULATION SHEET
Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
RFB No.: 2017-141-05-31-FAZ

REINFORCED POLYTHYLENE PIPE - 20 FOOT JOINTS
NIGP CODE: 658-58
VENDORS Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC
24" LF No bid
30” LF No bid
36” LF No bid
42" LF No bid
48" LF No bid
54" LF No bid
60” LF No bid
72” LF No bid
84” LF No bid
96” LF No bid

HIGH DESTINY POLYETHYLENE PIPE (HDPE)
NIGP CODE: 658-58 POlyethylene Pipe And Fitting

VENDORS Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC

54”LF No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET
Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
RFB No.: 2017-141-05-31-FAZ

CATEGORY (B) - INLETS
NIGP CODE: 210-31

INLETS, AREA, SEWER DRAIN, PRECAST, CONCRETE, STORM DRAIN,NO BOTTOM FLOORS

DESCRIPTION Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC
2’ No Bid
2V No Bid
3’ No Bid
3 No Bid
4 No Bid
4y No Bid
5’ No Bid
Type "A-1" 5V No Bid
Inlet 6 No Bid
(5'x 4 6y No Bid
7 No Bid
7% No Bid
8’ No Bid
8 1 No Bid
9’ No Bid
9w No Bid
10° No Bid
2’ No Bid
2 No Bid
3’ No Bid
3% No Bid
4 No Bid
4% No Bid
5’ No Bid
Type "A-3" 50 No Bid
Inlet 6’ No Bid
(5'x 6" 6% No Bid
7 No Bid
7V No Bid
8’ No Bid
8 1 No Bid
9’ No Bid
9 No Bid
10° No Bid
2’ No Bid
2V No Bid
Type "A" 3 No Bid
(SPL-1) 3 No Bid
Inlet 4’ No Bid
(5'x3) 4 No Bid
5 No Bid
S5V No Bid
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6’ No Bid

6’ No Bid

7 No Bid

7% No Bid

8’ No Bid

81’ No Bid

9’ No Bid

9V’ No Bid

10° No Bid

2’ No Bid

2 No Bid

3 No Bid

30 No Bid

4 No Bid

4% No Bid

5 No Bid

Type "A-1" 5% No Bid
(SPL-1) 6’ No Bid
Inlet 615 No Bid
(6'x4) 7 No Bid
URZY No Bid

8’ No Bid

8 1 No Bid

9 No Bid

9w No Bid

10° No Bid

2’ No Bid

2 No Bid

3 No Bid

3V No Bid

4 No Bid

4% No Bid

5 No Bid

Type "A-3" 50 No Bid
(SPL- 6 No Bid
(15) I)?Iee; 6 No B?d
7 No Bid

7Y No Bid

8’ No Bid

8’ No Bid

9 No Bid

9V No Bid

10° No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET
Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
RFB No.: 2017-141-05-31-FAZ

2’ No Bid

2% No Bid

3’ No Bid

3 No Bid

4’ No Bid

4% No Bid

5’ No Bid

Type "F-1" 5% No Bid
Inlet 6’ No Bid
(W=4') 6 vy No Bid
7’ No Bid

7 No Bid

8’ No Bid

81 No Bid

9’ No Bid

9 No Bid

10’ No Bid

2’ No Bid

2V No Bid

3 No Bid

3 No Bid

4 No Bid

4% No Bid

5’ No Bid

Type "F-2" 5% No Bid
Inlet 6’ No Bid
(W=5) 61 No Bid
7 No Bid

7% No Bid

8’ No Bid

81 No Bid

9’ No Bid

9 No Bid

10° No Bid

2 No Bid

Type "F-3" 20 No Bid
Inlet 3’ No Bid
(W=6 3 No Bid
4’ No Bid
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4 No Bid

5 No Bid

5V No Bid

6’ No Bid

6’ No Bid

7 No Bid

7 No Bid

8’ No Bid

81’ No Bid

9’ No Bid

9V’ No Bid

10° No Bid

2’ No Bid

2% No Bid

3 No Bid

3 No Bid

4 No Bid

4 No Bid

5 No Bid

TB(/ESLF" 51 No Bid
1) Inlet & No Bid
(W=3" 6 No Bid
7 No Bid

7 No Bid

8’ No Bid

8 14’ No Bid

9 No Bid

9% No Bid

10° No Bid

2’ No Bid

2% No Bid

3 No Bid

3 No Bid

4 No Bid

4% No Bid

Type "F-1" 5’ No Bid
(SPL- 514 No Bid
1) Inlet 6 No Bid
(W=4) 6 No Bid
7 No Bid

7V No Bid

8’ No Bid

8 14’ No Bid

9 No Bid

9V No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET
Hidalgo County (All funding sources, programs & entities)
“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
RFB No.: 2017-141-05-31-FAZ

10° No Bid

2’ No Bid

2% No Bid

3 No Bid

3V’ No Bid

4’ No Bid

4 No Bid

5 No Bid

5V’ No Bid

Type "F-2" 6 No Bid
1[)Sll;lfet 6 No Bid
(W=5") 70 No Bid
7 No Bid

8’ No Bid

814’ No Bid

9’ No Bid

9% No Bid

10° No Bid

2’ No Bid

2V No Bid

3 No Bid

3 No Bid

4 No Bid

4y No Bid

5’ No Bid

Type "F-3" 5% No Bid
(SPL- 6 No Bid
%‘]leée)t 6 No Bid
7 No Bid

7V No Bid

8 No Bid

8 14’ No Bid

9 No Bid

9V No Bid

10° No Bid
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“PIPES & Related Miscellaneous Items-Round 2”
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CATEGORY (C) - MANHOLES, NO BOTTOM FLOORS

DESCRIPTION VENDORS / PRICE
Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC

3 No Bid

37 No Bid

4 No Bid

47 No Bid

5 No Bid

57 No Bid

TYPE “M” 6’ No Bid
MANHOLE 6 Y No Bid
r No Bid

17 No Bid

8 No Bid

8 %’ No Bid

y No Bid

97 No Bid

10° No Bid
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