TABULATION SHEET
“PURCHASE OF SAND and BEDDING MATERIAL (on an as needed basis)”
RFSQ No.: 2017-147-06-06-FAZ

GRAVEL 750-77

Upper Valley Materials
(CAPA)

Terra Firma Materials

Vendor(s) . 9312 E. Curve Rd.
3609 W. Palma Vista :
Palmview, Texas 78572 Edinburg, Texas 78542
Pit Location 3 Mile Line & Tom Gill Rd. 43530 W. Expressway 83

Pefiitas, Texas

Havana, Texas 78560

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 1
(location of site for reference only)
Mile 11 North & 1 % West
Mercedes, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 2
(location of site for reference only)
4011 S. Veterans Blvd.

San Juan, Texas 78589

$ (per ton) $ (per ton)
éggregate Normal Size | Upper Terra Aggregate Normal Size Upper Terra
rade No. . Grade No. .
Valley Firma Valley Firma
1 2” NO BID 14.75 1 27 NO BID 14.75
2 1-1/2” 16.50 14.75 2 1-1/2 < 16.50 14.75
3 1-1/2” NO BID 14.75 3 1-1/2” NO BID 14.75
4 17 16.50 14.75 4 1” 16.50 14.75
5 3/4” 18.00 14.75 5 3/4” 18.00 14.75
6 1/2> 16.50 14.75 6 1/2” 16.50 14.75
7 3/8” NO BID 14.75 7 3/8” NO BID 14.75
8 3/8” 16.00 14.75 8 3/8” 16.00 14.75
Other 2% -3%” NO BID 14.75 Other 2% -3%” NO BID 14.75
Tunnel Rock 1%-2Y 14.75 14.75 Tunnel Rock 1% -2Y 14.75 14.75
Oversized Rock 37-67 14.25 18.00 Oversized Rock 37-6” 14.25 18.00

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 3
(location of site for reference only)
FM 2221 & lowa Rd.
Mission, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 4
(location of site for reference only)
1051 N. Doolittle Rd.
Edinburg, Texas

$ (per ton) $  (per ton)
éggregate Normal Size Upper Terra Aggregate Normal Size Upper Terra
rade No. . Grade No. .
Valley Firma Valley Firma
1 2” NO BID 14.75 1 27 NO BID 14.75
2 1-1/2 « 16.50 14.75 2 1-1/2 « 16.50 14.75
3 1-1/2” NO BID 14.75 3 1-1/2” NO BID 14.75
4 1” 16.50 14.75 4 17 16.50 14.75
5 3/4” 18.00 14.75 5 3/4” 18.00 14.75
6 1/2” 16.50 14.75 6 1/2” 16.50 14.75
7 3/8” NO BID 14.75 7 3/8” NO BID 14.75
8 3/8” 16.00 14.75 8 3/8” 16.00 14.75
Other 2% -3W%n” NO BID 14.75 Other 2B -3 NO BID 14.75
Tunnel Rock 1%-2Y 14.75 14.75 Tunnel Rock 1%-2Y 14.75 14.75
Oversized Rock 37-6” 14.25 18.00 Oversized Rock 37-6” 14.25 18.00




TABULATION SHEET
“PURCHASE OF SAND and BEDDING MATERIAL (on an as needed basis)”
RFSQ No.: 2017-147-06-06-FAZ

FINE SAND 750-77

Upper Valley Materials
(CAPA)

Terra Firma Materials
9312 E. Curve Rd.

Vendor .
endors SE0TNRal ISt Edinburg, Texas 78542
Palmview, Texas 78572 g
Pit Location 3 Mile Line & Tom Gill Rd. Fine Sand - 43530 W. Expressway
Havana, Texas 78560

Pefiitas, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 1
(location of site for reference only)
Mile 11 North & 1 % West
Mercedes, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 2
(location of site for reference only)
4011 S. Veterans Blvd.

San Juan, Texas 78589

Price (per ton)

Price (per ton)

Upper Valley Terra Firma

Fine Aggregate

Price per Ton NO BID 13.50

Upper Valley Terra Firma

Fine Aggregate

Price per Ton 13.50

NO BID

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 3
(location of site for reference only)
FM 2221 & lowa Rd.
Mission, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 4
(location of site for reference only)
1051 N. Doolittle Rd.
Edinburg, Texas

Price (per ton)

Price (per ton)

Fine Aggregate Upper Valley Terra Firma Fine Aggregate Upper Valley Terra Firma
i Price per Ton
Price per Ton NO BID 13.50 P NO BID 13.50
FILL SAND
r Valley Material . .
e (?:A?gA) SUBITELS Terra Firma Materials
Vendor(s) . 9312 E. Curve Rd.
SOt el Vi Edinburg, Texas 78542
Palmview, Texas 78572 9
Pit Location 3 Mile Line & Tom Gill Rd. Fill Sand - 43530 W. Expressway
Pefiitas, Texas Havana, Texas 78560

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 1
(location of site for reference only)
Mile 11 North & 1 %2 West

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 2
(location of site for reference only)
4011 S. Veterans Blvd

San Juan, Texas

Mercedes, Texas
FILL SAND Upper Valley Terra Firma FILL SAND Upper Valley Terra Firma
Price per Ton 8.00 8.00 Price per Ton 8.00 8.00

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 3
(location of site for reference only)

FM 2221 & lowa Rd.
Mission, Texas

HIDALGO COUNTY Precinct No. 4
(location of site for reference only)

1051 N. Doolittle Rd.
Edinburg, Texas

FILL SAND

Price per Ton

Upper Valley

Terra Firma

8.00

8.00

FILL SAND

Price per Ton

Upper Valley

Terra Firma

8.00

8.00




