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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG 

BID OPENING DATE:   May 10, 2017  BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M. 
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies for Adult 
Detention Facility (Jail)               

BID NO.: 2017-063-05-10-SMA Buyer:  Sandra Montalvo 

Name of Vendor 
Company/Firm 

Bid 
Request 

*Via 

Signature  
(if applicable) 

or  Initials of Staff 
Date Mailing Address, Phone No &  

E-Mail Address 

 
1.  

KEEFE SUPPLY CO. 
Attn: Blake Taylor 

BLM/ 
EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/24/17 

3101 Marquis Dr. Suite 200 
Garland, Tx75042 
w- 972-272-1564 
c- 214-392-7248 
f- 972-272-5387 
btaylor@keefegroup.com 

2.  R & R DISTRIBUTING 
Attn: Rene Lucio EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/24/17 

5705 E. Texas Rd. 
Edinburg, Tx  78542 
956-451-1831 
956-287-9614 fax 
roselucio@sbcglobal.net 
rrdistributing@sbcglobal.net 

3.  CHARM-TEX 
Attn:  Stan Danzger or Kaily Kellner EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/24/17 

1618 Coney Island Avenue 
Brooklyn, NY  11230 
800-221-3147 ext 254 
stan@charm-tex.com 
kaily@charm-tex.com 
www.charm-tex.com 

4.  ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC. 
Attn: Maegan Eisenman EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/24/17 

 Waco, Texas 76702 
800-524-5427  
254-751-0299 fax 
bids@icswaco.com 

5.  BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.  
Attn: Ryan Wilkie EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/25/17 

134 N. Main St.  
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 
DIRECT: 888-772-0250 ext 2172 
FAX: 800-322-7537 
www.bobbarker.com 
ryanwilkie@bobbarker.com 

6.  GLOBAL SUPPLY USA 
Attn: Larry  EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/26/17 

22411 5th Place W. 
Bothell, WA 98021 
Tel. 510-290-8618 
Fax. 510-735-8690 
globalsupplyusa@comcast.net 

7.  
PERFORMANCE FOOD GROUP, INC.  
D/B/A VISTAR 
Attn:  Sean C. Mahoney 

EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/27/17 

12650 E Arapahoe Road 
Centennial, CO  80112 
 781-799-3651 
Sean.mahoney@pfgc.com 

8.  
SAFEWAY SUPPLY 
Attn: Michael Dillemuth EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/28/17 

10841 HILLPOINT DR 
SAN ANTONIO TX 78217 
TEL: 210-496-0407.  
FAX 210-496-1407 
WWW.SAFEWAYSUPPLY.COM 
mdillemuth@safewaysupply.com 

9.  
PRIME VENDOR INC. 
Attn: Sarah Malcolm EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/28/17 

4622 Cedar Avenue Bldg 5 Suite 124 
Wilmington NC 28403 
Phone: 800-746-9554 
Fax: 800-746-8307 
Contact Email: bids20@prime-vendor.com 

10.  AMERCARE PRODUCTS, INC. 
Attn:  Julie Siegel EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/28/17 

Phone (425) 489-9575 
Fax (425) 486-3875 
julie@amercareproducts.net 

11.  NATIONAL FOOD GROUP 
Attn:  Chris Keirle EMR Sandra Montalvo 04/28/17 

10803 Thornmint Rd, ste 105 
San Diego, CA 92127 
 ckeirl@nationalfoodgroup.com 
(858) 207-9818 

12.  
UNION SUPPLY GROUP 
Attn:  Owen Thomas EMR Sandra Montalvo 05/01/17 

2301 East Pacifica Place 
Rancho Dominguez, CA 90224 
(310) 604-4660 
OThomas@unionsupplygroup.com 
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HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG 

BID OPENING DATE:   May 10, 2017  BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M. 
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office-Commissary Supplies for Adult 
Detention Facility (Jail)               

BID NO.: 2017-063-05-10-SMA Buyer:  Sandra Montalvo 

Name of Vendor 
Company/Firm 

Bid 
Request 

*Via 

Signature  
(if applicable) 

or  Initials of Staff 
Date Mailing Address, Phone No &  

E-Mail Address 

www.unionsupplygroup.com  

 

13.  
BROOKE SUPPLIES 
Attn:  Judy Meth EMR S.Montalvo 05/01/17 

525 E. County Line Road 
Lakewood, NJ  08701 
(877) 601-6344 ext. 205 
Judy@BrookeSupplies.com 
www.BrookeSupplies.com 

14.  
COOKESWEETS 
Terrell Cooke EMR S.Montalvo 05/01/17 

24296 N. Kansas City Rd. 
La Feria, TX 78559 
956-742-9304 
monfue63266@yahoo.com 

15.  
BOB BARKER 
Attn: Erika Flynn EMR S.Montalvo 05/01/17 

DIRECT: 919-753-1657 
134 N. Main St. 
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 
www.bobbarker.com 
erikaflynn@bobbarker.com 

16.  
MEDEK 
Attn: Dennis Garcia IP S.Montalvo 05/08/17 

956-655-7980 cell 
956-800-4366 office 
855-633-3577 fax 
dennis@medekllc.com 
www.medekllc.com 

17.      
 

  
 
*VIA: 
IN PERSON (IP) 
TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR) 
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM) 
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR) 

http://www.unionsupplygroup.com/
callto:%28877%29%20601-6344
mailto:Judy@BrookeSupplies.com
http://www.brookesupplies.com/
callto:956-742-9304
mailto:monfue63266@yahoo.com
callto:919-753-1657
http://www.bobbarker.com/
mailto:erikaflynn@bobbarker.com
mailto:dennis@medekllc.com
http://www.medekllc.com/


 

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
ACCEPTANCE/TABULATION SHEET 

DEPARTMENT NAME: Hidalgo County Sheriff’s Office- Commissary Supplies for Adult 
Detention Facility (Jail) 

BID NO:  2017-063-05-10-SMA BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M.  

BID OPENING DATE: May 10, 2017 BUYER: Sandra Montalvo 

NAME OF COMPANY 
ACKNOWLEDGE 

RECEIPT  

SUBMITTED 
ADDENDUM No 1 

(YES or NO) 

1.  
Performance Food Service,  
D/B/A Jenny Service  yes 

2.  
Rene Lucio –R&R DISTRIBUTING  yes 

3.  
Bob Barker Co.  yes 

4.  
Brooke Supplies  yes 

5.  ICS Jail Supplies  yes 

6.  
Phoenix Trading, Inc.  
DBA Amercare Products, Inc. 

 yes 

7.  
Charm-Tex  yes 

8.  
Keefe Supply Company  yes 
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BID TABULATION SHEET 
HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE 

“Commissary Supplies for Adult Detention Facility (Jail)” 
BID No. 2017-063-05-10-SMA 

LIST OF ITEMS 
PROPOSED PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

PFG 
d/b/a 
Jenny 

Service 

Rene 
Lucio 
d/b/a 

R & R 
Distributing 

Bob 
Barker 
Co.Inc. 

Brooke 
Supplies 

LLC 

ICS 
Jail 

Supplies 
Inc, 

Phoenix 
Trading 

Inc. 
d/b/a 

Amercare 

Charm 
-Tex 

Keefe 
Supply 

Co. 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

1.  3 ½” Flexible Pencil $ 0.2688 ------- No bid No bid $.06 ea. $0.29 $.039 $0.23 

2.  3 Musketeers Bar- 2.13 oz. $ 0.6000 $0.68 No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.72 

3.  4 ½” Flexible Black Ink Pen $ 0.2040 $0.34 $0.18 No bid $.25 ea $0.22 No bid $0.35 

4.  4”Anti Shank Security Toothbrush & Clear Cap --------- -------- No bid No bid $.10 $0.09 No bid ------- 

5.  Acne Gel Medication- 1 oz. Tube $ 1.2390 -------- No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $1.25 

6.  Advil Coated (2 tablet pouch) -50 ct. box --------- $0.41 No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.45 

7.  After Shave Lotion- 4 oz. $ 0.7740 -------- No bid No bid $.666 ea ------- No bid $0.65 

8.  Alcohol - Free Hair Gel -16 oz. Plastic Bottle $ 0.8510 -------- No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.91 

9.  Alcohol- Free Mouthwash- 8 oz. Plastic Bottle $ 0.8020 -------- $0.45 No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.63 

10.  Alka Seltzer (Original Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch)- 
116.ct. box -------- $0.45 $0.24 No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.45 

11.  Alka Seltzer-(Plus Cold Effervescent 2-tablet Pouch) 
-72 ct. bx -------- $0.53 No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.60 

12.  Almond Joy Bar-1.61.oz $0.6100 $0.68 No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $0.72 

13.  Anti-Shank Coffee Cup w/Lid-12 oz.  -------- ------- No bid No bid No bid ------- No bid $1.69 

14.  Anti-Shank Security Razor- Single Edge $0.0837 ea ------- $0.08 ea No bid $.10 ea $0.09 $0.09 $0.08 

15.  Athletes Foot Cream- 0.05 oz. Tube $1.2390 -------- $0.85 No bid $.952 $0.89 No bid $0.62 

16.  B.B.Q. Potato Chips- 1.5 oz. bag $0.4369 -------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.24 

17.  Baby Lotion- 4 oz. $0.7940 -------- $0.34 No bid $.407 $0.47 No bid $0.40 

18.  Baby Ruth- 2.1 oz. $0.6000 $0.68 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

19.  BBQ Corn Chips- 1.5oz. bag ------- -------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.23 

20.  Beef & Cheese Snack Pack, Hot Flavor- 1.2 oz. $0.5054 -------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.92 

21.  Bottled Water- 20 oz. plastic bottle -------- $0.38 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.55 

22.  Bubble Cushioned Envelope (6” x 9”) -------- $0.30 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.36 

23.  Bubu Lubu-1.2 oz $0.2789 $0.50 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid ------- 

24.  Butter Finger Bar- 2.1 oz. $0.6000 $0.68 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

25.  Caramel Popcorn-3.53 oz. Bag $0.8285 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.44 

26.  Cereal Bowl w/Lid- 24 oz.  $1.1133 -------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.55 

27.  Chap Stick Lip Balm- 15 oz. $0.5410 $1.16 $1.43  No bid $.551 $1.29 No bid $1.32 

28.  Cherry/Strawberry Danish- 4.25 oz. $0.4778 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

29.  Chicken Vienna Sausages Pouch- 3 oz. $1.2150 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.79 

30.  Chili Corn Nuts-1.4 oz $0.3632 $0.50 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.43 

31.  Chili No Beans- 11.25oz. Pouch $1.7020 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.16 

32.  Chili w/Beans- 11.25oz. Pouch $1.4315 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.16 

33.  Chocolate Cupcakes (2-pk) – 4 oz.  $0.4641 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.58 

34.  Christmas Card (English/Spanish) -6/pk $0.2300 --------- $0.38 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

35.  Chunk Light Tuna -4.23 oz. Pouch $0.9630 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.80 
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BID TABULATION SHEET 
HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE 

“Commissary Supplies for Adult Detention Facility (Jail)” 
BID No. 2017-063-05-10-SMA 

LIST OF ITEMS 
PROPOSED PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

PFG 
d/b/a 
Jenny 

Service 

Rene 
Lucio 
d/b/a 

R & R 
Distributing 

Bob 
Barker 
Co.Inc. 

Brooke 
Supplies 
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Jail 

Supplies 
Inc, 

Phoenix 
Trading 

Inc. 
d/b/a 

Amercare 

Charm 
-Tex 
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Supply 

Co. 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

36.  Churritos Red Chili Lime- 4 oz. bag -------- $0.98 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.03 

37.  Cinnamon Rolls- 4 oz. pk $ 0.3890 -------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

38.  Close Up “Red Gel” Toothpaste- 4.0 oz. $1.9085 -------- $1.12 No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.12 

39.  Coca Cola Classic- 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.2430 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

40.  Cocoa Butter Moisturizing Soap- 3.6 oz. $0.7520 --------- $1.00 No bid $.548 $0.55 No bid $1.46 

41.  Colgate “Red Gel” Toothpaste- 4.2 oz. $1.6390 --------- No bid No bid $1.80 -------- No bid $1.58 

42.  Conchas- 2ct 23 oz. -------- $1.49 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

43.  Contact Lens Solution- 4 oz. $2.9685 --------- No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $4.00 

44.  Cookies (duplex/vanilla/chocolate/strawberry) -6 oz. 
Tray $0.3730 $0.51 No bid No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.51 

45.  Dandruff Shampoo & Conditioner- 14.2 oz. $0.9350 --------- $3.72 No bid No bid $1.59 No bid $2.50 

46.  Dial -Hypo Allergenic Soap- 3-3.2 oz. bar $0.5343 $0.46 $0.56 No bid $.864 -------- No bid $0.46 

47.   Dial Soap- 4 oz. bar $0.7355 $0.77 $0.86 No bid $.548 -------- No bid $0.71 

48.  Dictionary (English-Spanish & English) $0.7310 --------- $4.49 No bid $2.08 -------- No bid $1.15 

49.  Diet Coke -20 oz. plastic bottle $1.2430 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

50.  Diet Dr. Pepper-  20 z. plastic bottle --------- -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

51.  Disposable Douche- 4.5 oz. $1.4610 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.59 

52.  Doritos Nacho Cheese-1.5oz $0.4317 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.32 

53.  Dove White Moisturizing Soap- 3 oz. bar $1.4635 -------- $1.68 No bid $1.75 $0.90 No bid $1.57 

54.  Dr. Pepper- 20 oz. plastic bottle $0.8250 --------- --------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

55.  Elastic Pony Tails- 18 ct. pk-black $0.6720 -------- $0.35 No bid $.52 -------- No bid $0.70 

56.  Eye Drops- 0.5 oz. $1.1898 -------- ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

57.  Fanta Orange- 20 oz. plastic bottle -------- -------- ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

58.  Father’s Day Card (English/Spanish) -6/pk $0.2300 -------- $0.42 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

59.  Fish Fillets -3.53oz. Pouch $0.6630 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.63 

60.  Flaming Hot Cheetos- 1.5oz. bag $0.4317 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.29 

61.  Gansito- 2ct- 3.53 oz. -------- $1.49 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

62.  Greaseless Skin Cream- 4.5 oz. -------- -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.15 

63.  Grey Sweatshirts (small thru 4XL) $11.8800 -------- $5.19 No bid $8.04 -------- $10.18 $5.33 

64.  Gummy Bears- 4 oz. $1.1770 $0.99 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.52 

65.  Hair Moisturizer- 4 oz. Tube $3.3980 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $2.01 

66.  Happy Birthday Card (English/Spanish) -6/pk $0.2300 -------- $0.42 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

67.  Happy Easter Card (English/Spanish)- 6/pk $0.2300 -------- $0.42 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

68.  Happy Mother’s Day Card (English/Spanish)- 
6/pk $0.2300 -------- $0.42 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

69.  Hemorrhoid Ointment- 2 oz. Tube $2.7165 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $2.84 

70.  Hershey’s Chocolate Almond- 1.45 oz. $0.6100 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 
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71.  Hinged Soap Dish Box- Regular Size $0.4020 $0.34 $0.28 No bid $.176 $0.30 No bid $0.28 

72.  Honey Bun-  6 oz. pk $0.4641 ------- ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.45 

73.  Hormel Spam Single Classic Pouch- 3 oz. $0.9000 -------- ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.03 

74.  Hot Chili w/Beans- 11.25 oz. Pouch $1.4315 -------- ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.16 

75.  Hot Cocoa Mix- 1oz. bag $0.1728 -------- ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.13 

76.  Hot/Spicy Pork Cracklings- 2 oz.  $0.6243 $0.75 ------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.68 

77.  Hydrocortisone Cream- 1 oz. Tube $1.6245 ------- $1.05 No bid $.979 $1.21 No bid $0.98 

78.  Hygiene Kit (4” T-Brush/T-Paste -1.05 oz. 
/Deodorant- 0.05 oz./Soap- 1 oz.) ------- $1.37 $0.59 No bid $.616 $0.79 No bid -------- 

79.  Jalapeno Cheese Spread- 8 oz. Plastic Tub $1.0970 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.10 

80.  Jelly (Grape & Strawberry)-12 oz. Squeeze 
Bottle $1.7910 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.65 

81.  Jolly Ranchers- 3.7 oz. Assorted Bag $0.8883 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.60 

82.  Legal Gummed Pads -( 8 ½ x 11”) $0.5688 -------- $0.93 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.58 

83.  M & M Peanuts-1.74 oz. bag $0.6000 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

84.  Maxwell House Instant Coffee- 4 oz. Resealable 
Clear Pouch $2.6413 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $2.30 

85.  Medicated Chest Rub- 3.53 oz. $1.0580 -------- -------- No bid No bid $1.15 No bid $1.32 

86.  Men White Crew Neck T-shirts (Small thru 
6XL) $3.8880 -------- $2.07 No bid 

$ 3.52 
-------- $2.38 $2.70 

87.  Men’s/Ladies Crew Socks (one size fits all) $0.6450 -------- $0.42 No bid $ .433 -------- No bid $0.50 

88.  Mild Dill Pickle- 5 oz. $0.7825 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.48 

89.  Milky Way Bar- 2.05 oz. $0.6000 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

90.  Mini Mantecadas Muffins- 4 ct-  4.41 oz --------- $1.49 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

91.  Moon pies (banana/strawberry/chocolate)- 2.75 
oz. $0.3740 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.36 

92.  Motrin Ibuprofen (2 tablet pouch)- 50 ct. bx --------- $0.55 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.25 

93.  Muscle Rub- 3 oz. Tube $1.9675 -------- -------- No bid No bid $1.79 No bid $1.75 

94.  Nair Hair Removal- 9 oz.  ---------- -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

95.  No Clasp Envelope (9” x 12”) $0.0615 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.09 

96.  Oral Pain Relief- 0.33 oz. Tube -------- -------- $.06 No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.14 

97.  Palm Hair Brush Flexible – Black -------- $0.37 -------- No bid $.25 $0.28 No bid $2.65 

98.  Pay Day Bar- 1.85 oz. $0.6452 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

99.  Peanut Butter Squeezers- 1.12 oz.  $0.2708 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.14 

100.  Peanut Pattie- 2.25 oz. --------- $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

101.  Peanuts Crunchy Coated- 3.2 oz ---------- $0.98 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

102.  Plastic Reading Glasses $2.4480 --------- -------- No bid $5.00 -------- No bid $1.09 

103.  Playing Cards Deck $0.9960 $0.98 $0.58 No bid $ .624 $0.85 No bid $1.16 

104.  Postcards -------- -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 
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105.  
Ramen Soups- 3 oz. Clear Pack-(chili, beef, 
,chicken,Shrimp Chili Lime Shrimp, Spicy Chicken, 
Spicy Beef)  

$0.1730 $0.24 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.175 

106.  Ranch Corn Nuts -1.4 oz $0.3632 -------- -------- No bid No bid $3.77 No bid $0.43 

107.  Razorless Hair Removing Cream- 6 oz. $2.9060 -------- $3.28 No bid $4.14 -------- No bid $3.24 

108.  Reese’s Peanut Butter Cups- 1.5 oz.  $0.6100 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

109.  Refried Beans Resealable Pouch- 6 oz. $0.6096 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.90 

110.  Roast Beef & Gravy- 10 oz. Pouch --------- -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $2.47 

111.  Salted Peanuts- 1.75 oz. bag $0.2461 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.20 

112.  Sardines in Hot Tomato Sauce 3.53oz. Pouch $0.5790 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.44 

113.  Shaving Gel- 3 oz. Clear Tube $0.6622 -------- $0.94 No bid $ .516 $0.80 No bid $0.57 

114.  Sketch Pads (50 Sheets) $0.5690 -------- $0.75 No bid $4.73 -------- No bid $0.58 

115.  Skittles “Original Fruits” -2.17 oz. bag $0.6622 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

116.  Snack Crackers -12 oz. box -------- -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.35 

117.  Snickers Almond Bar- 1.76 oz. $0.6000 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

118.  Snickers Bar- 2.07 oz. $0.6000 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

119.  Speed Stick Aqua Sport Anti-Perspirant Gel- 3 
oz. $1.9930 -------- $2.12 No bid $2.74 -------- No bid $2.10 

120.  Sprite- 20 oz. plastic bottle $1.2430 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.93 

121.  St. Valentines Cards (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.2300 -------- $.042 No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

122.  Starlite Mints- 3.75 oz. Bag $0.5755 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.42 

123.  Suave Powder Fresh Deodorant- 1.7 oz. Clear $1.2850 -------- $1.22 No bid $1.21 $1.74 No bid $1.29 

124.  Sugar Cubes- 1 1b. bx $1.5120 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.63 

125.  Sunflower Kernels- 4 oz. Bag $0.9583 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.35 

126.  Super Cantinero Peanuts & Tortilla Chips-5 ¼ oz. --------- $1.83 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

127.  Takis Guacamole- 4 oz. bag --------- $0.98 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.03 

128.  Takis or Extremes- 3.7 oz. bag --------- $0.98 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.03 

129.  Tampons – Singles (Regular/Super/Junior) -40 ct. 
Box $2.2803 -------- $0.08 No bid $3.42 bx $0.10 No bid $4.50 

130.  Tan PVC Shower Sandals (Size 8 thru 13) ---------- -------- $1.29 $1.79 $1.60 ea -------- $1.72 $1.65 

131.  Thanksgiving Day Card (English/Spanish) 6/pk $0.2300 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.50 

132.  Three Flowers Brilliantine- 4 oz. $2.8950 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.76 

133.  Topochico Beverage Apple- 20 oz. --------- $0.97 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

134.  Topochico Beverage Mineral Water- 20 oz. --------- $0.97 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

135.  Topochico Beverage Peach- 20 oz. --------- $0.97 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

136.  Topochico Beverage Pineapple- 20 oz. ---------- $0.97 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

137.  Topochico Beverage Strawberry- 20 oz. ---------- $0.97 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid -------- 

138.  Tortilla Chips- 12 oz. bag $1.1640 $1.41 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.14 



BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                                                                                               Page 5 of 5 

BID TABULATION SHEET 
HIDALGO COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE 

“Commissary Supplies for Adult Detention Facility (Jail)” 
BID No. 2017-063-05-10-SMA 

LIST OF ITEMS 
PROPOSED PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

PFG 
d/b/a 
Jenny 

Service 

Rene 
Lucio 
d/b/a 

R & R 
Distributing 

Bob 
Barker 
Co.Inc. 

Brooke 
Supplies 

LLC 

ICS 
Jail 

Supplies 
Inc, 

Phoenix 
Trading 

Inc. 
d/b/a 

Amercare 

Charm 
-Tex 

Keefe 
Supply 

Co. 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

UNIT 
PRICE 

139.  Tostadas- 12 oz. pack -------- $1.41 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $1.21 

140.  Tums- 3-roll pack $1.6330 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.68 

141.  Twin Pocket Folders $0.3168 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.32 

142.  Twix Bar- 2.0 oz. $0.6000 $0.68 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.72 

143.  Tylenol Extra Strength (2 gel pouch) 50 ct. bx ---------- $0.41 -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.52 

144.  Vanilla Caramels- 3 oz. Bag $0.8043 -------- -------- No bid No bid -------- No bid $0.41 

145.  VO5 Extra Body Conditioner- 12.5 oz. $0.9820 $1.15 -------- No bid $1.99 ea. $1.33 No bid $0.97 

146.  VO5 Extra Body Shampoo- 12.5 oz. --------- $1.15 -------- No bid $1.99 ea. $1.33 No bid $0.97 

147.  White Boxer Shorts (small thru 6XL) --------- -------- $1.17 No bid $1.06 ea. -------- $1.18 $2.00 

148.  White Handkerchief (15” x 15”) $0.6355 -------- -------- No bid $.605 ea. -------- No bid $0.55 

149.  White Ladies Panties (Size 5 thru 18) $1.5640 -------- $0.84 No bid $.805 ea. -------- $0.85 $1.65 

150.  White Men Briefs (small thru 5XL) --------- -------- $0.92 No bid $.927 ea. -------- $1.00 $1.65 

151.  White Men’s/Ladies Velcro Tennis Shoes     --------- -------- $5.49 No bid $6.40 ea. -------- No bid $19.50 

152.  White Security Envelopes--#10 --------- -------- -------- No bid $.028 ea. -------- No bid $0.03 

153.  White Sport Bras (medium thru 3XL) $10.8120 -------- $1.62 No bid $1.93 ea. -------- $2.18 $2.25 

154.  White Thermal Underwear Set (small thru 6XL) --------- -------- $2.92 No bid $5.39 ea. -------- $9.18 -------- 

155.  White Washcloth -(12”x12”) $0.3254 -------- $0.13 No bid $.118 ea. -------- $0.10 $0.25 

156.  Word Seek Puzzles Books $0.7310 -------- $1.21 No bid $1.22 ea. -------- No bid $0.95 

 





Controlling
Name of Interested Party
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Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 06/28/2017

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
JM Bogan III, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Hidalgo County

Commissary Supplies
Bid No: 2017-063-05-10-SMA

2017-230360

06/29/2017

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Bogan III, JM XWaco, TX United States

Bogan, TW XWaco, TX United States

Signature of officer administering oath

6

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL  ABOVE

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Title of officer administering oath

I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said  _____________________________________, this the ____________ day of ______________,

20________, to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

AFFIDAVIT

Printed name of officer administering oath

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5

Version V1.0.883www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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