“BULK GASOLINE ON-OFF HIGHWAY DIESEL FUEL & OTHER RELATED MISC. PRODUCTS”
BID COMPARISON BY PARTICIPATING VENDORS:

TABULATION SHEET

RFB Ne 2017-004-06-21-FAZ

OPTION I-DELIVERY OF FUEL to HIDALGO COUNTY Sites (BULK FUEL):

ITEM ARGUINDEGUI OIL Co. Il, Ltd. PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC. Difference

UNLEADED REGULAR GASOLINE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
OPIS PRICE $1.4661 $1.4661
STATE TAX .2000 0.2000
MARGIN Transport Delivery .0679 0.0439
OF
PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery 1147 0.5210

Total Margin of Profit 0.1826 0.5649 0.3823
TOTAL :
PRICE Transport Delivery $1.7340 $1.7100
PER Bobtail Deli $1.7808 $2.1871
GALLON obtail Delivery . .
UNLEADED MID-GRADE GASOLINE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
OPIS PRICE $1.5990 $1.5990
STATE TAX .2000 0.2000
MARGIN Transport Delivery .0679 0.0513
OF
PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery 1147 0.5292

Total Margin of Profit 0.1826 0.5805 0.3979
TOTAL :
PRICE Transport Delivery $1.8669 $1.8503
PER Bobtail Deli 1.9137 2.3282
GALLON obtail Delivery $1.913 $2.328
UNLEADED PREMIUM GASOLINE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
OPIS PRICE $1.8742 $1.8742
STATE TAX .2000 0.2000
MARGIN Transport Delivery .0679 0.0461
OF
PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery 1147 0.5201

Total Margin of Profit 0.1826 0.5662 0.3836
TOTAL :
PRICE Transport Delivery $2.1421 $2.1203
PER Bobtail Deli 2.1 2.594
GALLON obtail Delivery $2.1889 $2.5943
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ITEM

ARGUINDIGUI OIL

PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC.

LOW SULFUR DIESEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PRODUCT NO LONGER
OPIS PRICE AVAILABLE $1.4725
PRODUCT NO LONGER

STATE TAX AVAILABLE 0.2000

MARGIN Transport Delivery NO BID 0.0399

OF

PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery NO BID 0.6865
Total Margin of Profit 0.7264

TOTAL .

PRICE Transport Delivery NO BID $1.7124

PER Bobtail Deli NO BID $2.3590

GALLON obtail Delivery .

#2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

OPIS PRICE $1.4725 $1.4725

STATE TAX .2000 0.2000

MARGIN Transport Delivery .0679 0.0399

OF

PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery 1147 0.6865
Total Margin of Profit 0.1826 0.7264 0.5438

TOTAL :

PRICE Transport Delivery $1.7404 1.7124

PER Bobtail Deli 1.7872 2

GALLON obtail Delivery $1.78 .3590

#2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL

W/ENHANCED ADDITIVE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

OPIS PRICE $1.4725 $1.4725

STATE TAX .2000 0.2000

MARGIN Transport Delivery .0979 0.0899

OF

PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery 1447 0.7365
Total Margin of Profit 0.2426 0.8264 0.5838

TOTAL :

PRICE Transport Delivery $1.7704 $1.7624

PER Bobtail Deli 1.8172 2.4

GALLON obtail Delivery $1.8 $2.4090

#2 ULTRA SULFUR DYED DIESEL FUEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

OPIS PRICE $1.4902 $1.4902

STATE TAX .2000 0.2000

MARGIN Transport Delivery .0679 0.0499

OF

PROFIT: Bobtail Delivery 1147 0.5202
Total Margin of Profit 0 1826 05701 0.3875

TOTAL :

PRICE Transport Delivery $1.7581 $1.7401

PER Bobtail Deli 1.804 2.2104

GALLON obtail Delivery $1.8049 $2.210
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