


 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
ACCEPTANCE SHEET 

DEPARTMENTS NAME:   Hidalgo County Health & Human Services-“PURCHASE 
OF MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS 
RFB NO.: 2017-159-08-02-SMA 
RFB OPENING DATE:  AUIGUST 02, 2017 RFB OPENING TIME: 9:30: AM 
 

NAME OF COMPANY ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

1. Adapco  
 

2. Clarke Mosquito Control  
 

3. 
  

 
4. 

  
 

 

 
5. 

  
 

 

 
6. 
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*VIA: 
IN PERSON (IP) 
TELEPHONE REQUEST (TR) 
BIDDER LIST MAIL OUT (BLM) 
E-MAIL REQUEST (EMR) 

 

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
PARTICIPATING BIDDER’S LOG 

BID OPENING DATE:  AUGUST 02, 2017 BID OPENING TIME:  9:30 A.M. 
DEPARTMENT/BID DESCRIPTION: Hidalgo County Health & Human Services-“Purchase of Mosquito 
Control Chemicals” 

BID NO.: 2017-159-08-02-SMA Buyer:  Sandra Montalvo 

NAME OF VENDOR 
COMPANY/FIRM 

BID 
REQUEST 

*VIA 

SIGNATURE (IF 
APPLICABLE) 

OR  INITIALS OF 
STAFF 

DATE MAILING ADDRESS, PHONE No &  
E-MAIL ADDRESS 

 
1)  

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 
PRODUCTS, INC. 
Attn: Laura Phillips 

BLM S. Montalvo 07/18/17 
675 Sidwell Ct. 
St. Charles, IL  60174 
 630-671-3176  Office  
lphillips@clarke.com 

2)  COMMODITIESUSA, INC 
Attn: Judiht Tinta EMR S. Montalvo 07/25/17 

Controller 
10860 Spring Knoll Dr. 
Potomac, MD 20854 
Cell: 301-518-5407 
Office: 301-299-3426 
Fax: 301-299-5990 
tinta@commoditiesusa.net 

3)  

 
PRIME VENDOR INC 
Attn: Samantha Gertz 
 

EMR S. Montalvo 07/28/17 

4622 Cedar Ave.,Suite 123 
Wilmington, NC 28403 
Phone: 800-746-9554 
Fax:    800-746-8307 
Email: Primevendor124@gmail.com 

4)  ADAPCO 
Attn: Kathy Russell TR S. Montalvo/Sandy 07/31/17 

550 Aero Lane 
Sanford, FL 32771 
1-800-367-0659 
(P) 407-330-4800 
(F) 866-330-9888 
Direct -407-328-6519 
bids@myadapco.com 
krussell@myadapco.com/bids@myadapco.com 
 

5)      

 

6)      

 

7)      

 

8)      

 

callto:630-671-3176
mailto:lphillips@clarke.com
mailto:tinta@commoditiesusa.net
mailto:Primevendor124@gmail.com
mailto:bids@myadapco.com
mailto:krussell@myadapco.com%20/%20bids@myadapco.com


2802 S. Bus. Hwy 281 
Edinburg, Texas 78539 
Phone: (956) 318-2626 

Fax: (956) 318-2629 
www.co.hidalgo.tx.us/purchasing 

 

TABULATION SHEET 
DEPARTMENTS NAME:   Hidalgo County Health & Human Services-“PURCHASE OF MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS  
RFB NO.: 2017-159-08-02-SMA 
RFB OPENING DATE:  AUIGUST 02, 2017 RFB OPENING TIME: 9:30: AM 

DECRIPTION OF ITEMS 
(Equivalent and/or Better) 

PARTICIPATING VENDORS 

ADAPCO, INC 
Sanford, FL 

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 
PRODUCTS, INC. 

St. Charles, IL 
Brand Name 
(Equivalent 

and/or better) 
Chemical & 
composition 

MSDS 
LABELS 

ATTAHCED 
PRICE  

per gallon 

PRICE 
per 
case 

PRICE  
per  

drum 

PRICE  
per  
tote 

Brand Name 
(Equivalent 

and/or better) 
Chemical & 
composition 

MSDS 
LABELS 

ATTAHCED 

PRICE  
per gallon 

PRICE 
per 
case 

PRICE  
per  

drum 

PRICE  
per  
tote 

1.  ADULTICIDING CHEMICAL- 
275 gal tote 

Pursuit 
4-4/4.6% Yes $15.14 ------ ------ $4,163.50 Biomist 4+4 Yes $16.75 $83.75 $502.50/30 gal 

$921.25/ 55 gal $4,606.25 

2.  
BIOLARVICIDE Biological 
Larvicide Aqueous Suspension 
2x2,  5 gal case, 30 gal drum, 
250 gal tote 

Aquabac XT 
Liquid Yes $33.68 $168.40 $1,1010.40 $8,420.00 Vectobac 

12AS Yes 
$41.23 cs 

$41.10 drum 
$41.94 tote 

$206.15 $1,233.00 $11,072.16 

3.  INSECTICIDE 
5 gal case, 30 gal drum 

Deltagard 
ULV Yes $188.45/cs 

$182.35/dr $942.25 $5,470.50 ----- NO BID       

4.  MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE  
5 gal pail, 55 gal drum, 260 gal tote  Fyfanon ULV Yes 

$57.14/pl 
$55.19/dr 

$51.95/tote 
$285.70 $3,035.45 $13,507.00 NO BID      

5.  INSECTICIDE 
16 x 1 pt. cs, 30 gal drum 

Suspend 
Polyzone  Yes ----- $743.04 

16x1 pt cs No bid ------ NO BID      

LAVICIDAL APPLICATION 
Briquets or Dunks 

LAVICIDAL APPLICATION 
Briquets or Dunks 

DECRIPTION OF ITEMS 
Brand Name 

(Equivalent or better) 
Chemical & composition 

UOM Price  
per case 

Brand Name 
(Equivalent or better) 

Chemical & composition 
UOM Price  

per case 

6.  BRIQUETS OR DUNKS 
20 count per package 

Summit BTI Briquets 
(5x20 per case) Case $79.56 BTI Briquettes 100 briq/case $70.00 

 
 



From : Steve Crain <scrain@atlashall.com> 

Subject : RE: C-17-159-09-05-Adapco

To : 'Rocio Villarreal' 

<rocio.villarreal@co.hidalgo.tx.us> 

Zimbra rocio.villarreal@co.hidalgo.tx.us

RE: C-17-159-09-05-Adapco

Thu, Aug 24, 2017 08:55 AM 

Good to go.

From: Rocio Villarreal [mailto:rocio.villarreal@co.hidalgo.tx.us] 

Sent: Thursday, August 24, 2017 8:22 AM

To: Steve Crain <scrain@atlashall.com>

Subject: Re: C­17­159­09­05­Adapco

Mr. Crain:

As requested the changes have been done, please review and approve as to form.

Thank you

ROCIO VILLARREAL 

HIDALGO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPT. 

CONTRACTS MANAGER 

(956) 318-2626 Work 

(956) 292-7000 Ext. 4868 Work 

rocio.villarreal@co.hidalgo.tx.us
2812 S. Business Hwy 281 

Edinburg, Texas 78539

From: "Steve Crain" <scrain@atlashall.com>

To: "Rocio Villarreal" <rocio.villarreal@co.hidalgo.tx.us>

Sent: Wednesday, August 23, 2017 5:25:22 PM

Subject: RE: C-17-159-09-05-Adapco

Please change the approval to Atlas, Hall and Rodriguez, L.L.P. Thanks. 

From: Rocio Villarreal [mailto:rocio.villarreal@co.hidalgo.tx.us] 

Sent: Wednesday, August 23, 2017 5:01 PM
To: Steve Crain <scrain@atlashall.com>

Subject: C-17-159-09-05-Adapco

Page 1 of 2Zimbra

8/24/2017http://email.co.hidalgo.tx.us/h/printmessage?id=64109&tz=America/Chicago

sandra.montalvo
Highlight

sandra.montalvo
Highlight
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REQUIREMENTS  AGREEMENT       
C-17-159-09-05 

 
THIS AGREEMENT (the "Agreement") is entered into as of the 5TH of September, 2017   

by and between Adapco, LLC ("Seller") and Hidalgo County ("Buyer"). 
  

WHEREAS, Buyer has solicited proposals for the supply of its requirements of “Purchase 
of Mosquito Control Chemicals,” as further described in Exhibit "A" (the “Products”).  Request 
for Bid (RFB) Procurement Packet, which are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference 
for all purposes (the "RFB") for a period of one year;  
 

WHEREAS, Seller has submitted a proposal to supply Buyer's requirements; and  
 

WHEREAS, Buyer has determined that Seller has submitted the lowest and best bid to meet 
Buyer's requirements for the Product. 
 

NOW THEREFORE, for and in consideration of the mutual covenants and conditions 
hereinafter set forth, and other good an valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which 
is hereby acknowledged, the parties hereto agree as follows: 
 

1. Buyer agrees to purchase from Seller, and Seller agrees to sell to Buyer, all of the 
Products that Buyer may require for use by Buyer in “Purchase of Mosquito Control Chemicals,” 
in the areas of Hidalgo County projects for a period of one (1) year commencing  December 15, 
2017 and ending December 14, 2018, and may be extended with the County’s sole discretion for an 
additional two (2) one (1) year terms under the same rates, terms, and conditions, and it is agreed 
that the Products will meet the specifications set forth in Exhibit “A”  hereto. County reserves the 
right to continue this bid for an additional sixty (60) day grace period at the end of the contract term 
for unforeseen delay in award of new bid for next contract term. 
 

2. When Buyer determines that it needs a quantity of the Products to be delivered, it 
will, according to its Purchasing Policies, complete and submit to Seller a Purchase Order describing 
the type and quantity of the Products required.  The Products are to be delivered by Seller to the 
location in Hidalgo County specified by Buyer in its Purchase Order.   
 

3. Buyer agrees to pay Seller for each Purchase Order based on the prices set out in 
Exhibit "B".  Seller shall render invoices for each Purchase Order, and the invoices shall be paid by 
Buyer on or before the 30th day following receipt of the invoice. 
 

4.      Buyer may terminate this agreement upon thirty (30) days written notice to Seller at 
any time for any reason or no reason at all.   
 

5. General Provisions. 
 

a. Conflict with Applicable Law.  Nothing in this Agreement shall be construed so as 
to require the commission of any act contrary to law, and whenever there is any conflict 
between any provision of this Agreement and any present or future law, ordinance or 
administrative, executive or judicial regulation, order or decree, or amendment thereof, 
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contrary to which the parties have no legal right to contract, the latter shall prevail, but in 
such event the affected provision or provisions of this Agreement shall be modified only to 
the extent necessary to bring them within the legal requirements and only during the time 
such conflict exists. 

 
b. No Waiver.  No waiver by Buyer of any breach of any provision of this Agreement 
shall be deemed to be a waiver of any preceding or succeeding breach of the same or any 
other provision hereof. 

 
c. Entire Agreement.  This Agreement contains the entire contract between the parties 
hereto, and each party acknowledges that neither has made (either directly or through any 
agent or representative) any representations or agreements in connection with this 
Agreement not specifically set forth herein.  This Agreement may be modified or amended 
only by agreement in writing executed by Buyer and Seller, and not otherwise. 

 
d. Texas Law to Apply.  This Agreement shall be construed under and in accordance 
with the laws of the State of Texas, and all obligations of the parties created hereunder are 
performable in Hidalgo County, Texas.  The parties hereby consent to personal jurisdiction 
in Hidalgo County, Texas. 

 
e. Notice.  Except as may be otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement, all 
notices, demands, requests or communications required or permitted hereunder shall be in 
writing and shall either be (i) personally delivered against a written receipt, or (ii) sent by 
registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, postage prepaid and addressed to the 
parties at the addresses set forth below, or at such other addresses as may have been 
theretofore specified by written notice delivered in accordance herewith: 

 
If to Buyer:   Hidalgo County  

Attn: County Judge 
302 W. University Drive 
Edinburg, Texas  78539 

 
If to Seller:   Adapco, LLC 
    Attn: Jason Trumbetta, Duly Authorized 
    550 Aero Lane 
    Sanford, FL  32771 

  
Each notice, demand, request or communication which shall be delivered or mailed in the 
manner described above shall be deemed sufficiently given for all purposes at such time as it 
is personally delivered to the addressee or, if mailed, at such time as it is deposited in the 
Unites States mail. 

 
f. Additional Documents.  The parties hereto covenant and agree that they will execute 
such other and further instruments and documents as are or may become necessary or 
convenient to effectuate and carry out the terms of this Agreement. 
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g. Successors.  This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of the 
parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal representatives, 
successors, and assigns where permitted by this Agreement. 

 
h. Assignment.  This Agreement shall not be assignable. 

 
i. Headings.  The headings and captions contained in this Agreement are solely for 
convenient reference and shall not be deemed to affect the meaning or interpretation of any 
provision or paragraph hereof. 

 
j. Gender and Number.  All pronouns used in this Agreement shall include the other 
gender, whether used in the masculine, feminine or neuter gender, and the singular shall 
include the plural whenever and as often as may be appropriate 

 
k. Authority to Execute.  The execution and performance of this Agreement by Buyer 
and Seller have been duly authorized by all necessary laws, resolutions or corporate action, 
and this Agreement constitutes the valid and enforceable obligations of Buyer and Seller in 
accordance with its terms. 

 
l. Commitment of Current Revenues Only.  In the event that, during any term hereof, 
the Commissioners Court of Buyer does not appropriate sufficient funds to meet the 
obligations of Buyer under this Agreement, Buyer may terminate this Agreement upon sixty 
(60) days written notice to Seller.  Buyer agrees, however, to use reasonable efforts to secure 
funds necessary for the continued performance of this Agreement.  The parties intend this 
provision to be a continuing right to terminate this Agreement at the expiration of each 
budget period of Buyer pursuant to the provisions of Tex. Loc. Govt. Code Ann. ' 271.903 
(Vernon Supp. 1996). 

 
m. Insurance. Seller shall provide insurance in force on all its vehicles and 
all persons connected with providing services under this Contract naming Buyer as an 
additional insured (with coverages and in the amounts described on Exhibit “C” attached 
hereto and incorporated herein at this point for all purposes), and shall furnish to Buyer 
certificates of such insurance coverage. 

 
n.       Purchasing Ethics.  Seller represents and warrants it has not, during the process of 
being awarded this contract violated the following ethical standards of Buyer and, upon and 
after the execution of this Agreement, agrees to abide by the following ethical standards of 
Buyer:  

(1) It shall be a breach of ethics to offer, give or agree to give any elected 
official, department head or employee, or former elected official, department head or 
employee, of Buyer, or for any elected official, department head or employee or 
former elected official, department head or employee of Buyer, to solicit, demand, 
accept or agree to accept from another person, entity or organization, a gratuity or an 
officer of employment in connection with any decision, approval, disapproval, 
recommendation, preparation or any part of a program requirement or purchase 
request, influencing the content of any specification or procurement standard, 
rendering of advise, investigation, auditing, or in any other advisory capacity in any 
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proceeding or application, request for ruling, determination, claim or controversy, or 
other particular matter pertaining to any program requirement or a contract or 
subcontract, or to any solicitation or proposal therefor pending before any 
department or agency of Buyer. 

 
(2) It shall be a breach of ethics for any payment, gratuity or offer of employment 
to be made by or on behalf of a subcontractor under a contract to the prime 
contractor or higher tier subcontractor for any contract for Buyer, or any person 
associated therewith, as an inducement for the award of a subcontract or order. 

 
o. Immunities. Nothing in this Agreement is intended to and Buyer does not hereby 
waive, release or relinquish any right to assert any of the defenses Buyer enjoys by virtue of 
the state or federal constitution, laws, rules or regulations, and any sovereign, official or 
qualified immunity available to Buyer as to any claim or action of any person, entity, or 
individual against Buyer. 

 
 
EXECUTED effective as of the day and year first above written. 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
Atlas, Hall & Rodriguez, L.L.P 
 
 
By                                                       
 
       Buyer: 

HIDALGO COUNTY 
 
 

By:                                                       
                                     Ramon Garcia, County Judge  
ATTEST: 
 
 
                                                                        
Arturo Guajardo, Jr., County Clerk 

ADAPCO, LLC 

By:                                                             

Printed Name:                                          

Title:                                                          
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EXHIBIT “A” 
 

REQUEST FOR BID (RFB) 
PROCUREMENT PACKET 
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EXHIBIT “B” 
 

BID PAGE 
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EXHIBIT “C” 
 

CERTIFICATE OF 
INSURANCE 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 











Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 08/08/2017

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
ADAPCO, LLC
SANFORD, FL United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Hidalgo County

Purchase of Mosquito Control Chemicals
2017-159-08-02-SMA

2017-246779

08/08/2017

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

SPECIALTY PROFESSIONAL PRODUCTS XSanford, FL United States

Signature of officer administering oath

6

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL  ABOVE

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Title of officer administering oath

I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said  _____________________________________, this the ____________ day of ______________,

20________, to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

AFFIDAVIT

Printed name of officer administering oath

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5

Version V1.0.883www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission


	depts recommendations-ADAPCO
	ACCEPTANCE SHEET
	PARTICIPATION LOG
	tabulation SHEET
	legal counsels approval
	contract document
	1295
	Form 1295 Certificate 100258639 (1)



